

JACKSON KELLY PLLC  
500 Lee Street East, Suite 1600 (25301)  
Post Office Box 553  
Charleston, West Virginia 25322  
Telephone: (304) 340-1000  
Facsimile: (304) 340-1050  
Michael T. Cimino  
William F. Dobbs, Jr.  
Richard Grady Ford

*Special Counsel to the Debtors  
and Debtors in Possession*

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK**

---

**In re:**

**PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, *et al.*,**

**Debtors.<sup>1</sup>**

**Chapter 11  
Case No. 12-12900(SCC)  
(Jointly Administered)**

---

**SECOND FEE STATEMENT OF JACKSON KELLY PLLC FOR  
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF  
SEPTEMBER 1, 2012 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2012**

<b>NAME OF APPLICANT:</b>	<b>Jackson Kelly PLLC</b>
<b>ROLE IN THE CASE:</b>	Special Counsel to the Debtors and debtors- in-possession
<b>TIME PERIOD:</b>	September 1, 2012 through and including September 30, 2012
<b>CURRENT APPLICATION:</b>	Total Fees Requested: \$ 115,879.90 80% of Fees Requested: \$ 92,703.92 Total Expenses Requested: \$ 7,187.58

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors are the entities listed on Schedule 1 attached hereto. The employer tax identification numbers and addresses for each of the Debtors are set forth in the Debtors' chapter 11 petitions.

1. On July 9, 2012 (the “Petition Date”), Patriot Coal Corporation and substantially all of its affiliated subsidiary companies (“Debtors”) filed voluntary petitions for Chapter 11 Relief. [See ECF No. 1]. Debtors’ cases are being jointly administered by order of this Court. [ECF No 30].

2. Prior to the Petition Date, Jackson Kelly PLLC (“Jackson Kelly”) rendered substantial legal services to Debtors in a wide range of areas. Debtors have retained Jackson Kelly – with this Courts authorization by its September 10, 2012, *Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Jackson Kelly PLLC as Special Counsel for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date* [ECF No. 540] (the “Jackson Kelly Employment Order”) – *nunc pro tunc* from the Petition Date to continue to render professional services in connection with (collectively the “Authorized Representation”):

- (a) Environmental matters relating to the Debtors’ coal leases, coal property, mines and other properties and installations;
- (b) Mine safety and health matters, including alleged violations of the Mine Safety and Health Act;
- (c) The defense of Federal Black Lung cases;
- (d) The defense of West Virginia deliberate intent litigation;
- (e) Litigation on behalf of one or more of the Debtors as a party plaintiff;
- (f) Litigation on behalf of one or more of the Debtors as a party defendant;
- (g) Local real estate and commercial transactions, as needed from time to time, which may not duplicate services provided by the Debtors’ other counsel;
- (h) Local legislative and lobbying services; and
- (i) Representation of one or more of the debtors in arbitration issues.

3. In accordance with the Jackson Kelly Employment Order and the *Order to Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the “Interim Compensation Order”), Jackson Kelly, as special counsel to the Debtors, hereby submits its Second Fee Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “Fee Statement”) for the period from September 1, 2012 through and including September 30, 2012 (the “Fee Statement Period”).

4. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jackson Kelly seeks payment of \$99,891.50 representing (a) 80% of Jackson Kelly’s fees for services rendered and (b) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Fee Statement Period.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a listing of Jackson Kelly’s professional and paraprofessionals (collectively the “Jackson Kelly Professional(s)”) that rendered services for Debtors as authorized by the Jackson Kelly Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period. Exhibit A includes the, among other things, the total hours billed, hourly rate and total fees for each Jackson Kelly Professional, plus a blended hourly rate for each category of Jackson Kelly Professional, excluding paralegals.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a schedule summarizing the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Jackson Kelly is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

7. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Jackson Kelly during the Fee Statement period for services authorized by the Jackson Kelly Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project type authorized by said Order. These services include all services that were typically rendered in the ordinary course for had been being provided to Debtors before the Petition Date, but only as specifically

authorized by the Jackson Kelly Employment Order in connection with the Authorized Representation.

8. Attached hereto as Exhibit D are the time records of Jackson Kelly, which provide the contemporaneous record summaries of the time spent by each Jackson Kelly Professional during the Fee Statement Period by project category.

9. The undersigned certifying professional hereby certifies and represents (i) that he has read this First Fee Statement; (ii) that to the best of his knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees and disbursements requested herein fall within this Court's guidelines and those of the United States Trustee; (iii) that the fees and disbursements sought herein are billed at rates in accordance with Jackson Kelly's customary practices and generally accepted by its clients; and (iv) that in providing reimbursable services, Jackson Kelly does not make a profit on the services.

#### **Notice**

10. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, Esq., (ii) attorneys for the Debtors, Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP, 450 Lexington Avenue, New York, New York 10017, Attn: Marshall S. Huebner, Esq. and Brian M. Resnick, Esq., (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York, 33 Whitehall Street, 21st Floor, New York, New York 10004, Attn: Elisabetta G. Gasparini, Esq. and Paul K. Schwartzberg, Esq., (iv) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein, Esq. and Joseph Smolinsky, Esq., and (b) Willkie Farr &

Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz, Esq. and Ana Alfonso, Esq., and (v) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq.

11. WHEREFORE, Jackson Kelly respectfully requests that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: October 19, 2012

Respectfully submitted,

**JACKSON KELLY PLLC**

/s/ Richard Grady Ford

William F. Dobbs, Jr. (WV Bar No. 1027)

Michael T. Cimino (WV Bar No. 6094)

Richard Grady Ford (WV Bar No. 11197)

JACKSON KELLY PLLC

500 Lee Street East, Suite 1600 (25301)

Post Office Box 553

Charleston, West Virginia 25322

Telephone (304) 340-1280

Facsimile (304) 340-1080

*Special Counsel to Debtors and  
Debtors in Possession*

**SCHEDULE 1**  
(Debtor Entities)

1. Affinity Mining Company
2. Apogee Coal Company, LLC
3. Appalachia Mine Services, LLC
4. Beaver Dam Coal Company, LLC
5. Big Eagle, LLC
6. Big Eagle Rail, LLC
7. Black Stallion Coal Company, LLC
8. Black Walnut Coal Company
9. Bluegrass Mine Services, LLC
10. Brook Trout Coal, LLC
11. Catenary Coal Company, LLC
12. Central States Coal Reserves of Kentucky, LLC
13. Charles Coal Company, LLC
14. Cleaton Coal Company
15. Coal Clean LLC
16. Coal Properties, LLC
17. Coal Reserve Holding Limited Liability Company No. 2
18. Colony Bay Coal Company
19. Cook Mountain Coal Company, LLC
20. Corydon Resources LLC
21. Coventry Mining Services, LLC
22. Coyote Coal Company LLC
23. Cub Branch Coal Company LLC
24. Dakota LLC
25. Day LLC
26. Dixon Mining Company, LLC
27. Dodge Hill Holding JV, LLC
28. Dodge Hill Mining Company, LLC
29. Dodge Hill of Kentucky, LLC
30. EACC Camps, Inc.
31. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC
32. Eastern Coal Company, LLC
33. Eastern Royalty, LLC
34. Emerald Processing, L.L.C.
35. Gateway Eagle Coal Company, LLC
36. Grand Eagle Mining, LLC
37. Heritage Coal Company LLC
38. Highland Mining Company, LLC
39. Hillside Mining Company
40. Hobet Mining, LLC
41. Indian Hill Company LLC
42. Infinity Coal Sales, LLC
43. Interior Holdings, LLC
44. IO Coal LLC
45. Jarrell's Branch Coal Company
46. Jupiter Holdings LLC
47. Kanawha Eagle Coal, LLC
48. Kanawha River Ventures I, LLC
49. Kanawha River Ventures II, LLC
50. Kanawha River Ventures III, LLC
51. KE Ventures, LLC
52. Little Creek LLC
53. Logan Fork Coal Company
54. Magnum Coal Company LLC
55. Magnum Coal Sales LLC
56. Martinka Coal Company, LLC
57. Midland Trail Energy LLC
58. Midwest Coal Resources II, LLC
59. Mountain View Coal Company, LLC
60. New Trout Coal Holdings II, LLC
61. Newtown Energy, Inc.
62. North Page Coal Corp.
63. Ohio County Coal Company, LLC
64. Panther LLC
65. Patriot Beaver Dam Holdings, LLC
66. Patriot Coal Company, L.P.
67. Patriot Coal Corporation
68. Patriot Coal Sales LLC
69. Patriot Coal Services LLC
70. Patriot Leasing Company LLC
71. Patriot Midwest Holdings, LLC
72. Patriot Reserve Holdings, LLC
73. Patriot Trading LLC
74. PCX Enterprises, Inc.
75. Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC
76. Pond Creek Land Resources, LLC
77. Pond Fork Processing LLC
78. Remington Holdings LLC
79. Remington II LLC
80. Remington LLC
81. Rivers Edge Mining, Inc.
82. Robin Land Company, LLC
83. Sentry Mining, LLC
84. Snowberry Land Company
85. Speed Mining LLC
86. Sterling Smokeless Coal Company, LLC
87. TC Sales Company, LLC
88. The Presidents Energy Company LLC
89. Thunderhill Coal LLC
90. Trout Coal Holdings, LLC
91. Union County Coal Co., LLC
92. Viper LLC
93. Weatherby Processing LLC
94. Wildcat Energy LLC
95. Wildcat, LLC
96. Will Scarlet Properties LLC
97. Winchester LLC
98. Winifrede Dock Limited Liability Company
99. Yankeetown Dock, LLC

**Exhibit A**

**I.A. Partners/Counsel**

<b>NAME OF PARTNER / COUNSEL</b>	<b>YEAR ADMITTED</b>	<b>MATTER AREA OF LAW</b>	<b>TOTAL HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL FEES</b>
Cimino, Michael T.	1993-WV	Deliberate Intent	63.60	\$235	\$ 14,946.00
Dobbs, Jr., William F.	1973-WV	Bankrupcty and Environmental	7.20	\$370	\$ 2,664.00
Gardner, Blair M.	2001-WV 1977-PA	Environmental	37.70	\$264	\$ 9,952.80
Harman, Ashley M.	1996-WV	Black Lung	0.40	\$225	\$ 90.00
Harvey, M. Shane	1994-WV	Deliberate Intent	14.90	\$330	\$ 4,917.00
Huffman, Timothy E.	1980-WV	Workers Comp	1.28	\$340	\$ 435.20
Hunter, Chris M.	2004-WV	Environmental	15.50	\$196	\$ 3,038.00
Mattingly, William S.	1993-PA 1987-WV 1985-OH	Black Lung	2.70	\$276	\$ 745.20
McFarland, Benjamin M.	2005-WV	Deliberate Intent	33.60	\$175	\$ 5,880.00
McLusky, Robert G.	1981-WV	Environmental	46.60	\$306	\$ 14,259.60
Moore, R. H.	1976-PA	Deliberate Intent	1.00	\$265	\$ 265.00
Oakley, Kenneth B.	2005-KY	Deliberate Intent	54.20	\$175	\$ 9,485.00
Rembrandt, Ann B.	1987-WV	Black Lung	4.30	\$234	\$ 1,006.20
Robinson, Melissa M.	1991-WV	Deliberate Intent	0.60	\$220	\$ 132.00
Roeder, George E.	1993-PA 1981-WV	Black Lung	0.90	\$276	\$ 248.40
Sebok, Al F.	1985-WV	Deliberate Intent	3.10	\$360	\$ 1,116.00
Snyder, Kathy L.	1998-PA 1992-WV	Black Lung	0.40	\$234	\$ 93.60
Tan, Francesca	1988-WV	Black Lung	3.80	\$240	\$ 912.00
<b>Total Partners and Counsel</b>			<b>291.78</b>		<b>\$ 70,186.00</b>

**II.A. Associates**

<b>NAME OF ASSOCIATE</b>	<b>YEAR ADMITTED</b>	<b>MATTER AREA OF LAW</b>	<b>TOTAL HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL FEES</b>
Ballard, William C.	2004-WV 2002-DC 2001-NC	Environmental	8.90	\$265	\$ 2,358.50
Ford, Richard G.	2010-WV	Bankruptcy	25.60	\$215	\$ 5,504.00
Gillen, Kevin T.	2011-WV	Black Lung	13.80	\$190	\$ 2,622.00
Green, Chris M.	2008-WV	Black Lung	4.90	\$174	\$ 852.60
Heishman, Aaron S.	2010-WV	Environmental	22.20	\$145	\$ 3,219.00
Holley, Amy J.	2010-WV	Black Lung	11.30	\$153	\$ 1,728.90
Hughes, Jennifer L.	2004-WV	Environmental	9.50	\$215	\$ 2,042.50
Kapushion, Meredith A.	2005-CO	Deliberate Intent	16.90	\$265	\$ 4,478.50
Karim, Waseem A.	2004-KY	Black Lung	0.70	\$191	\$ 133.70
Soukup, Jeffrey R.	2012-WV 2007-KY	Black Lung	0.40	\$183	\$ 73.20
Webb, Jason P.	2007-PA	Deliberate Intent	65.30	\$170	\$ 11,101.00
<b>Total Associates</b>			<b>179.50</b>		<b>\$ 34,113.90</b>

**IV.A. Paraprofessionals**

<b>NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>YEAR ADMITTED</b>	<b>MATTER AREA OF LAW</b>	<b>TOTAL HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL FEES</b>
Calhoun, KD F.		Black Lung	1.50	\$115	\$ 172.50
Colston, Leanna L.		Deliberate Intent	46.50	\$130	\$ 6,045.00
Hammonds, Judy S.		Black Lung	9.90	\$102	\$ 1,009.80
Mitchell, Janet L.		Black Lung	1.80	\$102	\$ 183.60
Roehl, Charles A.		Environmental	1.20	\$111	\$ 133.20
Sigley, Marisa L.		Black Lung	0.70	\$102	\$ 71.40
Smith, Delores D.		Black Lung	1.40	\$125	\$ 175.00
Smith, Paula R.		Black Lung	0.30	\$125	\$ 37.50
Taulbee, Melissa L.		Black Lung	0.80	\$125	\$ 100.00
Vigneron, Morganna		Black Lung	1.50	\$125	\$ 187.50
Werner, Shannon L.		Deliberate Intent	12.90	\$130	\$ 1,677.00
Zalewski, Larry A.		Deliberate Intent	14.30	\$125	\$ 1,787.50
<b>Total Paraprofessionals</b>			<b>92.80</b>		<b>\$ 11,580.00</b>

**Attorney Blended Rates**

<b>RANK</b>	<b>ATTORNEY BLENDED RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES</b>
<b>Partners and Counsel</b>	\$240.54	291.78	\$70,186.00
<b>Associates</b>	\$190.05	179.50	\$34,113.90
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$221.31</b>	<b>471.28</b>	<b>\$104,299.90</b>

**Exhibit B**

**ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES  
INCURRED BY JACKSON KELLY PLLC ON  
BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS IN SEPTEMBER 2012**

<b>CATEGORY OF EXPENSES</b>	<b>AMOUNTS</b>
Computerized Legal Research - Westlaw	\$ 789.62
Copies	\$ 480.80
Copies - Out of Office	\$ 393.16
Copies of Medical Records/Reports/and Hospital Service Charges	\$ 25.00
Courier	\$ 9.00
Court Reporter Fee	\$ 2,593.51
Deposition Expense	\$ 1,650.00
Long Distance Telephone	\$ 42.42
Pacer	\$ 0.70
Special Postage	\$ 325.84
Travel	\$ 829.83
Trial Exhibits	\$ 47.70
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$ 7,187.58</b>

**Exhibit C**

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED  
BY JACKSON KELLY PLLC - SEPTEMBER 2012  
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	C/M #	HOURS	AMOUNT
<b>1.</b>	<b>Bankruptcy</b>				<b>31.40</b>	<b>\$ 7,650.00</b>
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Fee Statements and Applications	20551.338	31.40	\$ 7,650.00
<b>2.</b>	<b>Black Lung</b>				<b>61.50</b>	<b>\$ 10,443.10</b>
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Barker, Carlos (deceased); Barbara S. Barker (widow)	101398.1042	4.30	\$ 514.30
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Creech, Rush	101398.1034	0.50	\$ 95.50
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Ellis, Donnie Eugene (deceased); Janice Alberta Ellis (widow)	101398.1065	0.90	\$ 115.40
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Mattas, Larry D.	101398.1067	1.30	\$ 294.40
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Miller, Donnie L.	101398.1063	2.40	\$ 662.40
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Nelson, Melvin	101398.1061	1.50	\$ 173.10
		Catenary Coal Company, LLC	Workman, Charles R.	101397.417	0.30	\$ 30.60
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Bella, Charles, III	2304.484	0.30	\$ 32.90
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Campbell, Carl H., Jr.	2304.389	4.10	\$ 994.80
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Epling, Carl R., Jr.	2304.454	0.70	\$ 113.50
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Hatfield, James E.	2304.476	0.10	\$ 12.50
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Terry, Harold (deceased); Adele Terry (widow)	2304.453	1.30	\$ 184.10
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Vance, Ermal L.	2304.459	0.20	\$ 32.70
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Workman, Carl E., II	2304.475	0.30	\$ 32.90
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood (deceased); Leota Farley (widow) v. Sharples Coal Corp.	20551.334	0.10	\$ 12.50
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood v. Sharples Coal Corp.	20551.333	14.50	\$ 2,731.80
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Morris, Lee v. Ashland Coal, Inc.	20551.336	1.50	\$ 208.70
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Powell, Homer J. (deceased); Betty Jo Powell (widow) v. Arch of KY	20551.337	2.80	\$ 321.80
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Sparks, Ted (deceased); Peggy Sparks (widow)	20551.339	0.40	\$ 93.60
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Sutphin, James E. v. Sharples Coal Corp.	20551.335	24.00	\$ 3,785.60
<b>3.</b>	<b>Environmental</b>				<b>143.00</b>	<b>\$ 35,521.60</b>
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. and WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc. v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC and Hobet Mining, LLC	101398.994	0.20	\$ 52.80
		Hobet Mining, LLC	OVEC Re: Hobet 22 Temporary Restraining Order Motion	2304.462	78.20	\$ 18,917.10
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Selenium Issues	2304.385	0.30	\$ 79.20
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. (OVEC); West Virginia Highlands Conservancy, Inc. and Sierra Club v. Patriot Coal Corporation, et al.	20551.322	64.30	\$ 16,472.50
<b>4.</b>	<b>Safety &amp; Health</b>				<b>326.90</b>	<b>\$ 61,830.00</b>
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000192932 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2009-1786	101398.1028	6.00	\$ 1,242.00
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000215712 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2010-934	101398.1043	0.70	\$ 91.00
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000248495 (Fanco); WEVA 2011-1228	101398.1044	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000253903 (Guyan Mine); Citations 8117869, 8117874, 8117875 and Order No. 8130042	101398.1048	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000268449 (Guyan Mine) WEVA 2012-162	101398.1054	0.10	\$ 13.00

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	C/M #	HOURS	AMOUNT
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Guyan Surface Mine/Richard Young, Jr. Fatality	101398.1047	5.30	\$ 1,055.00
		Catenary Coal Company, LLC	Samples Mine - 105(c) Scotty Saul Discrimination Complaint	101439.345	3.50	\$ 774.50
		Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000268580 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-163	19692.326	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000271463 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-287	19692.327	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000274249 (Dodge Hil Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-461	19692.328	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000277187 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-503	19692.329	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	105(c) Travis Catsonis; MORG-CD-2012-07	165.1493	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Bridgette Monteon 105(c) Discrimination Complaint Federal No. 2 Mine	165.1496	17.60	\$ 3,095.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000166204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2009-229	165.1479	1.30	\$ 189.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000222396 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-198	165.1427	3.00	\$ 496.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000243406 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-840	165.1438	0.30	\$ 37.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000244760 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-932	165.1436	15.00	\$ 2,618.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1190	165.1441	0.30	\$ 37.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1191	165.144	0.30	\$ 37.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000251444 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2011-1681 and WEVA 2011-1682	165.1447	1.90	\$ 255.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000254488 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-2057 and WEVA 2011-2058	165.1453	1.30	\$ 162.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000257610 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2151	165.1457	25.30	\$ 4,265.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000260205 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2188	165.1459	1.00	\$ 125.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000263159 (Federal No. 2)	165.1463	6.30	\$ 1,035.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000266251 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-20 and WEVA 2012-21	165.1465	16.90	\$ 2,819.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000270521 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-174	165.147	2.00	\$ 340.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000270852 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-427 and WEVA 2012-428	165.1476	1.20	\$ 150.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000273621 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-529 and WEVA 2012.530	165.148	1.20	\$ 150.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000281811 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-894 and WEVA 2012-895	165.1491	0.20	\$ 26.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000285356 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1085 and WEVA 2012-1086	165.1492	0.30	\$ 38.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000291117 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1368 and WEVA 2012-1369	165.1494	2.70	\$ 351.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 00248954 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-1437	165.1446	0.30	\$ 37.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine - Assessment 000276475	165.1486	0.40	\$ 54.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine - WEVA 2012-624; Assessment 000276264	165.1485	1.30	\$ 162.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Safety and Health Consultation	165.491	0.40	\$ 68.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Unsupported Roof NOVs (Federal No. 2 Mine) (Joe Statler)	165.1426	0.20	\$ 25.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	William Mark Stewart 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2)	165.1464	0.90	\$ 201.00
		Highland Mining Company, LLC	Case No. 000162446 (Highland 9 Mine)	18176.335	116.40	\$ 21,468.00
		Highland Mining Company, LLC	Case No. 000202199 (Highland 9 Mine) Part 50 Violations (Leslie Pride); WEVA KENT 2010-232	18176.342	0.10	\$ 13.00

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	C/M #	HOURS	AMOUNT
		Highland Mining Company, LLC	Case No. MADi-CSI-2007-02 (Highland No. 9) 110(c) Special Investigation D-1 Citation No. 6692995	18176.326	0.60	\$ 130.50
		Highland Mining Company, LLC	Leslie Pride (Highland 9 Mine) Discrimination Complaint No. MADi-CD-2009-11	18176.341	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Case No. 000250766 (Beth Station No. 79 Prep Plant) WEVA 2011-1561	2304.486	2.30	\$ 519.50
		Ohio County Coal Company, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	16540.345	0.50	\$ 62.50
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Big Mountain No. 16; Inundation of Water	17931.58	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000158162 (Big Mtn. No. 16); WEVA 2008-1623	17931.515	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000163290 (Big Mtn No. 16); WEVA 2008-432	17931.503	1.70	\$ 389.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000172189 (Big Mountain Mine No. 16) WEVA 2009-666 and WEVA 2009-667	17931.53	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000191598 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2009-1772	17931.564	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000197709; (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-19	17931.553	0.60	\$ 123.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000211876 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-745	17931.594	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000214479 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-855	17931.591	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000218088 (Big Mountain No. 16); Motion to Reopen	17931.566	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000221013 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2010-1168	17931.57	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000224417 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2010-1323	17931.597	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000236828 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-530	17931.581	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000239682 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-552	17931.585	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000242484 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-769	17931.598	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000248053 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1293	17931.599	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000250539 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1504	17931.596	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000253329 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1754	17931.604	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000256585 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1990	17931.609	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000259308 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-2178	17931.61	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000270891 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2012-258	17931.62	0.10	\$ 22.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	MSHA Assessment Investigation and Research	17931.63	0.50	\$ 117.50
		Remington, LLC	Winchester Mine; Order Nos. 7157212, 7157213, and 7157210	15446.33	41.10	\$ 11,833.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	101(c) Petition Fire Suppression Modification	100577.382	0.50	\$ 87.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	American Eagle Mine; WEVA 2012-996 and WEVA 2012-999	100577.379	2.70	\$ 441.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000213025 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-828	100577.349	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000215706 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-996	100577.348	0.40	\$ 65.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000224877 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-1324	100577.344	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000227784 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-1599	100577.345	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000245651 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1102	100577.353	0.90	\$ 121.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000250991 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1598	100577.358	2.00	\$ 260.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000253895 (American Eagle Mine): WEVA 2011-1917 and WEVA 2011-1918	100577.364	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000257054 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2036	100577.36	1.40	\$ 209.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000259753 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2207 and WEVA 2011-2208	100577.365	2.90	\$ 650.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000262590 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-2412	100577.366	2.40	\$ 330.00

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	C/M #	HOURS	AMOUNT
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000265768 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-17 and WEVA 2012-19	100577.367	8.70	\$ 1,284.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000268443 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-124	100577.369	3.20	\$ 434.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000274148 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-655	100577.372	0.10	\$ 13.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000277038 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-650	100577.375	0.30	\$ 59.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000282296 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-898	100577.377	0.20	\$ 26.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000284555 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-999	100577.38	1.40	\$ 204.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000285360 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1102	100577.378	8.90	\$ 1,499.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000291125 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1453	100577.381	4.40	\$ 572.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 175956 ( American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2009-871 & 2009-872	100577.308	2.50	\$ 566.50
<b>5.</b>	<b>Workers Comp</b>				<b>1.28</b>	<b>\$ 435.20</b>
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Refunds	20551.311	0.40	\$ 136.00
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Senate Bill Implementation	20551.306	0.88	\$ 299.20
<b>Total Hours and Compensation Requested:</b>					<b>564.08</b>	<b>\$ 115,879.90</b>

**Exhibit D**

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
<b>BANKRUPTCY</b>					
Patriot Coal Corporation	Fee Statements and Applications	Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/18/12	0.40	E-mail from Mr. Krause regarding initial fee statement deadline and requirements.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/18/12	0.60	Meeting with Accounting personnel to generate necessary fee statement documents.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/18/12	0.30	Meeting with G. Ford regarding internal procedures for fee statements.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/18/12	0.30	Numerous e-mails from Accounting.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/18/12	1.10	Reviewing requirements and Davis Polk fee statement.
		Ford, Richard G.	09/18/12	0.60	Participating in meeting regarding fee application with J. Lowen and W. Dobbs.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/19/12	0.50	Detailed e-mail to attorneys regarding Patriot fee statement issues and questions.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/19/12	0.30	Meeting with Accounting personnel to set up fee statement charts, etc.
		Ford, Richard G.	09/19/12	4.70	Begin drafting first fee application for services rendered from petition date to August 31, 2012 including demonstrative exhibits regarding same.
		Ford, Richard G.	09/19/12	1.80	Correspondence with H. Persinger to generate accounting exhibits needed for first fee application.
		Ford, Richard G.	09/19/12	1.10	Reviewing attorney billing narratives for completeness.
		Ford, Richard G.	09/19/12	0.80	Reviewing fee application guidelines for District Court.
		Ford, Richard G.	09/19/12	2.00	Working on sorting through Federal Black Lung liabilities for first fee application.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/20/12	0.50	Initial review of Jackson Kelly fee statement.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/20/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Krause regarding fee statement issues.
		Ford, Richard G.	09/20/12	4.50	Confirming billing narratives to Bankruptcy Court and Trustee's narrative requirements with assistance of billing attorney for first fee application.
		Ford, Richard G.	09/20/12	6.00	Reviewing fee application accounting exhibits regarding expenses and billed hours.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/21/12	1.20	Reviewing and revising first fee statement.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/21/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Krause regarding first fee statement.
		Ford, Richard G.	09/21/12	0.80	Corresponding with Davis Polk regarding filing fee statement.
Ford, Richard G.	09/21/12	2.10	Finalizing fee statement.		
Ford, Richard G.	09/21/12	0.60	Preparing fee statement for filing.		
Ford, Richard G.	09/21/12	0.60	Reviewing exhibit prepared by Accounting for first fee statement.		

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
<b>Fee Statements and Applications Total</b>				<b>31.40</b>	
<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>				<b>31.40</b>	
<b>BANKRUPTCY TOTAL</b>				<b>31.40</b>	
<b>FEDERAL BLACK LUNG</b>					
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Barker, Carlos (deceased); Barbara S. Barker (widow)	Hammonds, Judy S.	09/11/12	0.10	Correspondence to claimant's representative.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/11/12	0.20	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/11/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/17/12	0.20	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/18/12	0.30	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/18/12	0.30	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/19/12	0.30	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/19/12	0.30	Revising Administrative Law Judge evidence summary form.
		Green, Chris M.	09/20/12	0.60	Reviewing medical report(s) of Dr. Fahey, reviewing medicals and file, planning defense strategy regarding evidentiary development, drafting memorandum to legal assistant, reviewing and revising evidence summary form.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/20/12	0.20	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/20/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Smith, Delores D.	09/20/12	0.10	Telephone conference with personnel at physician's office.
		Green, Chris M.	09/21/12	0.10	Planning defense strategy.
		Smith, Delores D.	09/21/12	0.30	Arranging for deposition.
		Smith, Delores D.	09/21/12	0.40	Preparing notice of deposition.
		Smith, Delores D.	09/21/12	0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter.
		Smith, Delores D.	09/21/12	0.20	Telephone conference with physician.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/24/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/27/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
Hammonds, Judy S.	09/27/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.		
<b>Barker, Carlos (deceased); Barbara S. Barker (widow) Total</b>				<b>4.30</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Creech, Rush	Karim, Waseem A.	09/25/12	0.50	Reviewing motion for extension and working on motion to objection.
		<b>Creech, Rush Total</b>			<b>0.50</b>
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Ellis, Donnie Eugene (deceased); Janice Alberta Ellis (widow)	Green, Chris M.	09/04/12	0.20	Follow up regarding case status.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/04/12	0.10	Telephone conference with judge's clerk.
		Vigneron, Morganna	09/19/12	0.10	Correspondence to Wells Fargo Disability Management personnel.
		Vigneron, Morganna	09/19/12	0.10	Reviewing order.
		Vigneron, Morganna	09/19/12	0.20	Updating detailed file summary.
<b>Ellis, Donnie Eugene (deceased); Janice Alberta Ellis (widow) Total</b>				<b>0.90</b>	

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Mattas, Larry D.	Calhoun, KD F.	09/10/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence and docketing status of request.
		Calhoun, KD F.	09/11/12	0.20	Updating detailed file summary, reviewing correspondence, and docketing status of claim.
		Roeder, George E.	09/14/12	0.50	Reviewing correspondence regarding post-hearing evidence, correspondence to Wells Fargo Disability Management personnel, and preparing memorandum to file regarding instructions to legal assistant.
		Calhoun, KD F.	09/17/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Roeder, George E.	09/27/12	0.40	Reviewing transcript of hearing, reviewing file(s), and correspondence to Wells Fargo Disability Management personnel.
<b>Mattas, Larry D. Total</b>				<b>1.30</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Miller, Donnie L.	Mattingly, William S.	09/18/12	1.00	Correspondence to client's representative regarding opinion letter.
		Mattingly, William S.	09/18/12	0.50	Planning appellate strategy.
		Mattingly, William S.	09/18/12	0.90	Reviewing Benefits Review Board decision.
<b>Miller, Donnie L. Total</b>				<b>2.40</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Nelson, Melvin	Hammonds, Judy S.	09/14/12	0.50	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/14/12	0.50	Updating detailed file summary.
		Smith, Paula R.	09/17/12	0.30	Reviewing correspondence and updating detailed file summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/21/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	09/21/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from Department of Labor and reviewing claim regarding status of evidentiary development.
<b>Nelson, Melvin Total</b>				<b>1.50</b>	
<b>Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>10.90</b>	
Catenary Coal Company, LLC	Workman, Charles R.	Hammonds, Judy S.	09/13/12	0.10	Correspondence regarding medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/13/12	0.20	Reviewing medicals and file.
<b>Workman, Charles R. Total</b>				<b>0.30</b>	
<b>Catenary Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>0.30</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Bella, Charles, III	Hammonds, Judy S.	09/05/12	0.20	Correspondence returning x-ray to claimant's counsel.
		Vigneron, Morganna	09/05/12	0.10	Obtaining and cataloging chest x-rays.
<b>Bella, Charles, III Total</b>				<b>0.30</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Campbell, Carl H., Jr.	Tan, Francesca	09/17/12	0.30	Reviewing correspondences from Department of Labor and status of development.
		Tan, Francesca	09/19/12	2.00	Reviewing and analyzing Department of Labor's evidence review and rationale.
		Mattingly, William S.	09/21/12	0.30	Reviewing and revising submission to OWCP.
		Tan, Francesca	09/21/12	0.50	Preparing correspondence to Department of Labor.
		Tan, Francesca	09/21/12	1.00	Reviewing evidence.
<b>Campbell, Carl H., Jr. Total</b>				<b>4.10</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Epling, Carl R., Jr.	Harman, Ashley M.	09/07/12	0.10	Reviewing claimant's motion for extension.
		Calhoun, KD F.	09/18/12	0.40	Updating detailed file summary.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Harman, Ashley M.	09/26/12	0.20	Reviewing correspondence from Department of Labor regarding Solicitor's response brief and correspondence to client's representative.
	<b>Epling, Carl R., Jr. Total</b>			<b>0.70</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Hatfield, James E.	Vigneron, Morganna	09/19/12	0.10	Obtaining and cataloging chest x-rays, reviewing file(s), and updating claim summary.
	<b>Hatfield, James E. Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Terry, Harold (deceased); Adele Terry (widow)	Gillen, Kevin T.	09/06/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s) and verifying procedural status of case to determine proper litigation strategy after Supreme Court of United States decision on Stacy petition for certiorari.
		Snyder, Kathy L.	09/09/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s), reviewing and revising motion to withdraw appeal to United States Court of Appeals and case status report to client's representative.
		Calhoun, KD F.	09/10/12	0.30	Reviewing and revising case status report and motion to withdraw to United States Court of Appeals.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/11/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s), reviewing and revising case status report and recommendation regarding further litigation.
		Calhoun, KD F.	09/14/12	0.10	Reviewing files for status of miner's claim for litigation strategy.
		Calhoun, KD F.	09/17/12	0.10	Drafting correspondence to opposing counsel regarding required notifications of withdrawal motions.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/19/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from client's representative.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/25/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to legal assistant regarding follow-up with client's representative regarding recommendation.
		Calhoun, KD F.	09/26/12	0.10	Drafting letters to Solicitor and opposing counsel regarding required notification of withdrawal of appeals with Fourth Circuit Court of Appeals.
		Calhoun, KD F.	09/28/12	0.10	Preparing and organizing materials for local Rule 27 notification of motions to opposing counsel.
	<b>Terry, Harold (deceased); Adele Terry (widow) Total</b>			<b>1.30</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Vance, Ermal L.	Harman, Ashley M.	09/07/12	0.10	Reviewing Administrative Law Judge order regarding remand brief and preparing memorandum to file.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	09/07/12	0.10	Calendaring briefing deadline.
	<b>Vance, Ermal L. Total</b>			<b>0.20</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Workman, Carl E., II	Hammonds, Judy S.	09/20/12	0.20	Correspondence returning x-ray to hospital.
		Vigneron, Morganna	09/21/12	0.10	Obtaining and cataloging chest x-rays, reviewing file(s), and updating claim summary.
	<b>Workman, Carl E., II Total</b>			<b>0.30</b>	
<b>Hobet Mining, LLC Total</b>				<b>7.00</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood (deceased); Leota Farley (widow) v. Sharples Coal Corp.	Vigneron, Morganna	09/26/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
	<b>Farley, Elwood (deceased); Leota Farley (widow) v. Sharples Coal Corp. Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood v. Sharples Coal Corp.	Gillen, Kevin T.	09/10/12	0.30	Discussing litigation strategy regarding motion for reconsideration and claimant's response to motion.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/10/12	0.30	Reviewing claimant's brief.
		Soukup, Jeffrey R.	09/10/12	0.40	Conference with firm counsel regarding strategy for motion to reconsider and ongoing case strategy and reviewing filing on motion for reconsideration.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/12/12	0.50	Reviewing Administrative Law Judge order.
		Vigneron, Morganna	09/12/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/13/12	0.60	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge Lesniak regarding requesting copy of claimant's counsel's affidavit and inquiring as to response due date.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/13/12	2.10	Reviewing file(s) for documentary evidence proving falsity of allegations in claimant's counsel's affidavit.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/13/12	0.70	Reviewing new evidence from claimant and reviewing affidavit and notarized letter from claimant's counsel submitted per Administrative Law Judge order.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/13/12	0.20	Planning case strategy regarding modification.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/25/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s), determining case status, and determining action to be taken.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/26/12	0.60	Drafting e-mail to C. Hunter and staff in Charleston office advising claimant's counsel continued to mail filings to incorrect Jackson Kelly office and requesting they forward any correspondence regarding appeal to Morgantown as soon as possible.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/26/12	1.20	Reviewing Administrative Law Judge order regarding denial of modification in miner's claim and denial of survivor's benefits.
		Vigneron, Morganna	09/26/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/27/12	1.30	Legal research regarding Administrative Law Judge discretion in weighing evidence and case law supporting argument in favor of broad discretion.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/27/12	0.70	Legal research regarding standards for Administrative Law Judge determining if medical report is reasoned and documented.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/27/12	1.50	Preparing draft brief.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/27/12	0.60	Reviewing Administrative Law Judge order for issues raised in claimant's motion.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	09/27/12	0.80	Reviewing claimant's brief.
Gillen, Kevin T.	09/28/12	2.40	Reviewing plaintiff's brief section regarding no abuse or discretion.		
<b>Farley, Elwood v. Sharples Coal Corp. Total</b>				<b>14.50</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Morris, Lee v. Ashland Coal, Inc.	Hammonds, Judy S.	09/06/12	0.20	Reviewing medicals and file and telephone conference with judge's clerk.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/10/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file and telephone conference with personnel at physician's office.
		Vigneron, Morganna	09/10/12	0.40	Reviewing order, correspondence to Wells Fargo Disability Management personnel, and updating detailed file summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/21/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Smith, Delores D.	09/21/12	0.10	Correspondence to Wells Fargo Disability Management personnel.
		Smith, Delores D.	09/21/12	0.20	Reviewing order.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	09/25/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with C. Green and conference with Administrative Law Judge confirming continuation of hearing.
	<b>Morris, Lee v. Ashland Coal, Inc. Total</b>			<b>1.50</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Powell, Homer J. (deceased); Betty Jo Powell (widow) v. Arch of KY	Mitchell, Janet L.	09/04/12	0.20	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from Dr. Castle regarding status of report.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	09/05/12	0.20	Telephone conference with judge's clerk and preparing memorandum to file.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	09/06/12	0.10	Telephone conference with judge's clerk.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	09/06/12	0.30	Reviewing order of continuance and updating file and calendar regarding same.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	09/10/12	0.20	Updating detailed file summary with procedural history.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	09/10/12	0.20	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from Dr. Castle's office regarding cancellation of deposition and e-mail to court reporter regarding cancellation.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	09/11/12	0.30	Reviewing correspondence regarding continuance, reviewing file(s) to check status of tasks, and reviewing additional correspondence.
		Karim, Waseem A.	09/12/12	0.20	Reviewing order continuing hearing and correspondence to client's representative.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	09/14/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s) regarding status of chest films and telephone conference(s) with hospital personnel.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	09/17/12	0.90	Reviewing correspondence regarding medical request, correspondence to physician(s), reviewing and catalog medical evidence, arranging for review of x-rays by radiologist(s), docketing and calendaring status of request.
	<b>Powell, Homer J. (deceased); Betty Jo Powell (widow) v. Arch of KY Total</b>			<b>2.80</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Sparks, Ted (deceased); Peggy Sparks (widow)	Rembrandt, Ann B.	09/21/12	0.40	Reviewing correspondence from Department of Labor, reviewing file(s), correspondence to client's representative, and e-mail to claimant's representative requesting copy of motion for modification.
	<b>Sparks, Ted (deceased); Peggy Sparks (widow) Total</b>			<b>0.40</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Sutphin, James E. v. Sharples Coal Corp.	Vigneron, Morganna	09/04/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		Green, Chris M.	09/06/12	0.60	Reviewing file(s), reviewing and revising prehearing report and evidence summary, reviewing Director's exhibits, planning defense strategy regarding evidentiary development, drafting memorandum to legal assistant, completing and filing prehearing report and evidence summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/06/12	0.10	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/06/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/06/12	0.10	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Green, Chris M.	09/07/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from Department of Labor.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/11/12	0.50	Correspondence to physicians.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/11/12	1.00	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/11/12	1.00	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/12/12	0.10	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/12/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/13/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/13/12	0.10	Telephone conference with personnel at physician's office.
		Green, Chris M.	09/14/12	0.20	Follow up regarding case status of evidentiary development, reviewing file(s), planning defense strategy, and preparing letter to client's representative.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/14/12	0.20	Arranging for review of x-rays by radiologist(s).
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/14/12	0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/14/12	0.10	Telephone conference with Department of Labor personnel.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/14/12	0.10	Telephone conference with personnel at physician's office.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/14/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/14/12	0.10	E-mail to claimant's counsel regarding x-ray reading and deposition.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/14/12	1.20	Preparing deposition notes.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/14/12	0.50	Reviewing files.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/14/12	2.80	Reviewing medical reports of Drs. Ranavaya, Crisalli, Rasmussen, Zaldivar, Spian, Habre, and Fino.
		Snyder, Kathy L.	09/14/12	0.30	Reviewing medicals and file regarding planning deposition strategy regarding new radiographic evidence.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/16/12	0.80	Preparing for deposition of Dr. Fino.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/17/12	1.00	Preparing for deposition.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/17/12	1.00	Representing client at deposition in Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/17/12	3.00	Travel to and from Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania for deposition.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	09/17/12	1.30	Preparing for deposition.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	09/18/12	0.30	Post-deposition conference with physician.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	09/18/12	0.40	Preparing deposition report.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	09/18/12	0.90	Representing client at deposition of Dr. Zaldivar in Charleston, West Virginia.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	09/18/12	0.60	Waiting for physician and conference with physician in preparation of scheduled deposition.
		Green, Chris M.	09/20/12	0.30	Reviewing medicals and file, planning defense strategy regarding hearing, and follow up regarding case status.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/25/12	0.10	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/25/12	0.10	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/25/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.
		Green, Chris M.	09/26/12	0.30	Drafting hearing outline.
		Green, Chris M.	09/26/12	0.50	Preparing for hearing.
		Green, Chris M.	09/26/12	0.40	Reviewing Director's exhibits.
		Green, Chris M.	09/26/12	0.60	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/26/12	0.20	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/26/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/26/12	0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/26/12	0.10	Telephone conference with personnel at physician's office.
		Green, Chris M.	09/27/12	0.80	Representing client at hearing in Charleston, West Virginia.
		Green, Chris M.	09/27/12	0.20	Waiting for hearing to be called.
		Holley, Amy J.	09/27/12	0.30	Reviewing deposition transcript of Dr. Fino and reviewing evidentiary submission letter.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	09/27/12	0.60	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge and correspondence to claimant's representative.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	09/28/12	0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter.
	<b>Sutphin, James E. v. Sharples Coal Corp. Total</b>			<b>24.00</b>	
<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>				<b>43.30</b>	
<b>BLACK LUNG TOTAL</b>				<b>61.50</b>	

**ENVIRONMENTAL**

Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. and WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc. v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC and Hobet Mining, LLC	Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	0.20	Reviewing and filing status report.
<b>Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. and WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc. v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC and Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>0.20</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	OVEC Re: Hobet 22 Temporary Restraining Order Motion	Gardner, Blair M.	09/06/12	2.40	Continue revising motions.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/07/12	0.80	Revising memorandum of law in support.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/07/12	3.20	Revising motion to modify existing orders in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/07/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with client, M. Daneker, and Arnold and Porter.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/07/12	0.20	Editing memorandum of law in support of motion to modify court orders requiring selenium treatment at Hobet.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/07/12	0.20	Conference call with client's representative and co-counsel regarding motion to extend compliance period.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/07/12	0.10	Conference call with S. Schwartz and client's representative.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/07/12	0.80	Reviewing and editing memorandum.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/08/12	1.80	Reviewing declarations submitted in bankruptcy proceeding.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/08/12	0.80	Revising memorandum of law in support.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/08/12	0.90	Revising motion to expedite briefing schedule in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/08/12	1.40	Revising motions to modify existing orders in case.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/08/12	3.80	Legal research regarding modifying court orders under Rule 60(b)(6) due to changed financial circumstances.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/08/12	1.90	Revising memorandum of law in support of modification of court orders requiring selenium treatment at Hobet to also seek relief from global consent decree.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/08/12	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/08/12	0.70	Working on motion and memorandum to delay compliance.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/09/12	1.10	Editing memorandum of law in support of motion to modify court orders requiring selenium treatment at Hobet.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/09/12	0.80	Continue working on brief and memorandum to delay compliance at Hobet 22, et al.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/09/12	0.60	Reviewing correspondence from multiple parties and editing pleadings.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	0.20	Reviewing and file status report.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	0.80	Revising memorandum of law in support.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	0.70	Revising motion to expedite briefing schedule in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	1.20	Revising motion to modify existing orders in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with client, M. Daneker, and Arnold and Porter regarding memorandum of law.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with client.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/10/12	3.30	Legal research regarding modification of a consent decree based on notion that economic down turn constitutes changed circumstances.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/10/12	2.80	Legal research regarding modification of consent decrees or court orders requiring environmental compliance on grounds that restrictions are financially burdensome.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/10/12	2.40	Continue working on affidavits and pleadings regarding extension request and reviewing comments from various client representatives.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/10/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister and R. Verheij.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/10/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Bean regarding loan covenants, liquidity and letter of credit.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/11/12	0.80	Revising memorandum of law in support.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/11/12	0.60	Revising motion to expedite briefing schedule in case.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/11/12	1.60	Revising motion to modify existing orders in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/11/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with client.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/11/12	2.40	Legal research regarding whether economic down turn constitutes changed circumstances for purposes of modifying a consent decree or court order.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/11/12	0.90	Proofreading and editing memorandum of law in support of motion to modify court orders requiring selenium treatment at Hobet.
		Ballard, William C.	09/12/12	1.10	Drafting memorandum regarding legal research regarding jurisdiction of Judge Chambers to extend the effective date of orders entered against Patriot.
		Ballard, William C.	09/12/12	1.10	Legal research regarding jurisdiction of Judge Chambers to extend the effective date of orders entered against Patriot.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/12/12	0.30	Meeting with A. McCallister and R. Verheij.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/12/12	0.70	Revising motion to modify existing orders in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/12/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Davis Polk.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/12/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with District Court.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/12/12	0.80	Legal research regarding legal standards required to modify a court order under Rule 60(b)(5) rather than 60(b)(6).
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/12/12	0.50	Conference call to prepare for telephonic status report and request for temporary stay to Federal Court, telephonic hearing with Court, and follow-up call with client's representatives.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/12/12	0.20	Legal research for briefing on request for extension of deadlines.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/12/12	0.20	Reviewing correspondence from client regarding edits to motion for extension of deadlines and discussing same.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/12/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with co-counsel.
		Ballard, William C.	09/13/12	1.40	Drafting memorandum regarding legal research regarding jurisdiction of Judge Chambers to extend the effective date of orders entered against Patriot.
		Ballard, William C.	09/13/12	1.50	Legal research regarding jurisdiction of Judge Chambers to extend the effective date of orders entered against Patriot.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/13/12	0.40	Meeting with R. McLusky and planning strategy regarding issues raised by plaintiffs vis-à-vis motion to stay order.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/13/12	2.10	Legal research regarding whether automatic stay that is triggered when one files for bankruptcy applies to criminal penalties under Clean Water Act.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	0.10	Continue working on exhibits and brief.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	0.10	Telephone conference with client's representative.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	0.30	Working on declaration of expert witnesses.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	1.70	Working on motion and memorandum to extend compliance deadlines.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		Roehl, Charles A.	09/13/12	0.60	Updating pleadings file and index.
		Ballard, William C.	09/14/12	1.90	Drafting memorandum regarding legal research regarding jurisdiction of Judge Chambers to extend the effective date of orders entered against Patriot.
		Ballard, William C.	09/14/12	1.90	Legal research regarding jurisdiction of Judge Chambers to extend the effective date of orders entered against Patriot.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/14/12	0.30	Meeting with R. McLusky regarding planning strategy for motion to stay order pending court decision.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/14/12	1.40	Reviewing submission to be made to District Court.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/14/12	0.60	Telephone conference(s) with Arnold and Porter and Davis Polk.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/14/12	1.40	Telephone conference(s) with creditor's counsel.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/14/12	0.10	Legal research regarding ability of criminal Clean Water Act liability to be preempted by automatic stay imposed by bankruptcy code.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/14/12	0.40	Conference calls with client's representatives, co-counsel and creditors committee.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/14/12	0.10	Telephone conference with client's representative regarding motion and memorandum regarding extension.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/14/12	0.30	Telephone conference with opposing counsel and correspondence to opposing counsel regarding motion for extension.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/14/12	2.20	Working on motion and memorandum for extension.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	09/16/12	2.80	Legal research regarding whether consent decree language allowing modification to consent decree only after agreement of all parties can prevent a court from modifying a consent decree under Rule 60(b)(5).
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/16/12	0.20	Conference call with bankruptcy counsel.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/16/12	0.10	Correspondence to bankruptcy counsel.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/16/12	1.00	Legal research regarding judicial ability to modify decree under Rule 60(b).
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/16/12	0.70	Working on pleadings in District Court regarding motion to extend briefing schedule and treatment deadline.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.20	Conference call with co-counsel.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.30	Conference call with Court.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.20	Correspondence to client's representative regarding hearing before District Court.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.10	Finalizing draft pleading for District Court regarding relief from outstanding briefing order.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.30	Preparing for conference call with Court.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.40	Reviewing and editing draft pleading from Bankruptcy Court.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Judge Chambers' Docket Clerk to set up telephonic hearing.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/18/12	0.10	Correspondence to bankruptcy counsel regarding draft slides on selenium compliance issues.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/19/12	0.20	Reviewing proposed PowerPoint for unsecured creditors committee regarding history of selenium compliance requirements.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/21/12	0.90	Reviewing file(s) and conference call regarding PowerPoint presentation to unsecured creditors' committee.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/23/12	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative regarding 60(b) issues regarding outstanding consent orders and permit blocking.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/23/12	0.40	Legal research regarding permit liability.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/23/12	0.30	Working on outline of Rule 60(b) issues regarding outstanding consent orders and permit blocking for call with creditors' committee.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/24/12	0.70	Preparing for and participating in conference call with bankruptcy counsel and counsel for unsecured creditors' committee to discuss selenium compliance strategies.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/24/12	0.20	Reviewing testimony of Dr. Margaret Palmer regarding selenium-induced fish deformities in Mud River and correspondence to client's representative regarding same.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/25/12	0.80	Conference call with client's representatives and unsecured creditors' committee.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/25/12	0.20	Correspondence to client's representative regarding permit blocking issues.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/25/12	0.60	Legal research regarding permit blocking and SMCRA issues.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/25/12	0.20	Locating and reviewing testimony of Mr. Schroeder in prior selenium proceedings.
		Roehl, Charles A.	09/25/12	0.20	Updating pleadings file and index for OVEC versus Hobet, WVSD 3:09-cv-1167.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/26/12	0.30	Reviewing and commenting on draft global settlement proposal.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/26/12	0.30	Reviewing and commenting on draft motion to lift bankruptcy stay regarding selenium compliance dates.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/26/12	0.10	Telephone conference with client's representative regarding settlement.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.20	Correspondence to client's representative regarding corporate structure and reviewing response.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.10	Correspondence to H. Baker and Davis Polk regarding permit blocking issues.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.30	Reviewing and commenting on draft motion to lift bankruptcy stay.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.40	Reviewing and editing memorandum regarding permit blocking.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.20	Telephone conference with client's representative regarding corporate structure.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/28/12	0.30	Reviewing new draft of motion to lift stay and commenting on same.
	<b>OVEC Re: Hobet 22 Temporary Restraining Order Motion Total</b>			<b>78.20</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Selenium Issues	Gardner, Blair M.	09/06/12	0.10	Forwarding order to client and opposing counsel.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/06/12	0.20	Reviewing order entered by Circuit Court.
	<b>Selenium Issues Total</b>			<b>0.30</b>	
<b>Hobet Mining, LLC Total</b>				<b>78.50</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. (OVEC); West Virginia Highlands Conservancy, Inc. and Sierra Club v. Patriot Coal Corporation, et al.	Gardner, Blair M.	09/04/12	2.40	Revising AVS memorandum per client.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/04/12	0.10	Transmitting memorandum to DPW.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/05/12	0.80	Revising AVS memorandum per client's instructions.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/05/12	0.80	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/05/12	0.80	Telephone conference(s) with H. Baker, A. Turner, and DPW.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/07/12	0.80	Revising memorandum of law in support.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/07/12	1.80	Revising motion to modify existing consent decree in case.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/07/12	0.20	Conference call with client's representative and co-counsel regarding motion to extend compliance period.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/07/12	0.10	Conference call with S. Schwartz and client's representative.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/07/12	0.80	Reviewing and editing memorandum.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/08/12	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/08/12	0.80	Working on motion and memorandum to delay compliance.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/09/12	0.80	Continue working on brief and memorandum to delay compliance at Hobet 22, et al.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/09/12	0.70	Reviewing correspondence from multiple parties and editing pleadings.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	0.70	Revising memorandum of law in support.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	1.00	Revising motion to modify existing decree in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with client, M. Daneker, and Arnold and Porter regarding memorandum of law.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/10/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with client.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/10/12	2.40	Continue working on affidavits and pleadings regarding extension request and reviewing comments from various client representatives.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/10/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister and R. Verheij.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/10/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Bean regarding loan covenants, liquidity and letter of credit.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/11/12	0.80	Revising memorandum of law in support.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/11/12	0.60	Revising motion to expedite briefing schedule in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/11/12	1.60	Revising motion to modify existing consent decree in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/11/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with client.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/12/12	0.30	Meeting with A. McCallister and R. Verheij.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/12/12	0.70	Revising motion to modify existing consent decree in case.
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/12/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Davis Polk.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		Gardner, Blair M.	09/12/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with District Court.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/12/12	0.50	Conference call to prepare for telephonic status report and request for temporary stay to Federal Court, telephonic hearing with Court, and follow-up call with client's representatives.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/12/12	0.20	Legal research for briefing on request for extension of deadlines.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/12/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from client regarding edits to motion for extension of deadlines and discussing same.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/12/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from client regarding status of motion to extend selenium compliance deadline.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/12/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with co-counsel.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/13/12	0.40	Meeting with R. McLusky and planning strategy regarding issues raised by plaintiffs vis-à-vis motion to stay order.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	0.10	Additional telephone conference with client's representative.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	0.30	Conference call with bankruptcy lawyers and client's representatives.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	0.40	Conference call with bankruptcy lawyers and client's representatives.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	0.10	Continue working on exhibits and brief.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	0.10	Telephone conference with client's representative.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	0.30	Working on declaration of expert witnesses.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/13/12	1.80	Working on motion and memorandum to extend compliance deadlines.
		Roehl, Charles A.	09/13/12	0.40	Updating pleadings file and index.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	09/14/12	0.30	Meeting with R. McLusky regarding planning strategy for motion to stay order pending court decision.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/14/12	0.50	Conference calls with client's representatives, co-counsel and creditors committee.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/14/12	0.10	Telephone conference with client's representative regarding motion and memorandum regarding extension.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/14/12	0.30	Telephone conference with opposing counsel and correspondence to opposing counsel regarding motion for extension.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/14/12	2.20	Working on motion and memorandum for extension.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/16/12	0.20	Conference call with bankruptcy counsel.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/16/12	1.10	Legal research regarding judicial ability to modify decree under Rule 60(b).
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/16/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from bankruptcy counsel regarding motions to modify consent decree.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/16/12	0.80	Working on pleadings in District Court regarding motion to extend briefing schedule and treatment deadline.
		Hughes, Jennifer L.	09/17/12	0.30	Drafting memorandum.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		Hughes, Jennifer L.	09/17/12	1.20	Research case law regarding FOIA exemption for trade secrets.
		Hughes, Jennifer L.	09/17/12	1.50	Research question regarding confidential business information regarding NPDES permit applications.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.20	Conference call with co-counsel.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.30	Conference call with Court.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.30	Correspondence to client's representative regarding hearing before District Court.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.10	Finalizing draft pleading for District Court regarding relief from outstanding briefing order.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.30	Preparing for conference call with Court.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.40	Reviewing and editing draft pleading from Bankruptcy Court.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/17/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Judge Chambers' Docket Clerk to set up telephonic hearing.
		Hughes, Jennifer L.	09/18/12	2.00	Drafting memorandum regarding confidential business information in NPDES permit application.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/18/12	0.10	Correspondence to bankruptcy counsel regarding draft slides on selenium compliance issues.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/19/12	0.20	Reviewing proposed PowerPoint for unsecured creditors committee regarding history of selenium compliance requirements.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/23/12	0.40	Legal research regarding permit liability.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/23/12	0.30	Working on outline of Rule 60(b) issues regarding outstanding consent orders and permit blocking for call with creditors' committee.
		Hughes, Jennifer L.	09/24/12	2.50	Research submission of confidential business information with NPDES permit application.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/24/12	0.70	Preparing for and participating in conference call with bankruptcy counsel and counsel for unsecured creditors' committee to discuss selenium compliance strategies.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/24/12	0.30	Reviewing testimony of Dr. Margaret Palmer regarding selenium-induced fish deformities in Mud River and correspondence to client's representative regarding same.
		Hunter, Chris M.	09/25/12	4.70	Legal research regarding Federal Regulation comments on "upstream" permit blocking, permit blocking in West Virginia, and administrative opinions on permit blocking.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/25/12	0.90	Conference call with client's representatives and unsecured creditors' committee.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/25/12	0.30	Correspondence to client's representative regarding permit blocking issues.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/25/12	0.50	Legal research regarding permit blocking and SMCRA issues.

**Time Detail By Project - September 2012**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/25/12	0.30	Locating and reviewing testimony of Mr. Schroeder in prior selenium proceedings.
		Hunter, Chris M.	09/26/12	7.30	Drafting ownership and control memorandum outlining difference between permit blocking at Federal and State level and explaining who can be permit blocked in West Virginia.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/26/12	0.40	Reviewing and commenting on draft global settlement proposal.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/26/12	0.20	Reviewing and commenting on draft motion to lift bankruptcy stay regarding selenium compliance dates.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/26/12	0.10	Telephone conference with client's representative regarding motion.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/26/12	0.10	Telephone conference with client's representative regarding settlement.
		Hughes, Jennifer L.	09/27/12	2.00	Drafting e-mail to A. McCallister regarding submission of confidential business information to West Virginia Department of Environmental Protection.
		Hunter, Chris M.	09/27/12	3.50	Reviewing and revising ownership and control memorandum outlining difference between permit blocking at Federal and State level and explaining who can be permit blocked in West Virginia.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.20	Correspondence to client's representative regarding corporate structure and reviewing response.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.10	Correspondence to H. Baker and Davis Polk regarding permit blocking issues.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.30	Reviewing and commenting on draft motion to lift bankruptcy stay.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.40	Reviewing and editing memorandum regarding permit blocking.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.20	Telephone conference with client's representative regarding corporate structure.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/27/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Baker regarding permit blocking issues.
		McLusky, Robert G.	09/28/12	0.40	Reviewing new draft of motion to lift stay and commenting on same.
<b>Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. (OVEC); West Virginia Highlands Conservancy, Inc. and Sierra Club v.</b>				<b>64.30</b>	
<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>				<b>64.30</b>	
<b>ENVIRONMENTAL TOTAL</b>				<b>143.00</b>	

**SAFETY & HEALTH**

Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000192932 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2009-1786	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.30	Reviewing counter offer received from Secretary and updating settlement chart.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative	
			Date	Hours		
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/06/12	0.30	E-mail traffic with Mr. Presler regarding settlement.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/06/12	0.30	E-mail traffic with Mr. Wellman regarding settlement.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/06/12	0.50	Reviewing and analyzing Secretary of Labor's offer.	
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/06/12	0.40	Reviewing proposal from Solicitor and updating settlement chart to prepare for conference with Administrative Law Judge.	
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/06/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Administrative Law Judge regarding conference.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/07/12	0.30	Conference call with Administrative Law Judge and Secretary of Labor.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/07/12	0.30	E-mail traffic with counsel regarding settlement.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/07/12	0.10	Telephone conference with client's representative regarding settlement.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/07/12	0.80	Working on settlement.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/10/12	0.30	Preparing for conference call with Ms. Wellman.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/10/12	0.20	Telephone conference with Ms. Wellman regarding settlement.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/12/12	0.50	Working on settlement.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/13/12	0.30	E-mail traffic regarding settlement.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/13/12	0.50	Working on settlement.	
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.40	Preparing settlement chart.	
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.	
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Reviewing offers and counter offers from Solicitor.	
		<b>Case No. 000192932 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2009-1786 Total</b>			<b>6.00</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000215712 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2010-934	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.50	Preparing settlement chart.	
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.	
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Reviewing offers and counter offers from Solicitor.	
		<b>Case No. 000215712 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2010-934 Total</b>			<b>0.70</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000248495 (Fanco); WEVA 2011-1228	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.	
		<b>Case No. 000248495 (Fanco); WEVA 2011-1228 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000253903 (Guyan Mine); Citations 8117869, 8117874, 8117875 and Order No. 8130042	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.	
		<b>Case No. 000253903 (Guyan Mine); Citations 8117869, 8117874, 8117875 and Order No. 8130042 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000268449 (Guyan Mine) WEVA 2012-162	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.	
		<b>Case No. 000268449 (Guyan Mine) WEVA 2012-162 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Guyan Surface Mine/Richard Young, Jr. Fatality	Cimino, Michael T.	09/13/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with D. Wellman regarding defenses to citations.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/17/12	0.50	Working on settlement.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/18/12	1.30	Legal research regarding 48.27 requirements and application.	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/18/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with C. Brumley regarding settlement.	
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.	

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/18/12	3.00	Legal research regarding validity of Citations 8116890 and 8116891.
<b>Guyan Surface Mine/Richard Young, Jr. Fatality Total</b>				<b>5.30</b>	
<b>Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>12.30</b>	
Catenary Coal Company, LLC	Samples Mine - 105(c) Scotty Saul Discrimination Complaint	McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/04/12	0.50	Reviewing and analyzing position statement and complaint and working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/06/12	1.00	Working on issues regarding 105(c) complaint.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/13/12	0.20	Reviewing correspondence from E. Waller.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/17/12	1.10	Working on issues regarding 105(c) complaint.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/20/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from E. Waller.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/21/12	0.30	Reviewing and analyzing position statement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/26/12	0.30	E-mail traffic with E. Waller.
<b>Samples Mine - 105(c) Scotty Saul Discrimination Complaint Total</b>				<b>3.50</b>	
<b>Catenary Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>3.50</b>	
Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000268580 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-163	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
<b>Case No. 000268580 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-163 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000271463 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-287	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
<b>Case No. 000271463 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-287 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000274249 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-461	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
<b>Case No. 000274249 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-461 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000277187 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-503	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
<b>Case No. 000277187 (Dodge Hill Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-503 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
<b>Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC Total</b>				<b>0.40</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	105(c) Travis Catsonis; MORG-CD-2012-07	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
<b>105(c) Travis Catsonis; MORG-CD-2012-07 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Bridgette Monteon 105(c) Discrimination Complaint Federal No. 2 Mine	Cimino, Michael T.	09/14/12	0.40	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding new claim.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/14/12	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/17/12	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/18/12	0.50	Conducting investigation into facts underlying 105(c) investigation and working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/25/12	0.20	Preparing for meeting with client.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/25/12	0.50	Working on issues regarding investigation into underlying 105(c) complaint.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/26/12	0.50	Legal research regarding issues regarding 105(c) discrimination claim.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		
			Date	Hours	Narrative
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/26/12	0.40	Working on issues regarding factual underlying 105(c) claim.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/26/12	0.80	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/27/12	7.00	Interviewing witnesses at mine regarding underlying 105(c) claim.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/27/12	0.80	Reviewing and analyzing file.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/27/12	1.00	Working on issues regarding position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/28/12	0.30	Conducting investigation into underlying issue claim.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/28/12	0.80	Reviewing and analyzing file.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/28/12	0.90	Working on position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/29/12	0.40	Reviewing and analyzing file.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/29/12	0.60	Working on position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/30/12	0.50	Reviewing and analyzing file.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/30/12	0.10	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/30/12	0.90	Working on position statement.
		<b>Bridgette Monteon 105(c) Discrimination Complaint Federal No. 2 Mine Total</b>		<b>17.60</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000166204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2009-229	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/07/12	0.40	Collecting and reviewing citations and inspector's notes and preparing same for settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/11/12	0.20	E-mail Solicitor to request notes and reviewing notes.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/11/12	0.30	Collecting and reviewing MSHA citations and other materials for settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/19/12	0.10	E-mail regarding assessment of penalty.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/19/12	0.10	E-mail to R. Phillips regarding delay.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/19/12	0.20	Reviewing and responding to R. Phillips.
		<b>Case No. 000166204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2009-229 Total</b>		<b>1.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000222396 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-198	Webb, Jason P.	09/06/12	0.20	E-mail Clerk regarding settlement and orders.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/06/12	0.30	Reviewing prehearing order and status regarding settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	0.20	E-mail to R. Wyatt and K. Blant regarding status.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	1.00	Legal research regarding outstanding B orders.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	0.10	Telephone call to K. Blant.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	0.20	Telephone call with R. Phillips.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	0.20	Telephone call with R. Wyatt.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/10/12	0.20	Telephone call to Harner's Clerk and e-mail Solicitor.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/19/12	0.20	E-mail to A. Lagne.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/19/12	0.40	Telephone call with M. Malachi regarding outstanding borders.
		<b>Case No. 000222396 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-198 Total</b>		<b>3.00</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000243406 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-840	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/24/12	0.30	Pulling and reviewing decision approving settlement regarding delinquency.
		<b>Case No. 000243406 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-840 Total</b>		<b>0.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000244760 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-932	Webb, Jason P.	09/04/12	0.70	Consulting with H. Moore.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/04/12	0.20	E-mail E. Waller.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/04/12	0.20	E-mail Solicitor.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	0.40	Reviewing Solicitor's response, reviewing inspector's notes, and e-mail regarding Mammoth order permitting amendment to pleading.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/10/12	0.70	Reviewing motion, discussing with A. Wolfson, and e-mail H. Moore following review.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/11/12	0.80	Reviewing Secretary's reply to motion to compel and legal research.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/12/12	0.20	E-mail H. Moore regarding reply to Solicitor's response.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/12/12	0.40	Reviewing Feldman motion in Mammoth Coal.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/12/12	0.40	Reviewing motion.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/12/12	0.20	Reviewing and updating case summary regarding Solicitor's opposition to motion to compel.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/13/12	1.00	Legal research regarding response to motion to compel.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/13/12	1.00	Preparing response to motion to compel.
		Moore, R. H.	09/14/12	0.50	Reviewing response to Department of Labor's response.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/14/12	6.50	Preparing reply to Secretary's response to motion to compel.
		Moore, R. H.	09/17/12	0.50	Reviewing response to response to motion.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/17/12	0.70	Editing response, preparing to send response, telephone call with R. Phillips, and preparing exhibits.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/17/12	0.20	Reviewing and updating case summary regarding motion to compel and status.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/24/12	0.20	Reviewing for results and consulting with H. Moore.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/27/12	0.20	Reviewing documents received via FOIA request and updating case summary.
	<b>Case No. 000244760 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-932 Total</b>			<b>15.00</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1190	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/12/12	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summary regarding settlement of penalties and Administrative Law Judge's decision to approve.
	<b>Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1190 Total</b>			<b>0.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1191	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/10/12	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summary regarding Administrative Law Judge's decision approving settlement of penalties and violations.
	<b>Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1191 Total</b>			<b>0.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000251444 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2011-1681 and WEVA 2011-1682	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/07/12	0.40	Collecting and reviewing citations and other documents regarding settlement conference.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/11/12	0.40	Collecting and reviewing records and citations for purpose of settlement conference.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/14/12	0.20	Reviewing hearing notice and status regarding exhibits.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/17/12	0.10	Telephone call with Clerk regarding settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/18/12	0.20	E-mail R. Phillips regarding settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/18/12	0.10	E-mail S. Grubbs regarding case status.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/25/12	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summary and calendar regarding Administrative Law Judge's order and settlement status.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/28/12	0.20	Reviewing pleadings and documents regarding settlement status.
<b>Case No. 000251444 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2011-1681 and WEVA 2011-1682 Total</b>				<b>1.90</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000254488 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-2057 and WEVA 2011-2058	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/13/12	1.30	Collecting and reviewing citations, inspector notes and other documents for settlement conference.
<b>Case No. 000254488 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-2057 and WEVA 2011-2058 Total</b>				<b>1.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000257610 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2151	Webb, Jason P.	09/05/12	0.20	E-mail Solicitor regarding settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/10/12	0.50	Preparing settlement and e-mail to P. Simpson for approval.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/14/12	0.10	E-mail reminder for settlement approval to P. Simpson.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/14/12	0.80	Collecting and reviewing citations, inspector's notes and other documents for preparation of settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/19/12	0.10	Sending reminder e-mail to P. Simpson.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/24/12	0.60	Telephone call with R. Phillips regarding settlement conference, e-mail G. McHenry regarding settlement conference, and e-mail Solicitor regarding settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/25/12	10.20	Attending Eastern settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/25/12	2.50	Travel to Eastern settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/26/12	7.50	Attending Eastern settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/26/12	2.50	Travel to Eastern settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/27/12	0.10	E-mail Solicitor regarding global settlement and e-mail G. McHenry to seek input on S&S.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/28/12	0.20	Telephone call to R. Phillips, telephone call to G. McHenry, e-mail G. McHenry, and e-mail Solicitor.
<b>Case No. 000257610 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2151 Total</b>				<b>25.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000260205 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2188	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/14/12	0.80	Collecting and reviewing citations, inspector's notes, and other documents in preparation for settlement conference.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/28/12	0.20	Reviewing pleadings and other documents regarding settlement status.
<b>Case No. 000260205 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2188 Total</b>				<b>1.00</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000263159 (Federal No. 2)	Webb, Jason P.	09/09/12	1.50	Preparing settlement regarding 2011-2415.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/09/12	2.00	Preparing settlement regarding 2011-2416.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/10/12	1.50	Preparing settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/10/12	0.20	Sending settlement for approval.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/11/12	0.20	Preparing for hearing and reviewing inspector's notes.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/14/12	0.10	E-mail reminder for settlement approval to P. Simpson.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/14/12	0.80	Collecting and reviewing citations and other documents regarding settlement conference preparation.
<b>Case No. 000263159 (Federal No. 2) Total</b>				<b>6.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000266251 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-20 and WEVA 2012-21	Webb, Jason P.	09/04/12	1.00	E-mail R. Phillips to request information.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/04/12	0.50	Legal research.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/04/12	0.50	Preparing for settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/04/12	1.10	Preparing settlement.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative	
			Date	Hours		
		Webb, Jason P.	09/05/12	0.50	E-mail J. Ewell.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/05/12	1.00	Reviewing materials provided by J. Ewell.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/05/12	0.40	Reviewing rebuttal and updating settlement.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/05/12	0.30	Telephone call to R. Phillips.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/06/12	5.10	Preparing settlement.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	0.20	E-mail G. McHenry.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	0.20	E-mail P. Simpson.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	0.20	Preparing e-mail to R. Phillips.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	1.00	Preparing settlement.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	1.00	Reviewing escapeway training materials.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/07/12	0.40	Telephone call with R. Phillips.	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/13/12	1.20	Collecting and reviewing citations and other documents for purpose of settlement conference preparation.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/14/12	0.20	E-mail R. Phillips, seeking rebuttal, and e-mail settlement approval reminder to P. Simpson.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/20/12	0.20	Telephone call with R. Phillips regarding lifeline training issue and e-mail to R. Phillips regarding settlement conference.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/24/12	0.20	Approval for hearing.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/24/12	1.50	Preparing for conference.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/24/12	0.20	Sending reminder to P. Simpson.	
		<b>Case No. 000266251 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-20 and WEVA 2012-21 Total</b>			<b>16.90</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000270521 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-174	Webb, Jason P.	09/12/12	0.20	Reviewing file and e-mail Solicitor.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/19/12	1.00	Reviewing decisions on flagrant regarding repeated failure.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/19/12	0.20	Scheduling call with Solicitor.	
		Webb, Jason P.	09/19/12	0.60	Telephone call with Solicitor regarding discovery.	
		<b>Case No. 000270521 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-174 Total</b>			<b>2.00</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000270852 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-427 and WEVA 2012-428	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/07/12	0.40	Collecting and reviewing citations and inspector's notes regarding settlement conference.	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/11/12	0.30	Reviewing MSHA citations and other materials for purpose of settlement conference.	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/12/12	0.50	Collecting and reviewing MSHA citations and other documentation for preparation of settlement conference.	
		<b>Case No. 000270852 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-427 and WEVA 2012-428</b>			<b>1.20</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000273621 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-529 and WEVA 2012.530	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/07/12	0.30	Collecting and reviewing citations and inspector's notes and preparing same for settlement.	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/11/12	0.30	Collecting and reviewing citations, inspection records and other materials for settlement.	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/12/12	0.60	Collecting and reviewing citations, notes and other documentation regarding settlement conference.	
		<b>Case No. 000273621 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-529 and WEVA 2012.530 Total</b>			<b>1.20</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000281811 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-894 and WEVA 2012-895	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.	

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
	<b>Case No. 000281811 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-894 and WEVA 2012-895 Total</b>			<b>0.20</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000285356 (Federal No. 2 Mine);	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
	WEVA 2012-1085 and WEVA 2012-1086	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/25/12	0.10	Reviewing notice from Solicitor.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/25/12	0.10	Updating case summary regarding status.
	<b>Case No. 000285356 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1085 and WEVA 2012-1086 Total</b>			<b>0.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000291117 (Federal No. 2 Mine);	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.
	WEVA 2012-1368 and WEVA 2012-1369	Colston, Leanna L.	09/14/12	2.00	Preparing summary of violations and defenses.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/14/12	0.50	Reviewing citations, penalty information and rebuttal information.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
	<b>Case No. 000291117 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1368 and WEVA 2012-1369 Total</b>			<b>2.70</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 00248954 (Federal No. 2 Mine)	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/12/12	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summary regarding settlement of penalties and Administrative Law Judge's decision approving same.
	WEVA 2011-1437				
	<b>Case No. 00248954 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-1437 Total</b>			<b>0.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine - Assessment 000276475	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/07/12	0.30	Collecting and reviewing citations, inspector's notes and other documents regarding settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/18/12	0.10	E-mail R. Phillips regarding settlement.
	<b>Federal No. 2 Mine - Assessment 000276475 Total</b>			<b>0.40</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine - WEVA 2012-624;	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/07/12	0.40	Collecting and reviewing citations and other documents regarding settlement conference.
	Assessment 000276264	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/11/12	0.30	Collecting and reviewing petition and citations for purpose of settlement.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/12/12	0.60	Collecting and reviewing documents regarding citations and inspections for settlement conference.
	<b>Federal No. 2 Mine - WEVA 2012-624; Assessment 000276264 Total</b>			<b>1.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Safety and Health Consultation	Webb, Jason P.	09/04/12	0.20	E-mail D. Allard.
		Webb, Jason P.	09/04/12	0.20	Telephone call with D. Allard.
	<b>Safety and Health Consultation Total</b>			<b>0.40</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Unsupported Roof NOV's (Federal No. 2 Mine)	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/04/12	0.20	Reviewing case summary regarding status.
	(Joe Statler)				
	<b>Unsupported Roof NOV's (Federal No. 2 Mine) (Joe Statler) Total</b>			<b>0.20</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	William Mark Stewart 105(c) Discrimination	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
	Complaint (Federal No. 2)	Cimino, Michael T.	09/25/12	0.10	E-mail traffic with Secretary of Labor regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/25/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with E. Waller.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/26/12	0.20	E-mail traffic regarding status of settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/26/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with E. Waller regarding status of settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/28/12	0.10	E-mail traffic with Mr. Phillips regarding status of settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/28/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from Mr. Phillips regarding status of settlement.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
<b>William Mark Stewart 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2) Total</b>				<b>0.90</b>	
<b>Eastern Associated Coal, LLC Total</b>				<b>101.70</b>	
Highland Mining Company, LLC	Case No. 000162446 (Highland 9 Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	09/04/12	3.00	Trial preparation.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.60	Additional work on preparing for upcoming final hearing.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.50	Assisting with preparation of motion to exclude Secretary's exhibits.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/04/12	6.70	Preparing responses to Secretary of Labor's discovery requests.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/04/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan regarding same.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/04/12	0.20	Receiving and reviewing e-mails from court reporter forwarding final versions of inspectors' deposition transcripts.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/04/12	0.80	Saving and printing deposition transcripts for M. Cimino.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/05/12	5.60	Trial preparation.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/05/12	1.10	Additional work on preparing trial notebook.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/05/12	0.70	Preparing log of entries and corrections.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/05/12	1.10	Research prior citations relating to belts at Highland Mine.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/05/12	0.40	Reviewing belt books.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/05/12	2.20	Analyzing Secretary of Labor's exhibit list for possible objections to admission into evidence.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/05/12	1.60	Continue working on discovery responses and e-mail same to client for review and approval.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/05/12	0.50	Discussing same with client.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/05/12	1.70	Preparing objection to admission into evidence of certain exhibits of Secretary's proposed exhibits.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/05/12	1.50	Additional work on saving deposition transcripts and e-mail to M. Cimino for his review.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/05/12	0.10	E-mail from B. Oakley regarding same.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/05/12	0.10	E-mail from court reporter indicating original was in mail.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/05/12	0.20	E-mail to court reporter inquiring regarding mailing original transcripts.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/05/12	0.20	E-mail to L. Colston regarding preparation for trial notebook.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/06/12	0.50	Preparing discovery responses.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/06/12	0.70	Preparing objections to exhibits.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/06/12	1.20	Trial preparation.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/06/12	0.50	Additional work on assisting with trial preparations.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/06/12	0.50	Additional work on reviewing belt books and preparing log of entries and corrections.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/06/12	0.30	Preparing stipulations for filing with Commission.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/06/12	1.90	Continue working on and finalizing responses to Miners Safety and Health Administration's discovery requests.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/06/12	3.10	Continue working on objections to Secretary's exhibits related to Order Number 6697578.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/07/12	1.00	Trial preparation.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/07/12	1.50	Additional work on assisting with trial preparations.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/07/12	1.00	Assisting with outlines for witness examinations.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/07/12	1.90	Analyzing J. Winders' deposition testimony regarding Citation 6697504.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/07/12	0.50	Begin working on T. Watkins' direct examination.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/07/12	0.80	Continue working on and finalizing objection to certain Secretary's exhibits.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/07/12	0.20	Preparing Highland's proposed stipulations.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/07/12	0.10	Forwarding same to B. Oakley discussing any changes he may feel necessary.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/07/12	0.30	Receiving and reviewing e-mail from L. Colston regarding preparation of trial notebook.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/09/12	1.50	Preparing for meeting with witness.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/09/12	5.50	Travel to Evansville.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/09/12	3.00	Travel from Lexington, Kentucky to Evansville, Indiana to meet with client for trial preparation.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/10/12	13.00	Preparing witness for trial.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/10/12	0.60	Additional work on trial preparations.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/10/12	1.00	Preparing outline of belt entries from inspector testimony.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/10/12	5.50	Meeting with clients to prepare for trial.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/10/12	4.00	Return travel from Highland Mine to Lexington, Kentucky.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/10/12	0.80	Travel from Evansville, Indiana to Highland Mine.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/10/12	2.00	Begin preparing trial notebook, citations and exhibits.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/10/12	0.50	Preparing index.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/10/12	0.10	Telephone conference with B. Oakley regarding preparation of trial notebook.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/11/12	1.20	Preparing opening, cross examination and direct examination.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/11/12	0.20	Working on settlement.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/11/12	0.50	Analyzing Secretary's responses to Highland's discovery requests.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/11/12	4.70	Continue working on direct examination of T. Watkins and D. Massoth regarding Citation 6697504.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/11/12	0.20	Preparing e-mail to M. Lawson accepting offers on 8489043 and 6697463.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/11/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with M. Lawson regarding settlement negotiations.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/11/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan regarding settlement negotiations.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/11/12	0.30	Conference with B. Oakley regarding citations settled prior to trial.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/11/12	0.10	Conference with B. Oakley regarding preparation of trial notebook.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/11/12	1.50	Working on revisions and additions to trial notebook.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/12/12	3.00	Trial preparation.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/12/12	1.50	Additional work on trial preparations.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/12/12	2.30	Assisting with cross and direct examination outlines of witnesses.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/12/12	2.50	Continue working on direct examinations of T. Watkins and D. Massoth.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/12/12	0.70	Preparing opening statement for 6697504.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/12/12	0.50	Additional work on updates to trial notebook.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/12/12	0.50	Duplicating and marking exhibits.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/12/12	0.20	Printing pleadings related to trial to include in trial notebook.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/12/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from B. Oakley regarding revisions to trial notebook.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/12/12	2.00	Revising trial notebook.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/12/12	0.50	Updating settlement status spreadsheet.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/12/12	0.60	Updating trial notebook index.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/13/12	0.60	Negotiating settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/13/12	0.60	Preparing for trial.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/13/12	1.10	Continue working on opening statement for Citation 6697504.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/13/12	1.00	Meeting with R. Duncan regarding settlement negotiations.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/13/12	0.80	Multiple telephone conferences and e-mails with M. Lawson, Solicitor, regarding settlement negotiations.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/13/12	4.10	Preparing cross examination of J. Winders.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/13/12	0.30	Preparing e-mail to E. Waller regarding settlement of case.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/13/12	0.30	Printing response and adding pleading tab to trial notebook.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/13/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from B. Oakley forwarding response to objection of exhibit.
		Werner, Shannon L.	09/13/12	0.10	Updating trial notebook index.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/14/12	0.50	Working on settlement.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/14/12	0.30	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from M. Lawson regarding terms and amount of final settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/17/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with and correspondence to client regarding belt and preshift inspection books.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/18/12	0.30	E-mail traffic regarding settlement payment plan.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	09/19/12	0.10	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from M. Lawson regarding conditions of one year payment plan.
		<b>Case No. 000162446 (Highland 9 Mine) Total</b>		<b>116.40</b>	
Highland Mining Company, LLC	Case No. 000202199 (Highland 9 Mine) Part 50 Violations (Leslie Pride); WEVA KENT 2010-232	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
	<b>Case No. 000202199 (Highland 9 Mine) Part 50 Violations (Leslie Pride); WEVA KENT 2010-232 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Highland Mining Company, LLC	Case No. MADI-CSI-2007-02 (Highland No. 9) 110(c) Special Investigation D-1 Citation No. 6692995	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/20/12	0.50	Working on issues regarding representation.
<b>Case No. MADI-CSI-2007-02 (Highland No. 9) 110(c) Special Investigation D-1 Citation No. 6692995 Total</b>				<b>0.60</b>	
Highland Mining Company, LLC	Leslie Pride (Highland 9 Mine) Discrimination Complaint No. MADI-CD-2009-11	Colston, Leanna L.	09/18/12	0.10	Preparing third quarter Patriot report.
<b>Leslie Pride (Highland 9 Mine) Discrimination Complaint No. MADI-CD-2009-11 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
<b>Highland Mining Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>117.20</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Case No. 000250766 (Beth Station No. 79 Prep Plant) WEVA 2011-1561	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/05/12	1.20	Additional work on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/05/12	0.20	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/19/12	0.70	Working on settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000250766 (Beth Station No. 79 Prep Plant) WEVA 2011-1561 Total</b>				<b>2.30</b>	
<b>Hobet Mining, LLC Total</b>				<b>2.30</b>	
Ohio County Coal Company, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	Zalewski, Larry A.	09/05/12	0.30	Reviewing proposed decision and updating case summary and calendar regarding same.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	09/12/12	0.20	Reviewing proposed decision and status regarding request for hearing.
<b>Electronic Surveying Petitions Total</b>				<b>0.50</b>	
<b>Ohio County Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>0.50</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Big Mountain No. 16; Inundation of Water	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Big Mountain No. 16; Inundation of Water Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000158162 (Big Mtn. No. 16); WEVA 2008-1623	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000158162 (Big Mtn. No. 16); WEVA 2008-1623 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000163290 (Big Mtn No. 16); WEVA 2008-432	Cimino, Michael T.	09/19/12	0.80	Working on issues regarding global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/24/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from Mr. Wilson regarding global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/25/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with E. Waller regarding global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/26/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with client regarding status of settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/26/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with counsel regarding status of settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000163290 (Big Mtn No. 16); WEVA 2008-432 Total</b>				<b>1.70</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000172189 (Big Mountain Mine No. 16) WEVA 2009-666 and WEVA 2009-667	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
<b>Case No. 000172189 (Big Mountain Mine No. 16) WEVA 2009-666 and WEVA 2009-667 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000191598 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2009-1772	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000191598 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2009-1772 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000197709; (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-19	Robinson, Melissa M.	09/10/12	0.20	E-mail correspondence with attorney for Solicitor regarding status.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	09/13/12	0.30	E-mail correspondence with J. Hargraves and Administrative Law Judge Steele regarding status.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000197709; (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-19 Total</b>					<b>0.60</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000211876 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-745	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000211876 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-745 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000214479 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-855	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000214479 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-855 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000218088 (Big Mountain No. 16); Motion to Reopen	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000218088 (Big Mountain No. 16); Motion to Reopen Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000221013 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2010-1168	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000221013 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2010-1168 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000224417 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2010-1323	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000224417 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2010-1323 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000236828 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-530	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000236828 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-530 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000239682 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-552	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000239682 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-552 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000242484 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-769	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000242484 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-769 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000248053 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1293	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000248053 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1293 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000250539 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1504	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000250539 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1504 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000253329 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1754	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
<b>Case No. 000253329 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1754 Total</b>					<b>0.10</b>

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000256585 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1990	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000256585 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1990 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000259308 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-2178	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000259308 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-2178 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000270891 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2012-258	Robinson, Melissa M.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing order.
	<b>Case No. 000270891 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2012-258 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	MSHA Assessment Investigation and Research	Cimino, Michael T.	09/14/12	0.50	Working on issues regarding production reports.
	<b>MSHA Assessment Investigation and Research Total</b>			<b>0.50</b>	
<b>Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>4.60</b>	
Remington, LLC	Winchester Mine; Order Nos. 7157212, 7157213, and 7157210	Cimino, Michael T.	09/12/12	2.50	Working on issues regarding (d) orders.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/13/12	1.50	Working on issues regarding production reports.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/13/12	1.20	Preparing prepenalty notice of contest.
		Harvey, M. Shane	09/13/12	2.80	Working on 104 (d) orders regarding books.
		Sebok, Al F.	09/13/12	0.30	Conference regarding attorney-client privilege and self-critical analysis; privilege regarding mine audits.
		Harvey, M. Shane	09/14/12	0.90	Research attorney-client privilege.
		Harvey, M. Shane	09/14/12	0.90	Research personnel records after Big Ridge.
		Harvey, M. Shane	09/14/12	0.90	Research regarding self-audit privilege.
		Harvey, M. Shane	09/14/12	1.10	Working on memorandum regarding same.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	09/14/12	2.70	Legal research regarding Part 50 cases.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	09/14/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with S. Harvey regarding client research requests.
		Sebok, Al F.	09/14/12	0.30	Conferences regarding protecting audits under evidentiary privilege.
		Sebok, Al F.	09/14/12	0.80	Legal research regarding self-critical evaluation and attorney-client privileges.
		Sebok, Al F.	09/14/12	0.90	Preparing memorandum regarding protecting corporate documents under privileges.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	09/17/12	2.50	Legal research regarding document disclosure requirements.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/18/12	0.20	E-mail traffic regarding (d) orders.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/18/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with E. Waller regarding (d) orders.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	09/18/12	4.50	Legal research regarding document production obligations to MSHA.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	09/19/12	4.00	Drafting memorandum.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	09/19/12	2.50	Legal research regarding document disclosure obligations.
		Harvey, M. Shane	09/20/12	4.70	Working on memorandum regarding records under Mine Act.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	09/20/12	0.40	Editing memorandum.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Sebok, Al F.	09/20/12	0.30	Analyzing cases regarding effect of attorney-client privilege on third parties.
		Sebok, Al F.	09/20/12	0.30	Analyzing e-mail regarding effect of attorney-client privilege on third parties.
		Sebok, Al F.	09/20/12	0.20	Conference regarding issues in memorandum regarding effect of attorney-client privilege on third parties.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/21/12	0.80	Revising memorandum regarding production of documents.
		Harvey, M. Shane	09/21/12	0.50	Correspondence with E. Waller.
		Harvey, M. Shane	09/21/12	3.00	Working on memorandum to client.
	<b>Winchester Mine; Order Nos. 7157212, 7157213, and 7157210 Total</b>			<b>41.10</b>	
<b>Remington, LLC Total</b>				<b>41.10</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	101(c) Petition Fire Suppression Modification	McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/06/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/21/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
	<b>101(c) Petition Fire Suppression Modification Total</b>			<b>0.50</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	American Eagle Mine; WEVA 2012-996 and WEVA 2012-999	Colston, Leanna L.	09/05/12	0.20	Receiving and processing discovery requests from Solicitor.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/05/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding discovery and status and strategy regarding WEVA 2012-996.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/14/12	0.50	Working on preparing discovery responses.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/26/12	0.50	Reviewing and analyzing file regarding WEVA 2012-996.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/26/12	0.50	Working on issues regarding defenses to orders regarding WEVA 2012-996.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/28/12	0.40	Conducting investigation into underlying order.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/28/12	0.40	Reviewing and analyzing file.
	<b>American Eagle Mine; WEVA 2012-996 and WEVA 2012-999 Total</b>			<b>2.70</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000213025 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-828	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000213025 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-828 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000215706 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-996	McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/14/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding discovery and status and strategy regarding WEVA 2010-996.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000215706 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-996 Total</b>			<b>0.40</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000224877 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-1324	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000224877 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-1324 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000227784 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-1599	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000227784 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-1599 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000245651 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1102	Colston, Leanna L.	09/13/12	0.50	Reviewing decision approving settlement for accuracy and correspondence to Administrative Law Judge's law clerk regarding inaccuracy in decision.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/24/12	0.10	Correspondence to client forwarding decision approving settlement.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/24/12	0.20	Reviewing decision approving settlement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/24/12	0.10	Working on finalization of settlement.
	<b>Case No. 000245651 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1102 Total</b>			<b>0.90</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000250991 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1598	Colston, Leanna L.	09/21/12	0.70	Preparing notebook of citations, penalties, defenses, and settlement chart to prepare for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.90	Preparing settlement chart to prepare for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.30	Reviewing citations and penalty information.
	<b>Case No. 000250991 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1598 Total</b>			<b>2.00</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000253895 (American Eagle Mine): WEVA 2011-1917 and WEVA 2011-1918	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000253895 (American Eagle Mine): WEVA 2011-1917 and WEVA 2011-1918 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000257054 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2036	McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.20	Planning and preparing for settlement conference regarding WEVA 2011-2036.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.10	Working on issues regarding status and strategy regarding WEVA 2011-2036.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy regarding WEVA 2011-2036.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/21/12	0.70	Preparing notebook of citations, penalties, defenses, and settlement chart to prepare for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000257054 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2036 Total</b>			<b>1.40</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000259753 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2207 and WEVA 2011-2208	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.20	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/05/12	0.50	E-mail traffic regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/06/12	0.20	E-mail traffic with Mr. Todd regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/07/12	0.10	Reviewing case for Mr. Todd regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/11/12	0.20	Reviewing e-mail from Ms. Epstein.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/17/12	0.50	Working on issues regarding vacated citation.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/18/12	0.30	E-mail traffic with Ms. Todd regarding vacated citation.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/19/12	0.60	Working on issues regarding vacated citation.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/25/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from Ms. Todd regarding vacated citation.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/27/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from Ms. Todd regarding vacated citation.
	<b>Case No. 000259753 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2207 and WEVA 2011-2208 Total</b>			<b>2.90</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000262590 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-2412	McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.10	Planning and preparing for settlement conference regarding WEVA 2011-2412.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.10	Working on issues regarding status and strategy regarding WEVA 2011-2412.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work		Narrative
			Date	Hours	
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy regarding WEVA 2011-2412.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/21/12	0.70	Preparing notebook of citations, penalties, defenses, and settlement chart to prepare for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/25/12	0.80	Preparing settlement chart to prepare for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/25/12	0.40	Reviewing citations and penalty information.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
		<b>Case No. 000262590 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-2412 Total</b>		<b>2.40</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000265768 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-17 and WEVA 2012-19	McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.10	Planning and preparing for settlement conference regarding WEVA 2012-17, 18, and 19.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding compliance with prehearing order deadlines and extensions of such deadlines regarding WEVA 2012-17, 18, and 19.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/20/12	0.60	Working on issues regarding position statement, status and strategy.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/21/12	0.80	Preparing notebook of citations, penalties, and defenses to prepare for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/21/12	0.60	Preparing settlement chart to prepare for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/24/12	2.20	Preparing settlement chart in preparation for settlement conference in Dockets 2012-17, 2012-18, and 2012-19.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/24/12	1.00	Reviewing citations and penalty information in Dockets 2012-17, 2012-18 and 2012-19.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/24/12	0.50	Planning and preparing for settlement conference.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/24/12	0.60	Working on issues regarding position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/25/12	0.90	Reviewing and analyzing file and working on issues regarding status and strategy regarding WEVA 2012-19.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/25/12	0.40	Reviewing and analyzing file regarding WEVA 2012-18.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.30	Preparing rebuttal information and citations to send to client in preparation for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.30	Reviewing rebuttal information and citations in Dockets 2012-17, 18 and 19.
		<b>Case No. 000265768 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-17 and WEVA 2012-19 Total</b>		<b>8.70</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000268443 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-124	McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.10	Planning and preparing for settlement conference regarding WEVA 2011-123.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy regarding WEVA 2011-123.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/19/12	0.10	Working on issues regarding status and strategy regarding WEVA 2011-369.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/21/12	0.70	Preparing notebook of citations, penalties, defenses, and settlement chart to prepare for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/24/12	0.70	Preparing settlement chart to prepare for settlement conference.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/24/12	0.30	Reviewing citations and penalty information.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/25/12	0.70	Preparing settlement chart to prepare for settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/25/12	0.30	Reviewing citations and penalty information.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000268443 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-124 Total</b>			<b>3.20</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000274148 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-655	Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000274148 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-655 Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000277038 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-650	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
		Harvey, M. Shane	09/27/12	0.10	Correspondence with Solicitor.
	<b>Case No. 000277038 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-650 Total</b>			<b>0.30</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000282296 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-898	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000282296 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-898 Total</b>			<b>0.20</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000284555 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-999	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/05/12	0.20	Receiving and processing discovery requests from Solicitor.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/05/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding discovery and status and strategy regarding WEVA 2012-999.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/14/12	0.50	Working on preparing discovery responses.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/14/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding discovery and status and strategy regarding WEVA 2012-999.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000284555 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-999 Total</b>			<b>1.40</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000285360 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1102	McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/05/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding discovery and status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/06/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/26/12	1.00	Reviewing and analyzing file regarding WEVA 2012-1101.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/26/12	1.10	Working on issues regarding defenses to orders regarding WEVA 2012-1101.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/26/12	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy regarding WEVA 2012-1101.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/28/12	0.40	Reviewing previous citation and order information for supporting documentation for position statement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/28/12	0.80	Working on preparing position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/28/12	0.90	Investigating citation and order.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/28/12	0.80	Reviewing and analyzing file.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/28/12	0.80	Working on position statement.

Time Detail By Project - September 2012

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/29/12	0.90	Legal research regarding conditions under which negligence of supervisors is not imputable to operator.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/29/12	0.70	Working on position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	09/30/12	0.50	Working on position statement.
	<b>Case No. 000285360 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1102 Total</b>			<b>8.90</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000291125 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1453	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/10/12	1.00	Preparing summary of violations and penalties.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/11/12	3.20	Reviewing rebuttal information and preparing summary of defenses.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
	<b>Case No. 000291125 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1453 Total</b>			<b>4.40</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 175956 ( American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2009-871 & 2009-872	Colston, Leanna L.	09/04/12	0.10	Reviewing file for status and preparing memorandum of status and further action.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/14/12	0.30	E-mail traffic regarding settlement conference.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/17/12	0.30	E-mail traffic with Secretary of Labor and Administrative Law Judge.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/18/12	0.20	E-mail traffic regarding battery charger violation.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/18/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Ms. Mucklow.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/19/12	1.20	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/26/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from Ms. Mucklow.
		Colston, Leanna L.	09/26/12	0.10	Preparing quarterly report for Patriot.
		Cimino, Michael T.	09/27/12	0.10	Correspondence to Mr. Boggs regarding settlement offer.
	<b>Case No. 175956 ( American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2009-871 &amp; 2009-872 Total</b>			<b>2.50</b>	
<b>Speed Mining, LLC Total</b>				<b>43.30</b>	
<b>SAFETY &amp; HEALTH TOTAL</b>				<b>326.90</b>	
<b>WORKERS COMP</b>					
Patriot Coal Corporation	Refunds	Huffman, Timothy E.	09/07/12	0.40	Preparing memorandum regarding status of litigation.
	<b>Refunds Total</b>			<b>0.40</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Senate Bill Implementation	Huffman, Timothy E.	09/11/12	0.88	Meeting with employer representatives and Office of Insurance Commission Commissioner.
	<b>Senate Bill Implementation Total</b>			<b>0.88</b>	
<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>				<b>1.28</b>	
<b>WORKERS COMP TOTAL</b>				<b>1.28</b>	
<b>TOTAL</b>				<b>564.08</b>	