

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI  
EASTERN DIVISION**

**In re:**

**PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, *et al.*,**

**Debtors.**

**Chapter 11  
Case No. 12-51502-659  
(Jointly Administered)**

**Objection Deadline:  
February 6, 2013 at 4:00 p.m.  
(prevailing Central Time)**

**MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP FOR  
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF  
DECEMBER 1, 2012 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2012**

**NAME OF APPLICANT:**

**Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP**

**ROLE IN THE CASE:**

Counsel to the Debtors

**TIME PERIOD:**

December 1, 2012 through and including  
December 31, 2012

**CURRENT APPLICATION<sup>1</sup>:**

Total Fees Requested: \$1,939,149.50  
80% of Fees Requested: \$1,551,319.60  
Total Expenses Requested: \$64,431.32

---

<sup>1</sup> These amounts reflect \$79,259.12 in voluntary reductions of fees and expenses, which voluntary reductions are in addition to reductions of \$23,239.38 on account of Southern District of New York and U.S. Trustee guidelines.

1. In accordance with the *Order To Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the “**Interim Compensation Order**”), Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP (“**Davis Polk**”), counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the “**Debtors**”), hereby submits its Monthly Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “**Fee Statement**”) for the period of December 1, 2012 through and including December 31, 2012 (the “**Fee Statement Period**”).

2. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Davis Polk seeks payment of \$1,615,750.92, representing (a) 80% of Davis Polk’s fees for services rendered and (b) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred.

3. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a listing of Davis Polk professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively, the “**Davis Polk Professionals**”), including the hourly rate for each Davis Polk Professional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Statement Period and the title, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees billed by each Davis Polk Professional.

4. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a schedule specifying the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Davis Polk is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Davis Polk during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project categories. Such services included:

- Participating in numerous meetings and telephone conferences with the Debtors’ management and employees covering topics

such as the chapter 11 cases generally, interpretation of court orders, determination of the status of claims, contract and lease rejection issues, operational issues and general business issues;

- Advising the Patriot Coal Corporation board of directors regarding fiduciary duty issues, disclosure obligations, business and reorganization issues, the bankruptcy process and its options regarding all of the above;
- Assisting with the Debtors' retention of professionals in the Debtors' chapter 11 cases and in the ordinary course of business;
- Responding to numerous telephone calls and letters from creditors, equity holders and other parties in interest concerning the Debtors' chapter 11 cases, the filing of claims against the Debtors and the rights of creditors under the Bankruptcy Code and conducting associated legal research;
- Research and analysis related to the Debtors' rights and obligations under coal supply agreements and other commercial contracts;
- Researching and preparing pleadings with respect to the Debtors' pre- and post-petition selenium-related environmental obligations;
- Researching and analyzing environmental and regulatory issues, including with respect to the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission, the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority, and the Mine Safety and Health Administration, and advising the Debtors regarding the same;

- Preparation and filing of Exchange Act filings;
- Coordinating the transfer of the Debtors' chapter 11 cases to the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern District of Missouri pursuant to an Order of the Court;
- Providing advice generally to the Debtors about the debtor-in-possession financing facilities;
- Assisting the Debtors with and analyzing issues related to the Debtors' negotiations regarding reclamation claims and demands for utility deposits;
- Analyzing and researching issues related to numerous executory contracts and advising the Debtors regarding the assumption, rejection and extending the time to assume or reject the same;
- Defending against and developing strategies with respect to parties filing motions seeking to lift the automatic stay;
- Coordinating and communicating with the Debtors and various parties regarding potential violations of the automatic stay;
- Developing strategies and seeking declaratory judgments regarding the Debtors' contractual rights under various royalty agreements;
- Participating in numerous teleconferences with the Debtors and other parties regarding critical vendor issues;
- Researching and analyzing labor and retiree issues and developing strategies with respect thereto, including related to sections 1113 and 1114 of the Bankruptcy Code;

- Participating in numerous meetings and teleconferences to provide advice to the Debtors' management concerning financial matters (e.g., cost reductions), union negotiations, union and non-union communications, and litigation and non-litigation strategy with respect to labor issues;
- Preparing proposals in connection with section 1113 and 1114 of the Bankruptcy Code and advising the Debtors with respect to the same;
- Communicating and negotiating with professionals engaged by the Debtors' union concerning collective bargaining agreements and various other matters;
- Reviewing certain employee compensation and benefit issues, conducting related legal research and advising the Debtors regarding the same;
- Researching and analyzing tax issues and advising the Debtors regarding the same;
- Participating in numerous telephone conferences with the Office of the U.S. Trustee regarding various procedural, case management and other issues;
- Responding to the U.S. Trustee's objection regarding interim compensation sought by retained professionals, including with respect to fee holdbacks;

- Conducting an extensive interview and document review process in connection with potential claims against certain counterparties;
- Researching and analyzing various legal issues related to potential claims against certain counterparties;
- Researching and preparing several non-first-day procedural and substantive motions;
- Coordinating with the Creditors' Committee regarding various pleadings and administration of the Debtors' estates generally and responding to comments and concerns of the Creditors' Committee;
- Preparing for, attending and taking part in bankruptcy court hearings; and
- Filing and service of court papers.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit D are the time records of Davis Polk, which provide a daily summary of the time spent by each Davis Polk Professional during the Fee Statement Period by project category.

**Notice**

7. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, (ii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Missouri, 111 South 10th Street, Suite 6.353, St. Louis, MO 63102, Attn: Leonora S. Long and Paul A. Randolph, (iii) attorneys for the administrative

agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein and Joseph Smolinsky, and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz and Ana Alfonso, and (iv) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq.

8. WHEREFORE, the Debtors respectfully request that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: St. Louis, Missouri  
January 22, 2013

By: /s/ Brian M. Resnick  
Marshall S. Huebner  
Damian S. Schaible  
Brian M. Resnick  
Michelle M. McGreal

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP  
450 Lexington Avenue  
New York, New York 10017  
Telephone: (212) 450-4000  
Facsimile: (212) 607-7983

*Counsel to the Debtors  
and Debtors in Possession*

**EXHIBIT A**

**Professionals and Rates**



**I.A. Partners/Counsel**

NAME OF PARTNER/ COUNSEL	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
<b>Partners</b>					
Sarah E. Beshar	1986-NY	Capital Markets	0.8	\$985	\$788.00
Edmond T. FitzGerald	1992-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	25.5	\$985	\$25,117.50
Marshall S. Huebner	1994-NY	Insolvency & Restructuring	60.8	\$985	\$59,888.00
Elliot Moskowitz	2002-NY	Litigation	120.6	\$975	\$117,585.00
Brian M. Resnick	2004-NY	Insolvency & Restructuring	93.3	\$850	\$79,305.00
Damian S. Schaible	2002-NY	Insolvency & Restructuring	1.4	\$975	\$1,365.00
Amelia T. R. Starr	1995-NY	Litigation	66.4	\$985	\$65,404.00
Mischa Travers	1998-NY	Corporate	4.5	\$985	\$4,432.50
Waide Warner	1980-NY	Credit	4.0	\$985	\$3,940.00
<b>Counsel</b>					
Hayden S. Baker	2003-NY	Environmental	30.3	\$915	\$27,724.50
Erin K. Cho	1998-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee	24.5	\$985	\$24,132.50
Jonathan D. Martin	2004-NY	Litigation	103.9	\$915	\$95,068.50
Michael J. Russano	2002-NY	Litigation	124.6	\$915	\$114,009.00
Erika D. White	1982-NY	Credit	2.1	\$985	\$2,068.50
<b>Total Partners and Counsel</b>			<b>662.7</b>		<b>\$620,828.00</b>

**II.A. Associates**

<b>NAME OF ASSOCIATE</b>	<b>YEAR ADMITTED</b>	<b>DEPARTMENT</b>	<b>TOTAL HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL FEES</b>
Jessica Agostinho	2011-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	13.9	\$575	\$7,992.50
Ron M. Aizen	2006-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	45.0	\$795	\$35,775.00
Adam Balin	2012-NY	Litigation	9.2	\$465	\$4,278.00
Patrick Blakemore	Admission Pending	Litigation	57.0	\$325	\$18,525.00
Jeffrey Brenner	2012-NY	Capital Markets	2.3	\$465	\$1,069.50
Tenley L. Chepiga	2009-NY	Credit	7.8	\$750	\$5,850.00
Kevin J. Coco	2010-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	153.3	\$675	\$103,477.50
Deryn Darcy	2010-NJ	Litigation	44.5	\$575	\$25,587.50
Nicholas J. Dashman	2010-CA	Corporate	4.7	\$575	\$2,702.50
Alexandre de Richemont	2012-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	6.6	\$465	\$3,069.00
Andrew N. DeLaney	2009-NY	Litigation	23.9	\$750	\$17,925.00
Richard Estacio	2010-NY	Litigation	61.4	\$675	\$41,445.00
Aryeh E. Falk	Admission Pending	Insolvency and Restructuring	71.7	\$325	\$23,302.50
Joshua Thomas Foust	2009-NY	Litigation	12.9	\$750	\$9,675.00
Andrew S. Gehring	Admission Pending	Litigation	124.4	\$675	\$83,970.00
Elyse Glazer	2010-NY	Litigation	66.0	\$675	\$44,550.00
Rayiner Hashem	Admission Pending	Litigation	1.2	\$325	\$390.00
Wendi Hoeben	2005-NY	Capital Markets	0.5	\$795	\$397.50
Alexander Ibrahim	2011-NY	Litigation	1.0	\$575	\$575.00
Mhairi Immermann	2012 - NY	Credit	1.8	\$465	\$837.00
Darren S. Klein	2007-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	37.9	\$795	\$30,130.50
Kevin Klesh	2002-NY	Environmental	10.8	\$795	\$8,586.00
Steven C. Krause	2007-MA 2008-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	35.2	\$795	\$27,984.00
Angela Libby	2012-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	88.9	\$465	\$41,338.50
Daniel M. Loss	2005-NY	Litigation	35.8	\$795	\$28,461.00
Christopher Lynch	2008-NY	Litigation	2.8	\$795	\$2,226.00
Ferrell Maguire	Admission Pending	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	12.3	\$325	\$3,997.50
Michelle M. McGreal	2007-NJ 2008-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	118.8	\$795	\$94,446.00
Adam Mehes	2011-NY	Litigation	20.1	\$575	\$11,557.50

NAME OF ASSOCIATE	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Gerald M. Moody	2010-MA 2010-NY	Litigation	32.9	\$675	\$22,207.50
Gina Y. Pak	2011-NY	Credit	4.6	\$575	\$2,645.00
Lina Peng	Admission Pending	Litigation	78.4	\$325	\$25,480.00
Saga K. Ravi	2010-NY	Litigation	64.0	\$675	\$43,200.00
Craig M. Reiser	Admission Pending	Litigation	163.8	\$575	\$94,185.00
Christopher Robertson	Admission Pending	Insolvency and Restructuring	74.0	\$465	\$34,410.00
Lara Samet	2008-NJ 2009-NY	Litigation	111.4	\$750	\$83,550.00
Daniel Silberger	2012-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	126.2	\$465	\$58,683.00
Steve Sorkin	2010-NY	Real Estate	0.5	\$675	\$337.50
Jillian R. Stillman	2010-NY	Litigation	5.5	\$675	\$3,712.50
Eugene Sokoloff	Admission Pending	Litigation	51.7	\$325	\$16,802.50
Marc J. Tobak	2009-NY	Litigation	108.3	\$750	\$81,225.00
Natasha Tsiouris	2011-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	3.7	\$575	\$2,127.50
Amy E. Turner	2009-NY	Environmental	46.3	\$750	\$34,725.00
Adam VanWagner	Admission Pending	Insolvency and Restructuring	59.9	\$325	\$19,467.50
Eli James Vonnegut	2008-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	1.6	\$795	\$1,272.00
Amit Vora	Admission Pending	Litigation	1.1	\$575	\$632.50
Bernard Chen Zhu	2008-NY	Litigation	116.8	\$795	\$92,856.00
<b>Total Associates</b>			<b>2122.4</b>		<b>\$1,297,639.00</b>

**Attorney Blended Rates**

	<b>ATTORNEY BLENDED RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES<sup>1</sup></b>
<b>Partners and Counsel</b>	936.8	662.7	\$620,828.00
<b>Associates</b>	611.4	2122.4	\$1,297,639.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>688.3</b>	<b>2785.1</b>	<b>\$1,918,467.00</b>

---

<sup>1</sup> These figures reflect reductions as referenced above.

### III.A. Paraprofessionals

NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES <sup>1</sup>
Jen Eum	Legal Assistant Corporate	5.6	\$325	\$1,820.00
Elliot Law	Legal Assistant Corporate	41.4	\$400	\$16,560.00
Marguerite Melvin	Legal Assistant Corporate	21.5	\$400	\$8,600.00
Michael Pucci	Legal Assistant Corporate	30.5	\$325	\$9,912.50
Robert L. Jones	Managing Attorney's Office	4.4	\$310	\$1,364.00
John Denkowski	Research Services	1.4	\$365	\$511.00
Edgar Halford	Research Services	8.5	\$290	\$2,465.00
Marlon Oliva	Research Services	1.0	\$290	\$290.00
<b>Total Paraprofessionals</b>		<b>114.3</b>		<b>\$41,522.50</b>

---

<sup>1</sup> These figures reflect voluntary reductions as referenced above.

**EXHIBIT B**

**Expenses**

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES  
INCURRED BY DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP ON  
BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD

CATEGORY OF EXPENSES	AMOUNTS
Computer research	\$37,679.29
Duplication	\$8,003.95
Litigation Support	\$207.45
Postage, courier and freight	\$744.84
Outside document retrieval (transcript, PACER, etc.)	\$1,850.27
Court and related fees	\$564.15
Electronic Discovery Services	\$60.50
Travel	\$10,179.11
Meals	\$5,141.76
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$64,431.32</b>

**EXHIBIT C**

**Summary by Project Code**



**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING  
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP  
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

<b>PROJECT CATEGORY</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>AMOUNT</b>
1.	ASSET DISPOSITIONS	15.5	\$11,568.50
2.	AUTOMATIC STAY\ LITIGATION	438.6	\$311,311.50
3.	CLAIMS INVESTIGATIONS	503.6	\$353,698.50
4.	CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDER\UCC ISSUES	170.7	\$114,963.50
5.	DPW RETENTION AND FEE ISSUES	190.8	\$107,709.00
6.	EMPLOYEE LABOR ISSUES	848.2	\$575,381.50
7.	EXECUTORY CONTRACTS	176.8	\$129,731.00
8.	FINANCING	26.2	\$20,109.50
9.	FIRST REVIEW	69.6	\$39,546.00
10.	GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION	229.9	\$133,755.00
11.	GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS	0.2	\$197.00
12.	NON-DPW RETENTION	41.0	\$23,443.50
13.	NON-WORKING TRAVEL	53.7	\$20,840.00
14.	PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	38.4	\$21,338.50
15.	REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL	96.2	\$75,556.50
<b>Total Hours and Compensation Requested:</b>		<b>2,899.4</b>	<b>\$1,939,149.50<sup>1</sup></b>

---

<sup>1</sup> This figure reflects reductions as referenced above.

**EXHIBIT D**

**Time Record**

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
<b>ASSET DISPOSITIONS</b>			
Coco KJ	12/03/12	0.3	Call with C. Ebetino regarding asset sale transaction (0.1); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Dashman NJ	12/03/12	3.6	Strategic project status call with M. Travers, B. Resnick, C. Ebetino, J. Bean and M. Buschmann (0.5); research asset purchase schedule precedents and draft asset purchase template (1.4); correspond with Z. Mitschrich regarding asset purchase template (0.3); correspond with M. McGreal regarding certain liabilities (0.4); research regarding certain liabilities (1.0).
McGreal MM	12/03/12	1.1	Draft summary of research on various legal issues relating to asset dispositions for N. Dashman.
Resnick BM	12/03/12	0.7	Call with C. Ebetino regarding asset sale issues (0.2); call with M. Travers regarding same (0.1); call with client and advisor group regarding asset sale strategies (0.4).
Travers M	12/03/12	1.0	Call with C. Ebetino and Blackstone team regarding status of strategic project and treatment of individual debtor entities.
Coco KJ	12/05/12	0.9	Call with C. Ebetino regarding asset sale issues (0.5); emails with clients and Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding asset sale issues (0.4).
Coco KJ	12/06/12	0.2	Email to C. Ebetino regarding asset sale issues.
Resnick BM	12/07/12	0.1	Review asset sale schedule.
Travers M	12/07/12	0.5	Review template for assets to be included in strategic project and discuss with N. Dashman.
Resnick BM	12/09/12	0.1	Review outline of asset sale project.
Coco KJ	12/10/12	0.3	Communications with E. Vonnegut regarding mortgage releases in connection with asset sale (0.1); emails with clients regarding same (0.2).
Dashman NJ	12/10/12	1.1	Strategic project status call with M. Travers, B. Resnick, C. Ebetino, J. Bean and M. Buschmann (0.6); research bankruptcy treatment of joint ventures and rights of first refusal (0.5).
Resnick BM	12/10/12	1.3	Call with clients and Blackstone regarding potential asset sales.
Travers M	12/10/12	1.5	Call with C. Ebetino, J. Bean and Blackstone regarding strategic project asset listing and workflow outline (1.3); review of workflow outline in preparation for call (0.2).

## Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/11/12	0.4	Emails with J. Tucker regarding delivering mortgage release notices to banks (0.2); emails with Davis Polk and Willkie regarding same (0.2).
Coco KJ	12/12/12	0.3	Emails with T. Chepiga and clients regarding mortgage releases.
Coco KJ	12/14/12	1.0	Email and call with J. Chincheck regarding Pardee asset sale (0.2); email to counsel to Pardee regarding asset sale (0.3); review de minimis asset sale procedures order and advise clients regarding requirements of same (0.5).
McGreal MM	12/14/12	0.1	Conference with K. Coco regarding monthly asset sale report.
Coco KJ	12/17/12	0.3	Call with J. Jones and J. Wubker regarding asset sale report and follow-up email regarding same.
McGreal MM	12/17/12	0.1	Email monthly asset sales report to Weil, Willkie and Kramer Levin.
Resnick BM	12/17/12	0.5	Weekly call with clients regarding asset dispositions.
Resnick BM	12/28/12	0.1	Emails with C. Ebetino and others regarding asset sale workstreams.
<b>Total ASSET DISPOSITIONS</b>		<b>15.5</b>	
<b>AUTOMATIC STAY\</b>			
<b>LITIGATION</b>			
Blakemore PW	12/01/12	6.0	Review contract and property treatises on assignments for STB brief (3.6); review lease assignments in connection with same (0.3); perform legal research on assignments under WV law (1.4); draft email responding to issues related to same (0.7).
Darcy D	12/01/12	1.1	Research case law regarding choice of law rules.
Estacio R	12/01/12	0.8	Research regarding setoff rights.
Gehring AS	12/01/12	0.3	Upload documents to United Mine Workers of America data room (0.2); email to team regarding same (0.1).
Ravi SK	12/01/12	4.4	Research case law regarding setoff.
Blakemore PW	12/02/12	4.1	Review cases regarding contract assignment for STB brief (1.9); review treatises and hornbooks in connection with same (0.9); draft email to B. Zhu and A. DeLaney regarding same (0.6); research procedural issues regarding same (0.7).
DeLaney AN	12/02/12	1.2	Prepare outline of relevant contracts for pleading.
Estacio R	12/02/12	6.7	Research and draft analysis of ability to exercise contractual setoff rights (6.6); conference with S. Ravi regarding the same (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Ravi SK	12/02/12	4.1	Research case law regarding setoff (1.8); draft email write-up of research regarding the same to M. Russano and R. Estacio (2.3).
Blakemore PW	12/03/12	3.4	Perform research on assignment for STB brief (1.6); read cases regarding contract assignment in connection with same (0.7); attend meeting with B. Zhu and A. DeLaney regarding same (0.5); research regarding procedure in rules of pleading in bankruptcy court (0.6).
DeLaney AN	12/03/12	6.0	Prepare outline in anticipation of pleading (5.5); meet with B. Zhu and P. Blakemore regarding pleading (0.5).
Estacio R	12/03/12	6.2	Conferences with E. Moskowitz, M. Russano and others regarding pension liability issues (1.5); review correspondence from A. Starr and Patriot regarding surety bond agreements (0.2); draft correspondence to A. Starr regarding the same (0.2); correspond with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding the same (0.1); research and draft memorandum regarding pension liabilities (3.8); draft correspondence to E. White regarding setoff analysis (0.4).
Falk AE	12/03/12	0.7	Revise notice of presentment for lift stay procedures per K. Coco comments.
Huebner MS	12/03/12	0.3	Conversations with general counsel and internally regarding St. Louis transfer issues.
Martin JD	12/03/12	5.6	Review materials concerning Magnum bonds (0.4); review research on adversary proceeding issues (5.2).
Moskowitz E	12/03/12	0.7	Correspondence regarding indemnification issues.
Ravi SK	12/03/12	4.7	Review research on setoff (1.4); research regarding indemnification (2.7); emails regarding the same to M. Russano, E. Moskowitz and R. Estacio (0.6).
Russano MJ	12/03/12	2.5	Review research regarding setoff (0.9); confer with R. Estacio and S. Ravi regarding same (0.3); confer with E. White regarding same (0.2); legal research regarding indemnification and confer with E. Moskowitz, S. Ravi and R. Estacio regarding same (1.1).
Starr AT	12/03/12	1.7	Calls and emails with Rudd counsel regarding motion to stay (0.4); calls and emails with K. Hertzog, M. Day, K. Coco and D. Klein regarding notice of rejection (1.0); emails with J. Jones regarding insurance stay (0.2); calls with Peabody counsel (0.1).
White ED	12/03/12	2.1	Analysis of indemnity issues.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	12/03/12	3.5	Conduct legal research regarding override litigation-related issues (1.1); review STB and Arch contracts in preparation for same (1.4); attend conference with A. Delaney and P. Blakemore regarding same (0.5); prepare and review correspondence with A. Delaney and P. Blakemore regarding same (0.5).
Blakemore PW	12/04/12	5.1	Perform legal research for STB brief (2.8); read cases regarding same (1.8); draft email on assignment issues regarding same (0.5).
DeLaney AN	12/04/12	1.1	Prepare outline and supervise research regarding pleading in override proceeding.
Denkowski JP	12/04/12	1.2	Obtain Patriot Coal Corporation Information relating to bonds and their pricing during specified periods and market capitalization during specified periods for D. Loss.
Estacio R	12/04/12	7.9	Draft summary of documents regarding pension liabilities for M. Russano (0.9); review correspondence from E. White regarding setoff (0.2); research and draft analysis regarding the same for M. Russano (4.8); correspond with M. Russano and S. Ravi regarding contract analysis (0.3); correspond with S. Ravi regarding research regarding set off (0.5); correspond with E. Sokoloff regarding the same (0.1); draft correspondence to M. McGreal regarding drafting memorandum regarding pension liabilities (0.1); correspond with A. Libby regarding the same (0.2); research and draft memorandum regarding pension fund liabilities (0.8).
Falk AE	12/04/12	2.3	Revise notice of presentment for insurance lift stay procedures per comments from M. McGreal.
Huebner MS	12/04/12	1.2	Call with Board counsel regarding litigation matters (0.8); prepare for call with Board counsel (0.4).
Martin JD	12/04/12	4.5	Calls with L. Barefoot, K. Costa and J. Mairo regarding adversary proceedings (0.3); review research and related materials on contract integration issues (2.5); communications with A. Starr, A. Rogoff, G. Plotko, C. Ebetino, J. Croft and others regarding Arch motion (1.7).
McGreal MM	12/04/12	0.9	Review and revise lift stay procedures motion.
Moskowitz E	12/04/12	1.3	Call with professional regarding background issues and follow-up.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Ravi SK	12/04/12	3.9	Meet with M. Tobak, A. Gehring and C. Reiser regarding retiree liability issues (0.5); call with C. Reiser regarding the same (0.4); call with A. Gehring regarding the same (0.2); email with M. Russano regarding indemnification issues and arguments (0.1); draft write-up regarding arbitration issues (1.1); research case law regarding arbitration issues (1.4); email with R. Estacio regarding setoff issues (0.2).
Reiser CM	12/04/12	0.5	Meet with M. Tobak, A. Gehring and S. Ravi regarding retiree cost liabilities research.
Resnick BM	12/04/12	0.2	Emails with Davis Polk litigation team regarding Peabody issues.
Russano MJ	12/04/12	4.8	Email to M. Huebner regarding indemnification research results (0.7); confer with S. Ravi and R. Estacio regarding same (0.3); review correspondence and attachments from Kramer Levin regarding pension materials and multi-employer pension plan (0.6); confer with B. Resnick, E. Moskowitz and R. Estacio regarding same (0.2); review correspondence from E. White regarding set-off and confer with R. Estacio regarding same (0.4); meet with M. Huebner, A. Starr and E. Moskowitz regarding conduct of investigation and witness interviews (0.5); review and analyze separation agreement regarding the same, including potential privilege issues (0.7); confer with A. Starr regarding same (0.4); review of special committee resolution and related emails (0.4); email to M. Huebner summarizing the June 2010 testimony of Cecil Roberts (0.5); confer with E. Moskowitz and A. Gehring regarding preservation notice (0.1)
Zhu B	12/04/12	3.6	Conduct legal research regarding procedural and jurisdictional issues in preparation for override litigation (2.2); prepare outline of legal research (0.6); prepare and review various correspondence with J. Martin and litigation team regarding same (0.8).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Blakemore PW	12/05/12	6.7	Meet with B. Zhu and A. DeLaney about contract assignment issues for STB brief (0.6); meet with A. Delaney about the same (0.2); follow-up research on assignment for same (2.9); draft and edit email on assignment for same (1.6); read cases regarding same (0.5); research on procedure for cross-motions for declaratory judgments for same (0.4); draft email to L. Jacobs about same (0.2); gather sources regarding same (0.3).
DeLaney AN	12/05/12	1.4	Meet with B. Zhu and P. Blakemore regarding response to pleading (0.7); preparation for same (0.7).
Denkowski JP	12/05/12	0.2	Obtain Peabody Market capitalization and stock price statistics (For D. Loss).
Estacio R	12/05/12	1.7	Research and draft memorandum regarding claim allowance (1.2); read correspondence from E. FitzGerald and others regarding liability calculations (0.1); correspond with E. Sokoloff regarding legal issues to be researched (0.3); read analysis from A. Starr regarding benefits of new agreements (0.1).
Martin JD	12/05/12	2.7	Review materials related to Arch motion (1.5); analyze case strategy for adversary proceedings (1.2).
Ravi SK	12/05/12	0.3	Review memorandum on retiree liability issues.
Starr AT	12/05/12	0.9	Emails and calls regarding Arch motion to intervene (0.3); emails with Rudd counsel regarding notice of rejection (0.2); emails regarding insurance issues with J. Jones and Sidley Austin (0.4).
Zhu B	12/05/12	3.5	Conduct legal research regarding override-related issues (3.2); prepare and review various correspondence with J. Martin and litigation team regarding same (0.3).
Blakemore PW	12/06/12	0.7	Phone call with L. Jacobs about motions schedule for STB brief (0.4); phone call with B. Zhu about same (0.1); research on local bankruptcy rules (0.2).
DeLaney AN	12/06/12	1.7	Research relating to response to pleading.
Estacio R	12/06/12	2.8	Read correspondence from A. Starr regarding surety bonds (0.1); research and draft pension liability memorandum (2.2); conference with E. Moskowitz regarding research regarding pension liability calculations (0.1); conference with R. Aizen regarding the same (0.2); draft correspondence to E. Sokoloff regarding indemnification research (0.2).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	12/06/12	4.5	Draft response to Arch intervention motion (2.8); review research on contract integration issues (1.0); review materials related to Arch rejection motion (0.7).
Pucci MV	12/06/12	4.3	Identify and retrieve selected hearing transcripts as per C. Reiser (0.7); organize materials for and prepare index and binders of Selected Pleadings from Precedent Cases as per C. Reiser (3.6).
Ravi SK	12/06/12	0.2	Review case law research on indemnities.
Resnick BM	12/06/12	0.4	Emails regarding potential litigation causes of action against Peabody.
Starr AT	12/06/12	0.6	Emails regarding motion to intervene with J. Martin (0.2); review motion (0.2); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding counsel (0.2).
Zhu B	12/06/12	2.5	Conduct legal research regarding contract assignment-related issues (1.8); prepare various correspondence with A. Delaney and P. Blakemore regarding same (0.5); attend conference with A. Delaney regarding override litigation issues and research (0.2).
Estacio R	12/07/12	10.2	Conference with E. FitzGerald regarding pension liabilities (0.2); draft correspondence to E. FitzGerald regarding the same (0.1); correspond with J. Eum regarding compiling references relating to the same (0.1); draft analysis regarding the same for E. FitzGerald and R. Aizen (1.2); research and draft analysis regarding pension liabilities (8.4); conference with M. McGreal regarding memorandum regarding pension liabilities (0.2).
Martin JD	12/07/12	4.1	Update call with company and advisors (0.7); prepare for same (0.2); communications with C. Ebetino, J. Wagner and others regarding STB filing (0.7); communications with A. Starr, H. Baker and others regarding Arch motion (0.9); conference call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding rejection motion (0.5); prepare for same (0.3); review research on contract integration issue (0.8).
Starr AT	12/07/12	0.6	Calls with H. Baker and J. Martin regarding objection to selenium settlement (0.2); review opposition to Arch motion to intervene (0.3); emails regarding the same to J. Martin (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	12/07/12	7.3	Prepare draft statement of facts in preparation for override litigation (4.3); review underlying override agreement and related contracts in preparation for same (1.4); conduct case law research regarding law of assignments (1.1); prepare various correspondence with J. Martin and litigation team regarding same (0.5).
Estacio R	12/08/12	1.6	Draft correspondence to M. McGreal regarding pension liability research (0.2); research and draft analysis regarding pension liabilities for E. FitzGerald and R. Aizen (1.4).
Darcy D	12/09/12	1.1	Research case law regarding impact of venue transfer on choice of law analysis (0.3); review case law regarding same (0.8).
Moody, Jr. GM	12/09/12	1.4	Conduct legal research regarding royalty payments.
Starr AT	12/09/12	0.3	Emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee review of Arch agreement with C. Ebetino and R. Mead.
Blakemore PW	12/10/12	4.4	Review memorandum on integrated documents (0.1); conversation with G. Moody regarding contract assignments (0.6); attend meeting with J. Martin, B. Zhu, G. Moody and A. DeLaney about STB override (1.6); research on issues related to contract assignments (1.5); update notes and summaries on contract assignments (0.6).
Darcy D	12/10/12	3.3	Review statutes in connection with venue research (0.6); review table of projects (0.1); review case law regarding impact of change of venue on choice of law analysis (1.5); meet with M. Tobak to discuss research on same (1.0); draft notes on venue transfer research (0.1).
DeLaney AN	12/10/12	2.1	Team meeting with B. Zhu, G. Moody and P. Blakemore regarding strategy and next steps for STB litigation (1.6); review research (0.5).
Estacio R	12/10/12	5.3	Research and draft memorandum regarding pension liabilities (3.7); correspond with M. McGreal regarding the same (0.1); draft analysis regarding pension liability issue for M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and others (1.0); conference with R. Aizen and Patriot regarding retaining expert (0.5).
Huebner MS	12/10/12	0.2	Internal emails regarding integration law in the eighth circuit.
Krause SC	12/10/12	0.5	Review eDiscovery contract (0.2); emails regarding same (0.3).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	12/10/12	0.3	Review STB override motion for Eastern District of Missouri transfer-related edits (0.2); emails with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding same (0.1).
Martin JD	12/10/12	5.5	Communications with A. Starr, R. Estacio, J. Croft and others regarding Arch motion (0.8); finalize filing in STB adversary proceeding (0.5); analyze automatic stay issue (0.9); review research on contract integration arguments (1.8); conference with B. Zhu, G. Moody, A. Delaney, P. Blakemore regarding case strategy (1.5).
McGreal MM	12/10/12	0.2	Review response to Arch intervention motion (0.1); correspondence with B. Zhu and K. Coco regarding same (0.1).
Mehes A	12/10/12	0.1	Correspondence with B. Zhu regarding override claims research.
Moody, Jr. GM	12/10/12	6.6	Conduct legal research regarding royalty payments for executory contract brief (3.8); call with P. Blakemore regarding royalty payment legal research and outline for motion to dismiss executory contract complaint (0.5); call with B. Zhu regarding same (0.8); meet with J. Martin, B. Zhu and others regarding motion to dismiss executory contract complaint and general case strategy (1.5).
Resnick BM	12/10/12	0.5	Emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and Davis Polk team regarding Arch order (0.2); calls and emails with Kramer Levin and J. Martin regarding Arch motion (0.3).
Samet L	12/10/12	0.1	Meet with E. Moskowitz regarding potential venue issues.
Zhu B	12/10/12	5.2	Attend conference with J. Martin, A. Delaney, G. Moody and P. Blakemore regarding strategy and next steps for STB litigation (1.0); conduct legal research regarding integration and assignment law issues (3.3); prepare summary regarding same (0.4); prepare various correspondence with A. Mehes, J. Martin and litigation team regarding follow up legal research in preparation for override litigation (0.5).
Blakemore PW	12/11/12	2.6	Research on Rule 12(e) for STB brief (1.0); email A. DeLaney regarding same (0.2); research on Rule 19 (1.0); email A. DeLaney regarding same (0.4).
DeLaney AN	12/11/12	3.1	Draft narrative of contractual relationships.

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Estacio R	12/11/12	6.6	Research and draft memorandum regarding pension liabilities (6.4); correspond with M. McGreal and R. Aizen regarding the same (0.1); correspond with A. Moskowitz and M. Russano regarding the same (0.1).
Martin JD	12/11/12	1.6	Review and comment on draft case management order (0.5); review research on expert witness issue (0.6); communications with J. Mairo regarding status of STB adversary proceeding (0.3); review research relating to 8th Circuit pleading standards (0.2).
Moody, Jr. GM	12/11/12	2.3	Conduct legal research regarding override royalty issues under state law (2.1); review legal research of P. Blakemore regarding Missouri bankruptcy procedural motion practice (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/11/12	0.2	Emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and Davis Polk team regarding Arch order.
Zhu B	12/11/12	5.5	Conduct research regarding integration related issues in preparation for override litigation (3.3); review STB transactional agreements in preparation for STB litigation (0.8); revise factual narrative for STB litigation (0.9); prepare various correspondence with A. Delaney, G. Moody and P. Blakemore regarding same (0.5).
Blakemore PW	12/12/12	2.9	Research on modification of contract for STB brief (0.9); review cases on same (0.6); research on general assignment principles (1.1); draft email to B. Zhu about same (0.3).
DeLaney AN	12/12/12	2.6	Draft contractual narrative.
Martin JD	12/12/12	2.3	Communications with G. Plotko, J. Jones and C. Ebetino, A. Starr regarding Arch surety motion (0.6); call with J. Croft regarding Arch intervention motion (0.2); review research and arguments related to STB adversary proceeding (1.5).
McGreal MM	12/12/12	0.2	Correspondence with J. Martin and A. Libby regarding Arch's motion to intervene.
Mehes A	12/12/12	2.5	Research override claims.
Moody, Jr. GM	12/12/12	3.9	Conduct legal research regarding treatment of override royalty payments under state law (2.4); summarize legal research regarding override royalty payments (0.7); call with B. Zhu regarding same (0.8).
Resnick BM	12/12/12	0.2	Correspondence with Kramer Levin and Davis Polk team regarding Arch order.
Starr AT	12/12/12	0.2	Call with J. Jones regarding Keystone.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	12/12/12	5.6	Conduct case law research regarding assignment and override related issues in preparation for STB and RoyaltyCo litigations (3.7); revise draft statement of facts for STB litigation (0.7); prepare various correspondence with A. Delaney and P. Blakemore regarding same (0.5); confer with G. Moody regarding assignment related research findings (0.5); prepare and review correspondence with A. Mehes regarding Missouri law research into override related issues (0.2).
Blakemore PW	12/13/12	1.7	Meet STB with J. Martin, B. Zhu, G. Moody and A. DeLaney about 12(c) brief (1.2); review cases and treatises on assignment contracts (0.5).
DeLaney AN	12/13/12	1.2	Override team meeting with P. Blakemore, J. Martin, B. Zhu and G. Moody .
Martin JD	12/13/12	5.7	Conference with B. Zhu, G. Moody, A. Delaney and P. Blakemore regarding strategy in STB adversary proceeding (1.0); analysis in preparation for same (0.5); communications with client, Arch counsel, Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding Arch motion and order and related revisions to order (4.2)
McGreal MM	12/13/12	0.2	Correspondence with E. Waller and others regarding 9019 motions.
Mehes A	12/13/12	0.3	Research override claims.
Moody, Jr. GM	12/13/12	2.9	Meet with J. Martin, B. Zhu, A. Delaney and P. Blakemore regarding STB executory contract motion, research regarding override royalties and general case strategy (1.2); conduct legal research regarding override royalties (1.6); circulate sections of treatises regarding override research to B. Zhu and A. Mehes (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/13/12	0.9	Emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and Davis Polk team regarding Arch order (0.2); correspondence with M. Huebner, M. McGreal and E. Moskowitz regarding U.S. Trustee objection to fee statement (0.7).
Zhu B	12/13/12	4.3	Attend conference with J. Martin, A. Delaney, G. Moody and P. Blakemore regarding legal research and strategy for STB litigation (1.0); conduct legal research in 8th circuit regarding integration and severability related issues (3.3).
DeLaney AN	12/14/12	1.2	Draft revised contract narrative.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	12/14/12	0.5	Edit memorandum regarding pension liabilities (0.4); review correspondence from Arch and Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding coal supply agreements (0.1).
Martin JD	12/14/12	2.2	Communications with A. Starr, Arch counsel and Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding Arch motion and order (1.5); communications with J. Shook, H. Lawrence, J. Stillman and others regarding automatic stay issue (0.7).
Mehes A	12/14/12	0.2	Research override claims.
Moody, Jr. GM	12/14/12	1.1	Conduct legal research regarding override royalties.
Resnick BM	12/14/12	2.1	Correspondence with M. Huebner, M. McGreal, E. Moskowitz and S. Krause regarding U.S. Trustee objection (1.6); participate telephonically in court chambers conference (0.3); emails with Kramer Levin and A. Starr regarding Arch order (0.2).
Starr AT	12/14/12	0.8	Emails and calls regarding Rudd motion with K. Coco and Rudd counsel (0.2); emails with J. Martin and J. Stillman regarding stay motion from insurer (0.3); emails with M. Rsusano regarding Peabody inquiries (0.3).
Zhu B	12/14/12	3.8	Review case law in Missouri and 8th Circuit federal courts regarding override and integration related issues (3.7); prepare correspondence with A. Mehes regarding same (0.1).
Martin JD	12/15/12	0.1	Emails with Arch counsel and Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding Arch motion.
Resnick BM	12/15/12	0.2	Email to M. Huebner regarding U.S. Trustee objection.
Martin JD	12/16/12	0.3	Emails with Kramer Levin regarding Arch motion (0.2); emails with M. McGreal and A. Starr regarding motions on for omnibus hearing (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/16/12	1.0	Review and revise talking points for Sierra Club settlement hearing.
Blakemore PW	12/17/12	4.9	Research on covenants running with the land and related issues for STB brief (2.3); read cases on covenants (1.6); draft response to questions about covenants to J. Martin and B. Zhu (1.0).
Martin JD	12/17/12	5.3	Revise proposed order and agreements for Arch motion (0.5); review research on contract integration issues for adversary proceedings (3.8); review contract for potential rejection (0.8); emails regarding same with A. Mehes (0.2).
Mehes A	12/17/12	0.5	Research override claims.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moody, Jr. GM	12/17/12	3.1	Conduct legal research regarding override royalties (2.9); correspondence with B. Zhu regarding override royalty legal research (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/17/12	2.7	Prepare oral argument for court hearing (1.9); discuss hearing issues with M. Huebner and M. McGreal (0.8).
Starr AT	12/17/12	0.2	Calls and emails regarding Rudd rejection order with K. Coco.
Zhu B	12/17/12	4.5	Revise draft statement of facts for STB draft motion (3.1); analyze STB agreements in preparation for same (1.1); prepare various correspondence with J. Martin and litigation team regarding same (0.3).
Blakemore PW	12/18/12	3.7	Meet with J. Martin, B. Zhu, G. Moody and A. DeLaney about STB briefing (1.1); review Massey 12(c) motion (0.7); read outline of relevant contracts (0.5); research on covenants (1.0); draft and send email memo regarding same (0.4).
DeLaney AN	12/18/12	1.8	Meet with J. Martin, B. Zhu, G. Moody and P. Blakemore regarding STB briefing (1.2); research into procedural issues (0.6).
Martin JD	12/18/12	3.4	Conference with B. Zhu, G. Moody, A. Delaney, P. Blakemore regarding STB adversary proceeding (1.0); review research relating to override agreements (0.8); review research on lease assignments (0.9); review contract for potential rejection (0.3); review research regarding rejection of settlement agreement (0.4).
McGreal MM	12/18/12	0.1	Correspondence with E. Waller, A. McCallister and others regarding 9019 orders.
Moody, Jr. GM	12/18/12	3.9	Meet with J. Martin, B. Zhu, A. Delaney and P. Blakemore regarding legal and factual research on override agreement for STB 12(c) motion (1.0); conduct legal research regarding override royalties (2.9).
Resnick BM	12/18/12	2.0	Argue Sierra Club motion in court hearing.
Starr AT	12/18/12	0.3	Calls with M. Russano regarding Peabody inquiry.
Stillman JR	12/18/12	0.1	Review motion to enforce settlement filed in violation of the stay.
Zhu B	12/18/12	3.8	Attend strategy conference with J. Martin, A. Delaney, G. Moody and P. Blakemore regarding STB litigation and follow up research (1.0); prepare draft outline of motion regarding same (2.1); review legal research regarding settlement agreement issues relating to Colver mine matter (0.5); review correspondence with J. Martin and A. Mehes regarding same (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Blakemore PW	12/19/12	5.9	Conduct substantive research on covenants (2.9); review significant West Virginia cases on covenants (2.0); draft email regarding same to J. Martin (1.0).
Martin JD	12/19/12	5.0	Review remand order in Bowles action (0.4); analysis of strategy in Bowles action (0.3); conference with J. Stillman regarding filing in Bowles action (0.2); review plaintiffs' filing in Bowles action (0.3); communications with M. McGreal, E. Waller and others regarding finalizing Solar settlement (0.4); analysis of contracts and legal research for STB adversary proceeding (3.4).
McGreal MM	12/19/12	0.6	Correspondence with E. Waller, J. Martin and others regarding Solar settlement payment (0.2); correspondence with co-counsel to PRP Group regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Glazer regarding pending adversary proceedings (0.2).
Mehes A	12/19/12	2.9	Research override claims.
Moody, Jr. GM	12/19/12	7.7	Conduct legal research regarding override royalties for STB 12(c) motion (6.3); summarize legal research regarding override royalties for STB 12(c) motion (1.3); send summary of legal research to J. Martin and B. Zhu (0.1).
Starr AT	12/19/12	0.5	Emails with J. Martin and J. Stillman regarding Boone County remand decision (0.2); review remand decision (0.3).
Stillman JR	12/19/12	1.5	Meet with J. Martin regarding response to stay violation (0.2); review background emails and motion papers (0.3); research 8th Circuit law on stay violations (1.0).
Zhu B	12/19/12	6.4	Prepare draft memorandum of law in STB litigation (3.2); review case law in preparation for same (2.1); conduct legal research regarding procedural issues in STB litigation (1.1).
Blakemore PW	12/20/12	1.6	Research summary judgment issues (1.0); correspond with A. DeLaney regarding same (0.1); read cases on overrides (0.5).
DeLaney AN	12/20/12	0.5	Research procedural issues.
Martin JD	12/20/12	3.1	Calls and emails with J. Stillman, E. Waller, J. Shook and F. Simmerman regarding Bowles action (0.8); review recent filings in Bowles action (0.4); communications with A. Starr, D. Klein, C. Ebetino and others regarding lease assumption rejection questions and related analysis (1.4); coordinate work on Massey, STB adversary proceedings (0.5).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Mehes A	12/20/12	0.1	Correspondence with team regarding change of venue.
Oliva M	12/20/12	1.0	Cite check and quote check brief, per A. Libby.
Starr AT	12/20/12	0.9	Review Boone County decision (0.4); email to J. Stillman regarding same (0.1); emails regarding retention agreement with B. Resnick and M. Huebner (0.2); review retention agreement (0.2).
Zhu B	12/20/12	8.0	Confer with D. Klein regarding issues relating to assumption and rejection of Arch assigned leases (0.2); conduct legal research regarding same (2.7); analyze assignment and assumption agreements regarding same (1.3); correspond with J. Martin, A. Starr and litigation team regarding same (0.2); prepare outline of memorandum of law in STB litigation (2.2); review case law in preparation for same (1.4).
Blakemore PW	12/21/12	3.2	Research on declaratory judgments (1.1); draft email to A. Delaney on same (0.1); research on assignments under the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.2); correspond with B. Zhu regarding same (0.3); research on overrides (0.5).
Martin JD	12/21/12	4.3	Call to M. Huebner regarding lease rejection issue (0.2); conference with A. Starr, B. Zhu and A. Mehes regarding lease rejection issue (0.7); analysis of lease rejection issue and related emails with D. Klein and others (0.9); communications with J. Stillman regarding automatic stay issue and review draft brief (0.8); update call with company and advisers (0.7); emails with B. Resnick and others regarding case scheduling (0.2); communications with C. Miller regarding Peabody subpoena (0.2); review research on contract integration issues (0.6).
Mehes A	12/21/12	3.7	Meet with A. Starr, J. Martin and B. Zhu regarding executory contract rejection (1.3); research discovery issues (2.4).
Samet L	12/21/12	9.5	Telephone calls with potential expert (0.8); emails with potential expert and with J. Bean and M. Luna regarding same (0.9); emails with E. Moskowitz and A. Gehring regarding data room issues (0.4); meet with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding case strategy (0.4); meet with E. Sokoloff regarding draft court papers (0.3); draft memorandum of law (5.9); research for same (0.7); review pro hac papers (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	12/21/12	2.7	Calls and emails regarding counsel representation issues with E. Moskowitz, M. Russano, J. Bean, B. Walsh and M. Huebner.
Stillman JR	12/21/12	3.9	Research the law of the 8th, 4th and 2nd Circuits regarding stay violations and draft argument for brief in opposition to motion to enforce settlement agreement.
Zhu B	12/21/12	6.6	Attend strategy conference with A. Starr, J. Martin and A. Mehes regarding lease assumption and rejection issues (0.6); confer with A. Mehes regarding same (0.2); research case law regarding assumption and rejection of assigned contracts (3.2); research Unsecured Creditors' Committee rules regarding assignment law issues in preparation for STB litigation (2.1); correspond with J. Martin and P. Blakemore regarding same (0.5).
Zhu B	12/22/12	4.7	Conduct legal research regarding rejection of leases and assignment agreements (4.2); prepare notes regarding same (0.5).
Zhu B	12/24/12	4.9	Conduct legal research regarding law of assignments and lease rejections (4.5); prepare correspondence with A. Mehes regarding same (0.4).
Martin JD	12/26/12	1.0	Conference call with A. Starr, B. Zhu and A. Mehes regarding lease rejection issue (0.5); review research regarding same (0.3); emails with B. Resnick regarding case scheduling (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/26/12	0.2	Emails with J. Martin regarding override litigation.
Starr AT	12/26/12	1.1	Calls with M. Bryan regarding legal representation issues (0.7); emails to E. Moskowitz, M. Russano and M. Huebner regarding the same (0.4).
Zhu B	12/26/12	6.3	Conduct case law research regarding law of assignments and integration related issues (5.2); draft research summary for A. Starr and J. Martin (0.8); prepare correspondence with A. Mehes regarding same (0.3).
Zhu B	12/27/12	9.1	Conduct legal research regarding contract integration and assignment law related issues in preparation for potential litigation (4.7); prepare various correspondence with A. Starr, J. Martin and litigation team regarding same (0.5); conduct case law research in preparation for STB litigation (2.3); prepare draft outline of STB brief (1.6).
Blakemore PW	12/28/12	0.1	Review research on integration.
Zhu B	12/28/12	7.6	Research case law on contract integration and override related issues in preparation for STB litigation (2.4); prepare draft outline of STB brief (5.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	12/29/12	5.6	Review case law research regarding override related issues in preparation for STB litigation (1.2); prepare draft outline of STB brief (4.4).
Zhu B	12/30/12	4.5	Prepare draft outline of STB brief (3.4); review legal research and various correspondence in preparation for same (1.1).
<b>Total AUTOMATIC STAY\ LITIGATION</b>		<b>438.6</b>	
<b>CLAIMS INVESTIGATIONS</b>			
Tobak MJ	12/01/12	4.9	Draft discovery document (3.7); legal research in connection with same (1.2).
Gehring AS	12/03/12	3.2	Redact documents for privilege (0.1); emails with M. Russano regarding same (0.2); update privilege log (0.1); call with M. Tobak regarding case status (0.2); call with C. Reiser regarding review of subsidiary records (0.1); email to M. Russano regarding same (0.2); review precedent actions (2.1); emails with M. Tobak regarding spin-off documents (0.1); review emails regarding assumption of liabilities (0.1).
Loss DM	12/03/12	1.8	Conferences with M. Tobak regarding investigation (0.3); fact research regarding Magnum acquisition (1.0); fact research regarding retiree liabilities (0.4); correspondence with C. Reiser regarding precedent research (0.1).
Reiser CM	12/03/12	4.3	Emails with M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding Patriot organizational documents and minutes review (0.1); update production log (0.1); discuss Patriot subsidiary documents and records review with A. Gehring (0.2); review email concerning Patriot's retiree healthcare costs (0.1); review trial transcripts, court decisions and other filings from cases involving spin-off transactions for possible inclusion in precedent pack (3.8).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Russano MJ	12/03/12	2.9	Confer with M. Tobak and D. Loss regarding status of document review and collection (0.1); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding general conduct of investigation (0.3); confer with E. Moskowitz and A. Gehring regarding preservation notice (0.1); confer with J. Bean regarding board and committee minutes and production regarding same (0.4); review and revise redactions regarding same (0.6); review correspondence and information from J. Bean regarding Peabody assumed retirees (0.5); review correspondence with local counsel regarding investigation issues (0.2); emails with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding meeting with Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.5); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding procedures for client interviews (0.2).
Tobak MJ	12/03/12	7.8	Legal research regarding Coal Act (0.6); conference with D. Loss regarding status (0.3); revise discovery documents (0.7); fact research and development regarding legacy liabilities (5.1); review summaries of board minutes (1.1).
Gehring AS	12/04/12	4.7	Emails from M. Russano and C. Reiser regarding Peabody brief (0.3); meet with M. Tobak, S. Ravi and C. Reiser regarding assumption of liabilities (0.5); email to M. Tobak, S. Ravi and C. Reiser regarding same (0.1); calls with C. Reiser regarding same (0.3); call with M. Tobak regarding same (0.5); calls with S. Ravi regarding same (0.2); research same (2.3); update document retention notice (0.4); emails with L. Jacobs regarding same (0.1).
Loss DM	12/04/12	5.6	Confer with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding claims (0.5); confer with M. Tobak regarding potential claims (0.4); review Peabody pleading regarding equity committee (0.4); work on legal memo and analysis of market data (4.3).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Reiser CM	12/04/12	10.4	Review trial transcripts, court decisions and other filings from cases involving spin-off transactions for possible inclusion in precedent pack (1.9); review response to motion of interested shareholders filed on bankruptcy docket and prepare email summary of same (0.4); review email from M. Tobak regarding research assignment, as well as relevant background materials, to prepare for meeting concerning same (0.4); perform retiree cost liabilities research and preparation of bullet-point memorandum regarding same (7.3); discuss retiree cost liabilities research with S. Ravi (0.4).
Russano MJ	12/04/12	4.5	Call with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding Peabody liability assumption (0.3); meet with D. Loss and M. Tobak regarding same and resulting legal and factual research into possible claims (0.5); confer with E. Moskowitz and J. Snider regarding conduct and structuring of claims investigation (0.4); review correspondence regarding benefit plan pre-funding and confer with D. Loss regarding same (0.3); email to G. Plotko regarding board minutes and production of same (0.3); review Peabody equity committee response (0.5); confer with C. Reiser regarding same (0.2); confer with M. Tobak regarding status of document collection and review (0.2); confer with M. Tobak regarding Rule 2004 subpoena and motion (0.1); call with J. Bean regarding various issues, including liability assumption and claims investigation (0.6); email to M. Huebner, A. Starr and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.4); call with professional, M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding claims investigation and general oversight role (0.5); confer with D. Loss, M. Tobak, A. Gehring and C. Reiser about preparation of background materials for professional (0.2).
Tobak MJ	12/04/12	3.6	Conference with M. Russano and D. Loss regarding Peabody issue research (0.5); conferences and correspondence with A. Gehring, S. Ravi and C. Reiser regarding same (1.9); draft memorandum regarding same (1.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Gehring AS	12/05/12	4.9	Research liabilities assumption agreements (1.1); email to M. Tobak regarding same (0.4); call with C. Reiser regarding same (0.1); call with M. Tobak regarding same (0.2); review memorandum regarding same (0.3); emails with Litigation Technical Services regarding document database (0.3); collect documents pertaining to spin-off (1.4); emails with M. Russano regarding Patriot settlements (0.5); calls with M. Tobak regarding document database (0.5); call with D. Loss regarding coal supply agreements (0.1).
Loss DM	12/05/12	6.1	Confer with C. Reiser regarding investigation (0.1); confer with A. Gehring regarding coal supply contracts (0.1); conferences with M. Tobak regarding investigation (0.7); work on legal analysis memo and solvency analysis (5.2).
Reiser CM	12/05/12	8.5	Retiree cost liabilities research and preparation of bullet-point memorandum regarding same (3.9); review amended preservation notice (0.1); review trial transcripts, court decisions and other filings from cases involving spin-off transactions for possible inclusion in precedent pack (3.2); review retiree cost liabilities research prepared by A. Gehring (0.1); discuss retiree cost liabilities research with M. Tobak (0.4); prepare email to M. Pucci concerning documents to be included in culled precedent binder (0.4); review draft memorandum on retiree cost liabilities research and emails concerning same (0.4).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Russano MJ	12/05/12	5.9	Call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding production of board minutes (0.2); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); confer with J. Bean regarding general claims investigation update (0.2); update claims investigation timeline, including review and analysis of various press releases, earnings calls and public filings (2.8); confer with M. Tobak regarding review and collection of company emails (0.2); prepare for client interviews (0.4); email to J. Bean regarding provision of solvency related materials to Blackstone (0.2); review memo regarding retiree putback and possible claims (0.8); confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.1); confer with E. Moskowitz, B. Resnick, S. Krause and M. Tobak regarding document vendor process (0.5); review assignment task list and confer with M. Tobak and D. Loss regarding same (0.4).
Tobak MJ	12/05/12	9.3	Draft memorandum analyzing issues related to Peabody, including analysis of research of S. Ravi, A. Gehring and C. Reiser (6.7); multiple conferences with D. Loss and A. Gehring regarding legal research and analysis (0.9); legal research regarding Coal Act (0.9); prepare list of outstanding tasks (0.8).
Gehring AS	12/06/12	2.0	Emails with D. Loss regarding coal supply contracts (1.0); call with D. Loss regarding same (0.2); call with C. Ebetino and J. Haider regarding document collection (0.2); calls with M. Tobak regarding same (0.2); emails with M. Russano regarding same (0.1); meet with M. Russano regarding same (0.2); call with C. Reiser regarding document review (0.1).
Loss DM	12/06/12	5.0	Correspondence with A. Gehring regarding coal supply contracts (1.0); teleconference with A. Gehring regarding same (0.2); correspondence with C. Reiser regarding legal precedents (0.3); revise legal analysis memo (3.5).
Reiser CM	12/06/12	0.9	Discuss Patriot document review project with A. Gehring (0.1); review culled precedent binder prepared by M. Pucci and calls with M. Pucci regarding same (0.7); discuss Patriot document review project with M. Tobak (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Russano MJ	12/06/12	6.8	Confer with E. Moskowitz regarding document collection and review protocols and custodians (0.3); confer with S. Krause and M. Tobak regarding same (0.4); confer with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding review of hard-copy documents (0.2); email to J. Bean regarding employee interviews (0.1); confer with M. Tobak regarding preparation for same, including review and analysis of emails (0.3); call with client regarding potential interviews and protocol for same (0.5); confer with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5); meet with A. Gehring regarding same (0.3); call to B. O'Neill regarding claim investigation coordination, planning and Rule 2004 requests (0.1); confer with D. Darcy regarding statute of limitations research (0.1); review client interview memo (0.9); legal and factual research relevant to claims investigation, including review of public filings and other transaction documents (3.1).
Tobak MJ	12/06/12	3.8	Analysis of coal supply agreements (2.4); revise discovery documents (1.0); analysis of coal act liabilities (0.4).
Gehring AS	12/07/12	1.7	Calls with M. Tobak regarding document review (0.3); call with C. Reiser regarding same (0.1); gather documents for professional (0.3); emails with M. Russano, D. Loss and M. Tobak regarding same (0.2); call with S. Ravi regarding document review (0.4); email to S. Ravi regarding same (0.1); calls with C. Reiser regarding same (0.3).
Loss DM	12/07/12	0.3	Correspondence with M. Russano, M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding investigation.
McGreal MM	12/07/12	0.2	Conference with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and M. Russano regarding diligence and information requests.
Ravi SK	12/07/12	1.8	Call with A. Gehring regarding §1113 proceeding and spin-off investigation (0.4); meet with M. Russano regarding document review in St. Louis (0.2); call with C. Reiser regarding St. Louis document review (0.1); review documents regarding spin-off investigation (1.1).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Reiser CM	12/07/12	1.9	Review trial transcripts, court decisions and other filings from cases involving spin-off transactions for possible inclusion in precedent pack (1.6); discuss St. Louis document review project with M. Russano (0.1); discuss St. Louis document review project with S. Ravi (0.1); discuss labor issues with A. Gehring (0.1).
Russano MJ	12/07/12	7.2	Meet with E. Moskowitz regarding various issues, including investigation management and staffing, ongoing research assignments and document review (0.5); emails with M. Huebner regarding investigation management (0.2); prepare for client interviews, including review of documents (2.2); confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.2); confer with D. Loss and M. Tobak regarding binder of materials for professional (0.2); review and revise ongoing task tracking chart (0.4); meet with M. Tobak regarding same (0.2); weekly call with clients regarding various issues, including document review and client interviews (0.7); confer with M. Tobak regarding staffing for hardcopy document review (0.3); confer with E. Moskowitz and S. Ravi regarding same (0.3); calls with B. O'Neill, G. Plotko and M. Tobak regarding Rule 2004 subpoena and investigation strategy (1.0); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.3); review company by-laws and indemnification provisions (0.4); emails to M. Huebner and J. Bean regarding same (0.3).
Tobak MJ	12/07/12	3.9	Conference with M. Russano regarding outstanding tasks (0.4); conference with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and M. Russano regarding strategy and legal analysis (1.0); conference with E. Moskowitz and M. Russano regarding same (0.5); conference with D. Darcy regarding legal research (0.2); review memorandum of D. Loss regarding legal analysis (1.2); correspondence and conferences regarding document collection and processing (0.6).
Gehring AS	12/08/12	0.2	Emails with Litigation Technical Services regarding document database (0.1); emails with M. Tobak regarding document review (0.1).
Reiser CM	12/08/12	0.8	Review interview memorandum and background materials in preparation for spin-off-related email document review project (0.4); review emails relating to spin-off (0.4).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Tobak MJ	12/08/12	4.2	Document research regarding spin-off (2.1); correspondence with A. Gehring, S. Ravi, C. Reiser, R. Cheong regarding document collection and review (0.5); review documents (1.6).
Gehring AS	12/09/12	1.0	Calls with S. Ravi regarding spinoff-related document review (0.3); call with M. Tobak regarding same (0.1); meet with M. Tobak regarding same (0.1); review documents (0.5).
Ravi SK	12/09/12	1.1	Review background materials in preparation for review of client emails (0.3); calls with A. Gehring regarding document review (0.3); review solvency analysis, §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals in preparation for St. Louis document review (0.5).
Reiser CM	12/09/12	2.7	Review emails relating to spin-off.
Tobak MJ	12/09/12	0.4	Perform factual research regarding spin-off.
Darcy D	12/10/12	1.2	Research case law regarding fraudulent transfer statute.
Gehring AS	12/10/12	4.9	Review client emails for information pertinent to potential claims investigation (3.9); email to team regarding relevant emails (0.4); gather documents for Special Litigation Committee (0.5); calls with S. Ravi and C. Reiser regarding document review (0.1).
Loss DM	12/10/12	2.0	Conference with M. Russano regarding legal claims memo (0.3); revise legal issues memo (0.9); correspondence regarding materials for special litigation counsel (0.2); review relevant documents (0.6).
Pucci MV	12/10/12	3.3	Organize materials for, and prepare index and binders of, materials related to spin-off.
Ravi SK	12/10/12	10.6	Review Patriot documents at Patriot headquarters in St. Louis, Missouri (9.6); discuss status of document review project with M. Russano and C. Reiser (0.1); discuss status of case with C. Reiser (0.1); discuss status of document review project with M. Tobak and C. Reiser (0.2); consolidate summary of documents reviewed and prepare email to M. Russano concerning the same (0.6).
Reiser CM	12/10/12	11.0	Review Patriot documents at Patriot headquarters in St. Louis, Missouri and determine which files to copy (10.0); discuss status of document review project with M. Russano and S. Ravi (0.1); discuss status of case with S. Ravi (0.1); discuss status of document review project with M. Tobak and S. Ravi (0.2); consolidate summary of documents reviewed and prepare email to M. Russano concerning same (0.6).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Russano MJ	12/10/12	7.6	Confer with client regarding interview scheduling (0.2); prepare for client interview, including review of documents and interview outline (2.8); draft email regarding investigation cooperation (0.4); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); email to clients regarding same (0.2); review and revise legal claims memo (1.1); confer with D. Loss regarding same (0.3); review assignment tracking chart and confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.4); review binder index for special committee counsel (0.2); confer with M. Tobak and S. Krause regarding document processing in preparation for review (0.3); review and comment on revised legal issues memo (0.4); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding privilege and the production of documents (0.5); confer with D. Darcy regarding statute of limitations research (0.1); confer with S. Ravi and C. Reiser regarding results of onsite review of documents (0.3); review tracking chart regarding same (0.3).
Tobak MJ	12/10/12	7.9	Prepare memorandum for client interview, including review of key documents (7.4); revise list of outstanding tasks (0.3); conference with D. Darcy regarding legal research (0.2).
Darcy D	12/11/12	0.5	Review case law on fraudulent transfer statute.
Gehring AS	12/11/12	0.4	Email to M. Tobak regarding client interview questions.
Loss DM	12/11/12	2.8	Conference with M. Tobak regarding legal research (0.6); correspondence with M. Tobak regarding same (0.1); review noteworthy documents including financial projections (1.1); teleconference with Blackstone (0.3); preparation for teleconference with Blackstone (0.4); draft summary of call with Blackstone (0.2); correspondence with C. Reiser regarding legal precedents (0.1).
Pucci MV	12/11/12	4.1	Organize materials for, and prepare index and binders of, Peabody and Patriot Board Presentations (2.3); organize case files on directory for all claims investigations materials (1.8).
Ravi SK	12/11/12	8.4	Review Patriot documents at Patriot headquarters in St. Louis, Missouri and determine which files to copy (7.6); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding status of document review project (0.2); consolidate summary of documents reviewed and prepare email to M. Russano concerning same (0.6).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Reiser CM	12/11/12	11.4	Review Patriot documents at Patriot headquarters in St. Louis, Missouri and determine which files to copy (10.6); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding status of document review project (0.2); consolidate summary of documents reviewed and prepare email to M. Russano concerning same (0.6).
Russano MJ	12/11/12	5.1	Prepare for client interview, including review and revisions to interview outline and review of documents (4.2); confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.4); confer with D. Loss regarding solvency analysis and review correspondence with Blackstone regarding same (0.2); confer with S. Ravi and C. Reiser regarding hard-copy document review (0.3).
Tobak MJ	12/11/12	8.9	Conference with D. Loss regarding legal research (0.5); draft preparation materials for client meeting (8.4).
Darcy D	12/12/12	1.5	Review and conduct research regarding fraudulent transfer statutes.
Gehring AS	12/12/12	1.3	Emails with C. Reiser regarding document review (0.1); review client emails (0.4); emails with E. Moskowitz, M. Russano and D. Loss regarding solvency analyses (0.5); email to M. Tobak regarding document collection (0.1); emails with M. Russano regarding provision of documents to SLC and Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2).
Loss DM	12/12/12	0.8	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz, M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding solvency analyses (0.3); correspondence with A. Gehring and L. Samet regarding production of documents to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.1); teleconference with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding document review (0.3); correspondence with Blackstone regarding solvency analyses (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/12/12	0.1	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz, M. Russano and others regarding spin-off documents.
Ravi SK	12/12/12	7.7	Review Patriot documents at Patriot headquarters in St. Louis, Missouri and determine which files to copy for further review (7.5); email to J. Bean regarding completion of review (0.1); review email detailing copying instructions to C. Papenberg (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Reiser CM	12/12/12	8.4	Review Patriot documents at Patriot headquarters in St. Louis, Missouri and determine which files to copy (7.7); consolidate summary of documents reviewed and prepare email detailing copying instructions to C. Papenberg (0.7).
Russano MJ	12/12/12	9.2	Prepare for and attend client interviews and meetings (5.3); meet with S. Ravi and C. Reiser regarding document review (0.5); confer with D. Loss regarding solvency materials and collection (0.3); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding production of solvency materials and designation of same (0.4); email to Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding same (0.4); confer with E. Moskowitz and M. McGreal regarding production of spin-off binder (0.3); review various solvency-related materials (1.1); review and revise draft Epiq contract and confer with J. Bean regarding same (0.9).
Tobak MJ	12/12/12	6.5	Prepare for and attend client interview and meetings.
Darcy D	12/13/12	0.5	Review case law regarding fraudulent transfer statute.
Gehring AS	12/13/12	7.3	Calls and meeting with C. Reiser regarding document review (0.5); call with D. Loss regarding same (0.1); review client's emails (1.9); email to E. Moskowitz, M. Russano and M. McGreal regarding production of documents to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.7); draft document review protocol (2.7); emails with D. Loss regarding same (0.2); review inventory of Patriot hard copy documents (0.1); prepare documents for the Special Litigation Committee (0.2); review D. Loss's memorandum regarding potential claims (0.6); review Peabody board presentations (0.3).
Loss DM	12/13/12	5.1	Correspondence with M. Tobak regarding document collection (0.3); confer with C. Reiser regarding precedent research (0.2); teleconference with A. Gehring regarding document review (0.1); correspondence with A. Gehring regarding document review protocol (0.2); analysis of financial projections (0.8); correspondence with Blackstone regarding same (0.2); revise document review protocol (3.3).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Ravi SK	12/13/12	1.3	Calls with C. Reiser regarding inventory spreadsheet of Patriot hardcopy documents and copying of such documents (0.6); review and send email regarding the same (0.4); review inventory spreadsheet of Patriot hardcopy documents (0.2); call with J. Bean regarding scanning of hard copy documents (0.1).
Reiser CM	12/13/12	10.9	Review items circulated in connection with review of emails relating to spin-off (0.4); review draft memorandum regarding claims investigation (0.5); confer with A. Gehring regarding spin-off email review (0.7); update Patriot hardcopy documents inventory spreadsheet, coordinate copying of documents therein, prepare email summary of inventory and emails and calls with C. Papenberg and S. Ravi regarding same (3.6); review trial transcripts, court decisions and other filings from cases involving spin-off transactions for possible inclusion in precedent pack (1.7); confer with D. Loss regarding case relevant to precedent collection (0.2); review emails relating to spin-off (3.8).
Russano MJ	12/13/12	7.6	Prepare for and attend client meetings and interviews (5.4); confer with S. Ravi and C. Reiser regarding review and collection of documents (0.4); email to Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding designation of documents and confer with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (0.4); confer with E. Moskowitz, M. McGreal and A. Gehring regarding designation and production of closing binder (0.3); confer with D. Loss, A. Gehring and M. Tobak regarding preparation of special committee background binder (0.2); review correspondence to Blackstone regarding solvency analysis (0.1); review solvency related documents (0.8).
Tobak MJ	12/13/12	4.1	Prepare for and attend client meetings and interviews.
Darcy D	12/14/12	0.7	Review email summarizing status of investigation (0.2); discuss progress on fraudulent transfer research with M. Tobak (0.4); compile cases to send to M. Tobak (0.1).
Gehring AS	12/14/12	1.6	Review emails for information pertaining to potential claims investigation (0.6); calls with C. Reiser regarding same (0.2); emails with Litigation Technical Services regarding document database (0.1); call with D. Loss regarding document review protocol (0.1); revise same (0.6).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Loss DM	12/14/12	5.1	Confer with C. Reiser regarding precedent research (0.2); analysis of solvency issues (0.6); edit document review protocol (3.7); review precedent research (0.5); teleconference with J. Hagan regarding document analysts (0.1).
Reiser CM	12/14/12	4.3	Review summary judgment decision in precedent spin-off case and prepare email summary analyzing the same (3.8); confer with D. Loss regarding case relevant to precedent collection (0.2); confer with A. Gehring regarding spin-off email review (0.3).
Russano MJ	12/14/12	2.7	Draft investigation summary update for M. Huebner, B. Resnick and E. Moskowitz (0.9); confer with D. Loss regarding Blackstone solvency analysis (0.1); email to B. O'Neill and G. Plotko regarding scheduling of client interview (0.2); email to client regarding same (0.2); confer with A. Starr regarding investigation update (0.1); confer with D. Loss and M. Tobak regarding document review planning and staffing (0.4); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); review and revise document review protocol (0.7).
Tobak MJ	12/14/12	2.7	Correspond with D. Loss and M. Russano regarding case status and discovery (0.4); conference with D. Loss regarding factual and legal research (0.7); review memorandum of D. Loss regarding research (0.5); conference with D. Darcy regarding legal research (0.4); review research of D. Darcy (0.7).
Darcy D	12/15/12	0.4	Review case law regarding fraudulent transfer statute.
Reiser CM	12/16/12	0.8	Review trial transcripts, court decisions and other filings from cases involving spin-off transactions for possible inclusion in precedent pack.
Tobak MJ	12/16/12	1.8	Review draft discovery protocol (0.2); revise draft discovery documents (0.9); legal research in connection with same (0.7).
Darcy D	12/17/12	2.2	Read case law on fraudulent transfer statute.
Gehring AS	12/17/12	3.8	Call with M. Tobak regarding document review (0.2); call with C. Reiser regarding same (0.2); review emails for information pertinent to potential claims investigation (2.1); send letter to M. Kafoury at Arch Coal regarding document preservation (0.2); revise document review protocol (0.4); emails with Litigation Technical Services regarding loading Patriot employees' emails into review database (0.7).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Loss DM	12/17/12	0.5	Correspondence with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding discovery issues (0.3); correspondence with A. Gehring regarding coal supply contracts (0.1); correspondence with C. Reiser regarding legal precedents (0.1).
Ravi SK	12/17/12	0.3	Call with C. Reiser regarding status of scanning of hard copy documents (0.1); send email to C. Reiser regarding the same (0.1); call with A. Gehring regarding claims investigation document review (0.1).
Reiser CM	12/17/12	2.8	Review trial transcripts, court decisions and other filings from cases involving spin-off transactions for possible inclusion in precedent pack (1.6); confer with A. Gehring regarding spin-off email review (0.2); confer with M. Tobak regarding copying of Patriot documents and emails and calls with G. Koenig and C. Papenberg regarding same (0.3); confer with S. Ravi regarding status of case (0.1); confer with M. Tobak regarding precedent citations for discovery request document and prepare citations for the same (0.6).
Russano MJ	12/17/12	10.7	Confer with E. Moskowitz regarding document review staffing and procedures (0.4); meet with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5); emails with L. Kabakov regarding same (0.3); review, revise and edit document review protocol and confer with D. Loss regarding same (1.1); email to B. O'Neill and G. Plotko regarding client interview scheduling (0.2); email to client regarding same (0.3); review Epiq contract (0.8); email to J. Bean regarding same (0.1); email to J. Bean regarding document collection (0.1); confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.4); confer with M. Tobak regarding interview notes (0.1); confer with E. Moskowitz and A. Gehring regarding preparation and special committee background binder (0.3); confer with A. Gehring regarding privilege log (0.1); review letter regarding document preservation (0.2); review, revise and analyze legal claims memo (1.2); update investigation factual background document (2.1); review interview notes (0.7); review solvency materials (1.3); review union correspondence regarding third-party claims (0.5).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Tobak MJ	12/17/12	8.6	Draft memorandum regarding client interview (5.1); revise draft discovery documents (1.9); legal research in connection with same (0.2); correspondence and conferences with M. Russano, D. Loss and A. Gehring regarding document review and collection (1.4).
Darcy D	12/18/12	1.6	Review case law on fraudulent transfer statute.
Gehring AS	12/18/12	2.6	Emails with M. Russano regarding meeting with client (0.2); emails with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding document review (0.2); call with C. Reiser regarding same (0.1); meet with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding case status (0.3); letters to Special Litigation Committee regarding documents pertaining to potential claims investigation (0.6); emails with Litigation Technical Services regarding loading documents into the database (0.1); review client emails for information pertinent to potential claims investigation (1.1).
Ravi SK	12/18/12	0.4	Calls with C. Reiser regarding scanning and saving of hard copy documents collected from Patriot's offices in St. Louis (0.1); review emails regarding the same (0.2); review saved files on drive (0.1).
Reiser CM	12/18/12	2.3	Coordinate FTP download of Patriot hardcopy documents, including calls and emails with S. Ravi, A. Gehring, R. Cheong and C. Hinton and review of downloaded materials (2.0); confer with A. Gehring regarding spin-off email review (0.1); review spin-off review protocol (0.2).
Russano MJ	12/18/12	5.7	Review and revise document review protocol (0.9); email to E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); emails with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding document review and document reviewer training (0.3); confer with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding client interview scheduling (0.3); prepare for client interview (1.3); confer with client regarding same (0.3); confer with team regarding document collection and processing (0.4); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding investigation planning and board presentation (0.4); email to M. Huebner regarding same (0.1); review and revise document vendor contract (0.8); meet with A. Gehring and M. Tobak regarding investigation planning document (0.6); confer with D. Loss regarding solvency analysis (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Tobak MJ	12/18/12	5.9	Conference with M. Russano, A. Gehring regarding client request (0.3); draft and revise client interview memo (5.4); correspondence regarding Epiq contract (0.2).
Darcy D	12/19/12	2.4	Review search results regarding case law on fraudulent transfer statute (0.4); read case law on fraudulent transfer statute (2.0).
Gehring AS	12/19/12	6.5	Call with S. Ravi regarding document review (0.1); calls with C. Reiser regarding same (0.6); emails with M. Russano regarding same (0.2); emails with Litigation Technical Services regarding document database (0.4); review M. Tobak's memorandum regarding an interview with client (0.8); draft summary of claims investigation process (3.3); emails with M. Tobak regarding same (0.1); review client emails for information pertinent to potential claims investigation (1.0).
Pucci MV	12/19/12	3.7	Review and process scanned documents retrieved from Patriot headquarters.
Ravi SK	12/19/12	0.4	Call with A. Gehring regarding document review (0.1); call with C. Reiser regarding scanning and loading of hard copy documents collected from Patriot's office (0.2); review document review protocol (0.1).
Reiser CM	12/19/12	2.8	Coordinate FTP download of Patriot hardcopy documents, including calls and emails with S. Ravi, M. Pucci and C. Hinton and review of downloaded materials (2.3); confer with A. Gehring regarding spin-off document review project and protocol (0.5).
Russano MJ	12/19/12	5.8	Draft, review and revise client interview memo (1.5); confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.1); confer with A. Gehring regarding document review staffing and planning (0.3); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding request for planning document and presentation (0.2); draft case summary document (1.6); review various Company documents and emails (2.1).
Tobak MJ	12/19/12	4.6	Revise client interview memorandum (1.3); draft memorandum summarizing ongoing projects in response to client request (3.3).
Darcy D	12/20/12	7.1	Meet with M. Russano regarding fraudulent transfer research (0.7); read case law on fraudulent transfer statute (4.7); review search results on Lexis regarding case law on fraudulent transfer statute (1.2); draft notes regarding cases on fraudulent transfer statute (0.5).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Gehring AS	12/20/12	3.2	Emails with M. Tobak, S. Ravi and C. Reiser regarding structure of Patriot subsidiaries (0.3); review client emails for information pertinent to potential claims investigation (2.6); emails with Litigation Technical Services regarding loading documents into database (0.3).
Gehring AS	12/20/12	0.7	Revise summary of investigative projects (0.5); emails with M. Russano regarding same (0.2).
Loss DM	12/20/12	0.3	Correspondence with Blackstone regarding solvency analysis (0.2); review team correspondence (0.1).
Pucci MV	12/20/12	7.0	Review and process scanned documents retrieved from Patriot headquarters.
Reiser CM	12/20/12	1.8	Confer with M. Pucci and A. Gehring regarding status of processing of hard copy document scans (0.2); review pre spin-off organizational chart and presentation concerning transfer process for spin-off and prepare summary of same (1.6).
Russano MJ	12/20/12	8.8	Draft, review and revise investigation project summary (2.6); confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.4); meet with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5); meet with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding same and preparation for client call regarding same (0.7); meet with D. Darcy regarding statute of limitations research (0.5); review and revise client memo and confer with A. Gehring regarding same (1.0); confer with M. Gongolevsky and M. Tobak regarding document vendor contract (0.3); confer with E. Moskowitz and L. Kabakov regarding document review planning and staffing (0.2); confer with D. Loss regarding solvency analysis (0.2); prepare for client interview, including review of documents (2.1); emails to J. Bean regarding document vendor contract (0.1); emails with client regarding interview (0.2).
Tobak MJ	12/20/12	0.3	Correspondence with M. Gongolevsky, M. Russano regarding Epiq retention (0.2); correspondence with A. Gehring regarding project outline (0.1).
Darcy D	12/21/12	0.8	Read case law on fraudulent transfer statute.
Gehring AS	12/21/12	6.8	Interview client regarding potential claims investigation (5.4); prepare for same (0.4); draft interview memo regarding same (1.0).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Loss DM	12/21/12	0.4	Preparation for Blackstone call (0.3); correspondence with M. Russano and M. Buschmann regarding Blackstone analysis (0.1).
Pucci MV	12/21/12	6.2	Review and process scanned documents retrieved from Patriot headquarters.
Reiser CM	12/21/12	0.8	Confer with M. Pucci regarding status of processing of hard copy document scans and emails to C. Hinton and R. Cheong regarding uploading scans to Epiq server (0.6); review investigation projects summary memorandum (0.2).
Russano MJ	12/21/12	8.9	Prepare for and attend interview with client (4.6); confer with A. Gehring regarding same and draft Rule 2004 subpoena (0.3); confer with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding investigation discovery and coordination (0.3); confer with client regarding overall case strategy (0.4); meet with client and A. Starr regarding same (1.0); review correspondence regarding Bryan Cave representation (0.3); confer with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and A. Starr regarding same (0.2); legal research regarding same (0.6); emails with J. Bean and M. Tobak regarding document vendor contract (0.2); confer with M. Huebner regarding investigation project summary memo (0.3); review and revise same (0.5); email to J. Bean regarding same (0.2).
Gehring AS	12/23/12	3.5	Emails with M. Russano, M. Tobak and review team regarding document review (0.4); emails with Computer Support regarding establishing an email group for the review team (0.1); draft client interview memorandum (3.0).
Russano MJ	12/23/12	0.2	Email to A. Gehring regarding document review planning and staffing.
Russano MJ	12/24/12	0.2	Confer with E. Moskowitz regarding document review planning and staffing.
Gehring AS	12/25/12	2.1	Draft client interview memorandum.
Darcy D	12/26/12	2.6	Read case law on fraudulent transfer statute.
Gehring AS	12/26/12	6.3	Draft and edit client interview memorandum (2.3); emails with Litigation Technical Services regarding document database (0.6); meet with M. Tobak, A. Vora and R. Hashem regarding review protocol (1.3); prepare for same (0.5); calls with M. Tobak regarding same (0.5); calls with C. Reiser regarding document review (0.5); revise document review protocol (0.6).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Hashem R	12/26/12	1.2	Conference with A. Gehring to discuss first review protocol.
Reiser CM	12/26/12	3.3	Emails to C. Hinton and R. Cheong regarding uploading scans to Epiq server and review of uploaded files (0.8); confer with A. Gehring regarding status and logistics of spin-off email review (0.6); prepare email summary of documents from email review (1.9).
Russano MJ	12/26/12	0.8	Review pro hac vice admission and email to D. Silberger regarding same (0.3); confer with E. Moskowitz, L. Samat and J. Martin regarding review status, process and protocol (0.5).
Tobak MJ	12/26/12	2.7	Conferences with A. Gehring regarding review protocol, United Mine Workers of America review (0.6); conference with A. Gehring, R. Hashem and A. Vora regarding case background and review (1.3); review documents circulated by C. Reiser (0.4); review revised review protocol (0.2); review summary of outstanding projects (0.2).
Vora A	12/26/12	1.1	Confer with A. Gehring and M. Tobak on case background, in preparation for first review.
Balin A	12/27/12	1.8	Meet with A. Gehring to discuss case and review protocol (1.0); read protocol and memo regarding November interview with clients (0.8).
Darcy D	12/27/12	5.4	Research case law regarding choice of law analysis (2.0); read case law relevant to interpreting fraudulent transfer statute (0.8); update M. Tobak on choice of law research to date (0.3); email with M. Russano regarding progress on research (0.1); read case law regarding choice of law analysis (0.5); draft notes on case law regarding fraudulent transfer statute (1.7).
Gehring AS	12/27/12	3.6	Email to document review team regarding first review (0.2); meet with A. Balin regarding document review (0.8); calls and emails with A. Balin regarding same (0.3); emails with Litigation Technical Services regarding document database (0.2); call and emails with M. Tobak regarding Rule 2004 subpoena (0.2); review same (0.3); emails and calls with M. Tobak and C. Reiser regarding potential claims investigation (1.2); second review of documents for information pertinent to potential claims investigation (0.4).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Reiser CM	12/27/12	2.3	Confer with A. Gehring regarding status and logistics of spin-off email review and emails to C. Hinton and R. Cheong regarding same (0.6); review document discussing counterparty property transfer and prepare email summary of relevant counterparty documents from email review (0.9); confer with A. Gehring regarding review of hard copy document scans (0.4); confer with M. Tobak regarding spin-off email review (0.4).
Russano MJ	12/27/12	1.3	Review and revise updated interview memos (0.6); confer with M. Tobak regarding draft Rule 2004 subpoena (0.2); confer with E. Moskowitz and C. Reiser regarding case assignments and staffing (0.3); confer with D. Darcy regarding statute of limitations research (0.2).
Tobak MJ	12/27/12	4.1	Multiple conferences with A. Gehring and C. Reiser regarding review protocol (1.1); correspondence with R. Choeng regarding review form (0.2); revise draft discovery documents (0.9); review revised interview memoranda (0.6); conference with D. Darcy regarding legal research (0.2); document research (1.1).
Darcy D	12/28/12	1.1	Read cases on applicable choice of law framework in bankruptcy context.
Gehring AS	12/28/12	2.1	Emails with M. Tobak regarding Rule 2004 subpoena (0.1); call with C. Reiser regarding document review (0.2); second review of documents for information pertinent to potential claims investigation (1.6); call with M. Tobak regarding document privilege (0.1); calls with C. Reiser regarding document review (0.1).
Reiser CM	12/28/12	0.4	Review invoice for hard copy documents and emails with G. Koenig and S. Ravi regarding same (0.1); confer with A. Gehring regarding status and logistics of spin-off email review (0.2); download and review motion filed in United Mine Workers of America action (0.1).
Russano MJ	12/28/12	0.9	Review revised draft Rule 2004 subpoena and confer with M. Tobak regarding same.
Tobak MJ	12/28/12	2.1	Revise draft Rule 2004 subpoena (0.9); correspondence with Committee counsel regarding same (0.1); second review of document for production (0.4); fact research (0.4); conference with A. Gehring regarding second review strategy (0.3).
Darcy D	12/29/12	1.3	Read case law on applicable choice of law framework in bankruptcy context.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Darcy D	12/30/12	4.5	Read case law on applicable choice of law framework in bankruptcy context (2.8); research case law regarding choice of law rules applicable to fraudulent transfer in particular state (1.4); compile cases on same (0.1); document research steps for fraudulent transfer research (0.2).
Darcy D	12/31/12	5.2	Read case law regarding choice of law framework relating to fraudulent transfer claims (4.2); research case law interpreting borrowing statute (1.0).
<b>Total CLAIMS INVESTIGATIONS</b>		<b>503.6</b>	
<b>CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDER\UCC ISSUES</b>			
Huebner MS	12/01/12	0.1	Emails regarding December 5 Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting.
McGreal MM	12/01/12	0.1	Correspondence with B. Resnick regarding claims settlement procedures motion.
Resnick BM	12/01/12	0.3	Review Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation (0.2); emails regarding same (0.1).
Falk AE	12/02/12	3.0	Draft letter to Drummond regarding payment.
Resnick BM	12/02/12	0.2	Review revised Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation.
Coco KJ	12/03/12	4.2	Review and revise draft deck for Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation (0.8); emails with clients, AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); review indemnification claim research (0.9); emails with GCG regarding claims reporting, review same (1.1); emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and Davis Polk team regarding claims objection procedures (0.3); review letter of credit and indemnity agreement with Travelers (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Huebner MS	12/03/12	0.7	Conversations with CEO regarding creditor inquiries (0.4); emails to Unsecured Creditors' Committee professionals regarding Thursday's meeting and discovery (0.1); internal emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee and discovery issues (0.2).
Klein DS	12/03/12	0.2	Voicemail to E. Waller regarding Mine Safety and Health Administration issues (0.1); call with E. Waller regarding same (0.1).
Libby A	12/03/12	0.5	Claims call with GCG.

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Lynch C	12/03/12	1.1	Prepare cover letter and discovery materials to produce to equityholders (0.7); call with M. Carney regarding discovery schedule (0.2); team emails regarding discovery schedule, productions (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/03/12	0.8	Correspondence with B. Resnick, K. Coco, A. VanWagner and others regarding meeting with Unsecured Creditors' Committee professionals (0.3); correspondence with Kramer Levin regarding same (0.1); coordinate meeting logistics (0.2); conference with K. Coco regarding procedures motions (0.2).
Moskowitz E	12/03/12	3.1	Team meetings to prepare for Unsecured Creditors' Committee discussions and follow-up issues.
Resnick BM	12/03/12	0.7	Emails with Kramer Levin, Houlihan and Davis Polk lawyers regarding meeting with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors (0.3); correspondence with A. Rogoff, M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding claims objection procedures (0.4).
Starr AT	12/03/12	0.3	Calls and emails regarding equityholders with C. Lynch, J. Bean and M. Carney.
VanWagner AB	12/03/12	2.6	Telephone calls with K. Coco regarding preparation for Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting on 12/5/12 (0.5); emails to A. Wong at Kramer Levin regarding same (0.4); emails to K. Coco regarding same (0.6); email G. Cunningham regarding same (0.2); email B. Resnick and M. McGreal regarding same (0.3); coordinate and prepare logistics for same (0.6).
Coco KJ	12/04/12	3.7	Organize and coordinate for Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (2.3); respond to creditor inquiry (0.2); review lift stay procedures notice of presentment and order (0.6); emails with AlixPartners and clients regarding letter of credit issues, analysis of contract regarding same (0.6).
Huebner MS	12/04/12	2.3	Call with T. Mayer to discuss Unsecured Creditors' Committee agenda items (0.8); meet with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors regarding Wednesday's meeting (1.5).
Klein DS	12/04/12	0.3	Emails with DIP team and K. Coco regarding letter of credit issues.
Libby A	12/04/12	0.9	Review and comment on lift stay procedures proposed order.



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	12/04/12	3.4	Supplier management committee call with Company and AlixPartners (0.2); conference with Davis Polk, Blackstone, Kramer Levin and Houlihan regarding various issues (2.1); coordinate logistics for meetings with Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco and A. VanWagner regarding same (0.3); draft email to Company regarding summary of meeting (0.4); draft agenda for meeting with Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/04/12	0.1	Review revised claims settlement procedures motion.
Resnick BM	12/04/12	3.5	Emails with Davis Polk team in preparation for meeting with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors and Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.3); meet with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors (2.0); emails with A. Rogoff regarding claims objection procedures (0.2).
Russano MJ	12/04/12	1.3	Attend Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting regarding various issues.
Starr AT	12/04/12	0.5	Calls with I. Bergmanis, S. Reyniak and D. Woo regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee.
VanWagner AB	12/04/12	7.9	Prepare for and coordinate Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (4.4); communications with K. Coco regarding same (1.1); communications with G. Cunningham regarding same (1.0); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.5); emails with A. Wong at Kramer Levin regarding same (0.6); email planning summary to B. Resnick and M. McGreal (0.3).
Coco KJ	12/05/12	4.0	Attend certain parts of full Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (2.0); claims processing and evaluation call with AlixPartners and GCG, prepare for same (0.7); draft language for settlement agreement in Pine Ridge cases (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); emails to J. Bondy (0.3); email to Davis Polk team regarding claim settlement procedures issues (0.3).
Huebner MS	12/05/12	8.4	Pre-meeting with management team to prepare for Unsecured Creditors' Committee in-person meeting (1.0); in-person meeting with Unsecured Creditors' Committee (5.9); post meeting conversations with various clients and Blackstone regarding followup on various topics raised by Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.5).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	12/05/12	0.7	Call with GCG and AlixPartners regarding claims reconciliation process (0.5); emails with K. Coco regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	12/05/12	0.5	Call with GCG regarding claims process and bar date issues.
Martin JD	12/05/12	2.5	Participate in portion of Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting.
McGreal MM	12/05/12	6.7	Meetings with Company, Blackstone and Davis Polk regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (1.6); participate in meeting with Company, Blackstone, Davis Polk, Unsecured Creditors' Committee and Unsecured Creditors' Committee professionals (5.1).
Resnick BM	12/05/12	7.4	Meet with clients and co-advisors in advance of Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (0.8); meet with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and advisors (6.6).
VanWagner AB	12/05/12	5.3	Prepare for and coordinate Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (3.8); email A. Wong at Kramer Levin regarding same (0.2); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (1.0); emails with G. Cunningham regarding same (0.3).
Klein DS	12/06/12	0.5	Email from reclamation counterparty regarding rejection and coordinate with K. Coco regarding same (0.3); coordinate with K. Coco on omnibus objection procedures (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/06/12	1.9	Conference with J. Lushefski, K. Hiltz, B. Resnick and others regarding intercompany claims.
Coco KJ	12/07/12	3.0	Draft motion and settlement agreement for Pine Ridge cases (1.6); emails with D. Klein regarding same (0.3); review letters received regarding reclamation claims (0.6); emails with AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Klein DS	12/07/12	0.3	Review reclamation fax and emails with K. Coco regarding same.
Libby A	12/07/12	0.1	Coordinate and send calendar invite for claims settlement meeting.
McGreal MM	12/07/12	0.2	Correspondence with A. Wong regarding objection deadline for Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.1); email M. Maher regarding proof of claim by PRP Group (0.1).
Silberger DM	12/07/12	0.7	Phone call with W. Pettit regarding reclamation forms (0.1); review of reclamation forms (0.6).
Huebner MS	12/09/12	0.2	Emails regarding intercompany issues.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/10/12	6.5	Draft and revise settlement agreement and motion to approve same regarding Pine Ridge cases (2.4); coordinate entry of Chartis stipulation and order (0.3); meet with B. Resnick and others regarding claim settlement procedures motion and follow up tasks regarding same (0.6); review comments to Chartis cross collateralization agreement and email to clients regarding same (0.7); analysis of reclamation questions from creditors (0.5); call with GCG regarding claims analysis process (0.4); call with clients and advisors regarding claims on account of benefits and prepare for same (0.8); call with R. McWilliams regarding reclamation reconciliations (0.3); review supplier management committee agenda (0.2); emails with AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding letters received from reclamation claimants (0.3).
Huebner MS	12/10/12	0.2	Emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee positions on pending motions including Arch.
Klein DS	12/10/12	2.0	Meet with B. Resnick and others regarding claims settlement procedures (0.6); meet with K. Coco regarding reclamation claims and other issues (0.2); call with S. Sorkin regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee questions regarding real estate (0.1); email R. McWilliams regarding reclamation claims (0.1); email E. Waller regarding payments and claims under prepetition settlement agreement and review same (0.4); emails with GCG regarding claims extract and bar date (0.2); emails with reclamation claimant regarding report and communications with K. Coco regarding same (0.4).
Libby A	12/10/12	0.3	Meet with B. Resnick, D. Klein and M. McGreal regarding claims settlement procedures.
McGreal MM	12/10/12	0.2	Conference with B. Resnick, D. Klein and others regarding claims settlement procedures.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Silberger DM	12/10/12	2.8	Review Department of Labor motion to approve global settlement regarding Mine Health Safety Cases (0.2); meet with K. Coco regarding proposed order and stipulation regarding Department of Labor cases (0.2); draft stipulation and order regarding Mine Health Safety Administration settlement (1.8); call to W. Pettit regarding reclamation forms (0.2); review enclosures to letter from Hutchens, Senter, Kellam and Pettit (0.3); bring enclosures from letter to Hutchens, Senter, Kellam and Pettit to WP, give instructions regarding scanning (0.1).
Coco KJ	12/11/12	2.8	Attend supplier management committee call and follow up tasks regarding same (0.6); emails with AlixPartners regarding reclamation claims (0.4); call with creditor (0.2); review Pine Ridge claim settlement draft documents (1.4); respond to voicemail from creditor (0.2).
de Richemont P	12/11/12	0.9	Research regarding claim against Dynegy (0.6); email about same (0.3).
Klein DS	12/11/12	0.7	Call with R. Mead regarding surety bond issues (0.1); emails with AlixPartners regarding reclamation objections (0.2); emails with J. Tucker and conversation with B. Resnick regarding intercompany claims (0.4).
Silberger DM	12/11/12	2.7	Draft stipulation and order in relation to settlement of Department of Labor Mine Safety and Health Administration cases (2.1); call with C. Kramer at Riezman Berger regarding the debtors' Schedule F (0.6).
Coco KJ	12/12/12	5.3	Weekly call with Kramer Levin and follow up tasks regarding same (1.2); comment on Chartis cross-collateralization agreement and communications with B. Resnick and D. Klein regarding same (0.9); emails with counsel to GexPro regarding reclamation and §503(b)(9) claims and analysis (1.0); call with GCG and AlixPartners regarding claims process and evaluations and follow up tasks regarding same (1.3); communications with D. Klein regarding critical vendor payment questions from counsel to Cecil Walker (0.5); review claims filed by ordinary course professionals and emails with GCG and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Klein DS	12/12/12	1.0	Call and email with B. Resnick regarding Mine Safety and Health Administration fine issues (0.4); discussion with K. Coco and email with counterparty regarding critical vendor claim (0.4); email K. Coco regarding reclamation report objections (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/12/12	1.1	Weekly update call with Kramer Levin, M. Huebner, B. Resnick and K. Coco (0.7); teleconference with GCG, K. Coco and others regarding claims and bar date (0.3); correspondence with S. Krause and K. Coco regarding proofs of claim (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/12/12	1.6	Weekly update call with Kramer Levin (1.0); calls with G. Plotko and A. Schlesinger regarding sharing of information with Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2); calls with J. Bean and D. Klein regarding claim settlement (0.3); emails with R. Mead and Davis Polk team regarding Chartis stipulation (0.1).
Silberger DM	12/12/12	0.6	Turn K. Coco's comments to proposed Order and Stipulation relating to Pine Ridge Mine Safety and Health Administration proceedings.
Coco KJ	12/13/12	2.5	Call with M. McGreal and analysis regarding Stewart claim (0.3); reclamation analysis and emails with advisors and clients (2.2).
Huebner MS	12/13/12	0.4	Conversation with F. Huffard regarding intercompany issues (0.3); emails with T. Mayer regarding intercompany issues (0.1).
Klein DS	12/13/12	1.1	Call with clients regarding transportation contract issues and intercompany claim issues (0.5); discuss same with K. Coco (0.2); emails with K. Coco regarding reclamation report (0.2); call with T. Chepiga regarding mechanics liens (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/13/12	0.2	Teleconference with B. Resnick regarding claims issues (0.1); correspondence with GCG regarding proofs of claim (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/13/12	0.2	Emails with Kramer Levin and Blackstone regarding information sharing.
Silberger DM	12/13/12	0.7	Follow up on call from C. Kramer regarding notice.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/14/12	2.4	Review and comment on critical vendor agreement with United (0.6); email to clients regarding same (0.1); call with GCG regarding claims process and analysis (0.1); review objections to reclamation report (0.7); emails and call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); email and call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); email to clients regarding same (0.3).
Falk AE	12/14/12	1.2	Prepare notice of no objection and finalize proposed orders for Stewart 9019 (0.7); file notice of no objection and draft email to Chambers regarding proposed order for Stewart and Solar 9019s (0.5).
Huebner MS	12/14/12	0.7	Conversation with F. Huffard regarding intercompany issues (0.5); emails with T. Mayer regarding same (0.2).
Klein DS	12/14/12	0.1	Emails with K. Coco regarding lien filings.
McGreal MM	12/14/12	0.6	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee confidentiality agreement (0.1); correspondence with D. Klein, K. Coco and others regarding claims settlement procedures (0.2); review claims settlement procedures motion (0.1); teleconference with D. Silberger regarding claims issues (0.1); correspondence with Kramer Levin, L. Samet and E. Glazer regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/14/12	0.3	Emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors and Blackstone regarding information sharing.
Silberger DM	12/14/12	0.8	Review objections from Conveying Solutions and Industrial Supply Solutions (0.2); call with K. Coco regarding objections and reclamation demands (0.2); draft letter to client regarding objections and intended resolution (0.3); call with K. Coco and R. McWilliams regarding revision of Reclamation Report and Notice of Objection (0.1).
Huebner MS	12/16/12	0.1	Emails to Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors regarding intercompany issues.
Coco KJ	12/17/12	1.7	Claims process and evaluation call with AlixPartners and GCG (0.3); call with counsel for Tire Centers regarding reclamation claims and objection, follow-up analysis and emails regarding same (0.5); meet with D. Klein regarding possible amendments to coal sale contracts order (0.2); analysis of same (0.6); review supplier management committee agenda (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	12/17/12	1.4	Call with Blackstone regarding intercompany issues (0.6); conference call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors regarding intercompany issues (0.5); conversation with T. Mayer regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee confidentiality issues (0.3).
Klein DS	12/17/12	0.5	Coordinate with K. Coco regarding reclamation claims (0.3); voicemails and call with E. Waller regarding Mine Safety and Health Administration fine issues (0.2).
Libby A	12/17/12	0.4	Call with GCG and Alix Partners regarding claims analysis.
McGreal MM	12/17/12	0.6	Teleconference with M. Huebner, T. Mayer, Blackstone and others regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee request for information.
Resnick BM	12/17/12	0.2	Emails with regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee information sharing.
Silberger DM	12/17/12	0.4	Receive and read Michelin's amended reclamation claim (0.1); draft email to K. Coco, including research into timing on past actions with respect to insufficient documentation reclamation claims, regarding Michelin reclamation claim (0.3).
Coco KJ	12/18/12	2.3	Attend supplier management committee call and prepare for same (0.4); make revisions to coal sale contract order and communications with clients regarding counterparty's requests for same (0.6); call with GCG regarding claims process and reconciliation (0.2); review and respond to reclamation report objection (0.8); advise clients of same (0.3).
de Richemont P	12/18/12	1.5	Research claims against Dynegy and summarize same.
Huebner MS	12/18/12	0.4	Conversation with Blackstone regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee information requests and next steps.
Klein DS	12/18/12	0.4	Emails with A. de Richemont regarding Dynegy proof of claim and call with J. Jones regarding same.

## Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/19/12	5.4	Analyze requested amendments to coal sale contracts order (0.3); call with C. Damba regarding same and follow-up emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); review and comment on Joy Mining critical vendor letter and emails with clients regarding same (1.1); call with counsel to Joy Mining regarding same (0.1); discuss same with D. Klein (0.1); draft and analyze response to Joy Mining critical vendor request (0.5); review claims breakdown and details in preparation for negotiation of claims settlement motion and communications with Davis Polk team and GCG regarding same (0.8); review supplier management committee follow-up email from R. McWilliams (0.1); call to counterparty regarding reclamation claims (0.1); review and analyze reclamation objection (0.9); emails to clients, AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); attend claims analysis call with GCG (0.2); review reclamation defenses memo (0.3).
Klein DS	12/19/12	1.3	Call with R. McWilliams regarding reclamation objections (0.2); email R. Mead regarding workers compensation letter (0.1); discussion with K. Coco regarding critical vendor agreement and revisions to same (0.5); discussion with K. Coco regarding reclamation defenses (0.2); review proof of claims summary and emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.3).
McGreal MM	12/19/12	1.0	Teleconference with A. Yerramalli regarding proposed orders (0.2); review and comment on memo regarding claims issues (0.7); correspondence with D. Silberger regarding same (0.1).
Coco KJ	12/20/12	1.9	Analyze Joy Mining critical vendor agreement (0.3); emails with clients regarding same (0.3); draft email to counterparties regarding same (0.2); analyze reclamation objection and draft email to counterparty regarding same (0.8); emails with AlixPartners regarding reclamation and §503(b)(9) claims (0.3).
Klein DS	12/20/12	0.5	Email K. Coco regarding reclamation objections (0.1); emails with K. Coco regarding workers compensation Ohio item (0.2); coordinate with K. Coco regarding critical vendor agreement negotiation (0.2).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/21/12	1.5	Emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and DIP lenders regarding critical vendors (0.3); draft and send email to Joy Mining (0.5); email to clients regarding same (0.1); respond to emails and voicemails from creditors (0.6).
Lynch C	12/21/12	1.7	Compile and review materials regarding equity committee litigation thus far in response to U.S. Trustee request and distribute same.
McGreal MM	12/21/12	0.2	Email monthly critical vendor report to Kramer Levin, Weil and Willkie (0.1); correspondence with A. Starr and C. Lynch regarding equity committee motion (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/21/12	0.1	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee and pension plan information sharing.
Starr AT	12/21/12	0.3	Calls and emails with M. McGreal and C. Lynch regarding equity committee.
McGreal MM	12/22/12	0.7	Review and revise memo on certain claims issues (0.6); email same to client, AlixPartners and Blackstone (0.1).
Klein DS	12/26/12	0.4	Emails with E. Waller and call with A. Turner regarding prepetition settlement agreement and related claims.
McGreal MM	12/26/12	0.6	Correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding claims settlement procedures (0.2); review data on claims from GCG (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick, K. Coco and others regarding claims objection procedures (0.2).
Libby A	12/27/12	1.1	Emails with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding claims objections motion (0.3); review claims objection procedures motion for Eastern District of Missouri transfer-related edits (0.5); emails with A. VanWagner regarding updates to claims objection procedures motion (0.3).
McGreal MM	12/27/12	0.9	Correspondence with K. Coco, A. Libby and A. VanWagner regarding claims objection procedures (0.3); correspondence with GCG and Kramer Levin regarding data on filed claims (0.2); review binder of equity committee pleadings (0.1); correspondence regarding same with A. Starr, C. Lynch and others (0.1); teleconferences with A. Yerramalli and A. Wong regarding claims settlement procedures (0.2).
Melvin MM	12/27/12	1.0	Research 8th Circuit precedent claims objection procedures motions and orders (0.9); obtain same and forward to A. Libby (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	12/27/12	0.3	Emails with M. McGreal regarding equity committee.
VanWagner AB	12/27/12	4.5	Emails with M. McGreal, K. Coco and A. Libby regarding claims objections motion (0.3); revise claims objections procedures motion (2.1); research eighth circuit case law precedent in connection with same (2.0); email same to A. Libby (0.1).
Coco KJ	12/28/12	0.9	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding claims settlement motion and order (0.2); emails with reclamation claimants regarding reclamation claims (0.3); emails with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); email to counterparty regarding reclamation objection (0.2).
Law EC	12/28/12	2.1	Further precedent research regarding claims objection procedures (1.7); numerous communications with M. Melvin, A. VanWagner and A. Libby regarding same (0.4).
Libby A	12/28/12	1.1	Review claims objection procedures motion (0.4); review 8th circuit claims objection precedents and discuss same with A. VanWagner (0.4); call with M. McGreal and A. VanWagner regarding claims objections procedures motion (0.3).
McGreal MM	12/28/12	1.7	Review and summarize revised claims settlement procedures order (0.4); email B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.2); teleconference with A. Yerramalli and A. Wong regarding same (0.2); review and comment on claims objection procedures (0.6); conferences with A. Libby and A. VanWagner regarding same (0.3).
Silberger DM	12/28/12	0.5	Research on reclamation procedures and practice.
VanWagner AB	12/28/12	2.3	Revise draft of omnibus objection procedures motion (0.7); conduct precedent research regarding same (0.6); emails to M. Melvin and E. Law regarding research for same (0.3); meet with M. McGreal and A. Libby to discuss same (0.2); further revisions to same (0.5).
McGreal MM	12/29/12	1.9	Review and revise claims objection procedures motion (1.4); legal research regarding same (0.3); email same to Kramer Levin, Weil, Willkie and Bryan Cave (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/29/12	0.3	Review claims objection procedures motion (0.2); emails with M. McGreal and local counsel regarding same (0.1).
Coco KJ	12/30/12	0.6	Emails regarding claims objections and claims settlements with Davis Polk team and GCG.
McGreal MM	12/30/12	0.2	Review and revise claims objection procedures motion (0.1); correspondence with A. VanWagner regarding same (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
VanWagner AB	12/30/12	1.2	Revise omnibus claims objections motion to prepare for filing (0.7); emails with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding same (0.3); further revision to same (0.1); email GCG regarding service of same (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/31/12	0.4	Review revised claims objection procedures motion (0.2); correspondence with B. Walsh and A. VanWagner regarding same (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/31/12	0.1	Emails with M. McGreal and local counsel regarding claims objection procedures.
<b>Total</b>		<b>170.7</b>	
<b>CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDERS\UCC ISSUES</b>			
<b>DPW RETENTION AND FEE ISSUES</b>			
McGreal MM	12/03/12	0.1	Email C. Robertson regarding monthly fee statements.
Robertson C	12/03/12	0.2	Discuss November fee statement with N. Tsiouris.
Travers M	12/03/12	0.2	Conflicts check for contract rejection motion.
Tsiouris N	12/03/12	0.2	Conversation with C. Robertson regarding November monthly fee statement.
VanWagner AB	12/03/12	0.5	Run conflicts check on counterparty (0.2); review conflicts check and email M. Travers regarding same (0.2); email result of conflicts check to K. Coco and others (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/06/12	0.2	Emails with S. Krause regarding billing issues.
VanWagner AB	12/06/12	1.2	Prepare Davis Polk October expenses for sending to U.S. Trustee (0.9); send same to U.S. Trustee (0.2); telephone call with C. Robertson regarding production of Davis Polk November fee statement (0.1).
Krause SC	12/07/12	0.9	Emails with B. Resnick regarding bill (0.3); review billing options and calculations (0.2); review retention papers (0.4).
Falk AE	12/10/12	3.1	Research and review recent U.S. Trustee objections to interim fee applications.
Foust JT	12/10/12	4.2	Research precedents for fee objection responses (1.7); research case law regarding objections to professional fees (2.5).
Klein DS	12/10/12	1.8	Coordinate regarding U.S. Trustee fee objection, including review of precedents and case law.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	12/10/12	0.9	Emails regarding parties-in-interest list (0.3); review retention documents (0.2); emails with R. Martin regarding same (0.2); confer with D. Meyer regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	12/10/12	2.4	Research regarding U.S. Trustee objections to professional fees (1.9); meet with D. Klein, M. McGreal and others regarding interim fee application objections (0.5).
McGreal MM	12/10/12	0.8	Conferences with B. Resnick and D. Klein regarding U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (0.3); conference with D. Klein, C. Robertson and others regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/10/12	0.5	Discuss possible U.S. Trustee objection and response thereto with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and M. McGreal.
Robertson C	12/10/12	5.9	Review case law and other precedent materials related to U.S. Trustee objection.
Tsiouris N	12/10/12	0.4	Communications with Davis Polk team regarding potential objection of U.S. Trustee to fee application and related research.
VanWagner AB	12/10/12	0.3	Meet with A. Libby regarding parties in interest declaration (0.1); meet with S. Krause regarding same (0.2).
Coco KJ	12/11/12	2.5	Review and comment on fee statement for confidentiality.
de Richemont P	12/11/12	0.3	Coordinate ongoing conflicts checks (0.1); email about same (0.1); review objection to fee application (0.1).

## Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Falk AE	12/11/12	11.8	Summarize past U.S. Trustee Objections to Interim Fee Applications and replies thereto (0.7); meet with C. Robertson to discuss same (0.3); continue to draft summary of past U.S. Trustee objections and replies (0.7); meet with M. McGreal, A. Libby, C. Robertson and D. Klein to discuss workstreams regarding anticipated U.S. Trustee objection (0.4); research hearing transcripts regarding interim fee application disputes with U.S. Trustee (3.3); meet with M. McGreal, A. Libby, C. Robertson and D. Klein to discuss workstreams (0.5); review prior Judge Chapman cases to identify holdback percentages (1.1); review U.S. Trustee Objection (0.2); email M. Melvin to find transcript from precedent fee hearing and review exhibits to U.S. Trustee Objection (0.2); meet with M. McGreal, A. Libby, C. Robertson and D. Klein to discuss U.S. Trustee Objection and next steps (0.4); search for detail on "transitory timekeepers" and "document clerks" whose time was subject to U.S. Trustee objection and email to team (2.1); review U.S. Trustee objection and U.S. Trustee guidelines regarding weekend expenses (0.9); summarize in spreadsheet vague entries identified by M. McGreal and A. Libby (1.0).
Foust JT	12/11/12	8.7	Research case law regarding objections to professional fees (4.4); review precedent responses to fee objections (1.6); analyze and summarize research results (2.7).
Glazer E	12/11/12	1.1	Review narratives within billing code "Employee Labor Issues" for privileged information.
Huebner MS	12/11/12	0.6	Review of U.S. Trustee objection to all quarterly fee applications (0.4); internal emails regarding same (0.2).
Klein DS	12/11/12	3.8	Call with L. Samet regarding U.S. Trustee fee objection (0.1); meetings with M. McGreal and others I regarding same (0.7); review precedent and case law regarding same (2.2); review U.S. Trustee objection (0.8).
Krause SC	12/11/12	2.1	Emails regarding 2013 rates (0.4); review parties-in-interest list (0.4); develop updated parties-in-interest procedures (0.2); confer regarding same with M. Melvin (0.1); review precedent (0.4); emails regarding same (0.6).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	12/11/12	5.5	Meet regarding reply to U.S. Trustee (0.5); review objection (0.3); review precedent research regarding holdbacks (0.5); legal research regarding fee statement guidelines and practices (1.2); legal research regarding precedent U.S. Trustee objections (1.4); follow-up meeting regarding reply (0.5); review and comment on time entry objections (0.9); review breakdown of time entry objection response (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/11/12	6.2	Conferences with D. Klein, C. Robertson and others regarding U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (1.3); review precedent U.S. Trustee fee application objections (0.7); review and comment on research outline regarding same (0.3); review U.S. Trustee objection to fee applications (0.6); conference with M. Huebner regarding reply to same (0.2); prepare response to U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (2.9); correspondence with A. Libby, C. Robertson and A. Falk regarding same (0.2).
Moskowitz E	12/11/12	0.8	Review U.S. Trustee objection (0.5); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3).
Reiser CM	12/11/12	1.4	Review and edit draft November bill for confidentiality.
Robertson C	12/11/12	8.3	Meet with M. McGreal, D. Klein, A. Libby and A. Falk to discuss response to U.S. Trustee objection (0.5); review precedents relevant to objection (0.5); review objection (0.4); meet with M. McGreal, D. Klein, A. Libby and A. Falk to discuss revised course of action (0.5); review relevant materials and draft numerous communications and charts regarding same (4.9); coordinate same with A. Falk and A. Libby (0.6); multiple discussions with A. VanWagner regarding preparation of November fee statement (0.9).
Samet L	12/11/12	0.6	Review precedent for responses to fee application challenges (0.3); review U.S. Trustee's objection to the Debtors' fee application (0.2); telephone calls and emails with E. Moskowitz and J. Foust regarding same (0.1).
Tsiouris N	12/11/12	1.5	Communications with C. Robertson and A. VanWagner regarding confidentiality review (0.3); edit and revise Davis Polk retention section for confidentiality and non-conforming entries (0.9); emails to M. Melvin regarding confidentiality review mark-ups and further instructions regarding same (0.3).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	12/11/12	0.9	Review environmental and regulatory bill for confidentiality.
VanWagner AB	12/11/12	4.3	Call, email and meet with C. Robertson regarding production of Davis Polk November fee statement (1.3); emails with C. Reiser regarding review of same (0.4); create project code pdfs (0.5); email to fee statement "team leaders" regarding confidentiality review of same (0.6); follow up email to A. Turner regarding same (0.1); review docket for Notices of Appearance and update Davis Polk parties-in-interest list (1.1); send same and summary of research to S. Krause (0.3).
Falk AE	12/12/12	1.0	Discuss certain expenses with M. McGreal and Chris Robertson and review firm policies regarding same (0.5); search GM transcripts for comments from Judge Gerber on Kramer Levin fee objection (0.2); search fee order regarding same (0.3).
Huebner MS	12/12/12	1.1	Conversations with E. Gasparini regarding U.S. Trustee objection (0.2); draft and transmit reply to U.S. Trustee (0.9).
Krause SC	12/12/12	0.9	Emails regarding Davis Polk retention matters (0.2); review parties-in-interest procedures (0.4); email regarding procedural options to B. Resnick and D. Schaible (0.3).
Libby A	12/12/12	0.3	Discuss holdback with M. McGreal (0.2); review emails summarizing research on precedent U.S. Trustee objection hearings (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/12/12	3.9	Prepare response to U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (2.8); conferences with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding same (0.9); correspondence with A. Libby, C. Robertson and A. Falk regarding same (0.2).
Pak GY	12/12/12	0.4	Review of November fee statement for financing privileged information.
Reiser CM	12/12/12	0.2	Review and edit draft November bill for confidentiality.
Resnick BM	12/12/12	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding U.S. Trustee objection to fee statement and response thereto (0.5); meet with C. Robertson and A. VanWagner regarding November fee statement (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Robertson C	12/12/12	3.0	Multiple discussions with A. VanWagner regarding preparation of November fee statement (0.5); meet with B. Resnick and A. VanWagner to discuss the same (0.2); emails to M. McGreal summarizing review of precedent materials for response to U.S. Trustee (0.6); email to M. McGreal regarding billing for weekend cars and expenses (1.7).
VanWagner AB	12/12/12	1.5	Call, email and meet with C. Robertson regarding preparation of Davis Polk November fee statement (0.9); email B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); meet with B. Resnick and C. Robertson regarding same (0.2); follow up with J. Brenner and L. Elbert regarding confidentiality review of same (0.3).
de Richemont P	12/13/12	0.2	Meet with A. VanWagner regarding ongoing conflicts checks.
Falk AE	12/13/12	2.4	Review cases provided by C. Robertson regarding billing for preparation of fee applications, redacting and editing time entries (0.7); research objections and hearing transcripts regarding same (1.7).
Huebner MS	12/13/12	0.5	Review of time entries and attachments to U.S. Trustee objection and conversation with M. McGreal regarding same.
Krause SC	12/13/12	2.6	Emails regarding 2013 rates (0.5); review parties-in-interest procedures (0.8); email regarding procedural options to B. Resnick and D. Schaible (0.2); review parties-in-interest list (0.3); confer with A. de Richemont regarding same (0.2); emails with A. VanWagner and M. Travers regarding conflict checks (0.2); review conflict check issues (0.4).
McGreal MM	12/13/12	1.3	Correspondence with Kramer Levin regarding U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (0.1); conference with M. Huebner regarding same (0.2); correspondence with C. Robertson regarding same (0.2); review research regarding U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (0.6); email M. Huebner regarding same (0.2).
Robertson C	12/13/12	2.8	Emails and discussions with A. VanWagner regarding production of November fee statement (0.3); call with S. Krause to discuss inclusion of a notice of rate increase in the November fee statement (0.1); call from C. Scarlett regarding charts for November fee statement (0.1); draft email to M. McGreal regarding U.S. Trustee objection (1.9); discuss research tasks for same with A. Falk (0.4).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Travers M	12/13/12	0.3	Conflicts check for rejection motion relating to counterparty.
Tsiouris N	12/13/12	0.5	Review bill for changes based on confidential review by various project leaders.
VanWagner AB	12/13/12	3.6	Draft November fee statement motion (1.4); research expense guidelines and email C. Robertson regarding same (0.1); email with N. Tsiouris regarding timing of same (0.1); run conflicts check for contract counterparties (0.4); meet with A. Falk regarding same (0.1); emails to K. Coco and A. Libby regarding same (0.1); meet and emails with S. Krause regarding same (0.4); emails with M. Travers regarding same (0.4); phone call with V. Jackson regarding parties-in-interest list (0.1); meet with A. de Richemont to discuss same (0.2); meet with V. Jackson to discuss same (0.2); call with A. de Richemont regarding same (0.1).
Huebner MS	12/14/12	1.2	Call with U.S. Trustee regarding Davis Polk fee objection (0.7); preparation for negotiations and possible hearing regarding same (0.5).
Krause SC	12/14/12	0.8	Emails regarding retention matters (0.3); confer with C. Robertson regarding same (0.2); confer with B. Resnick and D. Schaible regarding same (0.3).
Libby A	12/14/12	0.7	Emails with M. McGreal regarding U.S. Trustee issues (0.2); research regarding U.S. Trustee objections (0.5).
McGreal MM	12/14/12	3.9	Correspondence with C. Robertson regarding fee guidelines (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick and A. Schlesinger regarding same (0.2); teleconference with Chambers regarding fee applications and pending motions (0.1); correspondence with A. Schwartz and professionals regarding scheduling Chambers conference (0.2); teleconference with Chambers and professionals regarding fee applications (0.2); conferences with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding same (1.3); conference with C. Robertson regarding response to U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (0.3); emails with A. Libby and A. Falk regarding same (0.1); draft talking points for hearing on fee application (1.4).
Resnick BM	12/14/12	0.2	Discuss November fee statement with C. Robertson.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Robertson C	12/14/12	3.9	Email to M. McGreal regarding interpretation of U.S. Trustee expense guidelines (0.2); email to M. McGreal regarding U.S. Trustee's objection to vague time entries (0.3); meet with M. McGreal to discuss production of talking points for fee hearing (0.2); meet with S. Krause to discuss Davis Polk rates (0.2); review precedent rate increase notices (1.5); draft notice (0.7); prepare draft of November fee statement for review by B. Resnick (0.7); discuss same with B. Resnick (0.1).
Travers M	12/14/12	0.6	Conflicts checks for rejection motions.
VanWagner AB	12/14/12	1.2	Run conflicts check for contract counterparties (0.4); emails and phone call with M. Travers and S. Krause regarding same (0.6); emails with K. Coco and A. Falk regarding same (0.2).
Falk AE	12/15/12	1.2	Research case law on compensation for summer associate time in Chapter 11 cases and send summary to C. Robertson.
Libby A	12/15/12	1.2	Prepare markup of time entries in response to U.S. Trustee objection (0.6); email A. Falk regarding same (0.1); review U.S. Trustee fee objection research (0.5).
Robertson C	12/15/12	6.5	Draft talking points in response to U.S. Trustee's objection (6.2); revise draft notice regarding Davis Polk fees and send same to S. Krause. (0.3)
Falk AE	12/16/12	2.2	Research case law on compensating bankruptcy legal work at same levels as comparable non-bankruptcy work (0.5); research case law on compensability of confidentiality review in preparing fee applications (0.7); save and consolidate cases from talking points memo for fee hearing for hearing binder (1.0).
Krause SC	12/16/12	0.9	Review draft notice of increased rates (0.4); emails regarding same (0.2); emails regarding same with B. Resnick (0.3).
McGreal MM	12/16/12	5.7	Review and revise talking points on hearing on U.S. Trustee's objection to fee application (4.9); legal research regarding same (0.4); correspondence with A. Libby, C. Robertson and A. Falk regarding same (0.4).
Resnick BM	12/16/12	0.7	Review and revise draft notice (0.3); correspondence with S. Krause and C. Robertson regarding same (0.1); review talking points for hearing regarding U.S. Trustee objection (0.2); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Robertson C	12/16/12	1.5	Draft and revise schedules in draft notice (0.7); emails with B. Resnick and S. Krause regarding Davis Polk retention matters (0.3); research issues presented by U.S. Trustee objection (0.3); emails with M. McGreal and A. Falk regarding talking points (0.2).
Tsiouris N	12/16/12	0.1	Communications with A. VanWagner regarding timing of Davis Polk November fee statement.
VanWagner AB	12/16/12	0.9	Research and review professional fee guidelines for Eastern District of Missouri (0.6); email summary regarding same to N. Tsiouris (0.2); follow-up email to N. Tsiouris regarding same (0.1).
Falk AE	12/17/12	3.8	Research precedents on holdback percentage in interim fee orders (1.8). continue to research precedents on holdback percentage in interim fee orders (1.4) search for transcripts from interim fee hearings in precedent cases and email E. Law regarding same (0.4); review precedent transcript for relevant portions and email M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).
Huebner MS	12/17/12	1.4	Multiple calls and document review to resolve Davis Polk fee objection.
Krause SC	12/17/12	1.1	Review revisions to draft rates notice (0.4); emails regarding same with B. Resnick, C. Robertson and M. Huebner (0.5); further revisions to same (0.2).
Libby A	12/17/12	3.0	Research U.S. Trustee holdback objections to interim fee applications and resolution of objections (2.1); discuss research with M. McGreal and C. Robertson (0.2); multiple discussions regarding research with A. Falk (0.5); discuss same with M. McGreal (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/17/12	7.1	Teleconference with A. Schwartz and M. Huebner regarding U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (0.6); emails with M. Huebner and Blackstone regarding same (0.2); conferences with M. Huebner regarding U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (0.6); revise talking points on U.S. Trustee objection to fee application (4.4); legal research regarding same (0.7); correspondence with A. Libby, C. Robertson, A. Falk and others regarding same (0.6).
Resnick BM	12/17/12	0.4	Review and revise draft notice (0.2); correspondence with M. Huebner and others regarding retention matters (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Robertson C	12/17/12	6.1	Discuss status of negotiations with U.S. Trustee with M. McGreal (0.1); meet with M. McGreal, A. Libby and A. Falk regarding precedent holdback arguments and preparation of talking points and background materials (0.3); research holdback issues (3.7); emails and calls with A. Libby and A. Falk regarding same (0.4); emails to M. McGreal regarding same (0.4); discuss hearing preparation with K. Coco (0.2); revise draft notice (0.4); emails with S. Krause and B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); discuss preparation of November fee statement with A. VanWagner (0.1); call with N. Tsiouris to discuss status of fee statement (0.1); review schedules to be included in November fee statement (0.1).
Travers M	12/17/12	0.4	Further work on conflicts check for rejection motions.
VanWagner AB	12/17/12	1.6	Emails and calls with Davis Polk team regarding conflicts check for contract rejection counterparties (0.5); draft and revise November fee statement (0.8); send draft of fee statement to B. Resnick (0.3).
Krause SC	12/18/12	0.3	Emails regarding Davis Polk retention matters with B. Resnick, C. Robertson and M. Huebner.
McGreal MM	12/18/12	0.1	Correspondence with C. Robertson regarding estimate of December fees.
Robertson C	12/18/12	2.9	Prepare binders and other hearing materials for 12/18 hearing (0.3); attend hearing (1.0); email to M. McGreal regarding application of retainer (0.1); prepare in-depth estimate of December bill for clients (0.9); email to M. McGreal regarding same (0.5); call with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1).
Tsiouris N	12/18/12	0.1	Communications with A. VanWagner regarding timing of Davis Polk monthly fee statement.
VanWagner AB	12/18/12	0.6	Review requirements for parties-in-interest review (0.4); emails with V. Jackson regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/19/12	0.3	Correspondence with B. Resnick and C. Robertson regarding Davis Polk invoice (0.2); email A. VanWagner regarding expenses (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/19/12	1.5	Review November fee statement (1.3); meet with A. VanWagner regarding same (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Robertson C	12/19/12	2.0	Review and revise fee statement (0.4); discuss production of fee statement with B. Resnick (0.2); multiple discussions and emails with A. VanWagner concerning drafting of fee statement (0.9); multiple discussions and emails with C. Scarlett regarding production of updated charts for fee statement (0.5).
VanWagner AB	12/19/12	1.0	Meet with B. Resnick to discuss November fee statement (0.2); emails, calls and meet with C. Robertson to discuss drafting of same (0.8).
Coco KJ	12/20/12	0.3	Review fee statement and coordinate filing and service of same.
de Richemont P	12/20/12	0.1	Email about ongoing conflicts checks.
Resnick BM	12/20/12	0.2	Review November fee statement (0.1); discuss same with A. VanWagner (0.1).
Robertson C	12/20/12	1.8	Emails and discussions with A. VanWagner regarding production of November fee statement (0.6); revise caption for fee statement (0.1); emails with A. VanWagner regarding service of fee statement (0.2); emails and discussions with C. Scarlett regarding Davis Polk retainer amount (0.3); update chart of professionals' fees (0.3); email to N. Anderson and J. Jones regarding status of Davis Polk retainer and professionals' fees (0.3).
VanWagner AB	12/20/12	5.8	Emails and calls with C. Scarlett regarding November fee statement (1.1); call, email and meet with C. Robertson to discuss same (0.9); revise fee statement and send to B. Resnick (1.2); prepare same for filing (1.6); calls and emails with K. Coco regarding filing and service of same (0.2); email to Bryan Cave regarding service of same (0.2); send fee statement for service and route internally (0.4); email S. Krause regarding status of parties-in-interest review (0.2).
Robertson C	12/21/12	0.1	Email to M. McGreal regarding interim fees.
VanWagner AB	12/21/12	0.4	Meet with S. Krause to discuss parties-in-interest review (0.1); coordinate review of December fee statements with C. Schramm (0.3).
VanWagner AB	12/26/12	0.4	Calls with C. Robertson and C. Scarlett regarding Davis Polk fee payments (0.1); discuss parties-in-interest list update with V. Jackson (0.1); update parties-in-interest list (0.2).
Krause SC	12/27/12	0.9	Emails with V. Jackson regarding parties-in-interest and disclosure (0.5); emails with A. VanWagner regarding same (0.4).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
VanWagner AB	12/27/12	1.6	Review docket and update parties-in-interest list for biannual review.
VanWagner AB	12/28/12	0.7	Meet and email with S. Krause regarding parties-in-interest list update (0.3); meet with V. Jackson to discuss same (0.1); discuss timeline for Davis Polk December Fee statement with C. Robertson (0.1); discuss same with C. Schramm (0.2).
<b>Total DPW RETENTION AND FEE ISSUES</b>		<b>190.8</b>	
<b>EMPLOYEE LABOR ISSUES</b>			
Glazer E	12/01/12	0.8	Draft email to E. Moskowitz in connection with responses to information requests from Union.
Huebner MS	12/01/12	0.2	Conversation with E. Moskowitz and emails regarding United Mine Workers of America correspondence.
McGreal MM	12/01/12	0.1	Coordinate meeting on multiemployer pension plan issues.
Peng L	12/01/12	3.4	Draft memo of 8th Circuit authority on §§ 1113 and 1114 issues.
Resnick BM	12/01/12	0.4	Emails with E. Moskowitz regarding response to C. Roberts letter.
FitzGerald ET	12/02/12	1.2	Analysis of issues relating to Peabody Separation Agreement application to multi employer plan liabilities.
Libby A	12/02/12	4.5	Draft section of multi-employer pension plan memo (0.6); review and edit multi-employer pension plan memo (3.7); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/02/12	0.1	Correspondence with A. Libby regarding multiemployer pension plan research memo.
Peng L	12/02/12	5.0	Draft memo of 8th Circuit authority on §§ 1113 and 1114 issues.
Russano MJ	12/02/12	0.2	Confer with E. Moskowitz regarding internal meeting in preparation for multi-employer pension plan meeting.
Sokoloff EA	12/02/12	0.6	Revise new venue precedent research.
Aizen RM	12/03/12	4.3	Review multiemployer plan issues (1.3); emails with M. Luna regarding benefit plan changes (0.2); discussions with Davis Polk team, Blackstone and J. Woodrum regarding multiemployer plan (2.7); call to J. Bean regarding deferred compensation (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
FitzGerald ET	12/03/12	3.5	Analyze termination of Supplemental 401(k) Plan (0.5); meet with B. Resnick and E. Moskowitz (1.0); meet with R. Aizen regarding multi-employer pension plan withdrawal issues (1.0); meet with M. McGreal regarding same (1.0).
Gehring AS	12/03/12	3.4	Review documents for confidentiality (0.6); call with E. Glazer regarding document production to PwC (0.1); review E. Waller's notes from meeting with the United Mine Workers of America (0.7); call with K. Hartsog regarding live model (0.1); emails and calls with E. Moskowitz, E. Glazer, Alix and Patriot regarding posting documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (1.3); post documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.4); call with L. Samet and E. Glazer regarding IntraLinks documents (0.2).
Glazer E	12/03/12	5.0	Respond to information requests from Union, including emails with E. Moskowitz and calls with D. Lucha (3.9); prepare labor-related materials for Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (0.9); emails with Union regarding data room access (0.2).
Halford EB	12/03/12	6.0	Search LEXIS and Westlaw for cases, statutes and other authorities cited in the multi-employer pension plan memorandum (0.8); retrieve and print the Shepards report (0.2); review the Shepards reports (1.0); citecheck and bluebook the citations (2.0); search LEXIS and Westlaw for cases, statutes and other authorities cited in the multi-employer pension plan memorandum (0.5); retrieve and print the quote check report (0.3); review the Quote Check reports (0.7); quote check citations (0.5).
Huebner MS	12/03/12	2.0	Davis Polk meeting regarding multi-employer pension plan issues and Unsecured Creditors' Committee demands (0.9); conversation with E. Moskowitz regarding Peabody issues (0.2); review notes and precedents on pension issues (0.7); emails regarding new United Mine Workers of America counsel and conversation with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2).
Law EC	12/03/12	2.1	Precedent research regarding multi employer pension plan (1.9); communications with A. Libby regarding same (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	12/03/12	1.2	Locate and send final incentive plan proposals to M. McGreal (0.4); review and revise multi-employer pension plan memo and coordinate cite check of same (0.8).
Maguire F	12/03/12	4.6	Meet with R. Aizen and E. FitzGerald regarding arbitration research (0.7); research regarding arbitration procedure (3.9).
Martin JD	12/03/12	1.8	Review and comment on responses to union data requests (0.7); review case law regarding §1114 issues (1.1).
McGreal MM	12/03/12	3.3	Conference with E. Moskowitz, B. Resnick, M. Russano and others regarding multiemployer pension plan issues (0.8); conference with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz, B. Resnick and others regarding same (1.4); draft agenda for meeting regarding same (0.4); teleconference with B. Resnick regarding employee benefits (0.3); review and revise multiemployer pension plan memo (0.4).
Moskowitz E	12/03/12	6.7	Calls and correspondence with clients, team, advisors regarding responses to union data requests (2.9); call with L. Palans and follow-up (0.4); respond to union letter (0.5); correspondence with new counsel (0.3); update call with clients and follow-up (1.7); calls with J. Bean regarding requests (0.9).
Peng L	12/03/12	11.5	Draft and edit memo of 8th Circuit authority on §§ 1113 and 1114.
Ravi SK	12/03/12	2.4	Meet with B. Resnick, E. Moskowitz, R. Estacio, R. Aizen, M. Russano, M. McGreal and E. FitzGerald regarding multi-employer pension plan and indemnification issues .
Resnick BM	12/03/12	3.7	Meet with Davis Polk team regarding multi-employer pension plan issues (0.6); emails with Davis Polk team and Kramer Levin regarding same and ERISA issues (1.3); meeting and call with Davis Polk team, J. Woodrum and Blackstone regarding multi-employer pension plan issues (1.5); call with T. Mayer regarding ERISA issues (0.2); emails with R. Aizen regarding benefits changes (0.1).
Russano MJ	12/03/12	2.2	Prepare for multi-employer pension plan meeting, including review of research memos (1.2); attend multi-employer pension plan meeting with M. Huebner, B. Resnick and E. Moskowitz (1.0).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Samet L	12/03/12	3.9	Review Eighth Circuit case law regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (2.4); emails with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding employee and retiree issues (0.6); emails and telephone calls with E. Glazer, A. Gehring and others regarding data room and document production issues (0.7); emails with E. Sokoloff regarding research projects (0.2).
Sokoloff EA	12/03/12	6.8	Update labor communication and information logs (0.4); research and summarize new venue legal precedent (6.4).
Agostinho JN	12/04/12	1.1	Compare list of plans in presentation regarding compensation and benefits changes with plan documents previously reviewed.
Aizen RM	12/04/12	4.9	Discussions with Patriot, J. Martin and M. McGreal regarding retiree benefits (1.6); review multiemployer plan documents (1.2); discussions with E. FitzGerald and J. Bean regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan (0.2); meet with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel and bankers regarding benefits issues (1.9).
Eum JS	12/04/12	0.5	Coordinate circulation of Patriot 8th Circuit §§ 1113 and 1114 precedent binders as per E. Sokoloff.
FitzGerald ET	12/04/12	2.5	Research on multi employer plan issues (1.0); email to N. Bubnovich regarding same (0.2); meet with creditor advisors (1.0); discussion with B. Resnick regarding retention and incentive plan drafting and multi employer plan (0.3).
Gehring AS	12/04/12	4.1	Review documents for confidentiality (0.5); post documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.6); email to E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.3); review and update document request log (0.3); emails with E. Sokoloff regarding same (0.1); emails with L. Samet regarding Eastern District of Missouri research (1.2); email to E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (0.5); research collective bargaining agreement priority in Eastern District of Missouri (0.3); call with L. Samet regarding same (0.1); emails to industry expert regarding Patriot financial information (0.2).
Glazer E	12/04/12	4.5	Respond to information requests from Union, including emails with D. Lucha (3.8); review issues on Eighth Circuit case law on §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (0.7).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Halford EB	12/04/12	2.5	Search LEXIS and Westlaw for cases, statutes and other authorities cited in the multi-employer pension plan memorandum (0.5); review documents for quoted information online (1.0); quote check citations (1.0).
Huebner MS	12/04/12	1.4	Conversation with E. Moskowitz and M. Russano regarding Peabody and information issues (0.5); conversations with E. Moskowitz and multiple emails regarding United Mine Workers of America and Patriot positions on information issues (0.4); emails with client regarding United Mine Workers of America negotiation issues (0.2); conversations and emails with multiple clients regarding compensation issues (0.2); review of Peabody pleading (0.1).
Krause SC	12/04/12	1.0	Call with R. Aizen regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan (0.1); emails regarding same (0.2); call with B. Resnick and E. FitzGerald regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan (0.4); emails regarding same (0.3).
Law EC	12/04/12	3.1	Further precedent research regarding multi employer pension plan issues (2.7); numerous communications with A. Libby and M. Melvin regarding same (0.4).
Libby A	12/04/12	1.1	Discuss multi-employer pension plan research with E. Law (0.4); cite check multi-employer pension plan memo (0.6); discuss revisions to multi-employer pension plan memo with R. Estacio (0.1).
Maguire F	12/04/12	2.0	Draft outline of withdrawal liability arbitration procedure.
Martin JD	12/04/12	2.7	Calls with M. Luna, M. McGreal, R. Aizen and others regarding potential 363 motion (1.1); prepare for same (0.5); review and comment on communications with union (0.4); review materials related to §§ 1113 and 1114 process (0.5); call regarding same with L. Samet (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/04/12	1.6	Teleconference with M. Luna, R. Aizen and others regarding employee benefits (0.8); teleconference with J. Martin and R. Aizen regarding same (0.2); teleconference with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); review precedent multiemployer plan pleadings (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding wages order (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	12/04/12	6.7	Attend committee professionals meeting (1.1); prepare for committee professionals meeting (0.9); draft communication to Union counsel (0.6); correspondence with clients regarding Union strategy issues (1.3); correspondence with team regarding Union information requests (1.5); correspondence with team regarding Peabody labor issues (0.9); correspondence with consultant regarding expert witness (0.4).
Peng L	12/04/12	8.6	Draft and edit memo on 8th Circuit authority on §§ 1113 and 1114 issues.
Resnick BM	12/04/12	2.3	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding multi-employer pension plan issues (0.7); emails with Davis Polk team regarding critical employee incentive plan and key employee retention plan issues (0.4); call with E. FitzGerald and S. Krause regarding critical employee incentive plan/key employee retention plan issues and multi-employer pension plan issues (0.3); call with A. McCallister regarding garnishment issue (0.2); meet with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding §1113 issues (0.2); call with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.4).
Samet L	12/04/12	1.2	Edit research regarding Eighth Circuit law (0.5); emails and telephone calls with A. Gehring regarding same (0.3); prepare proposal for employee and retiree-related work product (0.3); emails with E. Glazer regarding same (0.1).
Sokoloff EA	12/04/12	6.4	Summarize and revise research on Eighth Circuit precedent (6.1); update labor communications and information log (0.3).
Agostinho JN	12/05/12	1.3	Conference regarding benefit plans and 363 motion with R. Aizen, M. Luna, D. Lucha and J. Orf (0.4); review new case law regarding calculation of withdrawal liability (0.4); review retiree notice letter and provide comments to same (0.5).
Aizen RM	12/05/12	2.2	Review benefits changes deck (0.5); discussions with Patriot and J. Agostinho regarding benefits changes (0.7); consider multiemployer plan issues (0.9); emails with N. Bubnovich regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan (0.1).
FitzGerald ET	12/05/12	3.0	Research on plan withdrawal issues (1.0); analysis of plan changes (0.5); research regarding multi-employer plan withdrawal calculations (1.5).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Gehring AS	12/05/12	2.7	Emails with L. Samet and E. Glazer regarding declarations (0.2); review documents for confidentiality (0.2); post documents to United Mine Workers of America data room (0.1); meet with E. Glazer regarding same (0.3); call with industry expert regarding declaration (0.2); review L. Peng and E. Sokoloff's memorandum regarding Eighth Circuit §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (1.3); meet with L. Samet, E. Glazer, L. Peng and E. Sokoloff regarding declarations (0.3); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding solvency materials (0.1).
Glazer E	12/05/12	2.7	Meet with labor team regarding declarations (0.5); meet with L. Peng regarding potential expert declaration (0.2); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding status of response to PwC requests for information (0.5); draft email to E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding potential expert declaration (1.2); provide data room access to union's law firm (0.3).
Krause SC	12/05/12	1.6	Review Eastern District of Missouri Key Employee Incentive Plan precedent (0.4); confer with A. Libby regarding same (0.1); telephonically attend meeting with Unsecured Creditors' Committee for discussion of employee benefits (0.7); emails regarding benefit plan presentations (0.4).
Law EC	12/05/12	0.9	Further research and obtain documents regarding multi employer pension plan precedents (0.8); communications with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).
Libby A	12/05/12	2.1	Dial into multi-employer pension plan presentation in Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (0.5); discuss multi-employer pension plan research with E. Law (0.2); listen to presentation on incentive plans at Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (0.4); edit incentive plan motion (0.6); review incentive plan precedents (0.4).
Maguire F	12/05/12	0.6	Review arbitration procedure outline and send to E. FitzGerald.
Martin JD	12/05/12	1.5	Conference with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (0.7); review materials related to potential expert (0.3); review materials related to union data requests (0.5).
McGreal MM	12/05/12	0.4	Conference with A. Libby regarding research on precedent motions relating to employee benefits (0.2); review precedents (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	12/05/12	0.8	Review various dockets and obtain 8th Circuit Key Employee Incentive Program precedent for A. Libby.
Moskowitz E	12/05/12	6.8	Attend labor portions of Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (1.9); prepare for same (0.7); follow-up discussions with clients (1.1); correspondence with United Mine Workers of America counsel regarding information requests (0.7); meet with M. Russano regarding same (0.3); meet with L. Samet and J. Martin regarding planning (0.5); additional correspondence with team regarding above issues (1.6).
Peng L	12/05/12	3.5	Team meeting to discuss declarations (0.4); edit 8th Circuit §§ 1113 and 1114 memo (2.9); review prior declarations for background in Patriot declaration (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/05/12	1.8	Emails with N. Bubnovich and Davis Polk team regarding critical employee incentive plan and annual incentive plan issues (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding §1113 issues (0.4); emails with Davis Polk team regarding multi-employer pension plan issues (0.6); review research regarding same (0.3).
Samet L	12/05/12	5.6	Edit research memorandum on Eighth Circuit law (3.6); emails and telephone calls with E. Sokoloff and L. Peng regarding same (0.4); prepare proposal for employee and retiree-related work product (0.2); meet with E. Glazer, A. Gehring and others regarding same (0.3); meeting with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding case strategy (0.7); emails with E. Moskowitz and others regarding employee and retiree issues (0.4).
Sokoloff EA	12/05/12	2.8	Meet with L. Samet, E. Glazer, A. Gehring and L. Peng to discuss litigation schedule (0.2); update log of labor communications and requests (0.3); revise memorandum on Eighth Circuit law (2.3).
Agostinho JN	12/06/12	0.5	Revise comments to retiree notice (0.2); correspondence regarding withdrawal liability calculation (0.3).
Aizen RM	12/06/12	1.1	Emails with M. Huebner regarding employee benefit changes (0.3); discussions with E. FitzGerald, E. Moskowitz, R. Estacio and M. McGreal regarding multiemployer plan (0.8).
FitzGerald ET	12/06/12	2.3	Discuss multi-employer plan issues with E. Moskowitz (0.5); phone calls with M. Luna to retain actuary for multi employer plan analysis (0.3); research on multi employer plan withdrawal issues (1.5).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Gehring AS	12/06/12	1.4	Meet with E. Glazer regarding PwC documents (0.1); post documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.3); review documents for confidentiality (0.3); emails with L. Samet and E. Glazer regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee documents (0.3); emails with industry expert regarding financial documents (0.3); emails with E. Moskowitz and E. Glazer regarding status of PwC document requests (0.1).
Glazer E	12/06/12	5.0	Call with Union's financial advisors regarding business plan (0.9); discussions with Patriot regarding same (0.3); meet with L. Samet and E. Sokoloff regarding labor issues (0.3); call with Patriot regarding Union data requests (0.4); emails with A. Gehring and Patriot regarding potential expert issues (0.2); respond to Union and Unsecured Creditors' Committee data requests and emails with E. Moskowitz and A. Gehring regarding same (2.3); calls with J. Martin, M. McGreal and L. Peng regarding potential expert declaration (0.6).
Huebner MS	12/06/12	0.2	Conversation with B. Resnick regarding employee issues.
Krause SC	12/06/12	0.2	Various emails regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan.
Law EC	12/06/12	0.8	Precedent research regarding 401(k) and deferred compensation (0.6); communications with M. Melvin regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	12/06/12	1.4	Emails with S. Krause regarding incentive plan motion (0.2); research Eastern District of Missouri incentive plan motions (1.2).
Martin JD	12/06/12	2.0	Review materials related to union data requests (0.6); review and comment on communications with union (0.4); review and comment on §§ 1113 and 1114 materials (1.0)
McGreal MM	12/06/12	1.6	Review precedents regarding employee communications (0.4); correspondence with J. Orf and M. Luna regarding same (0.1); conference with E. FitzGerald, E. Moskowitz and R. Aizen regarding multiemployer pension plan issues (0.4); review presentation on employee benefits (0.3); review and comment on letter to employees regarding benefits (0.1); email R. Aizen regarding same (0.1); correspondence with E. Glazer regarding §1113 declaration (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Melvin MM	12/06/12	4.9	Research and locate precedent regarding 401(k) plans for A. Libby (4.3); save same to the system (0.5); communication with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).
Moskowitz E	12/06/12	8.4	Call with PwC regarding data requests and follow-up (1.2); review funds request and correspondence regarding same (1.0); correspondence with team and client regarding declarations and related issues (1.3); draft letter to Union (1.1); correspondence regarding Peabody issues (0.9); review and edit 1113 legal memo and correspondence regarding same (1.2); meet with benefits team regarding multi-employer pension plan (0.4); additional email correspondence with team regarding above issues (1.3).
Peng L	12/06/12	10.7	Follow up research on snap-back provisions and other §1113 issues (10.5); meet with E. Glazer regarding Blackstone declaration (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/06/12	2.6	Emails with Davis Polk team and J. Woodrum regarding §1113 issues (0.9); emails with Davis Polk team and J. Woodrum regarding multi-employer pension plan issues (0.8); emails and calls with Davis Polk team regarding 363 and amendable benefits issues (0.5); review research regarding same (0.3); review response letter to C. Roberts (0.1).
Samet L	12/06/12	2.0	Emails with E. Moskowitz and others regarding labor experts (0.3); meet with E. Glazer and E. Sokoloff regarding case strategy (0.4); review 1113 and 1114 precedent (0.9); emails regarding employee and retiree issues (0.4).
Sokoloff EA	12/06/12	8.0	Meet with L. Samet and E. Glazer regarding briefing schedule (0.3); research contract law issues (1.1); research §1113 discovery issues (5.2); update labor information and communications logs (0.2); revise research on Eighth Circuit case law (1.2).
Agostinho JN	12/07/12	3.3	Meet with R. Aizen to discuss plan changes (0.5); prepare summary of changes to benefit plans (1.3); conference with J. Bean, M. Luna, D. Lucha, E. FitzGerald, R. Aizen and M. McGreal (1.2); meet with E. FitzGerald and R. Aizen to prepare for same (0.3).
Aizen RM	12/07/12	2.3	Discussions with Patriot, E. FitzGerald, M. McGreal and J. Agostinho regarding benefit changes.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/07/12	1.6	Call with clients regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 strategy and various other related issues (1.0); review Eighth Circuit memo regarding §1113 jurisprudence (0.6).
Eum JS	12/07/12	2.3	Compile authorities for withdrawal liability calculation cases binder as per R. Estacio.
FitzGerald ET	12/07/12	2.0	Research relating to multi employer plan issues (1.0); conference call with J. Bean and M. Luna regarding 363 motion plan changes (1.0).
Gehring AS	12/07/12	1.7	Post documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.6); calls and emails with J. Mazzotti regarding same (0.3); calls with J. Martin and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); emails with J. Mazzotti regarding PwC status update (0.2); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); meet with E. Glazer regarding PwC documents (0.4).
Glazer E	12/07/12	2.4	Attend to United Mine Workers of America and PwC requests for information.
Krause SC	12/07/12	0.3	Emails with A. Libby regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan.
Law EC	12/07/12	0.2	Circulate precedent research regarding employee incentive plans (0.1); communications with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).
Libby A	12/07/12	0.2	Emails with S. Krause regarding incentive plan motion.
Maguire F	12/07/12	5.1	Research on arbitration of withdrawal liability issue.
Martin JD	12/07/12	2.1	Review materials for posting to data room (1.2); review §1113 research (0.6); review information requests from funds (0.3).
McGreal MM	12/07/12	2.7	Teleconference with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz, J. Bean and others regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 strategy issues (1.1); teleconference with M. Luna, E. FitzGerald, R. Aizen and others regarding employee benefits (0.9); teleconference with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); teleconference with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); review powerpoint presentation regarding benefits (0.2); draft section for memo on multiemployer pension plan memo (0.2); correspondence with R. Estacio regarding same (0.1).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	12/07/12	4.4	Meet with M. Huebner to discuss status and follow-up regarding labor issues (0.7); call with clients and follow-up (1.2); review and edit legal memo and correspondence regarding same (0.8); correspondence regarding Peabody issues (0.9); correspondence regarding data requests (0.8).
Peng L	12/07/12	3.5	Research on snap-back provisions (2.5); draft section of potential expert declaration (1.0).
Resnick BM	12/07/12	1.3	Emails with Davis Polk litigation team regarding strategy with respect to benefit plans (0.2); emails with Davis Polk benefits team regarding multi-employer pension plan issues (0.4); review research regarding benefit plans (0.2); emails with J. Woodrum and E. Moskowitz regarding §1113 issues (0.2); review research regarding 8th Circuit law on §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (0.2); emails with N. Bubnovich regarding critical employee incentive plan and annual incentive plan (0.1).
Samet L	12/07/12	1.6	Review emails regarding labor issues and propose strategy for production of same (0.7); revise letter to C. Roberts regarding labor issues (0.5); emails regarding employee and retiree issues (0.4).
Sokoloff EA	12/07/12	4.1	Summarize research on contract issue (0.9); update labor data and communication logs (0.3); revise Eighth Circuit §§ 1113 and 1114 research (1.1); draft §§ 1113 and 1114 brief (1.8).
Aizen RM	12/08/12	0.1	Email from R. Estacio regarding multi-employer plan.
FitzGerald ET	12/08/12	0.5	Review of case law relating to withdrawal process.
Gehring AS	12/08/12	0.1	Emails with industry expert regarding declaration.
McGreal MM	12/08/12	0.2	Correspondence with R. Estacio regarding multiemployer pension plan memo.
Aizen RM	12/09/12	0.2	Review annual bonus plan.
Gehring AS	12/09/12	2.0	Review industry expert declaration.
Huebner MS	12/09/12	0.2	Emails regarding pension fund issues.
Resnick BM	12/09/12	0.2	Emails regarding §1113 and multi-employer pension plan issues.
Samet L	12/09/12	0.7	Revise analysis of retiree issues (0.4); emails with E. Moskowitz and M. Luna regarding same (0.3).
Agostinho JN	12/10/12	0.3	Review plan documents.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Aizen RM	12/10/12	1.9	Emails with M. Luna and K. Burlage regarding bonuses (0.3); discussions and emails with E. Moskowitz, M. Luna, B. Wald and R. Estacio regarding multi-employer plan actuary (1.1); discussions with M. McGreal regarding 363 motion (0.5).
FitzGerald ET	12/10/12	2.3	Review multiemployer plan outline (0.6); review multiemployer plan actuarial case law (1.0); discussions with multiemployer plan actuary (0.7).
Gehring AS	12/10/12	2.4	Review and edit industry expert declaration (1.6); review documents for confidentiality (0.4); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2); upload documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.1); emails with M. McGreal regarding 8th Circuit research (0.1).
Glazer E	12/10/12	0.2	Review United Mine Workers of America and PwC information requests (0.1); review documents in data room (0.1).
Huebner MS	12/10/12	1.1	Introductory call with new United Mine Workers of America counsel and brief chat with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.4); emails regarding multiple United Mine Workers of America issues (0.4); emails with clients and conversation with E. Moskowitz regarding pension and benefit fund discovery issues (0.3).
Klein DS	12/10/12	0.5	Emails with R. Mead regarding Ohio workers compensation correspondence and review of same.
Krause SC	12/10/12	0.9	Confer with A. Libby regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan (0.3); review N. Bubnovich declaration (0.6).
Law EC	12/10/12	1.9	Communications with A. Libby and M. Melvin regarding multi-employer plan research (0.3); obtain precedents of deferred compensation plan (1.2); communications with A. Libby and M. Melvin regarding same (0.4).
Libby A	12/10/12	1.7	Review multi-employer pension plan stipulation precedents (0.2); research related dockets for additional information on multi-employer pension plan precedents (0.4); blackline and review Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan decks and email S. Krause regarding changes (1.1).
Martin JD	12/10/12	3.1	Review documents for posting to data room (0.6); work on expert issues (0.4); review draft declaration (1.3); review and comment on information requests and responses (0.8).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	12/10/12	1.8	Review precedent §363 motions regarding benefits (0.5); correspondence with A. Libby regarding same (0.1); review research regarding multiemployer pension plan issues (0.1); teleconference with J. Orf, R. McWilliams, K. Coco and others regarding claims relating to employee benefits (0.6); teleconference with R. McWilliams and J. Creighton regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and R. Aizen regarding same (0.3).
Moskowitz E	12/10/12	5.6	Correspondence with team members regarding various §1113 preparation initiatives (2.8); meet with M. Huebner and call with F. Perrillo (0.6); draft response to Funds' discovery requests (1.3); respond to client emails (0.9).
Peng L	12/10/12	0.9	Research calculation of § 1114 claims issue.
Resnick BM	12/10/12	0.7	Call with J. Bean regarding director indemnification (0.1); review B. Hatfield indemnification agreement (0.1); call with D. Klein regarding workers compensation issue (0.2); emails with Davis Polk litigation team regarding multi-employer pension plan termination issues (0.3).
Samet L	12/10/12	8.3	Draft supporting declaration relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (3.3); review precedent for same (3.9); emails with M. Luna, J. Bean and others regarding retiree issues (0.3); emails with E. Moskowitz, J. Martin and others regarding proposed expert (0.1); correspondence with A. Libby and others regarding proposed case management order (0.5); emails with E. Sokoloff regarding research issues (0.2).
Sokoloff EA	12/10/12	5.1	Draft §§ 1113 and 1114 brief (2.8); additional research on §1113 standing issues (2.3).
Aizen RM	12/11/12	1.2	Discussions with E. FitzGerald, R. Estacio and actuary regarding multi-employer plan (1.0); emails with J. Tucker regarding compensation discussion and analysis (0.1); review email from J. Orf regarding retiree letters (0.1).
FitzGerald ET	12/11/12	1.0	Discussions with R. Aizen regarding benefit plan terminations.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Gehring AS	12/11/12	3.1	Meet with E. Moskowitz, J. Martin and L. Samet regarding industry expert declaration (1.5); draft outline of same (1.3); email to E. Moskowitz regarding confidentiality of documents (0.1); emails from E. Moskowitz regarding negotiations with the United Mine Workers of America (0.2).
Glazer E	12/11/12	1.2	Review and revise documents in response to union financial advisor's request for information (0.6); review precedent expert declarations related to labor savings (0.6).
Huebner MS	12/11/12	1.2	Conference call with senior client team, E. Moskowitz regarding United Mine Workers of America and pension fund requests and responses (1.0); emails with clients regarding actuarial issues (0.2).
Krause SC	12/11/12	0.1	Emails regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan with A Libby.
Law EC	12/11/12	1.4	Precedent research regarding 401(k) deferred compensation plans (1.2); communications with A. Libby and M. Melvin regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	12/11/12	1.4	Discuss multi-employer pension plan and 401(k) research with M. Melvin and E. Law (0.2); research and summarize precedent schedule of financial affairs amendments (0.6); review blackline of final Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan decks against former decks as part of updating related officer declaration and motion (0.6).
Martin JD	12/11/12	2.8	Conference with E. Moskowitz, A. Gehring and L. Samet regarding expert declarations and next steps (1.4); conference call with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz, B. Hatfield, J. Bean and others regarding responses to union (1.0); review documents for production to union (0.4).
McGreal MM	12/11/12	0.3	Correspondence with R. Estacio regarding multiemployer pension plan research (0.1); conference with B. Resnick regarding motions and claims relating to employee benefits (0.2).

## Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	12/11/12	8.2	Review legal research regarding third parties (0.5); correspondence with team regarding §1113 preparation and related issues (0.9); draft letter to Union counsel (1.1); review responses to information request and deliver comments to clients (1.2); revise letter to Funds' counsel and correspondence regarding same (0.5); call with clients and adviser regarding Union requests and follow-up (1.2); call with S. Ravi regarding document review (0.4); meet with L. Samet and J. Martin regarding industry expert and follow-up (1.1); review industry expert declaration (0.7); prepare for call with clients (0.6).
Peng L	12/11/12	0.3	Research §1114 claims calculation issue.
Samet L	12/11/12	9.9	Draft supporting declaration relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (7.1); review precedent for same (0.9); meet with E. Moskowitz, J. Martin and A. Gehring regarding expert declaration and labor strategy (1.4); emails and telephone calls with E. Sokoloff regarding research issues (0.3); review letter to J. Goodchild regarding information requests (0.2).
Sokoloff EA	12/11/12	5.0	Research §1113 standing issues (1.6); update labor communications and information log (0.3); research on §1113 discovery (3.1).
Agostinho JN	12/12/12	0.7	Review benefits plan documents.
Aizen RM	12/12/12	2.4	Comment on employee communications (1.7); discussion with E. FitzGerald regarding multi-employer plan (0.3); review retirement plan issues (0.4).
Gehring AS	12/12/12	3.7	Review documents for confidentiality (0.3); upload documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.4); call with Z. Mitschrich at Blackstone regarding Professional Eyes Only designation (0.1); emails with D. Loss and L. Samet regarding provisions of documents to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.1); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding United Mine Workers of America documents requests (0.2); draft outline of industry expert declaration (2.4); email to E. Moskowitz, J. Martin and L. Samet regarding same (0.1); call with L. Samet regarding same (0.1).
Glazer E	12/12/12	4.1	Revise supporting declaration.
Huebner MS	12/12/12	0.3	Review emails regarding labor diligence issues (0.2); emails regarding labor calculation issues (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	12/12/12	6.2	Drafting responses to union letters (4.4); communications with E. Moskowitz and others regarding data requests by union, funds and related responses (0.7); communications with E. Moskowitz regarding discovery issue (0.5); review documents for production to union (0.6).
McGreal MM	12/12/12	0.5	Conference with D. Silberger regarding motions relating to employee benefits (0.3); teleconference with J. Creighton regarding employee and retiree claims (0.2).
Moskowitz E	12/12/12	5.8	Correspondence regarding data requests (0.7); call with J. Goodchild and follow-up (0.8); correspondence with clients regarding Peabody issues and information requests (1.7); review draft submissions to workforce and correspondence regarding same (0.7); review Mesaba materials and correspondence regarding same (1.0); correspondence with team regarding 1113 next steps (0.9).
Peng L	12/12/12	2.8	Research §1114 claims.
Resnick BM	12/12/12	0.6	Emails regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 issues and research regarding same (0.4); emails with Company and E. Moskowitz regarding pension fund issues (0.2).
Samet L	12/12/12	4.4	Draft and edit supporting declaration relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (3.1); emails with E. Moskowitz and E. Sokoloff regarding same (0.2); emails and telephone calls with M. Russano, E. Moskowitz and A. Gehring regarding solvency opinions (0.5); edit expert declaration and telephone calls with A. Gehring regarding same (0.4); emails with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding potential expert retention (0.2).
Silberger DM	12/12/12	3.2	Meet with M. McGreal regarding §363 motions in respect of retiree benefits and deferred compensation plans (0.4); research on §1114 and issues relating to postpetition termination of retiree benefits (2.8).
Sokoloff EA	12/12/12	2.1	Summarize §1113 discovery precedent (1.6); review draft declaration (0.5).
Aizen RM	12/13/12	1.3	Comment on retiree letters (0.4); consider compensation disclosure questions (0.2); discussions with J. Tucker, S. Krause, W. Hoeben and J. Agostinho regarding compensation discussion and analysis (0.7).
Gehring AS	12/13/12	0.1	Emails with Z. Mitschrich at Blackstone regarding Professional Eyes Only designation.

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Glazer E	12/13/12	3.8	Draft supporting declaration related to labor and retiree savings (2.1); review and revise documents in response to union financial advisor's request for information (1.7).
Huebner MS	12/13/12	0.9	Review of multiple emails from E. Moskowitz and multiple clients regarding labor and §1113 issues and negotiations.
Klein DS	12/13/12	0.3	Call and email with K. Coco regarding Ohio workers' compensation correspondence.
Libby A	12/13/12	4.0	Review and revise officers' declaration for incentive motion and email same to S. Krause for review.
Martin JD	12/13/12	3.1	Call with L. Samet and potential expert (0.3); call with E. Moskowitz, L. Samet and second potential expert and related preparation (1.2); review and comment on draft declarations for possible litigation (1.2); review correspondence from union counsel (0.4).
McGreal MM	12/13/12	0.3	Review and comment on letters to retirees.
Melvin MM	12/13/12	0.2	Communication with E. Law regarding multi-employer pension plan research.
Moskowitz E	12/13/12	5.1	Correspondence with team regarding data requests (0.7); calls with J. Bean and D. Lusha and follow-up (0.9); correspondence with team regarding Peabody issues (0.6); review Union message and correspondence regarding same (0.7); correspondence with team regarding §1113 planning (1.2); call with potential expert witness and follow-up (1.0).
Peng L	12/13/12	6.8	Research impact of §1114 claims post rejection (2.5); research potential healthcare expert (4.3).
Resnick BM	12/13/12	1.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding §1114 and benefits issues (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team and J. Woodrum regarding multi-employer pension plan issues (0.4); emails with Blackstone and N. Bubnovich regarding critical employee incentive plan and annual incentive plan (0.2).
Samet L	12/13/12	9.1	Research regarding potential experts and emails regarding same (1.4); telephone call with J. Martin and potential expert (0.3); telephone call with E. Moskowitz, J. Martin and second potential expert (0.8); follow-up emails and telephone calls with expert (0.7); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding document production (0.3); edit supporting declaration relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (4.1); draft supporting declaration relating to bankruptcy, labor issues and proposals (1.5).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Silberger DM	12/13/12	7.1	Prepare for meeting with K. Coco regarding letter to Ohio Bureau of Workers' Compensation (0.6); meet with K. Coco regarding letter to Ohio Bureau of Workers' Compensation and upcoming conference call with same (0.3); research on §363 motions with respect to retiree benefits and deferred compensation plans and §1114 implications related thereto (6.2).
Sokoloff EA	12/13/12	0.5	Update labor information and communication logs.
Agostinho JN	12/14/12	0.1	Correspondence with O. Lozada regarding retiree life insurance documents.
Aizen RM	12/14/12	2.3	Consider 401(k) question (0.2); discussions with actuary, J. Bean, E. FitzGerald, B. Resnick and M. McGreal regarding retirement plans (1.9); comment on employee letters (0.2).
Cho EK	12/14/12	0.3	Telephone conference with R. Aizen regarding plan amendments.
FitzGerald ET	12/14/12	1.0	Discussions with Ron Aizen on plan changes (0.5); review of chart and plans (0.5).
Gehring AS	12/14/12	3.5	Emails from E. Moskowitz regarding responses to the United Mine Workers of America, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and the Funds (0.3); review documents for confidentiality (0.3); email to E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); post documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.2); revise industry expert declaration framework (1.8); emails with E. Moskowitz, J. Martin and L. Samet regarding same (0.3); email to industry expert regarding same (0.2); review calculations of Patriot's pension contributions (0.2); call with E. Glazer regarding same (0.1).
Glazer E	12/14/12	1.1	Review and revise documents in response to union financial advisor's request for information.
Huebner MS	12/14/12	0.4	Review of multiple emails to and from United Mine Workers of America regarding negotiations and confidentiality.
Krause SC	12/14/12	0.9	Review employee letters (0.6); emails regarding same (0.3).
Libby A	12/14/12	0.7	Review R. Aizen and S. Krause comments to employee compensation letters (0.2); compile same and circulate to team (0.5).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	12/14/12	2.6	Review and comment on draft declarations for possible litigation (1.5); draft responses to union correspondence (0.8); review emails regarding potential expert retention (0.3).
McGreal MM	12/14/12	0.3	Review wages order (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick and R. Aizen regarding employee benefit plans (0.2).
Melvin MM	12/14/12	0.9	Continue precedent research on multi-employer pension plans (0.8); forward precedent to A. Libby for review (0.1).
Moskowitz E	12/14/12	5.5	Draft letter to Union counsel and C. Roberts; (1.5); correspondence with Funds counsel (0.5); draft letter to Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.4); call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel and follow-up (0.6); review negotiation declaration (0.9); review industry expert declaration and correspondence regarding same (0.7); call with B. Resnick regarding status (0.3); email correspondence with team regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 strategy (0.6).
Peng L	12/14/12	3.5	Research regarding §1114 claims.
Resnick BM	12/14/12	1.3	Call with J. Bean regarding benefits issues (0.2); correspondence with E. FitzGerald and R. Aizen regarding same (0.8); emails with clients and E. Moskowitz regarding union issues (0.3).
Samet L	12/14/12	4.1	Edit research regarding potential expert (0.3); emails with E. Moskowitz and L. Peng regarding same (0.3); telephone calls with potential expert (0.4); emails with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (0.9); edit supporting declaration relating to 1113 and 1114 negotiations (1.7); draft supporting declaration from company executive relating to bankruptcy, labor issues and proposals (0.5).
Sokoloff EA	12/14/12	0.4	Update union information and communication logs.
Aizen RM	12/15/12	0.4	Email to J. Bean regarding 401(k) and supplemental 401(k).
Gehring AS	12/15/12	0.3	Post documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.2); emails with L. Samet and E. Glazer regarding Professional Eyes Only designation (0.1).
Glazer E	12/15/12	0.2	Emails with M. McGreal, A. Gehring and L. Samet regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room issues.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	12/15/12	1.8	Research Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan precedents in Eighth Circuit.
Samet L	12/15/12	8.0	Draft declaration of company executive in support of potential §§1113 and 1114 motion (4.2); research for same (3.8).
Aizen RM	12/16/12	0.1	Email from J. Woodrum regarding multiemployer plan.
Estacio R	12/16/12	0.2	Correspond with E. Moskowitz regarding meeting with pension funds (0.1); draft correspondence to assistant regarding the same (0.1).
Gehring AS	12/16/12	0.2	Emails from E. Moskowitz regarding negotiations with the United Mine Workers of America.
Glazer E	12/16/12	6.1	Work on expert declaration related to business plan.
Huebner MS	12/16/12	0.2	Emails with senior clients regarding United Mine Workers of America issues and confidentiality position.
Krause SC	12/16/12	1.2	Emails regarding employee letters (0.2); review Declaration in support of Key Employee Incentive Plan (1.0).
Martin JD	12/16/12	0.5	Review emails regarding documents posted to data room (0.2); review communications with union representatives regarding discovery issues and negotiation (0.3).
Moskowitz E	12/16/12	1.9	Emails with team regarding status and next steps (0.6); review and edit labor declaration (0.9); correspondence with clients regarding United Mine Workers of America response (0.4).
Samet L	12/16/12	3.4	Draft supporting declaration from company executive relating to bankruptcy, labor issues and proposals (2.6); research for same (0.8).
Agostinho JN	12/17/12	0.4	Review retiree life insurance documents.
Aizen RM	12/17/12	2.5	Emails with M. Luna and B. Resnick regarding benefit changes (0.4); discussions with J. Bean, M. Luna, B. Wald and actuary regarding benefit plans (0.9); discussions with E. Cho regarding benefit plan amendments (0.4); discussion with E. Moskowitz, Blackstone, E. FitzGerald and J. Woodrum regarding multi-employer plan (0.5); comment on Key Employee Incentive Plan and Critical Employee Retention Plan declaration (0.3).
Cho EK	12/17/12	1.3	Telephone conference with R. Aizen regarding benefit plan issues (0.5); review benefit plans (0.8).
Coco KJ	12/17/12	0.4	Review and comment on draft letter to Ohio Workers' Compensation group.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	12/17/12	1.2	Edit memorandum regarding pension liabilities (0.7); correspond with E. Moskowitz regarding meeting with pension funds (0.1); correspond with legal assistant regarding pension liabilities memorandum (0.3); correspond with assistant regarding coordinating meeting with pension funds (0.1).
Eum JS	12/17/12	2.0	Update citations and footnotes of multi-employer pension plan memo as per R. Estacio.
FitzGerald ET	12/17/12	1.7	Conference call with J. Bean and M. Luna regarding plan changes (0.5); analysis of multiemployer plan actuarial work (0.7); review of Incentive Plan presentation changes (0.5).
Gehring AS	12/17/12	6.7	Emails with J. Mazzotti at Alix regarding United Mine Workers of America document requests (0.2); meet with L. Samet and E. Glazer regarding provision of documents to the United Mine Workers of America (0.3); meet with E. Glazer regarding same (0.2); call to industry expert regarding declaration (0.1); cross-check documents in the United Mine Workers of America and Unsecured Creditors' Committee data rooms (5.3); emails and calls with E. Glazer, IntraLinks, Z. Mitschrich at Blackstone and J. Mazzotti at Alix regarding same (0.6).
Glazer E	12/17/12	6.1	Work on expert declaration related to business plan (4.7); meetings and calls with L. Samet and A. Gehring regarding United Mine Workers of America data room (0.6); revise extension agreement for Guyan mine (0.4); draft retention agreement for potential expert (0.4).
Huebner MS	12/17/12	0.7	Review of correspondence from United Mine Workers of America and conversation with E. Moskowitz regarding confidential matters.
Krause SC	12/17/12	0.2	Emails with A. Libby regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan.
Libby A	12/17/12	1.1	Incorporate S. Krause comments into officers' declaration (1.0); email same to R. Aizen (0.1).
Martin JD	12/17/12	1.9	Communications with L. Samet and E. Moskowitz regarding expert retention issues (0.7); review and comment on draft declarations (1.2).

## Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	12/17/12	7.9	Review and edit negotiation declaration and correspondence with L. Samet regarding same (1.7); draft response to United Mine Workers of America communications (1.2); call with T. Mayer and follow-up regarding United Mine Workers of America confidentiality points (0.7); meet with M. Huebner regarding status (0.4); call with Blackstone and J. Woodrum to prepare for Funds meeting (0.9); review and edit extension agreement (0.2); correspondence with team regarding expert witness issues (0.7); additional emails with team regarding above (1.3); review executive declaration and related materials (0.8).
Peng L	12/17/12	7.7	Read over emails from Davis Polk team (0.2); draft summary of research on §1114 claims (7.5).
Resnick BM	12/17/12	0.4	Call with E. Moskowitz regarding various labor issues (0.2); correspondence with F. Perillo regarding same (0.2).
Samet L	12/17/12	8.9	Draft and edit supporting declaration relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (6.8); meet with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.4); telephone calls and emails with potential expert (0.5); edit draft retention letter (0.4); meet with E. Glazer and A. Gehring regarding data room issues (0.3); correspondence regarding employee and retiree issues (0.5).
Silberger DM	12/17/12	2.1	Draft letter to Ohio Bureau of Workers' Compensation.
Sokoloff EA	12/17/12	0.5	Update union information and communication logs.
Agostinho JN	12/18/12	0.9	Conference with R. Aizen, M. Luna and M. McGreal regarding benefit plan communications (0.3); revise benefit program chart (0.6).
Aizen RM	12/18/12	3.9	Emails with Patriot, actuary and E. Moskowitz regarding multi-employer plan (0.7); discussions with E. Cho regarding supplemental 401(k) and 401(k) (0.4); meet with United Mine Workers of America Funds regarding diligence (1.2); call with M. Luna, J. Bean, M. McGreal and J. Agostinho regarding benefit changes (0.3); comment on compensation plan declaration (1.1); emails with J. Tucker and E. FitzGerald regarding Securities and Exchange Commission Forms 4 filings (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Cho EK	12/18/12	4.7	Prepare board resolutions (0.5); call with R. Aizen regarding amendments to benefit plans as well as correspondence with R. Aizen regarding same (1.0); review plan documents (1.0); prepare cover memo (0.2); prepare amendments (2.0).
Coco KJ	12/18/12	0.3	Review and comment on draft letter to Ohio Workers' Compensation entity (0.1); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Estacio R	12/18/12	3.4	Correspond with assistant regarding coordinating meeting with pension funds (0.1); correspond with E. Moskowitz regarding the same (0.1); review background materials in preparation for conference with pension fund regarding the funds' document request (1.3); attend conference regarding the same (1.8); correspond with E. Moskowitz regarding the same (0.1).
Falk AE	12/18/12	3.8	Meet with A. Libby regarding updating Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan to reflect 8th Circuit precedents (0.2); research precedents regarding same (2.8); draft updated language (0.4); draft email to A. Libby summarizing related Eighth Circuit law (0.4).
Gehring AS	12/18/12	4.7	Emails with Z. Mitschrich at Blackstone and J. Mazzotti at Alix regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room (0.1); emails with industry expert regarding declaration (0.6); emails with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (0.2); review documents responsive to PwC's information requests for confidentiality (0.4); email to E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); upload documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.2); review Unsecured Creditors' Committee documents to determine whether to provide them to the United Mine Workers of America (3.1).
Glazer E	12/18/12	5.5	Work on expert declaration related to business plan (4.1); calls with A. Schlesinger at Blackstone regarding expert declaration related to business plan and United Mine Workers of America data room issues (0.5); review documents for relevance and confidentiality for United Mine Workers of America data room (0.5); emails with A. Gehring regarding same (0.2); confer with L. Samet regarding revisions to draft declaration on negotiations with United Mine Workers of America (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	12/18/12	0.9	Conversation with E. Moskowitz and emails regarding pension and benefit funds requests (0.4); emails with multiple clients regarding United Mine Workers of America negotiations and disclosures (0.5).
Klein DS	12/18/12	0.7	Revise Ohio workers' compensation letter and coordinate with K. Coco regarding same (0.3); review news stories regarding United Mine Workers of America rallies and email L. Samet regarding same (0.4).
Krause SC	12/18/12	2.9	Confer regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan with A. Libby and R. Aizen (0.8); confer with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); review Key Employee Incentive Plan motion (0.5); review information for employees (0.2); emails regarding same (0.1); review Key Employee Incentive Plan motion (1.0); confer with A. Libby regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	12/18/12	8.2	Research 8th circuit precedent regarding ordinary course standard (1.1); discuss same with A. Falk (0.3); review and incorporate research regarding ordinary course into incentive plan motion (0.8); research 8th circuit standard for business judgment rule (3.5); incorporate same into incentive plan motion (0.5); discuss incentive plan motion with S. Krause (0.2); review S. Krause comments to incentive plan motion (0.2); incorporate same into motion (0.6); research approved Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan precedents for incentive plan motion (0.7); email final deck of incentive plans and related material to R. Aizen (0.1); call with R. Aizen and S. Krause regarding officers' declaration (0.2).
Martin JD	12/18/12	3.4	Call with E. Moskowitz, L. Samet, B. Hatfield and others regarding union negotiations (0.5); review and comment on draft declarations for potential litigation (2.6); review union data requests (0.3).
McGreal MM	12/18/12	0.4	Teleconference with M. Luna, R. Aizen and others regarding employee benefit programs.
Melvin MM	12/18/12	0.6	Review various dockets and obtain key employee retention program precedent motions and orders for attorney review.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	12/18/12	9.0	Prepare for meeting with Funds team (1.4); meet with Funds team and follow-up (1.6); correspondence with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel (0.7); correspondence with Union counsel (0.3); call with client regarding update on negotiations (0.7); correspondence with benefits team regarding actuarial issues (0.6); review, edit and circulate negotiation declaration (1.8); correspondence with advisors regarding information requests (1.0); correspondence with team regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 strategy issues (0.9).
Peng L	12/18/12	5.9	Summarize research on claims post 1114 rejection.
Resnick BM	12/18/12	2.7	Call with N. Bubnovich regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan (0.2); review N. Bubnovich presentations regarding same (0.3); prepare for meeting with J. Goodchild and others (0.2); attend meeting with J. Goodchild and others from plans (1.9); review Ohio workers' compensation letter (0.1).
Samet L	12/18/12	4.3	Edit supporting declaration relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (1.8); research regarding same (0.5); edit supporting declaration from company executive relating to bankruptcy, labor issues and proposals (1.1); conference call with B. Hatfield, E. Moskowitz and others regarding negotiation session (0.5); review research regarding claim calculation (0.4).
Silberger DM	12/18/12	0.7	Meet with K. Coco regarding Ohio Workers' Compensation letter (0.1); revise same (0.6).
Sokoloff EA	12/18/12	0.6	Update labor communication and information logs.
Aizen RM	12/19/12	3.2	Comment on Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan declaration (1.7); comment on board resolutions (1.2); comment on employee communications (0.3).
Cho EK	12/19/12	3.4	Prepare board resolutions and plan amendments (1.0); teleconference with R. Aizen regarding resolutions (0.4); prepare employee letters (2.0).
Falk AE	12/19/12	1.0	Research cases for Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan motion (0.4); confer with A. Libby regarding same (0.1); draft parentheticals regarding same (0.4); confer with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).
FitzGerald ET	12/19/12	1.2	Analyze plan termination issues.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Gehring AS	12/19/12	2.6	Review news pertinent to Patriot (0.2); email to industry expert regarding same (0.1); review documents responsive to PwC's information requests for confidentiality (0.2); post documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.2); review L. Peng's research on §1114 issues (0.3); call and emails with J. Mazzotti regarding status of PwC document requests (0.3); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.4); emails with team regarding provision of Unsecured Creditors' Committee documents to the United Mine Workers of America (0.3); review Unsecured Creditors' Committee documents for confidentiality and relevancy concerns (0.6).
Glazer E	12/19/12	4.2	Review documents in Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room (0.6); meet with A. Gehring regarding same (0.2); work on potential expert declaration related to business plan (3.2); meet with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2).
Huebner MS	12/19/12	1.6	Conversation with United Mine Workers of America counsel regarding confidentiality and related issues (1.0); emails with client regarding same (0.2); review of materials to prepare for call with United Mine Workers of America (0.4).
Krause SC	12/19/12	2.5	Emails regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan with A. Libby and R. Aizen (0.1); review comments to Key Employee Incentive Plan declaration (0.4); review relevant case law regarding same (0.2); confer with A. Libby regarding same (0.3); review and revise Key Employee Incentive Plan motion and order (0.6); review relevant precedent regarding same (0.9).
Law EC	12/19/12	0.1	Research sale incentive program precedent.
Libby A	12/19/12	7.0	Research §503(c)(3) standards in all jurisdictions (1.4); draft and revise compensation motion (4.2); discussion regarding same with S. Krause (0.3); coordinate citecheck of same (0.3); discuss ordinary course language with A. Falk and incorporate into motion (0.2); review R. Aizen comments and incorporate same into compensation motion (0.6).
Martin JD	12/19/12	1.3	Review and comment on draft §§ 1113 and 1114 declarations.
McGreal MM	12/19/12	0.2	Review and comment on chart relating to employee benefits.



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	12/19/12	6.2	Call with F. Perillo regarding labor issues (0.6); meet with M. Huebner (0.4); call with clients regarding Funds issues (0.7); review Blackstone declaration (0.9); call with L. Palans regarding labor issues (0.3); review data responses (0.7); correspondence with team regarding labor strategy (1.7); update emails to client (0.6); call with J. Bean regarding status (0.3).
Peng L	12/19/12	2.7	Complete edits to research on §1114 claims.
Resnick BM	12/19/12	0.4	Emails with client and Davis Polk team regarding benefits cuts.
Samet L	12/19/12	4.2	Review and edit research regarding employee and retiree issues (0.6); meet with L. Peng regarding same (0.3); revise supporting declaration relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (0.4); emails with J. Bean and others regarding draft court papers (0.3); draft memorandum of law regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 (1.6); review precedent for same (1.0).
Sokoloff EA	12/19/12	0.5	Update labor communication and information logs.
Agostinho JN	12/20/12	1.7	Conference with M. Luna, J. Orf, B. Resnick and R. Aizen regarding benefits plans (0.9); revise chart regarding benefit plans (0.4); review comments from J. Bean regarding same (0.4).
Aizen RM	12/20/12	2.0	Discussion with E. Cho regarding employee letters (0.3); call with Patriot regarding benefit claims (0.7); comment on board memo (0.9); discussion with S. Krause regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan and Critical Employee Retention Plan (0.1).
Cho EK	12/20/12	7.3	Review case law regarding multi-employee plan (1.5); prepare employee letters (1.0); teleconference related to actuary (0.4); teleconference with E. FitzGerald regarding same (0.6); prepare amendments to plans (1.8); teleconference with R. Aizen regarding amendments and letters (0.5); prepare memo for Board (1.5).
FitzGerald ET	12/20/12	1.0	Analysis of multi employer plan actuarial issues (0.6); resolve issues relating to suspension of 401(k) plan (0.4).
Gehring AS	12/20/12	1.1	Meet with E. Glazer regarding provision of documents to the United Mine Workers of America (0.2); email to E. Glazer regarding same (0.4); email to L. Samet regarding documents for healthcare expert (0.4); review news pertinent to Patriot (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Glazer E	12/20/12	2.4	Calls with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding draft expert declaration related to business plan (0.5); revise draft expert declaration related to business plan (1.9).
Krause SC	12/20/12	4.9	Review and revise Key Employee Incentive Plan motion and order (2.5); review benefits information sheet (0.3); emails regarding same (0.2); review analyses of employee compensation (0.6); conference with A. Libby regarding same (0.3); conference with R. Aizen regarding same (0.2); call with Blackstone regarding same (0.4); revise Key Employee Incentive Plan motion based on conversation (0.4).
Libby A	12/20/12	3.6	Review and revise compensation motion (1.2); discuss same with S. Krause (0.3); incorporate S. Krause comments into same (0.3); incorporate citecheck edits into same (0.5); draft and send email to B. Resnick regarding same (0.4); review individual compensation spreadsheet prepared by Blackstone (0.3); discuss same with S. Krause (0.2); coordinate call with Blackstone regarding same (0.1); call with A. Schlesinger and S. Krause regarding same (0.3).
Martin JD	12/20/12	3.9	Communications with L. Samet and E. Moskowitz regarding expert retention issues (0.4); call with L. Samet, D. Lucha, M. Luna and T. Terry regarding expert declaration (1.1); follow-up review of documents regarding same (0.4); review and comment on draft 1113 and 1114 declarations (1.5); calls with E. Moskowitz, E. Glazer regarding same (0.5).
McGreal MM	12/20/12	0.1	Email E. FitzGerald, B. Resnick and R. Aizen regarding supplemental 401(k) program.
Moskowitz E	12/20/12	4.8	Call with J. Goodchild and follow-up (0.9); meet with M. Huebner (1.0); call with J. Bean (0.4); review draft declaration (0.8); correspondence regarding court scheduling issues (0.3); correspondence with team regarding additional §1113 strategy issues (1.4).
Peng L	12/20/12	0.7	Follow up research on §1114 claims.
Resnick BM	12/20/12	2.0	Call with clients and AlixPartners regarding benefits cuts (0.8); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); emails with Davis Polk team regarding supplemental 401(k) (0.3); discussions with M. Huebner, S. Krause and others regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan (0.3); review Blackstone materials regarding same (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Samet L	12/20/12	8.7	Telephone calls and emails with potential expert (0.8); conference call with J. Martin, M. Luna, D. Lucha and potential expert regarding labor proposals and analysis (1.1); revise expert retention letter and emails regarding same (0.4); email updates to E. Moskowitz and J. Bean regarding potential expert (0.6); draft memorandum of law regarding employee and retiree issues (3.7); review precedent for same (1.3); emails and telephone calls with M. Luna and A. Gehring regarding company data (0.8).
Sokoloff EA	12/20/12	0.3	Update labor communications and information logs.
Agostinho JN	12/21/12	1.6	Conference regarding benefits plan status with B. Resnick, R. Aizen and M. McGreal (0.7); revise benefits summary table (0.9).
Aizen RM	12/21/12	1.7	Discussions with B. Resnick, M. McGreal and J. Agostinho regarding benefit changes (1.1); comment on employee letters (0.6).
Cho EK	12/21/12	1.0	Prepare employee letter (0.6); conference with R. Aizen and J. Agostinho regarding same (0.1); correspondence with R. Aizen regarding same (0.3).
FitzGerald ET	12/21/12	2.3	Review of plan termination and suspension resolutions (0.7); discussions with R. Aizen of plan freeze issues (0.6); review of plan termination communication (0.3); discussion with E. Cho regarding plan actuary retention (0.7)
Gehring AS	12/21/12	1.5	Review documents responsive to PwC's data requests for confidentiality (0.3); post documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.4); emails with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding same (0.4); email to industry expert regarding declaration (0.1); emails with L. Samet regarding documents for healthcare expert (0.1); meet with E. Glazer regarding provision of documents to the United Mine Workers of America (0.2).
Huebner MS	12/21/12	0.7	Review of latest correspondence from union and internal emails regarding reply (0.5); review of emails regarding information sharing with pension and benefit funds (0.2).
Libby A	12/21/12	0.1	Email M. McGreal language from wages order regarding supplemental 401(k).
Martin JD	12/21/12	1.3	Emails with E. Moskowitz, L. Samet and others regarding draft §§ 1113 and 1114 declarations (0.3); conference with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding case strategy and next steps (0.5); communications with L. Samet and others regarding expert declarations (0.5).

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
McGreal MM	12/21/12	0.9	Conference with B. Resnick, R. Aizen and J. Neidhart regarding modification of employee benefits (0.4); review revised chart regarding benefits (0.1); review and comment on revised employee letters (0.4).
Moskowitz E	12/21/12	3.9	Status meeting with L. Samet and J. Martin and follow-up (1.0); review Union information requests and respond to same (1.2); additional correspondence with team regarding 1113 planning (1.1); call with J. Bean regarding status and related issues (0.6).
Resnick BM	12/21/12	0.9	Meet with benefits team and M. McGreal regarding benefit cuts (0.5); emails with team regarding same (0.4).
Silberger DM	12/21/12	8.1	Research on §1114 issues and precedents for related motion (3.7); draft §363 motion relating to retiree benefits (4.4).
Sokoloff EA	12/21/12	0.7	Update labor communications and information logs (0.4); meet with L. Samet to discuss §1113 briefing (0.3).
Aizen RM	12/22/12	0.6	Email to J. Orf regarding employee letters (0.1); comment on supplemental 401(k) letter (0.3); comment on benefits chart (0.2).
Cho EK	12/22/12	0.3	Correspondence with R. Aizen regarding comments to employee letter.
McGreal MM	12/22/12	0.9	Review and comment on letter regarding supplemental 401(k) program (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and R. Aizen regarding same (0.3); review and revise chart on benefits programs (0.4).
Resnick BM	12/22/12	1.1	Review chart of treatment of benefits (0.3); review letters to employees regarding benefit cuts (0.3); emails with Davis Polk benefits team and M. McGreal regarding the same (0.5).
Samet L	12/22/12	3.1	Draft and edit memorandum of law regarding employee and retiree issues.
Silberger DM	12/22/12	4.8	Research on §1114 issues.
Sokoloff EA	12/22/12	1.8	Research and summarize legal issues surrounding strike threats.
Aizen RM	12/23/12	0.6	Comment on benefit changes chart.
Cho EK	12/23/12	0.2	Correspondence with R. Aizen regarding benefit program chart.
McGreal MM	12/23/12	0.4	Review and revise chart on employee benefit programs (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and R. Aizen regarding same (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/23/12	0.4	Review chart of benefit cuts (0.2); emails with R. Aizen and M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokoloff EA	12/23/12	0.1	Update labor communications and information logs.
Glazer E	12/24/12	5.2	Draft declaration on §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals and related cost savings.
Sokoloff EA	12/24/12	1.0	Research and summarize legal issues surrounding contingent claims.
Samet L	12/25/12	1.2	Review case law on labor issues (0.8); revise draft memorandum of law (0.4).
Gehring AS	12/26/12	2.9	Call with L. Samet regarding United Mine Workers of America document request (0.3); emails with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding same (0.6); draft sections of the §§ 1113 and 1114 brief (2.0).
Glazer E	12/26/12	0.9	Draft declaration on §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals and related cost savings.
Krause SC	12/26/12	0.5	Emails with R. Aizen regarding employee plans (0.2); emails with R. Aizen, B. Resnick and A. Libby regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan motion (0.3).
Moskowitz E	12/26/12	6.3	Review Union requests and data response to Union (3.4); correspondence with clients regarding information needed for Union responses (1.6); additional correspondence with clients and team regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (0.6); correspondence with team regarding Peabody issues (0.7).
Peng L	12/26/12	0.5	Transcribe Cecil Roberts' robocall dated 12/17/12 (0.4); review correspondence related to the §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/26/12	1.4	Review and revise Key Employee Incentive Plan and Key Employee Retention Plan motion.
Samet L	12/26/12	1.7	Emails and telephone calls with E. Moskowitz, A. Gehring and others regarding responding to United Mine Workers of America document requests (0.8); review correspondence regarding employee and retiree issues (0.4); additional emails and telephone calls with E. Moskowitz and A. Gehring regarding responding to United Mine Workers of America document requests (0.3); review and comment on revised document review protocol (0.2).
Silberger DM	12/26/12	9.4	Research on §1114 issues with respect to amendable benefits plans.
Sokoloff EA	12/26/12	0.7	Summarize §§ 1113 and 1114 liquidation precedent.
Aizen RM	12/27/12	1.0	Discussions with multi-employer plan actuary, E. FitzGerald and E. Cho regarding interest rates.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Cho EK	12/27/12	2.0	Conference with R. Aizen and T. Windsor regarding withdrawal liability (0.4); review multi-employer plan information (1.1); conference with R. Aizen regarding multi-employer plan (0.4); correspondence regarding actuary selection (0.1).
Gehring AS	12/27/12	0.7	Emails with L. Samet regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 brief (0.1); emails from E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.3); emails with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding documents responsive to the United Mine Workers of America document request (0.3).
Glazer E	12/27/12	0.6	Draft section of §§ 1113 and 1114 brief related to business plan.
Krause SC	12/27/12	0.8	Emails with B. Resnick and A. Libby regarding Key Employee Incentive Plan motion (0.3); review comments to Key Employee Incentive Plan motion (0.5).
Libby A	12/27/12	0.8	Review B. Resnick comments to incentive plan motion (0.3); emails with S. Krause regarding same (0.4); emails with E. Glazer, M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee §§ 1113 and 1114 presentation materials (0.1).
Moskowitz E	12/27/12	7.2	Call with F. Perillo and follow-up (0.4); review draft Union response and correspondence with clients and advisors regarding same (2.6); correspondence with clients regarding information requests (0.7); review and edit draft labor brief (2.9); correspondence with team regarding draft riders and next steps (0.6).
Peng L	12/27/12	0.3	Review emails relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 issues.
Resnick BM	12/27/12	0.2	Review multi-employer pension plan withdrawal letter.
Samet L	12/27/12	0.6	Emails with E. Moskowitz, A. Gehring and E. Sokoloff regarding draft memorandum of law (0.4); review riders to draft memorandum of law (0.2).
Silberger DM	12/27/12	14.0	Research on issues related to §363 motion relating to retiree benefits (9.0); draft and revise motion pursuant to §363 relating to retiree benefits (5.0).
Sokoloff EA	12/27/12	3.7	Revise §1113 brief and legal research regarding same (3.5); update labor communications and information logs (0.2).
Aizen RM	12/28/12	4.8	Discussions with E. Cho regarding multi-employer plan (0.5); prepare §363 motion (4.3).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Cho EK	12/28/12	4.0	Review §363 Motion (0.5); correspondence with R. Aizen regarding same (0.2); correspondence with J. Bean regarding retaining actuary (0.4); prepare retainer letter (1.5); calls to E. Graham and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5); correspondence with J. Agostinho regarding same (0.3); calls with R. Aizen regarding actuarial information (0.5); call with T. Windsor regarding retention (0.1).
Gehring AS	12/28/12	0.8	Review documents responsive to United Mine Workers of America data requests for confidentiality (0.1); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2); upload documents to the United Mine Workers of America data room (0.2); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding response letter to the United Mine Workers of America (0.3).
Glazer E	12/28/12	2.9	Draft section of §§ 1113 and 1114 brief related to business plan (2.7); confer with E. Cho regarding retention of potential expert in connection with withdrawal liability (0.2).
Krause SC	12/28/12	0.6	Review incentive plan motion (0.2); confer regarding same with A. Libby (0.2); email with N. Bubnovich and R. Aizen regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	12/28/12	0.8	Incorporate B. Resnick comments into incentive plan motion (0.6); discussed revised incentive plan motion with S. Krause (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/28/12	5.8	Conference with D. Silberger regarding motion to terminate retiree benefits (0.3); correspondence with E. Moskowitz and R. Aizen regarding same (0.3); review and revise §363 motion to terminate retiree benefits (5.2).
Moskowitz E	12/28/12	4.3	Correspondence with team regarding labor planning issues (0.7); draft response to Union communication and correspondence regarding same (2.0); call with L. Samet regarding brief (0.9); review and respond to information requests (0.7).
Peng L	12/28/12	0.1	Review litigation team emails in connection with §§ 1113 and 1114 issues.
Resnick BM	12/28/12	0.1	Emails with R. Aizen regarding multi-employer pension plan issues.
Samet L	12/28/12	1.4	Review edits to draft labor court papers (0.5); telephone call with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.9).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Silberger DM	12/28/12	9.0	Draft and revise motion pursuant to §363 relating to retiree benefits (3.6); additional research on §§ 363 and 1114 (3.3); draft motion to terminate executive 401(k) plans (2.1).
Samet L	12/29/12	2.0	Edit supporting declaration relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (0.9); edit supporting declaration from company executive relating to bankruptcy, labor issues and proposals (0.8); review correspondence regarding labor issues (0.3).
McGreal MM	12/30/12	0.2	Email D. Silberger regarding §363 motion to terminate benefits (0.1); email E. Moskowitz and R. Aizen regarding retiree benefits (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/31/12	0.1	Email D. Silberger regarding §363 motion to terminate retiree benefits.
Samet L	12/31/12	2.9	Edit supporting declaration from company executive relating to bankruptcy, labor issues and proposals (0.6); edit memorandum of law (2.3).
<b>Total EMPLOYEE LABOR ISSUES</b>		<b>848.2</b>	
<b>EXECUTORY CONTRACTS</b>			
Falk AE	12/02/12	1.7	Research case law on executory contracts and indemnification (0.7); draft email to M. McGreal outlining further research (1.0).
McGreal MM	12/02/12	0.2	Correspondence with A. Falk regarding research regarding executory contracts.
Coco KJ	12/03/12	2.8	Meet with B. Resnick and others regarding rejection of Drummond agreement, follow-ups regarding same (0.3); revise Drummond rejection order (0.4); emails with clients, Drummond's counsel and Davis Polk regarding revised order and next steps (0.5); call with clients regarding same (0.2); review and revise notice of no objections and proposed order for Republic Bank equipment rejection (0.3); review and revise notice of no objections and propose order for sixth omnibus rejection motion (0.4); emails with clients regarding same (0.2); draft emails to Chambers regarding same (0.3); email with S. Schuzenhofer regarding equipment leased from Prime Alliance and People's Capital (0.2).
Falk AE	12/03/12	2.5	Research case law regarding contract indemnities (2.3); conference call with Drummond counsel, D. Klein and K. Coco regarding objection to rejection notice (0.2).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	12/03/12	1.0	Call with counsel to Drummond regarding objection to rejection and follow-up regarding same (0.3); emails and call with A. Starr regarding potential rejection and follow-up with K. Coco regarding same (0.6); review and comment on rejection notice (0.1).
Libby A	12/03/12	2.1	Draft and revise notice of rejection of lease agreements (1.4); coordinate service of same (0.3); email drafts of same to Unsecured Creditors' Committee and DIP lenders (0.2); email A. VanWagner regarding conflicts check process in connection with same (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/03/12	2.5	Correspondence with J. Eagan regarding coal leases (0.2); teleconference with counsel to coal lessors (0.2); correspondece with A. Falk regarding research on executory contracts (0.1); review research (0.1); legal research regarding same (1.9).
Resnick BM	12/03/12	0.4	Emails regarding Drummond rejection (0.2); review equipment rejection notice (0.1); call with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).
Starr AT	12/03/12	2.8	Conference calls and emails regarding Arch with R. Mead, A. Benicasa, A. McCallister, G. Plotko and C. Ebetino (1.5); draft Arch analysis for Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.6); calls regarding Arch hearing with J. Croft (0.1); emails to E. Waller regarding Arch (0.1); calls and emails with P. Castro regarding counterparty negotiation (0.5).
VanWagner AB	12/03/12	0.7	Update fourth omnibus rejection order and send to K. Coco (0.2); file notice of rejection for counterparty and send for service (0.5).
Coco KJ	12/04/12	4.0	Call with A. Starr regarding Rudd contracts and motion filed, follow ups regarding same (0.3); emails with clients regarding Rudd rejection analysis and planning (0.5); two calls with J. Tucker regarding various contract rejection issues (0.4); call with J. Creighton regarding assumption and cure, follow-up email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); call with H. Baker and A. Turner regarding environmental settlement contract, follow-up emails regarding same (0.7); attend weekly contracts call with clients and AlixPartners, prepare for same (0.6); analysis of Drummond contract issues (0.4); emails with counterparty regarding Drummond withdrawal and revised court order (0.5).

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Falk AE	12/04/12	0.8	Prepare and file notice of no objection for Drummond rejection notice.
Klein DS	12/04/12	1.0	Emails with K. Coco regarding rejection proposed order (0.1); review and comment on same (0.3); emails with Drummond counsel regarding objection withdrawal (0.2); review declaration of no objections regarding same (0.1); review and comment on presentment package related to same (0.3).
Libby A	12/04/12	1.0	Update master lease spreadsheet (0.4); revise sixth omnibus rejection order (0.3), draft email to chambers (0.2), emails with team regarding rejections (0.1).
Starr AT	12/04/12	7.0	Meet with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and M. Russano regarding Peabody issues (0.6); calls and emails with J. Jones regarding Board issues; (0.3); emails regarding board resolution with J. Jones and M. Russano (0.5); draft emails regarding Arch bonds (0.7); calls and emails regarding the same with C. Ebetino and R. Mead (1.2); meet with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel and advisers regarding Arch (1.3); follow-up calls with C. Ebetino, R. Mead and J. Martin regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee requests (1.1); prepare for Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (1.3).
Coco KJ	12/05/12	1.1	Call with counsel for People's Capital and follow-up communications with clients (0.5); second call with People's Capital and follow-up emails to clients (0.6).
Huebner MS	12/05/12	1.0	Conversation with A. Rogoff and A. Starr regarding Arch issues (0.4); review of documents regarding same (0.6).
Libby A	12/05/12	0.3	Revise Rudd rejection notice and email K. Coco regarding same.
Starr AT	12/05/12	5.1	Finalize materials for Unsecured Creditors' Committee on litigation indemnities (0.4); calls and emails with C. Ebetino and R. Mead regarding Arch (1.4); prepare for Unsecured Creditors' Committee call regarding Arch (2.7); meet with M. Huebner regarding Arch (0.4); email to P. Castro regarding counterparty negotiations (0.2).
Coco KJ	12/06/12	1.2	Emails with People's Capital counsel and follow-ups with clients regarding same (1.0); call with S. Schuzenhofer regarding contract rejection issues (0.2).
Falk AE	12/06/12	0.2	Review Drummond order (0.1); correspond with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	12/06/12	0.3	Review and markup Arch deck and emails regarding same.
Starr AT	12/06/12	3.3	Revise Arch presentation (2.6); calls and emails regarding same with R. Mead, C. Ebetino and M. Huebner (0.4); emails and calls with G. Plotko regarding Arch issues (0.3).
Coco KJ	12/07/12	2.2	Emails with People's Capital counsel regarding go-forward rents, rejection date and other contract rejection issues (1.3); emails with clients regarding same (0.3); call with S. Schuzenhofer regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk team and emails regarding environmental counterparty settlement agreement (0.5).
Falk AE	12/07/12	0.5	Prepare notice of no objection for Chartis insurance stipulation.
Huebner MS	12/07/12	0.5	Call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding Arch.
Klein DS	12/07/12	0.9	Coordinate on Chartis stipulation including declaration of no objections (0.4); emails with G. Plotko regarding same (0.1); call with A. Starr regarding customer contract and follow-up regarding same (0.3); emails with K. Coco regarding real estate assumption process (0.1).
Libby A	12/07/12	0.3	Revise declaration of no objections to Chartis stipulation (0.2); emails with D. Klein and others regarding same (0.1).
Starr AT	12/07/12	4.9	Calls and emails regarding Arch with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel (0.8); calls and emails regarding preparation for Arch presentation to Unsecured Creditors' Committee to C. Ebetino, R. Mead, J. Martin, R. Estacio and M. Huebner (0.8); revise Arch presentation for Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.3); call with M. Buschmann regarding Arch (0.4); conference call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding Arch (0.5); calls and emails to Arch counsel regarding agreement (0.8); emails regarding counterparty coal supply negotiations with D. Klein, C. Damba and J. Tucker (0.3).
Coco KJ	12/09/12	0.6	Review and comment on letter from B. Bennett to CSX (0.4); email to clients regarding same (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/10/12	1.9	Review objection of Icon regarding contract rejection and email clients regarding same (0.9); emails with S. Schuzenhofer regarding People's Capital equipment (0.2); emails with counsel to People's Capital regarding equipment rejections (0.3); review agenda for weekly contracts call and prepare for same (0.5).
Estacio R	12/10/12	0.7	Correspond with J. Martin regarding agreements with Arch (0.1); correspond with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding the same (0.1); conference with A. Starr and Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding the same (0.2); draft correspondence for J. Martin regarding proposed changes to agreements with Arch (0.3).
Falk AE	12/10/12	1.9	Finalize proposed order authorizing Chartis insurance stipulation and draft accompanying email to Chambers.
Klein DS	12/10/12	1.6	Coordinate with K. Coco regarding ICON rejection objection (0.4); email clients regarding same (0.2); review and comment on Chartis presentment package (0.3); comment on Chartis agreement (0.3); emails with K. Coco regarding near term rejections (0.2); coordinate with K. Coco regarding consensual resolution of rejection (0.2).
Libby A	12/10/12	0.5	Review Icon objection to rejection notice and summarize same for client email.
McGreal MM	12/10/12	0.1	Review email to clients regarding objection to Icon rejection.
Starr AT	12/10/12	2.4	Calls and emails regarding Arch with J. Martin, B. Resnick, R. Estacio, C. Ebetino, R. Mead and J. Croft (1.8); review revised Arch orders (0.3); emails regarding objection deadlines with M. McGreal and B. Resnick (0.3).
Coco KJ	12/11/12	1.1	Emails with clients and AlixPartners regarding employment agreement rejections (0.4); email to B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); weekly contracts call (0.5).
Estacio R	12/11/12	2.0	Conferences with A. Starr regarding coal supply agreement amendment (0.3); review and edit the same (1.6); draft correspondence to A. Starr regarding the same (0.1).
Huebner MS	12/11/12	0.1	Review of emails regarding final Unsecured Creditors' Committee Arch comments.

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Klein DS	12/11/12	0.8	Call with J. Tucker and coordinate with A. Starr regarding new customer contract bankruptcy provisions (0.5); emails with M. Williams et al regarding real estate assumptions (0.3).
Starr AT	12/11/12	1.9	Review coal supply counterparty contract proposal (0.5); conference call with L. Damba, J. Tucker, R. Estacio and R. Mead regarding the same (0.5); meet with R. Estacio regarding revisions to coal supply contract (0.4); call with J. Tucker regarding the same (0.3); emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee comments on Arch order with J. Martin and B. Resnick (0.2).
Coco KJ	12/12/12	3.6	Review contracts for near-term rejection and update emails with AlixPartners regarding same (0.6); review and comment on draft documents from Republic (1.3); call with C. Ebetino and others regarding rejections of Icon agreement, transportation agreements and other issues and analysis regarding same (1.1); review background emails regarding environmental counterparty settlement (0.6).
Estacio R	12/12/12	0.5	Edit agreements and correspond with J. Martin regarding the same (0.3); read correspondence from A. Starr regarding the same (0.1); read correspondence from A. Starr regarding coal supply agreement amendment (0.1).
Klein DS	12/12/12	0.7	Email K. Coco regarding Chartis agreements (0.2); call with clients regarding ICON rejection and other rejection issues (0.5).
Starr AT	12/12/12	2.3	Calls and emails regarding Arch with J. Martin, G. Plotko, J. Croft, R. Estacio and A. Rogoff (1.6); revise counterparty coal sales agreement (0.5); emails to P. Castro and R. Estacio regarding the same (0.2).
Coco KJ	12/13/12	4.9	Calls and emails with clients and advisors regarding transportation contracts (1.8); review background on environmental counterparty settlements and call with environmental team regarding same (1.3); review Dodge Hill transport contract and email with clients regarding same (0.7); emails with Republic and review agreements with same (0.8); email to counsel for People's Capital regarding executory contracts and email to clients regarding same (0.3).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	12/13/12	3.1	Revise proposed order and agreements regarding coal supply agreements with Arch (1.7); correspond with J. Martin regarding the same (0.1); conference with J. Martin regarding the same (0.3); conferences with counsel to Arch regarding the same (0.3); correspond with J. Martin regarding issues raised by Arch counsel and Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding approval of agreements with Arch (0.1); draft analysis regarding the same for J. Martin and A. Starr (0.2); conference with A. Starr regarding coal supply agreements with AEP (0.1); draft correspondence to counsel for AEP regarding the same (0.2); draft correspondence to A. Starr regarding AEP response to draft agreements (0.1).
Falk AE	12/13/12	0.7	Meet with A. Libby regarding eighth omnibus rejection notice (0.2); review contracts for rejection notice and email A. VanWagner regarding conflicts (0.5).
Klein DS	12/13/12	0.6	Meet with K. Coco regarding contract rejection issues (0.2); emails with K. Coco regarding same (0.2); email J. Tucker regarding new contract bankruptcy language (0.2).
Libby A	12/13/12	0.3	Discuss rejection notice with A. Falk (0.2); email precedents of same to A. Falk (0.1).
Starr AT	12/13/12	1.4	Calls and emails with R. Estacio, J. Martin, A. Rogoff and G. Plotko regarding Arch issues (0.8); calls and emails regarding counterparty coal sales agreement with R. Estacio, J. Tucker, C. Damba and P. Castro (0.6).
Coco KJ	12/14/12	4.3	Draft new rejection notice for executory contracts (0.7); emails with Davis Polk team and conflicts counsel regarding conflicts (0.4); emails with S. Robinson regarding same (0.3); call with conflicts counsel regarding same and follow ups (0.5); review relevant agreements (0.4); emails and call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); call to Icon attorney (0.1); emails to counsel for People's capital (0.2); emails to Republic Bank counsel (0.2); review Rudd notice of no objections and proposed order (0.5); call with Davis Polk environmental team regarding environmental counterparty agreements and follow up tasks regarding same (0.5); emails with J. Tucker and J. Creighton regarding intercompany contracts (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Falk AE	12/14/12	0.7	Communicate with A. VanWagner and K. Coco regarding conflicts for 8th Omnibus Rejection Notice (0.2); file Rudd notice of no objection (0.2); send email to A. VanWagner regarding conflicts for rejection of additional employment contracts (0.1); draft and send email to GCG regarding service of process for notices of no objections (0.2).
Klein DS	12/14/12	0.4	Call with A. Starr regarding new customer contract bankruptcy language (0.1); review and comment on Rudd rejection presentment package (0.3).
Libby A	12/14/12	1.7	Draft proposed order for People's Capital equipment rejections (0.5); draft declaration of no objections for People's Capital equipment rejections (0.5); email proposed order and declaration of no objections to K. Coco (0.1); discuss eighth omnibus rejection notice assignment with A. Falk (0.2); follow-up conversations regarding same (0.1); revise Rudd rejection notice proposed order (0.3).
Resnick BM	12/14/12	0.2	Correspondence with J. Tucker regarding rejection of rights agreement.
Starr AT	12/14/12	4.8	Revise Arch order (1.4); revise Arch guarantee (0.4); conference calls and emails with A. Rogoff, G. Plotko, R. Estacio, J. Martin, J. Croft and C. Ebetino regarding Arch order and guarantee (2.3); calls and emails to M. McGreal regarding Arch order filing (0.3); emails to P. Castro regarding negotiation of coal sales agreement (0.2); emails regarding same to D. Klein, C. Damba, J. Tucker and R. Mead (0.2).
Starr AT	12/15/12	0.6	Emails regarding finalization of Arch order with J. Martin, J. Croft, G. Plotko and A. Rogoff.
Coco KJ	12/16/12	0.7	Review and comment on notice of no objections regarding fourth and sixth omnibus rejection notices (0.3); review and comment on proposed order regarding same (0.3); send proposed order to counterparties' counsel (0.1).
Falk AE	12/16/12	2.1	Draft Eighth Omnibus Rejection Notice (1.7); draft email with outstanding issues and send to K. Coco and A. Libby (0.3); review contracts and email A. Libby and K. Coco regarding same (0.1).
Libby A	12/16/12	0.7	Review and revise eighth omnibus rejection order (0.6); emails regarding same with K. Coco and A. Falk (0.1).
Baker HS	12/17/12	1.3	Review of contract rejection issues.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/17/12	3.2	Emails and calls with clients and AlixPartners regarding new rejection notice and associated analysis (1.9); call with attorney for ICON regarding executory contract rejection (0.1); emails with clients regarding assumption and rejection of real property contracts ahead of statutory deadline (0.8); review of Illinois environmental settlement agreement and email to client regarding same (0.4).
Falk AE	12/17/12	1.5	Review additional contracts for rejection (0.2); meet with K. Coco regarding amending rejection notice to incorporate same (0.1); revise Eighth Rejection Notice to incorporate new contracts, amendments and ancillary agreements (1.0); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.2).
Klein DS	12/17/12	1.8	Discussions with K. Coco regarding upcoming contract rejections and postpetition executory contract negotiations (0.2); review and comment on rejection presentment package for chambers (0.3); review and comment on revised proposed customer contract order and coordinate with K. Coco regarding same (0.4); email clients regarding same (0.1); emails and discussion with K. Coco regarding rejection notice comments and media inquiries regarding same (0.2); emails with J. Martin and B. Zhu regarding executory contract issues in prepetition settlement agreement (0.2); email K. Coco regarding recoupment issue for rejected agreement (0.1); emails with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding amended ordinary course contracts motion (0.3).
Libby A	12/17/12	2.8	Review and revise People's Capital rejection declaration of no objection (0.4); review and revise People's Capital rejection proposed order (0.4); draft email to chambers regarding entry of same (0.2); discuss edits to People's Capital rejection proposed order with D. Klein and implement same (0.2); save proposed order regarding People's Capital equipment rejections to system (0.1); draft notice of filing of proposed order for Arch rejection motion (0.7); prepare binder of Arch rejection motions (0.6); email draft eighth omnibus rejection notice to DIP Lenders and Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2).
Mehes A	12/17/12	0.7	Review Patriot contract for possible rejection.
Resnick BM	12/17/12	0.2	Review proposed revisions to coal sale contracts order.



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	12/17/12	4.3	Calls and emails regarding finalization of Arch order and guarantee with R. Mead, C. Ebetino, J. Croft, J. Martin, G. Plotko and M. McGreal (2.9); revise guarantee (0.4); calls to coal sales counterparty regarding default provisions (0.2); prepare for Arch hearing (0.8).
Coco KJ	12/18/12	3.8	Prepare and file new rejection motion (1.3); emails with C. Ebetino regarding real property contracts and upcoming rejections (0.3); attend weekly contracts update call (0.2); call with J. Eagan and real property team at Patriot regarding real property assumptions and rejections ahead of statutory deadline (0.5); emails with counsel to Rudd equipment regarding rejection (0.3); review draft withdrawal filing regarding same (0.1); email to People's Capital regarding rejection (0.1); email to clients regarding same (0.1); call with Weil Gotshal regarding real property deadlines (0.2); follow up analysis regarding same (0.4); call and emails with conflicts counsel regarding rejections being filed (0.3).
Falk AE	12/18/12	1.5	Finalize and file Eighth Omnibus rejection notice (0.5); update master contract and lease rejection spreadsheet accordingly (0.2); route filing internally and send to GCG for service on relevant parties (0.2); route Curtis Mallet rejection notice and update master rejection spreadsheet accordingly (0.2); send rejection tracker to word processing with detailed instructions on updating for Rudd, Icon and Drummond lease or contract rejections (0.2); follow-up with word processing via email and phone (0.2).
Klein DS	12/18/12	2.2	Call with R. McWilliams regarding real estate assumption and rejection process and DIP compliance (0.1); call with E. Coleman regarding same (0.1); discuss same and next steps with B. Resnick (0.4); follow-up call and emails with R. McWilliams regarding same (0.3); finalize and coordinate filing of rejection notice (0.2); review and comment on changes to amended ordinary course contract order (0.3); emails with K. Coco regarding same (0.2); review DIP order provisions for real property assumptions and rejections and discuss same with K. Coco (0.5); email J. Martin regarding prepetition settlement agreement integration issue (0.1).
Libby A	12/18/12	0.3	Emails regarding rejection master spreadsheet and review same.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	12/18/12	0.1	Correspondence with K. Coco regarding Rudd Equipment notice of withdrawal of motion to compel assumption.
Mehes A	12/18/12	3.3	Research consequences of contract rejection.
Resnick BM	12/18/12	0.2	Discuss lease rejection issues with D. Klein and others.
Starr AT	12/18/12	5.0	Prepare for Arch hearing (0.8); attend and present Arch settlement at hearing (1.8); negotiate with counterparty counsel regarding coal sales agreement (0.9); revise coal sales agreement (0.6); calls regarding coal sales agreement with P. Castro, T. Adkins, D. Klein and C. Damba (0.8); emails to Court regarding finalization of Arch order (0.1).
Coco KJ	12/19/12	4.2	Review draft real estate lease assumption and rejection schedule and communications with clients and professionals regarding same (0.5); emails with J. Eagan regarding Kay Company agreements (0.6); review contracts related to Illinois environmental settlement (0.3); call from J. Creighton regarding contracts analysis (0.1); call with E. Estrada regarding ICON agreements (0.1); review Republic Bank agreements and emails with Republic and S. Schuzenhofer regarding same (0.4); call with real property client team (1.0); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); call with S. Robinson regarding transportation agreements (0.2); follow-up analysis and emails regarding same (0.8).
Falk AE	12/19/12	0.2	Review updates to contract and lease rejection spreadsheet and revise accordingly.
Klein DS	12/19/12	1.8	Calls with R. McWilliams on real property assumption and rejection process (0.3); call with C. Ebetino and others regarding same (0.9); follow-up conversation with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); call with C. Damba regarding proposed amended ordinary course contracts order and follow-up with K. Coco regarding same (0.4).
Resnick BM	12/19/12	1.3	Call with M. Buschmann regarding lease rejections (0.2); correspondence with D. Klein regarding same (0.2); call with clients and AlixPartners regarding same (0.9).
Starr AT	12/19/12	1.6	Review coal sales amendment and purchase order (0.8); calls and emails with T. Adkins, P. Castro and C. Damba regarding the same (0.8).
VanWagner AB	12/19/12	0.9	Phone call with K. Coco to discuss contract review assignment (0.1); conduct contract review (0.8).
Baker HS	12/20/12	0.4	Correspondence regarding contract rejection.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/20/12	5.0	Call with real property team at company regarding assumption and rejection of real property agreements (1.5); follow-up emails with clients regarding analysis of same (0.8); email to S. Robinson regarding analysis of transportation agreements (0.6); emails with J. Creighton and J. Clarrey regarding analysis and process for assumption and rejection of real property agreements (0.4); call with J. Clarrey regarding same (0.2); meet with D. Silberger regarding drafting 365(d)(4) motion and follow-up tasks regarding same (0.7); send email to A. McCallister regarding environmental settlement agreement (0.3); call with S. Schuzenhofer regarding Republic Bank agreement and follow-up emails to clients and Republic regarding same (0.5).
Huebner MS	12/20/12	0.5	Meet with E. Moskowitz, M. Russano regarding Peabody issues.
Klein DS	12/20/12	3.3	Call with C. Ebetino and others regarding real property assumption and rejection (0.7); discussions with K. Coco regarding same (0.3); coordinate on research with K. Coco regarding rejection damages under equipment leases (0.3); emails with A. Starr and others regarding integration review for leases and call with B. Zhu regarding same (0.3); emails with clients regarding same (0.2); review lease documents related to same (0.4); emails and discussion with K. Coco regarding real property review process (0.3); emails with E. Waller regarding settlement agreement assumption and rejection issues (0.2); coordinate with A. Turner regarding autostay issues related to same (0.3); emails with C. Ebetino and others regarding real property review process (0.3).
Silberger DM	12/20/12	0.3	Meet with K. Coco regarding motions and memoranda related to real estate lease.
Starr AT	12/20/12	1.4	Emails regarding Arch integration analysis with D. Klein, J. Martin, B. Zhu and C. Ebetino (0.8); review Arch assignment and assumption agreements (0.6).
VanWagner AB	12/20/12	0.2	Meet with K. Coco to discuss contract review assignment.
Coco KJ	12/21/12	1.5	Analysis of real estate contracts and emails with clients and AlixPartners regarding same.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	12/21/12	1.1	Review lease renewal materials (0.3); call with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1); call with K. Coco regarding same (0.2); edit lease renewal documents to include bankruptcy protection language (0.4); email revised documents to K. Coco (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/21/12	0.3	Review office lease (0.1); correspondence with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding same (0.2).
Starr AT	12/21/12	1.6	Meet with C. Ebetino and M. Russano regarding contract rejections (0.6); meet with J. Martin, A. Mehes and B. Zhu regarding contract rejections (0.6); calls and emails regarding the same with J. Martin and D. Klein (0.4).
Mehes A	12/25/12	0.4	Research contract rejection.
Falk AE	12/26/12	0.1	Send employment contracts to M. McGreal for Unsecured Creditors' Committee review.
McGreal MM	12/26/12	0.2	Teleconference with A. Wong regarding employment agreements (0.1); correspondence with J. Bean and K. Coco regarding same (0.1).
Mehes A	12/26/12	2.3	Research executory contract rejection (1.7); conference call with A. Starr, J. Martin and B. Zhu (0.6).
Starr AT	12/26/12	1.3	Review emails and cases regarding assignment and assumption of leases (0.6); conference call regarding the same with J. Martin, B. Zhu and A. Mehes (0.5); emails regarding research to D. Klein and K. Coco (0.2).
Klein DS	12/27/12	0.3	Draft email to A. Turner regarding automatic stay and prepetition settlement agreement.
Mehes A	12/27/12	3.1	Research executory contract rejection issues.
Coco KJ	12/28/12	2.5	Analysis of real property assumption and rejection schedule and related issues (1.8); emails with clients regarding same (0.2); emails with Davis Polk team and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); emails with clients regarding office complex agreements (0.2).
Klein DS	12/28/12	0.4	Emails with K. Coco and clients regarding real property assumptions and rejections (0.3); emails with K. Coco regarding omnibus rejection notice response (0.1).
Starr AT	12/28/12	0.9	Review additional research regarding assignment and assumption of leases (0.5); emails regarding the same with J. Martin, A. Mehes, B. Zhu, D. Klein and K. Coco (0.4).
Coco KJ	12/30/12	0.6	Emails with clients regarding real property assumption and rejection analysis.
Klein DS	12/31/12	0.3	Emails from clients and Alix Partners regarding real property assumption and rejection process.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	12/31/12	0.1	Emails with D. Klein and K. Coco regarding executory contract assumptions.
Silberger DM	12/31/12	4.3	Research on §365(d)(4) motions filed in large coal cases, including locating and reviewing sample motions from various dockets on same.
<b>Total EXECUTORY CONTRACTS</b>		<b>176.8</b>	
<b>FINANCING</b>			
Pak GY	12/02/12	0.3	Review of First DIP Credit Agreement regarding Bankruptcy Court issue.
Huebner MS	12/03/12	0.2	Emails to B. Resnick and W. Warner regarding DIP financing issues.
Immermann MC	12/03/12	0.1	Distribute Perfection Certificate annexes to Weil and Willkie.
Pak GY	12/03/12	0.7	Review of First DIP Credit Agreement regarding Bankruptcy Court issue.
Resnick BM	12/03/12	0.2	Emails with G. Pak and M. Huebner regarding DIP covenants.
Pak GY	12/04/12	0.3	Review of First DIP Credit Agreement related to letter of credit issue (0.2); correspondence to K.Coco regarding the same (0.1).
Warner W	12/04/12	0.3	Calls and emails with Davis Polk team regarding Sierra club consent.
Chepiga TL	12/06/12	0.6	Review draft papers from Willkie and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same.
Resnick BM	12/06/12	0.2	Calls and emails with T. Chepiga regarding Sierra Club letter of credit.
Warner W	12/06/12	0.1	Email regarding document request.
Chepiga TL	12/07/12	1.6	Call with R. Mead and email with Davis Polk team regarding Sierra Club letter of credit (0.4); emails and call with Patriot, Alix Partners and Davis Polk team regarding FTI collateral request (0.9); call with H. Baker and A. Turner regarding Sierra Club letter of credit and emails regarding same (0.3).
Pak GY	12/07/12	0.8	Correspondences with Patriot and T. Chepiga regarding information request from FTI (0.2); call with Patriot regarding FTI information request (0.4); correspondence from Patriot regarding release of lease (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/07/12	0.2	Emails with T. Chepiga and E. Vonnegut regarding lien perfection issues.
Vonnegut EJ	12/07/12	0.2	Emails regarding collateral issues.

### Time Detail By Project

<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Warner W	12/07/12	0.1	Calls with Davis Polk team regarding Sierra club consent and related emails.
Chepiga TL	12/08/12	0.3	Review Credit Agreement regarding question on investments and email to Company regarding same.
Resnick BM	12/09/12	0.2	Emails regarding Lender update.
Chepiga TL	12/10/12	0.4	Email with R. Mead regarding investments (0.1); emails with E. Vonnegut and others regarding security and review of documents in connection with same (0.3).
Huebner MS	12/10/12	0.2	Client emails regarding DIP lender presentation.
Pak GY	12/10/12	0.3	Correspondence from T. Chepiga and Company regarding permitted investments (0.2); correspondence from T. Chepiga and E. Vonnegut regarding leases (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/10/12	0.3	Call with J. Luschefski regarding DIP lender update (0.1); call with R. Mead regarding same (0.1); call with E. Coleman regarding lien release (0.1).
Sorkin S	12/10/12	0.3	Emails with A. Feit regarding mortgages (0.1); internal calls regarding prior mortgages (0.2).
Vonnegut EJ	12/10/12	0.5	Discuss asset sale and related lien release with E. Coleman of Weil and K. Coco.
Warner W	12/10/12	0.2	Review loan agreement and email regarding potential investment.
Chepiga TL	12/11/12	1.3	Conference with E. Vonnegut regarding liens (0.2); calls with Willkie Farr and J. Tucker regarding disposition and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.1).
Pak GY	12/11/12	0.2	Correspondences from Davis Polk Credit and Bankruptcy team regarding White Stallion Coal investment.
Vonnegut EJ	12/11/12	0.5	Discuss existing liens on owned and leased property with Willkie and Davis Polk team.
Warner W	12/11/12	0.3	Telephone call(s) to and with T. Chepiga regarding asset sale for cash.
Chepiga TL	12/12/12	0.9	Draft letter to Bank of America and emails and conferences with W. Warner and Patriot regarding same.
Immermann MC	12/12/12	0.9	Draft closing checklist for joinder for new subsidiary.
McGreal MM	12/12/12	0.1	Correspondence with J. Jones and E. Vonnegut regarding Bank of America information request.
Pak GY	12/12/12	0.4	Correspondences with Company and Davis Polk Credit Team regarding future joinder of new subsidiary (0.2); correspondence with Company regarding Robin Land release and saved documents into system (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/12/12	0.2	Emails with C. Ebetino and R. Mead regarding DIP covenants.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Vonnegut EJ	12/12/12	0.3	Discuss lien search issues with Willkie.
Warner W	12/12/12	0.5	Review emails regarding asset dispositions and investment (0.2); certificate regarding Robin Land transaction (0.3).
Chepiga TL	12/13/12	0.5	Emails with J. Tucker and call with D. Klein regarding liens and review of documents in connection with same.
Immermann MC	12/13/12	0.2	Break out documents for subsidiary joinder.
Pak GY	12/13/12	0.1	Correspondence with M. Immermann regarding joinder.
Resnick BM	12/13/12	0.2	Emails with Willkie Farr regarding Sierra Club letter of credit.
Vonnegut EJ	12/13/12	0.1	Call regarding lien search issues with M. McGreal.
Warner W	12/13/12	0.1	Email regarding WWMV mechanics lien.
Chepiga TL	12/14/12	0.3	Call with J. Tucker regarding liens.
Pak GY	12/14/12	0.7	Review and revision of joinder checklist (0.6); correspondence with M. Immermann regarding the same (0.1)
Resnick BM	12/14/12	0.3	Correspondence with M. Schonholtz and A. Alfonso regarding Sierra Club letter of credit.
Sorkin S	12/14/12	0.1	Email to M. McGreal regarding Willkie questions about mortgages.
Chepiga TL	12/17/12	0.2	Emails with Patriot regarding 10-K.
Coco KJ	12/17/12	0.5	Update call with DIP lenders and counsel.
Huebner MS	12/17/12	0.7	Conference call with DIP lenders regarding general update (0.5); follow up call with M. Schonholtz regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/17/12	0.8	DIP lender update call with M. Huebner, B. Resnick, Weil, Willkie and others (0.7); teleconference with A. Feit regarding Bank of America's information request (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/17/12	0.8	Biweekly update call with DIP Lenders (0.7); follow-up emails regarding same (0.1).
Sorkin S	12/17/12	0.1	Email correspondence regarding mortgages.
McGreal MM	12/18/12	0.1	Teleconference with M. D'Antoni regarding Bank of America's information request.
Resnick BM	12/18/12	0.1	Call with M. Cohen regarding DIP issues.
Huebner MS	12/19/12	0.8	Call with Blackstone regarding financial analysis on multiple workstreams.
McGreal MM	12/19/12	0.2	Correspondence with J. Mazzotti and J. Jones regarding Bank of America's information request.
Immermann MC	12/20/12	0.6	Draft and distribute joinder documents for potential new subsidiary.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Chepiga TL	12/21/12	1.7	Review proposed contract language, DIP Credit Agreement and conferences with Patriot and W. Warner regarding same.
Warner W	12/21/12	1.6	Review proposed coal sales agreement provisions (0.4); conference with T. Chepiga (0.2); review loan agreement (0.5); telephone call with Patriot (0.5).
Pak GY	12/26/12	0.2	Review of correspondences received regarding joinder documents.
Warner W	12/26/12	0.8	Telephone conference with R. Mead regarding coal sales agreement (0.4); review loan agreement (0.4).
Pak GY	12/28/12	0.2	Correspondence with M. McGreal regarding Willkie request relating to as-extracted filings and mortgages.
<b>Total FINANCING</b>		<b>26.2</b>	
<b>FIRST REVIEW</b>			
Ravi SK	12/09/12	3.4	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/14/12	2.8	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/16/12	1.5	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/17/12	3.7	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/18/12	3.7	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/19/12	7.8	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/20/12	6.1	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/21/12	6.7	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/24/12	3.2	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/26/12	3.2	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Balin A	12/27/12	5.9	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/27/12	8.2	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off (8.1); review United Mine Workers of America document request (0.1).
Balin A	12/28/12	1.5	Review documents.
Reiser CM	12/28/12	7.0	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/29/12	1.1	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/30/12	2.0	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
Reiser CM	12/31/12	1.8	Review emails relating to Patriot spin-off.
<b>Total FIRST REVIEW</b>		<b>69.6</b>	
<b>GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION</b>			
Huebner MS	12/01/12	0.4	Conversation with A. Schulte regarding upcoming hearing (0.2); conversation with D. Schaible regarding hearing, venue transfer and other topics (0.2).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Law EC	12/01/12	2.6	Update assembled binders of first day, second day and DIP documents for St. Louis Court (2.4); numerous communications with K. Coco regarding same (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/01/12	0.6	Call with D. Schaible regarding case transfer issues (0.2); emails with M. McGreal and A. Rogoff regarding upcoming motions and hearing (0.4).
Schaible DS	12/01/12	0.3	Teleconferences regarding court issues.
McGreal MM	12/02/12	0.1	Email E. Waller regarding omnibus hearing.
Resnick BM	12/02/12	0.2	Emails with M. McGreal regarding various case issues.
Coco KJ	12/03/12	3.5	Weekly update call and follow-ups in connection with same (1.3); call with Judge Chapman's clerk (0.1); review hearing agenda for December 18 (0.3); review pending items list for clerk of court (0.4); review calendar (0.1); review precedent motions and orders from Eastern District of Missouri (0.5); review Eastern District of Missouri local rules and prior case management orders (0.8).
Huebner MS	12/03/12	1.7	Conversations with general counsel and CFO regarding various matters (0.8); review of select, relevant news articles (0.2); call with A. Schwartz regarding heavy schedule and objection deadlines (0.5); conference call with U.S. Trustee and court regarding December 18 hearing (0.2).
Jones RL	12/03/12	0.5	Review docket and documents per E. Sokoloff.
Law EC	12/03/12	0.3	Follow up with K. Coco regarding binders of first day, second day and DIP documents sent to U.S. Trustee, Bryan Cave and St. Louis Court.
Libby A	12/03/12	0.7	Call with GCG (0.6); look up objection deadlines for December 18 hearing (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/03/12	0.4	Correspondence with A. Starr and A. Libby regarding objection deadline (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding claims settlement procedures (0.1); email M. Freitag regarding venue transfer (0.1); correspondence with Weil Gotshal regarding same (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/03/12	0.3	Correspondence with M. McGreal and Bryan Cave regarding case transfer logistics.
Coco KJ	12/04/12	2.5	Coordinate logistics for venue transfer (0.9); draft, file and serve hearing agenda (0.4); review Surratt-States cases (0.3); emails with Davis Polk team and analysis regarding new case management order (0.3); file and serve notice of no objections (0.3); review draft order for submission to Chambers (0.3).

## Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
de Richemont P	12/04/12	0.1	Supervise filing of notice of no objections.
Falk AE	12/04/12	0.3	Update attendees on case calendar items.
Huebner MS	12/04/12	1.0	Call with CEO to discuss multiple topics (0.6); conversation with J. Bean regarding multiple pending matters (0.3); call with chambers of Judge Surratt-States (0.1).
Klein DS	12/04/12	0.1	Emails with M. McGreal regarding December 18 hearing schedule.
Law EC	12/04/12	0.6	Route pleadings (0.2); communications with A. Starr regarding same (0.1); communications with C. Robertson regarding binders and indices for hearing binders (0.3).
Libby A	12/04/12	2.6	Check notice provisions regarding §363 (0.2); review local rules in connection with drafting revised proposed case management order (0.9); draft, revise and file agenda (1.3); email GCG regarding updating website to reflect agenda (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/04/12	1.3	Correspondence with D. Schaible, C. Robertson and others regarding delivery of fee statements to U.S. Trustee's offices (0.3); email B. Resnick and C. Robertson regarding payment of fees (0.1); teleconference with Chambers regarding scheduling (0.2); review and comment on draft agenda (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); teleconference with M. Huebner and clerk of court (0.1); email Chambers proposed orders (0.1).
Melvin MM	12/04/12	0.1	Integrate originals into the main file.
Resnick BM	12/04/12	0.7	Call with L. Palans (0.2); discuss case transfer and related issues with M. Huebner and M. McGreal (0.5).
Silberger DM	12/04/12	3.8	Send example pro hac vice motion and order to GCG (0.1); collect cases for survey of 8th circuit jurisprudence (1.7); prepare summaries of chapter 11 cases from Eastern District of Missouri (2.0).
Coco KJ	12/05/12	3.3	Route documents (0.2); draft and send orders to chambers for entry (0.7); meet with A. Libby regarding Missouri local rules and organization of documents in connection with same (1.9); coordinate delivery of documents to U.S. Trustees (0.5).
Falk AE	12/05/12	1.3	Update case calendar (0.9); correspond with A. Libby and K. Coco regarding same (0.4).
Law EC	12/05/12	0.4	Route pleadings.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	12/05/12	1.3	Update case calendar (0.4); meet with M. McGreal regarding ongoing assignments (0.2); meet with K. Coco regarding case management order (0.7).
McGreal MM	12/05/12	0.4	Email Chambers proposed orders (0.1); conference with A. Libby regarding revised case management order (0.1); review binders of fee statements for U.S. Trustees' offices (0.1); correspondence with M. Huebner and C. Robertson regarding same (0.1).
Melvin MM	12/05/12	0.7	Review and integrate original pleadings into the main file (0.1); assist C. Robertson with labeling and packing binders to be shipped to Offices of the U.S. Trustee in Missouri, Washington, D.C. and South Carolina (0.6).
Robertson C	12/05/12	5.2	Prepare binders of retained professionals' fee hearing materials to send to the U.S. Trustee and coordinate mailing of same.
Silberger DM	12/05/12	6.8	Prepare memorandum on Eastern District of Missouri chapter 11 cases.
Tsiouris N	12/05/12	0.1	Communications with C. Robertson regarding binder production of fee statements for U.S. Trustee.
VanWagner AB	12/05/12	1.7	Prepare binders of fee statement to send to U.S. Trustee.
Coco KJ	12/06/12	3.2	Review and comment on chart of Missouri local rules and forms (2.2); call with L. Hughes regarding case management and case law issues, follow-up communications with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0).
Falk AE	12/06/12	1.4	Update case calendar to include recent rescheduling of hearings and new items.
Jones RL	12/06/12	1.0	Review docket and documents L. Peng.
Law EC	12/06/12	0.1	Route pleading.
Libby A	12/06/12	1.4	Research case management order precedents (0.5); emails and discussions with A. Falk regarding updating case calendar (0.9).
McGreal MM	12/06/12	0.8	Teleconference with E. Gasparini and D. Schaible regarding delivery of fee statements (0.1); review and comment on case calendar (0.3); teleconference with Bryan Cave and K. Coco regarding case administration (0.3); conference with K. Coco regarding staffing (0.1).
Melvin MM	12/06/12	1.6	Review various 8th Circuit dockets and obtain precedent notice and motion procedures motions and orders for A. Libby.
Resnick BM	12/06/12	0.7	Call with L. Palans regarding administration (0.2); discuss same with M. Huebner and M. McGreal (0.5).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	12/06/12	0.4	Teleconference with U.S. Trustee regarding case issues.
Silberger DM	12/06/12	5.9	Draft memorandum on 8th circuit chapter 11 law.
Coco KJ	12/07/12	2.2	Weekly update call and follow-up tasks related to same (0.9); review and comment on summaries of Surratt-States cases (1.3).
Huebner MS	12/07/12	2.0	Weekly call with management and co-advisors regarding all agenda matters (0.8); calls on discrete issues with senior management team (0.9); internal meeting with litigators regarding document issues (0.3).
Klein DS	12/07/12	0.4	Update call with clients.
Law EC	12/07/12	0.9	Route pleadings (0.7); communications with K. Coco resolving issues regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	12/07/12	0.6	Coordinate preparation of local rules minibook and discuss same with K. Coco.
McGreal MM	12/07/12	1.2	Weekly update call with Company and professionals (0.7); teleconference with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and chambers regarding scheduling (0.1); review and comment on Eastern District of Missouri local rules minibook (0.4).
Resnick BM	12/07/12	1.1	Weekly update call with clients (0.8); call with M. McGreal regarding various case issues (0.3).
Robertson C	12/07/12	0.3	Emails with D. Silberger regarding documents in precedent Eastern District of Missouri bankruptcy cases.
Silberger DM	12/07/12	4.2	Revise memo on Eastern District of Missouri chapter 11 law (3.5); emails with C. Robertson regarding same (0.2); research on Eastern District of Missouri practice and local rules (0.5).
Coco KJ	12/10/12	1.8	Analysis of new case management order requirements and Missouri local rules (1.0); emails with clients regarding monthly operating reports (0.6); meet with A. Libby regarding new case management order (0.2).
Falk AE	12/10/12	1.6	Review exhibit summaries from recent Eastern District of Missouri cases and send to A. Libby (0.9); review creditor matrices from recent Eastern District of Missouri cases and send to A. Libby (0.7).
Huebner MS	12/10/12	0.8	Review of eighth circuit law on various topics (0.5); conversation with Bryan Cave regarding St. Louis transfer logistics (0.1); conversation with U.S. Trustee regarding fee hearing (0.1); emails with Davis Polk and J. Bean regarding actuarial issues (0.1).
Law EC	12/10/12	0.6	Route pleadings (0.4); update files (0.2).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	12/10/12	0.9	Emails with L. Samet regarding case management order (0.1); meet with K. Coco regarding case management order (0.2); emails with M. McGreal regarding deferred compensation (0.1); discuss researching Eastern District of Missouri precedents regarding case management procedures with A. Falk (0.2); review results of research on case management procedures (0.3).
McGreal MM	12/10/12	0.6	Correspondence with K. Coco regarding filing monthly operating report (0.1); correspondence with Chambers regarding proposed Chartis stipulation and fee applications (0.1); conference with M. Huebner regarding call to Eastern District of Missouri chambers (0.2); conference with K. Coco regarding binder of pleadings (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/10/12	0.5	Call with L. Palans and M. Huebner regarding case transfer (0.2); discuss various case issues with M. Huebner and M. McGreal (0.3).
Coco KJ	12/11/12	1.8	Emails with clients regarding monthly operating report (0.3); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); call with D. Klein regarding same (0.1); coordinate document productions for Missouri court (1.2).
Huebner MS	12/11/12	1.3	Emails with C. Ebetino, E. Moskowitz, B. Resnick regarding joint venture issue (0.2); call with chambers regarding multiple topics (0.8); conversation with GC regarding multiple matters (0.3).
Law EC	12/11/12	4.2	Revise index of certain relevant motions and orders for Eastern District of Missouri Court (1.7); numerous communications with K. Coco and M. McGreal regarding same (0.4); assemble documents regarding same (0.3); route pleadings (0.9); communications with M. McGreal, K. Coco and C. Robertson regarding same (0.4); update files (0.5).
McGreal MM	12/11/12	0.7	Correspondence with N. Tsiouris and A. Libby regarding amending schedules (0.1); review precedent amended schedules (0.2); correspondence with R. Mead, K. Coco and Bryan Cave regarding new U.S. Trustee and filing Monthly Operating Reports (0.2); review binder of pleadings for Judge (0.1); correspondence with K. Coco regarding same (0.1).
Melvin MM	12/11/12	0.2	Distribute incoming pleadings and integrate originals into the main file.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	12/11/12	0.4	Emails with C. Ebetino regarding joint ventures (0.2); discuss various case issues with M. McGreal (0.2).
Tsiouris N	12/11/12	0.1	Email to M. McGreal regarding potential precedent amended Schedules.
Huebner MS	12/12/12	1.0	Conference call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding multiple topics (0.4); follow up with F. Huffard regarding same (0.2); conversation with GC regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee call and multiple other pending matters including November 18 hearing (0.4).
Jones RL	12/12/12	2.9	Review docket and documents per B. Zhu.
Libby A	12/12/12	2.4	Review Arch counterparty notice of no objection and case management order in connection with same and email M. McGreal regarding same (0.5); review local rules to compare with case management order (1.1); prepare local rules minibook (0.8).
Resnick BM	12/12/12	0.3	Meet with M. Huebner, M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding various case issues.
Silberger DM	12/12/12	0.8	Create chart of major chapter 11 cases in Eastern District of Missouri.
Coco KJ	12/13/12	1.5	Coordinate materials for St. Louis chambers.
Falk AE	12/13/12	2.7	Review docket and update case calendar accordingly (0.6); email specialist teams regarding case calendar (0.2); begin preparing binder for 12/18 hearing (0.2); meet with A. Libby regarding same (0.1); revise hearing agenda (0.5); review docket for objections to add to agenda (0.3); revise per comments from M. McGreal (0.3); send agenda to M. Melvin for binder preparation (0.2); review printed binders with A. Libby and give to E. Law to send to chambers (0.3).
Law EC	12/13/12	3.7	Route pleadings (0.4); assemble and update 12/18/2012 hearing binder (1.8); revise hearing agenda regarding same (0.4); coordinate FedEx regarding same (0.3); numerous communications with A. Falk, A. Libby and M. Melvin regarding same (0.8).
Libby A	12/13/12	1.5	Coordinate preparation of 12/18 hearing binder for court (0.6); discuss local rules and case management order with L. Samet and M. McGreal (0.5); review and comment on case calendar (0.4).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	12/13/12	0.5	Review hearing binder index for Judge (0.1); correspondence with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding same (0.1); review and comment on case calendar (0.2); correspondence with A. Libby and A. Falk regarding same (0.1).
Melvin MM	12/13/12	3.1	Prepare hearing binders for the December 18th hearing (2.8); coordinate duplication of same (0.3).
Pucci MV	12/13/12	1.9	Review hearing transcripts and court pleadings for fairness of settlement issue in Solutia case as per C. Reiser.
Robertson C	12/13/12	0.3	Coordinate production of hearing binders with A. Libby and M. Melvin.
Coco KJ	12/14/12	2.7	Weekly update call (0.5); draft and revise notices of no objection and proposed orders for sending to chambers (1.5); review and comment on draft venue transfer order as requested by chambers (0.7).
Falk AE	12/14/12	3.2	Look for precedent transfer order as basis for drafting transfer to Eastern District of Missouri (0.5); draft transfer order (0.7); revise draft transfer order to include tables enumerating all jointly administered cases and adversary proceedings (1.5); revise transfer motion per K. Coco comments and send to M. McGreal for review (0.5).
Huebner MS	12/14/12	1.5	Prepare for weekly update call with senior management (0.3); attend weekly update call with senior management (0.5); conference call with B. Resnick, M. McGreal regarding multiple pending matters (0.2); conversation with A. Rogoff regarding December 18 hearing (0.2); conference call with court regarding December 18 hearing (0.3).
Law EC	12/14/12	4.6	Follow up with M. McGreal regarding 12/18/2012 hearing binders to Judge Chapman's chambers (0.1); route pleadings (0.8); assemble binders and revise index to binders of relevant motions and orders for St. Louis Court (3.2); numerous communications with K. Coco, M. Melvin and M. McGreal regarding same (0.4); communications with A. Libby regarding ECF (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/14/12	1.0	Weekly update call (0.6); review and comment on notices of no objection and proposed orders (0.2); email Chambers regarding same (0.1); review binders of introductory pleadings for Judge (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	12/14/12	3.8	Prepare binders of key Patriot documents to be sent to the Eastern District of Missouri bankruptcy court (3.5); pack binders to be shipped to same (0.3).
Resnick BM	12/14/12	1.4	Weekly update call with clients and co-advisors (0.6); discuss court hearing and various case issues with M. McGreal (0.8).
Huebner MS	12/15/12	0.2	Conversation with A. Rogoff regarding fee hearing.
Law EC	12/15/12	0.9	Update binders of certain relevant motions and orders for St. Louis Court (0.8); communications with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding same (0.1).
Coco KJ	12/16/12	0.3	Coordinate preparations for Tuesday hearing.
Falk AE	12/16/12	0.3	Revise time entry objections spreadsheet (0.2); review M. McGreal changes to transfer order and respond to M. McGreal email regarding same (0.1).
Huebner MS	12/16/12	0.1	Emails regarding Tuesday's fee hearing.
Libby A	12/16/12	0.4	Emails regarding precedent standard language for 8th circuit case law (0.1); emails regarding holdback with M. McGreal (0.1); research regarding holdback issue (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/16/12	0.9	Review and comment on venue transfer order (0.4); correspondence with K. Coco, A. Falk and B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); review precedent venue transfer orders (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick, A. Starr and K. Coco regarding hearing preparation (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/16/12	0.3	Review transfer order (0.1); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).
Coco KJ	12/17/12	4.8	Prepare for omnibus hearing (1.8); coordinate revision of proposed orders and submissions to court (0.9); draft hearing agenda (0.7); circulate same to Davis Polk team (0.1); revise same (0.5); coordinate preparation of materials for hearing (0.7); call with A. Starr regarding hearing preparations (0.1).
Falk AE	12/17/12	2.7	Update case calendar and outlook invitations for extension of DIP challenge deadline (0.2); highlight cases and other materials for 12/18 hearing binder (1.7); draft email to M. Melvin and E. Law with instructions on preparing same (0.2); revise hearing agenda and send to K. Coco (0.1); prepare materials regarding withdrawal of Lawson Heirs Objection (0.2); file agenda for 12/18 hearing and email to GCG Inc. for service (0.3).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	12/17/12	2.4	Update call with J. Bean regarding all pending matters (1.0); several calls with U.S. Trustee regarding tomorrow's hearing and various resolutions (0.7); prepare for tomorrow's hearing (0.7).
Law EC	12/17/12	1.0	Numerous communications with K. Coco, A. VanWagner and M. Melvin regarding pleadings routing and preparations for 12/18/2012 hearing (0.5); obtain hearing transcript precedent for 12/18/2012 interim fee hearing (0.4); communications with A. Falk regarding same (0.1).
Libby A	12/17/12	1.2	Prepare binder of Sierra Club motion pleadings (0.6); assemble pdf for filing of same (0.2); draft notice of filing of proposed order for Sierra Club (0.2); assemble pdf for filing of same (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/17/12	1.3	Teleconference with R. McWilliams regarding filing monthly operating report (0.1); review and comment on hearing agenda (0.2); correspondence with A. Starr, K. Coco, A. Libby and others regarding hearing preparation (0.4); correspondence with Chambers regarding proposed orders and hearing (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco, A. Libby and A. Falk regarding same (0.2); review and comment on proposed omnibus fee order (0.2).
Melvin MM	12/17/12	2.8	Prepare hearing binders for the December 18th hearing (2.5); gather supplies for the supply box for the hearing (0.3).
Resnick BM	12/17/12	0.5	Call with L. Palans regarding court transfer (0.2); correspondence with M. Huebner and M. McGreal regarding same (0.3).
Robertson C	12/17/12	0.8	Discuss preparation of hearing binders with M. Melvin (0.2); revise proposed interim fee order (0.4); prepare and email schedule from proposed order to M. McGreal (0.2).
VanWagner AB	12/17/12	2.8	File and serve pleadings (1.1); call with E. Law to discuss routing of docket entries (0.1); route pleadings from docket to Davis Polk team (1.6).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/18/12	3.8	Route entered orders and emails with Davis Polk team and other professionals regarding same (0.4); update rejection status chart (0.5); emails with clients regarding monthly operating report (0.2); review of same (0.5); draft list of pending relief as requested by the court (0.6); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.3); revise and distribute draft venue transfer order as requested by the court (0.3); route filings and review docket (1.0).
Falk AE	12/18/12	1.3	Update case calendar for new rejection notices and extensions to reclamation report deadlines (0.2); send corresponding outlook invitations (0.2); update venue transfer order to reflect U.S. Trustee comment (0.4); update venue transfer order to reflect further comments from the U.S. Trustee (0.4); further update venue transfer order reflecting continued discussions with U.S. Trustee and email blackline to M. McGreal (0.1).
Huebner MS	12/18/12	2.7	Attend final hearing before Judge Chapman (1.4); conversation with M. McGreal regarding all final orders (0.2); multiple conversations, emails and drafts of drafts of proposed transfer order with A. Schwartz (1.1).
Klein DS	12/18/12	0.3	Emails with K. Coco regarding November monthly operating report (0.1); emails with K. Coco regarding rejection order service (0.2).
Law EC	12/18/12	0.2	Communications with A. Falk regarding hearing transcripts (0.1); route pleadings (0.1).
Libby A	12/18/12	0.2	Locate and email final proposed orders for Sierra Club and Arch motions to M. McGreal for submission to chambers.
McGreal MM	12/18/12	4.0	Prepare backup materials for hearing (0.9); attend omnibus hearing (1.4); correspondence with M. Huebner and A. Schwartz regarding venue transfer order (0.6); correspondence with A. Falk regarding same (0.2); review and comment on revised venue transfer order (0.3); review precedent venue transfer orders (0.2); correspondence with Chambers regarding proposed orders (0.1); correspondence with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding list of pending relief and proposed orders (0.1); review and comment on list of pending relief (0.1); conference with A. Libby regarding research on 8th Circuit law (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	12/18/12	0.7	Organize and clean up documents following 12/18 hearing (0.5); distribute incoming mail and integrate originals into the main file (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/18/12	1.2	Review and revise transfer order (0.1); call with A. Schwartz regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Huebner, M. McGreal and A. Schwartz regarding same (0.3); emails and calls with Davis Polk team regarding case transfer issues (0.3); meet with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding meeting with J. Goodchild and other case management issues (0.4).
VanWagner AB	12/18/12	1.3	Route pleadings to Davis Polk team.
Coco KJ	12/19/12	4.6	Review and revise draft pro hac vice motions (0.4); coordinate filing of documents in the Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern District of Missouri (1.5); file and route documents (0.3); meet with M. McGreal regarding coverage of Patriot tasks (0.2); review and comment on case calendar (0.2); coordinate with Bryan Cave regarding transfer of cases to Missouri (0.8); review fee statements and coordinate regarding filing and service of same (0.3); draft agenda for upcoming call with St. Louis U.S. Trustee (0.6); review Missouri local rules in connection with same (0.3).
Falk AE	12/19/12	1.5	Email GCG regarding docket page error (0.1); update case calendar (1.0); email to specialist and litigation teams for comments (0.1); blackline and email to A. Libby for review (0.1); communicate with environmental team regarding changes and update accordingly and email revised version to M. McGreal (0.2).
Huebner MS	12/19/12	1.0	Multiple emails with A. Schwartz regarding forms of order (0.4); review of same and conversation with M. McGreal (0.3); brief conversation with E. FitzGerald and review of materials regarding actuarial matters (0.3).
Klein DS	12/19/12	0.3	Emails with K. Coco and others regarding venue transfer logistics and ECF notifications.
Law EC	12/19/12	3.1	Route pleadings (0.2); process call from office of surface mining (0.8); communications with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding same (0.6); research procedures for obtaining Eastern District of Missouri ECF logins (0.9); numerous communications with K. Coco and C. Robertson regarding same (0.6).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	12/19/12	0.8	Revise draft case management order for 8th Circuit and email to K. Coco (0.2); review calendar and provide comments to A. Falk (0.5); coordinate preparation of local rule minibook (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/19/12	3.4	Correspondence with Chambers regarding proposed transfer order and fee order (0.2); review U.S. Trustee's proposed transfer order (0.1); correspondence with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); correspondence with K. Coco and D. Silberger regarding pro hac vice applications (0.1); review final transfer order and fee orders (0.2); teleconference with M. Huebner regarding call with Eastern District of Missouri U.S. Trustee (0.2); conference with K. Coco regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding service of venue transfer order (0.2); correspondence with A. Schwartz regarding omnibus fee order (0.4); correspondence with M. Huebner and C. Robertson regarding same (0.6); review and comment on revised fee order (0.4); review fee guidelines and precedent fee orders (0.3); email with various professionals regarding proposed omnibus fee order (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/19/12	0.5	Review and revise transfer order (0.2); correspondence with M. Huebner, M. McGreal and A. Schwartz regarding same (0.3).
Robertson C	12/19/12	0.3	Emails with D. Klein, K. Coco and E. Law regarding pro hac vice requirements in Eastern District of Missouri bankruptcy courts and ECF access in same.
Silberger DM	12/19/12	1.3	Research on certificates of service requirements in Eastern District of Missouri local rules (0.3); prepare additional pro hac vice motions and proposed orders for same (1.0).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/20/12	5.7	Analysis of monthly operating report and emails to clients in connection with move to St. Louis and new case numbers (0.9); call with J. Wubker regarding same (0.2); coordinate process regarding transfer of venue to St. Louis (0.9); call with R. Mead regarding U.S. Trustee issues and follow up with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); comment on GCG website (0.4); coordinate with Davis Polk team regarding necessary updates to filings and documents in connection with venue change (1.4); draft and revise agenda for call with St. Louis U.S. Trustee tomorrow (0.6); call with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); distribute same to Davis Polk team (0.1); call with L. Hughes regarding filings in Missouri and process (0.2); coordinate with E. Law regarding electronic case filing emails in Missouri (0.7).
Falk AE	12/20/12	2.0	Update case calendar (0.2); prepare table with case numbers for associated cases as they arrive on docket (1.3); review Monthly Operating Report to conform to transfer of case to Eastern District of Missouri (0.5).
Huebner MS	12/20/12	2.3	Conference call with J. Bean regarding multiple matters (1.1); conference call with J. Bean regarding cost containment strategies (0.3); prepare for call with U.S. Trustee tomorrow, including work on agenda and proposed approach (0.9).
Klein DS	12/20/12	0.5	Emails with E. Law regarding pleading routing from Eastern District of Missouri (0.2); coordinate with K. Coco regarding same (0.3).
Law EC	12/20/12	3.2	Research regarding procedures for obtaining ECF notification emails for Eastern District of Missouri (1.4); numerous communications regarding same with K. Coco, J. Candelario, M. Melvin and D. Klein (0.9); coordinate ordering 12/18/2012 hearing transcript (0.1); communications with K. Coco and R. Jones regarding same (0.2); route pleadings (0.5); communications with K. Coco regarding same (0.1).
Libby A	12/20/12	0.5	Review local rules, revise proposed case management order and email K. Coco regarding same.
McGreal MM	12/20/12	0.7	Review and comment on case calendar (0.2); review and comment on agenda for call with Eastern District of Missouri U.S. Trustee (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco regarding calendar, agenda and transfer issues (0.3).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	12/20/12	1.2	Call with clerk of St. Louis court (0.2); correspondence with M. Huebner, M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding venue transfer issues (0.7); review agenda for U.S. Trustee call (0.1); call with K. Coco regarding same (0.1); call with M. Huebner regarding workstreams (0.1).
Silberger DM	12/20/12	0.4	Gather precedents and prepare cover for email to conflicts counsel regarding pro hac vice admission.
VanWagner AB	12/20/12	0.6	Route pleadings to Davis Polk team.
Coco KJ	12/21/12	0.4	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding hearing dates, pro hac vice motions and filing procedures.
Eum JS	12/21/12	0.8	Compile vacation status of team members for Vacation Schedule spreadsheet as per L. Samet.
Falk AE	12/21/12	0.9	Prepare notice of omnibus hearings.
Huebner MS	12/21/12	2.2	Final preparation for multi-matter call with U.S. Trustee's office in St. Louis (0.3); call with B. Resnick, M. McGreal and U.S. Trustee in St. Louis regarding case transition (1.2); emails with local counsel and conversation with B. Resnick regarding upcoming hearing schedule and requirements for filing (0.3); conversation with J. Bean regarding various topics (0.4).
Klein DS	12/21/12	0.9	Emails with R. Mead regarding paper check headers (0.1); emails with R. Mead and M. McGreal regarding U.S. Trustee letter to bank (0.3); review final cash management order provisions related to same (0.3); call with R. Mead regarding same (0.2).
Law EC	12/21/12	0.9	Circulate index to binders of certain relevant documents for Judge Surratt-States (0.1); numerous communications with M. Melvin regarding ECF routing issues (0.4); review filings on docket (0.4).
Libby A	12/21/12	1.3	Coordinate production of minibooks (0.2); review and revise notice of hearing of omnibus hearings (0.3); coordinate filing of November monthly operating report (0.3); update pending relief list and email same to M. McGreal (0.2); research local rules regarding signature requirements (0.2); emails with D. Klein and others regarding waiver language in case management order (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	12/21/12	2.8	Teleconference with L. Long, P. Randolph, M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding various transfer issues (1.1); follow up conference with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Chambers regarding omnibus hearing dates (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick, B. Walsh and others regarding same (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick, L. Samet, D. Silberger and others regarding pro hac vice applications (0.3); review and comment on same (0.2); correspondence with D. Klein regarding cash management motion (0.1); review and comment on omnibus hearing notice (0.2); correspondence with A. Libby regarding same (0.2); email U.S. Trustee's office regarding case management order and pending relief (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/21/12	3.4	Weekly update call with clients and co-advisors (0.7); call with St. Louis U.S. Trustees (1.2); discuss follow-ups with M. McGreal (0.2); correspondence with local counsel and Davis Polk team regarding contents and timing of upcoming court hearings (0.9); correspondence with R. Mead regarding monthly operating reports and cash management (0.3); correspondence with M. McGreal and D. Silberger regarding pro hac vice applications (0.1).
Silberger DM	12/21/12	1.0	Draft and revise pro hac vice motions (0.7); circulate same to movants for confirmation of accuracy (0.3).
Huebner MS	12/22/12	0.2	Review and markup of pro hac vice and emails with comments (0.1); emails to Davis Polk and Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding January 14 omnibus hearing (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/22/12	0.5	Review and comment on notice of omnibus hearings (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); email Kramer Levin, Weil and Willkie regarding omnibus hearing dates (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/22/12	0.1	Emails with M. McGreal regarding court hearings and case transfer issues.
McGreal MM	12/23/12	0.1	Email U.S. Trustee regarding omnibus hearing dates.
Resnick BM	12/23/12	0.4	Emails with M. Huebner, M. McGreal, J. Martin and Kramer Levin regarding court hearing.
Resnick BM	12/24/12	0.3	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding court hearing (0.2); call with A. Rogoff regarding same and settlement procedures (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Falk AE	12/26/12	0.1	Send outlook invitations based on revised calendar circulated 12/20.
Law EC	12/26/12	0.2	Review filings on docket.
Libby A	12/26/12	0.9	Multiple emails with M. McGreal and D. Silberger regarding submission of Davis Polk pro hac vice motions and orders for filing (0.5); emails with M. McGreal regarding case status and pending assignments (0.1); emails with L. Hughes at Bryan Cave regarding filing ordinary course professionals Declaration and pro hac vice motions and ECF forwarding (0.2); emails with GCG regarding outstanding certificates of service and coordination of filings (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/26/12	0.5	Review and comment on revised pro hac vice motions (0.1); correspondence with A. Libby and D. Silberger regarding same (0.2); teleconference with B. Walsh regarding omnibus hearings (0.1); review revised notice of omnibus hearings (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/26/12	0.3	Emails with M. McGreal regarding claims settlement procedures and claims objection procedures (0.2); emails with M. Huebner and M. McGreal regarding upcoming court hearing (0.1).
Silberger DM	12/26/12	1.4	Turn comments to pro hac vice motions and orders and make conforming changes in all pro hac vice motions and orders.
Falk AE	12/27/12	0.5	Review docket for filing of pro hac vice motion (0.1); update case calendar (0.2); review updates to GCG Inc. website and follow up by email with GCG Inc. (0.2).
Law EC	12/27/12	0.7	Monitor docket (0.4); route pleadings (0.1); communications with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/27/12	1.3	Revise talking points for initial status conference.
Klein DS	12/28/12	0.5	Emails with R. Mead and B. Resnick regarding final cash management order (0.2); emails with A. Libby et al regarding pleading routing issues and analyze same (0.3).
Law EC	12/28/12	0.6	Monitor docket (0.3); communications with M. Melvin regarding same (0.1); update files (0.2).
Libby A	12/28/12	0.8	Emails regarding ECF notification forwarding with D. Klein, M. McGreal and Computer Support (0.5); call with M. McGreal regarding case status and upcoming assignments (0.2); email D. Silberger and M. McGreal regarding business judgment case law (0.1).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	12/28/12	0.2	Email U.S. Trustee regarding meeting (0.1); teleconference with A. Libby regarding status conference talking points and case management order (0.1).
Melvin MM	12/28/12	0.1	Route incoming pleadings.
Resnick BM	12/28/12	0.2	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding court hearing (0.1); emails with D. Klein regarding cash investments (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/31/12	0.5	Review and comment on notice of hearing (0.2); correspondence regarding same with B. Walsh, K. Coco and A. Libby (0.2); correspondence with GCG regarding service (0.1).
<b>Total GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION</b>		<b>229.9</b>	
<b>GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS</b>			
Huebner MS	12/01/12	0.1	Emails with J. Jones regarding board meetings.
Huebner MS	12/03/12	0.1	Emails with J. Jones regarding governance issues.
<b>Total GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS</b>		<b>0.2</b>	
<b>NON-DPW RETENTION</b>			
Robertson C	12/03/12	0.2	Emails with M. Graham at Steptoe & Johnson regarding monthly fee statements.
de Richemont P	12/04/12	0.5	Review ordinary course professional declaration and questionnaire (0.2); email about same (0.3).
Ibrahim A	12/04/12	0.4	Create draft order of Jackson Kelly notice of presentment for M. McGreal review (0.2); correspondence with M. McGreal and S. Krause regarding same (0.1); edit notice of presentment (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/04/12	0.3	Review precedent retention applications (0.2); email E. Moskowitz and B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/04/12	0.1	Call with M. McGreal regarding professional retention.
Robertson C	12/04/12	5.8	Review chart of retained professionals' fees to send to J. Jones (0.3); emails regarding same with B. Resnick and M. McGreal (0.1); draft and send email to J. Jones regarding retained professionals' fees (0.4); prepare binders of all professionals' interim fee applications and related documents to send to the U.S. Trustee (5.0).
de Richemont P	12/05/12	0.2	Email about ordinary course professional retention.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Ibrahim A	12/05/12	0.6	Review signed order of notice of presentment (0.4); correspondence with Jackson Kelly regarding entered order (0.2).
de Richemont P	12/06/12	0.1	Email about ordinary course professional retention.
Krause SC	12/06/12	0.5	Various emails regarding Epiq retention (0.3); review docket and declarations (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/06/12	0.1	Teleconference with A. Yerramalli regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee expenses.
Robertson C	12/06/12	0.1	Email Epiq retention order and declaration to S. Krause and M. Tobak.
Schaible DS	12/06/12	0.3	Teleconference with U.S. Trustee regarding fee application.
Tobak MJ	12/06/12	1.2	Telephone conference with Epiq and M. Gongolevsky regarding Epiq retention (0.5); correspondence with M. Russano and S. Krause regarding same (0.7).
de Richemont P	12/07/12	1.6	Email about ordinary course professional retention (0.4); research about same (0.8); meet with S. Krause and follow up on same (0.4).
Krause SC	12/07/12	0.4	Emails regarding ordinary course professionals retention (0.3); confer with A. de Richemont regarding same (0.1).
McGreal MM	12/07/12	0.1	Correspondence with C. Robertson and E. Gasparini regarding contact information for retained professionals.
Robertson C	12/07/12	0.7	Email to M. McGreal regarding contact information for retained professionals (0.6); emails with Cole Schotz regarding payment of fees (0.1).
Tsiouris N	12/07/12	0.1	Review email from U.S. Trustee for request of email list of retained professionals.
de Richemont P	12/10/12	0.1	Email about ongoing conflicts checks.
Krause SC	12/10/12	0.4	Emails with J. Jones regarding professional retention (0.2); review agreement (0.2).
Tobak MJ	12/10/12	0.8	Review contract for Epiq retention (0.5); conference with D. McGregor regarding Epiq retention (0.3).
Krause SC	12/11/12	0.9	Confer with C. Robertson regarding professional retention (0.2); review agreement (0.5); emails regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/11/12	0.2	Teleconference with AlixPartners regarding notice of fee increase.
Robertson C	12/11/12	4.2	Review and comment on professional engagement letter (2.3); discuss same with S. Krause (0.3); make additional revisions to engagement letter (1.4); email from Kramer Levin regarding payment of fees (0.1); email to J. Jones regarding same (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
VanWagner AB	12/11/12	1.6	Review and markup AP Services notice of rate change (0.9); research precedent for filing of same (0.2); send same to K. Sundt at AP Services (0.2); emails with C. Robertson regarding same (0.2); email M. McGreal regarding same (0.1).
Krause SC	12/12/12	0.4	Email D. Schaible regarding professional retention (0.1); confer with K. Coco and M. McGreal regarding ordinary course professionals claims (0.3).
Robertson C	12/12/12	0.5	Emails with Patriot and Kramer Levin regarding payment of Kramer Levin fees (0.1); call from H. Hiznay at Curtis regarding Curtis fee statement (0.1); revise professional retention markup to incorporate comments by D. Schaible and send same to S. Krause (0.3).
Tsiouris N	12/12/12	0.1	Communications with C. Robertson regarding logistics of filing of professional fee statements in Eastern District of Missouri.
VanWagner AB	12/12/12	0.4	File AP Services notice of rate change and send for service.
Huebner MS	12/13/12	0.3	Conversations with Kramer, Blackstone regarding fee hearing and objection.
Krause SC	12/13/12	0.2	Email J. Jones regarding professional retention.
Robertson C	12/13/12	0.4	Review and file Steptoe & Johnson's November fee statement on behalf of Steptoe & Johnson (0.2); email to M. McGreal regarding U.S. Trustee's objection to Blackstone expenses (0.2).
Schaible DS	12/13/12	0.4	Emails regarding conflicts issues.
de Richemont P	12/14/12	0.1	Email about ordinary course professional fees.
Resnick BM	12/14/12	0.2	Correspondence with Bryan Cave and S. Krause regarding Bryan Cave retention.
Robertson C	12/14/12	0.5	Listen to voice mail from J. Chincheck at Bowles Rice (0.1); review local rules regarding attendance at hearings (0.2); email to J. Chincheck regarding same (0.1); meet with M. McGreal to discuss U.S. Trustee's objection to Blackstone expenses (0.1).
Tsiouris N	12/14/12	0.1	Communications with C. Robertson regarding filing of professional fee statements.
Huebner MS	12/17/12	0.8	Conversations with Blackstone, Curtis, Kramer regarding resolution of their fee applications and tomorrow's hearing.
Libby A	12/17/12	0.1	Emails regarding other professionals attendance at fee hearing.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Robertson C	12/17/12	0.3	Draft email to retained professionals regarding November fee statements (0.1); email to B. Dobbs at Jackson Kelly regarding interim fee hearing (0.2).
Starr AT	12/17/12	0.7	Calls and emails with S. Krause and J. Jones regarding engagement letter.
Tsiouris N	12/17/12	0.1	Communications with C. Robertson regarding logistics of professionals filing November monthly fee statements in Missouri court.
Huebner MS	12/18/12	0.1	Review and markup of proposed order for all professionals fee applications.
Krause SC	12/18/12	0.3	Review Bryan Cave retention application.
McGreal MM	12/18/12	1.2	Review and comment on proposed omnibus fee order (0.6); correspondence with M. Huebner and C. Robertson regarding same (0.4); review precedent omnibus fee orders (0.2).
Robertson C	12/18/12	2.8	Prepare binders and other hearing materials related to non-Davis Polk parties (0.2); attend hearing (0.8); review and revise interim fee order (1.3); discuss fee order with M. McGreal (0.4); email to G. Ford at Jackson Kelly regarding November fee statements (0.1).
Tsiouris N	12/18/12	0.3	Communications with C. Robertson regarding logistics of professionals filing November monthly fee statements in Missouri court.
Krause SC	12/19/12	0.7	Review Bryan Cave retention application.
McGreal MM	12/19/12	0.1	Correspondence with K. Coco regarding rate increases of professionals.
Robertson C	12/19/12	3.9	Discuss interim fee order with M. McGreal (0.2); discuss order with A. Schwartz and M. McGreal (0.3); review and revise order and schedule thereto (2.0); multiple discussions with M. McGreal concerning revisions (0.5); prepare charts of payments due to the various professionals in the case following interim fee hearing (0.6); email to J. Jones regarding same (0.3).
Coco KJ	12/20/12	0.3	Review professionals' fee statements and coordinate filing and service of same.
de Richemont P	12/20/12	0.5	Review and prepare ordinary course professional declaration for filing.
Krause SC	12/20/12	0.2	Emails with A. de Richemont regarding ordinary course professionals retentions.
Resnick BM	12/20/12	0.2	Emails regarding Bryan Cave retention.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Robertson C	12/20/12	1.5	Call with H. Hiznay at Curtis to discuss procedures for filing fee statements moving forward (0.1); email to G. Ford regarding filing of Jackson Kelly's fee statement (0.1); email to D. Silberger and K. Coco regarding pro hac applications (0.1); email to B. Kotliar at Curtis regarding same (0.2); email to professionals regarding filing on Missouri docket (0.1); call with Blackstone regarding monthly fee statement (0.1); emails with L. Peterson regarding filing of E&Y fee statement (0.1); coordinate filing of Jackson Kelly and E&Y fee statements (0.3); email to M. Huebner regarding retained professionals' fees (0.4).
VanWagner AB	12/20/12	0.3	Send professionals' fee statements for service and route internally.
de Richemont P	12/21/12	0.2	Email about ordinary course professional retention.
Krause SC	12/21/12	0.3	Confer with A. VanWagner regarding parties-in-interest and related communication.
de Richemont P	12/26/12	0.2	Email about ordinary course professional retention.
Krause SC	12/26/12	0.4	Emails regarding ordinary course professional retention.
McGreal MM	12/26/12	0.4	Correspondence with A. Wong regarding ordinary course professionals (0.1); correspondence with S. Krause regarding same (0.2); review order regarding ordinary course professionals (0.1).
<b>Total NON-DPW RETENTION</b>		<b>41.0</b>	
<b>NON-WORKING TRAVEL</b>			
Baker HS	12/05/12	6.1	Travel to West Virginia for client meeting.
Baker HS	12/06/12	4.9	Travel from West Virginia to New York after client meetings.
Ravi SK	12/09/12	5.0	Travel from New York, NY to St. Louis, MO for on-site document review.
Reiser CM	12/09/12	6.0	Travel from New York, NY to St. Louis, MO for on-site document review.
Russano MJ	12/11/12	4.7	Travel to St. Louis for client meetings.
Tobak MJ	12/11/12	3.9	Travel from New York to St. Louis for client meeting.
Ravi SK	12/12/12	3.6	Travel from Patriot's office in St. Louis, MO to New York in connection with onsite document review.
Reiser CM	12/12/12	4.1	Travel from Patriot headquarters in St. Louis, MO to New York, NY.
Russano MJ	12/13/12	6.1	Travel to NY returning from client interviews and meetings.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Tobak MJ	12/13/12	4.3	Travel from Patriot Coal offices in St. Louis to New York.
Huebner MS	12/18/12	0.9	Non-working travel to and from final hearing before Judge Chapman.
McGreal MM	12/18/12	1.1	Travel to and from hearing.
Resnick BM	12/18/12	0.9	Travel to and from courthouse.
Robertson C	12/18/12	1.2	Travel to and from bankruptcy hearing.
Starr AT	12/18/12	0.9	Travel to and from bankruptcy hearing.
<b>Total NON-WORKING TRAVEL</b>		<b>53.7</b>	
<b>PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT</b>			
Silberger DM	12/03/12	6.5	Draft memorandum section on 8th Circuit plan structure law (4.9); revise same per K. Coco comments (1.6).
Resnick BM	12/05/12	0.2	Review plan structure issues memo.
Silberger DM	12/05/12	0.3	Turn B. Resnick's comments to plan structure issues memo.
Resnick BM	12/06/12	2.5	Meet with Alix and Blackstone regarding intercompany claim analysis.
Resnick BM	12/07/12	0.3	Call with M. Buschmann regarding intercompany claims analysis (0.2); review intercompany analysis work plan (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/10/12	0.4	Review plan structure issues memo.
Resnick BM	12/11/12	0.2	Call with D. Klein regarding intercompany claim issues.
Resnick BM	12/12/12	0.2	Meet with D. Silberger regarding plan structure issues memo.
Silberger DM	12/12/12	0.2	Meet with B. Resnick regarding revision of plan structure issues.
Resnick BM	12/13/12	0.2	Call with F. Huffard regarding intercompany claim analysis.
Resnick BM	12/14/12	0.3	Discuss intercompany claim analysis with M. McGreal and F. Huffard.
Silberger DM	12/14/12	3.6	Call with M. McGreal regarding expanded scope of memorandum on plan structure issues (0.1); redraft same per conversations with M. McGreal and B. Resnick (3.5).
Silberger DM	12/15/12	7.0	Review research on 8th circuit plan structure law (2.3); revise plan structure issues memorandum to reflect 8th circuit focus (1.4); research 8th circuit plan structure law (3.3).
Silberger DM	12/16/12	2.7	Research 8th Circuit law on plan structure issues.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	12/17/12	1.4	Emails with D. Silberger regarding plan structure issues (0.4); review and comment on memo regarding same (1.0).
Resnick BM	12/17/12	0.3	Call with Blackstone regarding intercompany claim analysis.
Silberger DM	12/17/12	4.9	Revise plan structure issues memorandum.
Coco KJ	12/18/12	0.7	Review and comment on memo regarding plan structure issues.
Silberger DM	12/18/12	0.5	Turn K. Coco's comments to memo on plan structure issues (0.4), generate blacklines and send for review to M. McGreal (0.1).
Silberger DM	12/19/12	0.4	Turn M. McGreal comments to memo (0.3); prepare and send distribution to B. Resnick for review (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/21/12	1.6	Review and revise memo regarding plan structure issues (1.5); discuss same with D. Silberger (0.1).
Silberger DM	12/21/12	2.3	Meet with B. Resnick regarding plan structure issues memo (0.1); revise same per B. Resnick comments (2.2).
Resnick BM	12/22/12	1.7	Review and revise memo regarding plan structure issue (1.5); emails with M. Buschmann regarding plan scenarios (0.2).
<b>Total PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT</b>		<b>38.4</b>	
<b>REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL</b>			
Resnick BM	12/03/12	0.1	Call with R. Verheij regarding Sierra Club settlement approval.
Baker HS	12/04/12	1.3	Review of contract rejection issues (0.8); meet with A. Turner regarding same (0.5).
Turner AE	12/04/12	1.9	Draft email summary of open questions regarding water treatment contract (1.2); discuss water treatment contract with H. Baker and K. Coco (0.7).
Baker HS	12/05/12	0.9	Review of selenium and reclamation issues.
Klein DS	12/05/12	0.4	Coordinate with K. Coco and M. Cimino regarding Mine Safety and Health Administration issues.
Baker HS	12/06/12	8.2	Meet with HCC insurance to review reclamation status.
McGreal MM	12/06/12	0.3	Teleconference with counsel to lessors regarding agreement with Sierra Club.
Resnick BM	12/06/12	0.3	Call with A. Rogoff regarding Sierra Club settlement (0.2); emails with J. Goodchild regarding same (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	12/06/12	2.0	Review documents to amend letter of credit (0.7); telephone A. Libby regarding upcoming objection deadline (0.1); review materials from pension fund (0.3); revise key dates calendar (0.2); telephone H. Baker regarding upcoming objection deadline (0.1); email correspondence regarding letter of credit (0.2); email correspondence regarding objection deadline (0.2); email correspondence regarding selenium call (0.2).
Baker HS	12/07/12	4.0	Review of Credit Agreement (0.6); call with A. Turner and T. Chepiga regarding same (0.5); call with J. Goodchild of Morgan Lewis regarding selenium settlement (0.7); research regarding selenium settlement agreement (0.4); review of Arch presentation materials (1.2); call with J. Goodchild of Morgan Lewis regarding selenium settlement (0.6).
Klein DS	12/07/12	0.3	Coordinate with K. Coco regarding Mine Safety and Health Administration claim issues.
McGreal MM	12/07/12	1.9	Correspondence with counsel to coal lessor regarding potential objection to Sierra Club settlement (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); teleconference with A. McCallister and counsel to coal lessor regarding objection to Sierra Club settlement (0.7); teleconference with A. McCallister regarding objections to Sierra Club settlement (0.2); review and summarize objections to Sierra Club settlement (0.7).
Resnick BM	12/07/12	2.5	Calls with J. Goodchild regarding Sierra Club settlement (0.7); calls with H. Baker and A. Turner regarding same (0.2); review research regarding same (0.9); review objections to Sierra Club settlement (0.3); calls with A. McCallister and R. Verheij regarding Sierra Club issues (0.4).



### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	12/07/12	6.9	Weekly update call with the Company and advisors (0.7); arrange Monday morning call with Morgan Lewis (0.1); email correspondence with H. Baker and K. Coco regarding Pennsylvania water treatment at mine (0.2); draft email to A. McCallister regarding Pennsylvania water treatment at mine (0.2); prepare for call with McGuireWoods regarding selenium settlement (0.4); prepare for call with H. Baker, B. Resnick and J. Goodchild and J. Sokolow of Morgan Lewis regarding selenium settlement (0.1); discuss Pennsylvania water treatment contract with H. Baker (0.1); discuss selenium letter of credit with H. Baker (0.1); compile documents referenced by Morgan Lewis on call (0.3); review Arch agreements for afternoon call with Morgan Lewis regarding selenium settlement (1.4); call with McGuireWoods regarding selenium settlement (0.5); call with H. Baker, B. Resnick and J. Goodchild and J. Sokolow of Morgan Lewis regarding selenium settlement (0.4); review documents to extend selenium letter of credit (0.9); review background selenium documents to respond to Morgan Lewis (0.8); call with H. Baker and T. Chepiga regarding selenium letter of credit (0.3); call with J. Goodchild, H. Baker and B. Resnick regarding selenium settlement (0.3); telephone M. McGreal regarding call with McGuireWoods (0.1).
Baker HS	12/10/12	0.3	Call with Morgan Lewis regarding Arch agreement.
Brenner J	12/10/12	0.1	Review monthly operating report 8-K and discuss same with K. Coco.
McGreal MM	12/10/12	1.0	Teleconferences and emails with counsel to lessors objecting to Sierra Club settlement (0.4); review response to information request from lessor objecting to Sierra Club settlement (0.1); correspondence with A. McCallister regarding same (0.2); revise order approving Sierra Club settlement (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/10/12	0.4	Call with J. Goodchild regarding Sierra Club settlement (0.1); emails regarding various parties' objections and potential objection to same (0.3).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	12/10/12	1.3	Call with J. Goodchild and R. Mauceri of Morgan Lewis regarding objections (0.1); review Lawson Heirs objection to Global Settlement Agreement (0.2); review Southern Land objection to Global Settlement Agreement (0.2); review mine plan summary (0.2); prepare for call with J. Goodchild and R. Mauceri of Morgan Lewis regarding objections (0.4); telephone M. McGreal regarding same (0.1); email correspondence regarding same (0.1).
Brenner J	12/11/12	1.3	Draft 8-K for monthly operating report filing.
Coco KJ	12/11/12	0.5	Review and comment on draft 8-K.
Klesh KJ	12/11/12	0.8	Confer with A. Turner regarding Colver Mine matters.
McGreal MM	12/11/12	0.2	Correspondence with objectors to Sierra Club settlement.
Resnick BM	12/11/12	0.4	Correspondence with A. McCallister regarding Sierra Club settlement language.
Turner AE	12/11/12	2.8	Review Pennsylvania mine contract materials (0.7); email correspondence regarding 10-K review (0.1); email correspondence with K. Klesh regarding Pennsylvania water treatment contract (0.2); prepare for meeting with K. Klesh regarding same (0.9); meet with K. Klesh regarding same (0.8); telephone call with J. Brenner regarding the environmental and regulatory section of the Company's draft 10-K (0.1).
Beshar SE	12/12/12	0.4	Communications regarding 8-K disclosure issues.
Klesh KJ	12/12/12	1.6	Review background documents regarding the Colver Mine (0.5); review latest technical information on Colver Mine from client (0.3); review additional background documents regarding the environmental history of the Colver Mine water treatment arrangement, settlement and assignment of rights under the settlement (0.7); conference with A. Turner regarding potential considerations related to the Colver Mine (0.1).
Libby A	12/12/12	0.2	Locate Pennsylvania mine contract documents and email same to A. Turner.
McGreal MM	12/12/12	0.7	Correspondence with objectors to Sierra Club settlement (0.3); correspondence with A. McCallister regarding same (0.2); revise order approving Sierra Club settlement (0.2).
Resnick BM	12/12/12	0.7	Correspondence with A. McCallister, R. Mead and M. McGreal regarding Sierra Club settlement and objections.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	12/12/12	5.2	Discuss Pennsylvania water treatment contract with K. Klesh (0.1); review historical documents regarding Pennsylvania water treatment contract (0.7); email correspondence regarding Pennsylvania water treatment contract (0.2); set up call regarding same (0.1); review email summary regarding Pennsylvania water output from technical consultant (0.2); review and revise 10-K (3.9).
Agostinho JN	12/13/12	0.3	Discuss 10-K compensation disclosure with R. Aizen.
Brenner J	12/13/12	0.1	Distribute monthly operating report 8-Ks.
Hoeben W	12/13/12	0.5	Call with R. Aizen, J. Tucker and others to discuss proxy disclosure.
Klesh KJ	12/13/12	1.8	Conference with A. Turner regarding next steps following client call regarding the environmental matters at the Colver Mine (0.3); prepare for call with client regarding Colver Mine environmental matters (0.3); participate in call with A. McCallister at the client and A. Turner regarding Colver Mine environmental matters (0.9); review email from K. Coco regarding bankruptcy matters as related to the Colver Mine (0.1); confer with K. Coco regarding Colver Mine issues (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/13/12	0.2	Teleconference with B. Resnick regarding West Virginia motion to modify (0.1); correspondence with objectors to Sierra Club settlement (0.1).
Turner AE	12/13/12	6.5	Review case calendar (0.1); call with K. Coco (0.1); review draft 10-K (3.7); review correspondence regarding assignment of Pennsylvania water treatment contract (0.3); prepare for call regarding Pennsylvania water treatment contract (0.5); prepare for meeting with K. Klesh regarding Pennsylvania contract (0.1); discuss Pennsylvania water treatment contract with K. Klesh (0.3); email correspondence regarding Pennsylvania water treatment contract (0.2); call with A. McCallister, K. Klesh and K. Coco regarding Pennsylvania water treatment contract (0.9); review materials from Jackson Kelly regarding Pennsylvania mine (0.3).
Coco KJ	12/14/12	1.1	Call with A. McCallister regarding environmental settlement and review background documents regarding same.

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klesh KJ	12/14/12	0.4	Confer with A. Turner regarding Colver Mine document review as relevant to environmental matters (0.2); confer with K. Coco regarding bankruptcy questions as relevant to the Colver Mine matter (0.2).
McGreal MM	12/14/12	2.5	Draft talking points for hearing on Sierra Club settlement (2.4); correspondence with objectors to Sierra Club settlement (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/14/12	0.2	Discuss Sierra Club settlement issues with M. McGreal and others.
Turner AE	12/14/12	3.9	Review materials from Jackson Kelly regarding Pennsylvania mine (2.2); weekly update call with Company and advisors (0.6); draft email summary regarding Colver mine issues (1.1).
Resnick BM	12/15/12	0.2	Emails with client regarding Sierra Club settlement motion and related letter of credit.
McGreal MM	12/16/12	1.1	Review and revise talking points for hearing on Sierra Club settlement (0.6); revise Sierra Club settlement joint motion to modify and proposed order (0.5).
Resnick BM	12/16/12	0.3	Review and revise motion to modify and related order.
Baker HS	12/17/12	1.0	Review of 10-K.
McGreal MM	12/17/12	0.4	Review and revise Sierra Club joint motion to modify and proposed order (0.3); correspondence with R. Verheij and B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/17/12	0.3	Review and revise Motion to Modify and Proposed Order.
Turner AE	12/17/12	2.0	Review 10-K and discuss with H. Baker (0.4); review research documents regarding Colver mine in Pennsylvania (1.1); email correspondence regarding same (0.2); discuss same with H. Baker (0.3).
Agostinho JN	12/18/12	0.6	Review 10-K filings for companies that filed for bankruptcy mid-year.
Baker HS	12/18/12	0.9	Meet with A. McCallister regarding contract rejection issues (0.4); prepare for same (0.5).
Beshar SE	12/18/12	0.4	Communications with Company and team regarding 10-K issues.
Brenner J	12/18/12	0.5	Coordinate 10-K review (0.1); review 10-K (0.4).
Turner AE	12/18/12	1.9	Meet with A. McCallister and H. Baker regarding environmental issues (0.4); review draft 10-K environmental disclosure (1.0); review Colver materials (0.4); email correspondence regarding Pennsylvania water treatment contract (0.1).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Agostinho JN	12/19/12	0.1	Prepare email regarding 10-K disclosure for mid-year bankruptcy filers.
Brenner J	12/19/12	0.3	Research Patriot board membership.
Klesh KJ	12/19/12	0.2	Confer with A. Turner on Colver Mine matter status.
McGreal MM	12/19/12	0.3	Revise Sierra Club joint motion to modify and proposed order (0.2); correspondence with A. McCallister and B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Resnick BM	12/19/12	0.3	Emails with Willkie Farr and clients regarding Motion to Modify and related Order (0.2); call with A. McCallister regarding same (0.1).
Turner AE	12/19/12	0.2	Email correspondence regarding Colver mine documents (0.1); review case calendar (0.1).
Agostinho JN	12/20/12	0.6	Research regarding 10-K and 10-K/A filings for mid-year bankruptcy filers.
Agostinho JN	12/21/12	0.4	Summarize 10-K filings for other companies in bankruptcy for J. Tucker.
Turner AE	12/21/12	1.2	Email correspondence regarding subsidence (0.1); review materials from Jackson Kelly regarding Pennsylvania mine (0.3); weekly update call with the Company and advisors (0.7); update H. Baker regarding same (0.1).
Turner AE	12/26/12	1.9	Email correspondence regarding subsidence claims (0.2); discuss with H. Baker (0.1); discuss with D. Klein (0.1); legal research applicability of stay to subsidence fund (1.5).
Baker HS	12/27/12	0.6	Meet with K. Klesh and A. Turner regarding contract issues.
Klesh KJ	12/27/12	0.8	Confer with H. Baker and A. Turner regarding Colver Mine matter (0.3); confer with A. Turner regarding public research related to the Colver Mine matter in Pennsylvania (0.1); prepare for upcoming call with the Pennsylvania regulators regarding same (0.4).
Turner AE	12/27/12	1.3	Review materials regarding Pennsylvania water treatment contract (0.8); draft email summarizing same (0.4); email correspondence regarding same (0.1).
Klesh KJ	12/28/12	2.1	Review background information related to the Colver Mine matter (0.3); confer with A. Turner regarding review of the documents related to the Colver Mine (0.2); review updated information from A. Turner regarding billing for the Colver Mine (0.3); prepare questions in advance of a call with Pennsylvania regulators (0.8); review study of water seepage rates from the Colver Mine (0.5).

### Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	12/28/12	5.9	Review materials from Jackson Kelly regarding Pennsylvania mine (3.2); case law research regarding applicability of stay (2.4); draft email summary regarding same (0.2); email correspondence regarding same (0.1).
Klesh KJ	12/29/12	2.3	Review background materials related to the Colver Mine matter (0.9); prepare questions and guidance in preparation for an upcoming call with Pennsylvania regulators concerning the settlement agreement arrangement related to the Colver Mine matter (1.2); provide draft to H. Baker for review (0.2).
Baker HS	12/31/12	0.4	Review of notes regarding contract rejection issue.
Klesh KJ	12/31/12	0.8	Review email from H. Baker regarding questions prepared in advance of discussions with Pennsylvania regulators (0.2); update the draft questions and provide draft questions to A. McCallister for review (0.6).
Turner AE	12/31/12	0.5	Review notes for call with Pennsylvania regulators.
<b>Total REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL</b>		<b>96.2</b>	
<b>Total</b>		<b>2,899.4</b>	