

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI**

In re:

**PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, et al.,
Debtors.**

Chapter 11

Case No. 12-51502

(Jointly Administered)

**MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC FOR
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF
MARCH 1, 2013 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2013**

NAME OF APPLICANT:	<u>Step toe & Johnson PLLC</u>
ROLE IN THE CASE:	Special Counsel for the Debtors
TIME PERIOD:	March 1, 2013 through and including March 31, 2013
CURRENT APPLICATION:	Total Fees Requested: \$29,801.00 80% of Fees Requested: \$23,840.80 Total Expenses Requested: \$ 2,769.19

1. In accordance with the *Order To Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262, S.D. NY] (the “**Interim Compensation Order**”), Steptoe & Johnson PLLC (“**Steptoe & Johnson**”), counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the “**Debtors**”), hereby submits its Monthly Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “**Fee Statement**”) for the period of March 1, 2013 through and including March 31, 2013 (the “**Fee Statement Period**”).

2. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Steptoe & Johnson seeks payment of \$26,609.99, representing (a) 80% of Steptoe & Johnson’s fees for services rendered and (b) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred.

3. Attached hereto as “Exhibit A” is a listing of Steptoe & Johnson’s professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively, the “**Steptoe & Johnson Professionals**”), including the hourly rate for each Steptoe & Johnson Professional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Statement Period and the title, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees billed by each Steptoe & Johnson Professional.

4. Attached hereto as “Exhibit B” is a schedule specifying the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Steptoe & Johnson is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

5. Attached hereto as “Exhibit C” is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Steptoe & Johnson during the Fee Statement Period, organized by matter categories.

Such services included:

- General labor and employment advice;
- General tax advice;
- Administrative litigation in front of the Mine Safety and Health Administration;
- Employment litigation;
- Federal administrative litigation in front of the Equal Employment Opportunity Commission;
- State administrative litigation in front of the West Virginia State Human Rights Commission.

6. Attached as “Exhibit D” are the time records of Steptoe & Johnson, which provide a daily summary of the time spent by each Steptoe & Johnson Professional during the Fee Statement Period by matter category.

NOTICE

7. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri 63141, Attn.: Jacquelyn A. Jones, (ii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Missouri, 111 South 10th Street, Suite 6.353, St. Louis, MO 63102, Attn.: Leonora S. Long and Paul A. Randolph, (iii) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn.: Marcia Goldstein and Joseph Smolinsky, and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn.: Margot B. Schonholtz and Ana Alfonso, and (iv) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn.: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq..

8. WHEREFORE, the Debtors respectfully request that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated this 18th day of April, 2013.

By: /s/ C. David Morrison
C. David Morrison
STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC
400 White Oaks Boulevard
Bridgeport, WV 26330-4500
Telephone: (304) 933-8113
Facsimile: (304) 933-8776
Special Counsel for the Debtors

EXHIBIT A

Professionals and Rates

I.A. Members / Of Counsel

Name of Member / Of Counsel	Title	Hourly Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Bryan R. Cokeley	Member	235.00	0.40	94.00
C. David Morrison	Member	235.00	4.70	1104.50
Craig A. Griffith	Of Counsel	205.00	7.40	1517.00
David E. Dick	Member	235.00	1.20	282.00
Jeffrey K. Phillips	Member	220.00	31.50	6930.00
Jonathan R. Ellis	Member	160.00	84.30	13488.00
L. Frederick Williams, Jr.	Member	235.00	1.10	258.50
Mark M. McCarthy	Of Counsel	205.00	3.80	779.00
Michael D. Mullins	Member	205.00	1.10	225.50
Paul A. Konstanty	Member	205.00	2.70	553.50
Rodney L. Bean	Member	235.00	0.90	211.50
Robert L. Bailey	Of Counsel	190.00	16.30	3097.00
TOTAL MEMBERS and OF COUNSEL:			155.40	\$28,540.50

II.A. Associates

Name of Associate	Department	Hourly Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Lauren M. Palmer	Labor - MSHA	\$143.00	2.50	357.50
Mark G. Jeffries	Labor – MSHA	\$160.00	3.90	624.00
W. James O’Brien	Litigation - MSHA	\$150.00	0.90	135.00
TOTAL ASSOCIATES:			7.30	\$1,116.50

III.A. Paraprofessionals

Name of Paraprofessional	Department	Hourly Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Nancy C. Knurek	Litigation Paralegal	\$90.00	1.50	135.00
Fern Medley-Forsythe	Litigation Paralegal	\$90.00	0.10	9.00
TOTAL PARAPROFESSIONALS:			1.60	\$ 144.00

EXHIBIT B

Expenses

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED BY
STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC ON BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS

CATEGORY of EXPENSES	AMOUNTS
Computer research	117.97
Office charges (photocopies, scanning, long distance calls, etc.)	86.03
Outside document retrieval	2473.80
Postage, courier and freight	34.32
Travel	56.50
TOTAL	\$2,768.62

EXHIBIT C

Summary of Project Code

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED
BY STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Labor Matters	4.30	1010.50
Catenary Train Derailment	2.70	553.50
Sales & Severance Tax Audit	7.80	1614.00
Logan v. Speed Mining, <i>et al.</i>	0.40	94.00
Burns v. Patriot Coal, <i>et al.</i>	2.00	470.00
Grand Eagle Mining / Cinda Croft EEOC Charge	0.20	47.00
Research & Development Tax Credit Appeal	0.70	161.50
Blankenship v. Brody Mining	0.40	79.50
Coen / Sunnyhill – Heritage Workers Compensation Matter	3.80	779.00
Qualls EEOC Charge	3.90	624.00
MSHA – General	5.20	832.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #171195)	3.90	858.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #168620)	0.50	80.00
Grand Eagle Mining (MSHA Case #142097)	0.10	22.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #172201)	0.10	16.00
Freedom Mine Accident Investigation (MSHA Case #195018)	4.20	924.00
Harris No. 1 Mine (MSHA Case #195547)	0.20	32.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #187706)	0.20	44.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #191184)	0.40	64.00
Ohio County Coal (MSHA Case #215176)	0.40	88.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #211084)	0.40	88.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #216244)	0.10	22.00
Grand Eagle Mining (MSHA Case #218390)	0.10	22.00
Rivers Edge Mining (MSHA Case #195562)	0.30	48.00
Rivers Edge Mining (MSHA Case #201969)	0.10	16.00
Rivers Edge Mining (MSHA Case #199003)	0.20	32.00
Rivers Edge Mining (MSHA Case #207476)	0.10	16.00
Rivers Edge Mining (MSHA Case #204739)	0.10	16.00
Ohio County Coal (MSHA Case #8501317)	0.10	22.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #189530)	0.10	22.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #198597)	0.40	88.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #201631)	0.30	66.00

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #204392)	0.60	132.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #249029)	0.10	22.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #243492)	0.10	22.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #230242)	0.80	176.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #227048)	0.30	66.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #231678)	0.10	22.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #246300)	0.20	44.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #247937)	0.30	66.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #249360)	0.20	32.00
Blue Creek No. 2 Mine (MSHA Case #261206)	0.40	64.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #254608)	0.10	22.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #257718)	0.10	22.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #260304)	0.50	110.00
Gateway Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #268444)	0.30	48.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #263281)	0.30	66.00
Blue Creek No. 2 (MSHA Case #274408)	3.30	528.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #275179)	1.40	224.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #274746)	0.10	22.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #256455)	0.40	88.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #236711)	0.30	66.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #276338)	0.20	44.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #273440)	0.20	44.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #261844)	0.40	88.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #259184)	0.30	66.00
Pruitt Discrimination Case #2	0.10	22.00
Campbells Creek No. 7 (MSHA Case #280072)	0.20	32.00
MSHA Contest – Oil Well – Freedom Mine	0.10	22.00
Gateway Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #281814)	0.40	64.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #280731)	0.10	16.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #282102)	0.20	32.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #283385)	0.20	32.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #285374)	0.30	48.00
American Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #286172)	14.70	2352.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #286437)	0.40	64.00

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
American Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #288468)	1.30	208.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #277675)	0.20	44.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #281671)	0.30	66.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #279236)	0.30	66.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #282477)	0.10	22.00
Federal No. 2 (MSHA Case #288463)	1.20	183.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #280351)	0.10	22.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #281671)	0.40	88.00
American Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #284555)	1.00	160.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #292179)	0.70	112.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #282970)	0.10	22.00
Dodge Hill Immediate Notification	0.10	22.00
Gateway Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #291126)	1.00	160.00
Farley Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #291118)	1.30	208.00
American Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #293996)	4.60	736.00
Jarvis Discrimination Suit (MADI-CD-2012-19)	0.10	22.00
Farley Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #293993)	1.10	176.00
Federal No. 2 ((MSHA Case #293992)	2.80	448.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #294007)	0.90	144.00
Dodge Hill Continuous Miner Citations	0.10	22.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #296918)	0.10	22.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #295104)	0.10	16.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #288592)	0.10	22.00
Peerless Rachel Mine (MSHA Case #298098)	1.20	192.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #288475)	0.10	16.00
Dodge Hill Mine #1 (MSHA Case #291263)	0.20	44.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #302493)	0.80	128.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #300547)	0.20	32.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #291748)	0.10	22.00
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #302491)	0.50	80.00
Camp 9 Prep Plant (MSHA Case #295409)	0.10	22.00
Dodge Hill Mine #1 (MSHA Case #294648)	0.10	22.00
Dodge Hill Mine #1 (MSHA Case #294118)	0.10	22.00
Dodge Hill Mine #1 (MSHA Case #299605)	0.10	22.00

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #300098)	1.60	352.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #270710)	0.30	66.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #267836)	0.60	132.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #284667)	0.30	66.00
Coalburg No. 1 Mine (MSHA Case #300799)	0.60	96.00
Eagle No. 1 Mine (MSHA Case #303942)	0.40	64.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #303681)	0.60	96.00
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #301677)	0.10	16.00
Section 105 Discrimination / John Cambron	0.20	44.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #290515)	0.40	88.00
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #303681)	0.40	64.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #305751)	0.20	44.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #289040)	0.20	44.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #287850)	0.60	132.00
Campbells Creek #10 Mine (MSHA Case #308065)	3.40	501.50
Rocklick Prep Plant (MSHA Case #285361)	0.30	48.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #308985)	3.10	496.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #306579)	3.40	544.00
MSHA & WVOMHS&T Investigation / Five Mile Plant	37.50	6427.50
Petition for Modification of Existing Standard	0.70	148.00
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #308615)	0.90	198.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #308168)	0.50	110.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #305751)	0.60	132.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #302632)	0.50	110.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #310776)	1.20	264.00
Harris Prep Plant (MSHA Case #288464)	0.10	16.00
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #307007)	0.20	32.00
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #308069)	0.70	112.00
Highland 105(c) Case (MADI-CD-2013-11)	4.30	946.00
Blue Creek No. 1 (MSHA Case #310934)	2.90	464.00
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #309494)	0.50	80.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #311653)	2.20	352.00
Campbells Creek No. 10 Mine (MSHA Case #310669)	0.50	80.00
Rocklick Plant – MSHA 110(c) Investigation	0.90	144.00

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Peerless Rachel Mine (MSHA Case #311865)	0.50	80.00
TOTAL HOURS and COMPENSATION REQUESTED:	164.30	\$29,801.00

EXHIBIT D

Time Records

Pg 17 of 43
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
LABOR MATTERS			
03/07/13	R Bean	.90	Review email from client re: FMLA issue involving employee with intermittent leave certification; review med cert documents and medical slips for employee; review FMLA regulations regarding recertification rights; telephone conference with client re: same
03/11/13	C Morrison	.20	Telephone conference with client re: possible religious discrimination issue
03/12/13	C Morrison	.60	Review proposed policy on wearing jewelry; revise policy
03/12/13	C Morrison	.20	Draft e-mail to client re: explaining changes to the policy on wearing jewelry
03/13/13	D Dick	.90	Call from client re: absence of employee from work
03/19/13	C Morrison	.20	Review e-mail from client re: possible discipline of employee
03/25/13	D Dick	.30	Email string from client re: employee's FMLA absences and getting recert; respond to client re: same
03/27/13	C Morrison	.20	Review documents re: the discipline of an employee and e-mail to client re: same
03/28/13	C Morrison	.20	Telephone conference with client re: employees who are ready to return to work from workers' compensation leave
03/28/13	C Morrison	.20	Draft e-mail to client re: language to use in letters to employees
03/28/13	C Morrison	.10	Review e-mail from client re: the interaction between the Workers' Compensation Act and the collective bargaining agreement
03/28/13	C Morrison	.30	Review statute and respond to e-mail from client
TOTAL HOURS:		4.30	
CATENARY TRAIN DERAILMENT			
03/01/13	P Konstanty	2.00	Review of historical investigative material in preparation for planning and strategy conference call with client
03/05/13	P Konstanty	.70	Telephone conference with client representatives re: potential resolution of derailment claims
TOTAL HOURS:		2.70	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
------------------	--------------------	--------------	------------------

SALES & SEVERANCE TAX AUDIT

03/06/13	L Williams, J	.20	Telephone conference with Tax Department attorney
03/07/13	L Williams, J	.30	Participation in status conference with Tax Department officials and Office of Tax Appeals
03/08/13	C Griffith	5.20	Research West Virginia's statutory and regulatory framework re: various issues raised on the severance tax issue
03/11/13	C Griffith	2.10	Research various aspects of the West Virginia State Tax Department's sales tax and severance tax audit of Patriot and its subsidiaries
TOTAL HOURS:		7.80	

LOGAN v. SPEED MINING, et al.

03/27/13	B Cokeley	.20	Review stipulation on lifting the automatic stay and transmittal with comments to clients
03/27/13	B Cokeley	.20	Confer with Mr. Waller and Ms. Hardy re: automatic stay being lifted
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	

BURNS v PATRIOT COAL, et al.

03/14/13	C Morrison	.20	Review motion to lift stay and other e-mails associated therewith
03/15/13	C Morrison	.30	Review letter from Chartis re: insurance coverage
03/15/13	C Morrison	.20	Draft letter to Chartis re: insurance coverage
03/15/13	C Morrison	.10	Draft e-mail to client re: insurance coverage
03/15/13	C Morrison	.20	Review e-mail from Chartis and respond
03/15/13	C Morrison	.20	Review motion for relief from stay to allow civil litigation to proceed
03/18/13	C Morrison	.10	Draft e-mail to client representatives re: motion to lift stay and review response from Chartis representative
03/19/13	C Morrison	.20	Review e-mail from client and letter to Chartis representative re: the relationship between Patriot and Pine Ridge Coal
03/22/13	C Morrison	.30	Telephone conference with Chartis representative re: the motion to lift the stay

Pg 19 of 43
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
03/22/13	C Morrison	.20	Telephone conference with client re: the motion to lift the stay

TOTAL HOURS: 2.00

GRAND EAGLE MINING / CINDA CROFT EEOC CHARGE

03/11/13	C Morrison	.10	Review signed settlement agreement and draft e-mail to client re: same
03/11/13	C Morrison	.10	Draft letter to attorney Berger re: settlement agreement

TOTAL HOURS: 0.20

RESEARCH & DEVELOPMENT TAX CREDIT APPEAL

03/05/13	L Williams, J	.30	Participation in status conference with Office of Tax Appeals
03/05/13	C Griffith	.10	Join telephonic status conference with West Virginia Office of Tax Appeals regarding the Tax Department's denial of Patriot's research and development tax credit claim
03/27/13	L Williams, J	.30	Review of emails and additional information regarding tax credit appeal

TOTAL HOURS: 0.70

BLANKENSHIP v. BRODY MINING, LLC

03/11/13	C Morrison	.10	Review agreed order appointing mediator
03/19/13	C Morrison	.10	Review plaintiff's initial disclosures
03/19/13	C Morrison	.10	Draft e-mail to client and to associate Fassio re: the initial disclosures
03/27/13	F Medley-Fors	.10	Draft interrogatories and requests for production to plaintiff

TOTAL HOURS: 0.40

COEN / SUNNYHILL - HERITAGE WC MATTER

03/05/13	M McCarthy	.30	Review Coen appeal, conference with Kathy Fink regarding medical payments, update file, correspond to Larry Boggess regarding medical payments, update file
03/19/13	M McCarthy	3.50	Prepare for and attend IC hearing in Logan

TOTAL HOURS: 3.80

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
QUALLS EEOC CHARGE			
03/07/13	M Jeffries	.20	Review Notice of Charge of Discrimination
03/11/13	M Jeffries	.20	Call to client re: fact investigation and requested materials for Position Statement
03/15/13	M Jeffries	.50	Contact client re: discovery documents
03/19/13	M Jeffries	.20	Call to client re: Request for Information and documents needed for Position Statement
03/20/13	M Jeffries	.60	Draft Notice of Appearance and request for extension of time to answer charge
03/20/13	M Jeffries	.10	Call and e-mail to EEOC with Notice of Appearance and to request extension of time to respond
03/20/13	M Jeffries	.50	Review email from client re: information needed for EEOC request for information and respond to same
03/22/13	M Jeffries	.40	Call to client re: request for information
03/25/13	M Jeffries	.70	Review email and documents from client re: persons hired during time period of charge
03/27/13	M Jeffries	.50	Review email and documents from client re: discovery and Position Statement and email client with additional questions regarding same
TOTAL HOURS:		3.90	
MSHA - GENERAL			
03/26/13	J Ellis	.80	Draft MSHA quarterly reports
03/28/13	J Ellis	1.80	Work on MSHA quarterly reports
03/29/13	J Ellis	2.60	Work on MSHA quarterly reports
TOTAL HOURS:		5.20	
HIGHLAND MINING - KENT 2009-491 MSHA CASE #171195			
03/13/13	J Phillips	1.80	Engage in settlement negotiations in KENT 2009-490
03/15/13	J Phillips	.70	Letter from ALJ William Moran re: hearing; engage in settlement negotiations; draft email to client representatives re: settlement terms in KENT 2009-490
03/22/13	J Phillips	.50	Engage in settlement negotiations
03/25/13	J Phillips	.70	Engage in settlement negotiations

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
03/26/13	J Phillips	.20	Finalize settlement terms in KENT 2009-491
TOTAL HOURS:		3.90	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2009-508/509 - MSHA CASE #168620			
03/05/13	J Ellis	.40	Calls and emails from Judge Bulluck's law clerk Steve Spitzer re: mediating settlement; email with client re: settlement
03/18/13	J Ellis	.10	Draft email to attorney Amos Pressler re: status of settlement documents on WEVA 2009-508
TOTAL HOURS:		0.50	
GRAND EAGLE MINING - KENT 2008-785 - MSHA CASE #142097			
03/22/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2009-594 & 595 - MSHA CASE #172201 (Eastern Associated Coal)			
03/18/13	J Ellis	.10	Email to attorney Jessica Allen re: status of settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FREEDOM MINE ACCIDENT INVESTIGATION - KENT 2009-1519- MSHA CASE #195018			
03/22/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/27/13	J Phillips	1.60	Receive and review lengthy settlement motion and order from solicitor Malia Lawson; review settlement documents and identify error in MSHA's calculation of payment; draft email to solicitor M. Lawson re: error; draft email to clients re: settlement documents
03/28/13	J Phillips	.20	Further revisions to MSHA's proposed settlement agreement documents
03/29/13	J Phillips	2.30	Review and revise most recent submission of "global settlement agreement;" Work through disputes concerning language and terms; emails from and to client re: final approval for joint settlement agreement and order approving global settlement agreement
TOTAL HOURS:		4.20	

Pg 22 of 43
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
HARRIS NO. 1 MINE - WEVA 2010-11 & 12 - MSHA CASE #195547			
03/04/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with client re: settlement order on WEVA 2010-11; email to Judge Rae's law clerk Maggie Palmer re: settlement order on WEVA 2010-11
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
HIGHLAND MINING - KENT 2009-1241 - MSHA #187706			
03/22/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2009-1744 - MSHA Case #191184			
03/28/13	J Ellis	.40	Draft settlement counterproposal; emails with attorney Amundson re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
OHIO COUNTY COAL - MSHA CASE #215176			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft settlement language for the global settlement motion concerning KENT 2010-1122
03/22/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
HIGHLAND MINING - KENT 2010-732 MSHA Case #211084			
03/01/13	J Phillips	.30	Review settlement documents submitted by solicitor A. Wyatt; draft email to solicitor A. Wyatt with suggested revisions to settlement documents
03/22/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
HIGHLAND MINING - KENT 2010-979 - MSHA CASE #216244			
03/22/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
GRAND EAGLE MINING - KENT 2010-1124- MSHA CASE #218390			
03/22/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	

Pg 23 of 43
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
RIVERS EDGE MINING - WEVA 2010-13 & 14 (MSHA CASE #195562)			
03/26/13	J Ellis	.30	Prepare for and attend status conference call with Judge Steele re: additions needed to settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
RIVERS EDGE MINING - WEVA 2010-287 - MSHA CASE #201969			
03/18/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review revised proposed settlement Documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
RIVERS EDGE MINING - WEVA 2010-147 - MSHA CASE #199003			
03/11/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Nadia Hafeez re: denial of motion to approve settlement and request from Judge to provide additional factual support
03/18/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review revised proposed settlement Documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
RIVERS EDGE MINING - WEVA 2010-542 - MSHA CASE #207476			
03/18/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review revised proposed settlement Documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
RIVERS EDGE MINING - WEVA 2010-480 - MSHA CASE #204739			
03/18/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review revised proposed settlement Documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
OHIO COUNTY COAL - KENT 2011-573-R - MSHA CASE #8501317			
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2009-1330 - MSHA CASE #189530			
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2010-83 - MSHA 198597			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.40	Draft language for global settlement document related to KENT 2010-83
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	

Pg 21 of 43
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2010-221 - MSHA CASE #201631			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft language for global settlement agreement related to KENT 2010-221
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2010-375 - MSHA CASE #204392			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.50	Work on global settlement documents for this docket
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.60	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-805 - MSHA CASE #249029			
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-544/545 - MSHA CASE #243492			
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2010-1617 - MSHA CASE #230242			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.70	Draft settlement motion language re: KENT 2010-1617 for inclusion in global settlement agreement
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.80	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2010-1451/1452 - MSHA CASE #227048			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft language for global settlement agreement related to KENT 2010-1451 and KENT 2010-1452
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2010-1632 - MSHA CASE #231678			
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-699/700 - MSHA CASE #246300			
03/05/13	J Phillips	.20	Letter from ALJ Zane Gill with order approving settlement; draft email to client outlining payment obligations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2011-746/747 - MSHA CASE #247937			
03/05/13	J Phillips	.30	Engage in global settlement agreement; draft email to solicitor M. Lawson explaining defenses supporting reductions to assessed penalty
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2011-1338 - MSHA CASE #249360			
03/11/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order approving settlement; draft email to client re: settlement order
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
BLUE CREEK NO. 2 MINE - WEVA 2011-2211 - MSHA #261206 (Midland Trail Energy)			
03/22/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails from judge's law clerk and attorney Anh LyJordan re: filing of settlement documents
03/29/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order approving settlement; draft email to client re: citation modifications
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-1164/1165 - MSHA CASE #254608			
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-1296/1297- MSHA CASE #257718			
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-1359/1360- MSHA #260304 (Highland Mining)			
03/05/13	J Phillips	.40	Attend ALJ conference call; draft email to client re: trial
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.50	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
GATEWAY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-125 - MSHA #268444 (Gateway Eagle Coal)			
03/11/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review order approving settlement; draft email to client outlining order modifications
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-1483 - MSHA CASE #263281			
03/01/13	J Phillips	.10	Emails from Judge J. Bulluck's law clerk and solicitor T. Motzny re: settlement negotiations
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/22/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from ALJ Jacqueline Bullock with notice of hearing
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
BLUE CREEK NO. 2 MINE - WEVA 2012-486 - MSHA CASE #274408			
03/04/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails from attorney Elaine Abdoveis and Judge Simonton re: status update
03/05/13	J Ellis	.50	Receive MSHA's counterproposal and draft a response
03/06/13	J Ellis	.10	Emails with attorney Elaine Abdoveis re: discovery issues
03/14/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from attorney Elaine Abdoveis re: settlement counterproposal
03/19/13	J Ellis	1.80	Receive and review Inspector Denny Hughes's inspection notes for day of inspection and preceding 30 days
03/26/13	J Ellis	.60	Emails with attorney Elaine Abdoveis re: settlement negotiations; attention to settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		3.30	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-534 & 533 - MSHA CASE #275179			
03/28/13	J Ellis	1.40	Attention to settlement negotiations on WEVA 2012-533; draft email to attorney Ahn LyJordan re: settlement negotiations on WEVA 2012-533; draft settlement counterproposal on WEVA 2012-534; emails with attorney James McClammer re: settlement negotiations on WEVA 2012-534
TOTAL HOURS:		1.40	

Pg 27 of 43
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2012-442 - MSHA CASE #274746			
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2011-1213 - MSHA #256455 (Ohio County Coal)			
03/05/13	J Phillips	.30	Finalize global settlement agreement terms; emails from and to solicitor M. Lawson re: needs for motion to approve settlement
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2011-262 - MSHA CASE #236711			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft factual basis for resolution to include in global settlement agreement
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-652 - MSHA CASE #276338			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief R. Lesnick with assignment to ALJ Thomas McCarthy
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-656 - MSHA CASE #273440			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief Lesnick with assignment to ALJ Thomas McCarthy
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2011-1478 - MSHA CASE #261844			
03/05/13	J Phillips	.30	Outline defenses to solicitor M. Lawson for inclusion in motion to approve global settlement
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2011-1362 - MSHA CASE #259184			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.20	Work on settlement document for portion of global settlement related to KENT 2011-1362

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
PRUITT DISCRIMINATION CASE NO. 2			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
CAMPBELLS CREEK # 7 MINE - WEVA 2012-759/760 - MSHA CASE #280072			
03/22/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails from CLR and Judge Lesnick's law clerk Kristin Abramson re: status of settlement documents on WEVA 2012-759
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
MSHA CONTEST - OIL WELL (Freedom Mine)			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
GATEWAY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-939 - MSHA #281814 (Eastern Associated Coal)			
03/26/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails from attorney McClammer re: status of settlement negotiations
03/28/13	J Ellis	.20	Draft settlement counterproposal to attorney McClammer
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-807 - MSHA CASE #280731			
03/05/13	J Ellis	.10	Email with client re: settlement
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-896 - MSHA CASE #282102			
03/04/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order approving settlement of WEVA 2012-896; draft email to client re: settlement terms on WEVA 2012-896
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-997/998 - MSHA CASE #283385			
03/26/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order of assignment and pre-hearing on WEVA 2012-998; draft email to client re: case assignment
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
-----------	-------------	-------	-----------

BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-1130 - MSHA CASE #285374

03/04/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review order approving settlement of WEVA 2012-1130; draft email to client re: settlement terms on WEVA 2012-1130
----------	---------	-----	---

TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
--------------	--	------	--

AMERICAN EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1131 - MSHA CASE #286172

03/01/13	J Ellis	.80	Call with client re: status of settlement negotiations; email to attorney Alan Kelly re: settlement proposal
----------	---------	-----	--

03/04/13	J Ellis	5.40	Attention to settlement negotiations; work on settlement proposal to MSHA; work on discovery responses
----------	---------	------	--

03/05/13	J Ellis	3.20	Research on orders issued for water in escapeways and on orders issued for examinations violations; work on settlement proposal to MSHA
----------	---------	------	---

03/15/13	J Ellis	2.70	Work on settlement counterproposal
----------	---------	------	------------------------------------

03/19/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with attorney Alan Kelly re: settlement negotiations
----------	---------	-----	---

03/22/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Brittany Smith re: status conference with Judge Steele
----------	---------	-----	---

03/25/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with attorney Alan Kelly re: MSHA's last settlement proposal
----------	---------	-----	---

03/26/13	J Ellis	2.10	Emails with attorney Kelly re: status conference call; prepare for and attend status conference call with Judge Steele; attention to settlement negotiations
----------	---------	------	--

TOTAL HOURS:		14.70	
--------------	--	-------	--

WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-1141/1142 - MSHA CASE #286437

03/04/13	J Ellis	.40	Receive and review order approving settlement of WEVA 2012-1141; draft email to client re: settlement terms on WEVA 2012-1141; receive and review order approving settlement of WEVA 2012-1142; draft email to client re: settlement terms on WEVA 2012-1142
----------	---------	-----	--

TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
--------------	--	------	--

AMERICAN EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1286/1287 - MSHA #288468 (Speed Mining)

03/01/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with attorney Matt Babbington re: settlement negotiations on WEVA 2012-1286
----------	---------	-----	--

03/08/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Matt Babbington re: drafting of
----------	---------	-----	--

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
			settlement documents on WEVA 2012-1286
03/19/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review proposed settlement documents on WEVA 2012-1286; email from attorney Matt Babbington to Judge Steele re: settlement
03/21/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review proposed settlement documents on WEVA 2012-1287
03/27/13	J Ellis	.30	Email from Kim Southern re: filing of settlement documents on WEVA 2012-1287; emails with attorney Matt Babbington and Judge Steele's law clerk Moshe Marvit re: additional information needed in proposed settlement documents on WEVA 2012-1286
03/28/13	J Ellis	.10	Email to Judge Steele's law clerk Moshe Marvit re: proposed settlement documents on WEVA 2012-1287
TOTAL HOURS:		1.30	
HIGHLAND #9 MINE - KENT 2012-591 - MSHA CASE #277675			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-777 - MSHA CASE #281671			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft language for global settlement agreement concerning KENT 2012-777
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-665 - MSHA CASE #279236			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft language for global settlement agreement related to KENT 2012-665
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2012-779 - MSHA CASE #282477			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FEDERAL NO. 2 MINE - WEVA 2012-1195/1196 - MSHA #288463 (Eastern Associated Coal)			
03/05/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from attorney Shah re: status of settlement negotiations

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
03/08/13	W O'Brien	.90	Review citations, discovery requests and settlement proposals in preparation for conference call with client
03/19/13	J Ellis	.20	Draft email to Gary McHenry re: discovery responses
TOTAL HOURS:		1.20	
HIGHLAND #9 MINE - KENT 2012-644 - MSHA CASE #280351			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-788 - MSHA CASE #281671			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft language for global settlement agreement
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
AMERICAN EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-999 - MSHA #284555 (Speed Mining)			
03/01/13	J Ellis	.10	Emails with attorney Ben Chaykin re: status of discovery responses
03/06/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with attorney Ben Chaykin re: settlement negotiations
03/07/13	J Ellis	.50	Attention to settlement negotiations; emails with attorney Ben Chaykin re: settlement negotiations
03/11/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with attorney Ben Chaykin re: potential settlement
TOTAL HOURS:		1.00	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-1473 - MSHA CASE #292179			
03/08/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from CLR re: case status
03/31/13	J Ellis	.60	Draft email to client re: status of settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.70	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2012-872 - MSHA CASE #282970			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
DODGE HILL IMMEDIATE NOTIFICATION			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
GATEWAY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1454 - MSHA CASE #291126			
03/13/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails from CLR Kelly Accord and Brittany Tofinchio re: status update to ALJ
03/25/13	J Ellis	.20	Email to client re: status of settlement negotiations
03/29/13	J Ellis	.60	Call with client re: information for settlement proposal; draft settlement counterproposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.00	
FARLEY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1452 - MSHA CASE #291118			
03/11/13	J Ellis	.20	Work on settlement proposal
03/25/13	J Ellis	.30	Email to client re: status of settlement negotiations
03/29/13	J Ellis	.80	Call with client re: information for settlement proposal; draft settlement counterproposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.30	
AMERICAN EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1579 - MSHA CASE #293996			
03/07/13	J Ellis	.70	Attention to settlement negotiations; emails with attorney Daniel Povich re: settlement negotiations
03/08/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with CLR re: settlement negotiations
03/11/13	J Ellis	.30	Draft settlement counterproposal on WEVA 2012-1578
03/12/13	J Ellis	2.80	Attention to settlement negotiations on WEVA 2012-1578; research re: unwarrantable failure orders for rock dusting
03/15/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order of assignment and pre-hearing order on WEVA 2012-1578
03/28/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review proposed settlement documents on WEVA 2012-1579
03/29/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Kim Southern re: filing of settlement documents on WEVA 2012-1579
TOTAL HOURS:		4.60	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
JARVIS DISCRIMINATION SUIT / MADI-CD-2012-19			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FARLEY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1577 - MSHA CASE #293993			
03/11/13	J Ellis	.20	Work on settlement proposal
03/25/13	J Ellis	.30	Email to client re: status of settlement negotiations
03/29/13	J Ellis	.60	Call with client re: information for settlement proposal; draft settlement counterproposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.10	
FEDERAL NO. 2 MINE - WEVA 2012-1575 & 1576 - MSHA #293992 (Eastern Associated Coal)			
03/05/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from attorney Keyur Shah re: status of settlement negotiations
03/11/13	J Ellis	2.60	Draft settlement proposal on WEVA 2012-1576; work on responses to requests for admission on WEVA 2012-1575
03/21/13	J Ellis	.10	Email to client re: discovery responses
TOTAL HOURS:		2.80	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-1580 - MSHA CASE #294007			
03/08/13	J Ellis	.70	Receive and review settlement counterproposal from MSHA; emails with client re: settlement negotiations
03/12/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails to and from CLR re: settlement negotiations; email from CLR to Judge Steele re: settlement
TOTAL HOURS:		0.90	
DODGE HILL CONTINUOUS MINER CITATIONS			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FREEDOM MINE - MSHA CASE #296918 (Ohio County Coal)			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-1661 - MSHA CASE #295104			
03/04/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Kim Southern re: filing of proposed settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2012-1152 - MSHA CASE #288592			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
PEERLESS RACHEL MINE - WEVA 2012-1727 - MSHA CASE #298098			
03/07/13	J Ellis	.30	Attention to settlement negotiations
03/20/13	J Ellis	.80	Calls and emails with attorney Caroline Hong re: settlement discussions; email from Caroline Hong to Judge Gill re: status update; draft email to client re: status of settlement negotiations
03/26/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from client re: response to Secretary's settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.20	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-1192 - MSHA CASE #288475			
03/04/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Kim Southern re: filing of proposed settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2012-1265 - MSHA #291263			
03/09/13	J Phillips	.10	Email from law clerk Moshe Marvit re: settlement negotiations
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2013-90 - MSHA CASE #302493			
03/08/13	J Ellis	.70	Receive and review inspector notes
03/26/13	J Ellis	.10	Email to client re: information needed for settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.80	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2013-86 - MSHA CASE #300547			
03/28/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with CLR re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
HIGHLAND #9 MINE - KENT 2012-1277 - MSHA CASE #291748			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2013-114 - MSHA #302491 (Gateway Eagle Coal)			
03/28/13	J Ellis	.50	Emails with CLR re: settlement negotiations on WEVA 2013-114; emails and calls with client re: status of settlement negotiations on WEVA 2013-114
TOTAL HOURS:		0.50	
CAMP 9 PREP PLANT - KENT 2012-1437 - MSHA #295409 (Heritage Coal)			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2012-1408 - MSHA #294648 (Highland Mining)			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2012-1407 - MSHA CASE #294118			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2013-13 - MSHA #299605			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-14 - MSHA CASE #300098			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/28/13	J Phillips	1.00	Work on settlement proposal
03/29/13	J Phillips	.50	Finalize settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.60	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-296 - MSHA CASE #270710			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft language for the global settlement agreement related to KENT 2012-296
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-134 - MSHA CASE #267836			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft language for inclusion in global settlement agreement
03/18/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief R. Lesnick with order of assignment to ALJ Thomas McCarthy
03/19/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.60	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-980 - MSHA CASE #284667			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft language for global settlement agreement
03/19/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
COALBURG NO. 1 MINE - WEVA 2013-83 - MSHA CASE #300799			
03/22/13	J Ellis	.60	Draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		0.60	
EAGLE NO. 1 MINE - WEVA 2013-227 - MSHA CASE #303942			
03/08/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review proposed settlement documents
03/27/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Kim Southern re: filing of settlement documents
03/28/13	J Ellis	.10	Email to Judge Steele's law clerk Moshe Marvit re: proposed settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2013-230 - MSHA CASE #303681			
03/11/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with CLR re: settlement
03/12/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from CLR re: settlement; emails from CLR and Judge Moran re: settlement
03/21/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review proposed settlement documents
03/29/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Kim Southern re: filing of settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.60	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2013-85 - MSHA CASE #301677			
03/15/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from attorney Ron Gurka re: status update to Judge Bulluck
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
SECTION 105 DISCRIMINATION / JOHN CAMBRON - MADI-CD-2013-5			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-1292 - MSHA CASE #290515			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/19/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft factual basis for resolution for inclusion in global settlement document
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2013-117 - MSHA CASE #303681			
03/20/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with Steve Spitzer re: reassignment of Sugar Maple dockets to Judge Bulluck
03/27/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order of reassignment and pre-hearing order
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
J			
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2013-261 - MSHA CASE #305751			
03/19/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2012-1170 - MSHA CASE #289040			
03/18/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-1111 - MSHA CASE #287850 (Ohio County Coal)			
03/15/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft language for global settlement agreement
03/18/13	J Phillips	.40	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.60	
CAMPBELLS CREEK #10 MINE - WEVA 2013-356 - MSHA CASE #308065			
03/08/13	J Ellis	.40	Receive and review inspector notes
03/27/13	L Palmer	2.50	Draft Campbell Creek No. 10 Settlement Proposal

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
03/28/13	J Ellis	.50	Draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		3.40	

ROCKLICK PREP PLANT - WEVA 2012-1161 - MSHA CASE #285361

03/15/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order of assignment and prehearing order
03/29/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review notice of substitution of counsel
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	

WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2013-447 - MSHA CASE #308985

03/07/13	J Ellis	2.30	Work on settlement proposal to MSHA
03/25/13	J Ellis	.80	Work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		3.10	

WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2013-371 - MSHA CASE #306579

03/25/13	J Ellis	2.30	Review inspector notes and draft settlement proposal
03/28/13	J Ellis	1.10	Work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		3.40	

MSHA & WVOMHS&T INVESTIGATION OF FIVE MILE PLANT ACCIDENT (Patriot Coal)

03/04/13	J Ellis	2.60	Review and revise prevention and submittal letter to WVOMHST; email to attorney Rife with WVOMHST re: document request; review and revise request for modification of 103(k) order in relation to B press
03/05/13	R Bailey	1.30	Draft memorandum re response to citation re filter press manual
03/05/13	J Ellis	2.80	Emails with client re: prevention and submittal letter to WVOMHST; calls and emails with client re: WVOMHST N.O.V. re: operators manual; calls and emails with WVOMHST re: N.O.V. #122993
03/06/13	R Bailey	1.80	Draft memorandum re response to citation re filter press manual
03/06/13	J Ellis	.60	Calls with client re: hydraulic testing; calls with client re: WVOMHST document request issues; calls and emails with client re: request for modification of 103(k) order issues
03/07/13	R Bailey	1.20	Draft memorandum re response to citation re filter press manual

Pg 39 of 43
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
03/07/13	N Knurek	1.50	Work on 1985 and 2013 WV Code Chapter 22 comparison chart for provisions on contesting n.o.v.'s from the WVOMHST
03/07/13	J Ellis	1.80	Calls and emails with client re: hydraulic testing; attention to potential expedited contest of n.o.v. relating to production of manuals
03/08/13	R Bailey	4.60	Draft memorandum re response to denial of petition for modification of 103(k) order
03/08/13	J Ellis	2.80	Emails with client re: request for modification 12 to the 103(k) order; attention to possible challenge to 103(k) order; research re: 103(k) order challenges
03/11/13	R Bailey	3.30	Draft memorandum re response to denial of petition for modification of 103(k) order
03/11/13	J Ellis	2.10	Review various reports on presses and facilities; research on 103(k) modification challenges
03/12/13	M Mullins	.40	Research regarding MSHA's preliminary report
03/12/13	M Mullins	.20	Call from client regarding fact investigation
03/12/13	J Ellis	.80	Attention to issues relating ultrasound testing of other presses; email to Vince Nicolau and Bill Tucker re: transcripts of witness interviews
03/14/13	R Bailey	3.90	Draft memorandum re response to denial of petition for modification of 103(k) order
03/18/13	M Mullins	.10	Correspondence to and from Townsend's counsel regarding request to allow expert to inspect property
03/18/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails to Vince Nicolau and Bill Tucker re: transcripts from witness interviews
03/20/13	J Ellis	1.20	Receive and review letter from MSHA to Tons Per Hour; emails from client re: MSHA letter to Tons Per Hour; receive and review notes re: Jingjin
03/21/13	M Mullins	.10	Correspondence from client regarding expert for tons per hour
03/21/13	M Mullins	.10	Correspondence to claimant's attorney regarding expert investigation of machine
03/21/13	J Ellis	1.10	Emails with client re: site inspection; receive and review Constellation Technology's report

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
03/22/13	M Mullins	.20	Call from client regarding fact investigation
03/22/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with client re: preservation of information
03/26/13	J Ellis	1.20	Emails with clients re: meeting with MSHA, report from Constellation Technology, return of materials from Constellation Technology; call with Frank Dulin re: report from Constellation Technology; email Vince Nicolau (MSHA) and Bill Tucker (WVOMHST) re: interview transcripts
03/27/13	J Ellis	1.40	Emails and calls with client re: examination of cylinders by experts retained by Tons Per Hour; attention to expert retention issues
TOTAL HOURS:		37.50	

PETITION FOR MODIFICATION OF EXISTING STANDARD (Patriot Coal)

03/04/13	R Bailey	.20	Draft 101(c) petition for modification of waterline standard to prevent freezing
03/05/13	J Phillips	.40	Revise petition for modification pursuant to suggestions by client
03/28/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Department of Labor with docket Assignment
TOTAL HOURS:		0.70	

HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-319 - MSHA CASE #308615

03/05/13	J Phillips	.10	Emails from and to solicitor Bernick re: discovery
03/09/13	J Phillips	.40	Email from solicitor Bernick with voluminous pages of inspector notes
03/18/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief Lesnick with assignment to ALJ Moran
TOTAL HOURS:		0.90	

DODGE HILL #1 MINE - KENT 2013-328 - MSHA CASE #308168

03/09/13	J Phillips	.20	Email from CLR Davis with inspector notes
03/18/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/22/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief Lesnick with assignment to ALJ Andrews
TOTAL HOURS:		0.50	

Pg 41 of 43
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
DODGE HILL #1 MINE - KENT 2013-262 - MSHA CASE #305751			
03/09/13	J Phillips	.10	Email from CLR Davis with inspector notes
03/18/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/22/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief Lesnick with assignment to ALJ Kenneth Andrews
03/25/13	J Phillips	.20	Review CLR Davis's settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.60	
DODGE HILL #1 MINE - KENT 2013-175 - MSHA CASE #302632			
03/18/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/18/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief Lesnick with order of assignment to ALJ Andrews
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Email from solicitor Bernick re: representation
TOTAL HOURS:		0.50	
DODGE HILL #1 MINE - MOTION TO REOPEN - MSHA CASE #310776			
03/10/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from FMSHRC re: motion to reopen penalty proceeding
03/14/13	J Phillips	.70	Work on response to recently received MSHA denial to reopening penalty proceeding
03/18/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/29/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from solicitor Schumann and to client re: no opposition to motion to reopen penalty proceeding
TOTAL HOURS:		1.20	
HARRIS PREP PLANT - WEVA 2012-1197 - MSHA CASE #288464			
03/29/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review notice of substitution of Counsel
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2013-357 - MSHA CASE #307007			
03/20/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review pre-hearing order and order of assignment
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2013-362 MSHA CASE #308069			
03/05/13	J Ellis	.50	Review petition and draft answer; email to attorney Ron Gurka re: answer
03/29/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order of assignment and pre-hearing order
TOTAL HOURS:		0.70	

HIGHLAND 105(C) CASE- MADI-CD-2013-11

03/13/13	J Phillips	3.40	Review and redact personnel file of Brad Houston; email from special investigator Kirby Smith re: position statement; emails from and to client re: policy violation by Brad Houston; draft letter to MSHA special investigator Freddie Fugate re: document production
03/18/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
03/21/13	J Phillips	.10	Emails from and to client re: MSHA's request for documents and interviews
03/22/13	J Phillips	.50	Communications with MSHA investigators re: interviews and document needs for 105(c) investigation
TOTAL HOURS:		4.30	

BLUE CREEK NO. 1 - WEVA 2013-503 MSHA CASE #310934

03/14/13	J Ellis	.40	Review petition and citations; draft answer
03/14/13	J Ellis	2.10	Work on settlement proposal to MSHA
03/20/13	J Ellis	.40	Work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		2.90	

SUGAR MAPLE - WEVA 2013-450 - MSHA CASE #309494

03/22/13	J Ellis	.50	Review petition and draft answer
TOTAL HOURS:		0.50	

WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2013-541 - MSHA CASE #311653

03/22/13	J Ellis	.50	Review petition and draft answer
03/26/13	J Ellis	1.70	Review citations and information from client; work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		2.20	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time- keeper	Hours	Narrative
CAMPBELLS CREEK NO 10 - WEVA 2013-526 - MSHA CASE #310669			
03/22/13	J Ellis	.50	Review petition and draft answer

TOTAL HOURS: 0.50

ROCKCLICK PLANT / MSHA 110(c) INVESTIGATION

03/29/13	J Ellis	.90	Emails from client re: information relating to potential 110(c) investigation; conference call with client re: background information on MSHA 110(c) investigation
----------	---------	-----	--

TOTAL HOURS: 0.90

PEERLESS RACHEL MINE - WEVA 2013-561 - MSHA CASE #311865

03/29/13	J Ellis	.50	Review petition and draft answer
----------	---------	-----	----------------------------------

TOTAL HOURS: 0.50
