

Objection Deadline: September 5, 2012 at 4:00 p.m. (prevailing Eastern Time)

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP
450 Lexington Avenue
New York, New York 10017
Telephone: (212) 450-4000
Facsimile: (212) 607-7983
Marshall S. Huebner
Damian S. Schaible
Brian M. Resnick
Michelle M. McGreal

*Counsel to the Debtors
and Debtors in Possession*

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK**

In re:

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, *et al.*,

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 12-12900 (SCC)

(Jointly Administered)

**MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP FOR
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF
JULY 9, 2012 THROUGH JULY 31, 2012**

NAME OF APPLICANT:	<u>Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP</u>
ROLE IN THE CASE:	Counsel to the Debtors
TIME PERIOD:	July 9, 2012 through and including July 31, 2012
CURRENT APPLICATION¹:	Total Fees Requested: \$2,750,065.00 80% of Fees Requested: \$2,200,052.00 Total Expenses Requested: \$150,160.71
PRIOR APPLICATION:	None

¹ These amounts reflect \$66,207.38 in voluntary reductions of fees and expenses, which voluntary reductions are in addition to reductions of \$21,380.11 on account of Southern District of New York and U.S. Trustee guidelines.

1. In accordance with the *Order To Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the “**Interim Compensation Order**”), Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP (“**Davis Polk**”), counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the “**Debtors**”), hereby submits its Monthly Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “**Fee Statement**”) for the period of July 9, 2012 through and including July 31, 2012 (the “**Fee Statement Period**”).

2. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Davis Polk seeks payment of \$2,350,212.71, representing (a) 80% of Davis Polk’s fees for services rendered and (b) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred.

3. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a listing of Davis Polk professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively, the “**Davis Polk Professionals**”), including the hourly rate for each Davis Polk Professional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Statement Period and the title, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees billed by each Davis Polk Professional.

4. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a schedule specifying the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Davis Polk is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Davis Polk during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project categories. Such services included:

- Participating in numerous meetings and telephone conferences with the Debtors’ management and employees covering topics

such as the chapter 11 cases generally, interpretation of court orders, determination of the status of claims, contract and lease rejection issues, operational issues and general business issues;

- Advising the Patriot Coal Corporation board of directors regarding fiduciary duty issues, disclosure obligations, business and reorganization issues, the bankruptcy process and its options regarding all of the above;
- Assisting with the Debtors' retention of professionals in the Debtors' chapter 11 cases and in the ordinary course of business;
- Responding to numerous telephone calls and letters from creditors, equity holders and other parties in interest concerning the Debtors' chapter 11 cases, the filing of claims against the Debtors and the rights of creditors under the Bankruptcy Code and conducting associated legal research;
- Obtaining critical relief to permit the Debtors to continue to operate in the ordinary course of business;
- Research and analysis related to the Debtors' rights and obligations under coal supply agreements and other commercial contracts;
- Researching and analyzing environmental and regulatory issues, including with respect to the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission, the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority, and the Mine Safety and Health Administration, and advising the Debtors regarding the same;

- Preparation and filing of Exchange Act filings;
- Defending against and developing strategies regarding parties seeking to change venue;
- Analyzing, researching, negotiating and drafting a credit agreement, motion and order regarding debtor-in-possession financing;
- Preparation for, and coordination of, the closing of the credit facilities;
- Preparation for hearings on the debtor-in-possession financing facilities;
- Attending to post closing matters related to the credit facilities, including negotiating, revising and reviewing deposit account control agreements and opinions;
- Assisting the Debtors in the bank syndication process, including reviewing bank presentation materials;
- Numerous telephone conferences with the lenders, counsel to lenders and other parties in connection with the debtor-in-possession credit facilities;
- Providing advice generally to the Debtors about the credit facilities;
- Assisting the Debtors with and analyzing issues related to the Debtors' negotiations regarding reclamation claims and demands for utility deposits;

- Analyzing and researching issues related to numerous executory contracts and advising the Debtors regarding the assumption, rejection and extending the time to assume or reject the same;
- Defending against and developing strategies with respect to parties filing motions seeking to lift the automatic stay and conducting associated legal research;
- Researching and analyzing labor and retiree issues, including related to sections 1113 and 1114 of the Bankruptcy Code;
- Reviewing certain employee compensation and benefit issues, conducting related legal research and advising the Debtors regarding the same;
- Researching and analyzing tax issues and advising the Debtors regarding the same;
- Participating in numerous telephone conferences with the Office of the U.S. Trustee regarding procedural, case management and other issues;
- Researching and preparing several non-first-day procedural and substantive motions;
- Coordinating with the Creditors' Committee regarding various pleadings and administration of the Debtors' estates generally and responding to comments and concerns of the Creditors' Committee;

- Preparing for, attending and taking part in bankruptcy court hearings;
- Responding to press inquiries; and
- Filing and service of court papers.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit D are the time records of Davis Polk, which provide a daily summary of the time spent by each Davis Polk Professional during the Fee Statement Period by project category.

Notice

7. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, (ii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York, 33 Whitehall Street, 21st Floor, New York, New York 10004, Attn: Elisabetta G. Gasparini and Paul K. Schwartzberg, (iii) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein and Joseph Smolinsky, and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz and Ana Alfonso, and (iv) proposed counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq..

8. WHEREFORE, the Debtors respectfully request that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: New York, New York
August 21, 2012

By: /s/ Brian M. Resnick

Marshall S. Huebner

Damian S. Schaible

Brian M. Resnick

Michelle M. McGreal

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017

Telephone: (212) 450-4000

Facsimile: (212) 607-7983

*Counsel to the Debtors
and Debtors in Possession*

EXHIBIT A

Professionals and Rates

I.A. Partners/Counsel

NAME OF PARTNER/ COUNSEL	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Partners					
Sarah E. Beshar	1986-NY	Capital Markets	16.2	\$985	\$15,957.00
John H. Butler	1995-NY	Mergers & Acquisitions	7.0	\$985	\$6,895.00
Alan Dean	1979-NY	Capital Markets	8.7	\$985	\$8,569.50
Kathleen L. Ferrell	1998-NY	Tax	10.9	\$985	\$10,736.50
Marshall Huebner	1994-NY	Insolvency & Restructuring	151.9	\$985	\$149,621.50
Benjamin Kaminetzky	1996-NY	Litigation: Insolvency & Restructuring	18.1	\$985	\$17,828.50
Elliot Moskowitz	2002-NY	Litigation	94.8	\$975	\$92,430.00
Antonio J. Perez- Marques	2003-NY	Litigation	15.1	\$850	\$12,835.00
Brian M. Resnick	2004-NY	Insolvency & Restructuring	81.9	\$850	\$69,615.00
Damian S. Schaible	2002-NY	Insolvency & Restructuring	142.4	\$975	\$138,840.00
Amelia T. R. Starr	1995-NY	Litigation	143.0	\$985	\$140,855.00
William L. Taylor	1991-NY	Mergers & Acquisitions	5.2	\$985	\$5,122.00
Waide Warner	1980-NY	Credit	62.3	\$985	\$61,365.50
Counsel					
Hayden S. Baker	2003-NY	Environmental	32.0	\$915	\$29,280.00
Betty M. Huber	1997-NY	Environmental	22.7	\$985	\$22,359.50
Jonathan D. Martin	2004-NY	Litigation	151.7	\$915	\$138,805.50
James I. McClammy	1998-NY	Litigation: Insolvency & Restructuring	38.6	\$985	\$38,021.00
David B. Toscano	1993-NY	Litigation: Insolvency & Restructuring	92.2	\$985	\$90,817.00
Total Partners and Counsel			1094.7		\$1,049,953.50

II.A. Associates

NAME OF ASSOCIATE	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Ron M. Aizen	2006-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	7.6	\$795	\$6,042.00
Jessica Alvarez	2011-NY	Litigation	61.4	\$575	\$35,305.00
Andres Arnaldos	2009-NY	Credit	28.6	\$750	\$21,450.00
Jeffrey Benner	2012-NY	Capital Markets	48.7	\$465	\$22,645.50
Tenley L. Chepiga	2009-NY	Credit	58.3	\$750	\$43,725.00
Kevin J. Coco	2010-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	7.9	\$675	\$5,332.50
Matthew Cormack	2012-NY	Litigation	39.0	\$465	\$18,135.00
Alexandre P. de Richemont	2012-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	35.9	\$465	\$16,693.50
Richard Estacio	2010-NY	Litigation	111.2	\$675	\$75,060.00
Joshua Thomas Foust	2009-NY	Litigation	86.1	\$750	\$64,575.00
Elyse Glazer	2010-NY	Litigation	27.7	\$675	\$18,697.50
Samantha Hait	2011-NJ 2012-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	78.2	\$465	\$36,363.00
Wendi Hoeben	2005-NY	Capital Markets	62.4	\$795	\$49,608.00
Lauren Howard	2010-NY	Litigation	25.4	\$675	\$17,145.00
Alexander Ibrahim	2011-NY	Litigation	40.5	\$575	\$23,287.50
Mhairi Immermann	Admission Pending	Credit	12.1	\$465	\$5,626.50
Samir Kaushal	2008-NY	Litigation	79.7	\$795	\$63,361.50
Darren S. Klein	2007-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	227.2	\$795	\$180,624.00
Steven C. Krause	2007-NY 2008-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	103.6	\$795	\$82,362.00
Angela Libby	Admission Pending	Insolvency and Restructuring	95.6	\$465	\$44,454.00
Jeffrey Lin	2012-NY	Litigation	32.6	\$465	\$15,159.00
Rebecca L. Martin	2012-NY	Litigation	33.8	\$465	\$15,717.00
Tracy Matlock	Admission Pending	Tax	14.1	\$465	\$6,556.50
Michelle M. McGreal	2007-NJ 2008-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	87.0	\$795	\$69,165.00
Adam Mehes	2011-NY	Litigation	117.8	\$575	\$67,735.00
Gerald M. Moody	2010-MA 2010-NY	Litigation	168.3	\$675	\$113,602.50
Ona Oshen	2010-NY	Environmental	14.8	\$675	\$9,990.00
Gina Y. Pak	2011-NY	Credit	50.7	\$575	\$29,152.50
Tejuana A. Roberts	2011-NY	Investment Management	6.4	\$575	\$3,680.00
Christopher Robertson	Admission Pending	Insolvency and Restructuring	37.4	\$465	\$17,391.00
Alexander C. Robinson	2011-NY	Litigation	6.7	\$575	\$3,852.50
Eric L. Ruiz	2010-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	174.0	\$675	\$117,450.00

NAME OF ASSOCIATE	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Lara Samet	2008-NJ 2009-NY	Litigation	75.4	\$750	\$56,550.00
Kevin M. Satter	2012-NY	Mergers and Acquisitions	42.8	\$575	\$24,610.00
Monica Sullivan	2009-NY	Litigation	31.8	\$750	\$23,850.00
Natasha Tsiouris	2011-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	27.2	\$575	\$15,640.00
Eli James Vonnegut	2008-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	46.8	\$795	\$37,206.00
Jake H. Wang	2012-NY	Investment Management	8.8	\$465	\$4,092.00
Kahlil Williams	Admission Pending	Litigation	41.4	\$465	\$19,251.00
Bernard Chen Zhu	2008-NY	Litigation	136.5	\$795	\$108,517.50
Total Associates			2391.4		\$1,589,660.00

III.A. Summer Associates

NAME OF ASSOCIATE	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Christopher Dodge			11.9	\$235	\$2,796.50
Dennis Heyman			8.7	\$235	\$2,044.50
Ali Isaac-Lowry			20.6	\$235	\$4,841.00
Olga Kogan			4.6	\$235	\$1,081.00
Britton Kovachevich			9.4	\$235	\$2,209.00
James Pyo			23.0	\$235	\$5,405.00
David Robles			16.5	\$235	\$3,877.50
Total Summer Associates			94.7		22,254.50

Attorney Blended Rates

	ATTORNEY BLENDED RATE	TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS BILLED	TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES¹
Partners and Counsel	959.13	1094.7	1,049,953.50
Associates	664.74	2391.4	1,589,660.00
Summer Associates	235.00	94.7	22,254.50
Total	743.38	3580.8	2,661,868.00

¹ These figures reflect voluntary reductions discussed herein.

IV.A. Paraprofessionals

NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES ²
Barbara Chan	Compliance Reporting Specialist	5.2	\$185	\$962.00
Edgar Halford	Research Services	6.6	\$290	\$1,914.00
Jamila Dphreaulezz	Document Clerk	5.0	\$105	\$525.00
Candace Knight	Document Clerk	7.3	\$105	\$766.50
Gomatie Narayan	Document Clerk	11.8	\$105	\$1,239.00
Kristyn Dunleavy	Legal Assistant Corporate	8.0	\$325	\$2,600.00
Jen Eum	Legal Assistant Corporate	41.7	\$325	\$13,552.50
James Kim	Legal Assistant Corporate	22.8	\$325	\$7,410.00
Elliot Law	Legal Assistant Corporate	59.7	\$400	\$23,880.00
Marguerite Melvin	Legal Assistant Corporate	81.3	\$400	\$32,520.00
Bernadette Sullivan	Legal Assistant Corporate	8.3	\$400	\$3,320.00
Megan Teixeira	Legal Assistant Corporate	12.0	\$325	\$3,900.00
Theresa Volano	Legal Assistant Corporate	18.0	\$400	\$7,200.00
Total Paraprofessionals		287.7		99,789.00

² These figures reflect voluntary reductions discussed herein.

EXHIBIT B

Expenses

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES
INCURRED BY DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP ON
BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD

CATEGORY OF EXPENSES	AMOUNTS
Computer research	22,357.67
Duplication	7,185.30
Postage, courier and freight	796.89
Outside document retrieval	572.81
Court and related fees	764.50
Filing, registration, fees & taxes	103,554.00
Travel	11,274.50
Miscellaneous disbursements	173.73
Office Charges	137.40
Meals	3,343.91
Total	150,160.71

EXHIBIT C

Summary by Project Code

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
1.	Asset Dispositions	34.2	21,341.50
2.	Automatic Stay / Litigation	1338.4	1,006,750.00
3.	Creditor/EquityHolder/UCC Issues	436.0	325,605.00
4.	Davis Polk Retention and Fee Issues	77.2	47,178.50
5.	Employee Labor Issues	169.8	139,512.50
6.	Executory Contracts	283.5	214,002.50
7.	Financing	383.4	284,932.00
8.	General Case Administration	611.7	379,946.00
9.	Governance Communications	20.6	17,403.50
10.	Non-Davis Polk Retention	214.4	113,789.50
11.	Non-Working Travel	26.7	11,592.00
12.	Regulatory and Environmental	271.6	187,055.00
13.	Shareholder Derivative Suit	1.0	957.00
Total Hours and Compensation Requested:		3868.5	2,750,065.00¹

¹ This figure reflects voluntary reductions discussed herein.

EXHIBIT D

Time Records

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
ASSET DISPOSITIONS			
McGreal MM	07/11/12	1.1	Review and comment on asset sale procedures motion.
Libby A	07/12/12	1.7	Research and revise de minimis asset sale motion (1.5); conversations with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	07/12/12	1.8	Review and comment on de minimis asset sale procedures motion (1.2); conference with A. Libby regarding same (0.2); teleconference with C. Blacker of AlixPartners regarding appropriate thresholds (0.3); coordinate call with client regarding same (0.1).
Ruiz EL	07/12/12	0.3	Review and revise de minimis asset sale motion.
Libby A	07/16/12	0.8	Research de minimis asset precedents.
McGreal MM	07/16/12	1.9	Teleconference with Company regarding asset sale procedures motion (0.4); revise motion (1.3); conference with D. Schaible and D. Klein regarding same (0.2).
Melvin MM	07/16/12	0.9	Locate precedent de minimis assets motions and orders, save same to the system and forward to A. Libby for review (0.8); communication with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).
Schaible DS	07/16/12	0.4	Review and revise email regarding asset sale motion.
McGreal MM	07/17/12	0.3	Revise de minimis asset sale procedures motion.
Ruiz EL	07/17/12	1.5	Review and revise de minimis asset sale motion.
Law EC	07/18/12	0.9	Obtain precedents regarding de minimis asset sale procedures and balance sheets (0.8); communications with E. Ruiz regarding same (0.1).
Libby A	07/18/12	1.8	Research de minimis asset precedents in response to U.S. Trustee comments (1.4); summary email to M. McGreal regarding same (0.4).
McGreal MM	07/18/12	0.9	Review precedent asset sale procedures caps (0.4); correspondence regarding same with D. Schaible and A. Libby (0.2); revise asset sale procedures motions (0.3).
Ruiz EL	07/18/12	1.1	Review and revise de minimis assets motion.
Ruiz EL	07/19/12	3.0	Review and revise de minimis asset sale motion (2.3); emails to D. Klein and D. Schaible regarding U.S. Trustee comments(0.2); emails and meeting with D. Klein regarding comments from DIP lenders (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Vonnegut EJ	07/24/12	0.5	Discuss 363 sales memo with B. Resnick, D. Klein and K. Satter.
Law EC	07/26/12	0.1	Obtain precedents of de minimis assets sale procedures order.
Melvin MM	07/26/12	0.2	Obtain a precedent sale of de minimis assets procedures order and precedent docket, and forward to J. Foust and S. Hait for review.
Ruiz EL	07/27/12	0.5	Review and revise de minimis asset sale motion.
Huebner MS	07/30/12	0.7	Conversations regarding multiple governmental and private objections to asset sales/abandonment motions.
Satter KM	07/30/12	6.2	Research and summarize §363 asset sales topics.
Satter KM	07/31/12	7.6	Research asset dispositions and draft 363 sales memo (6.2); research and summarize §363 sales process (1.4).
Total ASSET DISPOSITIONS		34.2	
AUTOMATIC STAY\ LITIGATION			
Alvarez J	07/10/12	10.4	Email review and correspondence with team and Word Processing (3.6); team meeting regarding case overview (0.6); review customer disclosures (0.8); review customer agreement and confirmations (1.6); conference call with S. Schwartz and D. Toscano (0.4); summarize conference with D. Toscano and S. Schwartz (0.8); meeting with S. Kaushal to provide case overview (0.4); draft court papers (2.2).
Cormack M	07/10/12	6.6	Discuss expert conflict with D. Toscano (0.1); research standard for disqualification of expert (3.4); edit motion papers in anticipation of adversary proceeding (2.5); meet with A. Starr, J. Martin, D. Toscano and team regarding litigation strategy (0.6).
Estacio R	07/10/12	10.9	Correspond with D. Toscano and others regarding preparing for counterparty contract breaches (0.1); correspond with assistant C. Moore regarding printing relevant contracts (0.1); review relevant agreements and papers to be filed in response to contract breach (0.7); conference with A. Starr and others regarding the same (0.4); correspond with J. Martin regarding issues of enforceability of automatic stay in various state proceedings (0.1); legal research regarding the same (6.7); draft and edit memorandum of law for A. Starr and J. Martin regarding the same (2.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Kaushal S	07/10/12	1.7	Call with G. Moody regarding bankruptcy background (0.1); meet with J. Alvarez regarding same (0.2); call with D. Toscano regarding same (0.1); call with J. Alvarez regarding same (0.1); call with G. Moody regarding same (0.3); email M. Cormack regarding motion papers (0.1); call with M. Cormack regarding same (0.1); review memo regarding contracts (0.7).
Lin J	07/10/12	3.1	Meet with A. Starr, D. Toscano and others to discuss contract enforcement issues (0.4); revise and transmit email regarding safe harbor clauses (0.9); research Coal Trading Agreement Master Agreement origins and commentary (1.1); draft emails summarizing the same (0.4); work with library to gather treatises on forward contract market (0.3).
Martin JD	07/10/12	9.9	Prepare responses to contract counterparty letters (4.7); finalize notice of automatic stay (0.8); emails with J. Jones, D. McAllister, R. Wuller and others regarding same (0.8); coordinate response to vendor regarding modification of credit terms (0.5); emails with E. Waller, E. Power, C. Zhu, R. Estacio and others regarding automatic stay questions (1.2); communications with R. Mead, D. Schaible and others regarding workers' compensation claims and related automatic stay issues (0.8); communications with J. Tucker, C. Damba, D. Schaible and others regarding the Coal Purchase Agreement (1.1).
Mehes A	07/10/12	11.1	Team meeting regarding status (0.5); call with D. Toscano and G. Moody regarding automatic stay papers (0.5); edit automatic stay papers (10.1).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/10/12	11.9	Review and revise draft complaint (4.6); research regarding same (2.4); attend team meeting to discuss automatic stay issues (0.5); correspondence with D. Toscano and A. Delaney regarding team meeting (0.2); calls with S. Kaushal regarding case background (0.4); correspondence with J. Alvarez regarding factual research for automatic stay issues (0.3); review agreements related to automatic stay issues (1.9); review research of J. Lin for draft brief (0.4); assist with service of letter to opposing counsel (0.4); correspondence and calls with M. Cormack regarding cite check of draft motion and draft complaint (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/10/12	5.0	Review counterparty termination letters (1.0); meet with D. Toscano, J. Martin others regarding litigation strategy (1.6); calls with J. Bean and B. Bennett regarding litigation strategy (0.8); calls and emails regarding coal supply agreement litigation with J. Martin, R. Estacio, J. Jones, J. Bean and R. Wuller (1.6).
Starr AT	07/10/12	1.2	Calls and emails regarding automatic stay issues with J. Martin, J. Jones, R. Meade, E. Waller and J. Bean (1.2).
Toscano DB	07/10/12	9.9	Email exchange with Davis Polk team members regarding potential dispute with customer (0.1); Davis Polk team meeting regarding potential customer dispute (0.5); review agreements with customer (0.2); telephone conference J. Alvarez regarding agreements with customer (0.1); telephone conference with A. Starr and J. Martin regarding agreements with customer (0.1); revise draft correspondence to customer (0.2); telephone conference with E. White regarding agreements with customer (0.1); telephone conference with declarant regarding declaration (0.1); telephone conference with declarant and J. Alvarez regarding declaration (0.4); email exchange, telephone conference with A. Mehes regarding agreements (0.2); review blacklines of operative documents (0.2); telephone conference with G. Moody and A. Mehes regarding legal arguments (0.5); read commentary on operative documents and email E. White regarding same (0.3); email client regarding operative documents (0.1); analyze operative documents (1.3); revise draft brief (0.5); telephone conference with J. Martin regarding draft correspondence to customer (0.3); revise draft correspondence and email client regarding same (0.5); communications with the client, A. Starr and J. Martin regarding same (0.6); finalize letter and email to the customer (0.3); research customer's operations (3.0); read letter from customer (0.1); read case (0.1); telephone conference with G. Moody regarding workstream (0.1).
Williams KC	07/10/12	0.7	Update automatic stay notices with post-filing case numbers.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	07/10/12	6.8	Prepare draft letter to governmental departments of workers' compensation regarding Patriot obligations (2.3); prepare and review correspondence with J. Martin and Patriot team regarding same (0.7); review July 10, 2012, counterparty letter regarding changes in contract terms and related correspondence (0.7); prepare draft letter regarding automatic stay (1.6); prepare and review correspondence with J. Martin and D. Klein regarding same (0.4); prepare and review correspondence with D. Toscano and A. Mehes regarding integration issues in preparation for automatic stay letter (0.7); review master equipment lease tracking chart and Peabody agreements regarding same (0.4)
Alvarez J	07/11/12	10.3	Email review and correspondence regarding litigation issues (1.6); review contract to draft court papers (0.5); draft court papers (4.9); review company disclosures (0.3); draft correspondence (1.0); review coal agreement literature (2.0).
Cormack M	07/11/12	6.6	Discuss filing procedure with G. Moody (0.3); discuss filing under seal with A. de Richemont (0.2); edit draft complaint and supporting documents (1.3); research procedural requirements of opening adversary proceeding (4.8).
Kaushal S	07/11/12	6.3	Review memo and supporting materials regarding contracts (1.4); conduct legal research regarding contracts (1.1); email D. Toscano and A. Mehes regarding legal research (0.2); call with A. Mehes regarding legal research (0.3); calls with G. Moody regarding drafting court papers (0.1); review notice and contract (0.2); meet with G. Moody regarding drafting court papers (0.3); draft same (2.7).
Lin J	07/11/12	2.4	Research public filings of coal supply counterparties (1.7); draft emails to D. Toscano and others summarizing same (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	07/11/12	9.1	Calls and conferences with A. Starr, D. Toscano, B. Bennett, J. Bean and others regarding contract disputes (2.2); analysis of contract disputes (3.6); call with counsel for contract counterparty (0.6); review draft letter to vendor regarding contract performance (0.3); emails with E. Waller, J. Jones, and others regarding automatic stay questions and research regarding same (1.5); communications with J. Tucker, C. Damba, D. Schaible, and others regarding contract performance (0.9).
Mehes A	07/11/12	6.1	Edit automatic stay papers.
Melvin MM	07/11/12	0.5	Discuss service in an adversary proceeding with E. Law and A. de Richemont (0.2); research regarding same (0.3).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/11/12	12.3	Review and revise draft complaint (1.9); send revised draft complaint to D. Toscano with mark-up of same (0.1); meeting with S. Kaushal to discuss drafts of automatic stay filings (0.3); call with M. Cormack regarding filing procedures (0.2); review research of M. Cormack regarding same (0.2); coordinate with distribution center to send letter via overnight mail (0.3); call with M. Cormack regarding draft complaint mark-up (0.1); call with S. Kaushal regarding draft complaint (0.1); review and revise company declaration (4.3); research factual background for company declaration (1.9); send revised company declaration to D. Toscano for comments (0.1); review research of J. Lin regarding public filings (0.2); review Patriot contracts (2.6).
Resnick BM	07/11/12	2.4	Call with J. Bean and others regarding Coal Supply Agreement strategy (1.0); call with counterparty regarding Coal Supply Agreement strategy (0.9); call with I. Engelhardt and others regarding counterparty's Coal Supply Agreement strategy conversation (0.5).
Robinson AC	07/11/12	6.7	Research altering the terms of an agreement that is subject to the automatic stay under §362 (6.1); correspondence with B. Zhu regarding research (0.6).
Ruiz EL	07/11/12	0.5	Email to AlixPartners regarding autostay vendor agreements.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/11/12	7.1	Conference calls with B. Bennett, D. Toscano and J. Martin regarding Coal Supply Agreements (1.2); conference call with client representatives and Blackstone regarding Coal Supply Agreements (0.7); conference call with counterparty to Coal Supply Agreement (0.5); review termination letters (0.8); draft Termination response letters (0.6); meet with D. Toscano and J. Martin to create Coal Supply Agreement litigation strategy (1.0); calls and emails regarding automatic stay questions from J. Jones and E. Waller (0.5); work on Coal Supply Agreement briefing (1.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	07/11/12	8.5	Email exchanges regarding contract dispute (0.1); review operative documents relating to contract dispute (0.2); office conference with A. Starr and J. Martin (0.5); telephone conference with declarant regarding declaration (0.2); telephone conference with J. Alvarez regarding correspondence with customer (0.1); telephone conference with G. Moody regarding drafting court papers (0.1); email exchange with Davis Polk team regarding customer (0.1); email exchange with S. Kaushal regarding legal issue (0.2); review, revise and finalize correspondence to customer (0.5); client call (1.0); office conference with A. Starr and J. Martin regarding potential court actions (0.5); email exchange with declarant regarding declaration (0.1); prepare for call with customer's counsel (0.4); telephone conference with customer, customer's counsel, client, A. Starr and J. Martin regarding dispute (0.7); office conference with A. Starr and J. Martin regarding same (0.3); telephone conference with client, A. Starr and J. Martin regarding customer disputes (0.7); telephone conference with declarant regarding declaration (0.1); finalize correspondence with customer (0.3); coordinate sending of correspondence (0.1); email client regarding correspondence (0.1); telephone conference with J. Alvarez regarding contract (0.1); telephone conferences with declarant regarding declaration (0.3); email Davis Polk litigation team regarding same (0.3); email with A. Starr, J. Martin and B. Resnick regarding temporary restraining order issues (0.2); revise draft declaration (1.3).
Zhu B	07/11/12	3.5	Revise shell letter to governmental departments of workers compensation (0.7); prepare and review correspondence with D. Schaible and J. Martin regarding same (0.4); conduct legal research regarding automatic stay and credit terms (2.1); attend conference with A. Robinson regarding same (0.3).
Alvarez J	07/12/12	7.3	Email review and correspondence (2.3); review contracts for court papers (0.7); team meeting to discuss case status (1.0); historical research for court papers (2.5); review coal literature (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Cormack M	07/12/12	7.1	Meet with A. Starr, J. Martin, D. Toscano and team to discuss automatic stay litigation strategy (0.9); call with G. Moody to discuss edits to complaint and company declaration (0.3); research potential defendants business practice and locations (0.5); review draft memorandum of law and declaration (1.3); legal research relating to scope of automatic stay and limit on safe harbor (2.6); review local and federal rules in preparation for filing adversary proceeding (1.5).
Estacio R	07/12/12	1.5	Read correspondence from D. Toscano and others regarding enforcing automatic stay (0.3); conference with A. Starr and others regarding same (1.0); analyze bankruptcy court filing procedures (0.2).
Heyman DK	07/12/12	2.9	Court paper research.
Huebner MS	07/12/12	0.3	Emails and conversations regarding coal supply issues.
Kaminetzky BS	07/12/12	1.9	Calls and meetings with M. Huebner, D. Schaible and J. Martin regarding background and update.
Kaushal S	07/12/12	4.4	Call with G. Moody regarding court papers (0.1); call with J. Alvarez regarding same (0.1); meet with G. Moody regarding court papers (0.2); draft court papers (2.7); attend team meeting with A. Starr, J. Martin, D. Toscano, A. Mehes, G. Moody, J. Alvarez, J. Lin and M. Cormack regarding court papers and strategy (0.3); draft court papers (1.0).
Klein DS	07/12/12	0.7	Emails with J. Martin regarding automatic stay and employee issues and coordinate with M. McGreal regarding same (0.3); emails with D. Schaible regarding same (0.1); review research relating to Debtor as plaintiff and autostay issues and emails with D. Schaible regarding same (0.3).
Lin J	07/12/12	1.3	Meet with A. Starr, D. Toscano and others to discuss coal supply issues (0.8); research information about coal supply contract counterparties and summarize same in email (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	07/12/12	8.4	Update call with company and advisers (1.1); calls to contract counterparty regarding performance (0.2); review research on actions where debtor is plaintiff and call with C. Zhu (0.8); call with R. Wuller and A. Starr regarding ongoing litigation matters (0.4); review draft papers for potential adversary proceeding (0.8); litigation team meeting regarding potential adversary proceedings (0.7); review case law and related research on potential contract dispute (3.7); communications with accounting expert (0.5); conference with B. Kaminetzky regarding contract issues (0.2)
McGreal MM	07/12/12	0.6	Teleconference with A. Starr regarding lifting the stay where debtor is a plaintiff (0.2); email research to Davis Polk group (0.3); correspondence with D. Klein regarding same (0.1).
Mehes A	07/12/12	12.3	Edit automatic stay papers (7.7); research legal issues related to automatic stay papers (3.6); team meeting regarding status update and steps forward regarding automatic stay papers (1.0).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/12/12	12.8	Call with D. Toscano regarding company declaration (0.1); call with T. Chepiga regarding lawsuits filed against Patriot (0.2); call with M. Cormack regarding lawsuits filed against Patriot (0.2); factual research regarding lawsuits filed against Patriot (1.1); call with A. Starr regarding same (0.1); call with J. Lin and A. Mehes regarding research on automatic stay issues (0.4); meet with S. Kaushal regarding draft complaint (0.4); legal research for draft brief (1.4); review correspondence regarding automatic stay issues (0.3); review and revise draft complaint (2.9); team meeting with A. Starr and others regarding automatic stay filings (0.9); review and revise draft company declaration (4.3); send revised company declaration to D. Toscano for review (0.1); review M. Cormack's filing procedure research (0.2); review draft attorney declaration (0.2).
Ruiz EL	07/12/12	0.3	Research regarding warehousemen liens.
Schaible DS	07/12/12	1.6	Coordinate regarding coal supply contract issues (0.9); review and coordinate on coal contract issues (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/12/12	6.9	Conference call with team and client regarding workstreams (0.7); calls and emails with G. Moody, D. Toscano, J. Martin, J. Bean, J. Alvarez and A. Mehes regarding legal analysis of Coal Supply Agreements (2.7); conference call with J. Bean and I. Englehardt regarding Coal Supply Agreement (0.4); calls and emails regarding accounting issues regarding Coal Supply Agreements (2.0); calls and emails with EDF regarding Coal Supply Agreement (0.2); calls and emails with RWE regarding Coal Supply Agreement (0.4); calls and emails with B. Bennett regarding strategy for counterparties (0.3).
Toscano DB	07/12/12	9.7	Telephone conference with G. Moody regarding draft court papers (0.1); Davis Polk litigation team meeting (0.9); telephone conference with declarant regarding declaration (0.7); email Davis Polk litigation team regarding same (0.1); email client regarding shipment records (0.1); revise draft court papers (7.8).
Zhu B	07/12/12	8.5	Prepare draft stipulations and orders regarding debtor-initiated prepetition litigations (3.7); conduct legal research regarding same (1.1); review underlying contracts regarding prepetition litigations (2.1); prepare various correspondence with J. Martin regarding same (0.7); review correspondence from Patriot team regarding barge agreement-related issues (0.4); attend conference with D. Klein regarding asset clawback issues (0.3); prepare and review correspondence with J. Martin regarding same (0.2).
Alvarez J	07/13/12	7.9	Coal delivery analysis (1.3); review draft court papers (1.4); research for court papers (2.3); review contracts for court papers (1.3); review company schedules (1.6).
Cormack M	07/13/12	2.6	Research discovery obligations and procedure for filing agreements under seal in adversary proceeding.
Estacio R	07/13/12	5.6	Read drafts of court papers regarding enforcing automatic stay (2.4); legal research regarding same (3.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	07/13/12	4.2	Multiple calls with F. Huffard regarding coal supply termination issues and lender calls (0.9); internal call with coal supply team regarding EDF, RWE and Vitol terminations (0.4); call with J. Bean regarding same and extended call with clients regarding same and next steps (1.7); call with Barclays and Citibank regarding forward contract and coal supply termination issues (1.2).
Kaminetzky BS	07/13/12	0.7	Call with M. Huebner regarding background and strategy (0.4); analysis regarding same (0.3).
Martin JD	07/13/12	7.8	Calls with potential accounting expert (1.3); calls and emails with B. Bennett, J. Bean and others regarding contract issues (1.4); prepare for potential adversary proceedings (3.6); calls with E. Waller and others regarding counterparty contractual performance issue (0.5); call with Weil regarding contract issues (0.3); revise stipulation for prepetition litigation (0.5); emails with A. Starr, C. Zhu and others regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	07/13/12	1.1	Review stipulation (0.6); conference with D. Klein regarding same (0.2); email D. Schaible regarding same (0.3).
Mehes A	07/13/12	0.4	Correspondence regarding substance of automatic stay papers.
Moody, Jr. GM	07/13/12	7.9	Call with D. Toscano regarding draft automatic stay filings (0.4); review and revise automatic stay complaints (4.7); call with M. McGreal regarding filing under seal in bankruptcy court (0.2); meet with S. Kaushal regarding status of case and draft complaints (0.4); call with J. Alvarez regarding legal research for draft brief (0.2); legal research for automatic stay filings (1.1); review and revise company declaration (0.2); review correspondence regarding automatic stay issues (0.1); send revised automatic stay filings to D. Toscano for review (0.1); send revised company declaration to A. Starr for review (0.1); call with D. Toscano regarding revisions to company declaration (0.1); create hard copies of documents and bring packet to D. Toscano (0.2); correspondence with D. Toscano regarding same (0.1).
Schaible DS	07/13/12	0.4	Coordinate regarding coal contract issues.
Starr AT	07/13/12	0.7	Calls and emails regarding automatic stay questions with J. Martin and J. Jones.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	07/13/12	3.7	Telephone conference with G. Moody regarding draft court papers (0.4); revise draft court papers (1.0); email exchange with J. Martin regarding sealing motion, telephone conference with G. Moody regarding same (0.1); telephone conference with G. Moody regarding declaration (0.1); telephone conference with G. Moody and T. Chepiga regarding declaration (0.1); telephone conference with W. Warner, G. Moody and T. Chepiga regarding declaration (0.1); email A. Starr and J. Martin regarding same (0.1); telephone conference with the client, A. Starr, J. Martin and consultant regarding potential litigation issue (1.0); telephone conference with J. Alvarez regarding company records (0.3); telephone conference with the declarant regarding the declaration (0.2); telephone conference with J. Alvarez (0.1) telephone conferences with J. Alvarez and declarant (0.2).
Zhu B	07/13/12	2.4	Review draft order authorizing settlement procedures in preparation for draft stipulation (0.9); prepare correspondence with A. Starr, J. Martin and M. McGreal regarding same (0.5); revise draft stipulation regarding debtor-initiated prepetition litigations (0.5); review and prepare correspondence with A. Starr, D. Toscano and J. Martin regarding coal supply agreement-related litigation issues (0.5).
Mehes A	07/14/12	2.3	Review and comment on declaration (0.8); research automatic stay issue (1.5).
Alvarez J	07/15/12	0.2	Review and respond to email correspondence.
Huebner MS	07/15/12	1.5	Conversation and emails with counsel to lenders regarding Coal Supply Agreements (0.8); conference call with clients regarding coal supply issues and counter-party negotiations update (0.5); summary email to client group and advisors regarding call with Weil Gotshal on Coal Supply Agreement (0.2).
Mehes A	07/15/12	2.3	Research automatic stay issues.
Moody, Jr. GM	07/15/12	0.9	Review and revise company declaration (0.4); research SEC filings for company declaration (0.5).
Schaible DS	07/15/12	0.4	Emails regarding coal supply contract issues.
Starr AT	07/15/12	1.5	Calls and emails with M. Huebner, J. Martin and D. Toscano regarding Coal Supply Agreement inquiries.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	07/15/12	1.9	Telephone conference with declarant (0.5); email exchanges with G. Moody and A. Mehes regarding draft court papers (0.6); read draft court papers (0.7); email exchange with A. Mehes regarding draft brief (0.1).
Alvarez J	07/16/12	2.9	Email review and correspondence (1.7); collect contracts for review (1.2).
Cormack M	07/16/12	5.9	Research verification of complaint requirement (1.8); research impact of confidentiality provision in contract on motion to seal (2.3); review and edit draft complaints (1.8).
Huebner MS	07/16/12	3.5	Calls with Weil regarding coal supply issues (0.9); conversation with Willkie regarding coal supply issues (0.2); conference call with clients, Blackstone regarding coal supply issues (0.8); call with RWE counsel regarding contract (0.3); call with Vitol counsel regarding contract (0.3); calls with EDF counsel regarding contract (0.4); review of communications with EDF regarding resolution (0.2); review of correspondence with RWE (0.1); emails regarding cardinal agreement and conversation with J. Bean, J. Martin regarding same (0.3).
Kaushal S	07/16/12	0.2	Call with G. Moody regarding court papers.
Lin J	07/16/12	1.5	Research issue of contract formation in supply contracts in Supreme Court case law (1.0); discuss the same with J. Alvarez (0.2); draft email summarizing same to J. Alvarez (0.3).
Martin JD	07/16/12	4.4	Analysis of contracts for call with DIP lenders (1.1); emails with E. Power and others regarding automatic stay questions, including research (0.8); calls with contract counterparties regarding performance (1.2); call with B. Bennett and others regarding contract terms (0.4); review draft litigation papers (0.9).
Mehes A	07/16/12	8.7	Review documents for automatic stay papers (5.3); edit automatic stay papers (3.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moody, Jr. GM	07/16/12	11.9	Call with D. Toscano regarding automatic stay filings (0.3); call with D. Toscano regarding revisions to complaints (0.2); meet with D. Toscano regarding revisions to complaints (0.2); call with M. Cormack regarding revisions to draft complaints (0.3); review and revise draft complaints (4.9); incorporate comments of M. Cormack into draft complaints (0.9); call with S. Kaushal regarding revisions to draft complaints (0.2); call with D. Toscano regarding legal research for draft brief and draft complaints (0.5); review and revise draft motion to file under seal (1.2); review and revise draft company declaration (0.4); correspondence with M. Cormack regarding procedures for filing under seal (0.2); review revisions to draft brief (0.9); review expert declaration (1.7).
Resnick BM	07/16/12	0.4	Emails regarding Coal Supply Agreements.
Ruiz EL	07/16/12	0.3	Review and revise assumption/rejection procedures motion.
Schaible DS	07/16/12	0.8	Coordinate regarding coal supply issues.
Starr AT	07/16/12	8.3	Revise expert materials (1.7); conference calls regarding Coal Supply Agreement with counterparties (1.0); prepare materials for banks regarding Coal Supply Agreements (1.2); calls and emails with J. Bean, M. Huebner, B. Bennett, J. Jones, R. Wuller, J. Martin, D. Toscano and M. Ellenberg regarding Coal Supply Agreement issues (3.6); calls regarding protocols for court hearings with D. Klein and J. Martin (0.3); review court documents (0.4); emails regarding autostay inquiries with J. Martin (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	07/16/12	10.4	Telephone conferences with A. Starr regarding existing and potential disputes (0.6); telephone conference with declarant regarding declaration and other issues (0.2); email with A. Starr regarding operative documents in potential disputes (0.1); telephone conference with G. Moody regarding filing logistics (0.2); telephone conference with A. Mehes regarding legal arguments (0.3); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding operative documents for disputes (0.1); telephone conference with J. Alvarez regarding same (0.1); telephone conference with A. Mehes regarding same (0.1); review draft court papers (1.1); office conference with G. Moody regarding same (0.2); telephone conference with J. Bean, M. Huebner, J. Martin and opposing counsel regarding dispute and telephone conference with B. Bennett, J. Bean, M. Huebner, A. Starr and J. Martin regarding same (1.0); telephone conference with J. Martin regarding operative documents relevant to disputes (0.2); telephone conference with J. Bean, M. Huebner, A. Starr, J. Martin and opposing counsel regarding dispute (0.5); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding settlement of dispute (0.1); telephone conference with consultant regarding expert analysis (0.5); telephone conference with G. Moody regarding legal arguments (0.2); email exchange with A. Starr regarding legal argument, including reading relevant legal authority (0.4); email exchange with G. Moody regarding draft court papers (0.1); telephone conference with G. Moody regarding draft court papers (1.0); draft court papers (3.0); revise draft court papers and circulate (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	07/16/12	5.1	Attend conference with J. Martin regarding certain Coal Supply Agreement and letter of credit issues (0.4); prepare and review various correspondence with M. Huebner, J. Bean and J. Martin regarding same (0.5); review and prepare various correspondence with J. Martin, A. Starr and M. Huebner regarding draft stipulation and order for certain coal supply contracts (0.5); analyze coal supply contract terms and background material in preparation for drafting stipulation and order (1.6); prepare various correspondence with J. Martin and litigation team regarding motion to seal (0.6); review and revise draft motion to seal (1.5).
Alvarez J	07/17/12	4.3	Email review and correspondence regarding litigation issues (0.5); analyze contract provisions (3.5); meeting with J. Eum to discuss contract (0.3).
Cormack M	07/17/12	4.3	Research issues related to damages and violation of automatic stay (1.8); discuss complaint and motion papers with G. Moody (0.2); edit draft papers (2.2); review case management order in preparation for filing (0.1).
Halford EB	07/17/12	3.6	Search LEXIS and Westlaw for cases cited in the memorandum of law in support of Debtors' motion (0.8); retrieve, print and review the Shepards reports (1.3); Citecheck and Bluebook the citations (1.5).
Huebner MS	07/17/12	4.1	Two calls with counsel to EDF regarding coal supply issues and negotiations over stipulations and forms of amendment (0.8); two full turns of draft of amendment to EDF (1.6); conference calls with client regarding EDF counter and negotiations (0.4); calls with J. Bean, B. Bennett, A. Starr regarding coal supply issues (0.6); conference call with Weil Gotshal coal counterparty issues (0.7).
Kaushal S	07/17/12	0.1	Call with D. Toscano regarding litigation strategy.
Klein DS	07/17/12	0.2	Emails with J. Martin regarding potential automatic stay violations.
Lin J	07/17/12	3.5	Cite check document related to Coal Supply Agreement (3.2); draft emails to G. Moody and A. Mehes regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	07/17/12	3.2	Review draft stipulation regarding amend and assume and related documents (0.9); emails with E. Power, J. Jones, J. Tucker and others regarding automatic stay issues (1.2); review draft litigation papers for potential adversary proceeding (1.1).
Mehes A	07/17/12	3.1	Review documents for automatic stay papers (2.4); edit automatic stay papers (0.7).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/17/12	10.2	Call with D. Toscano regarding revisions to draft complaint (0.2); review and revise draft motion to file under seal (0.7); call with M. Cormack regarding markup of draft complaint (0.1); review and revise draft officer and attorney declarations (2.7); call with A. Mehes regarding draft automatic stay filings (0.3); call with D. Toscano and others regarding draft automatic stay filings (0.3); review and revise draft complaints (2.9); incorporate comments of A. Starr into draft complaints and circulate blackline (1.1); review research of M. Cormack regarding bankruptcy court procedural standards (0.2); review and revise draft motion (0.9); review and revise draft order to show cause (0.8).
Starr AT	07/17/12	11.2	Calls with DIP lenders' counsel regarding contracts (1.9); prepare and revise charts regarding contracts (2.0); review and revise court documents regarding contracts (1.8); calls with J. Bean, J. Jones, B. Bennett, M. Schroeder, M. Huebner, D. Toscano and R. Wuller regarding contract issues (2.6); draft revised contracts (2.3); calls with counterparty counsel regarding the same (0.6).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	07/17/12	10.7	Email exchanges with Davis Polk litigation team regarding draft court papers (0.1); review materials in preparation for call with Weil Gotshal (1.3); telephone conference with A. Starr and Weil Gotshal regarding potential dispute (0.9); email exchange with A. Mehes regarding chart (0.1); revise draft chart and email to A. Starr (0.4); telephone conference with J. Alvarez regarding customer list (0.1); email to declarant regarding declaration (0.4); revise draft chart and email to client (0.4); telephone conference with G. Moody regarding draft court papers (0.2); telephone conference with declarant regarding declaration (0.1); telephone conference with R. Wuller regarding draft declarations (0.4); revise draft court papers (3.9); revise draft court papers and email to client group (1.5); revise draft brief and email to client group (0.1); telephone conference M. Huebner, A. Starr and Weil Gotshal regarding potential disputes (0.8).
Zhu B	07/17/12	9.1	Review case management order (0.4); prepare correspondence with A. Starr and J. Martin regarding notice issues in connection with stipulation and order (0.3); prepare draft sealing motion regarding same (0.8); review draft stipulation and order, and settlement agreement, from opposing counsel Cadwalader (1.9); prepare notes regarding same (0.5); revise draft stipulation and order (1.6); attend conference with A. Starr, M. Huebner and Patriot team regarding contract settlement and draft stipulation and order (0.9); review draft settlement agreement (2.1); prepare various correspondence with M. Huebner, A. Starr and opposing counsel regarding same (0.6).
Alvarez J	07/18/12	6.6	Calls with D. Toscano to discuss contract analysis (0.1); review and revise contract analysis spreadsheet (4.0); review email correspondence (0.4); research historical coal documents (2.1).
Cormack M	07/18/12	2.4	Research standard to seal adversary proceeding in its entirety (1.3); draft motion to seal stipulation and contract amendment (1.1).
de Richemont P	07/18/12	0.4	Review venue transfer motion (0.3); review calendar of upcoming hearings and deadlines (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	07/18/12	9.6	Correspond with J. Martin regarding opposing venue transfer motion (0.1); conference with J. Martin and C. Zhu regarding the same (0.4); conference with E. Moskowitz and others regarding the same (0.2); legal research regarding the same (3.2); draft outline of transfer opposition arguments (2.6); research in support of venue transfer opposition (3.1).
Heyman DK	07/18/12	5.8	Research regarding litigation issues.
Huebner MS	07/18/12	4.6	Numerous calls and emails regarding union venue transfer motion (1.4); detailed review and markup of union venue transfer motion (1.7); review and markup of outline regarding response (0.6); conversations with clients regarding preparation for venue fight (0.9).
Kaminetzky BS	07/18/12	2.8	Calls, email and meetings with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding motion to transfer venue, strategy and tasks (1.8); review email and data regarding venue transfer motion analysis (0.5); review and analyze venue pleading (0.5).
Kaushal S	07/18/12	3.5	Meet with A. Starr, D. Toscano regarding court papers (0.4); review court papers (0.2); call with M. Cormack regarding same (0.2); draft court papers regarding RWE (2.7).
Klein DS	07/18/12	3.5	Team meeting on venue issues and follow-up with M. McGreal regarding same (0.4); research related to same (0.8); coordinate factual analysis related to same (0.3); review union venue motion (0.6); analyze creditor distributions and emails regarding same (1.4).
Law EC	07/18/12	3.5	Research regarding Judge Chapman decisions/precedents on venue (3.3); communications and meetings with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).
Martin JD	07/18/12	6.1	Analyze and plan response to United Mine Workers Association's venue transfer motion (4.5); conferences and emails with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz, C. Zhu, R. Estacio, and others regarding same (1.6).
McClammy JI	07/18/12	2.8	Review case background materials (1.2); review venue transfer motion (0.7); review venue memos (0.5); telephone conference with E. Moskowitz regarding venue issues (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	07/18/12	3.5	Review motion to transfer venue (0.6); conference with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding venue motion objection strategy (0.7); draft email to clients regarding transfer motion (0.4); teleconference with J. Martin regarding venue research materials (0.1); teleconference with Company and H. Baker regarding potential settlement (0.9); conference with litigation team regarding venue motion objection strategy (0.4); correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding venue (0.4).
Mehes A	07/18/12	4.6	Research automatic stay issues (1.3); call with G. Moody regarding automatic stay issues (0.8); edit automatic stay papers (2.5).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/18/12	8.7	Review and revise draft company declaration (0.8); integrate comments of A. Starr into company declaration (0.5); send revised company declaration to D. Toscano for review (0.1); correspondence with M. Cormack regarding filing under seal (0.3); review research of M. Cormack regarding same (0.2); call with A. Mehes regarding draft brief and legal arguments regarding draft automatic stay filing (0.7); call with D. Toscano regarding legal arguments regarding draft automatic stay filing (0.2); correspondence with A. Mehes regarding draft brief (0.6); research legal issues regarding automatic stay for draft filings (3.4); review and revise draft automatic stay complaints and order to show cause (1.9).
Moskowitz E	07/18/12	8.9	Review venue motions (0.9); team meeting regarding same (0.4); draft outline of brief and work plan (2.4); correspondence with team regarding additional research and next steps (2.3); meet with M. Huebner (0.6); further revisions to outline and work plan and correspondence with team regarding same (1.3); meet with E. Glazer regarding client meeting preparation (0.3); prepare for client meeting (0.7).
Resnick BM	07/18/12	0.6	Review venue motion and comments thereto.
Samet L	07/18/12	0.3	Meeting with E. Moskowitz, J. Martin and others regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue.
Schaible DS	07/18/12	0.6	Emails and coordinate regarding venue motion.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/18/12	7.7	Calls with bank counsel regarding contracts (1.0); prepare of drafts of materials regarding contract analysis (0.4); calls and emails with contract counterparties (0.6); draft revised contracts (2.0); revise court documents regarding contracts (1.0); calls regarding contracts with J. Bean, R. Wuller, B. Bennett, M. Huebner, I. Engelhardt, C. Ebetino, D. Toscano and J. Jones (2.7).
Toscano DB	07/18/12	8.5	Telephone conference with J. Alvarez regarding factual research (0.1); revise draft court papers (0.8); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding potential disputes (0.1); read legal authorities (0.4); telephone conference with client, A. Starr and R. Wuller regarding interim relief (1.0); telephone conference with J. Alvarez regarding analysis of potential disputes (0.1); email with A. Starr regarding same (0.1); compile and confirm information relevant to analysis of potential disputes (1.7); telephone conference with declarant regarding declaration (1.0); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding court papers (0.1); telephone conference with J. Alvarez regarding chart (0.1); review court papers (0.6); telephone conference with G. Moody regarding legal argument (0.1); office conference with A. Starr and S. Kaushal regarding court papers (0.5); revise chart and email to Weil Gotshal (0.1); telephone conference with J. Alvarez regarding information relevant to analysis of potential disputes (0.1); telephone conference with S. Kaushal regarding draft court papers (0.1); review and revise draft court papers (1.2); email exchanges with A. Starr and S. Kaushal regarding same (0.2); email client group regarding same (0.1).
Williams KC	07/18/12	1.8	Review United Mine Workers Association's motion to transfer venue (0.3); team meeting regarding filing objection (0.3); review other background materials of venue transfer issues (1.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	07/18/12	11.1	Revise draft stipulation and order regarding the coal supply agreement (1.7); revise draft settlement agreement (1.3); prepare various correspondence with M. Huebner, A. Starr and opposing counsel regarding same (0.8); revise draft motion to seal (1.1); prepare list of missing documents relating to override agreements (0.9); prepare various correspondence with J. Martin and Patriot team regarding same (0.6); attend conference with J. Martin and R. Estacio regarding venue issues (1.0); review United Mine Workers Association motion to change venue (1.4); attend conference with E. Moskowitz, J. Martin and litigation team regarding venue motion next steps and strategy (1.1); prepare correspondence and background materials to E. Moskowitz and litigation team in preparation for venue opposition papers (0.7); conduct legal research regarding venue issues; prepare and review correspondence with J. Martin and R. Estacio regarding same (0.5).
Alvarez J	07/19/12	2.3	Email correspondence regarding litigation issues (0.6); calls with S. Kaushal regarding drafting court papers (0.1); research on contract governing laws (1.2); meeting with S. Kaushal and G. Moody to discuss court papers (0.2); call with J. Foust regarding coal contracts (0.2).
Cormack M	07/19/12	1.9	Draft motion to seal amendment to contract.
Estacio R	07/19/12	12.5	Draft and edit motion regarding interested party joinder in debtors' motion (1.6); correspond with D. Klein and E. Moskowitz regarding the same (0.1); conference with J. McClammy regarding objecting to motion to transfer venue (0.6); conference with J. Foust regarding the same (0.3); draft correspondence to J. Foust regarding legal and factual research in support of debtor's objection to transfer venue (0.7); legal research regarding the same (4.7); draft memorandum of law regarding the same (4.5).
Foust JT	07/19/12	11.1	Research local rules governing memoranda of law (0.9); research precedents for requests to pay fees of unions (2.1); coordinate factual and legal research for objection to venue transfer (8.1).
Hait S	07/19/12	5.4	Research §365(d)(3) issue for B. Resnick.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	07/19/12	4.5	Review of Equity Committee request and notes on same (0.4); conversations with the U.S. Trustee and internally regarding Equity Committee request (0.3); conference call with clients regarding preparation and fact gathering for venue fight (1.0); scores of emails with clients regarding venue facts (1.3); conversations with E. Moskowitz regarding calls from Chambers regarding venue scheduling (0.2); conversations with counsel for senior and convertible bondholders regarding venue issues (0.8); work on outline for venue brief (0.5).
Kaminetzky BS	07/19/12	6.1	Conference call regarding venue strategy (0.8); post-call and meeting with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding strategy (0.6); venue analysis (0.7); email regarding venue strategy, data and tasks (1.1); review and edit outlines (0.2); email regarding objection deadline (0.2); analysis regarding case law (1.8); email regarding same (0.3); email regarding discovery (0.2); call with E. Moskowitz regarding venue strategy (0.2).
Kaushal S	07/19/12	11.4	Emails to A. Starr, D. Toscano, J. Alvarez, G. Moody and M. Cormack regarding court filings (0.7); revise court papers (0.3); meet with A. Starr and D. Toscano regarding same (0.3); call with R. Waller regarding same (0.1); review and revise court papers (1.0); review counterparty edits to court papers (0.3); meet with A. Starr and D. Toscano regarding same (0.4); read emails regarding charts, court papers (0.2); review coal supply agreement (0.5); review and revise court papers (3.5); meet with A. Starr and D. Toscano regarding coal supply agreement (0.2); meet with A. Starr and D. Toscano regarding Vitol (0.5); review coal supply contracts (0.5); call with G. Moody regarding same (0.4); draft coal supply court papers (2.5).
Klein DS	07/19/12	4.5	Research on factual issues (0.7); call with clients regarding venue motion (0.6); coordinate factual development regarding same (1.8); draft support email and related documents (0.7); review case law regarding venue (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Lin J	07/19/12	4.6	Research S.D.N.Y. and Second Circuit case law related to transfer of venue (3.1); draft emails summarizing same to R. Estacio, J. Foust and others (1.0); read emails regarding the same (0.5).
Martin JD	07/19/12	2.6	Conferences and emails with A. Starr, B. Resnick and Cleary regarding motion scheduling (0.8); related research on scheduling issue (0.7); communications with A. Starr, M. Sullivan and T. Coburn regarding certain pre-petition actions (1.1).
McClammy JI	07/19/12	5.6	Review venue-related fact materials (1.0); review venue legal research (1.4); conference with L. Samet and R. Estacio regarding opposition to transfer motion (0.6); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding transfer motion issues (0.4); email correspondence regarding venue issues (0.3); review transfer motion (0.4); preparation regarding opposition to transfer motion (1.5).
Mehes A	07/19/12	2.8	Citecheck and edit automatic stay papers.
Moody, Jr. GM	07/19/12	11.9	Review and revise draft company declaration (0.9); research legal issues for draft brief (3.9); review A. Mehes's revisions to draft brief (0.6); send comments on revisions to draft brief to D. Toscano and A. Mehes (0.2); correspond with S. Kaushal regarding settlement filing (0.2); call with S. Kaushal regarding same (0.1); call with A. Mehes regarding executory contracts (0.1); review correspondence regarding automatic stay filing (0.3); meeting with A. Starr and others regarding settlement papers (0.8); meet with S. Kaushal regarding same (0.4); calls with S. Kaushal regarding drafts of settlement papers (0.5); correspondence with S. Kaushal regarding settlement agreement drafts (0.2); review and revise draft settlement agreements (3.7).
Moskowitz E	07/19/12	4.7	Call with clients regarding motion and next steps and follow-up (0.8); correspondence with J. McClammy and team regarding several venue issues and draft motion (1.8); review case law and precedent regarding venue (1.7); correspondence with M. Huebner and B. Kaminetzky regarding venue issues (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	07/19/12	3.1	Emails regarding override litigations (0.3); meet with S. Hait regarding override research issue (0.2); review research and cases regarding assumption/rejection issues (1.2); email to team regarding assumption/rejection issues (0.3); emails regarding override agreements (1.1).
Samet L	07/19/12	11.2	Review motion to transfer venue, first day filings, and related precedent (2.5); meeting with J. McClammy and R. Estacio regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue (0.6); meeting with J. Foust and R. Estacio regarding legal and factual research projects (0.3); research regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue (4.2); draft opposition to motion to transfer venue (3.6).
Schaible DS	07/19/12	0.6	Emails and coordinate regarding venue motion.
Starr AT	07/19/12	0.5	Meetings regarding lift stay motions (0.3); calls and emails regarding same with R. Wuller, M. Sullivan and J. Martin (0.2).
Sullivan MN	07/19/12	6.2	Email with A. Starr and J. Martin regarding motion to proceed with claims (0.1); review background material regarding stipulation to proceed with claims (0.5); conference with A. Starr and J. Martin regarding motion to proceed with claims (0.6); email to M. Mattingly regarding proposed stipulation (0.1); call with M. Mattingly regarding proposed stipulation (0.1); A. Starr, and J. Martin regarding motion to proceed with claims (0.1); draft motion and proposed order regarding motion to proceed with claims (4.6); email to A. Starr and J. Martin with draft motion and proposed order to proceed with claims (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	07/19/12	5.5	Email exchanges with Davis Polk litigation team regarding revising draft court papers (0.3); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding court papers (0.1); office conference with A. Starr and S. Kaushal regarding same (0.3); telephone conference with R. Wuller and S. Kaushal regarding same (0.1); email client regarding same (0.3); email exchange with S. Kaushal regarding draft court papers (0.2); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding court papers (0.1); review draft customer chart and email to A. Starr (0.1); office conference with A. Starr and S. Kaushal regarding draft court papers (0.8); telephone conference with A. Mehes regarding customer chart (0.1); revise customer chart and send to client (0.1); telephone conference with A. Saavedra of Weil Gotshal, regarding court filings (0.1); email with A. Starr regarding same (0.1); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding negotiations with customer (0.1); office conference with A. Starr, S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding drafting settlement papers (0.6); office conference with S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding same (0.2); listen to voice-mail messages from M. Huebner regarding draft court papers and email S. Kaushal regarding same (0.1); review operative agreement in connection with drafting settlement and amendment (1.4); review draft court papers and email S. Kaushal regarding same (0.1); email exchange with A. Mehes regarding draft brief (0.1); revise draft chart and email to Weil Gotshal (0.2).
Williams KC	07/19/12	10.5	Legal research on various venue transfer issues (10.4); circulate litigation list to team (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	07/19/12	11.8	Review and prepare various correspondence with J. McClammy, E. Moskowitz and litigation team regarding venue opposition papers next steps (0.8); conduct research regarding venue-related issues (0.9); review correspondence from J. Martin and Patriot team regarding override agreements analysis and next steps (1.2); prepare factual summary of override agreement in preparation for rejection analysis (3.6); prepare correspondence with S. Kaushal and A. Starr regarding the Coal Supply Agreement settlement and stipulation and order (0.4); review override agreement background materials and prepare notes regarding same (3.3); prepare various correspondence with A. Mehes regarding analysis of additional override agreements (0.5); prepare and review background materials in preparation for rejection papers (1.1).
Alvarez J	07/20/12	5.2	Review email correspondence (0.6); review and edit drafts of court papers (2.1); review court filing rules (2.5).
Cormack M	07/20/12	0.7	Research procedural issues regarding filing under seal.
Estacio R	07/20/12	14.9	Conference with J. McClammy and others regarding objection to motion to transfer venue (0.7); conference with L. Samet and others regarding same (0.2); draft a list of questions to be researched regarding objection to motion to transfer venue (1.3); draft objection to motion to transfer venue (7.4); edit same (2.4); legal research regarding same (2.9).
Eum JS	07/20/12	5.0	Compile emails related to venue transfer for Patriot: factual research for objection to venue transfer binder as per J. Foust.
Foust JT	07/20/12	12.4	Research precedents regarding payment of unions' professional fees (2.0); research 9019 settlement motion precedents (1.8); team meeting to discuss venue transfer objection (0.4); coordinate factual research for venue transfer objection (8.2).
Kaminetzky BS	07/20/12	1.5	Review email and data regarding venue analysis (0.8); email regarding venue strategy, brief and tasks (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Kaushal S	07/20/12	10.4	Draft court papers (1.7); review contracts (0.1); emails to J. Alvarez, G. Moody and M. Cormack regarding court papers (0.2); email status update to J. Alvarez, M. Cormack, R. Estacio, J. Eum, J. Lin, A. Mehes, G. Moody and D. Toscano (0.1); call with A. Starr regarding court papers (0.1); call with G. Moody, D. Klein regarding filing under seal (0.3); call with G. Moody regarding filing under seal (0.2); meet with A. Starr, G. Moody and D. Toscano regarding Vitol (0.7); revise court papers (7.0).
Klein DS	07/20/12	3.5	Coordinate venue objection fact gathering and analysis of same (2.3); internal team status meeting on same (0.7); review autostay motion regarding state court action and emails with litigation team regarding same (0.5).
Lin J	07/20/12	6.8	Research case law on motions to transfer venue under S.D.N.Y. and Second Circuit law (1.2); research case law regarding venue (4.1); meet with M. McClammy and others to discuss venue issues (0.5); draft emails summarizing research and send to J. Foust and others (1.0).
Martin JD	07/20/12	0.4	Communications with C. Ebetino, B. Hatfield, B. Resnick, A. Starr regarding motion scheduling.
McClammy JI	07/20/12	5.6	Review and comment regarding Committee presentation (0.3); prepare powerpoint regarding venue issues (0.8); conference with L. Samet, R. Estacio and others regarding status of venue tasks (0.5); review venue fact materials (0.7); review legal research (1.4); review case background materials (0.9); telephone conference with E. Moskowitz regarding status updates (0.2); telephone conference with S. Gordon regarding joinder issues (0.2); email correspondence regarding joinder issues (0.4); telephone conference with E. Moskowitz and D. Klein regarding joinder matters (0.2).
McGreal MM	07/20/12	0.3	Correspondence regarding objection to venue motion.
Melvin MM	07/20/12	1.8	Review various dockets and obtain precedent 9019 stipulations for J. Foust (1.4); obtain additional precedent for J. Foust (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moody, Jr. GM	07/20/12	8.6	Review and revise draft settlement agreements (4.1); call with S. Kaushal regarding draft settlement agreements (0.5); call with S. Kaushal regarding revisions to same (0.2); call with D. Toscano regarding same (0.1); meet with A. Starr and others regarding settlement posture (0.6); call with counterparties regarding settlement (0.4); review correspondence regarding settlement negotiations (0.7); review research of J. Alvarez regarding bankruptcy filing (0.4); research procedural issues regarding filing under seal (1.2); meet with S. Kaushal and J. Alvarez regarding bankruptcy filing procedures (0.4).
Resnick BM	07/20/12	0.8	Emails regarding non-Massey override agreements (0.5); call with J. Bromley (0.1); call with M. Huebner regarding overrides (0.2).
Ruiz EL	07/20/12	2.1	Calls with M. Sullivan regarding certain pre-petition litigation-related motion (0.8); review and revision of the same (1.3).
Samet L	07/20/12	10.1	Research regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue (3.7); draft opposition to motion to transfer venue (5.2); meeting with J. McClammy, D. Klein, and others regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue and factual development for same (1.0).
Schaible DS	07/20/12	1.0	Coordinate regarding Venue Motion issues (0.4); emails regarding Venue Motion issues (0.6).
Schaible DS	07/20/12	1.3	Telephone calls and coordinate regarding coal contract issues with Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.8); coordinate regarding coal supply contract disputes (0.5).
Starr AT	07/20/12	5.9	Calls and emails with contract counterparties regarding negotiations (1.1); revise contracts (1.3); calls and emails regarding counterparty issues with J. Jones, J. Bean, B. Bennett, R. Wuller, T. Thomas, D. Toscano, S. Kaushal and G. Moody (2.5); calls regarding filing procedures for contracts (0.2); review and revise motion regarding lift-stay (0.5); calls and emails regarding the same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Sullivan MN	07/20/12	3.5	Conference with A. Starr regarding motion and order regarding certain litigation (0.2); call with A. Starr regarding motion and order regarding certain litigation (0.1); review and revise motion and order regarding certain litigation (2.4); emails to A. Starr, J. Martin and D. Klein with revised motion and order regarding certain litigation (0.1); calls with E. Ruiz regarding motion and order regarding certain litigation (0.4); call from A. Starr regarding motion and order regarding certain litigation (0.1); email to D. Schaible, D. Klein, E. Ruiz, A. Starr and J. Martin with revised motion and order regarding certain litigation (0.1); email to Patriot and T. Coburn with revised motion and order regarding certain litigation (0.1).
Toscano DB	07/20/12	5.8	Review draft court papers (0.1); email with S. Kaushal regarding same (0.1); revise draft agreement (0.7); telephone conference with A. Starr, S. Kaushal and G. Moody (0.5); revise draft agreement (1.2); draft slide for presentation to Creditors Committee (1.5); review draft court papers and email S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding same (0.3); review revised draft of settlement papers (0.1); review revised draft of Credit Committee presentation slide (0.1); review draft agreement and email exchanges with Davis Polk litigation team regarding same (1.2).
Williams KC	07/20/12	5.1	Legal research on venue transfer issues (4.8); team meeting (0.3).
Zhu B	07/20/12	2.2	Attend conference with A. Mehes regarding overrides agreement analysis (0.5); review and prepare correspondence with J. Martin, B. Resnick and Patriot team regarding override agreement issues (0.6); analyze override contracts for integration and setoff issues (1.1).
Estacio R	07/21/12	2.4	Edit objection to motion to transfer venue (2.2); correspond with L. Samet et al regarding the same (0.2).
Eum JS	07/21/12	8.0	Compile cases cited in United Mine Workers Association Motion, research supplement and in regarding PWS decision as per J. Foust.
Kaminetzky BS	07/21/12	0.2	Email regarding venue data and response.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McClammy JI	07/21/12	2.5	Review fact binder regarding venue issues (1.1); review and comment regarding draft opposition brief (1.4).
Samet L	07/21/12	7.4	Research regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue (2.7); draft and edit opposition to motion to transfer venue (4.5); emails with D. Klein regarding fact development for venue motion (0.2).
Starr AT	07/21/12	0.5	Calls and emails regarding counterparty contracts with B. Bennett, G. Moody, S. Kaushal and D. Toscano.
Williams KC	07/21/12	2.3	Research on various legal transfer issues.
Zhu B	07/21/12	7.5	Review override agreement and related agreements (5.6); prepare summary of facts and legal analysis regarding same (1.9).
Huebner MS	07/22/12	0.4	Emails regarding venue litigation (0.2); emails regarding various override and Peabody issues (0.2).
Kaminetzky BS	07/22/12	0.3	Email regarding venue data and response.
Kaushal S	07/22/12	0.6	Emails to D. Klein, A. Starr, D. Toscano and G. Moody regarding filing (0.3); review court papers regarding same (0.1); call with D. Klein, A. Starr, D. Toscano, G. Moody and D. Schaible regarding same (0.2).
Klein DS	07/22/12	2.7	Coordinate with clients and others to gather factual record for venue objection (1.3); emails with litigators regarding contract amendments and state court lift-stay and call with D. Schaible regarding same (0.5); review and comment on same (0.7); emails and call with E. Ruiz regarding same (0.2).
Law EC	07/22/12	3.3	Further precedent research regarding venue transfers (1.9); review hearing transcript regarding same (1.2); email to M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).
McClammy JI	07/22/12	4.7	Review and revise draft opposition brief (2.3); telephone conferences with L. Samet regarding draft brief (0.2); email correspondence regarding venue motion issues (0.3); review cited cases (1.5); review draft of venue declaration (0.4).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/22/12	1.9	Review revised contract and summarize revisions (0.9); correspondence with S. Kaushal et al regarding revised contract (0.3); call with D. Klein et al regarding bankruptcy filing (0.2); review amended contract in advance of call regarding bankruptcy filing (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	07/22/12	3.9	Review, edit and draft brief in opposition to motion to transfer venue (3.4); correspondence with team regarding research questions (0.5).
Samet L	07/22/12	7.7	Research regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue (2.0); draft and edit opposition to motion to transfer venue (3.8); draft supporting declaration (1.9).
Schaible DS	07/22/12	0.4	Review and revise litigation lift-stay motion.
Schaible DS	07/22/12	0.4	Emails regarding venue issues.
Starr AT	07/22/12	1.6	Review revised contracts (0.6); emails to client regarding same (0.6); conference call regarding court filings with D. Klein, D. Schaible, D. Toscano and S. Kaushal (0.4).
Toscano DB	07/22/12	1.5	Telephone conference with A. Starr, D. Schaible, D. Klein, S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding filing court papers (0.2); read agreements and email Davis Polk team regarding same (1.3).
Williams KC	07/22/12	1.0	Legal research on venue transfer issues.
Alvarez J	07/23/12	2.4	Email review regarding automatic stay litigation court paper drafting (0.3); call with G. Moody to discuss case status (0.2); review court papers (1.3); meeting with S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding court papers (0.6).
Estacio R	07/23/12	9.2	Conference with L. Samet and others regarding objection to motion to transfer venue (0.6); edit same (1.2); legal research regarding same (7.4).
Eum JS	07/23/12	1.7	Update emails related to venue transfer for Patriot: factual research for objection to venue transfer binder as per J. Foust.
Foust JT	07/23/12	0.7	Team meeting to discuss venue transfer objection.
Foust JT	07/23/12	4.4	Factual and legal citecheck of venue transfer objection.
Huebner MS	07/23/12	6.6	Prepare for calls with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and bondholder groups regarding venue issues (1.4); call with T. Mayer regarding venue issues (0.8); call with R. Stark regarding venue issues (0.7); full turn of venue opposition brief (2.8); multiple conversations with clients regarding venue issues and approach (0.8); emails regarding possible litigation from surety bond providers (0.1).
Kamietzky BS	07/23/12	1.6	Review and edit venue brief (0.8); calls and email regarding strategy, brief, dates, Unsecured Creditors' Committee, joinders and tasks (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Kaushal S	07/23/12	10.5	Revise court papers (6.9); prepare for call with creditors (0.2); meet with D. Klein regarding call with court and call court (0.1); call with G. Moody regarding filing, court papers (0.3); call with creditors (0.8); call with D. Klein regarding court papers (0.1); call and meet with G. Moody regarding court papers (0.2); prepare materials for creditors (0.4); call with D. Toscano, G. Moody regarding court papers (0.2); review court papers (0.5); meet with G. Moody, J. Alvarez regarding same (0.5); meet with A. Starr, D. Toscano regarding same (0.3).
Klein DS	07/23/12	4.3	Coordinate on factual data gathering and analysis for venue motion (2.7); team meeting on venue motion and follow-up on related issues (0.6); coordinate on timing of motion filing from follow-up of Chambers calls, including discussion with M. Huebner regarding same (0.6); review and comment on same (0.4).
Law EC	07/23/12	0.6	Precedent research regarding motions to transfer venue.
Lin J	07/23/12	4.5	Meet with J. McClammy and others to discuss venue issues (0.6); review venue-related case law and prepare bullet points on the relevant aspects of the decision (3.2); review additional venue-related case law and prepare bullet points on the relevant aspects (0.7).
Martin JD	07/23/12	0.5	Communications with A. Starr and E. Powers regarding automatic stay questions.
McClammy JI	07/23/12	6.9	Review venue facts and supporting materials (0.8); review E. Moskowitz comments to brief (0.3); review M. Huebner comments to brief (0.4); review and comment regarding venue brief (1.5); review and comment regarding venue declaration (0.6); telephone conferences with E. Moskowitz regarding venue issues (0.2); conference with L. Samet, R. Estacio and others regarding status updates and next steps (0.5); email regarding venue issues (0.5); follow-up regarding joinder issues (0.4); review case law regarding venue matters (1.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moody, Jr. GM	07/23/12	7.9	Review correspondence regarding draft contract amendments (0.9); call with S. Kaushal regarding draft contract amendments (0.3); call with J. Alvarez regarding filing issues related to draft contract amendments (0.2); call with A. Starr and others regarding revisions to draft agreements (0.2); review and revise draft contract amendments (2.3); call with S. Kaushal regarding revisions to draft agreements (0.4); call with A. Mehes regarding fact research regarding Coal Supply Agreements (0.2); call with S. Kaushal regarding revised draft amendment (0.5); call with D. Toscano regarding same (0.2); call with E. Ruiz regarding procedures for filing in bankruptcy court (0.3); review draft notice of presentment (0.3); review draft stipulation (0.6); meet with S. Kaushal and J. Alvarez regarding draft contract amendments (0.4); factual research regarding market price of coal (0.4); review draft contract amendments (0.7).
Moskowitz E	07/23/12	7.7	Review brief and provide additional edits (1.7); team meeting regarding status and next steps on motion (0.6); correspondence with clients and common interest parties regarding venue motion and strategy (2.2); additional correspondence with team regarding brief (1.3); emails with team regarding research questions and follow up regarding same (1.9).
Resnick BM	07/23/12	3.4	Call with Weil Gotshal regarding venue (0.3); emails regarding venue litigation (0.4); meet with A. Starr and others regarding Massey and other overrides (0.3); correspondence with opposing counsel regarding certain litigation (0.4); research issues for call with C. Ebetino (2.0).
Samet L	07/23/12	9.7	Draft and edit opposition to motion to transfer venue (6.3); emails with E. Moskowitz, J. McClammy and others regarding same (0.8); telephone calls and emails regarding fact development for venue opposition (0.5); draft and edit supporting declaration (1.4); meeting with E. Moskowitz, J. McClammy and others regarding opposition strategy (0.7).
Schaible DS	07/23/12	0.6	Emails regarding utilities objection issues.
Schaible DS	07/23/12	1.3	Emails and telephone calls regarding venue issues and filing preparation.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/23/12	6.6	Calls and emails with counterparties regarding contract revisions (2.1); calls and emails with B. Bennett, C. Damba, T. Thomas, D. Toscano, S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding contract negotiations (2.5); revise contracts (2.0).
Sullivan MN	07/23/12	3.9	Confer with E. Ruiz regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (0.7); call with A. Starr regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (0.1); emails with A. Starr regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (0.2); emails with E. Ruiz regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (0.6); emails with D. Schaible, D. Klein, M. McGreal, A. Starr, J. Martin, and E. Ruiz regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (0.1); emails with J. Martin regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (0.1); email to D. Klein and E. Ruiz regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (0.1); email to D. Schaible, D. Klein, A. Starr, E. Moskowitz, J. McClammy, J. Martin, M. McGreal, and E. Ruiz regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (0.1); review and revise regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (1.8); email to M. Mattingly requesting information relating to motion to proceed with certain litigation claims (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	07/23/12	3.5	Review draft agreements (0.3); telephone conference with A. Starr, D. Klein and counsel for Unsecured Creditors Committee (0.9); review draft agreement and email Davis Polk litigation team regarding same (0.1); telephone conference with S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding draft agreement (0.1); email with A. Starr regarding same (0.1); prepare for call regarding agreement and stipulation (0.1); telephone conference with A. Starr and S. Kaushal regarding same (0.4); revise same (0.4); email exchange with G. Moody regarding draft agreement (0.1); email exchange with M. Huebner regarding potential dispute (0.1); review draft papers (0.4); telephone conference with S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding draft agreements (0.1); telephone conference with S. Kaushal regarding same (0.1); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding same (0.1); draft message to client regarding same (0.2).
Williams KC	07/23/12	1.9	Research tasks on venue transfer.
Zhu B	07/23/12	13.9	Review override agreement and ancillary agreements (4.6); review override agreement and related agreements (4.2); prepare summary of facts and legal analysis regarding same (3.9); prepare various correspondence with A. Starr, B. Resnick and J. Martin regarding override agreements (0.3); attend conference with A. Starr, B. Resnick and J. Martin regarding same (0.9).
Alvarez J	07/24/12	1.6	Email review regarding litigation issues (0.8); review court papers (0.8).
Estacio R	07/24/12	7.3	Review legal research of J. Lin regarding motion to transfer venue (0.4); draft correspondence to J. Lin regarding the same (0.1); correspond with L. Samet regarding the same (0.1); read correspondence from M. Huebner and others regarding opposition to venue transfer motion (0.3); legal research regarding the same (2.8); factual research regarding the same (1.4); conference with L. Samet and others regarding opposition to venue transfer motion (0.4); draft summary of case law for E. Moskowitz regarding collective bargaining agreements (1.8).
Foust JT	07/24/12	7.2	Research standards for calculating present value of pension liabilities.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Foust JT	07/24/12	3.3	Coordinate factual and legal citecheck of objection brief.
Hait S	07/24/12	6.0	Draft §365(d)(3) memo on proration issues and discuss with B. Resnick.
Halford EB	07/24/12	2.5	Generate a manual table of authorities for the memorandum opposition motion transfer venue brief (1.5); Bluebook and correct typographical errors in the citations (0.5); quality check the pagination of the table of authorities (0.5).
Huebner MS	07/24/12	1.9	Call with Stroock regarding venue (0.4); multiple calls with Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel regarding venue (0.9); meeting with E. Moskowitz regarding venue brief and comments (0.2); conference with clients regarding affiant issues for upcoming hearings (0.3); emails with DIP lenders regarding comments on venue brief (0.1).
Kaminetzky BS	07/24/12	0.5	Email regarding venue brief, strategy, data, Unsecured Creditors' Committee and update.
Kaushal S	07/24/12	7.4	Call with A. Starr, G. Moody, E. Ripley regarding court papers (0.5); revise court papers (6.9).
Klein DS	07/24/12	4.4	Coordinate on venue data collection, research and analysis.
Lin J	07/24/12	2.8	Meet with J. McClammy and others to discuss venue issues (0.5); research venue issue (1.1); compile list of alternate venues (0.7); draft emails summarizing the same (0.5).
Martin JD	07/24/12	1.3	Communications with A. Starr and E. Power regarding automatic stay questions (0.6); review automatic stay research (0.7).
McClammy JI	07/24/12	3.3	Conference with L. Samet, R. Estacio and others regarding updates and next steps on venue papers (0.4); email correspondence regarding venue issues (0.4); review venue fact materials (0.8); review revised brief and declaration (1.2); review venue case law (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moody, Jr. GM	07/24/12	8.6	Review and revise draft contract amendments (3.1); review and revise draft stipulations (0.8); correspondence with S. Kaushal regarding revised draft contract amendments (1.2); attend meeting with A. Starr and others regarding revisions to contract amendments and new agreements (0.4); call with E. Ruiz regarding notice of presentment (0.2); correspondence with E. Ruiz and others regarding draft notice of presentment (0.3); assist in filing notice of presentment and stipulations (1.2); call with C. Damba regarding revisions to draft contract amendments (0.3); call with D. Toscano regarding revisions to draft notice of presentment (0.2); calls with S. Kaushal regarding revision to draft agreements and filing documents with court (0.9).
Moskowitz E	07/24/12	9.2	Draft, revise and edit venue objection (1.7); correspond with team regarding research issues for venue objection and reviewing results (1.4); review declaration and correspondence regarding same (1.1); call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel (0.9); call with counsel to indenture trustee (0.2); calls and correspondence with creditors (0.3); follow up regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues (1.3); meet with M. Huebner regarding venue and related issues (0.7); emails to team regarding above (1.6).
Samet L	07/24/12	12.3	Edit opposition to motion to transfer venue (4.8); research regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue (3.2); factual development and analysis for same (2.3); edit support declaration (1.0); conferences with J. McClammy and others regarding litigation strategy (0.4); conferences with E. Moskowitz regarding opposition brief (0.6).
Starr AT	07/24/12	4.4	Revise contracts (1.7); calls and emails with contract counterparties (0.8); calls with T. Thomas, B. Bennett, D. Klein, D. Toscano, S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding coal supply contracts (1.1); finalize contracts (0.5); emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding coal contract (0.3).
Sullivan MN	07/24/12	0.5	Emails to M. Mattingly regarding service of motion (0.2); emails with E. Ruiz regarding service of motion (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	07/24/12	0.4	Telephone conferences with S. Kaushal and G. Moody regarding notice of presentment (0.1); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding same (0.1); telephone conference with S. Kaushal regarding same and email exchanges regarding same (0.2).
Williams KC	07/24/12	4.6	Research on venue transfer issues (4.1); team meeting (0.5).
Zhu B	07/24/12	11.1	Attend conference with A. Mehes regarding rejection motions (0.5); review and prepare various correspondence with J. Martin, B. Resnick and A. Mehes regarding draft rejection motions (1.0); prepare rejection motion (6.4); attend conference with A. Starr, B. Resnick, J. Martin and Patriot team regarding override agreements (2.1); review legal research regarding non-executory contract issues (1.1).
Estacio R	07/25/12	3.9	Correspond with L. Samet regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue (0.1); draft correspondence to J. Lin regarding the same (0.2); edit venue case summary chart (0.4); factual research regarding opposition to motion to transfer (1.2); draft correspondence to E. Moskowitz regarding the same (0.2); legal research regarding motion to transfer venue (1.6); correspond with E. Ruiz and L. Samet regarding bankruptcy court filing procedures (0.2).
Eum JS	07/25/12	1.5	Update emails related to venue transfer for Patriot and factual research for objection to venue transfer binder as per J. Foust.
Foust JT	07/25/12	6.8	Coordinate factual and legal citecheck of objection brief (4.7); record joinders of motion papers for and against venue transfer (2.1).
Huebner MS	07/25/12	2.3	Voicemails with U.S. Trustee regarding venue (0.1); multiple calls with Court, United Mine Worker's Association's counsel, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel regarding venue meeting (2.1); review of AEP joinder and calls regarding same (0.1).
Kaminetzky BS	07/25/12	0.2	Email regarding brief, data, strategy and adjournment.
Kaushal S	07/25/12	1.3	Prepare for and attend call with A. Starr, V. Roovers re court papers (0.2); draft court papers (1.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/25/12	3.0	Review and analysis of bond geographic data (1.1); coordination on fact collection and analysis for venue objection (1.3); revise notice of adjournment for venue motion and coordinate with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.6).
Lin J	07/25/12	2.1	Revise venue-related issue chart (1.2); research Northwest Airlines information for venue motion (0.5); research Jitney Jungle case to consider relevance to venue motion (0.4).
Martin JD	07/25/12	0.5	Emails with E. Power regarding automatic stay issue (0.2); call and email with J. Flaxer regarding Willits action (0.3).
McClammy JI	07/25/12	2.3	Review and comment regarding venue opposition and declaration (1.2); email correspondence regarding venue issues (0.4); telephone conferences with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding venue status (0.2); review client comments on venue papers (0.5).
Mehes A	07/25/12	0.5	Research regarding automatic stay issues.
Moskowitz E	07/25/12	5.9	Review drafts of venue brief and declaration and edit same (1.9); correspondence with team and clients regarding venue issues (1.7); correspondence with creditors regarding venue issues (2.3).
Narayan GS	07/25/12	0.5	Prepare distribution for B. Resnick.
Resnick BM	07/25/12	7.7	Call with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and D. Klein regarding venue (0.3); call with Cleary regarding override-related motion (0.2); second call with opposing counsel regarding override-related motion (0.2); call with J. Wagner and E. Gasparini regarding override-related motion (0.4); review research regarding discovery (3.3); draft talking points for telephonic court conference regarding override agreement (2.9); review override motions (0.4).
Samet L	07/25/12	6.6	Edit opposition to motion to transfer venue (3.5); research regarding opposition to motion to transfer venue (0.2); factual development and analysis for same (0.7); edit supporting declaration (1.4); conferences with E. Moskowitz and J. McClammy regarding opposition papers (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/25/12	5.3	Calls and emails with R. Wuller, J. Bean, M. Mattingly and H. Jernigan regarding certain pre-petition litigations (1.1); calls regarding autostay questions with J. Martin (0.4); calls with counterparties and clients regarding contracts (1.0); draft court pleadings (0.8); draft contracts (2.0).
Sullivan MN	07/25/12	0.3	Email to E. Ruiz regarding motions to proceed with certain litigation (0.1); call with A. Starr regarding motions to proceed with certain litigation (0.1); set up conferences regarding motions to proceed with certain litigation (0.1).
Toscano DB	07/25/12	2.4	Telephone conference with A. Starr regarding contract issue (0.2); read contracts (0.1); read contracts relating to payment issue (0.7); telephone conference with A. Mehes regarding contract interpretation issue, read email message from A. Mehes regarding same (0.1); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding same (0.1); email A. Starr regarding same (0.2); telephone conference with client regarding payment (0.4); office conference with A. Starr regarding same (0.3); draft message regarding same to client (0.3).
Williams KC	07/25/12	3.0	Fact check of objection to motion to transfer (1.6); research on venue transfer issues (1.4).
Zhu B	07/25/12	12.4	Revise override motion (2.2); revise override motion (4.3); revise third override second motion (2.1); review and prepare various correspondence with A. Starr, J. Martin, B. Resnick and A. Mehes regarding override motions (1.1); attend conference with J. Martin and Patriot team regarding override agreements (0.5); review legal research regarding override agreement-related issues (0.6); prepare correspondence with D. Klein and insolvency team regarding post-Case Management Order notice requirements (0.4); revise proposed orders for override motions (0.9); prepare correspondence with Patriot coal team regarding override motions (0.3).
Estacio R	07/26/12	5.8	Draft case analysis chart (0.3); legal research regarding venue transfer motion (1.2); research regarding bankruptcy court local rules (0.8); conference with J. Martin and others regarding litigating contract disputes (1.2); research regarding the same (2.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Eum JS	07/26/12	1.7	Catalog Tampa Electric agreements for Tampa Override directory as per A. Mehes (0.5); update emails related to venue transfer for Patriot and factual research for objection to venue transfer binder as per J. Foust (1.2).
Huebner MS	07/26/12	0.2	Emails regarding venue joinders, precedents and new schedule.
Kaminetzky BS	07/26/12	0.4	Call with E. Moskowitz regarding update (0.1); email regarding adjournment and joinders (0.3).
Kaushal S	07/26/12	4.1	Meet with A. Starr regarding contract (0.3); revise court papers (3.8).
Law EC	07/26/12	0.5	Research regarding unreported decisions on venue transfer (0.3); communications with E. Ruiz, L. Samet and R. Estacio regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	07/26/12	1.3	Draft, revise and file notice of adjournment of deadlines regarding venue motion (1.0); communications with E. Moskowitz and D. Klein regarding same (0.3).
Martin JD	07/26/12	3.4	Update call with company and advisors (1.0); analyze lift stay request regarding action on appeal (0.6); prepare for potential adversary proceedings regarding non-executory contracts (1.8).
McClammy JI	07/26/12	2.1	Review venue papers and comments received (1.3); conference with L. Samet regarding status of venue work streams (0.4); conference with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding venue status and next steps (0.3); telephone conference with counsel for creditor regarding venue motion status (0.1).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/26/12	0.4	Call with S. Kaushal regarding status of negotiations (0.1); locate various court filings and send to E. Ruiz (0.2); call with D. Klein regarding court correspondence with Court (0.1).
Moskowitz E	07/26/12	2.4	Call with clerk and report to parties (0.4); review revised motion and declaration (0.9); meet with J. McClammy and L. Samet regarding motion (0.4); review and edit scheduling notice (0.3); draft correspondence to Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel (0.4).
Perez-Marques AJ	07/26/12	0.9	Conference with A. Starr, J. Martin and others regarding Massey Litigation issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	07/26/12	1.9	Meet with M. Huebner regarding court conference (0.2); research various issues regarding adversary proceeding (0.8); research override property interest issues (0.9).
Samet L	07/26/12	2.9	Edit opposition to motion to transfer venue (1.6); edit supporting declaration (0.6); conferences with E. Moskowitz and J. McClammy regarding opposition papers (0.4); conferences with J. McClammy regarding same (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/26/12	0.5	Emails regarding the utilities motion.
Starr AT	07/26/12	3.7	Review materials regarding contract counterparty (0.8); calls with M. Huebner, D. Toscano and S. Kaushal regarding the same (0.6); calls regarding contract negotiations to counterparty, B. Bennett and T. Thomas (0.9); calls with Bridgehouse/Keystone with outside counsel, J. Jones and J. Bean (0.9); draft stipulations regarding the same (0.5).
Sullivan MN	07/26/12	5.0	Call to A. Libby regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (0.1); email to J. Martin regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (0.1); calls with A. Starr regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (0.4); email to S. Krause regarding litigation parties (0.1); calls with E. Ruiz regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (0.2); conference with A. Starr, J. Bean, M. Mattingly and H. Jernigan regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (0.6); draft stipulations and motions regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (2.9); conference with A. Starr regarding board presentation (0.2); draft slides for board presentation (0.4).
Toscano DB	07/26/12	0.3	Email exchange with A. Starr regarding contract issue (0.1); compile relevant legal research and circulate to A. Starr and S. Kaushal (0.2).
Williams KC	07/26/12	0.7	Create chart for parties filing objections to motion to transfer.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	07/26/12	10.7	Attend telephonic conference with J. Chapman, litigation team and opposing counsel regarding confirmation and rejection motion (0.5); attend follow up conference with B. Resnick and A. Starr and litigation team regarding rejection motion issues and strategy (0.8); attend conference with A. Mehes regarding override agreement-related research and next steps (0.4); attend conference with A. Starr, T. Perez, J. Martin and litigation team regarding override agreement-related strategy and next steps (1.0); prepare various correspondence with E. Moskowitz, D. Klein and litigation team regarding adversary proceeding issues (0.3); prepare draft declaratory judgment complaint (5.6); review legal research regarding real property covenants (1.1); prepare correspondence and materials to A. Starr and D. Toscano regarding Peabody agreements (0.4); prepare and review various correspondence with C. Ebetino, J. Jones, J. Martin and litigation team regarding draft override motions (0.6).
Estacio R	07/27/12	9.5	Conference with L. Samet regarding venue transfer objection (0.2); conference with J. Martin and others regarding litigating contract disputes (1.2); conferences with G. Moody regarding the same (0.1); review Patriot contracts (3.2); research regarding procedure for objection to motion to transfer venue (1.8); draft correspondence to E. Moskowitz and others regarding the same (0.3); research regarding rules applicable to adversary proceedings (0.6); draft adversary complaint regarding contract disputes (2.1).
Eum JS	07/27/12	3.5	Update emails related to venue transfer for Patriot and factual research for objection to venue transfer binder as per J. Foust (1.0); research cases and treatises as per A. Mehes (2.5).
Kaushal S	07/27/12	6.5	Call with A. Starr, D. Toscano regarding contracts (0.5); meet with A. Starr, D. Toscano regarding same (0.5); draft email regarding same (1.0); revise court papers (4.3); emails to V. Roovers, A. Sisitsky, A. Starr and D. Toscano regarding same (0.2).
Klein DS	07/27/12	0.6	Coordinate regarding factual gathering and analysis (0.4); emails with litigant and A. Starr regarding potential liftstay (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Kovachevich B	07/27/12	0.5	Initial project research meeting with A. Mehes.
Martin JD	07/27/12	1.3	Emails with E. Power and E. Waller regarding automatic stay issues in various actions.
McClammy JI	07/27/12	0.8	Email correspondence regarding venue issues (0.4); review venue open items (0.4).
Moskowitz E	07/27/12	0.9	Calls with creditor and follow-up.
Perez-Marques AJ	07/27/12	3.9	Conference with J. Martin (1.1); review memoranda and contracts (2.5); teleconferences with team regarding legal research issues (0.3).
Samet L	07/27/12	1.8	Edit opposition to motion to transfer venue (0.6); factual development and analysis for same (0.6); edit supporting declaration (0.4); conferences with R. Estacio regarding research issues (0.2).
Starr AT	07/27/12	3.8	Conference calls with contract counterparties (0.4); calls and emails with B. Bennett, T. Thomas, C. Damba, R. Mead, M. Schoeder, D. Toscano and S. Kaushal regarding contracts (1.8); revise contracts (0.5); review and revise court filings regarding contracts (0.6); emails regarding court filings (0.6); emails regarding stay (0.2); draft materials regarding certain pre-petition litigations (0.3).
Sullivan MN	07/27/12	1.3	Calls with A. Starr regarding committee presentation (0.2); revise committee presentation (0.2); emails to W. Taylor, W. Hoeben and N. Chiu regarding committee presentation (0.1); call with D. Schiabile regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (0.1); call with A. Starr regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (0.1); email to H. Jernigan and M. Mattingly regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (0.1); revise stipulation to proceed with certain litigation (0.3); email to A. Starr regarding stipulation to proceed with certain litigation (0.1); emails to D. Schiabile, D. Klein, M. McGreal, E. Ruiz, A. Starr, and J. Martin regarding motion to proceed with certain litigation (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	07/27/12	2.8	Telephone conference wiith A. Starr and S. Kaushal regarding contract issue (0.5); office conference with A. Starr and S. Kaushal regarding contract issue (0.5); office conference with S. Kaushal regarding same (0.1); read contract and email A. Starr and S. Kaushal regarding same (0.2); review message on legal issue from A. Mehes (0.1); revise draft message to M. Huebner regarding contract issue (0.7); email exchange, telephone conference with A. Starr regarding same (0.2); telephone conference with E. White regarding contract issue (0.3); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding settlement (0.2).
Zhu B	07/27/12	2.3	Prepare and review various correspondence with A. Starr, D. Toscano and S. Kaushal regarding issues relating to Peabody spin-off agreements (0.8); attend conference with B. Resnick, T. Krauley, T. Perez, J. Martin and litigation team regarding override motion format and strategy (1.5).
Kaushal S	07/28/12	0.4	Review contract (0.3); email A. Starr regarding same (0.1).
Martin JD	07/28/12	5.7	Analyze contracts in preparation for adversary proceedings (1.2); research in preparation for adversary proceedings (4.5).
Starr AT	07/28/12	0.3	Calls and emails regarding counterparty contracts (0.2); emails regarding stipulation with S. Kaushal (0.1).
Sullivan MN	07/28/12	0.2	Email to A. Starr regarding stipulation to proceed with litigation (0.1); email to H. Jernigan and M. Mattingly regarding stipulation to proceed with litigation (0.1).
Huebner MS	07/29/12	0.2	Review and reply to emails regarding Peabody and override issues.
Martin JD	07/29/12	3.9	Analyze potential motion to lift automatic stay and related research (1.6); research in preparation for adversary proceedings (1.5); review draft adversary proceeding complaint (0.8).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/29/12	8.0	Research legal issues regarding evidentiary issues in bankruptcy court (7.1); summarize same and send results of research to A. Perez and J. Martin (0.9).
Resnick BM	07/29/12	0.2	Emails regarding override research.
Samet L	07/29/12	3.0	Research and analysis for potential sur-reply submission or venue hearing.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/29/12	0.6	Calls and emails regarding negotiations with counterparty regarding relationship.
Cormack M	07/30/12	0.1	Call from claimant.
Foust JT	07/30/12	8.3	Research precedents and draft response to union request for professional fees.
Huebner MS	07/30/12	1.4	Conference calls with clients regarding Peabody (1.0); emails regarding Peabody payments (0.4).
Kaushal S	07/30/12	5.0	Review contracts (1.0); meet with A. Starr, D. Toscano and J. Martin regarding call with Patriot (0.2); call with Patriot (1.0); meet with A. Starr and D. Toscano regarding same (0.2); draft court papers (0.9); review court papers (0.2); conduct legal research regarding contracts (1.5).
Kovachevich B	07/30/12	5.8	Research severability and overlapping consideration (4.0); draft a research memo for A. Mehes on same (1.5); debrief research with A. Mehes (0.3).
Law EC	07/30/12	1.1	Additional research regarding precedents for venue (0.9); communications with L. Samet regarding same (0.2).
Martin JD	07/30/12	6.5	Update call with company and advisors (1.1); emails with J. Bean, E. Waller, E. Power and others regarding various automatic stay issues (1.5); call with opposing counsel regarding potential adversary proceeding and follow up (0.4); review and revise draft adversary proceeding complaint (1.2); conferences with T. Perez and A. Mehes regarding same (1.2); conference with G. Moody regarding adversary proceeding (1.1).
McClammy JI	07/30/12	0.4	Review revised venue papers.
Moody, Jr. GM	07/30/12	0.2	Correspondence with D. Toscano regarding finalized court filings (0.1); send finalized court filings to E. White and others (0.1).
Resnick BM	07/30/12	0.3	Emails regarding overrides research (0.2); emails regarding overrides and DIP covenants (0.1).
Samet L	07/30/12	2.1	Edit opposition to motion to transfer venue (0.5); edit supporting declaration (0.4); prepare outline for hearing or sur-reply submission (1.1); telephone calls with claims agent regarding factual issues for venue opposition (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/30/12	1.4	Conference call regarding certain pre-petition litigations with J. Jones, R. Wuller, A. Rogoff and M. Sullivan (0.7); call with M. Sullivan, J. Jones and R. Wuller regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee requests (0.4); calls and emails with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding the same (0.3).
Sullivan MN	07/30/12	6.2	Call with A Rogoff, A. Starr, R. Wuller and J. Jones regarding certain pre-petition motion (0.7); call with J. Jones, R. Wuller and M. Mattingly regarding certain pre-petition motion (0.5); conference with A. Starr regarding certain pre-petition motion (0.1); legal research and drafting analysis in connection with certain pre-petition motion and Unsecured Creditors' Committee's request (4.8); call with M. McGreal regarding certain pre-petition motion (0.1).
Toscano DB	07/30/12	2.5	Prepare for client call regarding contract issues (0.8); office conference with A. Starr, J. Martin and S. Kaushal regarding contract issues (0.3); telephone conference with client group, M. Huebner, A. Starr, J. Martin and S. Kaushal regarding contract issues (1.0); office conference with A. Starr and S. Kaushal regarding contract issues (0.3); email exchange regarding draft RWE stipulation (0.1).
Williams KC	07/30/12	4.3	Research on debtors and payment of union professional fees.
Cormack M	07/31/12	0.8	Discuss filing with A. Mehes (0.3); research adversary proceeding rules (0.5).
Kaushal S	07/31/12	5.9	Legal research regarding contract (5.7); draft email regarding court hearing (0.2).
Kovachevich B	07/31/12	3.1	Meet with T. Perez on research relating to agreements to execute agreements (0.5); researching the same (2.5); discuss research with A. Mehes (0.1).
Martin JD	07/31/12	5.7	Review and revise other draft complaints concerning non-executory contracts (1.8); numerous calls and emails with T. Perez, A. Mehes, R. Estacio and G. Moody regarding draft complaints (2.6); review research on contract integration (1.3).
McClammy JI	07/31/12	0.4	Review venue correspondence (0.2); review outline regarding venue issues (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moody, Jr. GM	07/31/12	0.8	Call with S. Kaushal regarding preparation for court hearing (0.3); call with D. Klein and others regarding same (0.1); review summary of confidential information description and provide comments to S. Kaushal (0.2); call with E. Ruiz regarding preparation for court hearing (0.1); call with M. McGreal regarding preparation for court hearing (0.1).
Samet L	07/31/12	0.3	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz and J. McClammy regarding opposition brief.
Starr AT	07/31/12	2.1	Review Bridgestone research (0.2); draft emails to J. Jones and J. Bean regarding same (0.4); review and revise counterparty stipulations (0.6); calls and emails regarding court conference regarding same (0.8); calls with J. Martin regarding stay (0.1).
Sullivan MN	07/31/12	0.1	Call with A. Starr regarding research surrounding non-core litigation.
Toscano DB	07/31/12	4.2	Revise draft message to Judge (0.1); telephone conference with S. Kaushal regarding same (0.1); read materials on integration issue (0.9); legal research regarding assumption issue (2.9); telephone conference with S. Kaushal regarding assumption issue (0.2).
Williams KC	07/31/12	1.5	Research on debtors and payment of union's professional fees (0.9); edit and comment on letter to E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.6).
Total AUTOMATIC STAY\ LITIGATION		1,338.4	
CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDERS\UCC ISSUES			
Huber BM	07/10/12	1.3	Emails regarding critical vendors motion approval and payments before next Monday (0.8); consider JV sale issues (0.5).
Oshen O	07/10/12	1.2	Retrieve filed Critical Vendor Motion (0.3); review same (0.2); email D. McCallister regarding same (0.1); emails with B. Huber regarding same (0.1); emails with B. Huber regarding joint ventures (0.1); consider First Day Motions outcome in relation to critical vendors (0.2); emails with B. Huber regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/11/12	6.6	Critical vendors call and follow-up regarding same (0.8); call with clients regarding top 50 creditors (0.6); coordinate on comments to claims trading order (0.5); review revised creditor list (0.8); calls with R. McWilliams regarding vendor issues (0.3); review and revise utilities motion (1.7); emails with company regarding critical (0.3); review notice of 341 meeting and comment on same (0.5); additional turn of utilities motion and email to clients and others (1.1).
Libby A	07/11/12	2.4	Draft and revise utilities motion and communications with E. Ruiz and D. Klein regarding same (1.6); research precedents and draft notice of hearing for utilities motion (0.3); revise notice of commencement for creditors and communications with E. Ruiz and O. Oshen regarding same (0.5).
McGreal MM	07/11/12	2.1	Teleconference with Company and D. Klein regarding critical vendors (0.6); teleconference regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee formation with Company, Blackstone and D. Schaible (0.8); research Unsecured Creditors' Committee formation (0.7).
Ruiz EL	07/11/12	2.4	Review and revise Utilities motion (1.9); review of precedent utilities motions (0.5).
Schaible DS	07/11/12	0.7	Unsecured Creditors' Committee call explanation.
Beshar SE	07/12/12	0.6	Review trading issues and discuss with W. Hoeben.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/12/12	4.2	Review and comment on utilities motion (0.5); emails with J. Jones regarding same (0.1); email E. Gasparini regarding utilities motion (0.1); review top 50 creditor list and discuss with D. Schaible (0.3); numerous calls with various creditors and other parties in interest related to filing questions (0.7); call with C. Zhu regarding creditor payment issues (0.2); emails with S. Mell regarding utilities motion (0.2); review surety bond schedule and coordinate with E. Richey regarding same (0.6); coordinate with E. Ruiz regarding critical vendor requests (0.2); emails with clients regarding creditor list (0.2); email J. Martin regarding same (0.1); review DIP order provisions related to utilities deposits and emails with credit team regarding same (0.2); research related to trade lien statutes (0.4); emails with R. McWilliams regarding royalty payment issues and review data regarding same (0.2); review and comment on critical vendor motion (0.2).
McGreal MM	07/12/12	0.9	Draft email to client regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee formation process (0.6); review letter from counsel to Peoples Capital regarding lease (0.2); email Alix regarding letter from Peoples Capital lease (0.1).
McGreal MM	07/12/12	0.2	Review Weil comments to utilities motion.
Ruiz EL	07/12/12	0.7	Review of and revise utilities motion.
Tsiouris N	07/12/12	1.4	Review and edit motions regarding 503(b)(9) and reclamation procedures and rejection or assumption procedures (1.1); communications with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Klein DS	07/13/12	3.9	Calls and emails with clients on numerous critical vendor issues (1.4); coordinate with AlixPartners on various creditor requests (0.8); emails with clients on top creditor list and discussions with D. Schaible regarding same (0.5); review and finalize utilities motion (0.6); review and comment on Massey motion (0.6).
McGreal MM	07/13/12	0.8	Teleconference with client and D. Schaible regarding critical vendors list (0.7); email client and AlixPartners regarding same (0.1).
Ruiz EL	07/13/12	0.5	Review and revise claims settlement motion.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/13/12	1.8	Emails regarding creditors' list (0.5); conference call and coordinate regarding critical vendors issues (0.8); emails regarding critical vendor motion (0.5).
Starr AT	07/13/12	9.1	Conference calls, emails and meeting with J. Bean, I. Engelhardt, B. Bennet, M. Huebner, M. Schroeder, Blackstone, J. Martin and D. Toscano regarding Coal Supply Agreements (5.2); review materials regarding coal supply agreements and provide comments (2.5); conference call with Coal Supply Agreement issue experts (0.8); calls with banks (0.6).
Klein DS	07/15/12	0.5	Emails with W. Petit regarding critical vendor status (0.2); emails with S. Mell on critical vendor issues (0.3).
Eum JS	07/16/12	1.2	Compile PDF portfolios for Coal Supply Agreements counterparties as per J. Alvarez.
Klein DS	07/16/12	2.6	Emails with AlixPartners team regarding critical vendor process (0.3); call with E. Waller regarding augering contract (0.2); call with numerous creditors and parties in interest regarding filing (0.6); discuss top creditor list with D. Schaible (0.2); coordinate on claims settlement procedures (0.3); coordinate on reclamation demands (0.3); communications with W. Elkins and other clients on creditor calls and other issues (0.3); coordinate on top creditor list issues with company and AlixPartners (0.4).
McGreal MM	07/16/12	0.4	Conference with D. Schaible and D. Klein regarding top 50 creditors list (0.2); conference with Alix regarding same (0.2).
Schaible DS	07/16/12	2.6	Review and revise reclamation motion (0.4); review and revise settlement procedures motion (0.5); creditor calls (0.7); emails and coordinate regarding creditor lists and U.S. Trustee requests (1.0).
de Richemont P	07/17/12	0.8	Review, prepare and file notice of revised top 50 creditors list (0.7); coordinate service of same (0.1).
Hait S	07/17/12	3.2	Turn comments to reclamation motion (1.2); revise second day motions (1.4); file claims (0.4); review creditor voicemail (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/17/12	3.1	Numerous calls with creditors regarding filing and critical vendor issues (0.5); coordinate with R. McWilliams regarding same (0.3); call with R. McWilliams regarding lien issue (0.2); emails with J. Jones and others regarding prepetition settlement obligations and voicemail related to same (0.2); call with utility regarding service shutoff (0.2); emails with J. Bean regarding insurance issues and research and analysis related to same (0.5); coordinate with W. Elkins regarding utilities issues (0.3); review several creditor letters and coordinate with R. McWilliams regarding same (0.6); call with Komatsu attorney and coordinate with clients regarding same (0.3).
McGreal MM	07/17/12	3.4	Teleconference with client regarding critical vendors (0.6); correspondence with Company and Kentucky Utilities regarding Heritage account (0.3); correspondence with various creditors and D. Klein regarding critical vendor status (0.7); review precedents of claims settlement procedures motion (0.3); revise claims settlement procedures motion (0.9); correspondence with D. Schaible regarding same (0.2); correspondence with client regarding same (0.2); teleconference with counsel for People's Capital regarding leases (0.2).
Melvin MM	07/17/12	0.3	Locate and forward claim settlement motion and order precedent to K. Satter.
Ruiz EL	07/17/12	3.9	Review and revise reclamation procedures motion (1.9); review and revise claims settlement motion (2.0).
Satter KM	07/17/12	3.2	Revise settlement motion and review precedent motions (1.1); search for precedent claims settlement motions (1.5); review of precedent claim settlement motions (0.6).
Schaible DS	07/17/12	4.4	Teleconference with multiple creditors regarding claim issues (1.1); teleconferences with creditor claims with clients regarding creditor claims (0.6); emails regarding creditor list and follow-up regarding same (0.8); work on U.S. Trustee creditor requests (0.5); teleconferences and coordinate regarding organization meeting (0.8); teleconferences and coordinate regarding organization meeting (0.6).
Hait S	07/18/12	0.5	Review and respond to creditor voicemail.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	07/18/12	2.7	Conversation with various creditors and U.S. Trustee at Unsecured Creditors' Committee's organizational meeting and attend same (1.3); prepare for Unsecured Creditors' Committee's organizational meeting (0.6); emails regarding initial meetings and prepare to meet with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's professionals (0.8).
Klein DS	07/18/12	3.5	Call with company regarding critical vendors (0.4); coordinate on critical vendor and warehousemen issues (0.3); numerous calls with creditors and utilities about prepetition claims (0.7); research repairmen liens issues and DIP overlay (0.6); review precedent committee bylaws (0.2); emails with J. Jones and M. O'Connell regarding prepetition claims (0.3); emails with J. Martin regarding utilities issues and analysis of same (0.5); coordinate on published decision book (0.2); emails to Blackstone regarding creditor issues and other near term tasks (0.3).
McGreal MM	07/18/12	3.7	Review precedent caps on claims settlement procedures (0.3); review and comment on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation (1.8); teleconference with Company regarding critical vendors (0.4); coordinate documents requests for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.8); email Company regarding same (0.1); teleconference with AlixPartners regarding warehousemen liens (0.2); teleconference with H. Baker and D. Klein regarding laboratory contracts (0.2).
Resnick BM	07/18/12	0.3	Emails regarding sharing of documents with Unsecured Creditors' Committee.
Ruiz EL	07/18/12	5.9	Prepare for Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (3.5); review and revise claims settlement motion (2.4).
Schaible DS	07/18/12	7.6	Coordinate regarding creditor claims (0.5); organizational meeting and follow-up regarding same (4.6); Unsecured Creditors' Committee update call and follow-up calls with clients (1.2); emails and teleconferences and coordinate with Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel regarding initial meetings (0.9); emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee information requests (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Howard L	07/19/12	1.7	Conference with A. Starr and A. Mehes regarding equity issue (0.4); review correspondence related to equity issue (0.7); draft summary of equity issue (0.6).
Huebner MS	07/19/12	2.1	Prepare for and meet with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel.
Klein DS	07/19/12	7.0	Call with company regarding critical vendors (0.4); prepare for and participate in initial meeting with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel and follow-up on issues from meeting (2.2); call with AlixPartners regarding lien issues and follow-up research related to same (0.4); revise reclamation procedures motion and research precedents regarding same (0.6); emails with H. Baker on prepetition claim issues and coordinate with team and company regarding same (0.5); review DIP agreement related to lien covenants and research related issues (0.6); review Unsecured Creditors' Committee information and begin pulling together documents to provide (0.7); review and comment on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation and coordinate on additional slides (1.2); coordinate on responsive documents from FTI data request (0.4).
McGreal MM	07/19/12	0.4	Correspondence with Company regarding sharing documents with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2); correspondence regarding presentation to Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2).
Mehes A	07/19/12	2.1	Meeting with A. Starr and L. Howard regarding equity issue (0.6); review equity background documents (0.3); research equity issue (1.2).
Ruiz EL	07/19/12	4.4	Critical vendor call with Alix partners (0.3); review of warehousemen agreement (0.6); preparation for meeting with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.6); review and revise reclamation and §503(b)(9) procedures motion (1.9).
Schaible DS	07/19/12	3.8	Emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting preparation (0.8); preparation for conduct Unsecured Creditors' Committee update meeting regarding case status and background (2.5); emails with and about Unsecured Creditors' Committee's objection deadline issues (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/19/12	1.6	Review shareholder letter (0.3); meeting with L. Howard and A. Mehes regarding response (0.4); emails to client and financial advisers regarding same (0.4); plan response (0.5).
Starr AT	07/19/12	6.9	Revise and finalize charts regarding contracts (0.5); calls and emails with counterparties regarding contract negotiations (0.7); revise draft contracts (3.5); calls, meetings and emails with B. Bennett, D. Toscano, S. Kaushal, E. Ripley, M. Huebner and J. Bean (2.2).
Vonnegut EJ	07/19/12	0.6	Discuss lease payment requests with clients.
Howard L	07/20/12	4.4	Draft outline of document regarding equity issue.
Klein DS	07/20/12	4.9	Call with clients and AlixPartners regarding critical vendors (0.3); review and revise letter from creditor and communications with R. McWilliams regarding same (0.3); coordinate data collection regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's information request (0.8); coordinate with AlixPartners regarding FTI data request (0.5); coordinate on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation, including revisions to new slides (1.1); review utilities objection and coordinate with D. Schaible regarding same (0.3); emails with company and AlixPartners regarding numerous vendor management issues (0.7); emails with B. Resnick regarding Massey motion (0.3); call with Frontier counsel regarding utility deposit request (0.2); gather documents and email to Committee (0.4).
Libby A	07/20/12	0.4	Call with K. Satter regarding no objection declaration to utilities motion (0.2); review no objection declaration to utilities motion (0.2).
Mehes A	07/20/12	1.1	Edit documents relating to equity issue.
Ruiz EL	07/20/12	4.0	Draft Unsecured Creditors' Committee slides for presentation (0.8); review of Unsecured Creditors' Committee Bylaws (1.3); review of precedent Bylaws (1.0); emails regarding notice of commencement (0.5); review of 10-k for Unsecured Creditors' Committee slides (0.2); emails to D. Klein and M. McGreal regarding the same (0.2).
Satter KM	07/20/12	0.6	Draft and review utilities notice of no objection, run blacklines and speak with A. Libby regarding the same.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/20/12	1.3	Telephone conference with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and follow-up regarding Motions pending (0.7); emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee confidentiality language (0.6).
Schaible DS	07/20/12	0.8	Telephone conference with utility counsel regarding utilities objection (0.5); coordinate regarding utilities objection (0.3).
Starr AT	07/20/12	0.5	Prepare materials for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee.
Howard L	07/21/12	0.5	Revise outline of correspondence regarding equity issue.
Klein DS	07/21/12	1.8	Review and comment on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation and coordinate with Davis Polk and Blackstone team regarding same (1.2); emails with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding relief set for August 2 (0.4); call with R. Mead regarding bank accounts (0.2).
Schaible DS	07/21/12	0.6	Emails regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation.
Howard L	07/22/12	0.3	Review and circulate draft documents pertaining to equity issues.
Huebner MS	07/22/12	0.4	Emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence.
Klein DS	07/22/12	0.5	Coordinate on additional Unsecured Creditors' Committee's diligence requests.
Howard L	07/23/12	4.7	Research relating to equity issues (3.5); emails and internal conferences regarding equity issues (1.2).
Klein DS	07/23/12	4.3	Call with A. Rogoff and others regarding customer contracts and various near term issues and follow-up on same (0.7); review and comment on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's presentation (0.7); call with R. Mead regarding surety bond issues and follow-up with M. Huebner regarding same (0.6); calls and emails with creditors regarding payment and other issues and emails with AlixPartners regarding same (0.8); call with utility regarding service termination notice and coordinate with AlixPartners regarding same (0.4); call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's Committee counsel regarding first and second days timing and follow-up internally regarding same (0.8); email clients regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Law EC	07/23/12	4.1	Precedent research regarding surety bonds motions and objections (2.4); obtain and assemble documents regarding same (1.3); numerous communications and emails with D. Klein and E. Ruiz regarding same (0.4).
Martin JD	07/23/12	0.4	Analyze utility issue, including call with R. McWilliams.
Mehes A	07/23/12	2.4	Meeting with A. Starr and L. Howard regarding equity issue (0.3); research regarding equity issue (2.1).
Robertson C	07/23/12	5.4	Compile documents in response to diligence request from Unsecured Creditors' Committee (3.4); email to A. Arnaldos regarding same (0.1); call with G. Pak regarding same (0.2); coordinate creation of data room to share documents with Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.7).
Ruiz EL	07/23/12	6.5	Call with company to discuss prepetition payments (0.5); review of Kanawha River contract (1.1); review and revise Bylaws (1.9); review and revise email to creditors (0.9); review and revise Keystone motion (0.6); review and revise prepetition payment chart (1.5).
Schaible DS	07/23/12	1.6	Emails and coordinate and telephone calls regarding Second Day Motion comments.
Starr AT	07/23/12	1.6	Conference call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding coal sales (1.0); emails regarding the same (0.2); prepare chart for creditors' committee (0.4).
Hait S	07/24/12	0.8	Review Unsecured Creditors' Committee's Bylaws and discuss with E. Ruiz.
Hait S	07/24/12	0.8	Organize and save claims received.
Huebner MS	07/24/12	1.7	Review of caselaw regarding claim generation issues (1.0); emails with client group regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee's diligence requests (0.2); emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee's financial advisor selection (0.1); review of memorandum regarding pension claim calculation issues (0.3); emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/24/12	8.2	Call with company regarding vendor issues and follow-up regarding same (0.6); call with S. Mell and others regarding same (0.3); call with clients and others regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's information request and follow-up regarding same (0.7); coordinate regarding utilities objection, including emails with objector and draft proposed resolution of same (1.2); review Committee comments to first days and second days and coordinate internally regarding same (2.3); coordinate with C. Blacker regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's information request and review documents potentially responsive to same (2.1); emails with clients and team regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's financial advisors (0.2); call with D. Schaible regarding numerous creditor and Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comment points and follow-up regarding same (0.8).
Robertson C	07/24/12	4.4	Organize ClientLink data room and upload documents for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (4.2); arrange for certain professionals working with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee to gain access to data room (0.2).
Ruiz EL	07/24/12	4.9	Review and revise proposed orders in connection with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comment (1.8); call with D. Schaible regarding the same (1.0); review and revise Unsecured Creditors' Committee's Bylaws (0.8); meeting with S. Hait regarding the same (0.2); meeting with D. Schaible and S. Hait regarding the same (0.2); emails to Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel regarding Bylaws (0.2); calls to creditors regarding claim questions (0.7).
Ruiz EL	07/24/12	0.9	Call with AlixPartners regarding utilities (0.1); calls with utilities regarding notices of terminated service (0.5); review of utilities order (0.3).
Ruiz EL	07/24/12	3.2	Call with counsel to Kanawha (0.5); review and revise vendor contract (0.9); call with Curtis Mallet regarding second omnibus rejections (0.2); review and revise EDF and Vitol stipulations (1.1); coordinate filing of the same (0.3); calls with A. Libby regarding the same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/24/12	2.7	Telephone conference with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding orders (0.2); conference call regarding second day motion issues with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.6); coordinate with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding first day motions and telephone conferences regarding same (0.8); coordinate regarding financial advisor workstreams (0.4); coordinate and emails regarding Utilities Motion comments (0.7).
Teixeira MM	07/24/12	3.1	Prepare and organize documents and index for upload to ClientLink.
Vonnegut EJ	07/24/12	0.9	Discuss utilities research with K. Satter (0.5); discuss Unsecured Creditors' Committee DIP document requests with C. Robertson and emails regarding same (0.4).
Foust JT	07/25/12	2.2	Incorporate the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to proposed orders.
Hait S	07/25/12	2.5	Meeting with E. Ruiz about Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to proposed final orders (0.5); revise proposed final orders (2.0).
Hait S	07/25/12	0.3	Organize and save reclamation reports.
Howard L	07/25/12	1.3	Draft correspondence regarding equity issues.
Huebner MS	07/25/12	3.3	Calls with F. Huffard regarding initial Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting (0.7); review and markup of Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation (1.1); emails regarding confidentiality issues regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee and coal supply agreements (0.4); several calls with A. Rogoff regarding multiple matters (1.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/25/12	8.4	Coordinate on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments and email to clients regarding same (0.7); multiple calls with creditors regarding potential objections to August 2nd hearing (1.3); email A. Star regarding creditor and Peabody issues (0.3); coordinate with clients, AlixPartners and Kramer Levin regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's information request (1.8); coordinate with H. Baker regarding U.S. Attorneys Office comments to second day motions (0.4); coordinate with S. Schutzenhofer regarding creditor issues regarding rejections (0.3); negotiations with utilities objector regarding utilities order (0.8); review and comment on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's presentation (0.6); call and emails with KramerLevin regarding utilities order (0.4); emails and calls with DIP lender counsel regarding same (0.3); revise utilities order and coordinate with clients regarding same (0.7); call with W. Elkins regarding vendor relationships and follow-up analysis regarding same (0.3); call with D. Schaible regarding creditor objections (formal and informal) to second day relief and follow-up regarding same (0.5).
Libby A	07/25/12	2.3	Revise various first and second day motions regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments.
Mehes A	07/25/12	7.5	Draft correspondence regarding equity issue.
Robertson C	07/25/12	0.3	Upload files related to the existing credit agreement guarantee to the the Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room.
Ruiz EL	07/25/12	1.8	Revise vendor agreement (0.2); review and revise vendor agreement from AlixPartners (0.4); email to AlixPartners regarding the same (0.1); review and revise utilities motion (1.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Ruiz EL	07/25/12	11.2	Call with company regarding prepetition payment requests (0.3); calls with surety holders regarding comments to first day orders (1.5); review and revise objection status chart (0.9); emails to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel regarding comments to orders (0.5); review and revise warehousemen order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.6); review and revise reclamation order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.5); review and revise critical vendors order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.5); review and revise wages order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.6); review and revise tax order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.6); review and revise surety order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.7); review and revise rejection procedures order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.5); review and revise insurance order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.4); review and revise cash management order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.7); review and revise customer obligations order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.7) review and revise foreign creditors order in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.7); review and revise rejection procedures in response to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.7); prepare for meeting with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.8).
Schaible DS	07/25/12	3.1	Telephone calls and emails regarding first day motion issues with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.7); emails and coordinate regarding same (2.4).
Starr AT	07/25/12	1.5	Calls and emails regarding shareholder issues with Blackstone and J. Jones (0.7); calls and emails regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's inquiries on contracts (0.8).
Teixeira MM	07/25/12	0.7	Prepare and organize documents and index for upload to ClientLink.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Foust JT	07/26/12	2.6	Incorporate Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to proposed orders.
Hait S	07/26/12	4.0	Turn Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to proposed orders (two rounds).
Hait S	07/26/12	4.8	Save and send reclamation claims (0.8); review formal and informal objections and compile summary chart (1.5); review of a precedent case to see what comments were taken (1.2); check precedents for replies to objections (1.3).
Howard L	07/26/12	1.7	Conference regarding equity issues (0.5); draft correspondence regarding equity issues (1.2).
Huebner MS	07/26/12	4.9	Emails and conversations with Davis Polk and Blackstone regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee confidentiality and recusal issues (0.4); pre-meet to prepare for initial Unsecured Creditors' Committee's advisors in-person meeting (0.3); attend initial Unsecured Creditors' Committee's advisors in-person meeting (3.8); debrief with F. Huffard regarding next steps on Unsecured Creditors' Committee data (0.4).
Klein DS	07/26/12	11.0	Comment on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation (0.4); review of comments on motions in response to creditor comments and revise same (1.3); meet with A. Rogoff and others to discuss first and second days, and follow-up on comments to same (2.1); numerous calls with creditors objecting to first and second days and analysis related to same (2.4); revise motions based on objections and other comments (1.3); resolve utilities objection and finalize utilities order (0.9); coordinate on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's information request with internal team and clients (1.8); coordinate with S. Hait on creditor issues regarding prepetition claim treatment (0.4); calls with utilities objector regarding entered order (0.4).
Krause SC	07/26/12	0.9	Prepare for hearing (0.1); review objections (0.4); prepare response to objections (0.2); confer regarding same with J. Foust (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	07/26/12	1.6	Revise critical vendors order per the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.5); save utilities order and blacklines as submitted to Chambers in the appropriate directory (0.2); file notice of no objections to utilities motion (0.5); file notice of cancellation of utilities hearing (0.4).
Mehes A	07/26/12	2.4	Edit correspondence regarding equity issues (1.7); conference call regarding equity issues (0.7).
Ruiz EL	07/26/12	10.0	Prepetition payment call with company and follow-up thereto (0.5); review and revise first day payment summary chart (0.5); prepare for meeting with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.2); meeting with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (2.0); review and revise reclamation order pursuant to Unsecured Creditors' Committee comments (0.7); review and revise wages order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.4); review and revise warehousemen order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.5); review and revise foreign creditor order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.6); review and revise the cash management order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.7); review and revise the critical vendor order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.4) review and revise the first omnibus objection order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.8); review and revise the ordinary course professionals' order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.4); review and revise the surety order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.4); review and revise the insurance order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.4); review and revise the tax order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.5).
Schaible DS	07/26/12	6.2	Meeting with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's advisors regarding case issues and first day orders and follow-up emails (5.8); emails regarding due diligence lists (0.4).
Schaible DS	07/26/12	0.6	Coordinate and emails regarding Utilities Motion objections.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/26/12	1.6	Conference call regarding shareholder issues with I. Englehardt, J. Bean, B. Hatfield, B. Bennett, M. Schroeder, R. Mead and Blackstone (1.1); meet with L. Howard and A. Mehes regarding opposition to shareholder request (0.5).
Teixeira MM	07/26/12	0.6	Prepare and organize documents and index for upload to ClientLink.
Vonnegut EJ	07/26/12	1.6	Review letter regarding selenium project and discuss same with H. Baker and A. McCallister (0.8); research regarding applicable utility rates (0.8).
Vonnegut EJ	07/26/12	0.7	Discuss comments of surety providers to surety order with surety counsel and DIP lender counsel and revise same.
Foust JT	07/27/12	1.8	Review objections filed in response to second day motions.
Howard L	07/27/12	1.3	Draft correspondence relating to equity issues.
Klein DS	07/27/12	9.3	Respond to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee with diligence items after review of same (0.7); review creditor objections to first and second days and email clients regarding same (1.1); call with clients regarding vendor issues and follow-up (0.4); call with C. Blacker regarding prepetition payments (0.2); call with E. Moskowitz regarding creditor prepetition claims, follow-up calls with W. Elkins and creditor (0.6); review prepetition contract and respond to R. McWilliams regarding claim issues (0.4); emails with clients regarding adjournment of certain motions and creditor comments (0.6); numerous calls with creditors regarding potential objections to first and second day motions and revisions to orders regarding same (2.7); coordinate gathering and review information potentially responsive to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's information request (2.6).
Krause SC	07/27/12	6.4	Calls with various creditors regarding objections (0.5); confer with D. Klein regarding objections (0.4); review formal objections (0.7); confer with J. Foust, S. Hait regarding reply brief (0.5); review reply brief (0.4); read reply brief precedent (0.3); emails regarding resolution language (0.3); review revised proposed orders (0.3); revise orders (3.0).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	07/27/12	1.2	Call with J. Eagan regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's questions regarding rejection motion and follow up (0.6); review research regarding utility contracts (0.6).
Melvin MM	07/27/12	0.4	Package and forward a reclamation demand filed in parts, to S. Hait.
Ruiz EL	07/27/12	6.7	Compile blacklines of all second day motions for email to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.5); email to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.5); emails to the Company regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.5); review and revise the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to surety order (0.6); review and revise of Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to surety order (0.6); review and revise of the Unsecured Creditors' Committee comments to the interim compensation order (0.4); review and revise the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to wages order (0.6); review and revise the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to the cash management order (0.6); review and revise the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to the insurance order (0.5); review and revise the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to the taxes order (0.6); review and revise the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to the customer obligations order (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/27/12	4.8	Numerous teleconferences and emails regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's and government's first day objections (1.5); work on first day objection responses (0.7); review and revise first day final orders and coordinate regarding same (1.9); coordinate regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's first day comments (0.7).
Starr AT	07/27/12	0.9	Conference call regarding shareholder issues with M. Schroeder, F. Huffard and A. Schlesinger (0.6); meet with L. Howard and A. Mehes regarding drafting response to shareholder letter (0.3).
Howard L	07/28/12	6.0	Draft correspondence relating to equity issues.
Foust JT	07/29/12	1.2	Revise draft omnibus reply to objections to de minimis asset sale and rejection procedures motions.
Howard L	07/29/12	1.8	Draft correspondence relating to equity issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/29/12	1.7	Review revised second days and comment on same related to creditor objections and comments (1.3); emails with internal team regarding assorted creditor issues related to objections and prepetition claims (0.4).
Krause SC	07/29/12	0.8	Review edits to procedures orders (0.5); review proposed reply to objections (0.3).
Ruiz EL	07/29/12	4.3	Review and revise proposed orders pursuant to Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (2.0); compile explanatory blacklines for email to company (1.2); email to company regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee comments (1.1).
Foust JT	07/30/12	1.2	Revise proposed submitted orders based on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments.
Hait S	07/30/12	2.4	Turn Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to proposed orders (1.5); save Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to proposed orders (0.9).
Hait S	07/30/12	2.0	Update objection chart and review first day Judge Chapman transcript (1.0); save and organize reclamation claims (1.0).
Howard L	07/30/12	1.7	Review and revise correspondence relating to equity issues.
Huebner MS	07/30/12	1.9	Meeting with E. Ruiz regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee's Bylaw issues and review of same (0.3); conference call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel regarding motions and hearing (1.2); conversations regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee's questions on joint venture investments (0.1); emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee confidentiality and diligence requests (0.3).
Klein DS	07/30/12	6.9	Call with C. Blacker regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's information request and follow-up (0.3); voicemail to M. McNamara regarding prepetition claim (0.1); call with A. Rogoff and others regarding comments to first days and second days and revise same (1.7); analysis and precedent research regarding same (0.6); revise orders related to same (1.3) communications with numerous creditors regarding comments to first and second days and coordinate on revisions to same (2.3); call with company regarding same and follow-up (0.6).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	07/30/12	4.2	Confer with various members of the Davis Polk team regarding procedures orders (1.2); calls with various objectors (0.9); revise procedures orders (2.1).
McGreal MM	07/30/12	3.6	Supplier Management call (0.4); conference with M. Huebner and D. Klein regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues with first and second day orders (0.3); teleconference with M. Huebner, D. Klein and Kramer Levin regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues with first and second day orders (1.2); review data room documents (0.8); correspondence with M. Huebner regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Company and Davis Polk team regarding Peabody and Arch relationship (0.4); teleconference with counsel to equipment lessor (0.1); teleconference with counsel to utility provider (0.1).
Mehes A	07/30/12	1.7	Edit correspondence relating to equity issues.
Ruiz EL	07/30/12	9.7	Review of Unsecured Creditors' Committee's Bylaws (0.7); review of Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to proposed orders (1.0); call with Kramer Levin regarding comments to first day proposed order and follow-up thereto (1.5); calls and emails to A. Yerramalli regarding the same (1.2); review and revise cash management order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.9); review and revise warehousemen order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.7); review and revise reclamation order pursuant to Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.5); review and revise customer obligations order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.6); review and revise foreign creditors order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.6); review and revise critical vendors order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.7); review and revise wages order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.8); review and revise tax order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.5).
Ruiz EL	07/30/12	1.4	Calls to utilities regarding service shutoffs.
Starr AT	07/30/12	0.4	Revise letter regarding shareholder issues.
Vonnegut EJ	07/30/12	0.4	Emails regarding surety order with sureties' counsel and Davis Polk team.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Foust JT	07/31/12	6.5	Draft and revise letter to union (3.1); research factual circumstances of cases supporting union's position (3.4).
Huebner MS	07/31/12	0.4	Multiple emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and client regarding comments on first day orders.
Klein DS	07/31/12	11.9	Call with R. Mead regarding surety and insurance comments by the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2); emails and discussions with E. Ruiz regarding critical vendor payments (0.3); call with R. McWilliams regarding same (0.2); coordinate on surety bond letter of credit replacement issue (0.3); email E. Waller regarding MSHA assessments (0.2); coordinate internally and with AlixPartners regarding Committee diligence requests (3.4); revise first day and second day orders (2.3); calls with various objectors and potential objectors related to same (1.4); coordinate with M. McGreal regarding creditor prepetition issues (0.4); coordinate with AlixPartners and clients regarding FTI data request (0.4); subsequent review and revisions to all second days and coordinate distribution of same (2.8).
Krause SC	07/31/12	7.5	Calls with Patriot team regarding procedures orders (0.6); calls with various objectors (0.8); revise procedures orders (3.1); emails regarding same (0.7); coordinate with various objectors and address issues (2.3).
McGreal MM	07/31/12	1.4	Review purchase money security agreement from critical vendor (0.4); teleconference with Company regarding same (0.1); conference with D. Klein regarding same (0.2); correspondence regarding issue with Kenergy utility service provider (0.3); teleconference with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding first day final orders (0.6).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Ruiz EL	07/31/12	10.0	Review of vendor agreement (0.5); call with company regarding prepetition payments (0.3); call with AlixPartners regarding vendor agreements (0.2); calls with Kramer Levin regarding comments to motions (1.5); emails to Kramer Levin regarding the same (0.8); review and revision of cash management order pursuant to Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.9); review and revise warehousemen order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (1.1); review and revise reclamation order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.8); review and revise customer obligations order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.8); review and revise foreign creditors order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.9); review and revise critical vendors order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (1.0); review and revise interim compensation order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.2); review and revise ordinary course professionals order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.2); review and revise tax order pursuant to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (0.8).
Starr AT	07/31/12	0.7	Emails with J. Bean, M. Schroeder, A. Schlesinger, F. Huffard and L. Howard regarding response to shareholder letter (0.5); revise response letter (0.2).
Total		436.0	
CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDERS\UCC ISSUES			
DPW RETENTION AND FEE ISSUES			
Krause SC	07/10/12	1.3	Review and revise Davis Polk retention application.
Law EC	07/10/12	0.2	Coordinate ordering of transcript for precedent research (0.1); communications with S. Krause regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin RL	07/10/12	3.0	Revise Davis Polk retention application (1.7); meeting with S. Krause regarding Davis Polk retention application (0.2); review payments received by Davis Polk from Patriot Coal for the Pillowtex chart as required by the Court (0.5); call with M. Marzigliano regarding payments for Pillowtex chart (0.1); calls with S. Krause regarding Davis Polk retention application (0.3); draft email and send draft of Davis Polk retention application to D. Schaible (0.2).
Krause SC	07/11/12	2.0	Emails regarding Davis Polk retention application (0.2); calls with E. Gasparini and Davis Polk team regarding Davis Polk retention (0.4); revise retention application (1.4).
Martin RL	07/11/12	1.9	Respond to question from D. Schaible regarding Davis Polk retention application (0.4); revise Davis Polk retention application (0.2); call with C. Zambrano regarding prepetition fees (0.4); call with S. Krause regarding prepetition fees (0.1); compose email to C. Scarlett regarding prepetition fees (0.1); prepare for meeting with D. Klein and S. Krause (0.7).
Melvin MM	07/11/12	0.3	Obtain the U.S. Trustee fee guidelines and forward to J. Pyo and A. Ibrahim.
Ruiz EL	07/11/12	0.4	Draft email to Davis Polk lawyers regarding bankruptcy billing.
Schaible DS	07/11/12	0.4	Coordinate with U.S. Trustee regarding retentions.
Krause SC	07/12/12	1.0	Meeting with D. Schaible, R. Martin regarding retention application (0.4); revise retention application (0.4); emails and calls with accounting to finalize prepetition bill (0.2).
Martin RL	07/12/12	1.8	Meeting with D. Schaible and S. Krause regarding Davis Polk retention application (0.5); call with M. Marzigliano regarding final prepetition invoices (0.1); compose email to M. Marzigliano and C. Scarlett regarding final prepetition invoices (0.2); call with S. Krause and C. Scarlett (0.1); review Pillowtex precedent (0.2); review proposed order language (0.1); respond to questions from C. Scarlett (0.1); revise Davis Polk retention application (0.5).
Schaible DS	07/12/12	1.6	Davis Polk retention meeting (0.4); coordinate regarding retentions (0.7); work on retention issues (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	07/13/12	0.8	Review and markup of Davis Polk retention application and conversation with D. Schaible and S. Krause regarding same.
Krause SC	07/13/12	2.4	Confer with D. Schaible regarding retention application (0.2); revise retention application (1.5); calls with credit team regarding parties in interest (0.4); call with M. Huebner regarding retention application (0.3).
Melvin MM	07/13/12	5.5	Review narratives in the latest run of the June monthly statement for accuracy and update.
Schaible DS	07/13/12	0.6	Coordinate regarding retention issues.
Schaible DS	07/14/12	0.6	Coordinate regarding retention issues.
Schaible DS	07/15/12	0.4	Review and revise bill materials.
Huebner MS	07/16/12	0.4	Review and markup of Davis Polk retention application and internal conversation regarding same.
Krause SC	07/16/12	2.5	Confer with M. Huebner regarding retention application (0.1); revise retention application (0.3); emails regarding bill and billing (0.4); conference with M. Huebner, D. Schaible regarding retention application and declaration (0.4); revise retention application (1.3).
Martin RL	07/16/12	0.4	Compose email to Accounting regarding updated bill (0.2); revise Davis Polk retention application (0.2).
Schaible DS	07/16/12	0.6	Coordinate regarding retention issues.
Huebner MS	07/17/12	0.4	Review of draft of Davis Polk retention papers and emails with U.S. Trustee regarding same.
Krause SC	07/17/12	2.9	Emails with Davis Polk team and U.S. Trustee regarding edits to retention application (0.6); edits regarding same (1.0); confer with E. Gasparini regarding application (0.2); emails regarding same (0.3); confer with D. Schaible regarding application (0.1); revise application (0.4); review precedent (0.3).
Martin RL	07/17/12	1.2	Revise Davis Polk retention application to conform to scrub list (1.0); search for last version of Davis Polk retention that was sent to J. Jones (0.2).
Schaible DS	07/17/12	0.6	Emails regarding retention applications and coordinate regarding same.
Krause SC	07/18/12	2.8	Emails regarding application (0.2); update bill (0.2); update retention application (0.2); review language and precedent (0.2); revise billing information and update retention application (0.2); review and update parties-in-interest list (0.5); prepare for filing (1.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin RL	07/18/12	0.8	Revise Davis Polk retention application for filing (0.7); review email regarding changes to and filing of Davis Polk retention application (0.1).
Ruiz EL	07/18/12	0.1	Review and revise Davis Polk retention application.
Krause SC	07/19/12	2.0	Finalize and file Davis Polk retention application.
Law EC	07/19/12	0.3	Circulate U.S. Trustee fee guidelines and related documents (0.2); communications with A. Ibrahim regarding same (0.1).
Martin RL	07/19/12	0.3	Coordinate filing of Davis Polk retention application.
Butler JH	07/20/12	2.1	Review and analyze updated conflicts searches for additional parties (1.4); review of language in declaration regarding same (0.4); emails with S. Krause and R. Martin regarding supplemental disclosure to U.S. Trustee and information walls (0.3).
Krause SC	07/20/12	1.4	Update parties-in-interest list (0.5); resolve various questions on parties-in-interest (0.6); call with E. Gasparini regarding same (0.3).
Martin RL	07/20/12	1.3	Send blacklines of Davis Polk retention application to S. Krause and A. Ibrahim (0.2); update parties in interest list (1.1).
Martin RL	07/23/12	0.2	Prepare and send declaration and signature page to M. Huebner for signature.
Melvin MM	07/23/12	8.8	Review and update narratives in the June/July monthly statement.
Melvin MM	07/24/12	3.3	Further clean-up of the narratives in the July monthly statement (2.9); communication with C. Scarlett regarding the July bill (0.2); communication with D. Klein and C. Robertson regarding monthly statement preparation (0.2).
Robertson C	07/24/12	0.4	Meet with D. Klein and M. Melvin to discuss preparation of bill (0.2); meet with A. Libby regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	07/25/12	0.8	Review April, May and June backup in response to U.S. Trustee inquiries.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	07/25/12	3.1	Review and update narratives in the July monthly statement (1.6); update certain project codes (0.3); communications with several timekeepers for clarification on their narrative entries (0.3); review July bill and combine certain entries (0.4); communications with C. Scarlett in Accounting and D. Klein regarding billing project codes (0.4); communication with C. Robertson regarding July monthly statement preparation (0.1).
Krause SC	07/26/12	1.2	Emails regarding parties-in-interest questions with various Davis Polk team members (0.5); emails with company to clarify parties-in-interest roles (0.2); call with J. Knight regarding same (0.2); emails regarding supplemental disclosure (0.3).
Krause SC	07/26/12	0.5	Review Patriot bill with M. Melvin.
Martin RL	07/26/12	0.4	Review emails discussing additional disclosures (0.1); meet with A. Starr and S. Krause regarding additional parties to be added to the restricted list (0.3).
Melvin MM	07/26/12	0.4	Communication with S. Krause regarding categories of project codes in the bill and pre-petition time (0.2); further discussions with S. Krause regarding combining certain project codes and obtaining a print out of each to be combined for his review (0.2).
Melvin MM	07/27/12	0.9	Communications with S. Krause regarding time in inactive project codes to be re-assigned (0.2); multiple communications with C. Scarlett in Accounting regarding same (0.3); PDF certain project codes of narratives for S. Krause's review (0.3); communication with C. Scarlett to request transfers of narratives in inactive project codes to active project codes (0.1).
Butler JH	07/30/12	0.3	Analyze conflicts (0.2); calls with R. Martin and S. Krause regarding conflicts and analysis (0.1).
Krause SC	07/30/12	3.4	Conflicts review (1.0); calls with accounting (0.5); emails regarding same (0.7); review same (1.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin RL	07/30/12	3.1	Call with J. Snider regarding certain client waivers (0.2); call with S. Krause regarding possibility of additional disclosures (0.1); review conflicts report for certain client (0.4); call with J. Collaguazo regarding certain client conflicts report (0.1); review active client/matter numbers for certain client (0.3); call with J. Butler regarding certain client conflicts check and compose email regarding same (0.2); follow up on certain client time billed and compose email updates to J. Butler and S. Krause regarding the same (1.1); update parties in interest list (0.1); call with M. Glass regarding certain client time billed and compose email to J. Butler and S. Krause regarding same (0.1); create list of changes to parties in interest list for conflicts report and send email to Conflicts, J. Butler and S. Krause regarding the same (0.5).
Butler JH	07/31/12	0.7	Review and analysis of further conflicts reports.
Isaac-Lowry A	07/31/12	0.2	Review parties-in-interest list.
Krause SC	07/31/12	1.0	Conflicts review (0.8); emails with Patriot and A. Star regarding same (0.2).
Martin RL	07/31/12	0.5	Review conflicts check for a certain client (0.3); meeting with J. Pyo regarding updates to the parties in interest list (0.1); coordinate preparation of conflicts check for review (0.1).
Melvin MM	07/31/12	3.7	Review and update narratives in the second half of the July monthly statement (2.7); update project codes (0.5); combine certain narratives (0.5).
Total DPW RETENTION AND FEE ISSUES		77.2	
EMPLOYEE LABOR ISSUES			
Aizen RM	07/10/12	0.5	Comment on NT 11-K.
Ruiz EL	07/10/12	0.1	Review wages motion.
Aizen RM	07/11/12	1.3	Research Employee Stock Purchase Plan question and discuss with S. Krause.
Klein DS	07/11/12	0.8	Emails with J. Martin regarding wages motion (0.3); review wages motion and precedents regarding same (0.3); coordinate with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).
Krause SC	07/11/12	0.5	Call with R. Aizen regarding equity interests and employee stock plan.
Martin JD	07/11/12	0.8	Revise letter to workers compensation commissions

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/11/12	0.8	Coordinate and plan for labor issues.
Aizen RM	07/12/12	1.4	Consider Employee Stock Purchase Plan issue and discuss with B. Resnick, W. Hoeben and Patriot.
Huebner MS	07/12/12	0.9	Davis Polk conference call and emails regarding §1113 and §1114 issues and client meeting.
McGreal MM	07/12/12	0.1	Send §1114 research to E. Moskowitz and B. Resnick.
Moskowitz E	07/12/12	2.0	Call with M. Huebner, D. Schaible and B. Resnick to discuss planning (0.4); review labor-related materials (0.5); draft work-plan bullets to prepare for client discussion (1.1).
Schaible DS	07/12/12	2.4	Teleconferences with clients regarding next steps for labor projects (0.8); teleconferences regarding labor team preparation and staffing and review emails regarding same (1.6).
Aizen RM	07/13/12	0.3	Discussion with J. Lutrín regarding key employee incentive plan and key employee retention plan (0.1); emails with J. Brenner regarding Section 16 (0.2).
de Richemont P	07/13/12	0.3	Call with K. Williams regarding §1114 overview (0.1); research and email precedent (0.2).
Huebner MS	07/13/12	3.6	Review of §1113/§1114 materials and preparing talking points for call (1.1); internal DPW call regarding 1113/§1114 issues (0.6); conference call with clients and Blackstone regarding same (1.4); conversations with F. Huffard regarding roles and responsibilities for legacy cost issues (0.5).
Kaminetzky BS	07/13/12	1.2	Calls, email and meeting with E. Moskowitz and M. Sullivan regarding 1114 background and analysis (0.8); review materials regarding same (0.4).
Klein DS	07/13/12	0.2	Call with bank regarding payroll processing.
McGreal MM	07/13/12	2.1	Conference with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and B. Resnick regarding 1113 and §1114 issues (0.6); correspondence with M. Sullivan regarding §1114 issues in Kodak (0.1); teleconference with client, M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and B. Resnick regarding §1113 and §1114 kick off call (1.2); teleconference with J. Lutrín regarding annual incentive plans (0.2).
Moskowitz E	07/13/12	2.7	Call with team regarding labor issues (0.4); prepare for call with clients (0.9); call with client team regarding labor issues (1.4).
Resnick BM	07/13/12	1.8	Call with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and M. McGreal regarding §1113 process (0.4); call with clients regarding 1113 and §1114 process (1.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/13/12	1.2	Coordinate regarding labor and contract issues.
Sullivan MN	07/13/12	3.6	Call with E. Moskowitz regarding §1114 (0.1); call with M. McGreal regarding 1114 (0.1); call with K. Williams regarding §1114 (0.1); email and call to B. Kaminetzky regarding §1114 (0.1); conference with B. Kaminetzky and K. Williams regarding §1114 (0.3); call with E. Moskowitz regarding §1114 (0.1); call with B. Kaminetzky following up on conference regarding 1114 (0.1); perform legal research analyzing §1114 issues (1.9); draft analysis of §1114 issues and send to E. Moskowitz (0.7); call to K. Williams regarding §1114 (0.1).
Williams KC	07/13/12	2.2	Research §1114 issues (1.8); meeting with B. Kaminetsky (0.4).
Aizen RM	07/16/12	0.1	Comment on employee Frequently Asked Questions.
Huebner MS	07/16/12	0.5	Emails with J. Bean regarding various employee issues (0.2); emails with client regarding §1113 expert, United Mine Workers Association's positions (0.2); emails with United Mine Workers Association's counsel (0.1).
Klein DS	07/16/12	0.4	Coordinate on wage motion issues with clients.
Martin JD	07/16/12	2.1	Prepare for meeting with Company regarding §1113 issues (1.6); conferences with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5).
McGreal MM	07/16/12	0.7	Advise client regarding labor issues (0.3); correspondence with J. Lutrin and A. Libby regarding incentive plan (0.4).
Moskowitz E	07/16/12	2.0	Meet with J. Morris regarding labor issues and related correspondence with team (1.1); follow-up with team regarding same (0.9).
Estacio R	07/17/12	0.4	Correspond with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding research regarding labor issues (0.1); research regarding same (0.3).
Huebner MS	07/17/12	2.6	Review and markup of section §1113 work plan (0.4); review of same with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin; conference call with Blackstone to prepare for Friday's §1113 and §1114 meeting in Charleston, WV (1.5); conference call with counsel for mine workers (0.3); conversation with general counsel regarding United Mine Workers Association call and emails with clients regarding same (0.4).
Kaminetzky BS	07/17/12	0.7	Email and analysis regarding strategy and legal issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	07/17/12	0.3	Confer with M. McGreal regarding employee issues and incentive plan (0.2); emails regarding same (0.1).
Martin JD	07/17/12	1.4	Review §1113-related background materials.
McGreal MM	07/17/12	0.2	Correspondence with S. Krause and J. Lutrin regarding incentive plans.
Moskowitz E	07/17/12	4.6	Prepare agenda and work plan (2.2); call with Blackstone regarding client meetings and follow-up (0.9); call with labor counsel and email regarding same (0.8); prepare for client meetings (0.7).
Schaible DS	07/17/12	1.3	Emails regarding union next steps (0.5); coordinate regarding pension and §1114 and union next steps (0.8).
Williams KC	07/17/12	1.8	Research related to §1114 proceedings (1.6); emails with Managing Attorney's Office to pull dockets and papers for same (0.2).
Aizen RM	07/18/12	0.1	Emails with D. Schaible regarding workers compensation.
Dphrepaulezz JH	07/18/12	1.2	Prepare distribution for E. Glazer.
Glazer E	07/18/12	4.9	Review background memoranda and other materials regarding §1113 issues (1.3); meet with E. Moskowitz regarding background on §1113 and 1114 process (0.5); draft emails regarding precedent materials related to §1113 and §1114 issues (0.2); preparation for client meeting regarding labor and retiree issues (2.6); meet with D. Alumbaugh regarding same (0.1).
Law EC	07/18/12	2.3	Research regarding §1113 and §1114 issues (2.1); communications with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	07/18/12	0.6	Meet with M. McGreal to discuss wages issues.
McGreal MM	07/18/12	0.4	Meeting with A. Libby regarding wages.
Schaible DS	07/18/12	1.0	Coordinate regarding union next steps (0.5); union matters update call with clients (0.5).
Aizen RM	07/19/12	2.3	Research workers compensation issue and discuss with Patriot, D. Schaible and B. Milder.
Glazer E	07/19/12	6.8	Legal research regarding §1113 and 1114 issues in relevant jurisdictions (3.2); summarize research regarding same for E. Moskowitz and J. Martin (0.9); preparation for client meeting regarding labor and retiree issues (2.5); draft emails to E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Law EC	07/19/12	4.1	Docket research and obtain various precedents regarding wages and workers' compensation (3.8); numerous communications with B. Milder and M. Melvin regarding same (0.3).
Martin JD	07/19/12	4.6	Prepare for meeting in Charleston regarding labor and retiree issues.
McGreal MM	07/19/12	0.1	Correspondence with employee benefits group regarding annual incentive plans.
Moskowitz E	07/19/12	4.5	Calls with court clerk and union counsels regarding scheduling and related issues (0.5); meet with committee counsel regarding background issues (0.4); prepare for client meetings regarding labor matters and business planning (2.9); review lender materials (0.7).
Ruiz EL	07/19/12	0.4	Calls with R. Aizen regarding wages order (0.2); review of wages order (0.2).
Schaible DS	07/19/12	1.1	Teleconference regarding workers compensation insurance issues (0.7); emails regarding workers compensation issues (0.4).
Glazer E	07/20/12	0.2	Meet with J. Freese regarding §1113 and §1114 issues.
Huebner MS	07/20/12	7.4	Pre-meetings and meetings in Charleston, West Virginia with senior client team, and others regarding labor and retiree issues and developing proposal and timeline.
Martin JD	07/20/12	7.6	Meeting in Charleston with I. Engelhardt, B. Hatfield and others regarding legal and retiree issues and follow up.
Moskowitz E	07/20/12	8.1	Prepare for meetings with client team (0.8); meetings with client team to discuss labor and case strategy (6.9); calls with team regarding opposition brief (0.4).
Ruiz EL	07/20/12	0.5	Review of contract with contingent worker.
Martin JD	07/21/12	1.6	Analysis of §1113 and §1114 issues.
Martin JD	07/22/12	1.3	Prepare work streams chart for §1113 and §1114 process.
Huebner MS	07/23/12	0.6	Conversations with client and emails regarding nonunion retiree medical issues and amounts.
Klein DS	07/23/12	0.6	Research pension claims issues.
Libby A	07/23/12	1.7	Review wages motion (0.8); revise first days summary to accurately describe wages motion (0.9).
Martin JD	07/23/12	1.3	Review materials related to 1113/§1114 issues.
Moskowitz E	07/23/12	1.2	Discuss follow up issues from client meetings with team.
Schaible DS	07/23/12	0.4	Coordinate regarding §1113 meeting issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Aizen RM	07/24/12	1.0	Review key employee incentive plans and discussed with J. Bean.
Glazer E	07/24/12	2.3	Draft confidentiality agreement with union.
Huebner MS	07/24/12	0.2	Call and emails with J. Woodrum regarding pension claim calculation issues.
Krause SC	07/24/12	1.0	Call with benefits and J. Bean regarding benefit plans and emails regarding same (0.8); emails regarding retention applications (0.2).
Law EC	07/24/12	3.1	Precedent research regarding labor union/pension plan issues (1.8); obtain and assemble documents regarding same (0.7); review communications and emails with D. Klein and team regarding same (0.6).
Libby A	07/24/12	2.2	Call with clients regarding wage related motions (0.8); research related to U.S. Attorney General comments (1.4).
Schaible DS	07/24/12	0.5	Conference call with clients regarding employee benefits.
Warner W	07/24/12	0.1	Review reports regarding union interference.
Glazer E	07/25/12	3.0	Draft confidentiality agreement with union (1.2); meet with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding §1113/§1114 issues (1.2); revise §1113/§1114 task chart (0.6).
Libby A	07/25/12	0.6	Review and revise wages section of first day summary chart for company (0.8); calls with E. Ruiz regarding same (0.2).
Martin JD	07/25/12	2.5	Conference with E. Moskowitz and E. Glazer regarding §1113/§1114 issues (1.2); review and revise document retention notice (0.6); review draft confidentiality agreement with union (0.4); revise task list for labor issues (0.3).
Moskowitz E	07/25/12	0.7	Meet with J. Martin and E. Glazer regarding work plan and related issues (0.5); review retention notice (0.2).
Starr AT	07/25/12	3.4	Review Peabody contracts (0.7); calls with J. Bean and D. Toscano regarding wages and benefits issues (0.5); draft email to client regarding same (0.3); calls and emails regarding contract motions with B. Resnick, J. Martin and C. Zhu (0.6); review contract motions (1.0); review legal research regarding Massey motion (0.3).
Aizen RM	07/26/12	0.5	Call with M. Luna regarding benefit plans.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Glazer E	07/26/12	0.9	Revise §1113/§1114 task chart and call with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.3); research regarding §1114 issues and emails with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.6).
Huebner MS	07/26/12	0.3	Review and markup of §1113/§1114 workstream and conversation with E. Moskowitz regarding same.
Libby A	07/26/12	0.6	Revise wages order per the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments.
Martin JD	07/26/12	0.5	Review emails from E. Moskowitz and E. Glazer regarding §1113/§1114 issues.
Moskowitz E	07/26/12	3.5	Call with F. Huffard regarding labor issues (0.5); revise work plan and circulate (0.7); correspondence with client regarding filing issues and creditor questions (1.3); review retention notice and circulate (0.4); review offer precedents and circulate (0.6).
Ruiz EL	07/26/12	1.4	Review of wages order regarding workers compensation issues (0.9); call with company regarding the same (0.3); email to D. Schaible regarding the same (0.2).
Schaible DS	07/26/12	0.4	Emails regarding labor meeting planning.
Aizen RM	07/27/12	0.1	Emails with W. Hoeben regarding Form S-8.
Glazer E	07/27/12	0.8	Draft emails to E. Moskowitz regarding 1113/§1114 issues (0.2); review documents related to §1113/§1114 issues and meet with J. Martin regarding same (0.6).
Huebner MS	07/27/12	0.3	Emails and calls with E. Moskowitz regarding §1113 issues.
Martin JD	07/27/12	1.1	Calls, conferences, and emails with E. Moskowitz, L. Samet and E. Glazer regarding §1113/§1114 issues.
Melvin MM	07/27/12	0.8	Obtain motions and orders regarding the payment of professional fees to union workers.
Moskowitz E	07/27/12	2.6	Draft communication to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.4); correspondence regarding union request (0.9); review company data and correspondence with R. Hartsog regarding same.
Glazer E	07/28/12	1.0	Review Schroeder declaration (0.2); prepare §1113/§1114-related materials (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Glazer E	07/30/12	4.0	Legal research regarding §1114 issues and draft email to E. Moskowitz summarizing research (0.5); teleconference with client regarding document preservation issues (0.8); prepare for same (0.3); draft memorandum to E. Moskowitz regarding document preservation issues (1.9); revise preservation notice and draft emails to E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (0.5).
Klein DS	07/30/12	1.2	Update call with clients (0.5); Call with B. Hattfield and others regarding labor issues and emails with M. Huebner regarding same (0.7).
Martin JD	07/30/12	0.7	Review Guyan MOU, including related call and emails with E. Moskowitz (0.4); emails with E. Moskowitz and E. Glazer regarding various §1113/§1114 issues (0.3).
Moskowitz E	07/30/12	3.7	Call with M. Luna and follow-up (0.9); correspondence with team regarding benefits (1.2); correspondence with A. Starr regarding strategic issues (0.4); review materials sent by company (0.8); review extension letter (0.4).
Ruiz EL	07/30/12	0.3	Emails to company regarding wages motion (0.1); call with company regarding the same (0.2).
Glazer E	07/31/12	1.2	Revise preservation notice and emails with E. Moskowitz and L. Jacobs regarding same (0.4); review documents related to §1113/§1114 issues (0.8).
Huebner MS	07/31/12	0.5	Emails and conversation with J. Bean regarding wages motion and PTO issues (0.3); emails regarding United Mine Workers Association letter and rallies (0.2).
Martin JD	07/31/12	0.8	Call with potential expert witness.
Moskowitz E	07/31/12	4.5	Revise letter regarding extension (0.4); draft letter to union and correspondence regarding same (1.3); correspondence with company personnel regarding strategy (1.4); call with consultant and follow-up (0.9); review confidentiality draft (0.5).
Ruiz EL	07/31/12	0.7	Review and revise wages order.
Total EMPLOYEE LABOR ISSUES		169.8	
EXECUTORY CONTRACTS			
Huebner MS	07/10/12	0.4	Emails and Davis Polk calls regarding termination threats by two parties.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	07/10/12	0.3	Call and emails with R. Mead, D. Schaible and others regarding equipment leases.
Schaible DS	07/11/12	0.5	Executory contract motion review and emails regarding same.
Tsiouris N	07/11/12	5.3	Meeting with D. Klein, M. McGreal and E. Ruiz regarding status of Second Day motions (0.8); review and revise Second Day motions (4.5).
Klein DS	07/12/12	0.4	Review and comment on rejection procedures motion.
Klein DS	07/12/12	0.2	Review Massey motion and emails with E. Ruiz regarding same.
McGreal MM	07/12/12	0.7	Review and comment on assumption/rejection procedures motion.
Ruiz EL	07/12/12	0.6	Review and revise assumption/rejection procedures motion.
Tsiouris N	07/12/12	1.3	Review of second day motion for approval of procedures for the rejection of executory contracts and unexpired leases and for the abandonment of personal property (1.1); communications with E. Ruiz, A. Libby and S. Hait regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	07/13/12	0.7	Draft notice of hearing of Massey motion (0.5); confirm fifth third leasing contracts were scheduled in omnibus rejection motions (0.2).
McGreal MM	07/13/12	0.4	Correspondence with A. Libby regarding rejection of Fifth Third leases (0.1); teleconference with client regarding same (0.1); email client regarding same (0.2).
Ruiz EL	07/13/12	0.5	Review and revise rejection procedures.
Warner W	07/13/12	4.1	Review coal contract terminations issues (0.4); telephone call with Patriot and others regarding coal contract terminations (1.4); review of complaint (0.3); telephone call with D. Toscano and others regarding complaint (0.1); closing matters for second out (0.7); review Davis Polk opinions (0.3); review document changes and schedule of weekend cleanup tasks (0.4); telephone calls with T. Chepiga and others (0.3); review 8-K (0.2).
Chepiga TL	07/14/12	0.1	Emails regarding opinions and summary chart.
Klein DS	07/17/12	0.6	Calls with rejection counterparties regarding return arrangements and coordinate with clients regarding same (0.4); emails with J. Jones regarding contract enforcement issues (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	07/17/12	0.2	Correspondence with Company regarding Fifth Third leases and abandonment of equipment.
Huebner MS	07/18/12	2.0	Emails internally and with clients regarding various Coal Supply Agreements and rejection issues (0.5); emails with C. Ebetino, J. Martin regarding various over-ride and royalty payment agreement issues and contracts (0.4); conference call with clients regarding Coal Supply Agreements and timing (0.6); emails with counsel to various coal supply counterparties regarding documentation and negotiation of transactions (0.5).
Klein DS	07/18/12	0.9	Revise omnibus rejection order (0.4); calls with rejection counterparties and emails with clients regarding return agreements (0.5).
Martin JD	07/18/12	2.2	Analyze potential contracts for rejection (1.4); emails with C. Ebetino, M. Huebner, D. Klein, C. Zhu, and others regarding same (0.8).
McGreal MM	07/18/12	0.4	Correspondence with counsel to various lessors regarding lease rejections.
Resnick BM	07/18/12	1.0	Emails regarding Massey litigation (0.3); prepare for call with Cleary (counsel to Massey) (0.7).
Starr AT	07/18/12	1.0	Calls and emails regarding contract rejection issues with J. Martin, B. Resnick, C. Ebetino, M. Huebner and C. Zhu.
Foust JT	07/19/12	0.4	Research case law on nunc pro tunc rejection.
Huebner MS	07/19/12	0.3	Conversations and emails regarding Massey litigation schedule.
Klein DS	07/19/12	0.9	Revise rejection motion and email same to D. Schaible (0.6); calls with counterparties and communications with company on rejections (0.3).
Martin JD	07/19/12	1.8	Analyze potential contracts for rejection (1.4); emails with J. Eagan, C. Ebetino and others regarding same (0.4).
Mehes A	07/19/12	1.9	Review executory contracts.
Resnick BM	07/19/12	1.0	Call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding Massey motion (0.2); meet with A. Starr and J. Martin regarding Massey and other override agreements (0.8).
Ruiz EL	07/19/12	0.7	Review and revise rejection procedures motion.
Schaible DS	07/19/12	0.5	Emails regarding executory contract rejection issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/19/12	1.8	Calls and emails regarding Massey contract rejection with B. Resnick, J. Martin, C. Ebetino, J. Bean and Massey counsel (0.8); review materials and research regarding contract rejection (1.0).
Tsiouris N	07/19/12	1.3	Organize Coal Supply Agreements and send to financial advisors (0.2); edit chart summarizing governing law provisions in Coal Supply Agreements (0.9); communications with team regarding financial advisor data requests (0.2).
Zhu B	07/19/12	0.7	Prepare and review correspondence with J. Martin regarding discussions with opposition counsel on Massey motion.
Huebner MS	07/20/12	0.7	Conversations with clients, Davis Polk regarding contract rejection issues and timing (multiple counterparties) (0.3); multiple calls and emails with multiple Davis Polk lawyers regarding new Coal Supply Agreement issues and amendments (0.4).
Klein DS	07/20/12	1.1	Calls with rejection counterparties regarding equipment retrieval and coordinate with company regarding same (0.7); revise rejection order and emails with Curtis Mallet regarding same (0.4).
Martin JD	07/20/12	0.3	Emails with C. Zhu, J. Eagan and others regarding potential contracts for rejection.
Mehes A	07/20/12	4.3	Review override agreements.
Resnick BM	07/20/12	0.9	Draft Massey hearing extension agreement (0.4); emails regarding Massey hearing extension (0.5).
Ruiz EL	07/20/12	1.0	Calls with D. Klein and C. Zhu regarding rejected contracts (0.3); review of first omnibus rejection order (0.4); call with S. Hait regarding the same and follow-up thereto (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/20/12	0.8	Emails regarding Executory Contract payments.
Starr AT	07/20/12	1.5	Calls and emails regarding executory contract issues with J. Martin, B. Resnick, C. Ebetino and M. Huebner (0.9); review legal analysis regarding the same (0.6).
Tsiouris N	07/20/12	0.2	Communications with financial advisor regarding supply agreements.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	07/20/12	3.7	Attend conference with D. Klein and E. Ruiz regarding first day rejection contracts (0.3); prepare and review correspondence with D. Klein and E. Ruiz regarding same (0.4); review first day rejection schedule (0.1); prepare presentation slide for certain rejection contracts (2.8); prepare correspondence with A. Starr, D. Schaible, J. Martin, D. Klein, D. Toscano and others regarding same (0.1).
Schaible DS	07/21/12	0.6	Emails regarding coal contract rejection issues.
Starr AT	07/21/12	0.8	Calls and emails regarding executory contract inquiries with B. Resnick, J. Martin and B. Zhu.
Martin JD	07/22/12	1.8	Analysis of contracts for rejection (1.2); emails with C. Ebetino, B. Resnick and A. Starr regarding same (0.6).
Mehes A	07/22/12	0.9	Research regarding executory contracts.
Resnick BM	07/22/12	1.3	Call with management regarding Massey and other override litigations (0.5); emails with C. Ebetino and Davis Polk team regarding Massey and other override litigations (0.8).
Schaible DS	07/22/12	1.5	Emails regarding coal contract issues (0.6); telephone conference and follow-up and emails regarding EDS filing (0.9).
Starr AT	07/22/12	0.3	Emails regarding executory contract issues with B. Resnick and J. Martin.
Huebner MS	07/23/12	1.4	Emails regarding Massey issues and approach and internal calls regarding same (0.2); emails regarding Arch issues and possible approach (0.1); review of present value issues for claim valuation (0.6); internal emails regarding finalizing Coal Supply Agreements (0.3); emails regarding business and drafting issues regarding Vitol contract (0.1); conversations with EDF counsel regarding multiple issues (0.1).
Klein DS	07/23/12	0.8	Coordinate with rejection counterparties regarding retrieval arrangements and emails with clients regarding same (0.6); emails with clients on postpetition contracts (0.2).
Libby A	07/23/12	2.6	Research precedents and draft Notice of Presentment for EDF Motion (1.9); file claims motion and follow-up with S. Hait regarding same (0.3); draft notice of presentment for Vitol Stipulation (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	07/23/12	5.4	Review and analyze multiple contracts for rejection (3.8); emails with Cleary, A. Starr, B. Resnick regarding Massey motion (0.9); research issues related to Massey motion (0.7).
Mehes A	07/23/12	3.6	Review documents regarding executory contract rejection (1.5); draft executory contract rejection motion (2.1).
Ruiz EL	07/23/12	2.5	Review and revise EDF stipulation (1.0); review and revision of Vitol stipulation (1.0); call to counsel to lessor regarding assumption of lease (0.2); review of Bridgehouse motion (0.3).
Satter KM	07/23/12	1.7	Meet with E. Vonnegut regarding research assignment (0.2); research the obligations of utility providers under §366 in the case of rejecting the contracts (1.5).
Schaible DS	07/23/12	0.6	Emails regarding contract assumption issues.
Starr AT	07/23/12	1.8	Calls regarding executory contract issues with J. Martin (0.3); meet with J. Martin, B. Resnick, C. Zhu regarding rejection analysis (0.6); revise legal analysis regarding same (0.7); emails with Massey counsel regarding motion (0.2).
Vonnegut EJ	07/23/12	0.8	Review and mark up reply to letter regarding selenium contract (0.6); review materials regarding workday contract (0.2).
Huebner MS	07/24/12	0.3	Conversations with B. Resnick regarding Massey litigation issues (0.2); emails with EDF counsel regarding various matters (0.1).
Klein DS	07/24/12	1.1	Call with J. Jones et al regarding postpetition contract drafting and follow-up (0.4); draft non-assumption language and email to B. Resnick (0.3); call with S. Kaushal regarding assumption stipulation and follow-up regarding same (0.4).
Libby A	07/24/12	2.1	Draft and revise notice of presentment for EDF stipulation (0.5); draft and revise notice of presentment for Vitol stipulation (0.5); discussions with litigation team regarding finalization and filing process for EDF and Vitol stipulations and revise to stipulations accordingly (0.8); file EDF and Vitol stipulation (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	07/24/12	6.1	Call with C. Ebetino, J, Eagan and others regarding contract rejections (2.4); further analysis of contracts for rejection (1.6); research on issues related to Massey motion (1.3); call with G. Moody regarding Massey research issues (0.3); call with Cleary regarding Massey motion and follow up (0.5).
Mehes A	07/24/12	6.3	Drafting motions regarding executory contract rejection.
Moody, Jr. GM	07/24/12	4.3	Call with J. Martin regarding legal research assignment (0.4); research legal issues regarding §365 motions (3.9).
Resnick BM	07/24/12	5.2	Call with C. Ebetino and others regarding Massey and other lease issues (1.4); research §365(d)(3) proration issues (2.8); meet with S. Hait regarding §365(d)(3) proration issues (0.2); call with Cleary regarding Massey schedule (0.3); meet with M. Huebner regarding Massey and payment of lessors (0.3); emails with clients regarding lessor payments and Massey (0.2).
Satter KM	07/24/12	8.7	Research caselaw and statutes regarding termination of utility contracts.
Starr AT	07/24/12	4.6	Conference calls regarding royalty contracts with C. Ebetino, J. Haider, B. Resnick and J. Martin (1.4); review royalty contracts (0.8); calls and emails regarding the same with J. Martin and C. Zhu (0.5); calls with Massey counsel regarding rejection motion (0.3); analyze Massey issues (1.6).
Tsiouris N	07/24/12	0.4	Review supply agreements to respond to questions from Unsecured Creditors' Committee.
Vonnegut EJ	07/24/12	0.2	Discuss workday contract with R. McWilliams.
Huebner MS	07/25/12	0.4	Further emails regarding Coal Supply Agreements and open issues (0.2); calls and emails regarding C. Walker issues (0.2).
Huebner MS	07/25/12	0.3	Conversations with A. Starr, B. Resnick and J. Bromley regarding Massey litigation.
Klein DS	07/25/12	0.9	Call with rejection counterparty regarding equipment retrieval and coordinate with clients regarding same (0.4); email R. McWilliams regarding potpetition contracts (0.2); emails with clients regarding lease assumption/rejections and timing issues (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	07/25/12	5.1	Review and revise rejection motions regarding overrides (2.7); calls with Cleary regarding Massey motion (0.8); conferences and emails with B. Resnick, G. Moody, and others regarding Massey motion and related research (1.6).
Mehes A	07/25/12	1.2	Edit rejection motions (1.0); obtain rejection notice addresses (0.2).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/25/12	9.6	Research legal issues regarding 365 motions (2.6); call with J. Martin regarding same (0.1); synthesize and summarize legal research (2.8); meet with B. Resnick and J. Martin regarding status conference with court (0.4); call with Alpha regarding status conference with court (0.2); draft talking points for conference with court (2.9); send same to J. Martin for review (0.1); integrate comments from J. Martin into draft talking points (0.4); send draft talking points to B. Resnick (0.1).
Schaible DS	07/25/12	1.9	Telephone calls and follow-up with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding utilities issues and emails with counterparty regarding same (1.4); emails regarding executory contract counterparty/utility requests (0.5).
Vonnegut EJ	07/25/12	0.8	Discuss Workday contract rejection with P. Brandt, E. Ruiz and D. Klein.
Foust JT	07/26/12	7.4	Research precedents for omnibus rejection replies (2.7); research standards for nunc pro tunc rejection (2.2); research standards for retroactive rejection (2.5).
Huebner MS	07/26/12	0.2	Conversation with B. Resnick regarding Massey matters and emails regarding same.
Libby A	07/26/12	0.8	Revise rejection/abandonment order per the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments.
Martin JD	07/26/12	4.8	Revise draft rejection motions (0.8); call with Judge Chapman regarding Massey motion and related issues (1.5); emails with C. Ebetino and others regarding Massey motion (0.8); conferences with A. Starr, T. Perez, C. Zhu, R. Estacio and others regarding Massey motion (1.7)

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Mehes A	07/26/12	6.1	Call with B.C. Zhu regarding override agreement research (0.4); conference with A. Starr, T. Perez, J. Martin, and litigation team regarding override agreement-related strategy and next steps (1.0); redact commercially sensitive terms from override contract (1.3); research override agreement-related issues (3.4).
Melvin MM	07/26/12	0.2	Obtain a precedent order regarding the rejection of non-residential real property for J. Foust and S. Hait.
Moody, Jr. GM	07/26/12	2.2	Conference call with Court regarding motion (0.3); meet with B. Resnick and others regarding same and strategy with respect to motion (0.8); legal research regarding contract interpretation (0.6); send results of research to B. Resnick (0.1); review draft talking points and send comments to B. Resnick (0.4).
Resnick BM	07/26/12	3.9	Prepare for telephonic status conference regarding Massey motion (1.5); telephonic status conference regarding Massey (0.3); meet with Davis Polk litigation team regarding Massey (1.8); draft email to clients regarding Massey (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/26/12	0.8	Emails and coordinate regarding contract party objections.
Starr AT	07/26/12	3.5	Review materials regarding royalty agreements (1.5); call with Court regarding the same (0.7); meetings regarding royalty motions (1.0); emails to C. Ebetino regarding the same (0.3).
Eum JS	07/27/12	1.1	Compile Massey-Peabody override materials for spiralastic binder as per B. Zhu.
Foust JT	07/27/12	1.3	Research precedents for omnibus rejection replies.
Huebner MS	07/27/12	0.3	Emails regarding first day orders and emails regarding Bowen Engineering demands.
Martin JD	07/27/12	4.9	Calls and conferences with B. Resnick, T. Graulich, T. Perez, C. Zhu and others regarding Massey motion (3.1); review documents and research related to Massey motion (1.8).
Mehes A	07/27/12	4.8	Review override agreement-related documents (0.4); conference with B. Resnick, T. Graulich and litigation team regarding override agreement strategy (1.5); research regarding override agreements (2.9).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moody, Jr. GM	07/27/12	5.1	Meet with B. Resnick and others regarding procedural strategy (1.1); call with B. Zhu regarding draft court filing (0.1); call with A. Mehes regarding contract integration (0.2); call with R. Estacio regarding draft court filing (0.1); call with J. Martin regarding same (0.1); call with A. Perez regarding contract interpretation (0.1); research legal issues regarding contract interpretation (3.4).
Perez-Marques AJ	07/27/12	1.2	Confer with B. Resnick, T. Graulich and others regarding Massey override strategy.
Starr AT	07/27/12	3.0	Review Peabody materials and related research (1.2); calls and emails with D. Toscano, E. White, M. Huebner and S. Kaushal regarding same (1.6); draft email memo for client regarding Peabody (0.7).
Vonnegut EJ	07/27/12	0.7	Discuss correspondence received by Hobet mining from Bowen consortium regarding the environmental project with clients and counsel to Bowen consortium (0.4); discuss AEP research regarding utility rates with D. Klein and J. Martin (0.3).
Zhu B	07/27/12	8.1	Prepare draft complaint for Massey override agreement (5.4); analyze additional background materials relating to Massey in preparation for draft complaint (2.1); prepare and review various correspondence with J. Martin and Patriot team regarding Massey background facts (0.6).
Mehes A	07/28/12	1.8	Edit override complaint.
Moody, Jr. GM	07/28/12	0.9	Research legal issues regarding admission of evidence in bankruptcy court.
Schaible DS	07/28/12	1.2	Emails and review materials regarding rejection procedures.
Zhu B	07/28/12	5.2	Prepare draft complaint for Massey override agreement (5.4); prepare correspondence with J. Martin and A. Mehes regarding next steps (0.5).
Mehes A	07/29/12	4.9	Edit override complaint.
Moody, Jr. GM	07/29/12	0.1	Review correspondence regarding executory contracts.
Schaible DS	07/29/12	0.8	Emails regarding rejection procedures comments.
Estacio R	07/30/12	8.8	Legal research regarding contract dispute (1.3); conference with G. Moody regarding the same (0.1); read correspondence from J. Martin regarding the same (0.1); review contracts subject to dispute (3.1); draft complaints seeking declaratory judgment regarding contract dispute (4.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	07/30/12	0.2	Emails regarding court's questions on Vitol and EDF.
Martin JD	07/30/12	1.8	Analyze certain Coal Supply Agreements for rejection (0.6); conferences and call with B. Bennett, C. Ebetino, M. Huebner, A. Starr and others regarding same (1.2).
Mehes A	07/30/12	3.0	Meeting with J. Martin regarding edits to override complaint (1.1); research regarding override complaint (1.9).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/30/12	11.4	Research legal issues regarding admission of evidence in bankruptcy court and New York law (4.4); review and revise draft complaint (2.8); review documents in preparation for drafting complaint (2.6); meet with J. Martin regarding draft complaint (1.0); call with A. Mehes regarding research on admission of evidence in bankruptcy court (0.4); call with A. Perez regarding same (0.1); call with R. Estacio regarding same (0.1).
Perez-Marques AJ	07/30/12	4.2	Review memos and caselaw (2.0); review and revise complaint (1.5); conference with J.D. Martin regarding same (0.7).
Starr AT	07/30/12	4.9	Emails regarding court pleadings for contract counterparties (0.3); review drafts of stipulation (0.3); calls and emails regarding the same (0.3); emails regarding stay issues (0.4); meet with J. Martin, S. Kaughal and D. Toscano regarding Peabody contracts (0.3); calls with B. Bennett, C. Ebetino, B. Hatfield, I. Englehardt, J. Martin and M. Huebner regarding coal supply contracts (1.0); meet with S. Kaushal and D. Toscano regarding research about coal supply contracts (1.0); calls and emails with J. Martin regarding the same (0.4); emails regarding new agreements (0.2); review Peabody contracts (0.7).
Tsiouris N	07/30/12	0.9	Review setoff materials on intranet (0.5); draft email regarding setoff issues to Davis Polk group (0.2); follow-up communications with E. White and D. Toscano (0.2).
Vonnegut EJ	07/30/12	0.7	Call with counsel to Bowen regarding selenium project contract (0.2); emails regarding dispute with Bowen regarding selenium project contract with client, H. Baker and D. Klein (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	07/31/12	8.9	Draft adversary complaints regarding contract disputes (3.8); analyze legal research from G. Moody and others regarding the same (0.7); read analyses from T. Perez and J. Martin regarding the same (0.3); confer with G. Moody regarding drafting adversary complaint (0.1); correspond with J. Martin regarding editing adversary complaints (0.1); confer with T. Perez regarding contracts in dispute (0.1); confer with legal assistant J. Eum regarding copying relevant contracts (0.1); review and edit adversary complaints regarding contract disputes (3.7).
Martin JD	07/31/12	1.5	Review and revise Massey complaint.
Mehes A	07/31/12	7.6	Edit override complaint (6.7); review override-related research (0.2); research filing procedures (0.7).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/31/12	9.4	Research legal issues regarding admission of evidence in bankruptcy court and New York law (3.2); summarize same and circulate to team (0.7); review and revise draft complaint (2.1); review documents in preparation for drafting complaint (2.3); call with T. Perez regarding preparation of background materials (0.1); call with J. Martin regarding draft complaint (0.2); review comments on draft complaints (0.7); send draft complaint to team for comments (0.1).
Perez-Marques AJ	07/31/12	4.9	Review settlement agreement and confer with team (via email) regarding same (1.8); conference with B. Kovacevich regarding integration legal research (0.5); teleconference with J.D. Martin regarding Massey override issues (0.4); review and revise complaint (1.7); review research regarding severability (0.5).
Schaible DS	07/31/12	1.1	Emails and teleconferences and review materials regarding rejection and asset sale procedures objections.
Starr AT	07/31/12	1.4	Review Peabody materials (0.5); calls with C. Ebetino and B. Bennett regarding same (0.6); emails regarding legal research on contracts (0.3).
Total EXECUTORY CONTRACTS		283.5	

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
FINANCING			
Chepiga TL	07/10/12	14.0	Mark-up DIP motion and conference with E. Vonnegut regarding same (0.6); coordinate signature page with M. Schroeder (0.1); review and mark-up roll-up credit agreement (1.1); emails and calls with E. Vonnegut and others regarding same (0.4); conferences with B. Smith regarding roll-up credit agreement (0.3); call with J. Chincheck and M. McGreal regarding inquiries (0.2); multiple calls with W. Warner and others, Company, Weil and Willkie regarding DIP hearing (1.4); additional mark-up of roll-up credit agreement and emails with W. Warner and others regarding same (1.6); review revised draft of security agreement and emails with Company, Weil and Willkie regarding same (0.6); review documents in preparation for DIP hearing (0.7); attend DIP hearing (4.0); conference with G. Pak and M. Immermann regarding status (0.7); emails with Weil regarding opinions and review of same (0.8); review and comment on revised draft of roll-up credit agreement (1.5).
Hait S	07/10/12	0.9	Draft notice of filing revised DIP motion exhibits.
Huebner MS	07/10/12	3.1	Extensive calls regarding DIP and first day hearing with clients, Davis Polk lenders' counsel (1.8); calls and emails with clients, Davis Polk lenders' counsel regarding cash collateral fallback plan (1.3).
Immermann MC	07/10/12	3.1	Revise and distribute closing deliverables (2.4); update discussions with Davis Polk team (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	07/10/12	11.7	Review of revised payoff letter and ongoing correspondences with Company, Mayer Brown and Bryan Cave regarding the same (0.6); correspondences with Davis Polk bankruptcy team regarding timing of filings (0.4); review of revised second out guaranty, revised guaranty, prepared blackline and sent to Weil (1.1); call with Weil and Willkie regarding hearing and related issues (0.5); call with Patriot regarding hearing and related issues (0.7); correspondences with the Company regarding flood insurance inquiry from Bank of America (0.2); call with S. Gordon regarding flood insurance request (0.3); confer with S. Sorkin regarding flood insurance process and confer with Mayer Brown regarding the same (0.5); confer with M. Teixeira and M. Immermann regarding mini-books for Davis Polk team to take to court and reviewed (0.6); review and revise multiple drafts of Second Out credit agreement and security and intercreditor agreement (2.2); review and draft of exhibits and schedules to Second Out credit agreement and correspondences with Willllkie regarding the same (2.7); review and revise closing deliverables and continue to prepare for closing (3.3); ongoing correspondences with Davis Polk team, Weil, Wilkie, Blackstone, Citi, Barclays Bank of America and Company regarding the foregoing. (0.7).
Resnick BM	07/10/12	11.4	Call with I. Engelhardt and others regarding hearing strategy (1.5); call with Willkie and Weil regarding hearing strategy (1.2); prepare for court hearing (4.0); attend court hearing to argue motion to approve DIP facility (3.7); emails regarding final changes to DIP Order (1.0).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Robertson C	07/10/12	6.8	Revise DIP motion (0.8); draft additional DIP talking points (0.5); finalize and file DIP motion (1.0); finalize and file motion to seal fee letters (0.5); prepare documents for DIP motion and motion to seal fee letters to be delivered to chambers (1.2); deliver DIP binders and related documents to Chambers (0.8); coordinate with S. Hait to prepare notice of filing of amended exhibits to the DIP motion (0.4); revise order to seal fee letters (1.3); redact fee letters (0.5); emails to E. Vonnegut regarding mechanisms for posting letters of credit under the first-out DIP facility (0.6).
Teixeira MM	07/10/12	2.0	Review and prepare minibooks (1.0); edit secretary certificate documents (1.0).
Vonnegut EJ	07/10/12	15.1	Attend first day and DIP approval hearing (2.5); finalize and file DIP Financing papers (4.5); prepare for DIP hearing and related revisions to documents and negotiations with lenders (8.1).
Warner W	07/10/12	12.5	Review and comment on drafts and redrafts of first out credit facilities (2.8); review of conditions to closing (0.6); multiple calls in preparation for hearing (1.6); multiple emails regarding hearing in bankruptcy court (3.9); closing matters (0.3); review security agreement and intercreditor provisions (0.3); telephone calls with Weil and Wilkie regarding intercreditor provisions (0.5); review and comment on roll-up credit agreement (0.5); review and comment on Davis Polk opinion (0.4); review and comment on press release (0.2); analyze cash collateral available from existing credit facility (1.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Chepiga TL	07/11/12	8.7	Emails and calls with E. Vonnegut, G. Pak and others regarding schedules (0.4); review funds flow (0.2); calls with R. Mead and lenders regarding funds flow (0.4); revise borrowing notice (0.2); multiple calls and emails with Company, Weil, Willkie, D. Klein and others regarding entry of interim order, first out facility closing and documents in connection with same (3.3); call with W. Hoeben and others regarding 8K (0.3); draft disclosure (1.0); calls with lender and Weil regarding security agreement (0.4); call with Blackstone regarding interest payments and review documents in connection with same (0.7); email update to M. McGreal (0.1); calls and emails with Willkie regarding second-out facility (0.3); correspondences with Patriot and Davis Polk team regarding post-closing items (0.6); email with D. Klein and others regarding taxes and review first-out facility in connection with same (0.8).
Immermann MC	07/11/12	1.0	Funds Flow call (0.3); revise opinions (0.3); correspondence regarding closing with the Davis Polk Patriot team (0.4).
Libby A	07/11/12	0.2	Email E. Vonnegut, C. Robertson and M. McGreal regarding DIP Exhibits.
Pak GY	07/11/12	4.9	Prepare new notes for Bank of America as per request from Weil (0.4); correspond with Willkie and Davis Polk teams regarding final version of security agreement for filing (0.4); correspond with Mayer Brown, Bryan Cave, Patriot and Davis Polk regarding payoff letter (0.6); all-hands call regarding funding and closing (0.3); correspond with Weil, Willkie and Davis Polk teams and banks regarding closing (0.6); correspond with Patriot and Davis Polk team regarding post-closing items (0.6); correspond with M. Teixeira regarding closing books and review of prepared index (0.9); calls with Willkie regarding Second Out credit agreement (0.4); correspond with Weil and Davis Polk team regarding diligence requests on letters of credit and review of system for the same (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	07/11/12	3.2	Emails regarding filing of DIP budget (0.5); call with E. Gasparino regarding fee letters (0.2); call with S. Krause regarding retention issues (0.2); emails regarding finalizing documents for closing of DIP facility (2.3).
Robertson C	07/11/12	0.8	Email redacted fee letters to B. Resnick and E. Vonnegut (0.2); email schedules to DIP order to M. McGreal (0.1); email DIP order to T. Chepiga (0.1); update key dates calendar with information from DIP agreements (0.4).
Teixeira MM	07/11/12	1.4	Draft indexes and prepare minibooks and closing sets of DIP Agreements.
Vonnegut EJ	07/11/12	1.2	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding finalizing and filing of DIP order and closing of DIP financing (0.7); calls with creditors regarding DIP (0.5).
Warner W	07/11/12	2.4	Closing matters for First Out Credit Facility (1.7); telephone calls with Weil and Willkie regarding closing mechanics and intercreditor matters (0.2); review asset securitization payoff letter (0.3); review and comment on Second Out Credit Facility revisions (0.1); review press coverage (0.1).
Chepiga TL	07/12/12	9.6	Update call (1.0); conferences with G. Pak and M. Immermann regarding post-closing items (0.4); review revised second-out credit agreement and emails with Willkie and W. Warner and others regarding same (0.3); emails with Company regarding post-closing items (0.3); draft disclosure and calls with W. Hoeben regarding same (1.2); call with G. Pak, M. Immermann, Company, S. Gordon, M. D'Antoni and others regarding same (0.5); multiple calls with K. Villareal, G. Pak and R. Mead regarding schedule 7.01 (0.7); conference with B. Smith regarding CA question (0.2); emails with Blackstone regarding same (0.1); emails with D. Schaible and others regarding credit agreement question and review of credit agreement in connection with same (0.5); draft post-closing opinion (1.3); emails and call with W. Warner and Company regarding comments to second out credit agreement (0.3); email and call with E. Vonnegut regarding credit agreement (0.2); call with G. Moody regarding litigation (0.2); draft summary chart for Company (2.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Immermann MC	07/12/12	6.0	Conference with T. Chepiga and G. Pak regarding post-closing (0.4); conference call with Patriot and local counsel regarding post-closing (0.5); draft continuing reporting obligations summary (4.1).
Klein DS	07/12/12	0.4	Review fee seal motion and emails with B. Resnick et al regarding same (0.2); emails with credit group regarding DIP amendment (0.2).
McGreal MM	07/12/12	0.4	Correspond with E. Vonnegut and D. Klein regarding motion to seal fee letters (0.1); correspondence regarding second day motions (0.3).
Pak GY	07/12/12	10.4	Correspondences with Weil and J. Brenner regarding missing sig page in fully executed First Out DIP Credit Agreement (0.4); correspondences to Mayer Brown and Bryan Cave regarding post-closing matters in connection with AR securitization termination (0.4); call with Patriot and local counsels regarding post-closing matters (0.5); review of surety motion in connection with Schedule 7.01 (0.3); draft of Schedule 7.01 and blackline of the same (0.4); draft of Schedule 6.21 and blackline of the same (0.4); conferred with Patriot, T. Chepiga, O. Oshen, J. Lutrín and D. Klein regarding Company's surety bonds and letters of credit (1.1); draft of post-closing checklist for Weil and Willkie (0.7); draft of post-closing checklist for Company (0.5); correspondence with Company regarding Barclay's request for bond agreement (0.2); correspondence to Weil and Willkie teams regarding post-closing call and revised schedules 7.02 ad 6.21 (0.6); conferences with T. Chepiga, M. Immermann regarding post-closing items (0.4); call with G. Pak, M. Immermann, Company, S. Gordon, M. D'Antoni and others regarding same (0.5); multiple calls with K. Villareal, T. Chepiga and R. Mead regarding schedule 7.01 (0.7); review of security agreement and draft of credit agreement summary memo (3.3).
Resnick BM	07/12/12	0.9	Call with R. Mead and T. Stenger regarding 13-week forecast, SocGen and surety bond issues (0.4); Emails regarding DIP post-closing issues (0.5).
Robertson C	07/12/12	1.2	Draft notice of entry of interim DIP order at direction of E. Vonnegut (1.1); review DIP motion in response to question from E. Ruiz concerning notice requirements (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Teixeira MM	07/12/12	2.1	Organize organizational documents and finalize documents (1.0); edit and draft closing set index (0.7); mail and prepare organizational document cds (sent to local counsel) (0.6).
Vonnegut EJ	07/12/12	0.7	Draft notice of entry of DIP Order and discuss same with M. McGreal and B. Resnick (0.5); discuss filing of DIP documents with B. Resnick and T. Chepiga (0.2).
Warner W	07/12/12	3.6	Confer with T. Chepiga regarding Second Out Credit Agreement and review same (0.7); telephone call regarding Hedge with B. Resnick and R. Mead (0.2); review 8-K and email to S. Beshar (0.3); telephone call with T. Chepiga regarding permitted debt (0.2); review credit agreement and telephone conference with WFG regarding expenses for lenders counsel (1.0); review and comment on Davis Polk opinion (0.4); telephone call(s) with A. Starr and others (0.2); telephone calls with A. Starr and Patriot (0.4); review 13-week cash flow issues (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Chepiga TL	07/13/12	14.5	Email correspondence with Company and Willkie regarding Second Out CA and bank accounts (0.8); call with W. Warner and A. Star (0.2); call with W. Warner, A. Starr and Company (0.4); mark-up disclosure and emails and calls with W. Hoeben regarding same (1.1); emails with R. Mead regarding accounts and review of documents in connection with same (0.2); emails and calls with E. Vonnegut, B. Resnick and others regarding status (0.5); conference with G. Pak and M. Immermann regarding post-closing (0.2); post-closing call with G. Pak, M. Immermann and Weil and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); review revised draft Second Out credit agreement and emails with Company and Willkie regarding same (0.3); call with Weil regarding clean-up comments and emails regarding same (0.2); calls with Willkie regarding closing (0.4); review opinion with comments from W. Warner and conference with M. Immermann regarding same (0.5); closing Second Out Facility and emails to Company and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); emails with R. Mead, B. Resnick and others regarding fees (0.3); calls and emails with S. Krause regarding DIP Facilities (0.2); emails and call with G. Moody, W. Warner and others regarding revised language (0.4); call with Weil and Willkie regarding clean-up changes and emails regarding same (0.3); emails with Willkie regarding lender signature pages (0.2); emails regarding Fifth Third terminations (0.2); emails with J. Chincheck and S. Gordon regarding draft opinion (0.4); emails with S. Beshar and R. Mead regarding document request (0.2); email clean-up comments to Weil (0.2); draft summary of DIP loan documents (6.1).
Huber BM	07/13/12	2.6	Emails and teleconferences regarding permit block issues relating to various West Virginia and Kentucky taxes (1.3); draft summary of status of issues (0.3); organize selenium consent decrees and send to Weil Gotshal pursuant to their request (0.7), discussions with O. Oshen regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Immermann MC	07/13/12	2.0	Post-closing call with Weil (0.6); correspondence with J. Brenner regarding final documents (0.2); finalize DIP opinions (0.7); revise NY/DE opinions (0.5).
Klein DS	07/13/12	0.5	Coordinate with R. Mead regarding cash management issues (0.2); coordinate on fee letter sealing issues (0.3).
Kogan O	07/13/12	0.9	Call with C. Robertson regarding DIP motion (0.3); research regarding same (0.5); email to C. Robertson regarding same (0.1).
McGreal MM	07/13/12	0.3	Review transcript regarding sealing fee letters (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/13/12	0.3	Call with W. Warner and others regarding Patriot Coal financing.
Pak GY	07/13/12	4.4	Review of draft of 8K in connection with DIP financing (0.6); correspondences with J. Brenner regarding timing of filing of 8-K and status of various documentation (0.4); correspondence from Company and Weil regarding Fifth Third terminations (0.2); confer with S. Jackman and M. Pilkington regarding UCC-1s for Fifth Third (0.3); correspondences with the Company and T. Chepiga regarding Deposit and Control Agreements (0.4); correspondences with the Patriot, Davis Polk and Willkie teams regarding status of Second Out DIP Facility documentation (0.4); call with Weil regarding post-closing matters (0.5); confer with S. Krause regarding description of banks in motion and revised the same (0.6); correspondence with M. Pilkington regarding bringdowns for post-closing opinions (0.2); ongoing correspondences and calls with Weil, Willkie, Davis Polk and Patriot teams regarding closing of Second Out DIP credit agreement (0.8).
Resnick BM	07/13/12	2.0	Emails regarding surety bonds (0.2); review surety bond motion (0.2); call with J. Smolinsky regarding fee letter disclosure (0.2); call with J. Smolinsky regarding contract terminations (0.1); call with E. Vonnegut and T. Chepiga regarding DIP filing (0.2); meet with E. Vonnegut regarding payment of Willkie's fees (0.1); call with E. Gasparini regarding fee letter sealing and budget (0.3); review research regarding fee letter sealing (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Robertson C	07/13/12	5.0	Revise notice of DIP Order and have same executed by B. Resnick (0.2); compile notice of entry of DIP Order and send to A. Libby (0.3); research whether said notice ought to be filed on the docket (0.2); coordinate with A. Libby and Garden City Group to serve said notice (0.3); research disclosure of fee lenders signed in connection with DIP financing in previous cases (3.3); call with B. Resnick to discuss research (0.1); email to B. Resnick summarizing research (0.6).
Vonnegut EJ	07/13/12	1.4	Discuss filing of DIP documents with B. Resnick and T. Chepiga and draft papers for same (0.6); review DIP order for payment of Willkie fees provisions and discuss payment of Willkie fees with B. Resnick and T. Chepiga (0.5); discuss document filing with A. de Richemont (0.3).
Klein DS	07/14/12	0.7	Emails with B. Resnick and E. Silverman regarding potential lender diligence questions.
Resnick BM	07/14/12	0.5	Revise notice of filing of DIP documents (0.2); review DIP Lender presentation (0.2); respond to questions from DIP Lenders (0.1).
Chepiga TL	07/15/12	0.9	Review clean-up drafts of First Out Credit Agreement and Security Agreement and emails with Company, Weil and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.7); emails and call with E. Vonnegut regarding documents to be filed (0.2).
Klein DS	07/15/12	0.2	Review revised tax lien language and emails with T. Chepiga on same.
Resnick BM	07/15/12	1.5	Prepare for court hearing regarding sealing of DIP financing fees.
Robertson C	07/15/12	0.9	Download redacted fee letter filed in precedent bankruptcy case and send same to B. Resnick (0.2); locate the original fee letter signed in precedent case on the system and email to B. Resnick (0.1); call from B. Resnick regarding redacted fee letters (0.2); redact certain portions of one of the fee letters in response to comments from B. Resnick (0.2); prepare versions of each fee letter highlighting the language to be redacted and send same to B. Resnick (0.2).
Vonnegut EJ	07/15/12	1.5	Finalize and file DIP financing documents.
Warner W	07/15/12	0.2	Review document changes and related emails.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Arnaldos A	07/16/12	1.9	Meet with T. Chepiga and G. Pak regarding post-closing actions (0.7); review post-closing checklist and credit agreements (1.2).
Chepiga TL	07/16/12	8.1	Emails with G. Pak, A. Starr and M. Huebner (0.3); call with M. Schroeder et al regarding summary chart (1.0); conferences with G. Pak and W. Warner regarding post-closing items (0.5); calls with R. Mead, G. Pak and Weil regarding swaps and review documents in connection with same (0.6); email correspondence with Davis Polk team (0.3); call with J. Brenner et al regarding materials (0.2); meeting with G. Pak and A. Arnaldos regarding status (0.4); revise summary chart, create deliverables calendar and distribute same to Company (4.8).
Law EC	07/16/12	0.4	Communications with C. Robertson regarding logistics of ECF filing of redacted fee letters.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	07/16/12	9.2	Emails with T.Chepiga, A. Starr and M. Huebner (0.3); conferences with T.Chepiga and W. Warner regarding post-closing items (0.5); calls with R. Mead, T.Chepiga and Weil regarding swaps and review documents in connection with same (0.6); email correspondence with Davis Polk team (0.3); call with J. Brenner and T. Chepiga and others regarding materials (0.2); meeting with G. Pak and A. Arnaldos regarding status (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk bankruptcy team regarding status of termination of AR securitization facility (0.2); revise schedule 7.02 and sent to T. Chepiga (0.3); review of revised summary chart (0.7); correspondences with Bowles Rice and D. Klein regarding bankruptcy motion for fees (0.3); correspondence to Weil and Willkie regarding delivery of stock certificates in Bank of America vault (0.3); correspondences with Weil, Company and Citi regarding call tomorrow on cash management (0.3); review original certificates and powers received by Company and prepare to send to Weil (0.6); request to Word Processing for conversion of Deposit and Control Agreements (0.3); correspondences to local counsels regarding call tomorrow on form of opinion (0.3); correspondences with Company regarding executed copies of documents (0.2); confer with S. Sorkin regarding flood certifications (0.3); correspondences with Willkie and S. Sorkin regarding flood certifications (0.6); revise form opinion, prepare blackline and send to Weil (0.8); revise closing set index and prepare closing set for duplication (1.7).
Resnick BM	07/16/12	4.2	Prepare for court hearing (1.0); attend court hearing to argue for DIP fee letter sealing motion (2.6); Review seal order (0.4); review form of notice (0.2).
Robertson C	07/16/12	2.0	Download case at the request of B. Resnick and send to B. Resnick (0.2); call with A. Libby to discuss availability of commitments under the First Out Facility (0.1); draft notice of filing of redacted fee letters (1.0); redact fee letters in form to be filed (0.3); compile .pdf of notice and fee letters to be filed upon lender sign-off (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Vonnegut EJ	07/16/12	2.3	Finalize papers for order authorizing filing of redacted fee letters and preparation of materials for hearing re same (1.6); prepare redacted fee letters for filing and review filing papers for same (0.7).
Warner W	07/16/12	1.9	Emails regarding bank meeting (0.2); issues regarding coal contract and lenders due diligence (0.4); review emails (1.3).
Arnaldos A	07/17/12	4.7	Review and make comments to memo regarding post-closing obligations and calendar (1.0); conference call regarding cash management (0.4); review draft opinion (0.6); conference call with Barclays (0.5); review credit agreement in order to respond to questions from Barclays regarding Designated Amounts regarding mechanism for adding new hedge agreements as secured obligations pursuant to the DIP Facility (1.5); draft responses to questions from Barclays (0.7).
Chepiga TL	07/17/12	2.0	Call with Company, Weil, Citi and Davis Polk team regarding cash management (0.5); update call (1.5).
Huebner MS	07/17/12	1.3	Emails with counsel for 2015 bondholders (0.2); review and markup of and email regarding lessor talking points (0.3); conversations with F. Huffard, Weil regarding bank meeting and covenants (0.8).
Law EC	07/17/12	0.3	ECF file redacted fee letters (0.2); communications with C. Robertson regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	07/17/12	4.4	Call with Citi, Weil and Company regarding cash management requirements (0.3); confer with T. Chepiga and A. Arnaldos regarding next steps (0.2); correspondences with Weil and Company regarding exhibits to First Out DIP credit agreement (0.4); correspondences with Company regarding borrowing base certificate (0.3); call with Company regarding status (0.3); correspondences with local counsels to set up call to discuss opinions (0.4); correspondences from S. Sorkin and Willkie regard flood certificates (0.2); correspondences with Company and Davis Polk teams regarding status and coverage (0.3); correspondence to Weil with Deposit and Control Agreements for review (0.3); review of mini-books and distribution of the same (0.6); correspondence from bankruptcy team regarding first day orders (0.2); update post-closing checklist (0.4); correspondence to Weil to follow-up on comments to form of opinion (0.2); review revised summary chart and calendar and confer with A. Libby regarding the same (0.3).
Resnick BM	07/17/12	0.7	Emails with R. Mead regarding SocGen hedge (0.1); call with R. Stern regarding SocGen hedge (0.1); call with U.S. Attorney's office regarding comments to DIP Order (0.1); review talking points for lessors (0.2); review U.S. Attorney's comments to DIP order (0.1); emails regarding notice of filing redacted fee letters (0.1).
Sullivan BM	07/17/12	1.2	Numerous emails exchanged with S. Sorkin and G. Pak and A. Feit at Willkie Farr regarding ordering Standard Flood Hazard Determinations for the real property and discussions regarding list of all owned or lease real property with improvements (0.8); office conferences with S. Sorkin regarding same (0.4).
Vonnegut EJ	07/17/12	0.7	Emails regarding inquiries from lessors with B. Resnick and S. Sorkin and discuss same with B. Resnick and draft talking points regarding same.
Warner W	07/17/12	0.9	Participate in update call (0.7); bank meeting preparation (0.1); review emails regarding hedges (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Arnaldos A	07/18/12	4.1	Conference call with local counsel regarding opinions (0.5); review lender presentation and bank book (2.2); review credit agreements and fee letters regarding question on payment of fees for non-secured loans (0.5); review files to find full Second Out DIP Facility documents (0.4); review communications regarding repairman's liens and others (0.5).
Chepiga TL	07/18/12	0.4	Call with G. Pak, A. Arnaldos and local counsel regarding opinions.
Huebner MS	07/18/12	0.6	Conversation with J. Smolinsky, DIP lender counsel regarding multiple issues.
Narayan GS	07/18/12	1.3	Prepare distributions for B. Resnick and S. Krause.
Pak GY	07/18/12	1.3	Emails regarding revised lender presentation from Citibank (0.2); correspond with Davis Polk bankruptcy team regarding potential venue change (0.1); call with local counsels regarding opinions (0.4); correspond with A. Arnaldos and M. Pilkington regarding bringdown good standings (0.2); correspond with Davis Polk team regarding repairman liens (0.2); correspondences with A. Arnaldos and E. Vonnegut regarding exhibits to Second Out DIP credit agreement (0.2).
Resnick BM	07/18/12	0.6	Emails regarding DIP documents (0.3); review DIP Lender presentation (0.3).
Sullivan BM	07/18/12	1.3	Continue to exchange numerous emails with S. Sorkin, S. Zoltek and A. Feit at Willkie Farr and Gallagher, regarding comprehensive list of property owned and leased for which flood hazard determinations will be required (0.8), office conferences with S. Sorkin regarding same (0.5).
Vonnegut EJ	07/18/12	0.7	Revise talking points regarding DIP for lessors and discuss same with B. Resnick (0.5); distribution of final credit agreements to Alix (0.1); email regarding DIP Budget to M. McGreal (0.1).
Warner W	07/18/12	1.7	Review lenders presentation and send comments on same (0.9); respond to Hedging security question (0.2); prepare response to equipment lien question (0.6).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Arnaldos A	07/19/12	2.8	Conference call regarding lender presentation (1.5); send copy of notes to Virginia local counsel (0.2); respond to questions from A. Libby regarding post-closing obligations (0.5); review comments to opinion made by Weil Gotshal (0.6).
Pak GY	07/19/12	0.7	Review of comments received from Weil on opinion (0.3); review emails from A. Arnaldos regarding the same (0.2); correspond with A. Arnaldos regarding notes issued at closing (0.2).
Resnick BM	07/19/12	0.2	Emails regarding lender presentation.
Sullivan BM	07/19/12	1.5	Numerous exchanges of emails with S. Sorkin, M. Williams, A. Feit, J. Egan and R. Evangel at First American regarding addresses for properties to order flood determinations, in particular Kentucky and West Virginia, numerous discussions (within the emails) regarding what properties are to be searched, what documents exist (surveys, deeds, tax maps) for most useful address, conference call with First American regarding timing of searches and information required, whether individual searches are required for each bank.
Warner W	07/19/12	1.4	Telephone calls with Patriot team for update (0.4); telephone calls with DIP lenders and others regarding bank book (1.0).
Arnaldos A	07/20/12	1.2	Respond to additional questions from A. Libby regarding post-closing obligations (0.3); conference call with D. Ferguson regarding legal opinion (0.5); conference call with T. Chepiga regarding legal opinion (0.4).
Huebner MS	07/20/12	0.9	Work on bank syndication deck and calls re same (0.6); conversations with Blackstone re bank meeting and financing issues (0.3).
Robertson C	07/20/12	0.4	Email to J. Foust regarding DIP lender counsel information (0.1); respond to question about 13-week cash flow from D. Klein (0.3).
Ruiz EL	07/20/12	0.2	Email to DIP lenders regarding filed motion.
Vonnegut EJ	07/20/12	0.6	Review DIP lender presentation (0.4); emails regarding DIP documents with clients and DIP lender counsel (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Warner W	07/20/12	4.6	Review and comment on revisions to bank meeting materials (3.1); review and comment on revised bank meeting materials (0.3); telephone conferences with M. Schroeder regarding financial statements (0.2); telephone conference with Weil regarding waiver (0.2); prepare amendment regarding financials delivery (0.5); emails regarding change (0.3).
Resnick BM	07/21/12	1.0	Review lender presentation (0.3); emails regarding lender presentation (0.2); call with banks regarding lender presentation (0.5).
Schaible DS	07/21/12	0.6	Emails regarding Debtor-In-Possession budget issues.
Taylor WL	07/21/12	0.3	Emails regarding disclosure issues in connection with financing.
Warner W	07/21/12	3.6	Emails (0.1); telephone conference with Weil (0.5); follow-up email (0.3); emails regarding alternative (0.3); review precedents (0.6); review and comment on materials for banks (1.0); telephone conference with lenders and others on comments (0.6); emails regarding disclosure (0.2).
Huebner MS	07/22/12	0.3	Emails regarding syndication presentation and further comments on same.
Resnick BM	07/22/12	0.4	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding lender presentation materials.
Warner W	07/22/12	1.3	Review and comment on model and assumptions.
Arnaldos A	07/23/12	1.3	Call with J. Tucker regarding post-closing obligations (0.2); draft email summarizing status of post-closing obligations (0.4); communications with J. Brenner regarding lender presentation (0.2); review and send comments to lender presentation (0.5).
Hoeben W	07/23/12	3.0	Review bank book and lenders presentation.
Huebner MS	07/23/12	3.6	Participation in two large calls with DIP lenders, counsel, clients and Blackstone to prepare for syndication meeting (1.3); review and markup of two full turns of materials for syndication meeting and emails to distribution list for same (0.9); multiple calls with A. Alfonso, M. Goldstein regarding DIP issues, collateral valuation issues, Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues (0.9); review of Blackstone model for syndication meeting (0.4); emails regarding Department of Justice comments on DIP order (0.1).
McClammy JI	07/23/12	0.5	Review and comment regarding lender presentation.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	07/23/12	0.7	Correspond with Davis Polk bankruptcy and credit teams regarding documents request from creditor's committee (0.4); review email from Citi regarding bank meeting (0.1); correspondences with A. Arnaldos and J. Brenner regarding bank meeting (0.2).
Resnick BM	07/23/12	3.6	Emails with Weil and Willkie regarding DIP financing issues (0.8); review bank book and model (0.9); emails regarding bank book and model (1.1); emails with Weil and clients regarding DOJ comments to DIP Order (0.3); call regarding bank book (0.5).
Schaible DS	07/23/12	0.6	Emails regarding Debtor-In-Possession hearing issues.
Sullivan BM	07/23/12	1.8	Meeting with S. Sorkin to review flood insurance issues (0.6); review maps and send to First American for analysis (1.2).
Teixeira MM	07/23/12	2.1	Review and track down credit documents (1.3); prepare large document request (0.8).
Vonnegut EJ	07/23/12	2.0	Review and mark-up presentation materials regarding DIP Loan (0.6); work on gathering DIP financing related documents for Unsecured Creditors' Committee and discuss same with C. Robertson (1.4).
Warner W	07/23/12	7.9	Review bank meeting materials (3.0); emails and analysis regarding disclosure of bank meeting materials (0.5); telephone call with M. Huebner and others regarding model (0.2); emails and review of agreement regarding delivery of initial financials (0.6); review pages regarding June 30 financials (0.5); review additional revisions (2.6); emails and review of waiver regarding delivery of initial financials (0.4); telephone call with Weil regarding amendment (0.1).
Arnaldos A	07/24/12	1.9	Review communications regarding waiver of obligation to deliver financial reports (0.4); review documents to be provided to Kramer Levin (1.0); review and send information regarding Patriot Coal Company LP (0.5).
Huebner MS	07/24/12	5.2	Attend pre-meetings with clients, lenders regarding bank syndication meeting (1.8); attend bank syndication meeting (3.1); follow up calls with multiple parties regarding bank syndication issues (0.3).
Klein DS	07/24/12	0.3	Emails with clients and E. Vonnegut regarding postpetition delivery and lien issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	07/24/12	0.4	Correspondences from Patriot regarding post-closing matters including Fifth Third Terminations (0.1); review comments to the waiver letter (0.2); correspondence from Patriot regarding potential IP (0.1).
Resnick BM	07/24/12	1.4	Research issues regarding Brown Rudnick comments to DIP order (0.7); call with S. Levine regarding comments to DIP order (0.2); emails regarding U.S. Attorney's comments to DIP order (0.1); call with T. Persinger regarding DIP order (0.4).
Sullivan BM	07/24/12	1.5	Search for real estate information related to flood insurance (0.8); exchange of numerous emails with S. Sorkin, First American Title Insurance Company, A. Feit and S. Zoltek regarding flood insurance (0.6); office conference with S. Sorkin (0.1).
Vonnegut EJ	07/24/12	1.5	Discuss comments to DIP order from parties in interest and planning for final DIP hearing with Davis Polk team (0.9); review PMSI documents, discuss same with D. Klein and email regarding same to clients (0.6).
Warner W	07/24/12	5.2	Conferences with Patriot regarding disclosure (0.4); telephone calls with Patriot 8-K (0.3); telephone calls to with Davis Polk and Patriot regarding 8-K (0.2); conferences with A. Dean regarding 8-K (0.2); review bank presentation regarding disclosure (0.8); telephone conferences with banks and others regarding bank book (0.5); review revisions to bank book (0.5); email regarding disclosure to public side (1.0); emails regarding waiver (0.2); signature pages for waiver (0.5); review issue regarding additional guarantors in roll up (0.4); review financials for the month of June (0.2).
Arnaldos A	07/25/12	1.1	Review communications regarding objection deadline for the DIP (0.2); revise legal opinion for DIP Lenders (0.9).
Huebner MS	07/25/12	0.8	Emails regarding surety bonds objections and conversation with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); multiple emails with DIP lenders regarding various topics (0.5).
Law EC	07/25/12	0.1	Communications with M. Melvin regarding objections to DIP.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	07/25/12	0.2	Review the docket to determine if any objections to the DIP financing motion had been filed (0.1); communication with E. Vonnegut regarding same (0.1).
Pak GY	07/25/12	0.3	Correspondences from C. Robertson regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee request for documents (0.1); correspondences on the executed waiver letter (0.2).
Resnick BM	07/25/12	1.1	Review B. Gorton's objection to DIP motion (0.2); call with B. Gorton regarding objection to DIP motion (0.5); calls with M. Huebner regarding DIP timing and objections (0.4).
Robertson C	07/25/12	0.5	Compile documents related to the existing credit agreement guarantee and email same to E. Vonnegut (0.3); review objection from surety bond holders to the DIP (0.2).
Vonnegut EJ	07/25/12	3.4	Discuss comments on DIP order with Brown Rudnick and research and draft same (1.8); discuss DIP order comments from sureties with surety counsel and review draft objection from same (0.8); emails regarding DIP provisions regarding JVs with Davis Polk team and review agreements for same (0.4); discuss final DIP order and final DIP hearing generally with Davis Polk team and DIP Lenders' counsel (0.4).
Huebner MS	07/26/12	1.0	Emails regarding DIP lender consultation rights (0.4); conversations with DIP counsel and with B. Resnick regarding DIP and surety progress on DIP (0.6).
Klein DS	07/26/12	0.4	Call with DIP Lender counsel regarding objections by surety providers and follow-up regarding same.
Pak GY	07/26/12	0.3	Correspondences from S. Sorkin and Weil regarding flood certification (0.2); correspondence from Patriot regarding post-closing matters (0.1).
Resnick BM	07/26/12	3.4	Review DIP Order comments received from various parties (0.8); call with Weil and Willkie regarding surety and DIP issues (0.5); calls with Weil, Willkie and B. Gorton regarding surety and DIP issues (1.2); revise DIP Order provisions (0.4); revise surety order provisions (0.5).
Robertson C	07/26/12	2.0	Call with DIP lenders and sureties to discuss DIP Order and Surety Motion (1.5); follow-up call regarding same (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Sullivan BM	07/26/12	1.0	Receipt of Standard Flood Hazard Determinations (0.4); review issues regarding properties (0.1); obtain West Virginia flood determinations (0.2); office conferences with S. Sorkin (0.1); exchange of emails with R. Evangel at First American regarding steps to clarify Kentucky results (0.2).
Vonnegut EJ	07/26/12	2.7	Discuss surety providers' objections to DIP with surety providers' counsel and DIP lender counsel and draft language for same.
Warner W	07/26/12	1.3	Review Davis Polk opinion/dating question (0.5); review local counsel opinions (0.1); Patriot Coal LP inquiry (0.1); review news reports (0.1); research 40 act issues (0.3); list of lenders (0.1); review status email (0.1).
Arnaldos A	07/27/12	2.9	Coordinate issuance of 40 Act Opinion with Investment Management group and obtain necessary information (2.5); send documents regarding 2008 Notes to C. Robertson (0.2); finalize legal opinion (0.2).
Huebner MS	07/27/12	0.3	Conversation with DIP lenders regarding U.S. Attorney's objections and possible resolutions (0.2); draft proposed language regarding same (0.1).
Pak GY	07/27/12	0.3	Correspond with A. Arnaldos, Patriot and Davis Polk team regarding 40 Act opinion and related documents.
Resnick BM	07/27/12	3.2	Review Weil's draft of DIP Order (0.4); review DIP Order comments received from various parties (0.8); emails regarding review of Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to DIP order (0.9); emails regarding surety comments to surety motion and DIP order (0.4); review surety order (0.3); revise DIP order provisions (0.4).
Roberts TA	07/27/12	3.0	Correspondence with A. Arnaldos (0.2); conference call with J. Wang and A. Arnaldos (0.1); review Davis Polk's '40 Act opinion (0.3); meet with J. Wang to discuss '40 Act analysis of the Parent and all of the guarantor subsidiaries (0.7); review Patriot's consolidated and unconsolidated financial statement and structure chart (1.7).
Robertson C	07/27/12	0.5	Locate indentures for notes issued under the prepetition credit agreements and email same to D. Klein and L. Samet (0.4); email MS Word copies of the two DIP facilities to E. Vonnegut (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Vonnegut EJ	07/27/12	1.9	Emails regarding DIP order objections with sureties, lenders' counsel, creditors' committee and U.S. attorney and review revised documents for same.
Vonnegut EJ	07/27/12	2.2	Negotiate revisions to surety order with surety counsel.
Wang JH	07/27/12	2.0	Conference call with T. Roberts and A. Arnaldos (0.1); meet with T. Roberts to discuss '40 Act analysis of the Parent and all of the guarantor subsidiaries (0.7); review Patriot's consolidated and unconsolidated financial statement and structure chart (1.2).
Warner W	07/27/12	0.6	Second partner review of Davis Polk opinion (0.3); review 40 Act (0.2); read news reports (0.1).
Resnick BM	07/28/12	0.1	Emails regarding sureties objections to DIP motion and surety motion.
Arnaldos A	07/29/12	0.3	Correspondence with C. Martin regarding 40 Act opinion.
Huebner MS	07/29/12	1.3	Multiple emails regarding DIP objections and review of Unsecured Creditors' Committee's demand list and spreadsheet regarding same.
Wang JH	07/29/12	0.1	Review unconsolidated financial statements.
Arnaldos A	07/30/12	3.3	Review communications regarding 40 Act (0.5); conference call with Patriot regarding 40 Act (0.5); conference call with H. Baker regarding letter of credit (0.3); draft email regarding status of specific letter of credit under DIP facility (1.2); review covenants affected by Massey payments (0.8).
Huebner MS	07/30/12	2.5	Call with DIP lenders regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee's and other objections (0.6); conversations with U.S. Attorney, J. Smolinsky regarding their DIP objections (0.5); conversations with DIP lenders regarding multiple other first day issues (0.8); emails and calls regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues on DIP (0.6).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	07/30/12	4.9	Review Unsecured Creditors' Committee DIP issues list (0.6); review sureties group draft objection to surety and DIP order (0.5); correspondence with counsel to sureties regarding objections (0.6); revise final surety order (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); correspondence with counsel to noteholders regarding objections to DIP (0.2); research precedent DIP orders on notice provisions (0.9); correspondence with M. Huebner regarding same (0.6); draft proposed notice of filing final DIP order (0.6); review revised final DIP order (0.7).
Pak GY	07/30/12	0.1	Review emails from Patriot and A. Arnaldos regarding Davis Polk post-closing opinion.
Resnick BM	07/30/12	0.6	Emails regarding various parties' comments and objections to final DIP order and sureties order.
Roberts TA	07/30/12	1.6	Davis Polk '40 Act team conference call with K. Winkelmann and M. Schroeder (0.4); meet with C. Martin and J. Wang regarding 40 act analysis (0.3); meet with J. Wang regarding '40 act analysis (0.2); review unconsolidated financial statements (0.7).
Robertson C	07/30/12	0.4	Email draft surety objection to M. McGreal (0.1); email A. Saavedra at Weil regarding current draft of DIP order (0.2); email copy of current DIP order to S. Levine at Brown Rudnick (0.1).
Vonnegut EJ	07/30/12	0.3	Emails regarding DIP order comments with DIP lenders' counsel, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee, Bondholders' counsel and Davis Polk team.
Wang JH	07/30/12	4.1	Davis Polk '40 Act team conference call with K. Winkelman and M. Schroeder (0.4); meet with C. Martin and T. Roberts (0.3); meet with T. Roberts regarding '40 act analysis (0.2); review unconsolidated financial statements (3.2).
Warner W	07/30/12	6.3	Weekly update (1.0); call regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee's issues (0.4); review issues list for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and other potential issues (0.5); calls with Patriot and others (2.2); review cleansing disclosure issues (2.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Arnaldos A	07/31/12	3.1	Review comments from lender's counsel to the local opinions (0.8); conference calls with local counsel regarding local opinions (0.5); call with M. D'Antoni regarding affidavit (0.1); communications regarding 40 Act opinion (0.3); respond to questions from D. Klein regarding characterization of guarantees under covenants of DIP financing (1.5).
Huebner MS	07/31/12	5.2	Conference call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee DIP lenders to go through all proposed Unsecured Creditors' Committee asks and comments (1.2); multiple emails with DIP lenders and conversations with M. Schonholtz and M. Goldstein regarding DIP lender comments and approach on first day orders (0.7); conference call with DIP lenders regarding new proposal including with respect to syndication (0.4); conference call with clients regarding same (0.8); multiple late night emails regarding remaining lender and Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments on first days slated for Thursday (0.8); internal conversations and emails regarding letter of credit renewal issues (0.4); meetings regarding new rounds of Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments on DIP order and emails regarding same (0.6); conversation with M. Goldstein regarding issues raised by DIP lenders (0.3).
McGreal MM	07/31/12	4.3	Teleconference with counsel to DIP Lenders, Unsecured Creditors' Committee and M. Huebner regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments (1.1); conference with M. Huebner regarding same (0.3); summarize the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to the DIP order (2.3); teleconference with Company and Blackstone regarding updates on DIP timing (0.3); send DIP documents to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.1); correspondence with counsel to noteholders regarding DIP (0.1); correspondence with counsel to surety providers regarding final surety and DIP order (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	07/31/12	1.6	Correspondence regarding Travelers LC (0.1); correspond with M. McGreal regarding Kenergy LC (0.1); review of relevant provisions in Second Out DIP and LC (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Kenergy LC (0.2); correspond with local counsels, A. Arnaldos and Weil regarding comments to local opinions (0.2); correspond with A. Libby regarding Agents for DIPs (0.1); review of drafts local counsel opinions (0.3); update post-closing checklist (0.2).
Resnick BM	07/31/12	0.3	Emails regarding various parties' objections to the DIP facility and surety motion.
Robertson C	07/31/12	1.3	Call with DIP lenders (1.1); follow-up call with DIP lenders (0.2).
Ruiz EL	07/31/12	0.5	Emails to DIP lenders regarding comments to first and second day orders.
Total FINANCING		383.4	
GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION			
Coco KJ	07/10/12	5.4	Emails, calls and coordinate preparation for first day hearing and service related to same.
de Richemont P	07/10/12	15.8	Review, revise and file first-day motions (1.4); prepare for and attend first-day hearing (14.4).
Dphrepaulezz JH	07/10/12	1.5	Prepare distribution for M. McGreal and E. Ruiz.
Eum JS	07/10/12	1.0	Assemble spiralastic copy of Jennings Negotiate and Adminster CSAs as per J. Alvarez.
Ferrell KL	07/10/12	1.2	Respond to inquiries relating to first day motions (1.0); conference with T. Matlock regarding Kodak NOL motion (0.2).
Hait S	07/10/12	0.8	Check first day hearing binders for accuracy.
Halford EB	07/10/12	0.5	Search LEXIS and the Bluebook for citation formatting information for tax court decisions (0.3); email response to the associate's citation formatting questions regarding tax opinion and pincite (0.2).
Huebner MS	07/10/12	0.8	Conversation with B. Resnick regarding hearing (0.3); respond to and route many incoming emails on various topics (0.5).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/10/12	2.7	Review Boston Generating first day transcript (1.1); assist in transport of case materials to the courthouse (1.6).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/10/12	15.8	Prepare for first day hearing, including binder review (3.2); coordinate on finalized DIP filings and binders for same (1.4); coordinate binders to U.S. Trustee and Chambers (0.7); review hearing materials (0.8); emails with proposed DIP counsel regarding first days (0.4); revise first day orders (0.7); communications with E. Gasparini regarding first day hearing (0.4); calls with clients regarding judge and first day hearing and coordination with team regarding same (0.6); research and analysis of precedent first days (0.6); discussions with team regarding motions to go forward (0.1); coordinate with Garden City Group regarding website update (0.1); coordinate regarding venue for organizational meeting (1.3); email G. Cunningham regarding "hotline" voice mailbox (0.1); review Kodak transcript (0.6); review first day orders to check conformity with Kodak and other J. Gropper precedents (0.3); emails with R. McWilliams regarding consignment and other questions (0.3); review order blacklines and coordinate on binders (0.9); pre-hearing discussions with Davis Polk team, clients and lender counsel (0.4); attend hearing, including capturing revisions in proposed orders and coordinating hearing materials (2.3); revise proposed orders and coordinate on submission to Chambers (0.3); emails with J. Martin regarding litigation defense (0.1); review documents related to same (0.1); update email to clients (0.1).
Krause SC	07/10/12	4.5	Team meeting (0.4); review case information website and Patriot site (0.3); preparation for first day hearing (3.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Law EC	07/10/12	8.5	Revise and circulate list of case numbers (0.2); coordinate and numerous communications with A. de Richemont, L. Doolittle, M. Levy, and J. Weinstein regarding logistics for attending first day hearing (0.6); assemble and update proposed orders on USB drive for hearing (0.7); numerous communications with E. Ruiz, A. Libby, and A. de Richemont regarding same (0.4); coordinate assembly and revisions to petitions and first day pleadings binders to be FedEx'ed to Judge Chapman (0.3); numerous communications with A. de Richemont, M. Melvin and T. Volano regarding same (0.3); revise setup of email routing listservs (0.1); communications with S. Jackman regarding same (0.1); assemble and update documents for first day hearing (1.1); setup prior to and assist during first day hearing (4.1); communications with D. Klein and R. Jones regarding ordering of transcript for first day hearing (0.3); review spreadsheet regarding state of incorporation (0.1); communications with M. Cormack regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	07/10/12	13.1	Prepare for first day hearing (8.6); coordinate service of first day orders and motion (0.9); coordinate service of notice of commencement and hearing and first day agenda (0.8); call with R. Meade and PNC regarding wages order issues (0.2); draft, edit and finalize notice of agenda and communications with D.Klein regarding same (1.2); draft, edit and finalize notice of commencement and hearing and communications with D. Klein regarding same (0.8); file revised exhibits to DIP motion (0.3); draft notice of hearing (0.3).
McGreal MM	07/10/12	13.2	General hearing preparation and preparation of binders (2.9); coordinate delivery of binders to U.S. Trustee and Court (0.5); meeting with D. Klein and E. Vonnegut regarding hearing prepare (0.6); coordinate filings with Chambers (1.3); teleconference calls with Company and Davis Polk team regarding first day hearing (1.9); review precedent Gropper orders (0.3); conferences with D. Schaible and D. Klein regarding revising orders and new Judge (1.1); revise proposed orders for change of judge (1.4); attend hearing (2.4); send update email and filed orders to client (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	07/10/12	6.5	Assist with preparation for first day hearing (2.2); prepare DIP financing binder for the Judge Chapman (2.5); update and copy check the first day pleadings binder for Judge Chapman's review (1.0); coordinate delivery of first day binders to Judge Chapman (0.3); post-hearing clean-up (0.3); route first day orders (0.2).
Moskowitz E	07/10/12	4.0	Prepare for first day hearings (0.6); attend first day hearings and follow-up (3.4).
Robertson C	07/10/12	0.8	Review revised orders to be submitted to Chambers (0.4); print and organize documents for first day hearing (0.4).
Ruiz EL	07/10/12	15.8	Prepare and review hearing binders (3.3); prepare and review reference materials for hearing (4.3); attend first day hearing and follow-up thereto (3.5); prepare for handout materials in-court (2.3); meet with first day team regarding hearing preparation and follow-up thereto (1.2); review of talking points (0.9); review of agenda (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/10/12	11.3	Emails regarding first day preparation (1.1); numerous teleconferences and coordinate and plan for first day hearing (2.6); first day hearing and coordinate and follow-up regarding same (3.7); review materials on first day hearing and review and revise motions (2.2); coordinate regarding hearing orders and order submission (1.7).
Taylor WL	07/10/12	0.4	Telephone calls and emails relating to the bankruptcy and the Rhino joint venture.
Tsiouris N	07/10/12	10.6	Edit first day motions (1.3); research regarding contract termination provisions (5.1); review and organize first day binders (4.2).
Volano T	07/10/12	4.1	Prepare transcript binders and hearing materials folders for DIP and NOLs documents (0.8); prepare first day pleadings binder (2.1); save and print orders that were entered on the docket (0.7); assist with packing materials for first day hearing (0.5).
Coco KJ	07/11/12	1.3	Emails with Davis Polk and Garden City Group regarding servce (1.1); review documents in connection with same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
de Richemont P	07/11/12	3.6	Review draft proposed orders (0.6); coordinate files management for proposed orders (0.3); coordinate production of materials for hearing (2.5); email and call with M. Cormack regarding filing procedures (0.2).
Dphrepaulezz JH	07/11/12	0.9	Prepare distribution for D. Toscano and G. Moody.
Hait S	07/11/12	3.3	Blackline and revise second day motions (2.5); meeting with E. Ruiz to discuss hotline (0.3); meeting with N. Tsouris to discuss second day motions (0.5).
Huber BM	07/11/12	0.4	Emails regarding Notice of Commencement to M. William's counterparties (0.3); discuss Notice of Commencement with O. Oshen (0.1).
Huebner MS	07/11/12	0.6	Conversation with D. Schaible regarding various workstreams (0.2); review and route many incoming emails from counterparties (0.2); review of emails regarding hearing and entry of orders (0.2).
Klein DS	07/11/12	5.5	Revise first day orders and coordinate court submission (0.5); meet with M. McGreal and others regarding second days and path forward (0.9); communications with B. Jones (0.2); draft list of near term tasks and coordinate with core team regarding same (1.1); review and revise numerous second days (1.4); coordinate with Garden City Group regarding service of first days (0.4); revise new agenda (0.4); discuss notice issues with E. Ruiz and follow-up regarding same (0.6).
Law EC	07/11/12	1.9	Communications with A. de Richemont and M. Melvin regarding preparations for 7/16/2012 hearing with Judge Chapman (0.2); update tasks list regarding same (0.2); numerous communications with M. Cormack and A. de Richemont regarding logistics of ECF filing, practice filing of adversary complaints to initiate adversary proceedings, state of incorporation spreadsheet and notice requirement in adversary proceedings (0.8); circulate hearing transcript (0.1); circulate list of case numbers and debtors (0.1); communications with M. Melvin and T. Volano regarding dockets for affiliated debtors not already added to list of jointly administered cases list (0.3); review billing memo (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	07/11/12	7.6	Coordinate service of first day motions; coordinate service of agendas and hearing notices (3.1); draft, file and serve notice of agenda (0.4); draft patriot workstreams chart for circulation to client (1.3); draft internal Patriot workstreams chart (1.7); review and revise various second days for global changes (1.1).
McGreal MM	07/11/12	6.8	Coordinate revised filings with Chambers (0.7); send update emails to clients and Davis Polk team (0.4); revise orders (0.6); conference with D. Klein regarding revised NOL order (0.3); review AlixPartners workplan (.8); teleconference regarding AlixPartners workplan (1.3); conferences with D. Schaible and A. Libby regarding workstreams list (0.6); revise workstreams list (0.7); meeting with D. Klein and E. Ruiz regarding second day motions (0.9); teleconference with J. Jones and R. Mead regarding entry of orders (0.5).
Melvin MM	07/11/12	3.1	Route incoming pleadings (0.4); gather Notices of Appearance in order to send a "welcome" package (0.4); communication with A. de Richemont regarding preparation for the June 16th hearing (0.3); communication with E. Ruiz regarding reviewing the docket to be sure all Debtor cases have the Joint Administration order entered and have been linked to the main case (0.1); review Local Rules for motion practice (0.6); review Debtors case dockets to be sure each lists a Joint Administration order and association with the main case (1.0); coordinate the duplication of entered orders to prepare binders of same (0.3).
Moody, Jr. GM	07/11/12	0.1	Call with D. Toscano regarding case management.
Oshen O	07/11/12	0.5	Email E. Ruiz regarding Notice of Commencement (0.1); discussions with E. Ruiz regarding Notice of Commencement (0.2); review docket (0.2).
Ruiz EL	07/11/12	4.8	Prepare orders to submit to Chambers (0.1); review and revise notice of hearing (0.2); meeting with N. Tsiouris, A. Libby and S. Hait regarding second day motions and follow-up thereto (0.7); meeting with D. Klein, M. McGreal and N. Tsiouris regarding next steps (1.0); call with O. Oshen regarding notice of commencement (0.2); review and revise notice of commencement (0.3); prepare for hearing (2.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/11/12	4.8	Conference call with client regarding case next steps (0.5); conference call on case planning issues (0.8); review and revise agendas and workstreams (1.2); review and revise utilities motion (0.6); coordinate regarding first day hearing (0.4) review workstreams issues (0.6); teleconference with M. Huebner regarding case issues (0.2); review and revise second day motions and teleconferences and emails regarding same (0.5).
Taylor WL	07/11/12	0.2	Telephone calls and emails relating to the bankruptcy.
Volano T	07/11/12	1.5	Review dockets for Patriot debtor entities to verify that joint administration order has been entered (1.2); communications with M. Melvin regarding projects for second day hearing (0.3).
Coco KJ	07/12/12	1.2	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding hearing preparation and coordinate same.
de Richemont P	07/12/12	3.9	Coordinate personnel and logistics for hearing (1.4); prepare hearing materials (1.7); prepare interim orders for submission to Chambers (0.8).
Eum JS	07/12/12	1.0	Research FedEx delivery confirmation as per J. Alvarez.
Hait S	07/12/12	4.2	Revise and turn comments to second day motions (1.6); meeting with A. Libby regarding drafting notices (0.3); blackline entered orders (2.0); meeting with A. Libby regarding filing (0.3).
Huber BM	07/12/12	1.1	Participate in weekly status call.
Klein DS	07/12/12	3.8	Update call with clients and follow-up on related issues (0.6); review and revise first day motions to reflect J. Gropper comments (0.4); coordinate with A. Libby regarding case calendar (0.2); coordinate with B. Jones regarding hearing transcript (0.1); coordinate with E. Ruiz regarding initial debtor interview information (0.3); coordinate on fax and service issues (0.3); coordinate on hearing scheduling and notices (0.3); review and comment on proposed orders (1.1); review client question list related to same (0.2); review first day hearing transcript (0.6).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Law EC	07/12/12	3.7	Resolve issues regarding misdirected proof of claim fax/faxline (0.4); communications with D. Klein and M. Melvin regarding same (0.4); numerous communications with A. de Richemont, M. Melvin and T. Volano regarding preparations for 7/16/2012 hearing and various other logistical matters (0.8); coordinate assembly of petitions with original signature pages (0.4); communications with A. de Richemont and E. Borden regarding same (0.5); respond to inquiry regarding first day affidavit (0.4); communications with P. Arsenec regarding forwarding of outside inquiries (0.2); communications with B. Resnick and R. Jones regarding hearing transcripts (0.4); communications with M. McGreal and S. Krause regarding daily summary of filings (0.2).
Libby A	07/12/12	4.8	Revise various second day motions for global changes (0.6); revise creditor matrix notice of commencement and email same to E. Ruiz and O. Oshen (0.4); coordinate service of first days (2.4); draft notice of hearing (1.1); calendar hearing dates (0.3).
McGreal MM	07/12/12	1.7	Weekly update call (0.9); call with AlixPartners over termination of purchase order (0.2); call with AlixPartners and D. Klein regarding same (0.2); call to Chambers regarding proposed orders (0.1); search for precedents for notice of entry of interim DIP order (0.2); email E. Vonnegut regarding same (0.1).
Melvin MM	07/12/12	3.8	Obtain docket updates (0.3); prepare a hearing binder for the July 16th hearing (1.0); coordinate duplication of same (0.3); prepare binders of entered orders (1.1); index same (0.3); update orders binders (0.4); update index (0.1); route pleadings (0.3).
Oshen O	07/12/12	0.2	Review emails regarding prepetition claims (0.1); review case docket (0.1).
Resnick BM	07/12/12	0.5	Participate in semi-weekly update call.
Ruiz EL	07/12/12	1.3	Meeting with A. de Richemont regarding preparation for hearing and follow up thereto (0.3); preparation of proposed orders for hearing (0.4); meeting with D. Klein regarding the same and follow-up thereto (0.2); review of notice of hearing (0.3); meeting with A. Libby regarding the same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/12/12	2.5	Work on second day motions (0.8); client update call and follow-up (1.0); emails regarding motions and review transcript (0.7).
Taylor WL	07/12/12	1.0	Attend status call.
Volano T	07/12/12	1.3	Organize and label hearing materials.
de Richemont P	07/13/12	5.7	Review, revise and file amended hearing agenda (0.7); prepare and dispatch binders for Chambers and U.S. Trustee (1.8); prepare material for hearing (2.6); coordinate hearing logistics and personnel (0.6).
Dunleavy KM	07/13/12	2.0	Begin revising document and coordinate job with word processing.
Hait S	07/13/12	2.0	Mark first day transcript and identify motions to be heard on 7/16 (1.0); turn comments to notice of hearing of Massey motion (0.6); meeting with A. Libby and M. McGreal regarding voice mail box and proof of claim tasks (0.4).
Huebner MS	07/13/12	3.1	Call with General Counsel regarding numerous topics (0.8); emails and calls with D. Schaible, B. Resnick, general counsel regarding Monday's hearing (0.8); partial review of materials in preparation for Monday's hearing (1.5).
Klein DS	07/13/12	1.1	Coordinate on service of first day and other issues (0.2); review all proposed orders and email to A. Alfonso (0.7); coordinate finalization of Massey motion (0.2).
Kogan O	07/13/12	0.6	Call with M. McGreal regarding judge research (0.2); review of cases (0.4).
Krause SC	07/13/12	0.3	Emails regarding conflicts process and case administration.
Law EC	07/13/12	2.3	Resolve issues regarding email routing lists (0.3); communications with A. de Richemont regarding same (0.2); follow up with M. McGreal regarding daily summaries of filings (0.1); review dockets and hearing calendar of Judge Chapman for 7/16/2012 hearing (0.8); coordinate logistics for 7/16/2012 hearing (0.6); communications with A. de Richemont and A. Isaac-Lowry regarding same (0.3).
Libby A	07/13/12	1.9	Coordinate service of various first and second days (1.5); draft internal calendar and emails with M. McGreal and D. Klein regarding same (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	07/13/12	2.1	Review and comment on revised agenda for hearing (0.2); conference with O. Kogan regarding research on Judge Chapman (0.3); correspondence with Chambers regarding revised agenda, blackberry passes and proposed orders (0.2); coordinate delivery of hearing preparation materials to M. Huebner (0.1); conference with D. Klein regarding hearing preparation (0.4); call with T. Stenger regarding update calls (0.1); commenting on second day motions and orders (0.2); correspondence with G. Moody regarding filing under seal (0.3); conference with A. Libby and S. Hait regarding proofs of claim, service, routing and telephone hotline (0.3).
Melvin MM	07/13/12	2.5	Obtain docket updates (0.3); route pleadings (0.4); update multiple copies of the July 16th hearing binder (1.2); communication with A. de Richemont regarding same (0.1); update the proposed orders hearing binders and label same (0.3); communications with E. Ruiz regarding same (0.1); communications with C. Robertson regarding original signature pages for the file (0.1).
Narayan GS	07/13/12	0.7	Prepare distribution for G. Moody.
Ruiz EL	07/13/12	4.7	Emails regarding initial debtor interview with D. Klein and M. McGreal (0.3); review of first day transcript (0.6); coordinate preparation for 7/16 hearing (2.7); review of binders for U.S. Trustee (0.4); review of binders for Chambers (0.4); review of notice of hearing (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/13/12	1.0	Emails regarding first days (0.5); emails regarding update calls (0.5).
Tsiouris N	07/13/12	0.8	General updates to second day proposed orders.
Volano T	07/13/12	1.1	Prepare hearing materials for Patriot first day hearing transcript (0.3); prepare labels for clean and blacklined orders (0.2); print latest version of vendor matrix, file in hearing materials folder (0.6).
Schaible DS	07/14/12	0.3	Emails and coordinate regarding hearing preparation.
de Richemont P	07/15/12	0.1	Email regarding hearing preparation.
Huebner MS	07/15/12	2.6	Review and reply to miscellaneous Patriot emails (0.3); review of materials in preparation for initial hearing with Judge Chapman and commencing to sketch out oral presentation (2.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Knight CG	07/15/12	7.3	Prepare distribution for M. McGreal (0.7); prepare distribution for B. Resnick (1.0); prepare distribution for S. Krause (0.2); prepare distribution for B. Resnick (0.7); prepare distribution for E. Ruiz (4.7).
Kogan O	07/15/12	3.1	Review cases previously decided by Judge Chapman (2.6); summarize same (0.4); email to C. Robertson and M. McGreal regarding same (0.1).
Martin RL	07/15/12	0.3	Coordinate conference room and guest passes for M. Schroeder and J. Bean (0.3)
Schaible DS	07/15/12	0.3	Emails regarding first day preparation.
de Richemont P	07/16/12	2.9	Prepare and deliver materials to hearing.
Hait S	07/16/12	2.3	Correspondence with Garden City Group and A. Libby regarding Garden City Group listservs (0.2); correspondence with A. Libby regarding filing claims (0.4); update second day motion scrub list and scrub second day motions (0.8); draft and file notice of omnibus hearings (0.4); review case voice mail box guidelines with E. Ruiz and return phone call (0.5).
Huebner MS	07/16/12	6.1	Complete review of source materials for initial presentation to court (1.8); draft oral presentation to Judge Chapman (1.7); attend continued first day hearing and present to court (1.5); conversations with counsel for various parties after hearing (0.3); meet with general counsel regarding multiple topics and next steps (0.5); conversation with F. Huffard regarding Chief Restructuring Officer issues (0.3).
Klein DS	07/16/12	9.5	Prepare hearing materials (3.6); meet with M. Schroeder and J. Bean regarding hearing issues and other assorted near term items (0.3); pre-hearing discussions with numerous parties in interest and clients (0.4) attend hearing (1.8); revise proposed orders (0.4); email hearing update to clients (0.4); coordinate with M. McGreal on proposed orders and revisions to same (0.4); coordinate on notice of appearance welcome packages (0.2); emails with AlixPartners regarding initial debtor interview and review information request related to same (0.4); review and revise numerous second day motions (0.9); review and comment on case timeling and workstream chart (0.2); comment on case calendar and summary of hearings (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	07/16/12	0.3	Emails regarding conflicts process and case administration.
Law EC	07/16/12	3.9	Communications with S. Hait regarding removal of email from service list (0.2); revise setup of email routing listservs (0.2); setup prior to and assist during 7/16/2012 hearing (2.8); communications with M. McGreal and A. de Richemont regarding "blackberry order" (0.1); review communications with D. Klein and R. Jones regarding ordering of transcript for 7/16/2012 hearing (0.1); circulate revised proposed orders post-hearing (0.1); update files and organize materials post-hearing (0.4).
Libby A	07/16/12	6.0	Emails with M. McGreal regarding hearing preparation (0.1); communications with S. Hait regarding notice (0.2); emails with Garden City Group regarding notice procedures under Case Management Order (0.3); communications with Garden City Group regarding notice (0.4); coordinate service of first day orders (1.2); review Patriot workstreams list and provide comments on same (1.0); emails to S. Hait regarding notice of omnibus hearing (0.2); draft internal workstreams calendar and email same to D. Klein and M. McGreal (2.6).
Martin RL	07/16/12	0.5	Coordinate signing of signature pages for retention applications by M. Schroeder.
McGreal MM	07/16/12	6.1	Attend second first day hearing (2.1); review and prepare hearing binders and various documents needed for hearing (1.1); conference with D. Klein regarding hearing preparation (0.2); coordinate proposed orders with Chambers (1.1); review and comment on bullet points on case administration for update call (0.9); teleconference with E. Ruiz regarding same (0.1); review Alix workplan (0.3); conference with D. Klein regarding second day motions (0.3).
Melvin MM	07/16/12	3.0	Obtain docket updates (0.3); route incoming pleadings (0.2); save all notices of appearance filed to date to the system (1.0); communication with A. de Richemont regarding same (0.1); route incoming pleadings (0.8); review incoming mail and distribute (0.5) integrate original signature pages into the main file (0.1).
Oshen O	07/16/12	0.3	Review emails regarding case (0.2); review case docket (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Ruiz EL	07/16/12	6.2	Prepare for hearing (1.5); attend hearing and follow-up thereto (2.7); review of second day conformity list (0.5); review and revise proposed orders and blacklines for Chambers (0.6); draft talking points for J. Jones (0.9).
Schaible DS	07/16/12	5.1	Emails and preparation for first day hearing (1.2); prepare for hearing (1.2); conduct hearing and follow-up afterwards (2.7).
Beshar SE	07/17/12	0.3	Communications with senior management at company.
de Richemont P	07/17/12	0.5	Review and revise outgoing notice of appearance welcome email (0.4); email about same (0.1).
Eum JS	07/17/12	2.8	Review and update Vitol Master Agreement blackline as per J. Alvarez and D. Toscano.
Huebner MS	07/17/12	3.0	All hands workstreams call (1.0); route many incoming letters, voicemails and emails (0.9); several calls with general counsel regarding multiple topics and workstreams (1.1).
Klein DS	07/17/12	5.9	Prepare for and participate in update call with clients (0.8); participate in Schedules and Statements of Fincial Affairs kickoff call with clients (1.6); finalize and file top creditor list (0.4); emails with E. Gasparini regarding case website and coordinate with Garden City Group regarding same (0.3); call with C. Blacker regarding initial debtor interview (0.2); comment on case calendar (1.1); coordinate on publication notice (0.4); coordinate on working group list (0.3); revise all second days and email to DIP lenders and E. Gasparini (0.8).
Krause SC	07/17/12	0.2	Update case information charts.
Law EC	07/17/12	0.3	Review communications regarding 7/16/2012 hearing transcript (0.1); update email list regarding daily summaries (0.1); follow-up with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	07/17/12	3.6	Emails with Garden City Group regarding service of first and second day motions (0.4); meet with D. Klein regarding comments to case calendar and calendar invites (0.3); revise case calendar to include DIP deadlines and D. Klein comments (2.3); email same to M. McGreal and D. Klein (0.1); emails with A. de Richemont regarding notice procedures (0.1); emails with M. McGreal regarding scheduling wages call (0.2); emails with C. Robertson and E. Vonnegut regarding service of DIP related documents (0.2).
McGreal MM	07/17/12	3.5	All-hands update call (0.7); review and comment on welcome service email draft (0.2); email clients entered orders (0.1); review and comment on case calendar (0.9); correspondence with D. Klein and A. Libby regarding same (0.1); review and comment on welcome service draft email (0.2); review and comment on July 9 Board minutes (0.6); correspondence with C. Robertson regarding review of Chapman cases (0.1); conferences with D. Klein and E. Ruiz regarding second day motions (0.6).
Melvin MM	07/17/12	3.1	Route incoming pleadings (0.3); send a "welcome" package to all those that filed or mailed in a notice of appearance (2.5); review and integrate incoming mail into the main file (0.3).
Resnick BM	07/17/12	0.7	Participate in semi-weekly update call.
Robertson C	07/17/12	0.9	File notice of filing of redacted fee letters (0.3); discuss service of process requirements regarding same with E. Vonnegut, A. Libby and D. Klein (0.2); review case management order regarding service of process inquiry (0.2); coordinate with Garden City Group to serve said notice on the appropriate parties (0.2).
Satter KM	07/17/12	2.2	Review emails and activity regarding status of the case (0.6); review docket and filed motions (1.6).
Schaible DS	07/17/12	1.7	Weekly update call (0.7); emails and review regarding second day motions (1.0).
Eum JS	07/18/12	2.5	Review and update Vitol Master Agreement blackline as per J. Alvarez and D. Toscano.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/18/12	2.1	Call with J. Creighton regarding Schedules (0.3); coordinate on calendar and updates regarding same (0.3); coordinate on §341 meeting and other service issues with E. Ruiz (0.4); review hearing transcript (0.7); coordinate with DIP lenders regarding second day comments (0.4).
Law EC	07/18/12	1.3	Communications with R. Jones regarding ordering of hearing transcript regarding same (0.3); route pleadings (0.2); communications with D. Klein regarding correction for final hearing date listed on docket text for interim order (0.2); communications with M. Melvin regarding various case administration matters and hearing transcripts (0.4); review billing memo (0.2).
Law EC	07/18/12	1.5	Obtain additional precedents regarding claims settlement, reclamation claims, ordinary course professionals (1.3); communications with A. Libby regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	07/18/12	2.0	Review M. McGreal mark-ups to calendar (0.3); send invites for calendar dates through January (0.8); emails with Garden City Group regarding notice of commencement process (0.4); review and revise presentation slide of interim first day order summaries (0.5).
McGreal MM	07/18/12	0.9	Correspondence with C. Robertson and E. Law regarding research Chapman cases (0.2); correspondence with Chambers regarding second day motions (0.1); teleconference with J. Jones regarding email updates; review U.S. Trustee's comments to second day motions (0.2); conference with D. Schaible regarding U.S. Trustee's comments to second day motions (0.4).
Melvin MM	07/18/12	1.2	Obtain docket updates (0.4); route incoming pleadings (0.3); send a "welcome" package to those that filed a Notice of Appearance (0.5).
Narayan GS	07/18/12	3.0	Prepare distribution for E. Ruiz.
Robertson C	07/18/12	0.8	Review summaries of prior cases prepared by O. Kogan.
Schaible DS	07/18/12	2.5	Weekly update call and follow-up (0.7); meeting regarding case issues and next steps and coordinate regarding same (0.9); emails and coordinate regarding second day motion comments (0.9).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Beshar SE	07/19/12	0.8	Calls with M. Huebner, A. Dean, CEO and Garden City Group at Company.
de Richemont P	07/19/12	0.4	Email regarding case calendar updating and filing procedures.
Hait S	07/19/12	2.8	Finalize and file second day motions (1.8); update working group list (1.0).
Huber BM	07/19/12	4.4	Participate on biweekly all hands status call (0.2); consider approach to Statements of Financial Affairs and Schedules (3.1); telephone conference with AlixPartners, Garden City Group and D. McAllister of Patriot regarding Statements of Financial Affairs and Schedules approach (1.1).
Huebner MS	07/19/12	3.5	Conversations with counsel for 2 counterparties regarding coal purchase issues (0.9); review and markup of new draft of assumption documentation and conversations with A. Starr (1.0); emails with clients regarding override agreements (0.2); conversations with U.S. Trustee regarding various matters (0.1); several conversations with general counsel regarding various pending issues (0.9); Thursday workstreams call (0.4).
Klein DS	07/19/12	1.9	Update call with clients and follow-up on near term tasks (0.5); call with J. Creighton regarding schedules (0.2); call with DIP Lender counsel regarding comments on all second days and revise same (0.5); comment on working group list (0.4); finalize second days (0.3).
Law EC	07/19/12	5.4	Draft index of first day orders minibooks (1.2); assemble draft originals regarding same (0.7); numerous communications with E. Ruiz regarding same (0.3); obtain precedents of dockets (0.9); communications with J. Foust regarding same (0.2); revise listservs (0.2); communications with S. Krause regarding same (0.1); route pleadings (0.5); numerous communications with D. Klein, S. Krause, A. Libby and E. Ruiz regarding same (0.4); further research regarding transfer of venue (0.7); follow-up regarding ordering of transcript (0.1); communications with E. Ruiz regarding ECF log-in and passwords (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	07/19/12	4.0	Meet with C. Robertson and S. Hait regarding filing process for retention applications (0.3); draft and edit calendar; emails with A. Arnaldos regarding DIP reporting requirements (0.3); review working group list (0.3); emails with Garden City Group regarding notice parties (0.2); file various second day motions (0.7); blackline various first days to review for changes made by Chambers (0.9); meet with retention team to discuss filing preparation process (0.4); review D. Klein comments to working group list for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2); discuss same with S. Hait (0.2); review and revise working group list (0.3); email professionals regarding updates to working group list (0.1); email S. Mell regarding critical vendor report deadline (0.1).
Oshen O	07/19/12	0.1	Review docket.
Resnick BM	07/19/12	0.4	Semiweekly update call (0.3); call with J. Conte (0.1).
Robertson C	07/19/12	2.3	Coordinate filing of documents.
Ruiz EL	07/19/12	0.4	Coordinate filing of second day motions.
Satter KM	07/19/12	3.0	Find and review precedent from Pinnacle bankruptcy regarding contract rejection order (0.4); run blacklines of same and the draft Patriot rejection order (0.2); draft proposed Patriot rejection order and speaking with E. Ruiz regarding same (2.4).
Schaible DS	07/19/12	2.3	Teleconferences with U.S. Trustee regarding second days and follow-up (0.5); weekly call to coordinate next steps (1.2); conference call on second day issues with agents (0.6).
Dphrepaulezz JH	07/20/12	0.3	Prepare distribution for S. Kaushal.
Hait S	07/20/12	5.7	Draft and blackline proposed final orders (3.5); update working group list (0.4); compile rejected contracts for unsecured creditors committee (0.9); save claims and utility requests for adequate assurance (and update respective charts) (0.7).
Huebner MS	07/20/12	1.2	Call with T. Mayer regarding multiple issues (0.5); conversations with CEO and General Counsel regarding multiple issues (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/20/12	1.3	Call with J. Creighton regarding Schedules (0.3); coordinate with C. Blacker on initial Debtor interview information (0.2); coordinate with C. Zhu regarding seal motion (0.3); emails with Garden City Group regarding service (0.1); coordinate with clients and data providers regarding newspaper publication (0.4).
Krause SC	07/20/12	0.4	Emails regarding various filings with company and U.S. Trustee.
Libby A	07/20/12	2.3	Calls with Garden City Group regarding preparation of creditor matrix (0.3); update working group list for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and emails with professionals regarding same (0.2); review draft working group list for Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.4); emails with Garden City Group regarding publication of notice of commencement quotes (0.1); update case calendar (0.3), emails with A. Arnaldos regarding DIP deadlines in connection with same (0.2); emails with S. Mell and others regarding same (0.2); review calendar for workstreams (0.6).
Melvin MM	07/20/12	2.3	Obtain docket updates (0.3); route incoming pleadings (0.3); review incoming mail and distribute (0.1); prepare and send a "welcome" package to those that filed a notice of appearance (1.6).
Narayan GS	07/20/12	0.8	Prepare distribution for S. Kaushal.
Ruiz EL	07/20/12	0.8	Review of filed documents (0.2); meeting with D. Klein regarding workstreams (0.6);
Schaible DS	07/20/12	1.4	Emails regarding case management hearing and filing issues (0.6); telephone conferences and follow-up with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding secondary motions (0.8).
Beshar SE	07/21/12	0.8	Emails with company and team regarding cash flow statements and private bank presentation.
McClammy JI	07/21/12	0.7	Review and comment regarding lender presentation (0.4); emails regarding lender presentation (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/21/12	0.3	Emails regarding update call.
Glazer E	07/22/12	0.3	Emails with P. Mishkin and J. Martin regarding document retention notice.
Libby A	07/22/12	0.9	Review and update case calendar and prepare calendar invites (0.7); emails with E. Ruiz regarding Monday tasks (0.2).
Resnick BM	07/22/12	0.1	Review updated work plan from AlixPartners.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/22/12	1.0	Emails regarding hearing issues and coordinate (0.6); staffing emails (0.4).
Eum JS	07/23/12	2.5	Compile STB Agreements for STB Override binder as per B. Zhu.
Glazer E	07/23/12	0.7	Draft document retention notice.
Hait S	07/23/12	4.1	Draft and blackline proposed final orders (2.5); save and organize claims and other miscellaneous mail (0.8); file motion (0.8).
Hoeben W	07/23/12	3.0	Draft rider for intralinks and revise following comments.
Huebner MS	07/23/12	2.1	Several conversations with General Counsel regarding multiple inquires and issues (1.2); triaging miscellaneous income queries and demands (0.4); internal conversations regarding additional hearing dates (0.1); conversation with F. Huffard regarding multiple issues (0.4).
Klein DS	07/23/12	1.8	Client update call and follow-up on agenda items (0.5); calls with Chambers regarding upcoming relief (0.3); coordinate on data issues regarding Schedules (0.4); coordinate on publication notice for §341 meeting (0.3); coordinate on signature packets for original pleadings (0.3).
Law EC	07/23/12	1.1	Communications with D. Klein, E. Ruiz and K. Satter regarding processing of original signature pages to petitions and resolutions (0.3); update files regarding same (0.2); numerous communications with M. Melvin regarding revisions to time entries and precedent research regarding transfer of venue (0.4); communications with J. Foust and J. Eum regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	07/23/12	1.2	Draft email to professionals regarding filing joinders (0.3); draft cover letter regarding same (0.8); review emails regarding timing of certificates and financials (0.1).
Melvin MM	07/23/12	0.5	Obtain docket updates (0.3); route incoming pleadings (0.2).
Resnick BM	07/23/12	0.3	Meet with M. Huebner and D. Schaible regarding various Patriot workstreams.
Ruiz EL	07/23/12	2.6	Review and revision of final orders (1.9); review and revision of email to venue joinders (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Satter KM	07/23/12	4.0	Review of talking points and motions and comparison with company's summary (1.9); review of §341 articles to be published in various newspapers (1.8); various emails (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/23/12	0.6	Emails regarding joinder issues.
Taylor WL	07/23/12	0.4	Emails (0.2); telephone calls regarding case management (0.2).
Eum JS	07/24/12	5.2	Update emails related to venue transfer for Patriot and factual research for objection to venue transfer binder as per J. Foust (1.8); catalog and compile Tampa agreements for Tampa Overrides binder as per B. Zhu (1.7); catalog and compile RoyaltyCo agreements for RoyaltyCo overrides binder as per B. Zhu (1.7).
Hait S	07/24/12	2.8	Revise proposed final orders.
Huebner MS	07/24/12	1.8	Meeting with senior management regarding multiple topics (0.8); emails regarding Brown Rudnick comments on pending motions (0.1); conversation with C. Ebetino regarding various issues (0.5); conversation with J. Bean regarding multiple matters (0.4).
Klein DS	07/24/12	0.8	Call with Chambers regarding hearing dates and follow-up with M. Huebner and others regarding same (0.3); emails regarding global notes for Schedules (0.3); email S. Mell regarding monthly operating report (0.2).
Law EC	07/24/12	0.4	Communications with K. Satter regarding processing of original signature pages to petitions and resolutions (0.1); communications with M. Melvin and T. Volano regarding coordination and logistics for upcoming hearings (0.3).
Libby A	07/24/12	0.4	Update case calendar (0.3); emails with D. Klein and E. Ruiz regarding objection deadline to rejection procedures motions and utilities (0.1).
Melvin MM	07/24/12	0.3	Obtain docket updates (0.2); send a "welcome" package to those filed a Notice of Appearance (0.1).
Oshen O	07/24/12	0.1	Review docket.
Robertson C	07/24/12	0.1	Discuss filing of retention applications with S. Hait.
Ruiz EL	07/24/12	0.4	Review of converted interim orders.
Satter KM	07/24/12	0.5	Gather pleadings for M. Huebner's signature and obtain signatures.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/24/12	2.5	Conference call regarding first day motion comments and next steps follow-up (1.5); coordinate hearing schedule (1.0).
Glazer E	07/25/12	0.9	Revise document retention notice and emails with J. Martin regarding same.
Hoeben W	07/25/12	1.5	Call with J. Tucker (0.3), call with M. Krasnicki (0.2); research large accelerated filer (0.5); research disclosure rejected agreements (0.5).
Huebner MS	07/25/12	2.7	Call with J. Bean regarding many topics (0.8); conversation with C. Ebetino regarding creditor questions (0.3); emails with Bondholder counsel regarding multiple topics (0.2); call with counsel for US Bank regarding multiple topics (0.4); calls and emails with CEO, general counsel regarding workstreams (0.6); review and route approximately 15 incoming letters, demands, voicemail from counterparties (0.4).
Klein DS	07/25/12	1.8	Meet with D. Schaible to review numerous near term tasks and issues (0.4); update call with clients and follow-up regarding same (0.4); call with Chambers regarding hearing dates (0.1); follow-up with M. Huebner and others regarding same (0.3); emails with V. Abriano regarding operating report (0.2); call with B. Resnick regarding key workstream chart and revise same (0.4).
Law EC	07/25/12	0.1	Route pleading.
Libby A	07/25/12	2.5	File notice of rescheduling of hearing (0.3); research precedents in response to various U.S. Attorney Office requests (1.1); revise various first and second days to reflect final hearing (0.3); file and serve notice of adjournment of venue motion (0.3); prepare and file notice of no objection (0.2).
Melvin MM	07/25/12	1.1	Obtain docket updates (0.3); save incoming pleadings to the system and route (0.4); integrate original pleadings into the main file (0.1); send a "welcome" package to those that filed a notice of appearance (0.3).
Narayan GS	07/25/12	2.5	Prepare distribution for E. Ruiz.
Resnick BM	07/25/12	0.3	Emails with various constituents regarding potential objections, extension of deadlines and staffing issues.
Ruiz EL	07/25/12	0.9	Research regarding U.S. Trustee comments (0.6); calls with A. Libby regarding the same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/25/12	3.8	Emails and telephone calls and coordinate regarding first day order objections (2.3); telephone calls and coordinate regarding venue issues and hearing issues (1.1); emails regarding second day orders (0.4).
Warner W	07/25/12	1.8	Review emails and files regarding initial date of engagement for document retention and email regarding same (0.9); conference(s) with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5); review and comment on opinion (0.4).
Glazer E	07/26/12	0.7	Revise document retention notice and emails with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5); calls with E. Ruiz and with A. Libby regarding document retention notice issues (0.2).
Huebner MS	07/26/12	2.6	Bi-weekly client update call (1.3); conversation with CEO regarding multiple matters (0.5); conversations with J. Beam regarding multiple matters (0.5); routing and review of multiple incoming letters and requests from counterparties (0.3).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/26/12	0.9	Revise master parties in interest list.
Klein DS	07/26/12	2.5	Update call with clients and follow-up and agenda items (1.1); call with D. Schaible on objections and numerous other near term tasks and follow-up regarding same (0.4); finalize notice of adjournment and hearing cancelation and coordinate with A. Libby regarding filing (0.5); email Chambers regarding utilities proposed order (0.2); coordinate with J. Creighton regarding Schedules (0.2); email A. Libby regarding §341 meeting notice (0.1).
Law EC	07/26/12	0.2	Communications with M. Melvin regarding precedent research on omnibus replies.
Libby A	07/26/12	1.8	Compile list of open questions for company (0.4); emails and calls with Garden City Group regarding service of 341 notice (0.3); prepare and gather signature pages for records (0.8); save word versions of EDF and Vitol stipulations to appropriate directory (0.1); prepare and gather signature pages regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	07/26/12	4.5	Obtain docket updates (0.5); save incoming pleadings to the system (0.4); route incoming pleadings (0.7); forward objections entered on the docket today to E. Ruiz and S. Hait (0.2); download, print and organize objections to second day pleadings and corresponding motions for S. Krause (0.5); communication with S. Krause regarding same (0.1); integrate originals into the main file (0.6); send a "welcome" package to those that filed a Notice of Appearance (0.4); review various dockets to locate a precedent and non-specific omnibus reply for J. Foust and S. Hait (1.0); forward same to J. Foust and S. Hait (0.1).
Moskowitz E	07/26/12	0.3	Correspondence with clients regarding case management issues.
Resnick BM	07/26/12	0.9	Participate in semiweekly update call.
Ruiz EL	07/26/12	0.7	Review and revise the prepetition payment chart (0.5); meetings with D. Klein regarding the same (0.2).
Satter KM	07/26/12	1.2	Coordinate with assistants to add various people to working group list (0.3); blackline and review utilities motion (0.3); miscellaneous emails (0.4); review and route various docket submissions (0.2).
Schaible DS	07/26/12	3.7	Telephone call regarding second days (0.5); weekly update call (0.5); numerous telephone calls and coordinate regarding second day and first day objections (1.9); emails regarding hearing issues (0.3); emails regarding second day orders issues (0.5).
Hait S	07/27/12	6.2	Research Single Asset Real Estate cases for D. Klein (5.4); save and organize reclamation claims (0.8).
Huebner MS	07/27/12	2.0	Conference call with K. Hiltz and F. Huffard regarding calendar and organizational issues (1.0); review and reply to numerous emails on numerous topics (0.6); emails regarding first day orders (0.4).
Klein DS	07/27/12	0.8	Call with Chambers regarding hearing (0.1); coordinate on binders of proposed orders for U.S. Trustee (0.5); call with J. Jones regarding Schedules issues (0.2).
Law EC	07/27/12	0.9	Assemble S.D.N.Y. docket precedents (0.7); communications with J. Foust regarding same (0.1); review communications regarding Bankr. S.D.N.Y. local rules (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	07/27/12	2.6	Draft email to C. Blacker at Alix regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee outstanding questions for company (0.8); review response to same (0.2); draft agenda for the August 2nd hearing (0.6); compile list of adjourned matters and related docket entries (0.6); emails with R. Esacio and L. Samet regarding court procedures and Case Management Order (0.2); emails with D. Klein regarding critical vendors deadlines (0.2).
Melvin MM	07/27/12	3.3	Download blacklines and assemble binders of draft proposed order blacklines, one for delivery to the E. Gasparini at the Office of the U.S. Trustee (1.5); several updates to binders (1.2); index same (0.3); updates to index (0.3).
Melvin MM	07/27/12	0.9	Obtain docket updates (0.3); route incoming pleadings (0.5); integrate original pleadings into the main file (0.1).
Ruiz EL	07/27/12	4.4	Final review and revise first and second day proposed orders for U.S. Trustee (3.1); coordinate preparation of blackline binder for U.S. Trustee (0.9); review and revise case calendar (0.4).
Schaible DS	07/27/12	4.4	Emails and review materials regarding second day motions and comments and objections (1.5); review materials and emails regarding Department of Justice issues (1.2); review U.S. Department of Justice order markups and teleconferences and emails regarding same (1.7).
Huebner MS	07/28/12	1.6	Review and reply to several dozen Patriot emails on multiple topics including upcoming hearing, objections and resolutions, DIP and Unsecured Creditors' Committee.
Klein DS	07/28/12	4.7	Draft call agenda for client update call and circulate internally (0.5); review comments on all first and second day orders and revise same (3.1); coordinate internally and with clients regarding objections and comments to same (1.1).
Libby A	07/28/12	1.1	Review precedent agenda letters (0.6); draft agenda letter for August 2nd hearing (0.5).
Resnick BM	07/28/12	0.1	Emails regarding update call agenda.
Schaible DS	07/28/12	1.7	Emails regarding update call key list (0.6); emails regarding second day motion comments and review drafts (1.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	07/29/12	1.0	Review and markup of client workstreams list and call with D. Klein and emails re same (0.3); review and routing multiple incoming inquiries and demands (0.7).
Klein DS	07/29/12	0.4	Revise call agenda and email to S. Mell.
Law EC	07/29/12	0.1	Review communications regarding preparations and logistics for 8/2/2012 hearing.
Libby A	07/29/12	0.6	Emails with D. Klein regarding matters going forward on August 2nd and adjourned matters.
Schaible DS	07/29/12	1.6	Emails regarding second day issues and coordinate and review orders.
Huebner MS	07/30/12	2.9	All hands call with clients and co-advisors (1.4); call with CEO, F. Huffard and K. Hiltz regarding major strategic initiatives (1.0); route incoming utility pleadings (0.3); review and markup of agenda letter (0.2).
Klein DS	07/30/12	3.9	Call with J. Creighton regarding Schedules and follow-up (0.3); discuss same with N. Tsiouris (0.2); review all first and second day orders, revise same and email to Committee and DIP Lenders (3.4).
Libby A	07/30/12	6.0	Coordinate posting of utilities order to case website (0.2); emails with Garden City Group regarding inquiry from G. McCollum regarding mail error (0.3); draft August 2nd agenda and emails with D. Klein and E. Ruiz regarding same (1.5); update and revise case calendar (0.8); send calendar invites to Davis Polk team regarding upcoming deadlines (0.4); draft notice of adjournment of hearing (0.7); coordinate binders for August 2 hearing (1.3); run blacklines for DIP lenders (0.6); review docket for Peabody notice of appearance and circulate same to Davis Polk team (0.2).
McGreal MM	07/30/12	1.9	Update call with working group (0.7); coordinating status conference and hearing logistics with Chambers (0.2); correspond with M. Huebner and A. Starr regarding status conference on stipulations (0.2); research regarding removing cases to bankruptcy court (0.4); correspond with M. Sullivan regarding same (0.2); correspond with D. Klein and E. Ruiz regarding hearing preparation (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	07/30/12	10.8	Obtain precedent pleadings from multiple bankruptcy cases for J. Foust and K. Williams (1.0); obtain precedent dockets for J. Foust (0.8); obtain docket updates (0.3); route incoming pleadings (0.5); prepare and send a "welcome" package to those that filed a Notice of Appearance (0.2); multiple communications with A. Libby and T. Volano regarding hearing binder preparation (0.6); download and organize pleadings to prepare August 2, 2012 hearing binders (5.9); multiple revisions to same per revised agendas (1.5).
Narayan GS	07/30/12	2.5	Prepare distribution for J. Brenner (1.8); prepare distribution for W. Hoeben (0.7).
Ruiz EL	07/30/12	2.6	Coordinate document preparation for omnibus hearing (1.2); review and revision of August 2 hearing agenda (1.0); calls to D. Klein and A. Libby regarding the same (0.4).
Schaible DS	07/30/12	2.6	Emails and teleconferences to coordinate first day objections and second day hearing and next steps.
Starr AT	07/30/12	1.0	Conference call with client and Blackstone regarding case status.
Taylor WL	07/30/12	0.6	Status call.
Tsiouris N	07/30/12	1.2	Meet with D. Klein to discuss Schedules (0.5); call with E. Ruiz regarding same (0.3); call with Alix, Patriot and D. Klein regarding Schedules.
Volano T	07/30/12	5.8	Prepare new hearing materials for wages motion and vendor motion backup (1.1); assist with preparation of hearing binders (4.7).
Dphrepaulezz JH	07/31/12	1.1	Prepare distribution for J. Eum.
Eum JS	07/31/12	3.0	Coordinate additional copies of RoyaltyCo, STB and Tampa Overrides binders as per R. Estacio.
Hait S	07/31/12	2.0	Check binders for second day hearing (1.0); run going final checklist (0.5); save and organize reclamation claims (0.5).
Huebner MS	07/31/12	0.6	Call with K. Hiltz, F. Huffard regarding cost control issues.
Klein DS	07/31/12	1.9	Revise notice of adjournment and coordinate regarding filing of same (0.5); revise key workstreams list (0.3); coordinate on hearing preparation (1.1).
Krause SC	07/31/12	0.5	Emails regarding hearing scheduling (0.3); confer regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Law EC	07/31/12	0.5	Prepare for 8/2/2012 hearing (0.1); communications with E. Ruiz, K. Satter and M. Melvin regarding logistics and preparations regarding same (0.4).
Libby A	07/31/12	3.9	Review binders for U.S. Trustee and DIP lenders and coordinate changes to same (0.7); update case calendar (0.4); revise, finalize and file notice of adjournment (1.3) confirm accuracy of calendar invites (0.2); draft and revise agenda for August 2nd hearing (0.6); revise calendar to reflect environmental deadlines (0.2); run blacklines for clients (0.5).
McGreal MM	07/31/12	3.1	Review and comment on case calendar (1.4); correspondence with A. Libby regarding same (0.1); correspondence with H. Baker regarding environmental litigation calendar dates (0.1); draft summary case calendar (0.6); coordinate case conference with Chambers and attendees (0.4); coordinate adjournments and agenda with Chambers (0.1); review Davis Polk workstreams leader list (0.2); correspondence with D. Klein regarding same (0.1); update clients regarding status conference (0.2); email Chambers regarding rejection orders (0.1); email Curtis Mallet regarding same (0.1).
Melvin MM	07/31/12	2.0	Route incoming pleadings (0.1); review and distribute incoming mail (0.2); send a "welcome" package to those that filed a Notice of Appearance (0.2); several updates to the August 2nd hearing binders (1.2); communications with A. Libby and T. Volano regarding same (0.3).
Narayan GS	07/31/12	0.5	Prepare distribution for S. Krause.
Resnick BM	07/31/12	0.1	Emails regarding workstream assignment chart.
Robertson C	07/31/12	0.2	Review proposed agenda.
Ruiz EL	07/31/12	1.7	Calls with K. Satter regarding document preparation for hearing (0.3); gather documents for hearing boxes (0.8); review of hearing binders (0.6).
Satter KM	07/31/12	3.9	Work with E. Ruiz to prepare for hearing (1.5); various emails (0.5); review and revise chart of hearing materials (1.9).
Schaible DS	07/31/12	1.6	Emails regarding first day order issues (1.2); emails regarding hearing scheduling and motion scheduling issues (0.4).
Tsiouris N	07/31/12	2.5	Review coal global notes and Statement of Financial Affairs precedents.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Volano T	07/31/12	4.2	Update hearing binders (0.3); prepare hearing materials for wages motion, cash management motion, Coal Supply Agreements, derivatives, critical vendors motion, foreign vendors motion, surety bond program, shippers and warehousemen motion and miscellaneous/general (3.9).
Total GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION		611.7	
GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS			
Ferrell KL	07/10/12	0.2	Review Patriot press releases.
Starr AT	07/10/12	0.3	Calls and emails regarding disclosure issues with S. Beshar and W. Hoeben.
Ruiz EL	07/11/12	0.8	Meeting with S. Hait regarding hotline and follow-up thereto (0.3); setup hotline (0.4); meeting with M. McGreal regarding the same (0.1).
Ruiz EL	07/12/12	1.9	Draft Board minutes.
McGreal MM	07/13/12	1.9	Draft minutes from July 8 Board meeting.
Sullivan MN	07/13/12	0.1	Call to W. Hoeben regarding FINRA.
Schaible DS	07/15/12	0.6	Review and revise employee question & answer document.
McGreal MM	07/16/12	0.4	Revise Board of Directors meeting minutes.
Ruiz EL	07/16/12	3.1	Meeting with S. Hait and K. Satter regarding hotline (0.5); draft Board minutes (2.6).
Ruiz EL	07/17/12	0.3	Review of comments to Board Minutes.
Schaible DS	07/17/12	0.6	Review and revise Board minutes.
Resnick BM	07/22/12	0.8	Call with management and Joelle Frank team regarding communications (0.7); Emails regarding disclosure of lender presentation (0.1).
Dean A	07/23/12	4.7	Conference with Patriot, W. Hoeben and J. Brenner regarding public bank presentation and regulation FD (1.0); draft legend for preliminary second quarter financial data (1.7); regulation F-D analysis of monthly operating data supplied to bankruptcy court (2.0).
Beshar SE	07/25/12	0.4	Review corporate governance issues.
Hait S	07/25/12	0.3	Attend to "hotline" call.
Taylor WL	07/25/12	0.6	Governance matters.
Starr AT	07/26/12	0.3	Emails regarding preparation of Board meeting materials.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Taylor WL	07/26/12	1.2	Conference call regarding governance (0.4); telephone calls regarding same (0.3); review materials regarding same (0.5).
Starr AT	07/27/12	0.6	Draft slides for nominating and governance committee meeting.
Taylor WL	07/27/12	0.3	Governance presentation.
Hait S	07/30/12	0.5	Respond to "hotline" call.
Starr AT	07/31/12	0.5	Review 10-Q (0.3); calls and emails with W. Hoeben regarding same (0.2).
Taylor WL	07/31/12	0.2	Governance presentation.
Total GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS		20.6	
NON-DPW RETENTION			
Butler JH	07/10/12	2.9	Review Ernst & Young engagement application, order and declaration (2.7); emails with S. Krause regarding the same (0.2).
Dodge C	07/10/12	0.6	Add information from filing into Alix Partners' retention letter; update Schroeder declaration.
Ibrahim A	07/10/12	7.2	Review J. Butler comments to Ernst & Young retention application with D. Robles (1.2); discuss comments with S. Krause (0.6); meet with D. Robles to discuss outstanding issues regarding same (0.3); review blacklines of retention application (0.8); make further edits to Ernst & Young application to comply with U.S. Trustee requests (0.7); create blacklines and send to S. Krause (0.2); review Blackstone comments to retention application (0.7); correspondence with R. Gentile regarding Blackstone issues with retention application (0.2); edit Blackstone retention application and meet with J. Pyo regarding same (1.1); meet with S. Krause and J. Pyo regarding outstanding issues with Blackstone retention (0.4); review Blackstone markup (0.5); correspondence with word processing about turning changes to Blackstone markup (0.2); correspondence with C. Dodge regarding markup of retention application by AlixPartners (0.3).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/10/12	1.8	Revise §327 retention application for Garden City Group.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	07/10/12	4.2	Revise Ernst & Young retention applications (2.9); calls with Alix regarding retention application (0.8); call with J. Simon regarding Ernst & Young retention (0.2); confer with J. Bean regarding Alix (0.3).
Martin RL	07/10/12	0.1	Review conflicts report regarding Ernst & Young retention application.
Pyo J	07/10/12	5.7	Revise Blackstone retention application based on docket information (0.2); revise Blackstone retention application based on comments from Blackstone (4.2); meeting with A. Ibrahim and S. Krause discussing moving forward (0.1); make final changes to Blackstone retention application (1.2).
Robles D	07/10/12	4.0	Work on retention application and declaration for Ernst & Young.
Dodge C	07/11/12	4.1	Blackline §363 application against 327 application and note changes; phone call with AlixPartners to discuss changes; add in more disclosure/disinterestedness information from AlixPartners and format fee language to match precedent case per advice of U.S. Trustee; first batch of edits from S. Krause to make AlixPartners' edits in line with trustee language; make AlixPartners' edits to their retention letter and add in post-filing information.
Ibrahim A	07/11/12	6.9	Edit AlixPartners retention application (1.3); meet with C. Dodge and S. Krause to discuss retention application (0.7); call with AlixPartners to discuss final issues before sending to U.S. Trustee (0.6); review Blackstone retention application (0.8); edit retention applications to comply with Blackstone markup (0.8); discuss markup edits with S. Krause (1.7); meet with S. Krause and J. Pyo regarding outstanding issues with Blackstone retention (0.6); meet with D. Robles and S. Krause to discuss Ernst and Young retention application (0.4).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/11/12	1.6	Revise Garden City Group's §327 application.
Klein DS	07/11/12	1.0	Review ordinary course professionals motion and revise same (0.4); communication with clients regarding legal retentions (0.2); email D. McCallister regarding conflicts waivers (0.2); coordinate with R. van den Sigtenhorst regarding ordinary course professionals (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	07/11/12	6.3	Emails with Alix regarding scope of retention (0.3); review and edit various retention applications and emails regarding same (6.0).
Pyo J	07/11/12	1.5	Review Blackstone's changes to retention application (0.4); meeting with A. Ibrahim and S. Krause regarding payment terms (0.6); research precedent for payment terms (0.5).
Butler JH	07/12/12	0.8	Review of follow up U.S. Trustee comments to Blackstone, Alix and Garden City Group retention letters (0.3); review of underlying applications (0.2); review of draft reply (0.2). email with S. Krause regarding same (0.1).
Dodge C	07/12/12	1.5	Enter U.S. Trustee edits in AlixPartners' retention application.
Ibrahim A	07/12/12	3.8	Correspondence with U.S. Trustee regarding Garden City Group, AlixPartners and Blackstone retention applications (0.2); call with Blackstone regarding U.S. Trustee issues (0.9); call with S. Krause regarding same (0.4); meet with J. Pyo to discuss edits to Blackstone in light of U.S. Trustee comments (0.5); meet with C. Dodge to discuss AlixPartners retention in light of U.S. Trustee comments (0.6); review Blackstone retention application (0.6); review AlixPartners retention application (0.5); correspondence with S. Krause regarding same (0.1).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/12/12	0.8	Revise §327 retention application for Garden City Group.
Klein DS	07/12/12	2.1	Review and revise interim compensation motion (0.5); coordinate with S. Krause regarding retentions (0.1); review precedent interim comp and ordinary course professional orders (0.5); communications with J. Bean regarding ordinary course professionals (0.3); emails with J. Snider regarding same (0.2); review precedent ordinary course professional caps (0.2); multiple emails and other communications with clients regarding special counsel retention and ordinary (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	07/12/12	5.3	Calls with B. Gentile regarding Blackstone retention (0.9); call with E. Gasparini regarding comments to retention applications (0.4); reply to E. Gasparini issues list (0.5); Davis Polk meetings regarding Alix, Blackstone and Garden City Group applications (0.4); review edits to Alix, Blackstone and Garden City Group applications (2.5); emails regarding same (0.4); confer with J. Butler regarding same (0.2).
Martin RL	07/12/12	0.1	Compose email and send revised parties in interest list to M. Cohen at Curtis.
Pyo J	07/12/12	2.2	Call with S. Krause, A. Ibrahim, and Blackstone regarding U.S. Trustee comments to retention application (0.4); revise Blackstone retention application to reflect U.S. Trustee comments (1.8).
Ruiz EL	07/12/12	0.9	Review and revise interim compensation procedures motion (0.4); review and revise ordinary course professionals motion (0.5).
Tsiouris N	07/12/12	1.3	Review and edit second day motion to establish procedures for interim monthly compensation and reimbursement of expenses of professionals (0.9); communications with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Butler JH	07/13/12	0.2	Review of Garden City Group §327 retention application and related correspondence with the U.S. Trustee.
Dodge C	07/13/12	0.5	U.S. Trustee edits to AlixPartners retention.
Ibrahim A	07/13/12	2.3	Correspondence with Blackstone regarding final issues with respect to retention application (0.2); edit retention application (0.4); meet with J. Pyo regarding same (0.3); review blacklines sent by J. Pyo (0.6); call with J. Pyo regarding edits (0.1); review final retention application before being sent to Blackstone (0.7).
Klein DS	07/13/12	3.1	Coordinate with R. van den Sigtenhorst and others regarding ordinary course professionals motion (0.4); review table regarding same and emails and calls with clients regarding same (0.5); research ordinary course professional conflicts issues (0.6); revise interim compensation order and send to E. Gasparini (0.4); revise ordinary course professionals motion and email to clients (1.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	07/13/12	4.8	Emails with B. Gentile and M. Buschmann regarding Blackstone retention (0.7); call with E. Gasparini regarding comments to retention applications (0.2); reply to E. Gasparini issues list (0.3); call with L. Eisele regarding Alix applications (0.3); emails regarding Garden City Group applications (0.2); revise various applications (3.1).
Martin RL	07/13/12	3.2	Review revisions to Curtis retention application (1.5); generate PDF signature pages for M. Schroeder signature (1.0); review and respond to email questions regarding retention applications (0.1); draft email to M. Cohen regarding M. Schroeder regarding retention application signatures (0.1); call with S. Krause regarding retention signature pages (0.1); revise Curtis retention application and send the same to M. Cohen at Curtis (0.4).
Pyo J	07/13/12	0.8	Revise Blackstone retention application based on final comments from S. Krause, U.S. Trustee and Blackstone.
Robles D	07/13/12	1.5	Update and blackline the Ernst & Young retention application and declaration.
Ruiz EL	07/13/12	0.5	Review and revise interim compensation procedures motion.
Klein DS	07/14/12	0.5	Several emails with client legal team regarding ordinary course professionals.
Ibrahim A	07/15/12	2.7	Retrieve Ernst and Young drafts of retention application (0.1); create blacklines against Davis Polk previous version (0.2); review blacklines of Ernst and Young edits (1.3); correspondence with S. Krause regarding same (0.3); correspondence with D. Robles (0.2); markup Ernst and Young blacklines (0.4); scan markups and send to S. Krause (0.2).
Klein DS	07/15/12	0.2	Review D. Schaible comments on ordinary course professionals motion.
Schaible DS	07/15/12	0.8	Review and revise emails regarding ordinary course professionals motion.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Ibrahim A	07/16/12	2.8	Review Ernst & Young correspondence concerning retention application (0.3); call with Ernst & Young counsel regarding retention application issues (0.9); meeting with D. Robles regarding same (0.3); edit Ernst & Young declaration (0.3); create blacklines (0.2); correspondence with Ernst & Young counsel regarding proposed declaration edits (0.2); review D. Robles edits to Ernst & Young application (0.4); meeting with D. Robles regarding same (0.2).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/16/12	0.3	Email correspondence regarding revisions to Garden City Group's §327 retention application.
Klein DS	07/16/12	0.8	Review precedent interim compensation motions (0.5); coordinate with clients on ordinary course professionals issues (0.3).
Krause SC	07/16/12	3.6	Call with M. Buschmann regarding Blackstone retention (0.2); call with J. Simon regarding Ernst & Young retention (0.4) emails regarding Garden City Group application and revise same (0.4); revise various applications (2.6).
Libby A	07/16/12	0.6	Research interim compensation precedents in response to U.S. Trustee comments (0.5); summary email to D. Klein regarding same (0.1).
Melvin MM	07/16/12	0.9	Locate precedent interim fee application motions and orders, save same to the system and forward to A. Libby for review (0.8); communicate with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).
Robles D	07/16/12	2.8	Revise and update the Ernst & Young retention application and blackline; meet with S. Krause and A. Ibrahim to call Ernst & Young's counsel.
Ibrahim A	07/17/12	2.1	Call with S. Krause regarding U.S. Trustee comments to Ernst & Young application (0.2); retrieve U.S. Trustee standard indemnity language (0.1); review engagement letters for indemnity language (0.2); meet with D. Robles to discuss edits to Ernst & Young retention application (0.4); call with D. Robles regarding same (0.2); review D. Robles edits to retention application (0.3); call with S. Krause regarding same (0.3); edit retention application (0.2); create blacklines for review by Ernst & Young and U.S. Trustee (0.2).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/17/12	3.4	Review and revise the Garden City Group §327 retention application.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	07/17/12	0.6	Research interim comp precedents and email with D. Schaible regarding E. Gasparini issues (0.4); call with Bowles Rice regarding ordinary course professionals and coordinate with S. Krause regarding same (0.2).
Krause SC	07/17/12	1.5	Emails regarding Ernst & Young retention (0.3); calls with P. Schwartzberg, J. Simon, call with A. Ibrahim regarding Ernst & Young retention (0.4); review edits to Ernst & Young retention (0.3); emails regarding Alix retention (0.2); confer regarding Garden City Group retention and review same (0.3).
Martin RL	07/17/12	1.0	Create standard template to use for on-going retention applications.
Robles D	07/17/12	2.7	Revise Ernst & Young retention application and declaration.
de Richemont P	07/18/12	0.7	Research and revise ordinary course professional fee comparison table.
Dodge C	07/18/12	1.0	Update AlixPartners' retention application.
Hait S	07/18/12	0.5	Correspondence with S. Krause regarding §327(e) research.
Ibrahim A	07/18/12	1.4	Correspondence with J. Simon regarding Ernst & Young edits to retention application (0.1); review blacklines (0.2); meet with S. Krause regarding same (0.3); edit blacklines (0.2); meet with D. Robles regarding same (0.3); answer D. Robles' questions and review changes (0.3).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/18/12	3.2	Revise Garden City Group's §327 retention application and begin to prepare same for filing.
Klein DS	07/18/12	1.6	Discuss interim compensation order with D. Schaible (0.2); emails with professionals regarding retention and coordinate with S. Krause regarding same (0.3); coordinate on E. Gasparini comments on ordinary course professionals motion (1.1).
Krause SC	07/18/12	5.9	Emails with various proposed special counsel (0.3); review issues related to §327(e) retention (0.3); review ordinary course professionals motion (0.6); review form §327(e) retention application (0.1); confer with D. Klein, M. McGreal regarding billing and retention (0.3); review edits to Garden City Group retention (0.3); review edits to AlixPartners retention (0.5); review and revise various retention applications (3.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin RL	07/18/12	3.5	Review parties in interest list (0.1); send parties in interest list to possible new professionals (0.4); call with A. Isaac-Lowry regarding revisions to Garden City Group retention application (0.1); create template for §327(e) retention applications (2.9).
Pyo J	07/18/12	2.8	Revise Blackstone retention to reflect scrub list of second day motions (1.4); call with Blackstone, U.S. Trustee and S. Krause regarding final comments (0.4); revise Blackstone retention based on call (1.0).
Robles D	07/18/12	1.5	Update Ernst & Young retention application (0.7); compare tax engagement letters to existing letters and order (0.8).
Ruiz EL	07/18/12	4.2	Review and revise interim compensation motion (0.2); review and revise interim compensation procedures motion (1.9); review and revise ordinary course professionals motion (2.1).
Dodge C	07/19/12	4.2	Finalize AlixPartners' retention edits and review, revise and file same.
Hait S	07/19/12	4.5	Research §327(e) issue for S. Krause.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Ibrahim A	07/19/12	8.3	Call with Blackstone regarding proposed language in Blackstone retention application (0.6); call with U.S. Trustee regarding same (0.4); edit Blackstone retention application (0.2); correspondence regarding proposed edits with Blackstone (0.3); call with Blackstone regarding same (0.4); call with U.S. Trustee regarding same (0.3); call with U.S. Trustee and Blackstone regarding final language in Blackstone retention application (0.4); review Blackstone retention application before filing (1.2); review Garden City Group retention application before filing (0.6); review Ernst and Young retention application before filing (0.9); meet with D. Robles regarding same (0.3); correspondence with U.S. Trustee regarding same (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding AlixPartners retention application and any final changes (0.2); review changes from AlixPartners (0.3); meet with C. Dodge to discuss AlixPartners changes (0.2); review blackline to AlixPartners retention application (0.6); discuss requirements with summer associates regarding how to package retention application for filing (0.4); review AlixPartners retention before filing (0.6); create blackline for review by U.S. Trustee and correspondence with same (0.2).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/19/12	2.4	Prepare Garden City Group retention materials.
Klein DS	07/19/12	1.1	Revise ordinary course professionals motion (0.4); emails with J. Bean and J. Jones on related questions (0.3); analyze historical professionals spend and coordinate with J. Jones regarding same (0.4).
Krause SC	07/19/12	9.0	Review and revise various retention applications (3.9); various calls with Alix, Blackstone, Curtis and U.S. Trustee regarding same (1.1); prepare applications to file and file applications (2.0); revise template for special counsel retention (1.2); calls with various proposed special counsel (0.8).
Law EC	07/19/12	0.8	Obtain precedents of retention applications (0.6); communications with J. Foust regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	07/19/12	1.5	Meet with C. Robertson and S. Hait regarding filing process for retention applications (0.3); file AlixPartners retention application and emails with S. Krause and A. Ibrahim regarding same (1.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin RL	07/19/12	2.1	Prepare Curtis signature page for delivery (0.1); call with E. Ruiz regarding list of second day retention applications (0.1); send parties in interest list to D. Morrison at Steptoe (0.1); create Excel sheet with professionals contact information and send revised parties in interest list to the same (1.4); review conflicts report and compose email to J. Butler regarding the same (0.2); update parties in interest list (0.2).
Pyo J	07/19/12	3.9	Revise Blackstone retention application based on comments by Blackstone (0.8); meeting with S. Krause and A. Ibrahim to discuss U.S. Trustee comments and next steps (1.6); revise Blackstone retention application based on meeting (0.4); prepare Blackstone retention application for filing (1.1).
Robles D	07/19/12	3.5	Finalize Ernst & Young retention application and file with court.
Ruiz EL	07/19/12	1.2	Review and revise interim compensation procedures motion (0.6); review and revise ordinary course professionals motion (0.6).
Schaible DS	07/19/12	0.5	Emails regarding fee statement coordinate issues.
Hait S	07/20/12	0.6	Revise §327(e) retention memo.
Ibrahim A	07/20/12	2.4	Correspondence with retention team regarding blacklines of final versions to send to U.S. Trustee (0.1); meet with S. Krause to discuss response email to U.S. Trustee questions and blackline issues (0.6); review all blacklines of final filed versions of retention applications (0.9); create PDFs of retention applications to be sent (0.3); correspondence with S. Krause and U.S. Trustee regarding final blacklines (0.3); correspondence with R. Martin regarding notice of appearances and outstanding conflict obligations (0.2).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/20/12	0.2	Prepare Garden City Group retention materials.
Klein DS	07/20/12	0.3	Review ordinary course professionals chart and emails with J. Jones regarding same.
Krause SC	07/20/12	2.0	Call with proposed special counsel (0.4); revise retention template (0.6); emails regarding retention applications (0.2); review memo on 327(e) retentions (0.8).
Robles D	07/20/12	0.5	Run final blacklines of Ernst & Young retention materials.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Schaible DS	07/20/12	0.9	Emails regarding filed retention applications (0.3); emails and telephone conferences regarding retention applications (0.6).
Schaible DS	07/22/12	0.4	Review and emails regarding DRC retention.
Hait S	07/23/12	0.8	Revise §327(e) memo.
Krause SC	07/23/12	2.0	Finalize application documentation (0.7); calls regarding ordinary course professionals and additional retentions (0.5); emails regarding same (0.3); review and revise §327 memo (0.3); emails regarding retention applications.
Martin RL	07/23/12	1.6	Send revised template to professionals not yet retained (0.6); update retained professionals sheet (0.2); revise parties in interest list (0.3); compose email to M. Cohen requesting executed signature page for Curtis declaration (0.2); put together file copies of retention applications for Davis Polk records (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/23/12	0.6	Coordinate regarding retention issues.
Ibrahim A	07/24/12	0.1	Correspondence with R. Martin and S. Krause regarding signature pages for retention applications (0.1).
Martin RL	07/24/12	1.9	Respond to questions from E. King at Steptoe regarding §327(e) retention application (0.6); follow up with professionals on request for declaration signature pages (0.3); call with S. Krause regarding questions from E. King at Steptoe (0.1); review Thompson Coburn §327(e) retention application (0.8); update parties in interest list (0.1).
Krause SC	07/25/12	1.2	Calls with various professionals regarding retentions (0.5); review Thompson Coburn application (0.3); review parties in interest list (0.2); emails regarding same (0.2).
Martin RL	07/25/12	0.4	Update parties in interest list (0.1); send parties in interest list (0.2); respond to emails from S. Krause regarding retention template (0.1).
Isaac-Lowry A	07/26/12	2.9	Revise Thompson Coburn retention application.
Krause SC	07/26/12	1.3	Emails regarding retention with Davis Polk team and J. Jones (0.3); confer regarding same with R. Martin (0.2); review parties-in-interest list (0.2); emails regarding disclosures (0.3); revise Thompson Coburn §327 retention application (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin RL	07/26/12	1.8	Call with A. Isaac-Lowry regarding revisions to Thompson Coburn retention application (0.1); meeting with with A. Isaac-Lowry regarding revisions to Thompson Coburn retention application (0.2); review precedent for retention application and meet with J. Pyo regarding retention application (0.2); update parties in interest list to reflect new notice of appearance parties (0.2); review revisions to Thompson Coburn retention application (0.3); review retention template (0.4); review Thompson Coburn retention application and send the same to R. Wuller at Thompson Coburn (0.4).
Pyo J	07/26/12	4.1	Meeting with R. Martin about retention application (0.2); draft preliminary template for retention application (3.9).
Ruiz EL	07/26/12	0.1	Review and revise interim compensation procedures motion.
Krause SC	07/27/12	0.5	Review for objections (0.2); emails regarding same (0.3).
Martin RL	07/27/12	0.1	Follow up with M. Melvin regarding whether any objections to retention applications had been filed.
Melvin MM	07/27/12	0.2	Review the docket to see if any objections were filed regarding a retention application on the docket for R. Martin.
Pyo J	07/27/12	1.4	Revise retention application in accordance with comments by S. Krause.
Krause SC	07/29/12	0.4	Emails regarding ordinary course professionals' retentions.
Isaac-Lowry A	07/30/12	0.2	Prepare file copies of retention applications.
Martin RL	07/30/12	1.3	Forward changes to parties in interest list to professionals (0.7); coordinate creation of file copies of filed retention applications for Davis Polk records (0.4); review retention questionnaire from Steptoe and Johnson and update retention professionals sheet with the same (0.2).
Ibrahim A	07/31/12	0.5	Review Greenberg Traurig retention documents (0.2); call with R. Martin regarding retention of professionals (0.2); correspondence with S. Krause regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	07/31/12	1.9	Revise parties-in-interest list (0.3); emails regarding ordinary course professionals retentions (0.6); review Greenberg Traurig questionnaire (0.2); review status of §327 applications (0.5); emails regarding same with R. Martin (0.3).
Martin RL	07/31/12	1.0	Check in with professionals regarding the status of retention applications (0.2); call with A. Ibrahim regarding Greenberg and Thompson Coburn retention applications (0.1); coordinate review of Greenberg and Thompson Coburn retention applications (0.1); revise Patriot retained professionals sheet (0.3); review Thompson Coburn retention application (0.3).
Pyo J	07/31/12	0.6	Update potential parties in interest list based on comments from S. Krause and R. Martin.
Total NON-DPW RETENTION		214.4	
NON-WORKING TRAVEL			
de Richemont P	07/10/12	0.4	Travel to and from first-day hearing.
Klein DS	07/10/12	0.8	Travel to and from court.
Law EC	07/10/12	1.1	Travel to and from Court for first day hearing.
McGreal MM	07/10/12	0.7	Travel to and from hearing.
de Richemont P	07/16/12	0.4	Travel to and from hearing.
Huebner MS	07/16/12	0.7	Travel to and from court.
Klein DS	07/16/12	0.8	Travel to and from court.
Law EC	07/16/12	0.8	Travel to and from Court for 7/16/2012 hearing.
McGreal MM	07/16/12	0.9	Travel to and from court for second first day hearing.
Ruiz EL	07/16/12	1.0	Travel to and from hearing.
Vonnegut EJ	07/16/12	0.7	Travel to and from hearing.
Huebner MS	07/18/12	0.6	Travel to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee organizational meeting.
Huebner MS	07/19/12	3.4	Travel to Charleston, WV for meetings with senior client team, Blackstone and J. Alix regarding labor and retiree issues.
Martin JD	07/19/12	4.5	Travel from New York to Charleston for client meetings.
Moskowitz E	07/19/12	3.8	Travel from New York to West Virginia for client meetings.
Huebner MS	07/20/12	0.9	Non-working travel home from Charleston.
Martin JD	07/20/12	2.2	Travel from Charleston, West Virginia to New York.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	07/20/12	3.0	Travel from West Virginia to NY.
Total NON-WORKING TRAVEL		26.7	
REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL			
Beshar SE	07/10/12	2.2	Review material agreements and calls and emails related thereto (0.7); review correspondence with NYSE and email (0.4); review FINRA correspondence and email (0.5); review 12b-25 documents and Form 8-K (0.6).
Chan B	07/10/12	2.9	Convert documents to SEC-compliant format (0.2); distribute proofs of Form 8-k for review (0.1) ; convert documents to SEC-compliant format (0.2); distribute proofs of Form NT 11-K for review (0.1); convert Form 8-K documents to SEC-compliant format (0.8); convert documents to SEC-compliant format (1.5).
Dunleavy KM	07/10/12	6.0	Compile all publicly filed agreements and search for language concerning terms of bankruptcy.
Hoeben W	07/10/12	8.2	Research material agreements and 8-K requirements (4.2); revise Form 12b-25 and discuss with M. Krasnicki (1.1); collect information and draft email to FINRA (2.1); various calls with S. Beshar, J. Brenner and others (0.8).
Huebner MS	07/10/12	0.1	Emails internally and with FINRA regarding FINRA request.
Matlock TL	07/10/12	3.1	Review roll-up DIP (0.2); discuss with A. Rubenstein (0.2); review and compare Kodak NOL motion (1.0); discuss same with K. Ferrell (0.3); email D. Klein and others regarding same (0.4); discuss NOL motion with A. Rubenstein (0.5); monitor hearing and discuss with K. Ferrell (0.5).
Oshen O	07/10/12	0.8	Review 10-K with respect to joint ventures (0.4); discuss with D. McCallister regarding Critical Vendor Motion (0.1); review emails related to case filings (0.3).
Zhu B	07/10/12	0.4	Attend conference with W. Hoeben regarding contract terminations issues in preparation for 8-K.
Beshar SE	07/11/12	1.1	Review 8-K and 12b-25 (0.7); discuss mutual agreements (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Brenner J	07/11/12	3.7	Draft 8-K (1.0); research intercreditor agreement disclosure (0.7); research DIP facility disclosure (0.9); research material agreements (0.8).
Chan B	07/11/12	1.6	Convert documents to SEC-compliant format (Form 8-K) (1.4); revise draft (0.1); distribute proofs for review (Form NT 11-K) (0.1).
Ferrell KL	07/11/12	1.4	Consider issues relating to the prepetition taxes and NOL order (0.8); conference with D. Schaible regarding NOL order and prepetition taxes (0.2); call with N. Barr regarding NOL order (0.2); call with A. Rubenstein and T. Matlock regarding tax items (0.2).
Hoeben W	07/11/12	5.3	Draft 8-K (1.3); review revised communication materials (0.6); various calls with S. Beshar, J. Brenner and others (1.2); research material agreements (2.2).
Huber BM	07/11/12	2.1	Teleconference and emails with D. McCallister regarding selenium prepetition payments (0.5); consider issues regarding the same (0.5); emails regarding Barclays PA Letter of Credit Collateral Bond Agreement request (0.3); consider JV strategy (0.8).
Matlock TL	07/11/12	0.4	Discuss NOL motion with A. de Richemont (0.1); review NOL and prepetition tax motion (0.3).
Oshen O	07/11/12	2.4	Discussion with D. Klein regarding selenium prepetition payments (0.2); email B. Huber with details regarding same (0.3); conference call with D. McCallister and B. Huber regarding selenium prepetition payments (0.3); consider same with B. Huber (0.3); email B. Huber regarding same (0.1); discuss same with B. Huber (0.1); discuss same with A. Libby (0.1); research Company joint ventures (0.2); draft email regarding same to B. Huber (0.3); research executory contract provision of Bankruptcy Code (0.1); email B. Huber regarding same in relation to environmental contract workers (0.1); emails regarding bank Collateral Bond Agreement request (0.3).
Schaible DS	07/11/12	1.2	Emails regarding tax issues (0.6); coordinate regarding issues (0.6).
Beshar SE	07/12/12	0.9	Review FINRA letter and calls to discuss with Company, A. Star and W. Hoeben.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Brenner J	07/12/12	3.4	Review 8-K disclosure (1.6); prepare documents for A. Dean's review (0.3); prepare documents to be filed with SEC (0.8); prepare and filed NT 11-K (0.7).
Chan B	07/12/12	0.2	Revise draft (0.1); distribute proofs for review (Form 8-K) (0.1).
Hoeben W	07/12/12	5.4	Draft description of new bank facilities for 8-K (4.3); review revised communication materials (0.2); various calls with S. Beshar, J. Brenner and others (0.9).
Huber BM	07/12/12	2.3	Emails regarding selenium contractors in the context of the critical vendors motion (0.2); teleconference and emails with D. McCallister and B. Gardner of Jackson Kelly regarding permit block issues (0.4); draft email to D. McCallister regarding environmental workstream checklist (1.2); emails with M. Williams regarding notice parties (0.3); emails regarding Barclay's request for bonding information (0.2).
Klein DS	07/12/12	1.2	Emails with H. Baker regarding permit block issues (0.2); coordinate with environmental team regarding surety bond issues (0.3); coordinate on NOL notice and service of same (0.3); review and comment on same (0.3); emails with S. Mell regarding permit blocking issues (0.1).
Oshen O	07/12/12	0.9	Review B. Huber's draft email regarding Environmental Workstream Checklist (0.2); provide comments on same (0.1); consider G. Pak request regarding reclamation and surety bonds; (0.3); discuss same with G. Pak (0.1); telephone discussions with notices team regarding Automatic Stay Notice (0.2)
Resnick BM	07/12/12	0.7	Call with J. Tucker and others regarding stock and disclosure issues.
Schaible DS	07/12/12	0.8	Emails regarding tax issues and next steps.
Starr AT	07/12/12	0.6	Calls and emails with S. Beshar and W. Hoeben regarding disclosure queries.
Sullivan MN	07/12/12	0.9	Call with A. Starr regarding FINRA request (0.1); review FINRA request (0.1); call with W. Hoeben regarding FINRA request (0.1); review FINRA precedents and send to W. Hoeben (0.6).
Beshar SE	07/13/12	1.8	Discuss with A. Dean (0.4); review FINRA letter (0.6); file 8-K (0.3); call regarding FINRA (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Brenner J	07/13/12	9.4	Meet with S. Beshar, W. Hoeben and A. Dean to discuss Patriot (0.3); draft, edit, organize and coordinate with Edgar department to file 8-K (8.1); draft and review FINRA letter (1.0).
Chan B	07/13/12	0.5	Revise draft (Form 8-K).
Dean A	07/13/12	0.3	Conference with S. Beshar and W. Hoeben regarding disclosure issues.
Hoeben W	07/13/12	8.0	Revise and file draft Form 8-K.
Huber BM	07/13/12	0.1	Review changed pages to rollup Debtor-in-Possession facility.
Huebner MS	07/13/12	0.2	Emails regarding FINRA and 8K issues.
Klein DS	07/13/12	1.3	Research regarding permit blocking and emails with clients regarding same.
McGreal MM	07/13/12	0.2	Correspondence with J. Brenner regarding FINRA request.
Oshen O	07/13/12	1.6	Discussions with B. Huber regarding Weil Gotshal selenium matters request and related cases (0.3); compile documents regarding same for Weil Gotshal (1.2); review B. Huber summary on status of issues (0.1).
Schaible DS	07/13/12	0.3	Emails regarding SEC letter.
Baker HS	07/16/12	1.5	Meeting with B. Huber regarding status (0.8); review of workstream chart and related correspondence (0.7).
Beshar SE	07/16/12	0.7	Review slides and send emails.
Dean A	07/16/12	0.3	Lender presentation Regulation FD issues.
Huber BM	07/16/12	1.5	Conference regarding status (0.8); review draft Unsecured Creditors Committee presentation (0.3); review draft Confidential Information Memorandum for Debtor In Possession loan (0.2); review agenda for July 17, 2012 working group call (0.2).
Baker HS	07/17/12	0.9	Status call (0.7); review of workstream (0.2).
Huber BM	07/17/12	0.8	Emails regarding orders for critical vendors motion and prepetition tax motion (0.1); dial into biweekly update call (0.2).
Klein DS	07/17/12	0.4	Call with D. McCallister and others regarding taxes and follow-up regarding same.
Matlock TL	07/17/12	0.1	Review final prepetition tax order.
Baker HS	07/18/12	3.6	Correspondence with D. McCallister and others regarding vendor payments (1.2); correspondence regarding selenium litigation (2.4).
Beshar SE	07/18/12	0.7	Emails to R. Mead at Patriot Coal regarding reporting obligations.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Brenner J	07/18/12	1.1	Research director bio disclosure in proxy regarding bankruptcy (0.5); research Exchange Act and Reg FD reporting requirements in bankruptcy (0.6).
Huber BM	07/18/12	5.2	Telephone conference and emails regarding environmental lab fees (0.9); emails and telephone conference regarding Sierra Club settlement options (1.4); prepare for telephone conference with Patriot and Alix regarding Statements of Financial Affairs and Schedules (2.9).
Klein DS	07/18/12	1.4	Call with D. McCallister and others regarding Sierra Club and follow-up on related issues with H. Baker and others (1.2); discussions with D. Schaible regarding same (0.2).
Oshen O	07/18/12	1.8	Review emails regarding environmental matters and other case updates (0.3); conference call scheduling (0.1); review updates to docket (0.1); research bankruptcy settlements by environmental groups (0.3); conference call regarding environmental matters (1.0).
Baker HS	07/19/12	5.9	Research regarding bankruptcy filings (1.2); review of credit committee presentation and related correspondence (0.9); call with AlixPartners, Garden City Group and Company regarding environmental claims and preparation for same (2.9); correspondence regarding workstreams and public disclosure (0.9).
Dean A	07/19/12	0.3	Coal contract disclosure issues. Conference with S. Beshar and M. Huebner.
Ferrell KL	07/19/12	0.3	Conference with A. Rubenstein and D. Klein regarding scope of prepetition taxes motion.
Huebner MS	07/19/12	0.3	Conversations with J. Bean, S. Beshar and A. Dean regarding disclosure issues.
Kim JM	07/19/12	6.0	Prepare PDFs of Statements of Financial Affairs documents for client as per O. Oshen (1.5); prepare list of real property lease assumptions or rejections motions/orders and asset divestiture/sale motions and order from coal bankruptcy precedents as per H. Baker and B. Huber (4.5).
Matlock TL	07/19/12	0.3	Discuss prepetition tax payments with A. Rubenstein (0.1); review interim order (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Oshen O	07/19/12	3.4	Consider Statement of Financial Affairs with B. Huber and H. Baker (0.6); discuss environmental issues with E. Ruiz (0.1); conference call with D. McCallister and others regarding Statement of Financial Affairs (1.1); compile documents containing environmental proceedings (1.6).
Ruiz EL	07/19/12	0.5	Emails to O. Oshen regarding environmental issues (0.2); review of email regarding environmental settlements (0.3).
Baker HS	07/20/12	2.2	Review of permitting research (1.8); correspondence regarding status of selenium matters (0.4).
Brenner J	07/20/12	0.9	Compile guidelines for Exchange Act reporting.
Ferrell KL	07/20/12	0.3	Conference with D. Schaible regarding Stroock comments on NOL order.
Kim JM	07/20/12	4.8	Prepare list of real property lease assumptions or rejections motions/orders and asset divestiture/sale motions and order from coal bankruptcy precedents as per H. Baker and B. Huber.
Klein DS	07/20/12	1.0	Call with S. Mell regarding severance tax issues and analysis related to same (0.3); email with A. Schlisinger regarding Sierra Club (0.2); review D. McCallister emails regarding Hobet and respond to same, including review of underlying letters and related analysis (0.5).
Schaible DS	07/20/12	0.4	Emails regarding NOL Motion with objectives.
Brenner J	07/21/12	0.9	Review bank book and lender presentation for non-public information.
Baker HS	07/22/12	0.5	Review of the Unsecured Creditor Committee's presentation and related correspondence.
Baker HS	07/23/12	2.7	Review of critical vendors and environmental proceedings documentation (1.2); correspondence regarding same (0.5); conference with D. Klein, D. McCallister and Alix Partners to discuss same (0.8); correspondence with J. Jones and D. McCallister regarding permits (0.2).
Beshar SE	07/23/12	1.3	Email and review of draft Form 8-K (0.3); review of bank book, preliminary financials and SEC letter (0.5); back and forth with Company regarding disclosure issues (0.3); call with Company regarding Reg F-D requirements (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Brenner J	07/23/12	4.9	Telephonic meeting with W. Hoeben, A. Dean and client about disclosure (0.6); research FD disclosure (1.0); draft 8-K and organize edgarization/sign-off/signing (3.3).
Ferrell KL	07/23/12	0.2	Conference with D. Klein regarding payment question (0.1); conference with A. Rubenstein regarding pre-petition taxes motion (0.1).
Hoeben W	07/23/12	1.5	Revise draft Form 8-K (0.5); call with J. Tucker, M. Schroeder, A. Dean and others to discuss FD requirements (0.5); discuss draft form 8-K with J. Tucker and others (0.5)
Huebner MS	07/23/12	0.5	Meeting and client call regarding selenium issues and negotiations.
Kim JM	07/23/12	5.2	Prepare list of real property lease assumptions or rejections motions and orders and asset divestiture and sale motions and order from coal bankruptcy precedents as per H. Baker and B. Huber.
Klein DS	07/23/12	1.0	Meeting with M. Huebner regarding Hobett issues (0.2); call with D. McCallister et al regarding same (0.8).
Resnick BM	07/23/12	0.5	Call with W. Hoeben regarding disclosure issues (0.2); emails regarding disclosure issues (0.3).
Ruiz EL	07/23/12	0.1	Review of email regarding environmental settlement.
Baker HS	07/24/12	0.4	Review of precedent motions and related research.
Beshar SE	07/24/12	1.3	Email discussion with Company regarding 10-K/A and 10-Q/A disclosure (0.7); communication internally regarding same (0.6).
Brenner J	07/24/12	0.9	Research 10-K/A and 10-Q/A disclosure.
Dean A	07/24/12	1.5	Conference with W. Hoeben and W. Warner regarding F-D issues in connection with bank meeting (0.4); review financial statement legends (1.1).
Ferrell KL	07/24/12	1.0	Consider Brown Rudnick proposal relating to proposed final NOL order (0.8); conference with D. Schaible regarding NOL order (0.2).
Hoeben W	07/24/12	1.4	Call with A. Dean, W. Warner and M. Schroeder and others to discuss 8-K (0.2); discuss 8-K with A. Dean and others (0.2); revise rider for intralinks (1.0).
Kim JM	07/24/12	3.7	Prepare list of real property lease assumptions or rejections motions/orders and asset divestiture/sale motions and order from coal bankruptcy precedents as per H. Baker and B. Huber.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Matlock TL	07/24/12	0.3	Discuss with K. Ferrell (0.1); find precedent NOL final order (0.1); read emails and chart regarding priority (0.1).
Warner W	07/24/12	0.1	Review email regarding selenium.
Brenner J	07/25/12	3.2	Review agreements for possible 8-K disclosure (0.3); research and draft 10-K/A and 10-Q/A (2.9).
Ferrell KL	07/25/12	3.5	Consider question relating to payment of certain fees (0.3); correspond with F. Williams regarding certain disputed tax claims (0.3); review comments relating to NOL order (0.5); review Final Trading Order precedents (0.8); conference with T. Matlock regarding proposed changes to Final Order (0.8); conference with A. Rubenstein and A. Libby regarding response to Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence request (0.3); conference with D. Klein regarding NOL order (0.2); correspond with K. Constantine at Dorsey and S. Levine at Brown Rudnick regarding NOL order (0.3).
Huber BM	07/25/12	0.9	Conference regarding comments to asset sales and rejection procedures orders.
Huebner MS	07/25/12	0.3	Emails regarding Bowen Engineering questions.
Klein DS	07/25/12	1.0	Emails with E. Waller and follow-up with H. Baker regarding Mine Safety and Health Administration fine issues (0.6); call with clients and follow-up regarding environmental issues (0.4).
Libby A	07/25/12	1.4	Draft and revise priority tax chart for Unsecured Creditors' Committee information requests (1.2); emails with D. Klein and tax team regarding same (0.1); review A. Rubenstein edits to priority tax chart (0.1).
Matlock TL	07/25/12	3.4	Review priority status of prepetition taxes (0.4); email K. Ferrell and A. Rubenstein regarding same (0.2); discuss same with A. Libby (0.1); review prepetition tax payments (0.3); email and discuss same with A. Rubenstein (0.2); draft final NOL order (1.3); meet with K. Ferrell to discuss same (0.8); email K. Ferrell regarding same (0.1).
Oshen O	07/25/12	0.1	Provide documents to Garden City Group regarding environmental proceedings.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Baker HS	07/26/12	2.2	Correspondence with D. McCallister and D. Klein regarding Hobet 22 selenium treatment facility and review of related correspondence (1.1); call with Pillsbury regarding same (1.1).
Brenner J	07/26/12	3.5	Draft 10-Q/A and 10-K/A (2.5); research SEC reporting (0.5); call with W. Hoeben, B. Taylor and N. Chiu to discuss NGC meeting slides (0.5).
Dean A	07/26/12	0.3	Conference with W. Hoeben regarding CEO/CFO certification Form 10K/A.
Ferrell KL	07/26/12	0.7	Correspond with bond trustees regarding comments on final NOL order (0.5); conference with T. Matlock regarding revisions to final NOL order (0.2).
Hoeben W	07/26/12	6.4	Review and revise Form 10-K/A and Form 10-Q/A (5.0); discuss certifications with A. Dean (0.5); research certifications (0.9).
Klein DS	07/26/12	1.2	Call with D. McCallister regarding Hobet and coordinate with H. Baker regarding same (0.6); review letters and analysis related to same (0.6).
Libby A	07/26/12	0.6	Review A. Rubenstein draft of priority chart (0.4), save same and blackline same for D. Klein (0.2).
Matlock TL	07/26/12	1.4	Review comments to final NOL order and email K. Ferrell regarding same (0.2); edit final NOL order (0.9); email K. Constantine and K. Ferrell (0.2); discuss final order notice requirements with A. Libby (0.1).
Baker HS	07/27/12	3.3	Correspondence with D. McCallister and E. Vonnegut regarding Hobet 22 selenium treatment facility and review of related correspondence (2.2); correspondence regarding asset sale procedures motions and review of same (0.7); review of workstreams (0.4).
Brenner J	07/27/12	2.9	Research status of registrations in bankruptcy (1.6); draft and edit 10-K/A and 10-Q/A (1.3).
Ferrell KL	07/27/12	0.6	Conference with F. Williams of Stepjoe and Johnson regarding West Virginia tax matters.
Foust JT	07/27/12	4.7	Revise proposed orders to establish procedures relating to sale/rejection/abandonment of mining property.
Hoeben W	07/27/12	1.0	Revise Form 10-K/A and Form 10-Q/A.
Matlock TL	07/27/12	0.6	Email K. Ferrell regarding tax proceedings (0.1); research same (0.4); discuss automatic stay with A. Libby (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Baker HS	07/28/12	0.2	Correspondence regarding Hobet 22 selenium facility.
Hoeben W	07/28/12	1.1	Draft email to M. Schroeder (0.2), revise Form 10-K/A and Form 10-Q/A (0.9).
Baker HS	07/30/12	2.5	Participation in status call and related correspondence (1.1); review of treatment of letters of credit and correspondence with A. Arnaldos, D. McCallister and Pillsbury regarding same (1.4).
Beshar SE	07/30/12	1.3	SEC comment (0.4); 8-K issues (0.5); corporate governance issues (0.4).
Brenner J	07/30/12	8.2	Research 10-Q precedent (0.7); form check and comment on 10-Q (6.4); research deregistration with the SEC (0.6); research proxy statement filing requirements/annual meeting requirements (0.5).
Dean A	07/30/12	1.3	Conference with W. Warner and W. Hoeben and review of disclosure of selenium liability and asset impairment charge.
Ferrell KL	07/30/12	0.6	Conference with K. Constantine of Dorsey regarding NOL motion (0.2); conference with Tracy Matlock regarding NOL motion (0.1); conference with S. Levine of Brown Rudnick regarding NOL motion (0.1); conference with Tracy Matlock regarding application of automatic stay for tax matter (0.2).
Hoeben W	07/30/12	5.8	Research and draft reporting guidelines (4.3); revise Form 10-K/A and Form 10-Q/A (1.3); call with M. Schroeder (0.2).
Huebner MS	07/30/12	0.6	Emails and conversation with W. Warner regarding disclosure issues.
Krause SC	07/30/12	0.8	Calls regarding 10-Q (0.2); review same (0.6).
Matlock TL	07/30/12	3.2	Discuss automatic stay with E. Ruiz (0.4); read and mark-up final NOL order (1.6); email K. Ferrell and others regarding same (0.1); email D. Klein and others regarding automatic stay (0.1); research same (1.0).
Oshen O	07/30/12	0.5	Review docket (0.2); email H. Baker describing certain new motions (0.3).
Ruiz EL	07/30/12	0.2	Calls with T. Matlock regarding effect of automatic stay on tax proceedings.
Baker HS	07/31/12	6.1	Review of draft disclosure and related documentation (5.1); correspondence regarding same (0.8); review of first day motions (0.2).
Beshar SE	07/31/12	2.0	Call SEC (0.5); back and forth with Company regarding amended 10-K and 10-Q filings (0.9); review documents (0.6).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Brenner J	07/31/12	5.7	Draft, edit and form-check 10-Q.
Ferrell KL	07/31/12	0.9	Conference with T. Matlock regarding NOL order (0.2); call S. Levine regarding NOL order (0.1); review revised draft of NOL order (0.6).
Foust JT	07/31/12	2.6	Review precedents for environmental settlement motions.
Hait S	07/31/12	1.2	Review Patriot 10-Q.
Hoeben W	07/31/12	10.8	Revise Form 10-Q/A and Form 10-K/A (1.0); call with SEC (0.2), prepare fax to SEC (2.1); research and emails to N. Chiu regarding presentation governance committee (0.8); review draft 10-Q (6.7).
Huebner MS	07/31/12	1.2	Conference call with Irl Engelhardt, F. Huffard, W. Warner re 8K issues (0.3); review and markup of draft 10Q (0.9).
Kim JM	07/31/12	3.1	Meet with O. Oshen regarding Environmental Documents organization (0.3); update environmental documents binder as per O. Oshen (2.8).
Krause SC	07/31/12	0.7	Review 10-Q (0.5); emails regarding same (0.2).
Matlock TL	07/31/12	1.3	Research automatic stay (0.9); meet with K. Ferrell regarding final NOL order and automatic stay (0.4).
Oshen O	07/31/12	0.9	Sort files relating to environmental matters (0.5); discuss same with J. Kim (0.3); review docket (0.1).
Roberts TA	07/31/12	1.8	Meet with J. Wang regarding 40 Act analysis (0.3); review unconsolidated financials for '40 Act review (1.1); meet with J. Wang and C. Martin regarding '40 Act analysis open issues (0.4).
Wang JH	07/31/12	2.6	Meet with T. Roberts (0.3); review unconsolidated financials for '40 Act review (1.9); meet with T. Roberts and C. Martin regarding '40 Act analysis open issues (0.4).
Warner W	07/31/12	0.8	Calls with Patriot and others regarding opinions (0.2); review cleansing disclosure issues (0.1); question regarding SEC comments (0.3); question regarding 40 Act opinion and local opinions (0.2).
Total REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL		271.6	
SHAREHOLDER DERIVATIVE SUIT			
Martin JD	07/10/12	0.4	Calls with plaintiff's counsel (0.3); email regarding same with J. Bean (0.1)

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	07/20/12	0.6	Prepare materials regarding shareholder issues (0.4); emails to clients regarding same (0.2).
Total SHAREHOLDER DERIVATIVE SUIT		1.0	
Total		3,868.5	