

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI  
EASTERN DIVISION**

In re:

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, *et al.*,

Debtors.

Chapter 11  
Case No. 12-51502-659  
(Jointly Administered)

Objection Deadline:  
August 3, 2013

**MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF GCG, INC., AS  
ADMINISTRATIVE AGENT FOR THE DEBTORS, FOR  
THE PERIOD OF JUNE 1, 2013 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2013**

Angela Ferrante, Vice President, Bankruptcy Operations  
Elizabeth Vrato, Assistant Director, Midwest Operations  
GCG, Inc.

July 19, 2013

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS

Re: Patriot Coal Corporation, *et al.*  
Debtors and Debtors in Possession  
June 1, 2013 through June 30, 2013

Professional Services Rendered by GCG, Inc. as Administrative Agent for the  
Above-Captioned Debtors and Debtors in Possession (collectively, the "Debtors").

|   |                   |
|---|-------------------|
| Total Amount of Hourly Compensation for Professional Services   | \$10,040.70       |
| Holdback as per <i>Order to Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals</i> , dated August 2, 2012 (20%) | (\$2,008.14)      |
| Total Compensation for Professional Services Excluding Holdback   | \$8,032.56        |
| Actual and Necessary Expenses   | \$14.26           |
| <b>Total Requested Payment</b>  | <b>\$8,046.82</b> |

**June Monthly Fee Statement Index**

- Exhibit A**      **Summary of Fees by Billing Category**
- Exhibit B**      **Summary of Fees by Timekeeper**
- Exhibit C**      **Time Detail**
- Exhibit D**      **Actual and Necessary Expenses**

**Exhibit A**  
**To June 2013 Monthly Fee Statement**  
**Summary of Fees by Billing Category**

**SUMMARY OF FEES BY BILLING CATEGORY**

Patriot Coal Corporation, *et al.*  
(June 1, 2013 - June 30, 2013)

|  | BLEND<br>ED<br>RATE | TOTAL HOURS<br>BILLED | TOTAL FEES         |
|--|---------------------|-----------------------|--------------------|
| Claims Analysis/Advanced<br>Reconciliation | \$119.71            | <b>57.0</b>           | <b>\$6,823.50</b>  |
| Fee Application Preparation*               | \$137.00            | <b>23.1</b>           | <b>\$3,164.70</b>  |
| Schedules/SoFAs/Other<br>Schedules         | \$175.00            | <b>0.3</b>            | <b>\$52.50</b>     |
| <b>Total</b>                               | <b>\$124.88</b>     | <b>80.4</b>           | <b>\$10,040.70</b> |

---

\*CCG, Inc. will voluntarily adjust the fees sought with respect to Fee Application Preparation on a quarterly basis, as necessary, in compliance with applicable precedent.

**Exhibit B**  
**To June 2013 Monthly Fee Statement**

**Summary of Fees by Timekeeper**

**SUMMARY OF FEES BY TIMEKEEPER**

Patriot Coal Corporation, *et al.*  
(June 1, 2013 - June 30, 2013)

**1. Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation**

| <b>NAME</b>  | <b>SENIORITY</b>   | <b>BILLING RATE</b> | <b>HOURS</b> | <b>TOTAL DOLLAR VALUE</b> |
|--|--------------------|---------------------|--------------|---------------------------|
| Gargan, Kimberly                                     | Project Manager    | \$122.00            | 54.1         | \$6,600.20                |
| Moodie, Alison                                       | Project Supervisor | \$77.00             | 2.9          | \$223.30                  |
| <b>Total Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation</b> |                    |                     | <b>57.0</b>  | <b>\$6,823.50</b>         |

**2. Fee Application Preparation**

| <b>NAME</b>                              | <b>SENIORITY</b>                | <b>BILLING RATE</b> | <b>HOURS</b> | <b>TOTAL DOLLAR VALUE</b> |
|--|---------------------------------|---------------------|--------------|---------------------------|
| Vrato, Elizabeth                         | Ass't Director, Bankruptcy      | \$200.00            | 2.2          | \$440.00                  |
| Granger, Lauren                          | Sr. Project Manager, Bankruptcy | \$175.00            | 2.8          | \$490.00                  |
| Nadick, Ryan                             | Sr. Project Manager, Bankruptcy | \$175.00            | 0.5          | \$87.50                   |
| Golenberg, Jesse                         | Bankruptcy Consultant II        | \$122.00            | 10.9         | \$1,329.80                |
| Grover, Kevin                            | Project Manager, Bankruptcy     | \$122.00            | 6.7          | \$817.40                  |
| <b>Total Fee Application Preparation</b> |                                 |                     | <b>23.1</b>  | <b>\$3,164.70</b>         |

3. Schedules/SoFAs/Other Schedules

| <b>NAME</b>                                  | <b>SENIORITY</b>                | <b>BILLING<br/>RATE</b> | <b>HOURS</b> | <b>TOTAL<br/>DOLLAR<br/>VALUE</b> |
|--|---------------------------------|-------------------------|--------------|-----------------------------------|
| Nadick, Ryan                                 | Sr. Project Manager, Bankruptcy | \$175.00                | 0.3          | \$52.50                           |
| <b>Total Schedules/SoFAs/Other Schedules</b> |                                 |                         | <b>0.3</b>   | <b>\$52.50</b>                    |

**Exhibit C**  
**To June 2013 Monthly Fee Statement**  
**Time Detail**



Time Detail Exhibit

| Date     | Time Elapsed | Name             | Activity                                | Billing Amount | Description  |
|----------|--------------|------------------|---|----------------|--|
| 6/3/2013 | 2.2          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$268.40       | Reviewed updated settlement agreements provided by AP (.4); updated allowed amounts of claims affected by settlements (.6); updated disallowed amounts of claims affected by settlement letters (.3); discussions with counsel re: exhibits for upcoming omnibus objections (.3); discussions with case team re: potential filed and scheduled claim splits per matching (.4); created insufficient documentation exhibit for counsel (.2).  |
| 6/4/2013 | 5.2          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$634.40       | Reviewed paid/satisfied spreadsheet for upcoming objection from AP to ensure all information was accurate (.3); updated proposed reconciliation for all records re same (.3); generated exhibit for paid satisfied parties for objection (.4); generated exhibit for insufficient documentation parties for upcoming omnibus objection (.4); created exhibit for bondholder exhibit for upcoming objection (.4); generated updated exhibit for books & records objections for modify amount (.3), generated updated exhibit for books/records objections for priority and amount(.3), generated updated exhibit for books/records objections for wrong debtor(.2), generated updated exhibit for books/records objections for modify priority (.3); forwarded exhibits to counsel for review/comments (.2); reviewed draft 5th omnibus from counsel re: books and records (.2); updated new breakdown of claims per objection (new exhibit classifications created) (.4); updated reconciliation for modify debtor/reclassify claims (.3); generated new exhibits for all books and records omnibus objections (.7); created exhibit for claims against non-debtor entities after review of spreadsheet re same (.3); forwarded exhibits to counsel for review (.2). |
| 6/5/2013 | 1.3          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$158.60       | Attended call with AP re: settlement letter updates to be posted to FTP for update (.3); updated exhibits relating to 9 B&R omnibus objections, forwarded to counsel for review (.6); discussions with AP regarding split filed/partial transfer scheduled claims and claims matching relating to same (.4).   |

Time Detail Exhibit

| Date     | Time Elapsed | Name             | Activity                                | Billing Amount | Description  |
|----------|--------------|------------------|---|----------------|--|
| 6/6/2013 | 5.3          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$646.60       | Communicated with Bryan Cave regarding naming convention of exhibits (.2); updated all B&R exhibits with comments from counsel (.4); reviewed AP "satisfied" scheduled records against GCG records to determine if there were settlements AP had as resolved(.6); discussions with D. Patel re: outstanding settlements re: same (.2); reviewed for accuracy all exhibits re exhibits received missing settlements from AP(.3); followed-up with D. Patel re outstanding exhibit information for update purposes (.2); coordinated with A. Moodie to update remaining complete settlements (.3); attached images of settlements to affected claims (.3); discussions with J. Clarey re: additional books and records objection parties received (.2); reviewed objections spreadsheet for accuracy of information (.3); coordinated with systems/QA to populate claims with proposed amounts/proposed debtors (.5); separated claimants affected by exhibits for B&R objection for reconciliation purposes (.2); generated new exhibits based on addition of B&R zero value claims (.6); follow-up with counsel and AP re: B&R objections (.2); reviewed updated settlement agreements from D. Patel at Alixpartners (.2); updated database with allowed/disallowed amounts/debtors (.3); coordinated with I. Finklestein on updates to exhibit generator tool (.3). |
| 6/7/2013 | 3.6          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$439.20       | Reviewed updates to bondholder exhibit as provided by AlixPartners (.3); generated updated exhibit for bondholder exhibit for upcoming omnibus objection (.3); generated updated exhibits for books & records objections for wrong debtor/wrong priority claims (.5); forwarded exhibits to counsel for review/comments (.2); reviewed draft 6th omnibus customized notice form from counsel re: insufficient documentation (.2); updated reconciliation for B&R omnibus claimants per objection data received from J. Clarey (.4); per counsel's request, generated exhibits for all parties affected by books and records omnibus objections (.7); forwarded exhibits to counsel for review (.2); reviewed updated settlement agreements provided by D. Patel for accuracy of claim information (.4); prepared database for updates relating to allowed amounts/debtors re same (.2); followed-up with case team re: data (.2).  |

Time Detail Exhibit

| Date      | Time Elapsed | Name             | Activity                                | Billing Amount | Description  |
|-----------|--------------|------------------|---|----------------|--|
| 6/10/2013 | 5.3          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$646.60       | Per discussions with B. Walsh at Bryan cave, updated format of Exhibit F (modify priority/amount) (.3); updated order of exhibit relating to B&R exhibit G (wrong debtor/amount/priority) for B. Walsh (.3); removed parties from potential 6th omni objection motion (insufficient documents) (.2); generated new exhibit for counsel (.2); reviewed supplementation batch 3 and 4 settlements provided by AP (.4); reviewed allowed claims against settlement letters (.4); coordinated with systems to update allowed amounts for allowed filed/scheduled claims (.5); worked with systems to update allowed debtors for all claims listed as allowed in settlements (.3); updated disallowed amounts for schedules listed on Ex A of settlement letters (separating out schedules attached to filed claims) (.6); updated reconciliation for all claims affected for website claims register (.3); reviewed split claims to be created (.2); created new database records for split claims (.4); assigned images for original claim to newly created split records (.5); updated allowed amounts/debtors for each split claim along with the original claim number (.6); assigned settlement images to records (.1). |
| 6/11/2013 | 1.0          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$122.00       | Reviewed updated zero liability exhibits from AlixPartners and Bryan Cave (.3); removed parties no longer being objected to (.2); generated new exhibit for counsel/AP review (.3); inserted explanations for zero liability objection per Bryan Cave data (.2).   |
| 6/12/2013 | 1.1          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$134.20       | Updated books & record exhibit (wrong debtor/modify amount/modify priority) for AP (.3); reviewed data relating to employee no liability MPR claims provided by AlixPartners for accuracy (.3); entered no liability reconciliation into claims database for exhibit generation (.4); sent to client for review (.1).  |
| 6/13/2013 | 0.7          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$85.40        | Updated books and records zero liability exhibit per information provided by AP (.3); sent to AP/Bryan Cave for review (.1); updated books and records wrong amount exhibit per information provided by AP (.2); sent to AP/Bryan cave to review (.1).   |

Time Detail Exhibit

| Date      | Time Elapsed | Name             | Activity                                | Billing Amount | Description  |
|-----------|--------------|------------------|---|----------------|--|
| 6/14/2013 | 6.5          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$793.00       | Reviewed data relating to books & records omnibus objection updates provided by AP (.6); updated reconciliation for zero liability re same (.3); created new zero liability exhibit for Bryan cave/AP review (.3); reviewed data relating to modified amount updates for affected claimants provided by AP (.3); updated reconciliation for modified amount claimants (.3); created updated modified amount exhibit for Bryan cave/AP review (.2); updated reconciliation for zero liability re same (.3); created new zero liability exhibit for Bryan cave/AP review (.3); removed reconciliation for books & records parties no longer affected by upcoming omnibus objection (as settlement agreements were signed/returned) (.4); reviewed new data from AP re: new upcoming omnibus objection for amended/superseded claims (.4); updated reconciliation in database for amended claimants re same (.3); listed surviving claims (for exhibit) of amended/expunged claimants (.3); created amended/superseded exhibit for Bryan cave/AP review (.2); added parties who have numerous surviving claims (.2); reviewed new data from AP re: new upcoming omnibus objection for duplicative claims (.3); updated reconciliation in database for amended claimants re same (.2); listed surviving claims (for exhibit) of duplicative/expunged claimants (.2); created amended/superseded exhibit for Bryan cave/AP review (.2); added parties who have numerous surviving claims to same (.2); reviewed data provided by AP re: employee/no liability claims for potential DPW claims objection (.3); followed-up with counsel re: objection format (.2); updated bondholder reconciliation per discussions with AP/Bryan cave (.3); generated updated exhibit re same for counsels review (.2); removed certain claimants from omnibus objection per settlements rec'd from AP (.3); generated updated exhibit for counsel's review re: same (.3). |

Time Detail Exhibit

| Date      | Time Elapsed | Name             | Activity                                | Billing Amount | Description  |
|-----------|--------------|------------------|---|----------------|--|
| 6/17/2013 | 2.7          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$329.40       | Manually updated explanation column for parties added to the zero liability exhibit per counsels instructions (.3); moved claimants from modify amount exhibit to zero liability per APs request (.3); followed-up with AP re same (.2); reviewed updated claimant data provided by AP re: duplicative claims objection (.2); generated updated duplicative omnibus objection exhibit for counsel (.2); communications with Bryan Cave, AP, DPW re: certain claimants listed as zero liability (.3); generated amended/superseded claims objection exhibit (.2); generated updated modified debtor/reclassification exhibit (.3); reviewed email from Bryan Cave with parties to remove from the bondholder exhibit (.2); removed bondholder reconciliation for non-bondholder claimants re: same (.3); generated updated bondholder exhibit for counsel re: same(.2).   |
| 6/18/2013 | 3.1          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$378.20       | Discussions with AP/DPW re: updates to B&R no liability claims (Employee-MPR) (.2); updated claimants reconciliation to reflect the possible upcoming objections(.3); generated updated C-2 exhibit to reflect potential expungement of MPR claimants(.3); manually updated exhibit with "explanation column" to state (by docket number) why the claim will be expunged (.3); reviewed new no liability data from AP(.3); followed-up with case team re same (.1); discussions with Bryan Cave, AP, DPW re: personal injury claimants listed as zero liability (.3); generated amended/superseded claims objection exhibit (.3); forwarded to BW for review (.1); call with D. Patel to discuss reduced objection parties being moved to zero liability (.3); updated reconciliation on claimants re same (.2); generated updated exhibit for duplicate claim parties (.3); followed-up with Bryan Cave re same (.1). |

Time Detail Exhibit

| Date      | Time Elapsed | Name             | Activity                                | Billing Amount | Description  |
|-----------|--------------|------------------|---|----------------|--|
| 6/19/2013 | 6.9          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$841.80       | Entered expungement reconciliation for claimants affected by the Order granting the 4th omnibus objection to claims (.4); entered expungement reconciliation for claimants affected by the Order granting the 3rd omnibus objection to claims (.4); entered adjournment information for claimants adjourned per the 3rd omnibus objection to July 23, 2013 (.3); reviewed updated data from AP regarding books & records updates for claims (.3); updated proposed reconciliation in the database for newly affected creditors (.3); removed personal injury claimants from zero liability objection (.4); call with D. Patel to discuss "reduced to 0" claim category for zero liability claims (.3); updated explanation column for each party added to the zero liability exhibit per case procedures order (.4); generated updated modified debtor exhibit (.3); generated updated modified amount exhibit (.3); generated updated modified classification exhibit (.2); generated updated modified debtor/amount exhibit (.3); generated updated modified debtor/reclassification exhibit (.3); generated updated modified debtor/classification/amount exhibit (.4); forwarded exhibits to counsel for review (.1); call with D. Patel to discuss movement of certain claims from duplicative to zero liability exhibit (.2); updated reconciliation for claimants re same (.2); generated updated duplicative omnibus objection exhibit for counsel (.2); removed certain claimants from amended/superseded claims objections (parties who have signed a settlement) (.2); generated updated exhibit re same (.2); generated updated beneficial bondholder exhibit (.3); forwarded exhibits to counsel for review (.1); discussions with Bryan Cave and AP re: explanation detail for zero liability records (.2); updated exhibit with new language re: conversations (.2); moved claimants from modify amount exhibit to zero liability per APs request (.4); followed-up with AP re same (.2). |
| 6/20/2013 | 1.4          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$170.80       | Reviewed updated zero liability explanations for exhibit provided by Bryan Cave (.3); removed claimants from the objection per direction from B. Walsh (.3); updated explanation information on zero liability exhibit per update provided by B. Walsh (.2); altered objection for certain claim from reduce to reclassify objection (.2); generated updated reclassification exhibit (.2); generated updated reduced objection exhibit (.2).  |

Time Detail Exhibit

| Date      | Time Elapsed | Name             | Activity                                | Billing Amount | Description  |
|-----------|--------------|------------------|---|----------------|--|
| 6/21/2013 | 1.0          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$122.00       | Updated reconciliation details for Docket No. 4181 in the database (5th omni objection) which included link to objection on public claims register (.3); updated reconciliation details for Docket No. 4182 in the database (6th omni objection) which included link to objection on public claims register (.1); updated reconciliation details for Docket No. 4192 in the database (7th omni objection) which included link to objection on public claims register (.2); updated reconciliation details for Docket No. 4195 in the database (8th omni objection) which included link to objection on public claims register (.2); reconciliation details for Docket No. 4201 in the database (9th omni objection) which included link to objection on public claims register (.2).   |
| 6/27/2013 | 4.0          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$488.00       | Reviewed spreadsheet provided by Alixpartners of settled filed/scheduled claims to confirm the associated letter was provided for each entity (.6); reviewed allowed claims to determine if any were previously expunged per omnibus objection (.3); removed "allowed" claims from update as expunged by 2nd omnibus order (.1); followed-up with AlixPartners re same (.1); coordinated with internal systems/QA to update secured/administrative/unsecured allowed amounts of claimants allowed per settlement letters (.7); updated allowed debtors for any allowed claim with updated debtor information (.3); associated settlement letter images to appropriate allowed claim records for website claims register (.3); compared disallowed filed/scheduled claims against exhibit for accuracy(.7); updated register to disallow scheduled/filed claims pursuant to settlement letters received (.6); associated settlement images to disallowed claims re: same (.5); reviewed data provided by AP for customized objection to CSE Corporation (.3); updated proposed amounts for exhibit generation re: same (.3); followed-up with Bryan Cave/AP to discuss mailing procedures relating to individual objections (.1). |

Time Detail Exhibit

| Date      | Time Elapsed | Name             | Activity                                | Billing Amount | Description   |
|-----------|--------------|------------------|---|----------------|---|
| 6/28/2013 | 2.8          | Gargan, Kimberly | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$341.60       | Reviewed batch 5 settlement agreement pdfs provided by AP to determine if both disallowed/allowed claims exhibits were listed in each agreement (.4); updated allowed amounts for claimants per partial transfer agreement settlements (.8); updated disallowed amounts for claimants per partial transfer agreement settlements (.7); emailed AP to discuss missing exhibits from settlement letters(.2); generated a split claim for claim 59 (A/B/C) pursuant to settlement agreement returned to AP (.4); associated settlement images to affected scheduled/filed claim database records (.3). |
| 6/26/2013 | 0.8          | Moodie, Alison   | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$61.60        | Responded to AlixPartners re updating claim record (.1); updated claim record to reflect settlement agreement (.2); reviewed claim withdrawal for accuracy(.2); reviewed claim settlements for accuracy (.3).   |
| 6/27/2013 | 2.1          | Moodie, Alison   | Claims Analysis/Advanced Reconciliation | \$161.70       | Conferred w/ K. Gargan re executed settlements in FTP site (.3); updated claim register to reflect executed settlement agreements (.9); created spilt claims to associate with primary claims(.9).  |
| 6/11/2013 | 1.2          | Golenberg, Jesse | Fee Application Preparation             | \$146.40       | Started draft of May monthly fee statement.   |
| 6/12/2013 | 1.1          | Golenberg, Jesse | Fee Application Preparation             | \$134.20       | Drafted Monthly Fee statement for May 2013.   |
| 6/13/2013 | 1.3          | Golenberg, Jesse | Fee Application Preparation             | \$158.60       | Continued to draft/edit monthly fee statement for May 2013.   |
| 6/14/2013 | 1.1          | Golenberg, Jesse | Fee Application Preparation             | \$134.20       | Compiled exhibits for Monthly fee statement for May 2013.   |
| 6/17/2013 | 2.9          | Golenberg, Jesse | Fee Application Preparation             | \$353.80       | Continued to draft/revise monthly fee statement including exhibits.   |
| 6/18/2013 | 1.8          | Golenberg, Jesse | Fee Application Preparation             | \$219.60       | Finalized monthly fee statement for May 2013.   |
| 6/19/2013 | 0.9          | Golenberg, Jesse | Fee Application Preparation             | \$109.80       | Made additional final edits/revisions to monthly fee statement for May 2013.  |
| 6/20/2013 | 0.6          | Golenberg, Jesse | Fee Application Preparation             | \$73.20        | Final review/submission of Monthly fee applications for May 2013.   |
| 6/4/2013  | 1.1          | Granger, Lauren  | Fee Application Preparation             | \$192.50       | Discussions with billing and fee app team re invoices and per monthly fee statement.  |
| 6/6/2013  | 0.2          | Granger, Lauren  | Fee Application Preparation             | \$35.00        | Data preparation for monthly fee statement.   |
| 6/10/2013 | 0.3          | Granger, Lauren  | Fee Application Preparation             | \$52.50        | Calculated amounts due for May fee statement.   |
| 6/11/2013 | 0.4          | Granger, Lauren  | Fee Application Preparation             | \$70.00        | Reviewed initial draft of monthly fee statement.  |
| 6/12/2013 | 0.4          | Granger, Lauren  | Fee Application Preparation             | \$70.00        | Communications with internal fee application team re May fee statement revisions.   |
| 6/19/2013 | 0.2          | Granger, Lauren  | Fee Application Preparation             | \$35.00        | Communications with fee application team re billing totals for monthly fee statement.   |
| 6/20/2013 | 0.2          | Granger, Lauren  | Fee Application Preparation             | \$35.00        | Discussions with fee application team re updates to billing team.   |
| 6/3/2013  | 0.1          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation             | \$12.20        | Reviewed status of case fee chart for may fee activity.   |



Time Detail Exhibit

| Date                         | Time Elapsed | Name             | Activity                        | Billing Amount     | Description   |
|------------------------------|--------------|------------------|---------------------------------|--------------------|---|
| 6/6/2013                     | 0.8          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$97.60            | Pulled timekeeping report for May fee statement (.3); researched filed applications and entered orders through end of May for updates to fee statement (.5).                                    |
| 6/7/2013                     | 0.3          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$36.60            | Updated fee statement expenses.   |
| 6/10/2013                    | 0.7          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$85.40            | Additional fee statement expense backup review.   |
| 6/11/2013                    | 1.0          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$122.00           | Ran timekeeper verification tool on May entries for accuracy(.4); updated status of June timeline for all team activity and plotted critical path to monthly statement filing date (.6).        |
| 6/13/2013                    | 0.5          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$61.00            | Reviewed and allocated expenses for May monthly statement (.4); Fee Application Team status review on monthly fee statement meeting (.1).   |
| 6/14/2013                    | 0.3          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$36.60            | Fee Application Team status review on monthly fee statement meeting (.2); updated timeline for status of timekeeping and expense exhibits for monthly fee statement (.1).                       |
| 6/17/2013                    | 0.5          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$61.00            | Pulled timekeeping report for monthly statement (.4); requested modifications of header on exhibit (.1).  |
| 6/18/2013                    | 0.6          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$73.20            | Assembled documents into final PDF of monthly statement for review by case team (.3); prepared timing chart updates and participated in fee application team meeting re May fee statement (.3). |
| 6/19/2013                    | 1.5          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$183.00           | Edited exhibit for timekeeping detail for May fee statement.  |
| 6/26/2013                    | 0.2          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$24.40            | Led fee application team meeting discussion of status and monthly fee statement.  |
| 6/28/2013                    | 0.2          | Grover, Kevin    | Fee Application Preparation     | \$24.40            | Meeting with fee application team to discuss status of June monthly deliverable (May monthly fee statement).  |
| 6/19/2013                    | 0.5          | Nadick, Ryan     | Fee Application Preparation     | \$87.50            | Reviewed May monthly fee statement (.3); revised same (.2).   |
| 6/12/2013                    | 0.2          | Vrato, Elizabeth | Fee Application Preparation     | \$40.00            | Communications/document review regarding preparation of monthly fee statement.  |
| 6/13/2013                    | 0.2          | Vrato, Elizabeth | Fee Application Preparation     | \$40.00            | Additional document review regarding preparation of monthly fee statement.  |
| 6/14/2013                    | 0.2          | Vrato, Elizabeth | Fee Application Preparation     | \$40.00            | Further review of monthly fee statement.  |
| 6/17/2013                    | 0.3          | Vrato, Elizabeth | Fee Application Preparation     | \$60.00            | Reviewed documents for monthly statement.   |
| 6/18/2013                    | 0.4          | Vrato, Elizabeth | Fee Application Preparation     | \$80.00            | Reviewed supporting documents for monthly fee statement.  |
| 6/19/2013                    | 0.6          | Vrato, Elizabeth | Fee Application Preparation     | \$120.00           | Reviewed supporting documents for monthly statement.  |
| 6/20/2013                    | 0.3          | Vrato, Elizabeth | Fee Application Preparation     | \$60.00            | Reviewed monthly statement for accuracy.  |
| 6/3/2013                     | 0.3          | Nadick, Ryan     | Schedules/SoFAs/Other Schedules | \$52.50            | Coordinated filing of amended schedules with counsel.   |
| <b>Total Billing Amount:</b> |              |                  |                                 | <b>\$10,040.70</b> |   |

**Exhibit D**  
**To June 2013 Monthly Fee Statement**  
**Actual and Necessary Expenses**

**Patriot Coal Corporation, et al.,**  
Expenses  
(June 1, 2013 - June 30, 2013)

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Description</b>       | <b>Timekeeper</b> | <b>Amount</b>   |
|-------------|--------------------------|-------------------|-----------------|
| 6/19/2013   | Overtime Meal - CJE Café | K. Gargan         | \$ 14.26        |
|             | <b>Total</b>             |                   | <b>\$ 14.26</b> |