

JACKSON KELLY PLLC
500 Lee Street East, Suite 1600 (25301)
Post Office Box 553
Charleston, West Virginia 25322
Telephone: (304) 340-1000
Facsimile: (304) 340-1050
Michael T. Cimino
William F. Dobbs, Jr.
Elizabeth A. Amandus
*Special Counsel to the Debtors
and Debtors in Possession*

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI**

In re:

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, et al.,

Debtors.

**Chapter 11
Case No. 12-51502
(Jointly Administered)**

**FIFTEENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF JACKSON KELLY PLLC FOR
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF
OCTOBER 1, 2013 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2013**

NAME OF APPLICANT:	Jackson Kelly PLLC
ROLE IN THE CASE:	Special Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors- in-possession
TIME PERIOD:	October 1, 2013 through and including October 31, 2013
CURRENT APPLICATION:	Total Fees Requested: \$151,834.40 80% of Fees Requested: \$121,467.52 Total Expenses Requested: \$4,386.59

1. On July 9, 2012 (the “Petition Date”), Patriot Coal Corporation and substantially all of its affiliated subsidiary companies (“Initial Debtors”) filed voluntary petitions for Chapter 11 Relief. [See ECF No. 1]. Subsequently, Brody Mining, LLC and Patriot Ventures LLC (together, the “New Debtors,” and with the Initial Debtors, the “Debtors”¹) each commenced its chapter 11 case by filing a petition for voluntary relief with this Court on September 23, 2013. The Initial Debtors’ cases are being jointly administered pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b) and the Joint Administrative Order entered on July 10, 2012 [ECF No. 30], and the New Debtors’ cases are being jointly administered with the Initial Debtors’ cases pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b) and the Order Directing Joint Administration of Chapter 11 Cases entered by the Court on September 27, 2013 in each of the New Debtors’ chapter 11 cases.

2. Prior to the Petition Date, Jackson Kelly PLLC (“Jackson Kelly”) rendered substantial legal services to Debtors in a wide range of areas. Debtors have retained Jackson Kelly – with the Court’s authorization by its September 10, 2012, *Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Jackson Kelly PLLC as Special Counsel for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date* [ECF No. 540] (the “Jackson Kelly Employment Order”) – *nunc pro tunc* from the Petition Date to continue to render professional services in connection with (collectively the “Authorized Representation”):

(a) Environmental matters relating to the Debtors’ coal leases, coal property, mines and other properties and installations;

(b) Mine safety and health matters, including alleged violations of the Mine Safety and Health Act;

¹ The Initial Debtors are listed on Schedule 1, attached hereto. The employer tax identification numbers and addresses for each of the Debtors are set forth in the Debtors’ chapter 11 petitions.

- (c) The defense of Federal Black Lung cases;
- (d) The defense of West Virginia deliberate intent litigation;
- (e) Litigation on behalf of one or more of the Debtors as a party plaintiff;
- (f) Litigation on behalf of one or more of the Debtors as a party defendant;
- (g) Local real estate and commercial transactions, as needed from time to time,

which may not duplicate services provided by the Debtors' other counsel;

- (h) Local legislative and lobbying services; and
- (i) Representation of one or more of the debtors in arbitration issues.

3. The Court's December 5, 2012, *Order Authorizing the Payment for Certain Services on a Fixed Fee Basis to Jackson Kelly PLLC* [ECF 1677] (the "Fixed Fee Order"), amended the Jackson Kelly Employment Order to provide for fixed fee billing for local legislative and lobbying services at a rate of \$2,500 per month *nunc pro tunc* to the Petition Date.

4. The Court's October 25, 2013, *Order Granting in Part Debtors' Omnibus Application to Expand Retention of Professionals to Include New Debtors* [ECF 4865] (the "Expansion Order") expanded the employment of Approved Firms, including Jackson Kelly, to encompass representation of New Debtors, Brody Mining, LLC and Patriot Ventures LLC.

5. In accordance with the Jackson Kelly Employment Order (as amended and expanded) and the *Order to Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jackson Kelly, as special counsel to the Debtors, hereby submits its Fifteenth Monthly Fee Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the "Fee Statement") for the period October 1, 2013 through and including October 31, 2013 (the "Fee Statement Period").²

² Also included in this Fee Statement are fees totaling \$14,511.70 relating to time spent by Jackson Kelly personnel working on a new file on behalf of Patriot Coal Corporation during the months of August (1.3 hours,

6. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Jackson Kelly seeks payment of \$125,854.11 representing (a) 80% of Jackson Kelly's fees for services rendered (\$121,467.52) and (b) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Fee Statement Period (\$4,386.59).

7. Exhibit A is a listing of Jackson Kelly's professional and paraprofessionals (collectively the "Jackson Kelly Professional(s)") that rendered services for Debtors under the Jackson Kelly Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period. Exhibit A includes, among other things, the total hours billed, hourly rate and total fees for each Jackson Kelly Professional, plus a blended hourly rate for each category of Jackson Kelly Professionals, excluding paralegals.

8. Exhibit B is a schedule summarizing the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Jackson Kelly seeks reimbursement, and the total amount for each expense category.

9. Exhibit C is a summary of the hours and amounts billed by Jackson Kelly during the Fee Statement period for its Authorized Representation of the Debtors during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project type authorized by the Jackson Kelly Employment Order.

10. Exhibit D provides the time records relating to Jackson Kelly's Authorized Representation of the Debtors, including summaries of the time spent by each Jackson Kelly Professional during the Fee Statement Period organized by project category.

totaling \$343.20) and September (49.4 hours, totaling \$14,168.50). These fees were inadvertently classified under an incorrect client number and, thus, were omitted from Jackson Kelly's Thirteenth and Fourteenth Fee Statements.

11. The undersigned certifying professional hereby certifies and represents (i) that she has read this Fifteenth Fee Statement; (ii) that to the best of her knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees and disbursements requested herein fall within the Court's guidelines and those of the United States Trustee; (iii) that the fees and disbursements sought herein are billed at rates in accordance with Jackson Kelly's customary practices and generally accepted by its clients; and (iv) that in providing reimbursable services, Jackson Kelly does not make a profit on the services.

Notice

12. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, Jackson Kelly will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, Esq.; (ii) attorneys for the Debtors, Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP, 450 Lexington Avenue, New York, New York 10017, Attn: Marshall S. Huebner, Esq. and Brian M. Resnick, Esq.; (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Missouri, 111 South 10th Street, Suite 6.353, St. Louis, Missouri 63102-1125, Attn: Leonora S. Long; (iv) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein, Esq. and Joseph Smolinsky, Esq., and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz, Esq. and Ana Alfonso, Esq.; and (v) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq.

13. WHEREFORE, Jackson Kelly respectfully requests that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: November 19, 2013

Respectfully submitted,

JACKSON KELLY PLLC

/s/ Elizabeth A. Amandus

William F. Dobbs, Jr. (WV Bar No. 1027)

Michael T. Cimino (WV Bar No. 6094)

Elizabeth A. Amandus (WV Bar No. 11062)

JACKSON KELLY PLLC

500 Lee Street East, Suite 1600 (25301)

Post Office Box 553

Charleston, West Virginia 25322

Telephone (304) 340-1280

Facsimile (304) 340-1080

*Special Counsel to Debtors and
Debtors in Possession*

SCHEDULE 1
(Debtor Entities)

1. Affinity Mining Company
2. Apogee Coal Company, LLC
3. Appalachia Mine Services, LLC
4. Beaver Dam Coal Company, LLC
5. Big Eagle, LLC
6. Big Eagle Rail, LLC
7. Black Stallion Coal Company, LLC
8. Black Walnut Coal Company
9. Bluegrass Mine Services, LLC
10. Brook Trout Coal, LLC
11. Catenary Coal Company, LLC
12. Central States Coal Reserves of Kentucky, LLC
13. Charles Coal Company, LLC
14. Cleaton Coal Company
15. Coal Clean LLC
16. Coal Properties, LLC
17. Coal Reserve Holding Limited Liability Company No. 2
18. Colony Bay Coal Company
19. Cook Mountain Coal Company, LLC
20. Corydon Resources LLC
21. Coventry Mining Services, LLC
22. Coyote Coal Company LLC
23. Cub Branch Coal Company LLC
24. Dakota LLC
25. Day LLC
26. Dixon Mining Company, LLC
27. Dodge Hill Holding JV, LLC
28. Dodge Hill Mining Company, LLC
29. Dodge Hill of Kentucky, LLC
30. EACC Camps, Inc.
31. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC
32. Eastern Coal Company, LLC
33. Eastern Royalty, LLC
34. Emerald Processing, L.L.C.
35. Gateway Eagle Coal Company, LLC
36. Grand Eagle Mining, LLC
37. Heritage Coal Company LLC
38. Highland Mining Company, LLC
39. Hillside Mining Company
40. Hobet Mining, LLC
41. Indian Hill Company LLC
42. Infinity Coal Sales, LLC
43. Interior Holdings, LLC
44. IO Coal LLC
45. Jarrell's Branch Coal Company
46. Jupiter Holdings LLC
47. Kanawha Eagle Coal, LLC
48. Kanawha River Ventures I, LLC
49. Kanawha River Ventures II, LLC
50. Kanawha River Ventures III, LLC
51. KE Ventures, LLC
52. Little Creek LLC
53. Logan Fork Coal Company
54. Magnum Coal Company LLC
55. Magnum Coal Sales LLC
56. Martinka Coal Company, LLC
57. Midland Trail Energy LLC
58. Midwest Coal Resources II, LLC
59. Mountain View Coal Company, LLC
60. New Trout Coal Holdings II, LLC
61. Newtown Energy, Inc.
62. North Page Coal Corp.
63. Ohio County Coal Company, LLC
64. Panther LLC
65. Patriot Beaver Dam Holdings, LLC
66. Patriot Coal Company, L.P.
67. Patriot Coal Corporation
68. Patriot Coal Sales LLC
69. Patriot Coal Services LLC
70. Patriot Leasing Company LLC
71. Patriot Midwest Holdings, LLC
72. Patriot Reserve Holdings, LLC
73. Patriot Trading LLC
74. PCX Enterprises, Inc.
75. Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC
76. Pond Creek Land Resources, LLC
77. Pond Fork Processing LLC
78. Remington Holdings LLC
79. Remington II LLC
80. Remington LLC
81. Rivers Edge Mining, Inc.
82. Robin Land Company, LLC
83. Sentry Mining, LLC
84. Snowberry Land Company
85. Speed Mining LLC
86. Sterling Smokeless Coal Company, LLC
87. TC Sales Company, LLC
88. The Presidents Energy Company LLC
89. Thunderhill Coal LLC
90. Trout Coal Holdings, LLC
91. Union County Coal Co., LLC
92. Viper LLC
93. Weatherby Processing LLC
94. Wildcat Energy LLC
95. Wildcat, LLC
96. Will Scarlet Properties LLC
97. Winchester LLC
98. Winifrede Dock Limited Liability Company
99. Yankeetown Dock, LLC

Exhibit A

I.A. Partners/Counsel

NAME OF PARTNER / COUNSEL	YEAR ADMITTED	MATTER AREA OF LAW	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Adkins, Wendy G.	2003-WV	Deliberate Intent Litigation	2.60	\$187.00	\$486.20
Anderson, Jon L.	2004-WV	Safety and Health	4.50	\$295.00	\$1,327.50
Brumley, Christina T.	1998-WV	Commercial	19.10	\$264.00	\$5,042.40
Cappellanti, Ellen S.	1980-WV	Commercial	20.40	\$370.00	\$7,548.00
Cimino, Michael T.	1993-WV	Safety and Health	82.50	\$234.72	\$19,364.00
Dobbs, Jr., William F.	1973-WV	Bankruptcy, Commercial	0.80	\$370.00	\$296.00
Gardner, Blair M.	2001-WV, 1977-PA	Environmental	1.20	\$264.00	\$316.80
Harman, Ashley M.	1996-WV	Black Lung	29.70	\$225.00	\$6,682.50
Huffman, Timothy E.	1980-WV	1980-WV	7.80	\$340.00	\$2,652.00
Loeb, Jr., Charles W.	1982-WV	Commercial	1.60	\$276.00	\$441.60
Mattingly, William S.	1993-PA, 1987-WV, 1985-OH	Black Lung	0.70	\$276.00	\$193.20
McFarland, Benjamin M.	2005-WV	Safety and Health	97.70	\$175.00	\$17,097.50
McLusky, Robert G.	1981-WV	Environmental	1.60	\$306.00	\$489.60
Moore, R. H.	1976-PA	Safety and Health	22.80	\$265.00	\$6,042.00
Oakley, Kenneth B.	2005-KY	Safety and Health	1.70	\$175.00	\$297.50
Rembrandt, Ann B.	1987-WV	Black Lung	0.30	\$234.00	\$70.20

Sebok, Al F.	1985-WV	Safety and Health	27.40	\$360.00	\$9,864.00
Snyder, Kathy L.	1998-PA, 1992-WV	Black Lung	0.40	\$234.00	\$93.60
Southworth, Louis S.	1968-WV	Legislation	Flat Fee		\$2,500.00
Tweel, Robert G.	1994-WV, 1994-TN	Commercial	1.80	\$330.00	\$594.00
White, Kristin R.	2001-CO	Safety and Health	0.80	\$355.00	\$284.00
Total Partners and Counsel			325.40		\$81,682.60

II.A. Associates

NAME OF ASSOCIATE	YEAR ADMITTED	MATTER AREA OF LAW	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Amandus, Elizabeth A.	2009-WV	Bankruptcy	9.30	\$235.00	\$2,185.50
Dennison, Patrick W.	2011-PA, 2010-FL	Safety and Health	1.90	\$215.00	\$408.50
Ferguson, Amanda E.	2012-CO	Safety and Health	14.00	\$195.00	\$2,730.00
Gillen, Kevin T.	2011-WV	Black Lung	0.20	\$190.00	\$38.00
Holley, Amy J.	2010-WV	Black Lung	37.40	\$250.00	\$9,350.00
Holley, Amy J.	2010-WV	Black Lung	9.30	\$153.00	\$1,422.90
Imbrogno, Felicia Phipps	2010-WV	Commercial	3.40	\$225.00	\$765.00
Jurasko, Jessica M	2004-PA	Safety and Health	34.10	\$225.00	\$7,672.50
Presley, Nicklaus A.	2013-WV	Commercial	4.50	\$190.00	\$855.00
Schwendeman, Adam	2012-WV	Safety and Health	103.90	\$200.00	\$20,780.00
Stieger, Rodney W.	2009-WV	Safety and Health	10.60	\$235.00	\$2,491.00
Tyree, Matthew S.	2009-WV	Environmental	7.90	\$215.00	\$1,698.50
Witter, Michelle	2008-CO	Safety and Health	16.70	\$240.00	\$4,008.00
Total Associates			253.20		\$54,404.90

IV.A. Paraprofessionals

NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL	YEAR ADMITTED	MATTER AREA OF LAW	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Bostic, Rebecca L.		Workers Compensation	2.80	\$125.00	\$350.00
Calhoun, KD F.		Black Lung	3.10	\$115.00	\$356.50
Colston, Leanna L.		Safety and Health	58.90	\$130.00	\$7,657.00
Forman, Chelsea		Black Lung	0.20	\$80.00	\$16.00
Gray, Diane L.		Safety and Health	2.40	\$80.00	\$192.00
Hammonds, Judy Saunders		Black Lung	0.40	\$102.00	\$40.80
Horter, Brooke M.		Commercial	4.30	\$160.00	\$688.00
Lilly, April		Commercial	8.70	\$145.00	\$1,261.50
Manchas, Penny L.		Black Lung	7.70	\$98.00	\$754.60
Mitchell, Janet L.		Black Lung	0.40	\$102.00	\$40.80
Nichols, Karen		Commercial	1.30	\$145.00	\$188.50
O'Neil, Anna M.		Safety and Health	19.60	\$130.00	\$2,548.00
Roehl, Charles A.		Environmental	0.90	\$111.00	\$99.90
Sigley, Marisa L.		Black Lung	0.40	\$102.00	\$40.80
Smith, Delores D.		Black Lung	0.80	\$125.00	\$100.00
Wilson, Lisa F.		Black Lung	2.20	\$125.00	\$275.00

Zalewski, Larry A.		Safety and Health	9.10	\$125.00	\$1,137.50
Total Paraprofessionals			123.20		\$15,746.90

Attorney Blended Rates

RANK	ATTORNEY BLENDED RATE	TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS BILLED	TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES
Partners and Counsel	\$251.02	325.40	\$81,682.60
Associates	\$214.87	253.20	\$54,404.90
Total	\$235.20	578.60	\$136,087.50

Exhibit B

**ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES
INCURRED BY JACKSON KELLY PLLC ON
BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS IN OCTOBER 2013**

CATEGORY OF EXPENSES	AMOUNTS
Computerized Legal Research - Westlaw	\$ 1,927.03
Copies	\$ 1,435.58
Courier	\$ 4.62
Lien Searches	\$ 250.00
Long Distance Telephone	\$ 6.00
Mileage	\$ 3.36
Pacer	\$ 22.40
Special Postage	\$ 560.28
Travel	\$ 177.32
Total	\$ 4,386.59

Exhibit C

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
OCTOBER 2013 BY JACKSON KELLY PLLC
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	C/M #	HOURS	AMOUNT
1	Bankruptcy Total				9.60	\$2,296.50
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Fee Statements and Applications	20551.338	9.60	\$2,296.50
2	Black Lung Total				55.80	\$10,124.90
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Barker, Carlos; Barbara S. Barker	101398.1042	0.30	\$37.50
			Ellis, Donnie Eugene; Janice Alberta Ellis	101398.1065	1.20	\$173.50
			Hubbard, James A.	101398.1038	0.40	\$40.80
		Catenary Coal Company, LLC	Mink, Albert F.	101397.400	1.80	\$244.50
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Campbell, Carl H., Jr.	2304.389	0.20	\$16.00
			Epling, Carl R., Jr.	2304.454	38.20	\$7,381.00
			Hatfield, Halcy	2304.481	8.50	\$1,372.60
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood v. Sharples Coal Corp.	20551.333	0.20	\$25.00
			Sutphin, James E. v. Sharples Coal Corp.	20551.335	5.00	\$834.00
3	Commercial Total				65.60	\$17,569.00
		Patriot Coal Corporation	RWMV, LLC Membership Sale of Interest	20551.342	65.60	\$17,569.00
4	Deliberate Intent Litigation Total				2.60	\$486.20
		Patriot Coal Corporation	John Renner; et al v. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC; Patriot Coal Corporation; et al	20551.326	2.60	\$486.20
5	Environmental Total				11.60	\$2,604.80
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	OVEC, Inc. and WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc. v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC and Hobet Mining, LLC	101398.994	1.20	\$225.00
			Scott G. Mandirola, and Thomas L. Clarke v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC	101398.1030	0.30	\$79.20
		Coyote Coal Company LLC	Appeal No. 12-48-EQB Re: OVEC, WV Highlands Conservancy, and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke	21767.302	1.70	\$365.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Appeal No. 13-01-EQB Re: OVEC and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke	165.1518	2.30	\$494.50
		Hillside Mining Company	OVEC and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke; WVDEP v. Hillside Mining Company; Appeal No. 12-30-EQB	25970.301	0.30	\$64.50
		Hobet Mining, LLC	EQB Appeal No. 13-19-EQB; NPDES Permit No. WV0046701 Re: WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc.; OVEC; and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke	2304.494	2.90	\$623.50
			Hobet Valley Fill 2013 Notice of Violation	2304.493	1.60	\$489.60
			OVEC Re: Hobet 22 Temporary Restraining Order Motion	2304.462	0.60	\$112.50
		Panther, LLC	EQB Appeal No. 13-14-EQB Re: WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc.; OVEC; and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke	15445.302	0.70	\$150.50
6	Legislation Total				-	\$2,500.00
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Legislative Services	20551.302	-	\$2,500.00
7	Safety and Health Total				546.00	\$113,251.00

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	C/M #	HOURS	AMOUNT
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000215712 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2010-934	101398.1043	0.80	\$188.00
			Case No. 000248495 (Fanco); WEVA 2011-1228	101398.1044	0.40	\$94.00
			Case No. 000253903 (Guyan Mine); Citations 8117869, 8117874, 8117875 and Order No. 8130042	101398.1048	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000305365 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2013-225	101398.1072	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000317925 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2013-799	101398.1073	0.60	\$141.00
			Dozer Reporting Violation (Guyan Mine)	101398.1074	0.10	\$23.50
			James Sommerville 105(c) Discrimination Complaint	101398.1075	0.10	\$23.50
			Richard Young, Jr. Fatality (Guyan Surface Mine)	101398.1047	0.40	\$94.00
		Brody Mining LLC	110(c) Investigation; Citation Nos. 7167439, 7167441, and 7168910	19478.337	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000246005 (Brody Mine No. 1); WEVA 2011-1033	19478.323	2.80	\$602.00
			Case No. 000251217 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2011-1566; SOL No. 11-64598	19478.318	1.80	\$286.50
			Case No. 000271619 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-361	19478.317	0.30	\$58.50
			Case No. 000274401 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-463 and WEVA 2012-462	19478.316	0.50	\$84.50
			Case No. 000288738 (Brody No. 1); WEVA 2012-1208	19478.330	6.80	\$1,416.00
			Case No. 000291400 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-1340 and WEVA 2012-1339	19478.315	7.20	\$1,457.50
			Case No. 000294263 (Brody No. 1 Mine); WEVA 2012-1515	19478.325	6.60	\$1,204.50
			Case No. 000296195 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-1622; SOL No. 12-66793; Citation No. 8132634	19478.320	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000297111 (Brody No. 1 Mine); WEVA 2012-1663	19478.327	0.90	\$183.50
			Case No. 000299752 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-1772	19478.314	6.00	\$1,203.50
			Case No. 000302807 (Brody No. 1); WEVA 2013-120 and WEVA 2013-121	19478.329	0.60	\$116.50
			Case No. 000310927 (Brody Mine No. 1)	19478.310	5.40	\$838.50
			Case No. 000314409 (Brody Mine No. 1); WEVA 2013-674	19478.311	31.20	\$6,471.00
			Case No. 000319586 (Brody No. 1); WEVA 2013-908	19478.335	0.30	\$49.50
			Case No. 000321030 (No. 1 Mine); WEVA 2013-996 and WEVA 2013-997	19478.331	6.10	\$803.50
			Case No. 000323691 (Mine No. 1); WEVA 2013-1054 and WEVA 2013-1055	19478.333	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000326531 (Mine No. 1); WEVA 2013-337-R and WEVA 2013-338-R	19478.336	4.20	\$693.00
			Contest POV Notice (Brody Mine No. 1)	19478.338	303.40	\$68,851.00
			Diesel Grader Petition Modification	19478.312	0.10	\$23.50
			Mack Paynter 08/06/13 Accident Investigation	19478.332	0.10	\$23.50
			MSHA Global Settlement	19478.309	0.10	\$0.00
			Part 50 Audit 08/13/13; WEVA 2013-1347-R	19478.334	1.90	\$341.50
			WEVA 2012-756; Assessment No. 46-09086-280070 (Brody Mine No.1)	19478.319	0.10	\$23.50
			WEVA 2013-237 (Brody Mine No.1)	19478.321	0.80	\$167.00

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	C/M #	HOURS	AMOUNT
			WEVA 2013-370; Assessment No. 46-09086-308309 (Brody Mine No.1)	19478.322	6.10	\$1,180.50
		Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000274249 (Dodge Hil Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-461	19692.328	0.10	\$23.50
			Electronic Surveying Petitions	19692.325	0.30	\$37.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Bridgette Monteon 105(c) Discrimination Complaint Federal No. 2 Mine	165.1496	0.40	\$62.50
			Case No. 000254488 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-2057 and WEVA 2011-2058	165.1453	1.00	\$140.50
			Case No. 000270521 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-174	165.1470	5.00	\$900.50
			Case No. 000273621 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-529 and WEVA 2012.530	165.1480	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000279351 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-992	165.1508	0.20	\$47.00
			Case No. 000281811 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-894 and WEVA 2012-895	165.1491	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000296853 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1722	165.1497	0.50	\$86.00
			Case No. 000299484 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-14	165.1500	0.90	\$148.50
			Case No. 000305620 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-287	165.1501	0.20	\$47.00
			Case No. 000308056 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-358 and WEVA 2013-359	165.1507	0.50	\$117.50
			Case No. 000310662 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-521	165.1511	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000313254 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-623	165.1513	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000314379 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-626	165.1512	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000316613 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-767	165.1515	0.70	\$101.50
			Case No. 000318010 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-816	165.1519	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000319524 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-895	165.1516	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000328346 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-1203	165.1522	2.20	\$332.50
			Case No. 000330248 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-1297	165.1523	2.20	\$391.00
			Cecil Green 105(c) Discrimination Claim (Federal No. 2 Mine)	165.1509	0.40	\$62.50
			Cecil L. Palmer 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine)	165.1520	10.50	\$1,827.00
			Christopher Salina 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine)	165.1504	0.40	\$62.50
			Electronic Surveying Petitions	165.1469	0.40	\$50.00
			Federal No. 2; 107(a) Order	165.1514	0.10	\$23.50
			Jack Frazier 105(c) Discrimination Complaint; MORG-CD-2013-05	165.1506	0.40	\$62.50
			John "Jack" H. Frazier 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine)	165.1521	14.10	\$2,469.00
			John Symenski 105(c) Discrimination Complaint; Federal No. 2 Mine	165.1498	18.30	\$3,241.50
			MSHA Violations (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-89	165.1499	0.50	\$86.00
			Seth Hixenbaugh 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine); MORG-CD-2013-07	165.1510	17.60	\$3,126.50
		Gateway Eagle Coal Company LLC	Electronic Surveying Equipment	24902.301	0.30	\$37.50

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	C/M #	HOURS	AMOUNT
		Highland Mining Company, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	18176.348	2.40	\$300.00
			Leslie Pride (Highland 9 Mine) Discrimination Complaint No. MADI-CD-2009-11	18176.341	0.10	\$23.50
		Hobet Mining, LLC	104(a) Citation (Hobet 21 Mine); Rock Debris	2304.492	0.40	\$62.50
		Midland Trail Energy LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	23660.311	0.30	\$37.50
		Newtown Energy, Inc.	Electronic Surveying Petitions - Eagle Mine; Coalburg No. 1 Mine; Coalburg No. 2 Mine and Peerless Rachel Mine	19439.315	0.30	\$37.50
			Kanawha Eagle 101(c) Petition for Plugging Gas and Oil Wells (Peerless Mine)	19439.320	0.40	\$62.50
			Kanawha Eagle Fitzpatrick Fatality (Peerless Mine) Initial Investigation	19439.319	0.50	\$75.50
			Kanawha Eagle Notice of Violations (Peerless Mine) Re: Fitzpatrick Fatality	19439.321	2.80	\$482.50
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Safety and Health Consultation	20551.324	18.80	\$4,166.00
		Remington, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	15446.327	0.30	\$37.50
			Winchester Mine; Order Nos. 7157212, 7157213, and 7157210	15446.330	0.10	\$23.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	101(c) Gas Wells Petition (American Eagle Mine); Case No. 2005-MSA-00003	100577.399	3.40	\$556.00
			101(c) Petition Fire Suppression Modification	100577.382	0.40	\$62.50
			110(c) Investigation (American Eagle Mine); Order No. 8155598	100577.401	6.50	\$1,155.50
			American Eagle Mine - Jeff Green Investigation	100577.387	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000250991 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1598	100577.358	0.40	\$62.50
			Case No. 000253895 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1917 and WEVA 2011-1918	100577.364	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000257054 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2036	100577.360	0.70	\$101.50
			Case No. 000262590 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-2412	100577.366	0.40	\$62.50
			Case No. 000265768 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-17 and WEVA 2012-19	100577.367	1.00	\$140.50
			Case No. 000268443 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-124	100577.369	0.70	\$101.50
			Case No. 000274148 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-655	100577.372	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000277038 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-650 and WEVA 2013-1219	100577.375	1.70	\$234.00
			Case No. 000291125 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1453	100577.381	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000299489 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-36	100577.384	0.10	\$23.50
			Case No. 000302481 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-110	100577.385	0.40	\$62.50
			Case No. 000305627 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-321	100577.386	0.70	\$115.00
			Case No. 000308060 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-373	100577.388	0.70	\$115.00
			Case No. 000310665 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-502	100577.390	2.40	\$487.00
			Case No. 000317917 (American Eagle); WEVA 2013-892	100577.394	14.30	\$2,413.00
			Case No. 000320768 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-975	100577.398	2.40	\$222.50
			Case No. 000326261 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-1165	100577.397	1.80	\$294.00
			Case No. 000329021 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-1264	100577.400	2.30	\$375.50
			Dwight Richmond 105(c) HOPE-CD-2013-09	100577.396	4.40	\$792.50

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	C/M #	HOURS	AMOUNT
			Special Investigation 110(c) From 104d Orders Issuance (American Eagle Mine); Citation No. 8120583	100577.393	0.40	\$62.50
8	Workers Compensation Total				10.60	\$3,002.00
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Refunds	20551.311	10.60	\$3,002.00
Grand Total					701.80	\$151,834.40

Exhibit D

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Patriot Coal Corporation	Fee Statements and Applications	Amandus, Elizabeth A.	10/7/2013	1.70	Preparing supplemental declaration of employment.
			10/8/2013	0.20	Directing conflict check of new debtors' parties in interest.
				0.80	Research regarding interpretation of Bankruptcy Rule 2014's requirement that all "connections" adverse to debtor be disclosed.
				0.50	Reviewing and revising draft supplemental declaration of employment and reviewing previous disclosures.
			10/15/2013	0.60	Preparing fourteenth fee statement.
				0.30	Reviewing conflict results for supplemental representation filing.
			10/16/2013	0.80	Preparing supplemental representation filing.
			10/17/2013	0.10	Preparing fourteenth fee statement.
			10/18/2013	1.10	Preparing fourteenth fee statement for filing.
				0.20	Sending fourteenth fee statement for filing.
			10/21/2013	0.30	Correspondence with Michelle McGreal regarding issues pertaining to Jackson Kelly that will be addressed at tomorrow's hearing.
				0.20	Directing Accounting to compile additional information requested by court.
				0.80	Preparing supplemental retention filing.
				0.10	Reviewing notice of hearing matters.
				0.20	Sending supplemental retention to Davis Polk and Wardwell for filing.
			10/24/2013	0.20	Correspondence with Michelle McGreal regarding hearing and supplemental travel itemization.
				0.20	Reviewing Davis Polk's example of itemization of travel expense and directing compilation of similar information for period covered by third fee application.
			10/28/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail confirmation that itemization has been received.
			0.50	Reviewing supporting documentation, including receipts, and forwarding itemization and supporting document to Judge's clerk.	
	0.20	Reviewing travel itemization supplement and asking for additional information.			
10/29/2013	0.20	Reviewing September fee statement to determine whether certain matter was included.			
	0.30	Reviewing fourteenth fee statement and telephone conference(s) with Ms. Amandus regarding same.			
	Fee Statements and Applications Total			9.60	
Patriot Coal Corporation Total				9.60	
Bankruptcy Total				9.60	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Barker, Carlos; Barbara S. Barker	Smith, Delores D.	10/25/2013	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative.
				0.10	Reviewing opposing party's brief.
				0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
	Barker, Carlos; Barbara S. Barker Total			0.30	

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	Ellis, Donnie Eugene; Janice Alberta Ellis	Hammonds, Judy Saunders	10/9/2013	0.10	Correspondence to claimant.
				0.10	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
				0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
				0.10	Revising Administrative Law Judge's evidence summary form.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	10/19/2013	0.10	Reviewing work records.
				0.20	Revising preliminary evidence summary form as required by prehearing order.
		Smith, Delores D.	10/7/2013	0.10	Preparing notice rescheduling deposition.
				0.10	Rescheduling deposition.
				0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.
				0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter.
				0.10	Telephone conference with physician.
	Ellis, Donnie Eugene; Janice Alberta Ellis Total			1.20	
	Hubbard, James A.	Mitchell, Janet L.	10/29/2013	0.10	Docketing and calendaring status of request.
				0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
				0.10	Reviewing files.
				0.10	Telephone conference with judge's clerk.
	Hubbard, James A. Total			0.40	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total				1.90	
Catenary Coal Company, LLC	Mink, Albert F.	Calhoun, KD F.	10/9/2013	0.20	Updating detailed file summary.
		Harman, Ashley M.	10/1/2013	0.30	Reviewing and revising correspondence to client's representative and correspondence to Administrative Law Judge regarding attorney fee petition.
			10/16/2013	0.20	Reviewing correspondence from Department of Labor regarding benefits reimbursement, correspondence to client's representative, and preparing memorandum to file.
		Manchas, Penny L.	10/2/2013	0.10	Docketing status of claim.
				0.10	Reviewing correspondence from claimant.
			10/24/2013	0.20	Updating detailed file summary.
				0.10	Docketing status of claim.
				0.10	Reviewing correspondence from Department of Labor.
				0.20	Updating detailed file summary.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	10/10/2013	0.30	Responding to e-mail from Department of Labor and correspondence to Department of Labor.
	Mink, Albert F. Total			1.80	
Catenary Coal Company, LLC Total				1.80	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Campbell, Carl H., Jr.	Forman, Chelsea	10/15/2013	0.10	Reviewing correspondence and docketing status of request.
			10/23/2013	0.10	Reviewing correspondence and docketing status of request.
	Campbell, Carl H., Jr. Total			0.20	
	Epling, Carl R., Jr.	Calhoun, KD F.	10/1/2013	0.10	Correspondence to opposing counsel regarding required notification of motion to extend filing time.
			10/2/2013	0.30	Electronically filing motion for extension with United States Court of Appeals for Fourth Circuit.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
			10/3/2013	0.30	Reviewing and revising motion to seal opening brief and joint appendix to Fourth Circuit Court of Appeals.
			10/4/2013	0.10	Reviewing correspondence and docketing status of request.
			10/4/2013	0.70	Electronically filing opening brief and joint appendix with Fourth Circuit Court of Appeals.
			10/8/2013	0.10	Reviewing and revising motion to seal opening brief and joint appendix with Fourth Circuit Court of Appeals.
			10/14/2013	0.10	Reviewing correspondence and docketing status of request.
			10/14/2013	1.20	Electronically filing joint appendix with Fourth Circuit Court of Appeals.
		Harman, Ashley M.	10/1/2013	0.50	Reviewing and revising joint appendix index and planning defense strategy regarding motion for extension.
			10/2/2013	2.80	Additional work on reviewing and revising index to joint appendix.
				3.00	Preparing statement of facts for Fourth Circuit brief.
			10/3/2013	0.20	Reviewing and revising motion to seal brief and joint appendix.
			10/4/2013	0.50	Additional work on reviewing and revising motion to seal.
				0.40	Reviewing and revising joint appendix exhibits and index.
			10/10/2013	4.00	Preparing statement of facts for Fourth Circuit.
				0.30	Reviewing claimant's response to motion to seal.
			10/11/2013	1.80	Additional work on preparing statement of the facts for Fourth Circuit brief.
			10/16/2013	2.60	Additional work on preparing statement of facts.
			10/17/2013	4.10	Preparing argument section of Fourth Circuit brief.
			10/23/2013	0.30	Planning defense strategy regarding constitutional argument to Fourth Circuit.
				1.00	Revising opening brief to Fourth Circuit.
			10/24/2013	1.30	Additional work on opening brief to Fourth Circuit.
			10/25/2013	4.00	Additional work on reviewing and revising opening brief to Fourth Circuit.
				1.00	Legal research regarding Chenery doctrine.
		Manchas, Penny L.	10/1/2013	0.10	Docketing status of claim.
				0.40	Revising joint appendix I.
				1.40	Revising joint appendix II.
			10/2/2013	0.10	Docketing status of claim.
				0.30	Final draft of Volume I.
				0.30	Final draft of Volume II.
			10/3/2013	1.10	Preparing medical evidence for Volume I of joint appendix.
				1.50	Preparing medical evidence for Volume II of joint appendix.
			10/4/2013	0.50	Additional review of medical evidence for joint appendix.
			10/7/2013	0.70	Designating evidence in Volume I and II for joint appendix.
			10/14/2013	0.10	Docketing status of claim.
				0.40	Reviewing and organizing joint appendix I and II.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	10/7/2013	0.10	Calendar briefing deadline.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Snyder, Kathy L.	10/1/2013	0.10	Drafting motion for extension to United States Court of Appeals regarding impact of amendments to regulations.
				0.10	E-mail to opposing counsel regarding mandatory notification of motion.
			10/2/2013	0.20	Reviewing e-mail from opposing counsel, instructing legal assistant regarding draft of motion for extension, reviewing and revising motion for extension to United States Court of Appeals.
		Wilson, Lisa F.	10/1/2013	0.10	Planning appellate strategy regarding electronic filing of redacted and sealed brief and joint appendix.
	Epling, Carl R., Jr. Total			38.20	
	Hatfield, Halcy	Holley, Amy J.	10/2/2013	0.10	Reviewing Benefits Review Board's decision and order.
			10/3/2013	0.20	Reviewing Benefits Review Board decision and order affirming award of benefits.
			10/4/2013	0.40	Additional review of Benefits Review Board decision and order.
				1.30	Preparing opinion letter to client's representative regarding Benefits Review Board decision and order and recommendation.
				0.20	Reviewing medical summary.
				0.70	Reviewing prior Administrative Law Judge decision and order.
				0.60	Reviewing prior briefs.
			10/8/2013	0.40	Completing opinion letter to client's representative.
			10/15/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail regarding decision and order and appeal and preparing memorandum to legal assistant.
			10/22/2013	0.20	Reviewing e-mail from client regarding recommendation letter and preparing memorandum to file.
			10/24/2013	0.60	Additional review of Administrative Law Judge and Benefits Review Board decision and orders.
				1.40	Additional review of files, including medical opinion evidence.
				0.20	Planning continued defense strategy.
				0.70	Preparing correspondence to claimant answering questions regarding recommendation to appeal and Benefits Review Board decision and order letter.
			10/31/2013	0.20	E-mail to client regarding recommendation to appeal.
		Mattingly, William S.	10/10/2013	0.40	Reviewing and revising opinion letter.
			10/14/2013	0.30	Reviewing and revising opinion letter.
		Wilson, Lisa F.	10/23/2013	0.50	Drafting petition for review for United States Court of Appeals for Fourth Circuit and preparing memorandum to file.
	Hatfield, Halcy Total			8.50	
Hobet Mining, LLC Total				46.90	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood v. Sharples Coal Corp.	Wilson, Lisa F.	10/25/2013	0.10	Reviewing correspondence.
				0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
	Farley, Elwood v. Sharples Coal Corp. Total			0.20	
	Sutphin, James E. v. Sharples Coal Corp.	Gillen, Kevin T.	10/28/2013	0.20	Finalizing motion for time frame extension.

Time Detail By Project - October 2013

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Harman, Ashley M.	10/14/2013	0.40	Planning defense strategy regarding reply brief.
				1.00	Reviewing claimant's response brief.
		Holley, Amy J.	10/14/2013	0.30	Additional review of claimant's response brief.
				0.20	Planning and preparing continued defense strategy.
				0.30	Reviewing petition for review and supporting brief.
			10/16/2013	0.10	Preparing memorandum to legal assistant regarding extension requests.
				0.10	Reviewing e-mail regarding continued defense strategy and outstanding Director's brief.
			10/22/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail regarding motion for extension; preparing memorandum to legal assistant.
			10/23/2013	0.10	Reviewing motion for extension to Benefits Review Board.
			10/24/2013	0.10	Preparing memorandum to legal assistant regarding updating summary and motion for extension.
				0.30	Reviewing and revising motion for extension to file consolidated brief.
				0.10	Reviewing medical summary.
			10/25/2013	0.10	Reviewing status of motion for extension.
			10/28/2013	0.10	Completing motion for extension.
			10/31/2013	0.10	Reviewing order giving Director 10-days to file response brief.
		Wilson, Lisa F.	10/23/2013	0.50	Drafting motion for extension to file a consolidated brief with Benefits Review Board.
				0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
				0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
			10/28/2013	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
				0.40	Reviewing file.
				0.20	Updating detailed file summary.
				5.00	
	Sutphin, James E. v. Sharples Coal Corp. Total			5.00	
	Patriot Coal Corporation Total			5.20	
	Black Lung Total			55.80	
Patriot Coal Corporation	RWMV, LLC Membership Sale of Interest	Brumley, Christina T.	8/30/2013	1.30	Conference with Messrs. McCallister and Ebetino regarding sale of interest in WWMV.
			9/3/2013	0.30	Conference with Mr. Loeb regarding terms of sale of membership interests.
			9/9/2013	0.10	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from Mr. Eaves regarding assignment and assumption.
				1.50	Reviewing draft transaction documents.
				0.10	Reviewing e-mail from Mr. Ebetino regarding assignment and assumption.
			9/10/2013	0.20	Conference with Mr. Loeb and Mr. Dobbs regarding bankruptcy provisions in transaction.
				0.20	Conference with Mr. Loeb regarding transaction.
				4.50	Meeting with Messrs. Eagan and Ebetino regarding transaction.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
				0.50	Research regarding security interests in limited liability company and leasehold interests.
				0.50	Reviewing e-mails from Mr. Ebetino regarding previous lending arrangements.
			9/12/2013	0.30	Reviewing operating agreement.
				0.80	Conference with Ms. Cappellanti regarding transaction.
				0.30	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from Mr. Ebetino regarding security for transaction.
			9/13/2013	0.50	Reviewing bank documents.
				1.50	Conference with Messrs. Eagan and Ebetino regarding transaction documents.
			9/16/2013	0.10	Coordinating lien searches.
			9/17/2013	0.30	Reviewing lien search summary and preparing e-mail to Ms. Cappellanti regarding same.
			9/23/2013	0.20	Correspondence with Ms. Cappellanti regarding status.
				0.60	Preparing e-mail to Mr. McCallister to summarize status.
				0.20	Reviewing e-mails from Mr. Eagan regarding name change documents and base leases.
			9/24/2013	0.40	Conference with Ms. Cappellanti regarding status of negotiations, deed of trust, and lien issues and reviewing e-mail from Mr. Ebetino regarding landlord consent to deed of trust.
			10/4/2013	2.20	Additional revision of transaction documents.
				0.20	Conference with Ms. Lilly regarding preparation of property descriptions for deeds of trust.
				0.20	Reviewing and revising transaction documents.
				0.10	Reviewing e-mail from Mr. Ebetino regarding requested changes to document.
			10/7/2013	0.20	Additional work on payment agreement.
				0.10	Preparing e-mail to Messrs. Ebetino and Eagan regarding payment agreement.
				0.10	Preparing e-mail to Messrs. Ebetino and Eagan regarding transaction documents.
			10/8/2013	0.50	Working on transaction documents.
				0.50	Conference with Ms. Lilly regarding property descriptions.
				0.20	Correspondence with Messrs. Eagan and Ebetino regarding payment agreement.
				0.10	Correspondence with Mr. Eagan regarding property descriptions.
				0.10	Preparing e-mail to Mr. McCallister regarding same.
				0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Coco of Davis Polk regarding notice of transaction to Bankruptcy Court.
				0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. McCallister regarding bankruptcy approval of transaction.
		Cappellanti, Ellen S.	9/12/2013	0.40	Conference with Ms. Brumley to review transaction.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
					1.10 Revising assignment and assumption of member interests prepared by client.
					1.10 Revising membership pledge agreement prepared by client.
					0.50 Revising payment agreement prepared by client.
					0.30 Revising promissory note prepared by client representatives.
			9/13/2013		1.00 Revising assignment agreement.
					0.30 Revising note.
					1.00 Revising unit pledge agreement.
			9/16/2013		1.00 Telephone conference(s) with client to discuss drafting of documents and needed revisions.
			9/17/2013		1.00 Additional work on payment agreement.
					0.50 Reviewing leases referred to in agreement regarding termination provisions to incorporate in documents.
					0.50 Revising assignment and assumption agreement.
					0.50 Revising payment agreement.
			9/18/2013		1.00 Telephone conference(s) with client to review documents.
					1.00 Finalizing documents to send to client.
					1.00 Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Eagan to review documents.
					1.00 Working on leasehold deed of trust.
			9/19/2013		1.50 Additional work on credit line deed of trust.
			9/20/2013		0.50 Reviewing and approving client changes to agreements.
			9/23/2013		2.00 Meeting with Mr. Eagan and Mr. Ebetino to discuss meeting with Mr. Ballard and changes to documents.
					1.00 Revising documents per meeting.
			9/24/2013		0.10 Conference with Ms. Brumley to review status.
					0.10 Correspondence regarding ability to pledge sublease.
			9/27/2013		0.50 Reviewing Fifth Third loan documents.
			10/8/2013		1.00 Conference with Messrs. Ebetino and Eagan to discuss revisions to documents.
					0.50 Revising promissory note and payment agreement.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	9/3/2013		0.30 Meeting with Ms. Brumley and Mr. Loeb regarding retention for commercial transaction and staffing and billing issues.
			9/4/2013		0.20 Meeting with Ms. Brumley and Mr. Loeb regarding billing issues for commercial transactions.
		Horter, Brooke M.	9/13/2013		0.30 Conferring with C. Brumley regarding findings.
					2.00 Lien search in and Boone County Clerk's Office.
					2.00 Lien search in Kanawha County Clerk's Office.
		Imbrogno, Felicia Phipps	9/16/2013		0.50 Reviewing county lien search documents.
					0.50 Summarizing county lien search documents into memorandum regarding same.
			9/17/2013		1.20 Reviewing lien and UCC searches.
					1.20 Summarizing review of lien and UCC searches into memorandum regarding same.
		Lilly, April	10/4/2013		0.80 Preparing property descriptions.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
				0.50	Reviewing coal leases.
			10/7/2013	2.50	Preparing property descriptions for credit line DOT.
				1.50	Reviewing coal leases and subleases.
			10/8/2013	3.40	Working on property descriptions.
		Loeb, Jr., Charles W.	9/3/2013	0.80	Reviewing deal structure term sheet and discussing same.
			9/10/2013	0.80	Reviewing and working on transaction structure with Ms. Brumley.
		Nichols, Karen	9/13/2013	0.30	Performing UCC search for WWMV, LLC and RWMV, LLC at West Virginia Secretary of State and requesting copies of documents.
			9/16/2013	0.10	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from West Virginia Secretary of State regarding cost of UCC search.
				0.10	Telephone conference(s) with West Virginia Secretary of State to check on status of UCC search.
			9/17/2013	0.80	Obtaining UCCs for RWMV, LLC and WWMV, LLC.
		Presley, Nicklaus A.	9/19/2013	3.00	Reviewing lease agreements for certain prohibition provisions.
				1.50	Summarizing prohibition provisions in lease agreements.
		Tweel, Robert G.	9/13/2013	0.50	Conference regarding assignment issues.
				0.50	Telephone conference(s) with Chuck Ebetino, John Eagan, et al. regarding assignment issues.
				0.80	Working on language regarding assignment issues.
		RWMV, LLC Membership Sale of Interest Total		65.60	
Patriot Coal Corporation Total				65.60	
Commercial Total				65.60	
Patriot Coal Corporation	John Renner; et al v. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC; Patriot Coal Corporation; et al	Adkins, Wendy G.	10/22/2013	0.30	Reviewing and analyzing insurance coverage information provided by E. Waller in preparation of telephone conference.
				0.50	Telephone conference with E. Waller and L. Hughes in preparation of status conference regarding bankruptcy.
			10/25/2013	0.10	Drafting e-mail correspondence to counsel for Coffindaffer regarding bankruptcy proceedings.
				0.50	Reviewing coverage letters from insurance providers in preparation of status conference before Judge Clawges regarding bankruptcy proceedings and insurance coverage issues.
				0.10	Telephone conference with counsel for McGill regarding status of bankruptcy proceedings.
			10/28/2013	0.10	Drafting e-mail correspondence to E. Waller providing report of status conference before Judge Clawges.
				0.10	Drafting e-mail correspondence to plaintiff's counsel regarding Court's direction to return for status conference when definite answers were available as to bankruptcy and insurance issues.
				0.90	Representing corporate defendants at a status conference before Judge Clawges to provide update on bankruptcy proceedings and insurance coverage issues.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
John Renner; et al v. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC; Patriot Coal Corporation; et al Total				2.60	
Patriot Coal Corporation Total				2.60	
Deliberate Intent Litigation Total				2.60	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	OVEC, Inc. and WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc. v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC and Hobet Mining, LLC	Gardner, Blair M.	10/3/2013	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Special Master.
			10/7/2013	0.10	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from Special Master.
			10/9/2013	0.20	Conference call with Special Master.
				0.10	E-mail to A. McCallister.
				0.60	Updating pleadings file and index.
OVEC, Inc. and WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc. v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC and Hobet Mining, LLC Total				1.20	
	Scott G. Mandirola, and Thomas L. Clarke v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Gardner, Blair M.	10/28/2013	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with J. Frame regarding status of order.
			10/29/2013	0.10	E-mail to client.
				0.10	Telephone conference(s) with J. Frame.
Scott G. Mandirola, and Thomas L. Clarke v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total				0.30	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total				1.50	
Coyote Coal Company LLC	Appeal No. 12-48-EQB Re: OVEC, WV Highlands Conservancy, and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke	Tyree, Matthew S.	10/1/2013	0.20	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding settlement.
			10/7/2013	0.40	Correspondence with opposing and co-counsel regarding finalizing agreement.
			10/17/2013	0.10	Correspondence with Department of Environmental Protection regarding finalizing agreement.
				0.20	Finalizing and filing agreement.
				0.20	Finalizing and signing agreed final order.
	0.60	Preparing motion to enter agreed order and finalizing agreed order.			
Appeal No. 12-48-EQB Re: OVEC, WV Highlands Conservancy, and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke Total				1.70	
Coyote Coal Company LLC Total				1.70	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Appeal No. 13-01-EQB Re: OVEC and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke	Tyree, Matthew S.	10/1/2013	0.20	Correspondence with appellant regarding settlement.
				0.40	Finalizing settlement.
			10/7/2013	0.30	Correspondence with opposing and co-counsel regarding finalizing agreement.
			10/17/2013	0.10	Correspondence with Department of Environmental Protection regarding finalizing agreement.
				0.40	Updating client regarding sample dates and deadlines.
	0.30	Correspondence with client regarding final agreed order.			
	0.60	Conferring with co-counsel and clients regarding entrance of modification and sampling periods as a result of modification.			
Appeal No. 13-01-EQB Re: OVEC and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke Total				2.30	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC Total				2.30	
Hillside Mining Company	OVEC and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke; WVDEP v. Hillside Mining Company; Appeal No. 12-30-EQB	Tyree, Matthew S.	10/7/2013	0.30	Examining monitoring requirements.
			OVEC and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke; WVDEP v. Hillside Mining Company; Appeal No. 12-30-EQB Total		

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Hillside Mining Company Total				0.30	
Hobet Mining, LLC	EQB Appeal No. 13-19-EQB; NPDES Permit No. WV0046701 Re: WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc.; OVEC; and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke	Tyree, Matthew S.	10/17/2013	0.30	Examining permit file.
			10/23/2013	2.60	Examining permit file.
	EQB Appeal No. 13-19-EQB; NPDES Permit No. WV0046701 Re: WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc.; OVEC; and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke Total			2.90	
	Hobet Valley Fill 2013 Notice of Violation	McLusky, Robert G.	10/10/2013	0.20	Telephone conference with client's representative regarding status of investigation and discussing with Department of Environmental Protection.
			10/14/2013	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative regarding Surface Mine Board hearing.
				0.10	Discussing status of Surface Mine Board appeal.
			10/29/2013	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative.
				0.20	Reviewing additional correspondence from client and begin working on settlement order.
				0.10	Reviewing correspondence from client.
			10/30/2013	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative.
			0.70	Working on proposed agreed order resolving case.	
Hobet Valley Fill 2013 Notice of Violation Total			1.60		
OVEC Re: Hobet 22 Temporary Restraining Order Motion	Gardner, Blair M.	10/8/2013	0.10	Assigning assistant to file electronically.	
			0.20	Reviewing status report and attachments.	
	Roehl, Charles A.	10/9/2013	0.30	Updating pleadings file and index.	
OVEC Re: Hobet 22 Temporary Restraining Order Motion Total			0.60		
Hobet Mining, LLC Total				5.10	
Panther, LLC	EQB Appeal No. 13-14-EQB Re: WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc.; OVEC; and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke	Tyree, Matthew S.	10/7/2013	0.30	Examining outstanding issues and monitoring requirements.
			10/14/2013	0.20	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding settlement.
			10/17/2013	0.20	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding potential to settle.
	EQB Appeal No. 13-14-EQB Re: WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc.; OVEC; and Sierra Club v. Thomas L. Clarke Total			0.70	
Panther, LLC Total				0.70	
Environmental Total				11.60	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Legislative Services	Southworth, Louis S.	10/1/2013	0.00	Legislative Services - Flat Fee - October 2013.
	Legislative Services Total			0.00	
Patriot Coal Corporation Total				0.00	
Legislation Total				0.00	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000215712 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2010-934	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/17/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic regarding status.
			10/23/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic with Secretary of Labor.
			10/28/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic with Ms. Kulanu.
			10/29/2013	0.10	E-mail traffic with Ms. Kulanu.
	Case No. 000215712 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2010-934 Total			0.80	
Case No. 000248495 (Fanco); WEVA 2011-	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.	

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	1228		10/17/2013	0.30	E-mail traffic with Ms. Pearson.
	Case No. 000248495 (Fanco); WEVA 2011-1228 Total			0.40	
	Case No. 000253903 (Guyan Mine); Citations 8117869, 8117874, 8117875 and Order No. 8130042	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000253903 (Guyan Mine); Citations 8117869, 8117874, 8117875 and Order No. 8130042 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000305365 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2013-225	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000305365 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2013-225 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000317925 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2013-799	Cimino, Michael T.	10/2/2013	0.50	Preparing for witness preparation meeting with company witnesses.
	Case No. 000317925 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2013-799 Total		10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Dozer Reporting Violation (Guyan Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Dozer Reporting Violation (Guyan Mine) Total			0.10	
	James Sommerville 105(c) Discrimination Complaint	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	James Sommerville 105(c) Discrimination Complaint Total			0.10	
	Richard Young, Jr. Fatality (Guyan Surface Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Richard Young, Jr. Fatality (Guyan Surface Mine) Total		10/18/2013	0.30	Working on settlement.
	Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total			2.60	
Brody Mining LLC	110(c) Investigation; Citation Nos. 7167439, 7167441, and 7168910	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody 110(c) Investigation, Citation Numbers 7167439, 7167441, and 7168910.
	110(c) Investigation; Citation Nos. 7167439, 7167441, and 7168910 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000246005 (Brody Mine No. 1); WEVA 2011-1033	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2011-1033.
			10/15/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic regarding conference call with Administrative Law Judge in Brody WEVA 2011-1033.
			10/18/2013	0.30	E-mail traffic with Mr. McCracken regarding WEVA 2011-1033.
			10/21/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic with Administrative Law Judge regarding Brody WEVA 2011-1033.
			10/25/2013	0.30	Attending conference call with Administrative Law Judge regarding Brody WEVA 2011-1033.
				0.30	E-mail traffic regarding deposition transcripts in Brody WEVA 2011-1033.
				0.20	Preparing for conference call with Administrative Law Judge regarding Brody WEVA 2011-1033.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/24/2013	0.10	Reviewing settlement offer and counter received from Solicitor in Brody 2013-1033.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
				0.10	Summarizing offers and calculating reductions in Brody 2013-1033.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/23/2013	0.50	Reviewing and analyzing discovery responses and roof control plan in preparation for response to Secretary's offer in Brody 2011-1033.
				0.30	Reviewing citation inspector notes in preparation for response to Secretary's offer in Brody WEVA 2011-1033.
			10/25/2013	0.10	E-mail correspondence with Mr. McCracken forwarding Brody offer in WEVA 2011-1033.
				0.10	E-mail correspondence with Mr. Ray regarding counteroffer to MSHA in Brody WEVA 2011-1033.
	Case No. 000246005 (Brody Mine No. 1); WEVA 2011-1033 Total			2.80	
	Case No. 000251217 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2011-1566; SOL No. 11-64598	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2011-1566.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/21/2013	0.40	Preparing request for settlement authority for client approval in Brody 2011-1566.
				0.40	Reviewing citations, penalties, defenses, and settlement offers in Brody 2011-1566.
			10/25/2013	0.30	Reviewing settlement motion for approval of filing in Brody 2011-1566.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/2/2013	0.20	Meeting with Justin Ray to discuss defenses to citations in Brody WEVA 2013-1566.
				0.20	Travel from Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia.
				0.20	Travel to Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia for meeting with Justin Ray.
	Case No. 000251217 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2011-1566; SOL No. 11-64598 Total			1.80	
	Case No. 000271619 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-361	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2012-361.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	10/22/2013	0.10	Correspondence with Solicitor regarding new Solicitor assigned to case in Docket 2012-361.
			10/23/2013	0.10	Reviewing settlement offer received from Secretary of Labor regarding Docket 2012-361.
	Case No. 000271619 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-361 Total			0.30	
	Case No. 000274401 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-463 and WEVA 2012-462	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2012-462 and WEVA 2012-463.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/1/2013	0.10	Correspondence to client forwarding decision and closing file.
				0.10	Reviewing decision approving settlement in 2012-462 for accuracy.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	10/22/2013	0.10	Correspondence with Solicitor regarding new Solicitor assigned to case in Docket 2012-463.
			10/23/2013	0.10	Reviewing settlement offer received from Secretary of Labor regarding Docket 2012-463.
	Case No. 000274401 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-463 and WEVA 2012-462 Total			0.50	
	Case No. 000288738 (Brody No. 1); WEVA	Cimino, Michael T.	10/2/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic with Ms. Abdoveis regarding WEVA 2012-1208.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	2012-1208		10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1208.
			10/14/2013	0.30	Working on settlement in Brody WEVA 2012-1208.
			10/17/2013	0.30	E-mail traffic with Ms. Abdoveis regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1208.
			10/18/2013	0.20	Working on settlement regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1208.
			10/24/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic with Ms. Abdoveis regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1208.
			10/31/2013	0.30	E-mail traffic with Ms. Abdoveis regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1208.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/2/2013	2.80	Meeting with Justin Ray to discuss defenses to citations in Brody WEVA 2012-1208.
				0.20	Travel from Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia.
				0.20	Travel to Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia for meeting with Justin Ray.
			10/8/2013	1.40	Preparing position statement for Brody WEVA 2013-1208.
			10/11/2013	0.10	Preparing position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1308.
			10/15/2013	0.50	Preparing position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1208.
	Case No. 000288738 (Brody No. 1); WEVA 2012-1208 Total			6.80	
	Case No. 000291400 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-1340 and WEVA 2012-1339	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1339 and WEVA 2012-1340.
			10/14/2013	0.20	Working on settlement in Brody WEVA 2012-1339.
			10/18/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic with Ms. Abdoveis regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1339.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/2/2013	0.20	Meeting with Justin Ray to discuss defenses to citations in Brody WEVA 2012-1339.
				0.20	Travel from Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia.
				0.20	Travel to Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia for meeting with Justin Ray.
			10/8/2013	0.70	Preparing position statement for Brody WEVA 2013-1339.
			10/9/2013	0.20	Preparing position statement for Brody WEVA 2013-1339.
			10/18/2013	0.70	Analyzing case law discussing duplicative citations in Brody WEVA 2012-1339.
				0.70	Analyzing case law regarding citations issued on the same hazard for Brody WEVA 2012-1339.
				1.60	Legal research for Brody WEVA 2012-1339 regarding orders and citations issued on the same condition in the same working section and when such issuance is invalid.
				1.40	Legal research in preparation for position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1339.
				0.40	Preparing position statement for Brody WEVA 2012-1339.
				0.40	Preparing position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1339.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	Case No. 000291400 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-1340 and WEVA 2012-1339 Total			7.20	
	Case No. 000294263 (Brody No. 1 Mine); WEVA 2012-1515	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1514 and WEVA 2012-1515.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/21/2013	1.00	Preparing summary of violations and assessments in Brody 2012-1515.
				0.70	Reviewing citations and penalties in Brody 2012-1515.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/8/2013	0.60	Preparing position statement for Brody WEVA 2013-1566.
			10/13/2013	0.40	Reviewing and analyzing regulations and statutes in preparation for draft of position statement in Brody WEVA 2013-1514.
				1.00	Reviewing citations and rebuttals in preparation for draft of position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1515.
				0.30	Reviewing citations in preparation for draft of position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1514.
				0.60	Reviewing regulations and statutes in preparation for draft of position statement in Brody WEVA 2013-1515.
			10/14/2013	1.30	Preparing position statement for Brody WEVA 2012-1515.
			10/15/2013	0.30	Preparing position statement in Brody WEVA 2013-1566.
			10/21/2013	0.30	Reviewing Secretary's offer for settlement recommendation in Brody WEVA-1566.
	Case No. 000294263 (Brody No. 1 Mine); WEVA 2012-1515 Total			6.60	
	Case No. 000296195 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-1622; SOL No. 12-66793; Citation No. 8132634	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1622.
	Case No. 000296195 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-1622; SOL No. 12-66793; Citation No. 8132634 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000297111 (Brody No. 1 Mine); WEVA 2012-1663	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1663.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/13/2013	0.40	Reviewing and analyzing regulations in preparation for draft of position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1663.
				0.40	Reviewing citations and rebuttals in preparation for draft of position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1663.
	Case No. 000297111 (Brody No. 1 Mine); WEVA 2012-1663 Total			0.90	
	Case No. 000299752 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-1772	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2012-1772.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/2/2013	0.20	Meeting with Justin Ray to discuss defenses to citations in Brody WEVA 2012-1772.
				0.20	Travel from Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia.
				0.20	Travel to Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia for meeting with Justin Ray.
			10/11/2013	0.40	Preparing position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1772.
			10/14/2013	0.40	Preparing position statement for Brody WEVA 2012-1772.
			10/15/2013	4.50	Preparing position statement in Brody WEVA 2012-1772.
	Case No. 000299752 (Brody Mine No.1); WEVA 2012-1772 Total			6.00	

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	Case No. 000302807 (Brody No. 1); WEVA 2013-120 and WEVA 2013-121	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2013-120 and WEVA 2013-121.
			10/25/2013	0.20	Working on settlement regarding Brody WEVA 2013-120.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/25/2013	0.10	Correspondence to client forwarding decision and closing file in Brody 2013-120.
				0.10	Reviewing and processing decision approving settlement in Brody 2013-120.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/3/2013	0.10	E-mail correspondence with Solicitor regarding status of MSHA counteroffer in Brody WEVA 2013-121.
	Case No. 000302807 (Brody No. 1); WEVA 2013-120 and WEVA 2013-121 Total			0.60	
	Case No. 000310927 (Brody Mine No. 1)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.00	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2013-564.
			10/9/2013	0.30	E-mail traffic with S. Martin regarding petition in Brody WEVA 2013-564.
			10/11/2013	0.10	Correspondence to Ms. Boyd regarding Brody WEVA 2013-564.
				0.50	Preparing answer regarding Brody WEVA 2013-564.
				0.10	Preparing discovery requests regarding Brody WEVA 2013-564.
				0.10	Preparing notice of deposition regarding Brody WEVA 2013-564.
				0.10	Reviewing citations regarding Brody WEVA 2013-564.
				0.10	Reviewing petition regarding Brody WEVA 2013-564.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/9/2013	0.50	Preparing answer to petition for assessment in Brody Mining Docket 2013-564.
				0.60	Preparing discovery requests and notice of deposition in Brody Mining Docket 2013-564.
				0.20	Reviewing and processing petition for assessment in Brody Mining Docket 2013-564.
			10/11/2013	2.00	Preparing summary of violations and penalties in Brody 2013-564.
				0.80	Reviewing citations and assessments in Brody 2013-564.
	Case No. 000310927 (Brody Mine No. 1) Total			5.40	
	Case No. 000314409 (Brody Mine No. 1); WEVA 2013-674	Cimino, Michael T.	10/1/2013	0.20	Preparing for meeting with Justin Ray regarding WEVA 2013-674.
			10/2/2013	4.00	Attending meeting with Justin Ray.
				1.00	Preparing for meeting with Justin Ray regarding WEVA 2013-674.
				0.60	Preparing request for settlement.
				0.90	Preparing response to discovery requests.
			10/3/2013	1.20	Preparing discovery responses for Brody WEVA 2013-674.
				0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2013-674.
			10/10/2013	6.50	Interviewing witnesses at Brody regarding WEVA 2013-674.
			10/15/2013	1.20	Preparing responses to discovery requests in Brody WEVA 2013-674.
			10/24/2013	0.40	E-mail traffic with Secretary of Labor and Administrative Law Judge regarding new trial date in Brody WEVA 2013-674.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/28/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from Mr. Baker (2013-674).
			10/1/2013	0.30	Preparing for inspector's deposition.
				0.20	Preparing notice of inspector deposition in Docket 674.
				0.50	Working on discovery responses in Docket 674.
			10/2/2013	1.00	Additional work on discovery responses for Brody Docket 2013-674.
				0.30	Preparing request for settlement authority for client approval for Brody Docket 2013-674.
			10/3/2013	0.30	Additional work on discovery responses for Brody 2013-674.
				0.30	Preparing amended notice of witness deposition in Brody 2013-674.
			10/11/2013	0.40	Additional work on discovery responses in Brody 2013-674.
			10/16/2013	0.50	Bates numbering all documents for production in Brody 2013-674.
				0.50	Finalizing discovery responses in Brody 2013-674.
				0.50	Preparing onshift and preshift records for production in Brody 2013-674.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/2/2013	1.00	Meeting with Justin Ray and preparing responses to Secretary's first set of discovery for Brody WEVA 2013-674.
			10/7/2013	0.50	Preparing discovery responses to Secretary's first set of discovery requests for Brody WEVA 2013-674.
			10/9/2013	0.10	E-mail correspondence with Justin Ray to arrange interview with miners for Brody WEVA 2013-674.
				0.40	Reviewing file in preparation for interviews with roof bolters on section for Brody WEVA 2013-674.
			10/10/2013	4.10	Conducting interviews with roof bolters on #5 section regarding orders in Brody WEVA 2013-674.
				1.30	Travel from Appalachian Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia for interviews in Brody WEVA 2013-674.
				1.30	Travel to Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia for interviews in Brody WEVA 2013-674.
			10/11/2013	1.00	Preparing discovery responses to Secretary's first set of discovery requests in Brody WEVA 2013-674.
			10/16/2013	0.50	Preparing responses to Secretary's first set of discovery requests in Brody 2013-674.
				31.20	
	Case No. 000314409 (Brody Mine No. 1); WEVA 2013-674 Total				
	Case No. 000319586 (Brody No. 1); WEVA 2013-908	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2013-907 and WEVA 2013-908.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/10/2013	0.10	Preparing summary of violations and penalties in Brody 2013-907 and 908.
				0.10	Reviewing citations and assessment in Brody 2013-907 and 908.
	Case No. 000319586 (Brody No. 1); WEVA 2013-908 Total			0.30	

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	Case No. 000321030 (No. 1 Mine); WEVA 2013-996 and WEVA 2013-997	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2013-996 and WEVA 2013-997.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/9/2013	0.20	Preparing summary of assessments in Brody Mining Docket 2013-997.
				0.30	Preparing summary of defenses in Brody Mining Docket 2013-997.
				0.20	Preparing summary of violations in Brody Mining Docket 2013-997.
				0.10	Reviewing citations in Brody Mining Docket 2013-997.
				0.10	Reviewing penalty information in Brody Mining Docket 2013-997.
				0.10	Reviewing rebuttal information in Brody Mining Docket 2013-997.
			10/16/2013	2.00	Preparing summary of violations and penalties for 124 citations in Brody 2013-996.
				2.00	Preparing summary of violations and penalties for 124 citations in Brody 2013-997.
				0.50	Reviewing citations and assessments in Brody 2013-996.
				0.50	Reviewing citations and assessments in Brody 2013-997.
	Case No. 000321030 (No. 1 Mine); WEVA 2013-996 and WEVA 2013-997 Total			6.10	
	Case No. 000323691 (Mine No. 1); WEVA 2013-1054 and WEVA 2013-1055	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2013-1054 and WEVA 2013-1055.
	Case No. 000323691 (Mine No. 1); WEVA 2013-1054 and WEVA 2013-1055 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000326531 (Mine No. 1); WEVA 2013-337-R and WEVA 2013-338-R	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2013-337-R and WEVA 2013-338-R.
			10/9/2013	0.30	E-mail traffic with S. Martin regarding petition in Brody WEVA 2013-1189.
			10/11/2013	0.10	Correspondence to Ms. Boyd regarding Brody WEVA 2013-1189.
				0.50	Preparing answer regarding Brody WEVA 2013-1189.
				0.10	Preparing discovery requests regarding Brody WEVA 2013-1189.
				0.10	Preparing notice of deposition regarding Brody WEVA 2013-1189.
				0.10	Reviewing citations regarding Brody WEVA 2013-1189.
				0.10	Reviewing petition regarding Brody WEVA 2013-1189.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/10/2013	1.50	Preparing summary of violations and penalties in Brody 2013-337.
				0.30	Reviewing citations and assessment in Brody 2013-337.
				1.00	Reviewing files received from Dinsmore relative to new petition in Brody 2013-337.
	Case No. 000326531 (Mine No. 1); WEVA 2013-337-R and WEVA 2013-338-R Total			4.20	

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	Contest POV Notice (Brody Mine No. 1)	Anderson, Jon L.	10/29/2013	4.50	Research regarding potential for intervention to challenge to POV rule pending before Sixth Circuit Court of Appeals, reviewing docket sheet and filings from Sixth Circuit challenge, and conference with co-counsel regarding challenge to POV.
		Cimino, Michael T.	10/24/2013	0.60	Working on issues regarding POV notice regarding Brody.
			10/25/2013	4.50	Working on issues regarding Brody POV notice.
			10/27/2013	3.50	Analyzing citations that formed the basis of POV.
				0.40	E-mail traffic with counsel and Eric Waller regarding POV issues.
			10/28/2013	1.50	Working on issues regarding challenge to POV notice.
			10/29/2013	0.40	E-mail traffic regarding strategy regarding filing two notices of contest in Brody POV matter.
				9.90	Working on Brody POV issues.
			10/30/2013	12.10	Preparing for hearing on 70 S&S violations regarding Brody.
			10/31/2013	5.10	Working on issues regarding Brody POV notice and hearing.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/25/2013	0.20	Preparing and filing Freedom of Information Act request for POV supporting documentation.
				4.80	Preparing chart summarizing citations.
				1.00	Reviewing POV information and citations at issue in POV determination.
			10/28/2013	1.00	Additional work on reviewing POV information and citations at issue in POV determination.
				5.00	Preparing chart summarizing citations.
			10/29/2013	0.90	Additional work on reviewing POV information and citations at issue in POV determination.
				4.00	Preparing chart summarizing citations.
				2.00	Working on motions to expedite dockets.
			10/30/2013	1.00	Additional work on reviewing POV information and citations at issue in POV determination.
				1.20	Preparing chart summarizing citations.
				1.00	Working on motions to expedite dockets.
			10/31/2013	2.50	Finalizing and filing motions to expedite.
				3.00	Preparing chart of issues after reviewing POV order and compiling citations referenced in order.
				3.00	Preparing for hearing.
		Dennison, Patrick W.	10/24/2013	1.00	Discussing POV with Jessica Jurasko and reviewing citations on MSHA's website.
			10/25/2013	0.30	Discussing POV criteria and method to get removed from POV with Hank Moore and Jessica Jurasko.
			10/31/2013	0.60	Research and pulling cases dealing with POV subject matter.
		Ferguson, Amanda E.	10/29/2013	3.30	Legal regarding regarding "CM Not Permissible" category of Brody POV S&S citations
				2.50	Legal research regarding "Inaccessible Mandoor" category of Brody POV S&S citations.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
			10/30/2013	0.50	Legal research regarding "Crossunder" category of Brody POV S&S citations.
				1.60	Legal research regarding "Inaccessible Mandoor" category of Brody POV S&S citations.
			10/31/2013	0.70	Legal research regarding "Crossunder" category of Brody POV citations.
				1.80	Legal research regarding "Escapeway Map Out of Date" category of Brody POV citations.
				1.20	Legal research regarding "Materials in Walkway of Bolter" category of Brody POV citations.
				0.90	Legal research regarding "Pumper Ventilated Improperly" category of Brody POV citations.
				1.50	Legal research regarding "Section Foreman Had Not Walked Primary Escapeway in its Entirety" category of Brody POV citations.
		Hayes, Seth P.	10/26/2013	5.50	Legal research regarding new POV Rule and due process arguments to be made in contesting MSHA's issuance of POV notice at Brody No. 1 Mine.
			10/27/2013	5.10	Additional legal research regarding new POV Rule and due process arguments to be made in contesting MSHA's issuance of POV notice at Brody No. 1 Mine.
				2.00	Drafting verified complaint for injunctive relief and mandamus.
			10/28/2013	5.80	Additional legal research regarding arguments around Thunder Basin's prohibition against pre-enforcement challenges to Mine Act and editing and revising complaint for injunctive relief.
			10/29/2013	3.00	Additional revisions to verified complaint to reflect S&S citations issued to Brody No.1 Mine and subsequent withdrawal orders.
				0.60	Devising litigation strategy regarding filing of verified complaint in light of client's meeting with MSHA.
				3.00	Legal research regarding post-deprivation procedural requirements when no pre-deprivation procedural protections are provided.
			10/30/2013	2.50	Additional revisions to verified complaint.
				1.20	Begin drafting petition in support of injunctive relief.
				3.00	Legal research regarding predeprivation procedural requirements.
			10/31/2013	2.70	Additional legal research regarding predeprivation procedural requirements.
				3.00	Additional work on drafting petition in support of injunctive relief.
		Jurasko, Jessica M	10/24/2013	3.60	Legal research regarding issuance of POV, evaluation of criteria considered by MSHA, and client's options to contest.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
				0.70	Preparing summary of findings for Mike Cimino and Ben McFarland.
			10/25/2013	4.80	Research and analyzing options to challenge POV, including POV criteria analysis, MSHA monitoring tool, due process arguments, and S&S findings.
			10/26/2013	0.80	Drafting motion to expedite hearing for POV notice contest.
				0.50	Drafting motion to expedite hearing for withdrawal order.
				0.70	Drafting notice of contest for POV notice.
				0.60	Drafting notice of contest for withdrawal order for POV.
				2.60	Research and analyzing case law and opinions of Judge Steele regarding S&S findings.
			10/28/2013	1.30	Further analysis of Judge Steele's rulings on S&S designations.
				2.30	Legal research regarding Commission jurisdiction to hear challenges to MSHA rules for inclusion in memorandum of law.
				1.60	Reviewing and analyzing Sixth Circuit submissions on POV.
			10/29/2013	2.80	Legal research regarding rulemaking challenges before Commission for inclusion in memorandum of law.
				1.70	Preparing draft of memorandum of law regarding rulemaking, notice and comment requirements.
			10/30/2013	1.40	Continue legal research regarding Commission jurisdiction to decide matters involving challenges to rules.
				1.80	Continue legal research regarding rulemaking challenges before Commission for inclusion in memorandum of law.
				2.70	Continue preparation of draft of memorandum of law regarding rulemaking, notice and comment requirements, and Commission jurisdiction.
			10/31/2013	0.80	Continue legal research regarding rulemaking challenges before Commission for inclusion in memorandum of law.
				3.40	Drafting prehearing memorandum for submission to Judge Steele prior to oral argument.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/8/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding position statement, status and strategy.
			10/15/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding position statement.
				0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/21/2013	0.80	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/22/2013	1.00	Working on issues regarding settlement evaluation.
				0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/24/2013	1.40	Working on issues regarding Brody POV notice.
				0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/25/2013	1.40	Working on issues regarding Brody POV notice.
				1.90	Working on issues regarding POV.
			10/28/2013	0.50	Working on finalization of settlement.
				1.80	Working on issues regarding Brody POV notice.
			10/29/2013	1.00	Working on issues regarding POV notification.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
			10/31/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		Moore, R. H.	10/25/2013	0.50	Conference call with Eric Waller.
				1.00	Discussion with Jessica Jurasko.
				0.50	Discussion with Mike Cimino.
			10/26/2013	1.00	Reviewing violation sheets.
			10/28/2013	1.00	Reviewing amicus brief and motion to dismiss in Sixth Circuit challenge to rule.
				2.00	Reviewing citations to determine what to contest.
				1.00	Working on motion to expedite and notices of contest.
			10/29/2013	0.20	Additional telephone call with Eric Waller.
				2.00	Begin application for temporary relief.
				0.30	Conference call with Mike Cimino, Al Sebok, and Seth Hayes.
				0.50	Drafting contests regarding new orders.
				1.00	Drafting motions to expedite for assessed violations.
				0.20	E-mail with Eric Waller.
				0.50	Reviewing complaint regarding injunctive relief.
				1.00	Revising motion to expedite and notices of contest.
				0.10	Telephone call with Eric Waller.
			10/30/2013	0.50	Filing notice of contest and motion to expedite on Tuesday's orders.
				1.00	Filing notices of contest and motion to expedite on first two orders.
				1.50	Reviewing NMA filings.
				1.00	Working on memorandum of law.
				1.00	Working on motion for temporary relief.
			10/31/2013	0.30	Conference call with Eric Waller and Mike Cimino.
				0.20	Conference call with Eric Waller.
				0.70	Conference call with Judge Steele.
				0.50	Conference call with Solicitor and Mike Cimino.
				0.30	E-mails regarding MSHA's position regarding criteria.
				1.00	Reviewing Murray Energy Sixth Circuit filings.
				1.00	Working on application for temporary relief.
				1.00	Working on memorandum of law.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/17/2013	1.80	Updatring Brody chronologies regarding upcoming docket meeting.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/27/2013	4.10	Legal research for citations in POV review for Brody Mining.
				3.70	Reviewing and analyzing S&S citations in POV review for contest for Brody Mining.
			10/28/2013	3.70	Legal research regarding favorable citations in POV.
				3.40	Reviewing and analyzing citations in POV date range that are favorable to provide defenses and arguments against S&S.
			10/29/2013	0.80	Analyzing case law regarding prompt hearings post and predeprivation by administrative agencies.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
				7.90	Analyzing citations, case law, and relevant regulations to formulate defenses to 67 favorable S&S citations used in criteria for Brody POV.
				2.30	Legal research for case law discussing what constitutes a prompt hearing post and predeprivation by administrative agencies.
				3.20	Legal research regarding issues in 67 favorable S&S citations used in criteria for Brody POV.
			10/30/2013	0.60	Analyzing case law discussing prompt hearings post and predeprivation.
				1.00	Legal research regarding what constitutes prompt hearing post and predeprivation by administrative bodies.
				13.20	Meeting with Justin Ray at Wells Complex to discussing facts and defenses to 67 favorable S&S violations used in criteria for Brody POV.
			10/31/2013	3.20	Analyzing case law regarding issues in 67 favorable S&S citations used in criteria for Brody POV.
				2.30	Analyzing citations and regulations of 54 citations listed in notice of POV in preparation for meeting with Justin Ray.
				3.00	Formulating lists of evidence needed for each citation in 67 favorable S&S used in criteria for Brody POV.
				4.30	Legal research regarding 67 favorable citations used in criteria for Brody POV.
		Sebok, Al F.	10/25/2013	2.30	Conference regarding filing action against MSHA, reviewing documents relating to POVs, and analyzing legal issues regarding POVs.
			10/26/2013	1.00	Analyzing issues regarding injunction.
				0.50	Conferences regarding complaint.
				2.40	Legal research regarding Thunder Basin and legal research regarding POV final regulations.
				0.50	Working on complaint.
			10/27/2013	0.40	Conferences regarding complaint.
				0.20	E-mail traffic regarding complaint.
				2.00	Legal research regarding injunctions, Thunder Basin, due process, and POV.
				0.30	Reviewing and revising complaint.
				0.50	Working on complaint.
			10/28/2013	0.40	Conferences regarding complaint.
				0.50	E-mail traffic regarding MSHA withdrawal order.
				4.00	Legal research regarding pre-enforcement court challenges.
				1.00	Reviewing and revising complaint.
			10/29/2013	2.10	Analyzing legal issues regarding filing federal court action.
				0.50	E-mail traffic regarding citations.
				0.50	E-mail traffic regarding intervention in Sixth Circuit action.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
				0.50	E-mail traffic regarding memorandum in support of preliminary injunction.
				1.00	Telephone conference regarding strategy.
				1.00	Working on complaint
			10/30/2013	0.60	Conferences regarding memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction.
				0.40	E-mail traffic regarding memorandum regarding options.
				1.40	Legal research regarding filing federal court action.
				2.00	Preparing memorandum regarding options with regard to filing federal court action.
			10/31/2013	0.20	Conferences regarding MSHA proceedings and possible federal court action.
				0.20	E-mail traffic regarding conference with Administrative Law Judge.
				0.50	Reviewing briefs filed in Sixth Circuit Court of Appeals.
				0.50	Working on briefs to be filed by Brody.
		White, Kristin R.	10/29/2013	0.20	Conference with Michelle Witter and Amanda Ferguson regarding research.
				0.40	Reviewing research needed for S&S challenge for Brody POV.
			10/31/2013	0.20	Working on defenses to lifeline S&S citations for Brody POV challenge.
		Witter, Michelle	10/29/2013	1.30	Legal research regarding and analyzing citations involving S&S designations on service brake issue and drafting memorandum regarding same.
				1.70	Legal research regarding citations involving S&S designations on lifeline issue and drafting memorandum regarding same.
			10/30/2013	0.70	Drafting memorandum regarding alleged inadequacy of examinations.
				0.80	Drafting memorandum regarding citations involving S&S designations.
				2.50	Legal research regarding and analyzing citations involving alleged inadequacy of examinations.
				3.50	Legal research regarding and analyzing citations involving S&S designations.
			10/31/2013	2.00	Legal research regarding and analyzing citations involving S&S designations on cable protection issues and drafting memorandum regarding same.
				1.20	Legal research regarding issues surrounding mining under bodies of water and drafting memorandum regarding same.
				3.00	Legal research regarding self rescuers and requirements for S&S and drafting memorandum regarding same.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	10/24/2013	0.40	Collecting and reviewing citation history data regarding Brody Mining.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
			10/29/2013	1.40	Compiling, reviewing data, and preparing summary regarding citation and violation history for Brody Mine.
			10/30/2013	1.40	Reviewing appellate court dockets and various briefs and appendices for Murray Energy and NMA matters.
			10/31/2013	0.80	Reviewing and hand delivering materials and documents to Judge Steele's office.
				0.80	Reviewing MSHA website regarding status of proposed penalties for various citations.
	Contest POV Notice (Brody Mine No. 1) Total			303.40	
	Diesel Grader Petition Modification	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody 101(c) petition for modification.
	Diesel Grader Petition Modification Total			0.10	
	Mack Paynter 08/06/13 Accident Investigation	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody August 6, 2013 accident investigation.
	Mack Paynter 08/06/13 Accident Investigation Total			0.10	
	MSHA Global Settlement	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody Global Settlement.
	MSHA Global Settlement Total			0.10	
	Part 50 Audit 08/13/13; WEVA 2013-1347-R	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody Part 50 Audit.
			10/24/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic with Mr. Gurka regarding Brody Part 50 Audit.
			10/31/2013	0.60	Working on summary of certain 104(a) citations in Brody Part 50 Audit.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/29/2013	0.50	Preparing pre-penalty notice of contest for Part 50 citations.
				0.50	Reviewing Part 50 citations.
	Part 50 Audit 08/13/13; WEVA 2013-1347-R Total			1.90	
	WEVA 2012-756; Assessment No. 46-09086-280070 (Brody Mine No.1)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2012-756.
	WEVA 2012-756; Assessment No. 46-09086-280070 (Brody Mine No.1) Total			0.10	
	WEVA 2013-237 (Brody Mine No.1)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2013-236 and WEVA 2013-237.
			10/9/2013	0.50	E-mail traffic regarding interviews of roof bolter operators in Brody WEVA 2013-236.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/1/2013	0.10	Correspondence to Solicitor.
				0.10	Reviewing file for discovery requests in Docket 236.
	WEVA 2013-237 (Brody Mine No.1) Total			0.80	
	WEVA 2013-370; Assessment No. 46-09086-308309 (Brody Mine No.1)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/1/2013	0.70	Preparing for meeting with Justin Ray regarding WEVA 2013-369.
			10/3/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report regarding Brody WEVA 2013-369 and WEVA 2013-370.
			10/11/2013	0.20	Working on settlement regarding Brody WEVA 2013-369.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/1/2013	0.20	Reviewing file for discovery requests in Docket 369.
			10/11/2013	0.40	Additional work on discovery responses in Brody 2013-369.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	10/11/2013	1.30	Working on position statement in Brody Mining WEVA 2013-369.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/2/2013	0.20	Meeting with Justin Ray to discuss defenses to citations in Brody WEVA 2013-369.
				0.20	Travel from Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia.
				0.20	Travel to Appalachia Mine Services in Wharton, West Virginia for meeting with Justin Ray.
			10/3/2013	2.00	Preparing position statement in Brody WEVA 2013-369.
			10/11/2013	0.60	Preparing position statement in Brody WEVA 2013-369.
	WEVA 2013-370; Assessment No. 46-09086-308309 (Brody Mine No.1) Total			6.10	
Brody Mining LLC Total				393.60	
Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC	Case No. 000274249 (Dodge Hil Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-461	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000274249 (Dodge Hil Mine No. 1); KENT 2012-461 Total			0.10	
	Electronic Surveying Petitions	Zalewski, Larry A.	10/21/2013	0.30	Reviewing order and updating case summary and calendar regarding status and hearing.
	Electronic Surveying Petitions Total			0.30	
Dodge Hill Mining Company LLC Total				0.40	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Bridgette Monteon 105(c) Discrimination Complaint Federal No. 2 Mine	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Bridgette Monteon 105(c) Discrimination Complaint Federal No. 2 Mine Total			0.40	
	Case No. 000254488 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-2057 and WEVA 2011-2058	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.90	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000254488 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-2057 and WEVA 2011-2058 Total			1.00	
	Case No. 000270521 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-174	Cimino, Michael T.	10/1/2013	0.40	Working on settlement regarding WEVA 2012-529.
			10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/1/2013	0.60	Working on issues regarding status update.
			10/2/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/3/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/8/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/9/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/10/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/17/2013	0.60	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/18/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/23/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding settlement, status and strategy.
			10/24/2013	0.60	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/29/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/21/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
	Case No. 000270521 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-174 Total			5.00	
	Case No. 000273621 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-529 and WEVA 2012.530	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000273621 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-529 and WEVA 2012.530 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000279351 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-992	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/29/2013	0.10	Reviewing substitution of counsel.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	Case No. 000279351 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-992 Total			0.20	
	Case No. 000281811 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-894 and WEVA 2012-895	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000281811 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-894 and WEVA 2012-895 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000296853 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1722	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/29/2013	0.10	Reviewing substitution of counsel.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000296853 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1722 Total			0.50	
	Case No. 000299484 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-14	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/29/2013	0.10	Reviewing substitution of counsel regarding WEVA 2013-14.
				0.10	Reviewing substitution of counsel regarding WEVA 2013-15.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.60	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000299484 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-14 Total			0.90	
	Case No. 000305620 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-287	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/29/2013	0.10	Reviewing substitution of counsel.
	Case No. 000305620 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-287 Total			0.20	
	Case No. 000308056 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-358 and WEVA 2013-359	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/29/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic with Ms. Kulanu.
				0.10	Reviewing substitution of counsel regarding WEVA 2013-358.
				0.10	Reviewing substitution of counsel regarding WEVA 2013-359.
	Case No. 000308056 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-358 and WEVA 2013-359 Total			0.50	
	Case No. 000310662 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-521	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000310662 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-521 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000313254 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-623	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000313254 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-623 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000314379 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-626	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000314379 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-626 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000316613 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-767	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.60	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000316613 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-767 Total			0.70	
	Case No. 000318010 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-816	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000318010 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-816 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000319524 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-895	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000319524 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2013-895 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000328346 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-1203	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/1/2013	0.50	Preparing answer and discovery.
				0.30	Reviewing and analyzing file and working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/1/2013	0.50	Drafting answer to petition.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
				0.50	Drafting initial discovery.
			10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000328346 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-1203 Total			2.20	
	Case No. 000330248 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-1297	Cimino, Michael T.	10/31/2013	0.10	Correspondence to Ms. Boyd.
				0.50	Preparing answer.
				0.10	Preparing discovery requests.
				0.10	Preparing notice of deposition.
				0.10	Reviewing citations.
				0.10	Reviewing petition.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/30/2013	0.50	Preparing answer to petition for assessment.
				0.50	Preparing discovery requests and notice of deposition.
				0.20	Reviewing and processing petition for assessment.
	Case No. 000330248 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-1297 Total			2.20	
	Cecil Green 105(c) Discrimination Claim (Federal No. 2 Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Cecil Green 105(c) Discrimination Claim (Federal No. 2 Mine) Total			0.40	
	Cecil L. Palmer 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/14/2013	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with counsel regarding status.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/2/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/3/2013	1.00	Drafting position statement.
				0.20	Reviewing and analyzing file.
				0.40	Working on factual investigation.
			10/7/2013	0.30	Drafting and revising position statement.
				0.40	Working on issues regarding factual investigation.
				0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/8/2013	0.70	Working on issues regarding position statement.
			10/9/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding position statement.
			10/10/2013	0.80	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/11/2013	0.30	Reviewing and analyzing file.
				1.40	Working on position statement.
			10/14/2013	1.20	Drafting position statement.
				0.30	Reviewing and analyzing file.
				0.40	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/17/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/21/2013	0.10	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/22/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/23/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding settlement, status and strategy.
			10/24/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/25/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/3/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
			10/7/2013	0.40	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
	Cecil L. Palmer 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine) Total			10.50	
	Christopher Salina 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	Christopher Salina 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine) Total			0.40	
	Electronic Surveying Petitions	Zalewski, Larry A.	10/22/2013	0.40	Reviewing and updating case summaries regarding status of settlement conference and Administrative Law Judge order.
	Electronic Surveying Petitions Total			0.40	
	Federal No. 2; 107(a) Order	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Federal No. 2; 107(a) Order Total			0.10	
	Jack Frazier 105(c) Discrimination Complaint; MORG-CD-2013-05	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Jack Frazier 105(c) Discrimination Complaint; MORG-CD-2013-05 Total			0.40	
	John "Jack" H. Frazier 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/2/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/3/2013	0.90	Drafting position statement.
				0.20	Reviewing and analyzing file.
				0.20	Working on factual investigation.
			10/4/2013	0.80	Working on issues regarding factual investigation.
				1.80	Working on position statement.
			10/7/2013	2.00	Drafting position statement.
				1.90	Working on issues regarding factual investigation.
			10/9/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/10/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/11/2013	0.30	Reviewing and analyzing file.
				1.50	Working on position statement.
			10/14/2013	1.20	Drafting position statement.
				0.20	Reviewing and analyzing file.
				0.40	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/17/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/21/2013	0.10	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/22/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/23/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding settlement, status and strategy.
			10/24/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/25/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding settlement.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/3/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
	John "Jack" H. Frazier 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine) Total			14.10	
	John Symenski 105(c) Discrimination Complaint; Federal No. 2 Mine	Cimino, Michael T.	10/2/2013	0.30	Working on settlement documents.
			10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/15/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic regarding settlement.
			10/17/2013	0.30	E-mail traffic regarding status.
			10/18/2013	0.50	Working on settlement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/1/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/2/2013	1.70	Drafting settlement agreement.
				0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/3/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding settlement.
			10/14/2013	1.20	Drafting final settlement and release agreement.
				0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
			10/15/2013	1.70	Working on issues regarding final settlement and release agreement.
			10/17/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/17/2013	3.10	Working on issues regarding alleged breach of settlement agreement.
			10/18/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/18/2013	1.90	Working on continued settlement negotiations.
			10/18/2013	1.20	Working on issues regarding expungement of Symenski personnel file.
			10/21/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/22/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/23/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/24/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/25/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding finalization of settlement.
			10/28/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding discovery.
			10/29/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding settlement.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/3/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
			10/21/2013	0.40	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
			10/23/2013	0.10	Docketing deadline.
			10/24/2013	0.10	Reviewing order postponing hearing and order setting date for receipt of settlement agreement.
			10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
				18.30	
	John Symenski 105(c) Discrimination Complaint; Federal No. 2 Mine Total				
	MSHA Violations (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-89	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/29/2013	0.10	Reviewing substitution of counsel.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	MSHA Violations (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2013-89 Total			0.50	
	Seth Hixenbaugh 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine); MORG-CD-2013-07	Cimino, Michael T.	10/1/2013	1.40	Working on settlement.
			10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/29/2013	0.10	E-mail traffic regarding new trial date.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/1/2013	1.50	Drafting overall case evaluation.
			10/1/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding discovery, status and strategy.
			10/2/2013	0.80	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/2/2013	0.60	Analyzing file.
			10/2/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/14/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/15/2013	1.60	Preparing for Hixenbaugh deposition.
			10/15/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/17/2013	0.40	Preparing for Hixenbaugh deposition.
			10/17/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding settlement.
			10/18/2013	0.60	Working on issues regarding compliance with prehearing order.
			10/18/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding discovery.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
			10/21/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/22/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/23/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding settlement, status and strategy.
			10/24/2013	0.60	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/25/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/29/2013	1.30	Working on issues regarding trial preparation.
			10/31/2013	1.30	Analyzing discovery.
				1.90	Preparing for Hixenbaugh depositions.
				0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/1/2013	0.30	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding settlement offer.
			10/2/2013	0.10	Drafting letter to D. Allard.
				0.30	Obtaining copy of arbitration file.
			10/3/2013	0.20	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
			10/21/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
			10/31/2013	0.10	Docketing discovery due date.
				17.60	
	Seth Hixenbaugh 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2 Mine); MORG-CD-2013-07 Total			17.60	
	Eastern Associated Coal, LLC Total			77.20	
Gateway Eagle Coal Company LLC	Electronic Surveying Equipment	Zalewski, Larry A.	10/21/2013	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summary and calendar regarding status and hearing.
	Electronic Surveying Equipment Total			0.30	
	Gateway Eagle Coal Company LLC Total			0.30	
Highland Mining Company, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	Zalewski, Larry A.	10/14/2013	0.40	Preparing letter to MSHA regarding hearing.
				0.40	Preparing request for hearing regarding proposed decision and order regarding Highland Mine.
			10/25/2013	0.30	Reviewing proposed decision and updating case summary regarding status and appeal.
			10/28/2013	0.20	Reviewing Solicitor notice and updating case summary.
			10/31/2013	0.40	Preparing letter to MSHA regarding hearing request.
				0.70	Preparing request for hearing regarding proposed decision.
	Electronic Surveying Petitions Total			2.40	
	Leslie Pride (Highland 9 Mine) Discrimination Complaint No. MADI-CD-2009-11	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Leslie Pride (Highland 9 Mine) Discrimination Complaint No. MADI-CD-2009-11 Total			0.10	
	Highland Mining Company, LLC Total			2.50	
Hobet Mining, LLC	104(a) Citation (Hobet 21 Mine); Rock Debris	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	104(a) Citation (Hobet 21 Mine); Rock Debris Total			0.40	
	Hobet Mining, LLC Total			0.40	
Midland Trail Energy LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	Zalewski, Larry A.	10/21/2013	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summaries and calendar regarding status conference.
	Electronic Surveying Petitions Total			0.30	
	Midland Trail Energy LLC Total			0.30	

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Newtown Energy, Inc.	Electronic Surveying Petitions - Eagle Mine; Coalburg No. 1 Mine; Coalburg No. 2 Mine and Peerless Rachel Mine	Zalewski, Larry A.	10/21/2013	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summaries and calendar regarding status conference.
	Electronic Surveying Petitions - Eagle Mine; Coalburg No. 1 Mine; Coalburg No. 2 Mine and Peerless Rachel Mine Total			0.30	
	Kanawha Eagle 101(c) Petition for Plugging Gas and Oil Wells (Peerless Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Kanawha Eagle 101(c) Petition for Plugging Gas and Oil Wells (Peerless Mine) Total			0.40	
	Kanawha Eagle Fitzpatrick Fatality (Peerless Mine) Initial Investigation	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/3/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
			10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.
	Kanawha Eagle Fitzpatrick Fatality (Peerless Mine) Initial Investigation Total			0.50	
	Kanawha Eagle Notice of Violations (Peerless Mine) Re: Fitzpatrick Fatality	Cimino, Michael T.	10/2/2013	0.10	E-mail traffic regarding motion to reopen.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/2/2013	1.30	Preparing counsel for motion to reopen.
			10/3/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/18/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/1/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		10/3/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding Cox's affidavit.	
			0.20	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.	
	Kanawha Eagle Notice of Violations (Peerless Mine) Re: Fitzpatrick Fatality Total			2.80	
Newtown Energy, Inc. Total				4.00	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Safety and Health Consultation	Cimino, Michael T.	10/3/2013	0.20	Legal research regarding Part 50.1 reporting of accident at Brody.
			10/4/2013	0.80	Working on research regarding immediate reporting.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/1/2013	4.50	Preparing opening brief.
			10/3/2013	0.30	Analyzing case law discussing reporting requirements under Part 50.10 when an "accident" occurs.
				0.20	Legal research regarding reporting requirements under Part 50.10.
			10/4/2013	0.90	Analyzing case law discussing immediately reportable "accidents" under Part 50.10.
				1.30	Legal research for case law discussing immediately reportable injuries under Part 50.
		Stieger, Rodney W.	10/30/2013	3.10	Legal research regarding post-deprivation hearings.
			10/31/2013	4.00	Drafting section of memorandum of law regarding post deprivation review.
				3.50	Legal research regarding post-deprivation review.
	Safety and Health Consultation Total			18.80	
Patriot Coal Corporation Total				18.80	
Remington, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	Zalewski, Larry A.	10/21/2013	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summaries and calendar regarding status conference.
	Electronic Surveying Petitions Total			0.30	
	Winchester Mine; Order Nos. 7157212, 7157213, and 7157210	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative		
Winchester Mine; Order Nos. 7157212, 7157213, and 7157210 Total				0.10			
Remington, LLC Total				0.40			
Speed Mining, LLC	101(c) Gas Wells Petition (American Eagle Mine); Case No. 2005-MSA-00003	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.		
			McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/7/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding 101(c) petition.	
				10/8/2013	1.80	Preparing 101(c) petition.	
				10/31/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.	
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/7/2013	0.20	Drafting letter to Director Triebusch.		
				0.30	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding filing petition.		
					0.20	Revising petition.	
				10/25/2013	0.30	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.	
		101(c) Gas Wells Petition (American Eagle Mine); Case No. 2005-MSA-00003 Total				3.40	
			101(c) Petition Fire Suppression Modification	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
				O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.30	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.
		101(c) Petition Fire Suppression Modification Total				0.40	
			110(c) Investigation (American Eagle Mine); Order No. 8155598	Cimino, Michael T.	10/24/2013	0.30	E-mail traffic regarding new 110(c) investigation.
				McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/24/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding initial factual investigation, status and strategy.
					10/25/2013	0.70	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
					10/28/2013	0.50	Working on issues regarding factual investigation.
						0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
					10/29/2013	1.40	Working on investigation into underlying 104(d) order.
					10/31/2013	0.60	Analyzing file.
						2.10	Working on investigation into underlying citations.
		110(c) Investigation (American Eagle Mine); Order No. 8155598 Total				6.50	
			American Eagle Mine - Jeff Green Investigation	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
American Eagle Mine - Jeff Green Investigation Total				0.10			
	Case No. 000250991 (American Eagle Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.		
	WEVA 2011-1598	O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.30	Preparing chronology regarding upcoming docket meeting.		
Case No. 000250991 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1598 Total				0.40			
	Case No. 000253895 (American Eagle Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.		
	WEVA 2011-1917 and WEVA 2011-1918						
Case No. 000253895 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1917 and WEVA 2011-1918 Total				0.10			
	Case No. 000257054 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2036	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.		
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.60	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.		
Case No. 000257054 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2036 Total				0.70			
	Case No. 000262590 (American Eagle Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.		
	WEVA 2011-2412	O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.30	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.		
Case No. 000262590 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-2412 Total				0.40			
	Case No. 000265768 (American Eagle Mine)	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.		
	WEVA 2012-17 and WEVA 2012-19	O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.90	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.		
Case No. 000265768 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-17 and WEVA 2012-19 Total				1.00			
	Case No. 000268443 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-124	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.		
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.60	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.		

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	Case No. 000268443 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-124 Total			0.70	
	Case No. 000274148 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-655	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000274148 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-655 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000277038 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-650 and WEVA 2013-1219	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		Gray, Diane L.	10/30/2013	0.40	Preparing citation summaries.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/1/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding discovery.
			10/17/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/3/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
			10/25/2013	0.60	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000277038 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-650 and WEVA 2013-1219 Total			1.70	
	Case No. 000291125 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1453	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000291125 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1453 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000299489 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-36	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
	Case No. 000299489 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-36 Total			0.10	
	Case No. 000302481 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-110	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.30	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000302481 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-110 Total			0.40	
	Case No. 000305627 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-321	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/29/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.30	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000305627 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-321 Total			0.70	
	Case No. 000308060 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-373	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/29/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.30	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000308060 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-373 Total			0.70	
	Case No. 000310665 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-502	Cimino, Michael T.	10/2/2013	0.10	Working on settlement.
			10/3/2013	0.20	Working on settlement.
			10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/7/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic regarding settlement.
			10/18/2013	0.30	Working on settlement.
			10/22/2013	0.10	E-mail traffic regarding settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/3/2013	0.40	Additional work on preparing request for settlement authority for client.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/3/2013	0.30	Preparing settlement chart.
			10/7/2013	0.20	Preparing settlement chart.
			10/8/2013	0.30	Preparing settlement chart.
			10/21/2013	0.10	E-mail correspondence with Randy Boggs regarding Secretary's counteroffer.
			10/22/2013	0.10	E-mail correspondence with client's representative.
	Case No. 000310665 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-502 Total			2.40	
	Case No. 000317917 (American Eagle); WEVA	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	2013-892	Colston, Leanna L.	10/22/2013	0.20	Calculating reductions.
				0.20	Preparing request for settlement authority for client approval.
				0.40	Preparing settlement chart of offers.
				0.40	Preparing settlement chart of penalties.
				0.40	Reviewing and processing settlement offer from Solicitor.
			10/29/2013	0.10	Additional work on preparing request for settlement authority.
				0.10	Preparing notice of inspector deposition.
			10/30/2013	0.20	Reviewing and summarizing Solicitor's latest settlement offer.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/1/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/17/2013	1.00	Working on issues regarding hearing preparation.
			10/22/2013	0.90	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
				0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/23/2013	0.40	Reviewing and analyzing file.
				2.10	Working on issues regarding settlement evaluation.
				0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/24/2013	0.80	Working on issues regarding counteroffer to MSHA.
				0.70	Working on issues regarding settlement evaluation.
			10/25/2013	0.80	Working on issues regarding settlement evaluation, status and strategy.
			10/28/2013	1.40	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/29/2013	1.40	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/30/2013	0.20	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
			10/31/2013	0.70	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/1/2013	0.10	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding deposition availability.
			10/21/2013	0.30	Reviewing e-mail traffic regarding status and strategy.
		Schwendeman, Adam	10/1/2013	0.10	E-mail correspondence with client's representative regarding deposition dates and counteroffer.
			10/22/2013	0.40	Analyzing Secretary's counteroffer in preparation for response.
				14.30	
	Case No. 000317917 (American Eagle); WEVA 2013-892 Total				
	Case No. 000320768 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-975	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		Gray, Diane L.	10/31/2013	2.00	Preparing citation summaries.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.30	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000320768 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-975 Total			2.40	
	Case No. 000326261 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-1165	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/1/2013	0.50	Preparing answer and discovery.
				0.30	Reviewing and analyzing file and working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/23/2013	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.60	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.
	Case No. 000326261 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-1165 Total			1.80	
	Case No. 000329021 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-1264	Cimino, Michael T.	10/22/2013	0.30	E-mail traffic regarding new matter.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/22/2013	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
			10/24/2013	0.60	Preparing answer and discovery.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/24/2013	0.50	Drafting answer.

Client Name	Matter Name	Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
	Case No. 000329021 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2013-1264 Total			0.50	Drafting initial discovery.
	Dwight Richmond 105(c) HOPE-CD-2013-09	Cimino, Michael T.	10/1/2013	2.30	
			10/4/2013	0.50	E-mail traffic regarding complaint from Mr. Richmond.
			10/11/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
			10/17/2013	0.50	Preparing answer.
			10/22/2013	0.20	E-mail traffic with Mr. Gray.
		Colston, Leanna L.	10/4/2013	0.50	Preparing answer to second complaint.
			10/22/2013	0.50	Preparing answer to discrimination complaint.
				0.50	Preparing interrogatories to Secretary of Labor.
				0.40	Preparing and filing answer to complaint.
				0.20	Reviewing and processing additional complaint filed by Richmond.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	10/1/2013	0.70	Working on issues regarding Richmond appeal.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.30	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.
	Dwight Richmond 105(c) HOPE-CD-2013-09 Total			4.40	
	Special Investigation 110(c) From 104d Orders Issuance (American Eagle Mine); Citation No. 8120583	Cimino, Michael T.	10/4/2013	0.10	Preparing third quarter report.
		O'Neil, Anna M.	10/25/2013	0.30	Preparing chronologies for upcoming docket meeting.
	Special Investigation 110(c) From 104d Orders Issuance (American Eagle Mine); Citation No. 8120583 Total			0.40	
	Speed Mining, LLC Total			45.50	
	Safety and Health Total			546.00	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Refunds	Bostic, Rebecca L.	10/11/2013	2.80	Reviewing file and exhibits regarding missing records.
		Huffman, Timothy E.	10/4/2013	0.80	Telephone conference with Office of Insurance Commissioner counsel regarding preparation of record for appeal.
			10/9/2013	1.80	Conference with Office of Insurance Commissioner counsel regarding record on appeal.
			10/10/2013	1.50	Working on stipulation for record on appeal.
			10/11/2013	1.00	Working on supplement to record on appeal.
			10/14/2013	0.50	Telephone conference with counsel for employer in similar matter also on appeal to Kanawha County Circuit Court.
			10/15/2013	0.30	Reviewing correspondence from Office of Insurance Commissioner counsel.
				0.30	Telephone conference with other employer's counsel.
			10/18/2013	0.50	Telephone conference with other employer counsel regarding issue of consolidation of appeals.
			10/24/2013	0.50	Conference with other counsel regarding Office of Insurance Commissioner request to consolidate.
				0.10	Memorandum to Office of Insurance Commissioner counsel.
			10/25/2013	0.50	Telephone conference regarding consolidation issue.
	Refunds Total			10.60	
Patriot Coal Corporation Total				10.60	
Workers Compensation Total				10.60	
Grand Total				701.80	