

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI**

In re:

**PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, et al.,
Debtors.**

Chapter 11

Case No. 12-51502

(Jointly Administered)

**MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC FOR
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF
DECEMBER 1, 2013 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2013**

NAME OF APPLICANT:	<u>Step toe & Johnson PLLC</u>
ROLE IN THE CASE:	Special Counsel for the Debtors
TIME PERIOD:	December 1, 2013 through and including December 31, 2013
CURRENT APPLICATION:	Total Fees Requested: \$33,142.10 80% of Fees Requested: \$26,513.68 Total Expenses Requested: \$ 1,867.65

1. In accordance with the *Order To Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262, S.D. NY] (the “**Interim Compensation Order**”), Steptoe & Johnson PLLC (“**Steptoe & Johnson**”), counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the “**Debtors**”), hereby submits its Monthly Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “**Fee Statement**”) for the period of December 1, 2013 through and including December 31, 2013 (the “**Fee Statement Period**”).

2. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Steptoe & Johnson seeks payment of \$28,381.33, representing (a) 80% of Steptoe & Johnson’s fees for services rendered and (b) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred.

3. Attached hereto as “Exhibit A” is a listing of Steptoe & Johnson’s professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively, the “**Steptoe & Johnson Professionals**”), including the hourly rate for each Steptoe & Johnson Professional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Statement Period and the title, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees billed by each Steptoe & Johnson Professional.

4. Attached hereto as “Exhibit B” is a schedule specifying the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Steptoe & Johnson is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

5. Attached hereto as “Exhibit C” is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Steptoe & Johnson during the Fee Statement Period, organized by matter categories.

Such services included:

- General labor and employment advice;
- Administrative litigation in front of the Mine Safety and Health Administration;
- Employment litigation;
- Federal administrative litigation in front of the Equal Employment Opportunity Commission;
- State administrative litigation in front of the West Virginia State Human Rights Commission.

6. Attached as “Exhibit D” are the time records of Steptoe & Johnson, which provide a daily summary of the time spent by each Steptoe & Johnson Professional during the Fee Statement Period by matter category.¹

NOTICE

7. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri 63141, Attn.: Jacquelyn A. Jones, (ii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Missouri, 111 South 10th Street, Suite 6.353, St. Louis, MO 63102, Attn.: Leonora S. Long and Paul A. Randolph, (iii) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors’ postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn.: Marcia Goldstein and Joseph Smolinsky, and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn.: Margot B. Schonholtz and Ana Alfonso, and (iv) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn.: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq..

¹ Note the time entries for all “Brody Mining” cases reflect time from September 1, 2013 through and including December 31, 2013. S&J filed its Supplemental Declaration to include Brody Mining, LLC and Patriot Ventures LLC, which commenced Chapter 11 cases on September 23, 2013, on October 16, 2013 [Dkt. 4792].

8. WHEREFORE, the Debtors respectfully request that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated this 29th day of January, 2014.

By: /s/ C. David Morrison

C. David Morrison

STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC
400 White Oaks Boulevard
Bridgeport, WV 26330-4500
Telephone: (304) 933-8113
Facsimile: (304) 933-8776
Special Counsel for the Debtors

EXHIBIT A

Professionals and Rates

I.A. Members / Of Counsel

Name of Member / Of Counsel	Title	Hourly Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
C. David Morrison	Member	235.00	1.00	235.00
Jeffrey K. Phillips	Member (MSHA)	220.00	44.20	9724.00
Jonathan R. Ellis	Member	160.00	53.00	8480.00
Sarah C. Ellis	Member	185.00	4.30	795.50
Thomas S. Kleeh	Member	235.00	3.70	869.50
Thomas S. Kleeh	Member (MSHA)	235.00	17.30	4065.50
Todd M. Swanson	Member	185.00	9.10	1683.50
W. Henry Lawrence	Member	235.00	1.00	235.00
TOTAL MEMBERS and OF COUNSEL:			133.60	\$26,088.00

II.A. Associates

Name of Associate	Department	Hourly Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Candace B. Smith	Litigation – MSHA	143.00	10.50	1501.50
Daniel D. Fassio	Labor	170.00	1.50	255.00
Katrina N. Harper	Litigation – MSHA	143.00	21.20	3031.60
Seth P. Bradley	Litigation	160.00	8.00	1280.00
Lauren A. Williams	Litigation	160.00	1.10	176.00
TOTAL ASSOCIATES:			42.30	\$6,244.10

III.A. Paraprofessionals

Name of Paraprofessional	Department	Hourly Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Leanne Chandler	Labor	90.00	9.00	810.00
TOTAL PARAPROFESSIONALS:			9.00	\$810.00

EXHIBIT B

Expenses

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED BY
STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC ON BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS

CATEGORY of EXPENSES	AMOUNTS
Computer Research	8.66
Courier Service: UPS, FedEx and Messenger service	26.45
Court Reporting Fees: depositions	1561.20
Long Distance Telephone Charges	31.98
Office Charges: Credit card charge for background check	24.95
Photocopying / Scanning Charges	28.40
Postage	34.50
Travel (associated with interviews and on-site MSHA investigations)	151.51
TOTAL	\$1,867.65

EXHIBIT C

Summary of Project Code

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED
BY STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Kopperston Water Suit	2.10	411.00
Mitchell v. Brody Mining	0.90	179.00
Chafin v. Brody Mining	2.20	484.50
Hoosier v. Brody Mining	1.60	343.50
Labor Matters	1.20	282.00
Ryan, et al. v. Patriot Coal	0.30	70.50
Kanawha Public Service District	30.40	4569.00
MSHA – General	7.10	1136.00
Grand Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #167389)	0.50	110.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #275179)	0.20	32.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #272361)	0.20	32.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #274746)	0.20	44.00
Campbell’s Creek Mine (MSHA Case #274403)	1.60	256.00
Federal No. 2 Mine (MSHA Case #288463)	0.40	64.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #292179)	0.50	80.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #282970)	0.30	66.00
Campbell’s Creek Mine (MSHA Case #299492)	0.40	64.00
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #291748)	0.20	44.00
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #302491)	1.20	171.60
Peerless Rachel Mine (MSHA Case #300803)	0.20	32.00
Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #300794)	0.20	32.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #294118)	2.00	440.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #299605)	0.10	22.00
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #300098)	8.50	1523.50
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #301677)	2.40	346.60
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #305637)	3.40	537.20
Campbells Creek Mine (MSHA Case #302485)	0.20	32.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #305751-01)	0.10	22.00
Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #306750)	0.20	32.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #306579)	0.20	32.00
MSHA & WVOMHS&T Investigation of Five Mile Accident	0.20	32.00
Petition for Modification of Existing Standard	0.10	22.00

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #308615)	3.80	836.00
Dodge Hill Mining (MSHA Case #302632)	0.20	44.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #310776)	0.10	22.00
Sugar Maple Mine (MSHA Case #308069)	0.30	42.90
Highland 105(c) Case (MADI-CD-2013-11)	17.80	3454.00
Peerless Rachel Mine (MSHA Case #311865)	0.20	32.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #315841)	0.40	88.00
Gateway Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #317918)	0.10	16.00
Peerless Rachel Mine (MSHA Case #316379)	0.80	128.00
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #311244)	2.00	440.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #320153)	0.60	132.00
Peerless Rachel Mine (MSHA Case #319302)	1.60	256.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #319538)	0.20	32.00
Blue Creek No. 1 (MSHA Case #321036)	1.20	192.00
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #311244)	0.10	22.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #285951)	0.10	22.00
Highland Mining – Section 110 Investigation	0.10	22.00
Farley Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #323406)	0.50	80.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #315443)	0.20	44.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #322169)	1.00	160.00
Peerless Rachel Mine (MSHA Case #321949)	0.70	112.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #315841)	3.90	858.00
105(c) Discrimination Suit (MADI-CD-2013-21)	0.10	22.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #316625)	0.90	144.00
Camp 9 Prep Plant (MSHA Case #316458)	0.30	66.00
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #303146)	0.10	22.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #321749)	1.60	256.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #324895)	0.70	112.00
Campbell's Creek Mine (MSHA Case #323414)	2.00	320.00
Blue Creek No. 1 Mine (MSHA Case #326536)	3.30	495.70
Peerless Rachel Mine (MSHA Case #324648)	5.20	753.80
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #318578)	0.30	66.00
Camp 9 Prep Plant (MSHA Case #319391)	0.20	44.00
Rocklick Prep Plant (MSHA Case #322160)	0.10	16.00

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #327800)	4.60	685.00
Rocklick Prep Plant (MSHA Case #327791)	0.30	48.00
Campbells Creek Mine (MSHA Case #329022)	0.10	16.00
Blue Creek No. 1 Mine (MSHA Case #329229)	0.60	96.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #327299)	5.50	880.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #318096)	0.90	198.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #320895)	0.70	154.00
Wells Prep Plant (MSHA Case #327790)	0.40	64.00
Peerless Rachel Mine (MSHA Case #327527)	7.30	1118.70
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #321364)	0.40	88.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #329862)	0.30	48.00
Sarmiento v. Patriot Coal (MADI-CD-2014-12)	0.30	66.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #323571)	2.60	572.00
Blue Creek No. 1 Mine (MSHA Case #331689)	3.70	532.50
Justice Discrimination Claim (PINE-CD-2014-01)	16.40	3854.00
Kuhn Discrimination Claim (HOPE-CD-2014-02)	0.90	211.50
Farley Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #331425)	1.00	160.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #330261)	0.10	16.00
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #332073)	0.40	88.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #332963)	1.20	192.00
Winchester Mine – Fatal Investigation	7.80	1248.00
Dodge Hill Mine (MSHA Case #326360)	3.20	704.00
Highland Mine (MSHA Case #326853)	3.10	682.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #332467)	2.30	347.60
Wallace 105(c) Investigation (MADI-CD-2014-07)	0.80	176.00
TOTAL HOURS and COMPENSATION REQUESTED:	184.90	33,142.10

EXHIBIT D

Time Records

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
KOPPERSTON WATER SUIT			
12/11/13	W Lawrence	1.00	Review and respond to emails; conference call with client and bankruptcy counsel; email to client on Prenter amounts
12/11/13	L Williams	1.10	Legal research re: doctrine that continuing tort tolls the applicable statute of limitations
TOTAL HOURS:		2.10	
MITCHELL V. BRODY MINING, LLC, ET AL.			
09/25/13	T Kleeh	.10	Draft notice of automatic stay
09/25/13	T Kleeh	.10	Draft letter to Judge Kaufman regarding same
09/25/13	D Fassio	.30	Draft notice of automatic stay
09/25/13	D Fassio	.20	Draft correspondence to judge regarding automatic stay
12/12/13	T Kleeh	.20	E-mail to client regarding status report for due diligence
TOTAL HOURS:		0.90	
CHAFIN v. BRODY MINING, LLC			
09/20/13	T Kleeh	.20	Emails with client regarding status
09/25/13	T Kleeh	.10	Draft letter to Judge Thompson regarding same
09/25/13	T Kleeh	.20	E-mails with client regarding same
09/25/13	T Kleeh	.10	Draft notice of automatic stay
09/25/13	D Fassio	.10	Draft correspondence to judge regarding automatic stay
09/25/13	D Fassio	.40	Draft notice of automatic stay
10/01/13	T Kleeh	.30	Telephone conference with Mr. Medailleau regarding status
11/05/13	T Kleeh	.20	Call from plaintiff's counsel regarding status, motion to lift stay
11/15/13	T Kleeh	.20	Call from plaintiff's counsel regarding status
11/18/13	T Kleeh	.20	Telephone conference with plaintiff's counsel regarding status
12/12/13	T Kleeh	.20	E-mail to client regarding status report for due diligence
TOTAL HOURS:		2.20	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
HOOSIER v. BRODY MINING, LLC			
09/25/13	T Kleeh	.10	Draft notice of automatic stay
09/25/13	T Kleeh	.10	Draft letter to Judge Thompson regarding same
09/25/13	D Fassio	.30	Draft notice of automatic stay
09/25/13	D Fassio	.20	Draft correspondence to judge regarding automatic stay
11/05/13	T Kleeh	.20	Call from plaintiff's counsel regarding status, motion to lift stay
11/15/13	T Kleeh	.20	Call from plaintiff's counsel regarding status
11/18/13	T Kleeh	.20	Telephone conference with plaintiff's counsel regarding status
12/12/13	T Kleeh	.20	E-mail to client regarding status report for due diligence
12/19/13	T Kleeh	.10	Call from Mr. Medailleu regarding status
TOTAL HOURS:		1.60	
LABOR MATTERS			
12/13/13	C Morrison	.10	Draft e-mail to Attorney Bailess and read response re: dates of discharge
12/13/13	C Morrison	.10	Draft e-mail to Attorney Bailess re: his threatened litigation
12/13/13	C Morrison	.20	Telephone conference with Attorney Bailess re: his threatened litigation
12/13/13	C Morrison	.10	Draft e-mail to client and read his response re: Attorney Bailess's communications
12/17/13	C Morrison	.20	Exchange e-mails with Attorney Bailess re: new cases he wants to file and send e-mail to client re: same
12/18/13	T Kleeh	.20	E-mails with client regarding WARN issues
12/20/13	C Morrison	.10	Draft e-mail to client re: information needed for potential case against Brody Mining
12/20/13	C Morrison	.10	Review client's responsive e-mail and reply to him re: potential case
12/20/13	C Morrison	.10	Draft e-mail to Attorney Bailess re: his Brody cases
TOTAL HOURS:		1.20	

Pg 18 of 37
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
RYAN, CASEY, ET AL. V. PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION			
12/02/13	T Kleeh	.10	Call from Chubb adjuster regarding status
12/19/13	T Kleeh	.20	Telephone conference with Chubb adjuster regarding status
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
KANAWHA PUBLIC SERVICE DISTRICT			
12/02/13	T Swanson	2.60	Draft summary of meeting with PSC Staff and advice going-forward
12/02/13	T Swanson	1.20	Research West Virginia case law for opinions addressing whether a private corporation may use the DOH right-of-way
12/03/13	T Swanson	.10	Call from client regarding ownership status of DOH right-of-way
12/03/13	T Swanson	.30	Draft summary of real estate issues to be addressed
12/04/13	T Swanson	.30	Calls to and from client regarding real estate issue
12/04/13	S Ellis	1.00	Begin research on real estate right of way issue regarding DOH's ability to convey
12/04/13	S Bradley	3.50	Research legality of DOH right-of-way grants to private versus public entities
12/05/13	T Swanson	.20	Call to client regarding real estate issues
12/05/13	S Bradley	4.50	Research Division of Highways' right to grant a permit to use a right-of-way to a private entity; draft and revise memorandum pertaining to said research
12/10/13	T Swanson	.10	Call to client regarding Kanawha County Commission meeting
12/11/13	S Ellis	1.30	Review and revise memorandum regarding DOH right to grant right of way; review tax maps and pipeline schematics to determine title work necessary
12/12/13	T Swanson	.50	Review memo regarding client's use of DOH right-of-way
12/12/13	S Ellis	1.30	Determine extent of title work needed; begin title work spot checking
12/16/13	L Chandler	3.50	Review records in Kanawha County with respect to ownership of Slaughters Creek Road

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/17/13	L Chandler	5.50	Review records in Kanawha County Clerk's Office, Assessor's Office and Circuit Clerk's Office regarding ownership of Slaughters Creek Road
12/17/13	T Swanson	.20	Review project outline for Kanawha County Commission meeting
12/17/13	S Ellis	.20	Work on title spot checking
12/19/13	T Swanson	.80	Prepare for Kanawha County Commission meeting
12/19/13	T Swanson	2.80	Attend Kanawha County Commission meeting
12/19/13	S Ellis	.50	Review title work results
TOTAL HOURS:		30.40	

MSHA - GENERAL

12/10/13	J Ellis	.20	Call with MSHA CLR Blair re: Peerless Rachel dockets
12/12/13	J Ellis	.40	Call from MSHA CLR Blair re: S&S citations at Peerless Rachel
12/13/13	J Ellis	2.30	Work on quarterly MSHA reports
12/16/13	J Ellis	1.70	Work on quarterly MSHA reports
12/19/13	J Ellis	1.50	Work on quarterly reports on MSHA matters
12/20/13	J Ellis	.30	Work on quarterly status reports on MSHA matters
12/26/13	J Ellis	.70	Work on quarterly MSHA reports
TOTAL HOURS:		7.10	

GRAND EAGLE MINING - KENT 2009-292 - MSHA CASE #167389

12/11/13	J Phillips	.20	Engage in settlement negotiations
12/18/13	J Phillips	.20	Receive and review proposed settlement documents
12/23/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Judge Paez with decision approving settlement; draft email to client with payment obligations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.50	

WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-534 & 533 - MSHA CASE #275179

12/03/13	J Ellis	.20	Status conference call with Judge Moran
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-466 - MSHA CASE #272361			
12/03/13	J Ellis	.20	Status conference call with Judge Moran
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2012-442 - MSHA CASE #274746			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
CAMPBELL'S CREEK #7 MINE - WEVA 2012-593 - MSHA #274403			
12/04/13	J Ellis	.50	Work on settlement negotiations
12/05/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with MSHA attorney Abdoveis re: settlement negotiations
12/06/13	J Ellis	.20	Call with client re: status of settlement negotiations
12/10/13	J Ellis	.40	Email to client re: status of settlement negotiations; email with MSHA attorney Abdoveis re: settlement; email from MSHA attorney Abdoveis to Judge Feldman re: settlement of docket
12/11/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Judge Fledman's law clerk re: deadline to file settlement documents
12/20/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with MSHA attorney Abdoveis re: status of proposed settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		1.60	
FEDERAL NO. 2 MINE - WEVA 2012-1195/1196 - MSHA CASE #288463			
12/16/13	J Ellis	.40	Work on settlement counterproposal
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-1473 - MSHA CASE #292179			
12/20/13	J Ellis	.20	Email to MSHA CLR K. Acord re: status of overdue proposed settlement documents
12/23/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review proposed settlement documents
12/30/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from MSHA CLR K. Accord to Judge Moran re: settlement
TOTAL HOURS:		0.50	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2012-872 - MSHA CASE #282970			
12/12/13	J Phillips	.20	Receive and review settlement documents

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
CAMPBELLS CREEK #10 - WEVA 2013-38 - MSHA CASE #299492			
12/05/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with Judge Feldman's law clerk re: case status
12/10/13	J Ellis	.20	Call with MSHA CLR Blair re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
HIGHLAND #9 MINE - KENT 2012-1277 - MSHA #291748			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/18/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from solicitor B. Mauk re: representation
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2013-114 & 113 - MSHA #302491			
12/30/13	K Harper	1.20	Drafting settlement proposal 2013-113
TOTAL HOURS:		1.20	
PEERLESS RACHEL MINE - WEVA 2013-84 - MSHA #300803			
12/05/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order approving settlement and draft email to client re: settlement order
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2013-82 - MSHA CASE #300794			
12/05/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order approving settlement and draft email to client outlining citation modifications
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2012-1407 - MSHA #294118			
12/12/13	J Phillips	.30	Engage in settlement negotiations
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/16/13	J Phillips	.20	Emails from and to solicitor E. Friary re: settlement and evidentiary hearing; email from law clerk re: hearing
12/20/13	J Phillips	.90	Letter from Judge Feldman with notice of hearing; identify witnesses; draft email to client re: trial and witnesses

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/26/13	J Phillips	.50	Work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		2.00	
<hr/>			
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2013-13 - MSHA CASE #299605			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
<hr/>			
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-14 - MSHA #300098			
12/12/13	J Phillips	.20	Emails from and to solicitor S. Allen re: discovery and settlement
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/16/13	J Phillips	2.00	Engage in settlement negotiations; draft email to client summarizing settlement strategy
12/20/13	C Smith	.20	Prepare responses to MSHA's discovery requests
12/22/13	C Smith	2.50	Respond to solicitor's interrogatories and requests for production
12/23/13	J Phillips	1.50	Engage in settlement negotiations; draft settlement proposal
12/23/13	C Smith	.20	Respond to solicitor's interrogatories and requests for production
12/26/13	J Phillips	.10	Emails from and to law clerk Steve Spitzer re: pre-hearing conference
12/27/13	C Smith	.10	Respond to solicitor's interrogatories and requests for production
12/29/13	C Smith	.30	Respond to Petitioner's request for interrogatories
12/30/13	C Smith	.50	Respond to Petitioner's request for interrogatories
12/31/13	J Phillips	.10	Email from law clerk Steven Spitzer re: ALJ conference call
12/31/13	C Smith	.70	Respond to solicitor's requests for interrogatories
TOTAL HOURS:		8.50	
<hr/>			
SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2013-85 - MSHA CASE #301677			
12/26/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with Ron Gurka and Steve Spitzer re: status conference call

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/30/13	K Harper	2.20	Drafting settlement proposal 2013-85
TOTAL HOURS:		2.40	
SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2013-316 & 317 - MSHA #305637			
12/13/13	J Ellis	.50	Work on settlement proposal on WEVA 2013-317
12/16/13	J Ellis	2.30	Review inspectors' notes and draft settlement proposal on WEVA 2013-317
12/26/13	J Ellis	.20	Work on settlement proposal on WEVA 2013-316
12/30/13	K Harper	.40	Reviewing dockets in preparation of settlement proposal on WEVA 2013-316
TOTAL HOURS:		3.40	
CAMPBELLS CREEK #10 MINE - WEVA 2013-111/112 - MSHA #302485			
12/16/13	J Ellis	.20	Email to MSHA attorney Gurka re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2013-261 - MSHA CASE #305751-01			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2013-366 - MSHA #306750			
12/02/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with MSHA attorney Engel re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2013-371 - MSHA CASE #306579			
12/10/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review proposed settlement documents from MSHA CLR Blair
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
MSHA & WVOMHS&T INVESTIGATION OF FIVE MILE PLANT ACCIDENT			
12/06/13	J Ellis	.20	Call with client re: conferencing state NOV
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
PETITION FOR MODIFICATION OF EXISTING STANDARD			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-319 - MSHA #308615			
12/06/13	J Phillips	2.50	Emails from solicitor P. Bernick with pre-hearing disclosure and extensive exhibits; draft respondent's pre-hearing disclosure
12/11/13	J Phillips	.60	Engage in settlement negotiations; draft settlement proposal
12/12/13	J Phillips	.20	Engage in settlement negotiations
12/30/13	J Phillips	.50	Draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		3.80	
DODGE HILL #1 MINE - KENT 2013-175 - MSHA CASE #302632			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - MOTION TO REOPEN - MSHA CASE #310776			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2013-362 MSHA #308069			
12/31/13	K Harper	.30	Analyzing docket in preparation of drafting settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
HIGHLAND 105(C) CASE- MADI-CD-2013-11			
12/01/13	C Smith	1.40	Summarize depositions of Plaintiff and Defendant's witnesses
12/03/13	J Phillips	2.40	Fax from the MoM clinic with medical records of plaintiff; draft letter to opposing counsel re: medical records; prepare for client conference call
12/03/13	C Smith	4.60	Prepare deposition summaries of key witnesses in preparation for hearing
12/06/13	J Phillips	2.70	Teleconference with client re: settlement strategy; email from client with settlement authority; email from atty. T. Opegard with preliminary statement of plaintiff; draft email to client re: settlement negotiations; letter from Methodist Hospital with medical records of plaintiff; multiple teleconferences with atty. T. Opegard re: settlement negotiations
12/07/13	J Phillips	.70	Engage in settlement negotiations

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/08/13	J Phillips	1.50	Prepare for deposition of MSHA investigator Fugate; engage in settlement negotiations
12/09/13	J Phillips	2.30	Engage in settlement negotiations with solicitor S. Belton; multiple emails from atty. T. Oppegard re: settlement terms; draft emails to clients re: settlement and temporary reinstatement; draft settlement agreement and release
12/10/13	J Phillips	.60	Emails from and to client re: terms of settlement agreement; teleconference with atty. T. Oppegard re: settlement; text from atty. T. Oppegard re: confidentiality provision; work on confidential settlement agreement and release
12/11/13	J Phillips	.30	Emails from and to client re: settlement; texts from and to atty. T. Oppegard re: confidentiality provision and job reference for plaintiff
12/13/13	J Phillips	1.00	Draft email to atty. T. Oppegard re: settlement agreement; draft MSHA quarterly case status report; Email from atty. T. Oppegard with preliminary revisions to settlement agreement; letter from solicitor S. Belton with "joint motion to approve settlement;" draft letter to atty. T. Oppegard re: joint motion; revise confidential settlement agreement
12/16/13	J Phillips	.30	Email from client with edits to settlement documents; email from atty. T. Oppegard re: settlement check information; revise confidential settlement agreement
TOTAL HOURS:		17.80	
PEERLESS RACHEL MINE - WEVA 2013-561 - MSHA #311865			
12/05/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order approving settlement and draft email to client outlining citation modifications
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
MINE HIGHLAND 9 - KENT 2013-618 - MSHA CASE #315841			
12/11/13	J Phillips	.20	Emails from and to solicitor N. Morholt re: depositions
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/18/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft email to client re: depositions
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
GATEWAY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2013-812 - MSHA CASE #317918			
12/16/13	J Ellis	.10	Email to MSHA CLR Johnson re: status of settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
PEERLESS RACHEL MINE - WEVA 2013-759 - MSHA CASE #316379			
12/02/13	J Ellis	.20	Email from client re: settlement; emails with client re: time frame on getting final settlement order
12/05/13	J Ellis	.20	Email to MSHA CLR Blair re: settlement
12/10/13	J Ellis	.10	Call with MSHA CLR Blair re: status of settlement documents
12/13/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review proposed settlement documents; email from MSHA investigator Southern re: filing settlement documents; email to client re: filing of settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.80	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-479 - MSHA #311244			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/16/13	J Phillips	1.20	Draft settlement proposal
12/30/13	J Phillips	.70	Draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		2.00	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-745 - MSHA CASE #320153			
12/11/13	J Phillips	.30	Work on resolving discovery disputes
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/18/13	J Phillips	.20	Emails from and to solicitor N. Morholt re: discovery issues
TOTAL HOURS:		0.60	
PEERLESS RACHEL MINE - WEVA 2013-888 - MSHA CASE #319302			
12/05/13	J Ellis	.70	Calls and emails with client re: status of settlement negotiations
12/06/13	J Ellis	.30	Emails with client re: status of settlement negotiations; emails with MSHA CLR Blair re: settlement
12/09/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with client S&S citations at Peerless Rachel

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/10/13	J Ellis	.10	Call with MSHA CLR Blair re: status of settlement documents
12/13/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review proposed settlement documents; email from MSHA representative K. Southern re: filing settlement documents; email to client re: filing of settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		1.60	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2013-897 - MSHA CASE #319538			
12/05/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order approving settlement and draft email to client outlining citation modifications
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
BLUE CREEK NO. 1 DEEP MINE - WEVA 2013-958 - MSHA CASE #321036			
12/03/13	J Ellis	.70	Work on settlement negotiations
12/10/13	J Ellis	.20	Email to client re: status of settlement negotiations
12/17/13	J Ellis	.30	Emails with client re: settlement negotiations; emails with MSHA CLR Blair re: settlement
TOTAL HOURS:		1.20	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-480 - MSHA #311244			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2012-1136 MSHA #285951			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
HIGHLAND MINING - SECTION 110 INVESTIGATION - MADI-CD-2013-06			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
FARLEY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2013-1052 & 1051 - MSHA #323406			
12/04/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails from MSHA attorney Marino re: settlement negotiations on WEVA 2013-1051
12/16/13	J Ellis	.30	Emails with Judge Rae's law clerk and MSHA attorney Marino re: status conference call; settlement negotiations with Attorney Marino
TOTAL HOURS:		0.50	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2013-617 - MSHA #315443			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2013-999 - MSHA #322169			
12/03/13	J Ellis	.40	Work on settlement negotiations
12/10/13	J Ellis	.20	Email to client re: status of settlement negotiations
12/16/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with client re: status of settlement negotiations
12/18/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with client re: status of settlement negotiations; email to MSHA CLR Blair re: settlement
TOTAL HOURS:		1.00	
PEERLESS RACHEL MINE - WEVA 2013-1026 - MSHA #321949			
12/02/13	J Ellis	.30	Email from client re: settlement; emails with MSHA CLR Haynes re: settlement
12/06/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review proposed settlement documents
12/10/13	J Ellis	.10	Emails with MSHA CLR Haynes re: status of settlement documents
12/12/13	J Ellis	.10	Emails with MSHA representative K. Southern re: expediting filing of settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.70	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-619 - MSHA #315841			
12/11/13	J Phillips	.80	Draft settlement proposal; engage in settlement negotiations
12/12/13	J Phillips	1.30	Engage in settlement negotiations
12/13/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/13/13	J Phillips	1.40	Engage in settlement negotiations; draft settlement proposal
12/30/13	J Phillips	.20	Engage in settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		3.90	
105(C) DISCRIMINATION SUIT - MADI-CD_2013-21			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2013-760 - MSHA CASE #316625			
12/04/13	J Ellis	.90	Receive and review inspector notes and work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		0.90	
CAMP 9 PREP PLANT - KENT 2013-657 - MSHA #316458			
12/13/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/17/13	J Phillips	.10	Work on settlement proposal
12/18/13	J Phillips	.10	Receive and review "decision approving settlement;" draft email to client with decision and outlining payment obligation
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-112 - MSHA #303146			
12/12/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2013-1036; 1037; 1038 - MSHA #321749			
12/16/13	J Ellis	.30	Emails with Judge Miller re: settlement of WEVA 2013-1036 and 1038; email to MSHA CLR Blair re: status of settlement documents
12/17/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order approving WEVA 2013-1037 settlement and draft email to client outlining citation modifications
12/18/13	J Ellis	.50	Receive and review proposed settlement documents on WEVA 2013-1036; receive and review proposed settlement documents on WEVA 2013-1038
12/19/13	J Ellis	.10	Emails with MSHA representative K. Southern and CLR Blair re: assignment of cases to Judge Miller
12/26/13	J Ellis	.50	Receive and review order approving settlement of WEVA 2013-1036; receive and review order approving settlement of WEVA 2013-1038; draft email to client outlining citation modifications
TOTAL HOURS:		1.60	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2013-1110 - MSHA CASE #324895			
12/04/13	J Ellis	.40	Attention to settlement negotiations
12/23/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review letter from attorney Kooi re: request for settlement proposal; email to

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
			client re: additional information needed for settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		0.70	
CAMPBELLS CREEK NO. 10 - WEVA 2013-1076 - MSHA #323414			
12/02/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review counterproposal from MSHA attorney Kooi
12/04/13	J Ellis	.50	Review MSHA's proposal and draft counterproposal
12/05/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with MSHA attorney Kooi and Judge Miller's law clerk re: conference call with Judge Miller
12/09/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Judge Miller's law clerk re: status conference
12/11/13	J Ellis	.40	Prepare for and attend status conference call with Judge Miller
12/16/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review notice of hearing and draft email to client re: hearing
12/17/13	J Ellis	.30	Work on prehearing disclosures
TOTAL HOURS:		2.00	
BLUE CREEK NO. 1 DEEP MINE - WEVA 2013-1136 - MSHA #326536			
12/04/13	J Ellis	.60	Work on settlement negotiations
12/09/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with MSHA attorney Abdoveis re: settlement negotiations
12/10/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with MSHA attorney Abdoveis and Judge Gill's law clerk re: extension of prehearing order deadlines
12/19/13	K Harper	1.90	Settlement proposal 2013-1136
12/20/13	J Ellis	.40	Draft settlement proposal to MSHA attorney Abdoveis
TOTAL HOURS:		3.30	
PEERLESS RACHEL MINE - WEVA 2013-1129 -1130 - MSHA #324648			
12/02/13	J Ellis	.30	Work on settlement proposals
12/02/13	K Harper	.20	Reviewing settlement dockets in preparation of drafting settlement.
12/04/13	K Harper	3.20	Drafting settlement proposal for WEVA 2013-1130

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/05/13	J Ellis	.30	Email to MSHA attorney Engel re: settlement proposal on WEVA 2013-1130
12/05/13	K Harper	1.20	Drafting settlement proposal on WEVA 2013-1129
TOTAL HOURS:		5.20	
<hr/>			
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-744 - MSHA #318578			
12/06/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief R. Lesnick with order of assignment to ALJ McCarthy
12/12/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/23/13	J Phillips	.10	Email from law clerk Riley re: pre-hearing submissions
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
<hr/>			
CAMP 9 PREP PLANT KENT 2013-757 - MSHA #319391			
12/06/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief R. Lesnick with assignment to ALJ McCarthy
12/12/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	
<hr/>			
ROCKLICK PREP PLANT - WEVA 2013-955 - MSHA CASE #322160			
12/12/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review order of assignment and prehearing order
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
<hr/>			
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2013-1204 - MSHA #327800			
12/12/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order of assignment and prehearing order
12/18/13	J Ellis	.20	Draft email to client re: information needed for citation contest
12/19/13	J Ellis	.40	Work on settlement negotiations
12/20/13	J Ellis	.10	Emails with client re: request for information for settlement proposal
12/23/13	J Ellis	.60	Emails with opposing counsel R. Kooi re: extension of prehearing deadline; email to Judge Lewis re: extending prehearing deadline; emails with client re: information needed for settlement proposal
12/24/13	J Ellis	.10	Email from Judge Lewis's law clerk re: extension of prehearing deadline

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/30/13	K Harper	3.00	Drafting settlement proposal 2013-1204
TOTAL HOURS:		4.60	
<hr/>			
ROCKLICK PREP PLANT - WEVA 2013-1193 - MSHA #327791			
12/12/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review order of assignment and prehearing order
12/17/13	J Ellis	.10	Emails with MSHA attorney S. Hecker re: previously filed answer
12/22/13	J Ellis	.10	Email to client re: case assignment
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
<hr/>			
CAMPBELLS CREEK NO. 10 - MSHA #329022			
12/02/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review letter from MSHA attorney C. Schumann re: no objection to Respondent's motion to reopen
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
<hr/>			
BLUE CREEK NO. 1 DEEP MINE - WEVA 2013-1233 - MSHA #329229			
12/09/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review settlement counterproposal from MSHA attorney E. Abdoveis
12/10/13	J Ellis	.40	Work on settlement counterproposal
TOTAL HOURS:		0.60	
<hr/>			
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2013-1238 - MSHA #327299			
12/03/13	J Ellis	.30	Call with MSHA attorney J. McClammer re: settlement negotiations; email from J. McClammer re: status conference call
12/16/13	J Ellis	.20	Emails with MSHA attorney J. McClammer re: settlement negotiations
12/17/13	J Ellis	1.30	Work on settlement negotiations
12/18/13	J Ellis	1.20	Receive and review settlement counterproposal from MSHA and begin working on response
12/20/13	J Ellis	1.90	Draft settlement counterproposal to MSHA attorney J. McClammer
12/23/13	J Ellis	.60	Email from MSHA attorney J. McClammer re: settlement negotiations; attention to settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		5.50	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2013-818 - MSHA #318096			
12/06/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter with order of assignment to ALJ McCarthy and pre-hearing order
12/12/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/17/13	J Phillips	.40	Work on settlement proposal
12/18/13	J Phillips	.10	Engage in settlement negotiations
12/23/13	J Phillips	.10	Emails from and to CLR Boyd re: request for extension
TOTAL HOURS:		0.90	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2013-812 - MSHA #320895			
12/06/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief R. Lesnick with assignment to ALJ T. McCarthy and pre-hearing order
12/12/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/17/13	J Phillips	.30	Work on settlement proposal
12/18/13	J Phillips	.10	Engage in settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		0.70	
WELLS PREP PLANT - WEVA 2013-1187 - MSHA #327790			
12/17/13	J Ellis	.10	Receive and review letter from attorney R. Kooi re: request for settlement proposal
12/20/13	J Ellis	.20	Receive and review order of assignment and prehearing order
12/22/13	J Ellis	.10	Draft email to client re: information needed for citation contest
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
PEERLESS RACHEL MINE - WEVA 2013-1228 - MSHA #327527			
12/02/13	J Ellis	.20	Work on settlement proposal
12/05/13	K Harper	1.20	Drafting settlement proposal for WEVA 2013-1288
12/10/13	J Ellis	2.60	Work on settlement proposal
12/10/13	K Harper	1.70	Drafting settlement proposal WEVA 2013-1228
12/19/13	J Ellis	1.60	Review citations and draft settlement proposal to MSHA attorney Kimberly Engel
TOTAL HOURS:		7.30	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-841 - MSHA #321364			
12/12/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/20/13	J Phillips	.10	Letter from Chief Judge Lesnick with assignment to ALJ T. McCarthy
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2013-1321 - MSHA #329862			
12/12/13	J Ellis	.30	Receive and review proposed settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
SARMIENTO, CARLOS V PATRIOT COAL CORP.			
12/03/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft email to client re: MSHA interview summaries
12/12/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
DODGE HILL MINE: NO. 1 - KENT 2013-906 - MSHA CASE #323571			
12/12/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/26/13	J Phillips	2.30	Review inspector notes; review rebuttal information; draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		2.600	
BLUE CREEK NO. 1 - WEVA 2014-7 - MSHA CASE #331689			
12/20/13	J Ellis	.20	Work on settlement proposal
12/23/13	K Harper	3.50	Drafting settlement proposal 2014-7
TOTAL HOURS:		3.70	
JUSTICE DISCRIMINATION CLAIM - PINE-CD-2014-01			
12/05/13	T Kleeh	.20	E-mails with client regarding grievance
12/06/13	T Kleeh	.20	E-mails with client regarding update
12/10/13	T Kleeh	.50	Call from MSHA special investigator regarding follow-up witness interviews; draft position statement; e-mails with client regarding follow-up documentation
12/11/13	T Kleeh	.80	Telephone conference with MSHA special investigator regarding witness interviews, status; e-mails with client representatives regarding witness interviews; e-mails with client regarding status

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/12/13	T Kleeh	6.50	Prepare for witness interviews by MSHA; travel to Wharton; meet with Mr. Childers and MSHA special investigators; meet with Mr. Milam regarding status, factual background; travel to Charleston; e-mail to client representatives regarding status; call to client regarding status; telephone conference with client regarding status; review documentation related to Justice's LOA provided by Mr. Milam; e-mail to MSHA special investigators regarding same; draft position statement
12/13/13	T Kleeh	1.10	E-mails with client regarding status, pending lay-off; draft position statement; work on strategy issues
12/16/13	T Kleeh	5.80	Multiple telephone conferences with MSHA special investigator regarding follow-up questions, documents; e-mails with client representatives regarding same, position statement; review documents provided by Mr. Milam; e-mails with MSHA special investigator regarding requested documents; draft position statement; e-mails with client representatives regarding position statement; draft e-mail to MSHA special investigator regarding requested follow-up information
12/17/13	T Kleeh	1.30	Draft position statement; e-mails with Mr. Waller and Ms. Ojeda regarding same; draft responses to MSHA special investigator's inquiries; e-mails with Messrs. Waller and Milam and Ms. Ojeda regarding same, inquiries from local union president; e-mails with MSHA special investigator regarding follow-up inquiries, requests for information
TOTAL HOURS:		16.40	
KUHN DISCRIMINATION CLAIM - HOPE-CD-2014-02			
12/03/13	T Kleeh	.50	E-mails with client representatives regarding return to work meeting; review documents related to same
12/04/13	T Kleeh	.20	E-mails with Mr. Fala regarding status
12/05/13	T Kleeh	.20	E-mails with Mr. Fala regarding status
TOTAL HOURS:		0.90	
FARLEY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2013-1349 & 1350 - MSHA CASE #331425			
12/06/13	J Ellis	.70	Attention to settlement negotiations

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
12/22/13	J Ellis	.20	Draft email to MSHA CLR Nelson re: request for inspector notes and missing citation in petition
12/23/13	J Ellis	.10	Email to MSHA CLR Nelson re: missing citation in petition and inspectors notes
TOTAL HOURS:		1.00	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2013-1302 - MSHA CASE #330261			
12/20/13	J Ellis	.10	Email to client re: request for information for settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		0.10	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2014-24 - MSHA #332073			
12/03/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft answer to petition; draft written discovery requests
12/12/13	J Phillips	.10	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2014-65 - MSHA #332963			
12/05/13	J Ellis	.40	Review petition and draft answer
12/18/13	J Ellis	.80	Draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.20	
WINCHESTER MINE - FATAL INVESTIGATION			
12/02/13	J Ellis	4.40	On site for witness interviews and accident investigation
12/03/13	J Ellis	3.40	On site for witness interviews and MSHA/WVOMHST investigation
TOTAL HOURS:		7.80	
DODGE HILL MINE #1 - KENT 2013-991 - MSHA #326360			
12/09/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft answer to petition; draft written discovery requests
12/12/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/17/13	J Phillips	.10	Emails from and to CLR Gray re: discovery
12/27/13	J Phillips	1.80	Draft settlement proposal
12/31/13	J Phillips	.70	Work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		3.20	

TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2013-984 & 985 - MSHA #326853			
12/09/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft answer to petition and written discovery requests in KENT 2013-984
12/09/13	J Phillips	.20	Draft answer to petition and draft written discovery requests in KENT 2013-985
12/12/13	J Phillips	.30	Draft MSHA quarterly case status report
12/27/13	J Phillips	1.70	Draft settlement proposal in KENT 2013-985
12/31/13	J Phillips	.70	Work on settlement proposal in KENT 2013-985
TOTAL HOURS:		3.10	
WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2014-80 - MSHA 332467			
12/18/13	J Ellis	.40	Review petition and draft answer
12/19/13	J Ellis	.70	Review citations and draft settlement proposal to MSHA CLR Jean Blair
12/19/13	K Harper	1.20	Drafting settlement proposal 2014-80
TOTAL HOURS:		2.30	
WALLACE 105(C) INVESTIGATION - MADI-CD-2014-07			
12/20/13	J Phillips	.80	Review three section 105(c) complaints; draft letter to investigator Kirby Smith re: representation; draft MSHA quarterly case status report
TOTAL HOURS:		0.80	